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JAMES F. FOLEY DEAD

A NE3AUNEE PIONEER PASSES 
AWAY IN CALIFORNIA

Prominent In All Early-Day Actlv- 
Itloi and Widely Known ae a 

Mining Man

James P. Foley, the greater part of 
whose active years had been spent in 
Ncgaunee but who latterly had made 
hi* home in California, died February 
8tt i  News of his demise has Just 
reached Ncgaunee, and though partic­
ulars are locking, it is assumed that 
he passed away at the home of his 
son-in-law and daughter, Mr. and Mrs, 
Thomas O. Atkinson, at Metropolitan, 
Cala. He had spent considerable time 

* In a hospital at San Francisco, but 
Ncgaunee friends of the family be­
lieve that more recently he had re­
turned to Metropolitan* Up to the 
time of leaving Neg&unee, nearly ten 
years ago, when he was then close to 
the four-score mark, Mr. Foley was 
quite active for a man of his advanc­
ed years, but In more recent years 
his health had failed greatly, and 
Negaunee friends were not unpre­
pared for the news of his final pass­
ing.

Mr. Foley was bom at Cape Breton 
May 8th, 1831, and was a son of Mr. 
and Mrs. David Foley, natives of 
Co'unty Waterford, Ireland. The fath­
er had been a farmer in the old 
country, but In the early 30’s came 
to the United States and after a 
comparatively brief stay In Nova 
Scotia settled In Pennsylvania, where 
he engaged In mining. The son at­
tended the public schools until he 
was ten years of ago and for the fol­
lowing five years worked In the coal 
mines. He was then apprenticed to 
learn the bricklaying and plastering 
trades and after becoming a Journey­
man he worked at various places un­
til 1850, when he removed to the 
Lake Superior region.

He engaged in mining at Ontonagon, 
subsequently spent several years at 
Engle Harbor, and then went to Wa­
basha county, Minn., where he. en­
gaged in farming. Itcturning to the 
Copper Country ho engaged In the 
masoirs trade and later come to Ne- 
gnunce to lake a wood contract from 
the Iron Cliffs Company. He after­
ward resumed the mnson’s trade and 
some of the buildings which he 
erected are still standing. It wus 
about this time that ho first became 
interested In mining, and he helped 
develop the Lucy mine. Somewhat 
later be spent a year and a half In 
Utah, looking after a silver property.

Returning to Negaunee, Mr. Foley 
again took up ’prbspecting, subse­
quently bocomlng district agent for 
the Palist Brewing Company, a con­
nection which though It continued 
many years did not prevent his giv­
ing considerable attention to mining 
mutters. The discovery of the Mil­
waukee mine, an enterprise In which 
the late John Q, Adams was associat­
ed, brought the first really substan­
tial returns on Ills prospecting work, 
the deal being one of considerable 
magnitude for thosp days. Later he 
was Interested Jn developing the 
Wheeling mine and the Chicago, New 
York Hematite and Manganese prop­
erties, and still later he did some 
mining work In Connecticut and New 
•'York, the JlaJny Luke region no*t 
engaging his uttentlon. ,

H was lils unyielding faith that the 
territory to the southward of he elly 
MtIII contained undiscovered mlncrul 
that Jed to his entering the employ 
of the Hreitiing-Kaufinan Interests 
between fifteen and twenty years ago 
and M ,1s very generally understood 
that It wus Ills knowledge of con­
ditions In that district Hint brought 
about the opening of llm Ureltung- 
Hematite mid Mary Charlotte prop- 
,.riles, lie continued to he superin­
tendent of these mines up to the 
time i f  his retirement from adlye 
business efforts some ten years ago,

During his residence at Engle llur- 
tmr, Mr. Foley was united In marriage 
with Miss Mamuret Finnegan, who 
died December 24. 1009, at the age of 
80. Mr. Foley remained here hut a 
comparatively short time after his 
wife’s death, and the greater part of 
tin* subsequent time was spent with 
his son-in-law und daughter In Cali­
fornia. A son, Prior Foley, died 
many years ago, und besides the 
daughter, Mrs. Mary P. Atkinson, 
there survives one son, David F. Fo­
ley, of Virginia, Minn., who Is at the 
head of the Oliver Iron Mining Com­
pany’s police force throughout tin* 
Lake Huperlor district. A brother, 
John Foley, who also formerly resid­
ed here, (lied not long after his re­
moval to Minnesota a (lumber of 
years ago, ,

Mr. Foley took a prominent purl Ini

all of Ncgaunee’s early-day activities, 
serving as a supervisor for several 
terms, and for a considerable time 
as assessor, and being chosen mayor 
in 1896. He also was foreman of the 
fire department for a considerable 
period. In the early 80*s Mr. Foley 
built a home at the corner of Case 
street and Teal Lake avenue, It being 
among the first brick residences 
erected In the city. In the latter years 
of their life in this home, tholr own 
children being widely scattered, Mr, 
and Mrs. Foley became MgrandpaM 
and "grandma" to all of the children 
for blocks around, and tho la tter will 
share in the general sorrow a t the 
passing of this conspicuous figure in 
Negaunee's history.

It Is understood that Mr. Foley’B 
remains were temporarily placed In 
a ’mortuary vault in California and 
that they will he brought here for 
interment beside his wife some time 
next month.

BIG GAME TO-NIGHT

Escanaba and Negaunee High School 
Baeketball Teams to Compete

The crack Escanaba high school 
team is booked for a match game 
with the Negaunee high school team 
to-night at the Negaunee High School 
gymnasium and a contest worth wit­
nessing Is sure to result. The Esca- 
naba lads Is reckoned among the best 
basketball teams in the Upper Penin­
sula. Play will start promptly at 8 
o’clock.

SIR JOSEPH RICHARDSON

Negaunee Pioneer "Knighted" by 
Boys of St. John’s

At a meeting of the Knights of St. 
John, held on Tuesday evening at the 
Guild Hall, the boys adopted Joseph 
Richardson Into their society "honor­
is causa." "Joe" Is tho boys "peer­
less" friend when they are (n Little 
Lake and they do not forget him. 
Mr. Richardson made the hoys happy 
on Tuesday by attending their meet­
ing and sharing In a spread at which 
neither "wienies" nor ice cream was 
lacking.

MUST BE PLAINLY AODRE8SEO

Remove Old Labels Before Remalling 
Cartons, Boxes, Etc.

Postmasters throughout the coun­
try have been requested not to Qcccpt 
parcel post matter presented for mail­
ing In the form of enrtons, boxes or 
other receptacles which have been 
previously sent through tho mails, 
unless tho stamps which the parcel 
bore In Its previous mailing have 
been removed. Furthermore post­
masters are instructed to soe that all 
old address labels have been removed 
prior to presentation for mailing. 
Every package should, of course, he 
fully and plainly addressed, and bear 
the name of the sender as well.

RUMORED TRAIN CHANGES

8t. Paul Line to Discontinue Through 
Service Next Month

The rumor af a discontinuance of 
8t. Paul rullroud through passenger 
train service to Marquette and the 
Copper Country has been revived, and 
the present report fixes the date as 
the first Sunday In Miiieh. In view 
of the numerous "Hashes In the pan" 
which have marked this prospective 
ehango, there will he no eertalnty 
about ft until wheels actually cease 
to turn, hut there is little doubt that 
the change Is hound to eome whether 
It Is next month or Inter.

We are too far removed from head­
quarters to get any official dope, and 
hence ate unable to say whether the 
North-Western line figures In (he 
present contemplated change, hut 
there has been much speculation 
among those who kept track of Upper 
Peninsula' rullroud uffnlrs as to how 
long the North-Western might he ex- 
pectod to keep sllont on the subject. 
Homo little time after Federal control 
became a reality thero came the an­
nouncement that save In very excep­
tional Instances, each road would he 
restricted to its own equipment, und 
in due course the North-Western 
censed to send Its coaches through 
to the Copper Country, while the Ish- 
pcmfng-Marquette run was also 
abandoned. It wus ussumed that the 
Ht. Paul would have to follow suit, 
hut for some reason or unothcr It has 
managed to keep its trulns running 
over the Houtli Shore tracks and peo- 
|ile are therefore warranted In In­
sisting that 'Volng is believing" when 
it coni' to disappearance of (tic Ht. 
Paul coaches from this section.

PERSONAL PARAGRAPHS 
ABOUT FOLK YOU KNOW.

Mrs. William Duccy, formerly Mias 
Evelyn Sullivan of this city, and who 
was married last December at Elk­
hart. Ind., was here for a few days 
the past week visiting her sister, 
Catherine Sullivan, teacher a( the 
high school, departed Monday morn­
ing for Wakefield to pay a short visit 
with her sister, Mrs. LaVlgne, and 
then go to Winnipeg for a hort stay 
en route to Join her husband at Seat­
tle. Mr. Ducey is at Camp Lewis and 
expects to soon receive his discharge 
from the U. S. Army, after which Mr. 
and Mrs. Duccy will proceed to their 
future home In Juneau, Alaska, where 
Mr. Ducey holds an Important posi­
tion as government surveyor for tho 
Alaska territory.

Mrs. Samuel Stephens and son, Ray­
mond, returned home Sunday after­
noon from Houghton, where they went 
to attend the funeral of a relative.

Mrs. John Brown and daughters. 
Mary and Margaret, of Wakefield, arc 
visiting in Negaunee, the guests of 
Mrs. John A. Wasmuth.

Benjamin Jussen, who had been in 
Negaunee for several days visiting 

»hfs son, Herbert C. Jussen, departed 
Monday night for his home in Iron- 
wood.

Mrs. Elizabeth McHatton left Inst 
Sunday evening on a visit to her for­
mer home In Salt Lake City, Utah.

Superintendent S. 0. Clinton, of the 
Baraga county schools, and a former 
member of th$ Negaunee High School 
faculty, will have no opposition this 
spring for re-election to the office. 
The Upper Peninsula Farmer, L’Anse, 
says "Mr. Clinton has held the office 
(or a number of years and will he 
honored with another term."

MJss Genevieve Carroll, o^Escmm- 
tm, and a sister of Mrs. Kenneth Pci- 
low ofxhls city, who recently passed 
the examination with a number of 
young women of the country i.» go 
overseas as a Y. M. C. A. canteen 
worker, sailed last Saturday for 
France on tho Levlthian, the largest 
troopship afloat.

Richard P. Argali, who accompani­
ed the remains of of Paul S/nlthum 
to this city tor Interment, lius re­
turned to Kinney, Minn.

Mrs. W. G. Johnston concluded a 
visit of several days In Negaunee 
with her twin sister, Mrs. A. ft. 
Knight, and departed Saturduy night 
on her return to Duluth.

Mr. and Mrs. Alexander Maitland 
left last Sunday evening cn route to 
California, whore they expect to visit 
for some time,

Miss Maude Bice, who has been on 
the sick list for tho puHt few days, Is 
recovering.

Mr. and Mrs. George J, Hniipt paid 
a visit to friends In Marquette last 
Hunduy. ,

O'. R. Jackson and J. R  NeDon left 
Hunduy cvonlng for Lansing, where 
they went to attend the Republican 
flute Convention, which was held in 
that city on Tuesday.

Mrs. T. C. Yates loft last Sunday 
evening for St. Louis, Mo., where she 
will visit for several days with her 
son-in-law and daughter, Mr. and Mr*. 
F. G. Fulkerson. She was accompani­
ed as far as Chicago by her mother, 
Mrs. H. A. Bushncll, who will visit 
relatives there.

Alvin Bellstrom and Fred Rice 
have returned from & visit in St. PauI 
and Minneapolis.

Mrs. Chas. Johnson returned Sunday 
morning from Chicago, where she had 
been receiving successful medical 
treatment at the Augustana Hospital. 
Though stll weak from the effects of 
two operations, she is gaining In 
strength dally.

T. M. Wells was a passenger to 
Lower Michigan early In the week.

Mr. and Mrs. F. A. Bell left last 
Saturday evening on a visit to Chi­
cago.

, Mr. and Mrs. Howard Davey left 
Sunday afternoon for Lansing, where 
they are to make their home, Mr. 
Davey having obtained lucrative em­
ployment there.

Mrs. Richard Harris, who had been 
on an extended visit to her son-in-law 
and daughter, Mr. and Mrs. James 
Remington, at Coleraine, Minn,, re­
turned home l&st Saturday.

Samuel Lowensteln left last Sun­
day evening on a  purchasing trip for 
the big department store.

Mrs. LaVerne Seass paVl a visit to 
friends in Marquette last Sunday,

Postmaster O. J. Murray, of Mlchl- 
gamme, was a business caller in Ne­
gaunee on Monday and Tuesday.

Miss Anna Keating visited in Mar­
quette Monday evening.

Henry Mall recently underwent a 
successful operation for appendicitis 
at Dr. Robbins’ Hospital and will 
soon he aide to resume his work.

F. D. Kllnglum! has boon laid up 
with nn aggravated case of lumbago 
for the past few days.

Stephen Rule has returned from 
Bessemer, Ala., where he had been 
employed for some time.

Mrs, Clarence fThcln left last Sun­
day evening on a visit to her sisters 
at Oshkosh nud Wausau, Wis. At 
Oshkosh with Mines. Louis Fredericks 
and Joseph West, and at Wausau Mrs. 
Samuel Foster.

Mr. nnd Mrs. D. W. Driscoll spent 
last Sunday wth relatives and friends 
In Marquette.

Mrs. William Davey und grand­
daughter. Corine Davey, returned by 
the early morning train from Evoleth, 
Minn., where they had been paying a 
visit to Thomas Goldsworthy and 
family.

Frank Mulvey was up from Mar­
quette on Monday on a business mis­
sion and took occasion to cull on Ills 
old-time friends.

Mrs. Philip Levine I’etunnal home 
yesterday morning from a visit with 
friends in Ghlcugq.

EDUCATORS’ NATIONAL MEET

Superintendent Denison to Attend 
Chicago Convention

E. EX Denison, superintendent of 
the Negaunee public schools, will 
leave this evening for Chicago, where 
he will attend the annual convention 
of the school superintendent’s section 
of the National Educntlonnl Associa­
tion. He will spend Saturday nnd 
Sunday at his boyhood home In North­
ern Indiana, returning to Chicago In 
time for the opening of the conven­
tion, which will ho In progress 
throughout the coining week.

NEGAUNEE CITY BAND

Is Now Thoroughly Oaganlzed for the 
Coming Season

The Negaunee City Band is now or­
ganized for tho coming season ami 
has recently been supplied with the 
latest selections in music. At n re­
cent meeting the following officers 
were chosen;

Business Manager—Capt. Joseph 
Thomas.

Leader—Joseph Violetta.
Secretary—Robert J. Vealc.
Treasurer—Thomas Ellis, Sr.
Librarian—Frank Prowse.
Music Committee -Joseph Violetta. 

Thomas Ellis, Charles Letcher nnd 
William Heavytddes.

Uniform Committee—Frank Prowse 
and Alfred Bennetts.

Street Manager—Robert J. Wenlo.

MASONIC CLUB TO FEAST

An Oyater Supper the Card for 
Saturday Evening

The newly organized Masonic Club 
will have an oyster supper Saturday 
evening, It Is quite likely to be 
merely the forerunner of a series of 
social activities calculated to hrlnit 
the Negaunee members of the fra­
ternity Into closer friendship. The 
lodge has placed its club rooms in the 
Perkins' block tit the disposal of the 
new organizatio, and the house com- 
mlttCQ has given evidence of Its In­
tention to do Us full port by the in­
stallation of an Edison phonograph, 
us well as some card tables und other 
furnishings calculated to contribute 
to the comfort und pleasure of the 
duh  members.

PATRIOTIC PROGRAM TO-DAY

High 8chool Students Commemorate 
Waehlngton’e Birth

The calendar has not dealt kindly 
with the school folk this month, for 
Washington’s birthday fulls on Satur­
day and the students are thus de­
prived of their customary holiday. 
The "loss" Is not total, however, for 
this afternoon studies will give way 
f.u all of the rooms to programs 
which will fittingly commemorate the 
services rendered the nation by our 
first President.

Tho program which will he p'rc- 
sented In the high school at 2 
o'clock thfK'nfLernoon Is us follows: .
Music.............High School Orchestra
Declaration of Independence,. . . . . . .

............... ..John T. Lchtoncn
Flag Salute

Pence Conference...........Frank Mateer
Music ...............................Girls' Chorus
"George Washington” . .T. A. Thoren
Music ...............................Hoys' Chorus
"A Perfect Tribute"......... Matt Nuttfln

Houg Session
Ending with "Star Spangled Manner.''

THE FEBRUARY CLOVER-LAND
Mrs, W. H. Raymond and daughter, 

Evelyn, departed lust evening for 
Sioux City, Iowa, where H> ' ill 
visit with their daughter mid sis', r, 
Mrs, Herbert Culllgrtu.

John Harrington returned Tuesday 
afternoon from Scranton. I'm. where 
lie had been employed for the past 
seven months or more,

Mr, and Mrs, John Rough, Jr„ who 
had been visiting here with Mr. 
Rough's parents for some time, de­
parted Tuesday evening on their re­
turn to Chicago.

George A. Flory, a member of Co. 
M 330th Infantry, has arrived In New 
York from oversea* and Is expected 
home any day now,

John Allison, son of Mr. nnd Mrs. J. 
F. Allison, who received an honorable 
discharge from the U, 8, Navy about 
two weeks ugo, and has been visiting 
with his sister In Boston, is expected 
home to-day. *

Miss Catherine O’Leary was a pass- 
anger to Sharon, Minn., on Monday.

Mr, and Mrs, Joseph K. Kocholcnu 
paid a visit to Iron Mountain, their 
former home, early In the week.

Jacob Halo, August Allen, Matt 
Kero und Carl Petto went to Lak/* 
Miclilgamnie Tuesday on a fishing ex­
pedition mid expert to return tills 
(Friday) evening,

Miss /{edvlg Anderson left early 
In the week for Chicago to get posted 
In the latest creations In millinery.

Justice of (lie Pence William <H. 
Jones was a passenger Tuesday to 
Munlslng, where lie attended to some 
Moose bulge matters.

Mr. mid Mrs^ Fred Haili have 
changed their place of residence from 
Negaunee to Isbpeming, where Mr. 
Hath Is employed by Needham Bros.

Prlvuto Charles Palola Is home 
from overseas, having arrived Wed­
nesday aftcrnoqn.

Miss Evelyn Casey Is here on a 
visit from Ann Arbor.

Henry Levine, of the Hub Clothing 
Store, urrlved home this morning 
from a business trip to Chicago.

A. W. Thompson, of Vulcan, was In 
Negaunee Wednesday und Thursday, 
paying a visit to his soii'ln-law and 
daughter. Rev, and Mrs. James E. 
Crosfile.

Fred OUo, of Hancock, was In Ne­
gaunee Wednesday afternoon between 
trains en route to fils home from a 
visit In Milwaukee and Groan H.-iy,

Mrs, Jacob Anietli and son l*-ft 
Wednesday evening on u visit to rel- 
alvex In Escanaba.

Mrs. Charles Hporky left yesterday
(-veiling on u visit to Escunuba.

8he«p-Rol*lng Boomed but Many 
Other Timely Topic#

The February number of Clover- 
Land Is pretty much a "sheep" num­
ber, which Is not at all out of place 
In view of Hie glowing Importance uf 
this Industry, which last year passed 
from the experimental stage into a 
certainty. Due tribute Is made to the 
showing made In this direction by 
Marquette county, which by tho way 
Is the largest county In Michigan. 
One of tho Humorous Illustrations «e- 
compnnylnif this article gives a view 
of the sheep on Guo, flhurkcy's farm 
near Republic. Among the many 
other articles In the February Clover- 
Land are: "Ontonagon County Makes 
Cream; Will It Grow Reef?" "Pro­
posed Oreat Lukes-Ht. Lawrence- 
Tidewater Route a Necessity;" "Prime 
Importance ef Good Roads Proven 
Over and Over," tho latter being by 
J. A. -Docile, tlie new secretary- 
manager of the Upper Peninsula De­
velopment Bureau.

An Intending feature Is a table 
giving "Official Climatological Data 
of Clover-Land." TJie average annual 
growing season in this district, based 
upon Escanaba records, Is IIP days; 
contruKled with 131 days at Lander, 
Wyo„ MG at H elena , Monl„ 1 HI! at 
Salt Lake City, I'tali; 203 al Roswell, 
,N. M„ and 178 at Boise, Idaho.

THOREN MAKES REPORT

CITY ATTORNEY TELLS OF PHONS 
RATE*HEARING

Municipalities Were Wise In Pre- 
tenting a Solid Front at 

State Capital

City Attorney T. A. Thoren present­
ed a formal report to the Common 
Council at it* last meeting on tlm 
telephone rate hearing in Lansing, 
which was attended by himself and 
Attorney F. A. Bell as representative* 
of the city of Neftuunee, and ns wo 
were unable to include the report in 
the Council proceedings, It is hero 
presented. •

While Negaunee took no active part 
In the actual proceedings before thn 
State Commission and Mr. Thoren’* 
reference to this phase of the pro­
ceedings Is only Incidental, It may ho 
stated that the developments at Lan­
sing make It clear that, no matter 
whfit may be the final outcome In tho 
phone rate henring. It was most ad­
visable for Michigan munlcipnlitie st 
Join in sending repreentatives to Lart- 
Hkng, for the solid front they there 
presented makes it curtain that tho 
telephone company will have "to 
show cause" for every concession It 
seeks.

Mr. Tlmren’s report Is as follows:
To the Honorable Mayor and Com­

mon Council of the City of Negaunee, 
Gentlemen:

! herewith submit a brief summary 
of my (rip to Lansing to attend tho 
hearing on January 21, In the Matter 
of the Application of the Michigan 
State Telephone Company for Au­
thority to Standardize the rates, rent­
als und charges in all its exchange* 
In the state of Michigan, other Hum 
tho Detroit exchange.

While It was known that people of 
the state were considerably wrought 
up over the proposed Increase In tlm 
cost of telephone service, the number 
of those who were right on the spot 
at the opening of the hearing asking 
to he "shown" exceeded the most ex­
travagant expectation. There are 181. 
telephone exchanges In Michlgun ami 
the patrons of at least three-fourth* 
of those were reproonted by counsel, 
eflher elly or village attorneys or 
counsel specially retnined for that 
purpose. The Commission's quarter* 
in the Oakman Building were les* 
than half inrge enough to conven­
iently accommodate tint vast array of 
counsel with tho result that a num­
ber were obliged to stand In the aisle* 
u>id Jn the doorways to get within 
earshot of the witnesses.

Chairman Reiser opened the hear­
ing with a comprehensive statement 
of petitioner's claim and outlined tho 
rules to govern the conduct of tho 
investigation. The petitioner wa* 
to put in Its case after which ad­
journment was to he taken to give 
ample opprtunlty for transcribing Urn 
testimony and making copies thoreot 
nnd of the exhibits for distribution, 
umong counsel for the municipalities.

The hearing continued for two 
days and lifter .'\ve witnesses had 
been examined, an udjourument wax 
taken until February 19, at which 
thno tho Telephone Company will put 
In such further testimony as it lm* 
to offer, Tlmre will lben lm still 
another adjournment togivn tin* pub­
lic sufficient time to work up Its 
case.

Front my experience at Lansing f 
am firmly convinced that the Com- 
nilssloii'H findings will bit In aeeonl 
with the Just rights of both parties.
I have formed this opinion because 
of the able personnel of the Commis­
sion mid Hu> determination of Him 
parties In Interest to overlook noth­
ing In tlx1 preparation and presenta­
tion of their respective interests.

Before leaving Lansing ilm attor­
neys for the Upper I’enJnsi/ia held u 
meeting to discuss the modus oper­
and! at the xubcqmml bearings. 
While many valuable suggestions 
were offered at this meeting it was 
not deemed advisable to determine 
upon a line of aeilon tiptll Hu* Tele­
phone Company rested the ease,

I would suggest (hat the inunlel* 
palllles of Hie county pool their hi* 
lerests and agree upon' some attorney 
to handle Hie matter for the people 
of Hie county as a whole. For this 
work I know of no one belter quali­
fied Hum Mr. Bell who with the un­
dersigned represented this city at th« 
hearing. Mr. Bell will attend Ho- 
next hearing and will bo doubt have 
something of Interest to report at lie* 
next regular meeting of this council.

I also attended a meeting on tho 
evening of January 2b called "for thn 
purpose of perfecting an organization 
of tlm City Attorneys of this state." 
The session had not progressed very 
far before It became evident that tho 
sponsors for the movement were moto 
keen upon landing a retainer In tho 
Telephone Hearing than discussing 
matters contemplated by the call. 
Needless to say tiiat Hie meeting fell 
fiat. It Is unfortunate that consider­
ations of personal gain hould have 
queered such a laudable undertaking, 
for there is no doubt that if Hie legal 
advisors of the different iminlelpull- 
Hes could occasionally get together 
for a discussion of their problems, 
suggestions w'ould be offered which 
would prove of Immense value, net 
only to Hm (Tty Attorney but to tho 
IIHIII lei pH I Ity Itself. Respeel fully,

T. A. THOREN. City Attorney.

John Merten, ’ fat her of former 
resident Fr» d J, Merten, He* plumber, 
I- reported critically III at He homo 
of ids sou In iMikosh, WD,



N E G A U N E E  I R O N  H E R A L D

GAS MEN PLAY A BIG 
PART IN WINNING WAR

Ten Thousand Soldiers Toil 
Turning Out Shells to Rout 

Germans.

at

MANY ARE INJURED AT WORK
Edgewood Arsenal In Maryland Won

Place of Leadership Over Allies In
Scientific Progress and Dead* 

liness of Output—Gas Fac- 
tory City In Itself.

ItnHlinoro, Mil.— While I ho men who 
have boon working In shipyards and 
munition plants have received Just 
praise for their fulfillment of patriotic 
duty, then? Ik an army of men 10,000 
at rung who have worked faithfully, 
eurefully screened from public notice, 
performing some of* tin* most Impor­
tant work of the war, work which was 
largely responsible for the early sign­
ing of the armlsllee. \vho have re­
ceived no recognition at all.

Pay after day they have seeretly 
worked In tin* manufacture of the poi­
sonous gases which muted the Hunt* 
and Impressed upon the (ioniums the 
Ingenuity and resourcefulness of the 
American brain.

Those men of the Kdgewood arsenal 
stayed, on American still, never had the 
excitement of ipi ocean voyage or ad­
venture in a foreign country or the 
hero-worship of those who have been 
overseas, mid yet while staying right 
In this nomiry they ran greater risks 
than minty of the men on the llrlttg 
line.

300 at One Time in Hospital.
Tht‘ hospital at Kdgewood Is nmv 

occupied by "UP mint who have been 
gassed or hunted while about their 
country’s work. Then* have been ns 
grear heroes at Kdgewood as on tin1 
hnttlellcld. There is In the hospital 
a blue-eyed hoy in curly manhood, 
smiling hrnvely through sears which 
are today as vivid as the lirst day. 
months ugu. when they brought him, 
u \Vrlthlng Idt of humanity, to the 
hospital. Nor Is lie the only one. There 
are others, some of whom have been 
gassed twice and thrice and tire today 
invalided In Colorado, having devel­
oped tuberculosis.

Hundreds of others are maimed and 
will ulwuys bear the murks of their 
sacrifice for Uncle Sam. which they 
gave so gladly without any of the 
glory, stripes, promotion or encourage- 
nient given to the men In the camps 
an<1 trenches.

The signing of the armistice has 
made It possible for the public to linva 
the first insight Into the vast work 
which Inis been accomplished at .the 
Kdgewood arsenal, where lias been 
manufactured unit shipped safely 
"over them” more gas limn has been 
made hy Ktighind and Krtinee com­
bined. Fur removed from prying eyes, 
these lltoiisunds of men have produced 
gases which will go down in history 
as among the grottiest achievements of 
the war.

Gaa Factory a City In Itself.
Where on October 1H. HH7. stood a 

Imre waste of forest, now slainlA wlmt 
Is a Niimll manufacturing town and a 
city In Its activities. drent chemical, 
plants have risen with lightning rapid­
ity, There are tin* ehlnrlne, phosgene, 
rhlnrnlln and mustard gas phials, and 
thru down near tin- water the large 
tilling plnitl where Hie Idg shells were 
tilled wllh deadly poisons and sent on 
their errand of freeing hunmiilty.

Kdgewood urseijitl '•overs a irnel of 
Jtoo acres, adjoining Its companion 
unit, the great Aberdeen proving 
grounds, when1 the biggest of the big 
guns were tried nut tlml were de­
signed to smash Hie strongest of Her- 
mttn fortltleiiilniis. At the nrseiml 
these results, It was eontldeatly pre­
dicted. would he more effectively se­
cured, and certainly at Himillcr hu­
man cost, hy the gas products which

wouldIt was confidently declared 
smother the Metz forts.

Upon these INN) acres have been con­
structed a large number of Immense 
chemical plants with the necessary ad- 
Janets, all on an extensive scale, con­
nected hy ,T) miles of railway, oper­
ated hy United States army crews, 
working three shifts a day. At first 
It was attempted to run the arsenal 
with civilian labor, hut the hazardous 
character of the employment made this 
class of employee so uncertaih, al­
though fancy wages were offered, that 
It became necessary to use enlisted 
men exclusively throughout the plant.

Tin* result Ims been that work of 
a highly specialized nature am) extra 
hazardous has been done hy men re­
ceiving from SSO a month up. mid un­
der rigorous military discipline.

The research laboratory work of the 
arsenal lias been highly fruitful and 
the gases of the Hermans are said to 
he mild In comparison with the more 
terrible products of Kdgewood. of 
which the O rm ans tuid only got a 
foretaste when the armistice was 
signed.
"Came to Teach, Remain to Learn."*
Two experts, (’ohmol Auld and Cap­

tain Hmikar, one sent from Kngland 
and I he other front France, to old In 
the establishment of toxic gas plants, 
wild on leaving: "We enme to teach, 
hut we remain to learn.”

The Central Const met Ion corpora­
tion received a contract In October, 
1017. for the construction of a gas 
shell tilling plant at Kdgewood, under 
(he Immediate supervision of

gymnasium 
sns here, the ban having been 
one of the first rules placed ijy 
the authorities recently. Here­
after all girls in the gym classes 
must wear cotton stockings. The 
new rule Is made In the interest 
of uniformity, economy and de­
mocracy.
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(now Incut. (\d.) Kdwin M. Chance. 
Hum connected with the ordnance de­
partment.

It soon became quite evident that 
more Hum one gas shell tilling unit 
would bo required. It was also ap­
parent that experimental work neces- 
sarlTy had to he carried on In connec­
tion with construction on a somewhat 
ehibonitc scale In the first unit, both 
of which circumstances caused the 
pressure on the entire situation to be 
rapidly Increased, hence the contract­
or's organization, as well ns the mili­
tary personnel, began to Increase rap­
idly early in the present year, until at 
the height of Its operation the con­
struction corporation had approximate­
ly (1.000 men In Its employ; new camp 
buildings and mess halts were con­
structed al top speed.

When we saved salt last winter we 
helped swell the amount needed for 
the making of chlorine, of which It 
is the foundation. This plant produced 
100 tons of chlorine and 112 tons of 
fused caustic soda a day. making one 
of the largest single plants of its kind 
in the country. For (he first time vis­

itors—a party of business men—were 
allowed through, the plant last week 
mul they saw one of the commonest of 
table supplies, salt, being made Into 
one of the most fata! poisons. This 
chloric gas passes from F.,r»fi2 electro­
lytic cells, Is dried hy sulphuric add 
and pumped to the chemical plant#. 
Dry chloric gas Is bubbled Into the 
common suiphur In tanks and become* 
a bnalt* raw material in the production 
of mustard gas, which was one of tho 
deadliest weapons used to win tlu. 
war.

Then there Is the phosgene plnnt. 
Here coke Is received hy rail und 
burned hy n common steam boiler. 
Pure oxygen, obtained from liquid alt 
and carbon dioxide, are passed togeth­
er through red-hot coke producing car­
bon monoxide. Dry chlorine gas and 
carbon monoxide are suitably mixed, 
and hy passing over n catalyzer, con­
verted to form gaseous phosgene. The 
‘liquid phosgene Is filled Into one-ton 
containers for overseas shipment and 
was tie* gas most largely used In the 
war.

(’hlorpgorln. one of the commonest 
('apt. ' war gases Is another product of l$dge-

wood and was produced at Hie rate of 
,‘10 tons a day.

Filing plants are another Important 
feature of the arsenal. Here shells 
are received by rail ami inspected. 
Phosgene, chlorpgorln and mustard gas 
are received from the chemical plant. 
Other war gases are obtained from 
outside plants hy rail. The capacity 
of these plants Is more than 12f>,000 
containers a day. The ventilation Is 
such that men In direct contact with 
the liquid gus lire not required to wear 
masks. The filled shells are returned 
from filling machines and are classi­
fied by weight and stored one Hay ns a 
test for leakage, They are then paint­
ed gray and striped, the numbers and 
colors of the stripes indicating the na­
ture of the gas within the shell. Here 
the drums, whose range is approxi­
mately 1,700 yards, are filled with the 
fatal gases, Tin? grenades are tilled 
hy hand with stannic chloride and are 
used especially in clearing dugouts. 
Others are tilled with white phosphor­
us und are used in the production of 
smoke screens In connection wllh the 
concealment of troops.

M’NULTYS’ DEEDS WIN 
THEM LASTING FAME

Washington.—Wlmt’* in the name 
.McNulty?

The encyclopedia Is silent concern­
ing Us origin, but two marines of that 
iiiiini*, who probably did not even know 
one another, had lives that were near­
ly parallel lo one another, and both 
distinguished themselves us heroes oil 
the hutllefieldH of France. Which is 
Indicative ilint the sum* lighting Idood 
courses In tlie veins of these McNulty* 
from an ancestry that was doubtlessly 
Irish.

Their mime* were nearly alike— 
Thomas .Inhu McNulty mid .loliu Mc­
Nulty, They wen* both In tin* be­
ginning of their forties—they were 
both In tin* marine corps—-they were 
both first sergeants—and holh had 
seen 111 years of service under the 
Stars and Stripes. Moreover, both 
fought In tin* same hattlcs In France 
and both wen* seriously wounded. 
Ami Hie climactic result of this strange

PRESIDENT WILSON AND MME. POINCARE
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Pimaldcip Wilson and Mine. Poincare, wife of Hie French president, head- 
g a procession leaving the railway station a I Purls, President Poincare Is 
town behind President Wilson with Mrs. Wilson.

parallel was that both distinguished 
themselves ns heroes almost at Hie 
same time. John was awarded the 
distinguished service ernsr, and Thom­
as was cited for distinguished service.

Hut here the parallel censes and 
things begin to take opposites. Thom­
as John enlisted In San Francisco, and 
It wus at Hie oilier side of tin* couth 
item—Norfolk, Vn. that John enlist­
ed. Thomas John was horn In Amer­
ica and John In Kngland. Thomas 
John wus first sergeant of the Sixty- 
sixth company of imirlncs and John 
was Hu* first sergeuul nf tin* Seventy- 
seventh company.

i It was In Hie marines' great fight 
|at Hellenu Wood that First Sergt. 
Thomas John McNulty won his fame 
ami subsequent citation. lie led Ids 
company of men In a daring charge 
across a field of popples against Del* 
lean Wood, whence Herman machine 
guns poured death* Into thi*lr midst. 
His grim shouts of encouragement 
cheered them on to victory until Ills 
voice wits silenced hy lend and lie fell 
seriously wounded amid Hie blossoms.

Hut his was a hardihood that could 
not die hy any sudden means. Upon 
Ills recovery In* Joined a replacement 
haltallou and was In the heat of sub­
sequent battles up to the time the 
armistice went Into effect, lie Inis u 
failicr, Patrick McNulty, living at No. 
Idl'l Unmet street, Scranton, Pu.

Extraordinary Harolam.
First Hcrgt. John McNulty wua 

awarded his cross for extraordinary 
heroism In the fighting between IIIiidc- 
Mont and Salat Ktlenne. Under a 
heavy artillery and machlno-gun fire 
that rolled forward with a German 
counter-attack he stuck hy hla machine 
gun. Kvcry man of tils gun crew wus 
shot down beside him, hut hu stuck. 
Shot after shot burrowed Its way into 
his vltnls, hut still he stuck to Ills ma­
chine gun with n tenacity Hint could 
only be broken with death mid a re- 
gard Hint he did not have for his life, 

ill was at o moment when It seemed 
1 dial Ills Iron power of will was soon 
lo have no living laxly lo direct Hint 

* Hu* Herman attack was heaten off, mid 
First Scrgcnul McNulty laid his head 
oti tlx* ground exhausted. Kveu then 
he stuck h.v Ills gun. and it was only 
when ordered to the rear hy Ills com­
manding nUlcer that he finally retired.

; "Ile was mi Inspiring example to Ids 
men,” according to memoranda In con­
nection with his being awarded the 
distinguished service cross.

Mis mother Is Mrs. June A. Wilson, 
oho lives at No. I,’ Dindi\.o<>d street. 
Uevere, Muss.

AMERICAN NAVAL AIR STATION IN IRELAND
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This photograph, taken from an airplane, shows one id Hu* Aim rlcan naval air stations In Ireland. It wus 
here that Hie hydroplanes that guarded the coast of Ireland and hunted U-boats came.

WOUNDED YANKS SIGHTSEEING IN LONDON

i

from

A few of the wounded.American hoys on a sightseeing tour of Louden after llielr luiriUhlp* In the battles In 
Fruuce. They are feeding pigeons on St. Paul's ting. This tour wax conducted hy the Ited (.'mss, and ouch ono of 
the hoys has u Ited Cross lag on him.

KILLED THE “ EMPEROR OF THE SAHARA” KEEPS HER PETIN THE 200

A late photograph id' Mis. Jiietpies l.ehaudy, who slew her mldlonulr» 
liushund at her home hi Wcsihury, I,. I., she says, to protect herself and 
^.lighter Jacqueline, who Is shown hero with her. Lehaudy, self-styled 
“emperor of the Sahara,'' was the noii of the. "sugar king” of Fruuce.

DESTROYERS RETURN FROM OVERSEAS
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A Heel of destroyers Ims just returned to the Charleston navy yard after 
being overseas for more than a year. Due of Ho* ships, tin* Tucker, sank a 
U-boat, mid displays a huge shir on one of Hu* funnel* ,i» evidence ot the 
victory.

There nru certain thoughtful Indi­
viduals who nialntuiu that n goldfish 
Is the only proper pet for cljy dwel­
lers. Tho Counted* do Sulvorto do­
mesticated n delightful Hon cub, hut 
tho ungrateful little brute behaved so 
badly thut tho countess hud to securo 
him an apartment at tho zoo, where 
she visits him dally.

Topical Church Windows.
Ono does not usually URsnchito 

church windows with lltumlmitlons of 
a topical nature, hut there are sev­
eral to be found sentterfd about In dif­
ferent parts or the country. In Kng­
land there Is it window connected with 
Hying. This Is u recently built eliureli. 
so It Is, perhaps, not so surprising as 
some. Another Is u topographical 
window. It Is <i memorial window to 
i church warden mid In the lower pan­
els are some quite good ami recognized 
pictures. Perhaps the most remark- 
aide cam* in lids connection In to he 
found at Stoki* Poges church, which 
contains a “bicycle" window, This 
may. of course. h<> mi attempt to show 
one or the other of the lUhlleuI »'v1- 
slons." Tin* reiimrkahlc thing about 

| It Is Hint the window was imulo u* far 
j burl, :'•* the sexenieeuth <*, ;;M:r\
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AMERICAN PRINCESS OF WALES?
Thu mntrimontul fulurei of the 

priori1 of Wales Is much discussed in 
London Him* days. The Doily Express, 
for Instance, recently devoted two col­
umns to the subject, pointing out tlmt 
I In* war 1ms narrowed tin* choice for 
tin* royal marriage. There is no pos­
sibility now of a German princess be­
coming queen of England, and n vast 
tragedy has obliterated Ihe Uusslan 
royul fmully.

As 'regards marriageable prin­
cesses In other European countries, 
the Express says that J'rlncess Yo- 
landa of Italy Ik Ineligible on religious 
grounds. Princess Helena of Greece 
Is no longer talked of us the future 
queen, and although one of the ltou- 
manlan princesses might he chosen, 
the prospect would arouse little on* 
thuslasin.

“The fact Is," Rays (he Express, 
“that there Is a keen desire that tin* 
prince shall he allowed to choose for 

himself a British wife—If npt an American. Ills marriage with a British 
bride would be exceedingly popular. If ho should choose an American bride, 
the enthusiasm on both sides of the Atlnntle would be unbounded, und dra­
matic possibilities would he opened up.

“The example would be Infectious, and there is no telling whore the con­
sequences would end."

The Express says the Idea of royal caste marrying within Itself Is no 
pnrt of English law and forms no written pnrt of any continental constitution.

"There Is nothing whatever to prevent King George giving his consent 
to the marriage of the prince of Wales to anybody who Is not a ltoinan 
Catholic," It adds.

PLEA FOR DISCHARGED WOMEN
“Thousands of women will auto­

matically step out of positions and 
part with pay envelopes as each home­
coming troopsblp#dlschurges Its human 
freight on our shores. It Is the busi­
ness of this country to sue that those 
women are protected In their retire­
ment and that an exchange to another 
industrial front be effected without ap­
preciable loss to the puy envelope."

Mrs. Currie Chapman Cntt, nation­
al suffrage president, thus summed up 
recently the threefold problem of the 
readjustment of the labor situation 
from the war to the peaco basis.

“We ore entering our protest 
against dlschargo of women “without 
proper warning and without help In 
finding other positions. We have asked 
the federul employment agencies es­
tablished throughout the country to 
find work for Bohllers to do the same 
for women. Our state suffruge'asso­
ciations act as* our local representa­
tives In bringing pressure to bear and the national association uses what 
federal influence it can command. Our state associations also Investigate 
special cuses. .

“Should there he failure to act on the part of the federal employment 
agencies It may become ncccssury to call together the organisations now 
working on the different phases of the reconstruction of industry as they 
affect women. The Women's Trade Union league concerns Itself with the 
wuge scale and conditions of iubor. The Young Women's Christian associa­
tion specializes on the care of women out of positions. Others uttack the 
question ‘from different ungles."

WHERE ROOSEVELT SLEEPS HIS LAST SLEEP.
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This Ik Young’s .Memorial cemetery at Oyster Boy, N. Y.. wlirio the body of Theodore lloosuvclt was Interred 
•after simple services. Inset is it portrait of Itev. Or. George E. Talmudgo, pastor of Christ Episcopal church, who 

conducted the ceremony.

WIPING OUT ALL 
TRACES OF WAR 1

$  SYMPATHETIC TWINS

Thrifty French Already Cleaning 
Up Battle Ground to 

Plant Grain.

TASK MOST DIFFICULT ODE

LIEUT. RENE FONCK IS COMING
Lieut. Itene Fonek, the French uc© 

of aces, Is soon to visit the United 
States. Lieutenant Fonek Is the In­
credible youngster of twenty-four who 
winged 125 German flyers (luring the 
war, 70 of them, olllelnlly scored and 
within the French lines.

You umy expect to see u slim and 
wiry chap with the flaming* ©yes of u 
fanatic, yearning for the ahnormul. 
ltuf he Is not tike tlmt. He Is rather 
a rqunt hoy, with broad shoulders, 
grave features, steady, serious eyes, 
und a large head full (|f common sense 
—In appearance exactly what he was 
before the war, a village schoolboy la 
the Vosges with a knack for machin­
ery. Jle is a good hoy, more jealous 
of Ids reputation us a clean man than 
of his fame as a scourge of the skies.

A vast ninlion, he says, explains 
Ills success as an airman, u caution 
temporal by confidence, Unusual eyes, 
an uncanny facility In marksmanship, 

a gift of discovering JiU opponent's weaknesses, n constant variation of Ut* 
ties, novor fighting twice in the sinno way, und u paradoxical and scrupulous 
prudoneo uro in his list of assets.

CHIEF OF CHILDREN’S BUREAU
“The time has come when tin*

Athol© subject of child labor should he 
considered anew with reference to ed- 
iicatlon ns Ihe most effective and 
nyifltublc means of control," Miss 
fulln Luthrop declared In her annual 
report as chief of tin* children's bu­
reau. In eo-operytion with state ofil- 
rials, the bureau Is preparing a plan 
i t  uniform reporting on work eertlll- 
rates Issued to children in slates hav­
ing certificate requirements, which, It\ 
n believed, will furnish much valuahlu 
nfornijillon regarding child labor.

More than 0,500.000 children have 
been weighed und graded In the lm- 
van's children year campaign to save 
\t least 100,000 Imhles who die from 
[irevcutahle diseases. The report mild 
widespread Interest wus being shown 
in the cumpnlgn and many eminent 
physicians were giving I heir services 
to aid in raising the physical standard.
Public health nurses and adequate 
care for mothers and Infants were urged by the bureau. Juvenile delinquency 
was Increased In many cities by war conditions. Especially notable was the 
growth in the number of cuses of carrying concealed weapons.

Removing of Barbed Wire Entangle­
ments la No Easy Matter—Nar­

row Gauge Railways Being 
Torn Up and Trenches

Filled In.

Paris.—Eradication of nil traces of 
the 02 months’ wur bus already begun 
everywhere along the old stationary 
front which tuurked the line of the op­
posing armies since the inception of a 
war of position.

Barbed wire entanglements are be­
ing torn up, trenches are being filled 
In, camouflage is being taken down, 
narrow-gauge railways removed, and 
shell dumps and other depots for ma­
terial being transported away.

This Is the first time that uny field 
fortifications have been permitted to  
be touched by the civilian population. 
Even ufter the Germans hud been 
driven from the Chateau Thierry re­
gion south of the Mnrne to north of 
the Vesle, the military authorities re­
fused to permit burbed wire to be 
taken up or earthworks filled in.

In most cases tills work Is being 
done by civilians, but everywhere with 
the releuse of the older classes of 
French soldiers and the numerous re- 
formes—wounded discharged from the 
army—there are enough men familiar 
with field works to supervise the re­
moval of them.

Difficult Work.
It is no eusy matter for the novice 

to pull up barbed wire, mid In pluccs, 
particularly In the Juvigny region 
north of the Alsne. where the Thirty- 
second division fought with Genera) 
Mnngin’s superb Tenth army and won 
for themselves the sobriquet of "The 
Tigers," the entanglements cover hun­
dreds of acres; the belts being hun­
dreds of yards In depth. Tills wire 
datos back from September, HIM, and 
Is rusty ami dangerous to bundle, 
owing to the presence of tetanus mi­
crobes, The newer “ginnt German 
wire," the si muds of which an* n 
quarter of an Inch thick and which 
bristle with barbs, is equally hard to 
remove.

The old wide trenches which wen* 
In vogue curlier ii? the war before lie* 
development of ilic mlncnwcrfcr us an 
accurate piece of onlnauee, arc lim'd 
to till hi, as tltclr parapets have been 
washed away by rains and blasted to 
tills of shellfire. They art* like gnat 
ditches, furrowing the earili In every 
til reel Ion. The newer, narrower 
trenches, shored with limber and pro­
vided with dueldinnrd Moors ait* easier 
to fill In. Tin* thrifty I'Toneh first pull 
out the shoring and let the ndn act 
on the treiiehos fog a eoU|1le of weeks 
in which lime they Invariably fall in. 
then they shove? wver the top, smooth­
ing It off.

No attempts an* made to fill la tlie 
(logouts, the cntmiircN merely being 
hoarded up and covered over. Iti 
'unity of those German (logouts there 
are Infernal machines and man traps 
likely to explode when tin* first per­
son enters. Loose hoards on the stall's 
>r hits of string stretched across the 
entrance set off explosives. In many 
dber "dilgouts there an* enrpses of 
' •lends or foes, killed underground l»,\ 
bombs burled down the exits.

All roads In the zone where ĥe op 
posing armies him* swayed hack and 
forth are lined with fox holes, as the 
Aiuerlenn doughboys call the liny 
shelter eaves they are taught to dig 
with bayonets and mess kits and 
which provide such wonderful shelter 
iiguhist shrapnel. Everywhere In Hie 
belt of tcrruln marking the extreme 
limits of the passage of the fighting 
troops there nre endless rows of these 
fox boles dug Into the ditches beside

the roads. They tell the silent tales 
of bodies of troops on the march spied 
out by enemy airplanes or captive bal­
loons and cuught under concentrated 
fire by many batteries. Then the men 
nre ordered to tuku cover, and since 
there Is none to take they must Im­
provise their own shelter.

It Is a remurkable sight to see how 
fust n soldier can dig a cuvc thut will 
shelter his body with no implements 
but a bayonet and mess kit. They 
loosen the earth with the buyonet and 
scoop it out with the big, long-handled 
tin cup, sometimes working with the 
skillet in the other hand.

Only light, Decuuvllle railways are 
being taken up, all standard gauge 
lines which huve been laid since the 
war remaining in position until such 
time as the administration determines 
wlmt shall he done with them.

Few pieces of artillery remain iu 
their emplacements, nearly all of those 
which were overlooked in capture dur­
ing uttacks having been drugged out
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Is stricken too. Recently Ben­
jamin, who Is a soldier In the 
army overseas, wus taken to a 
base hospital suffering from an 
uttuck of Spanish Influenza. 
Here at home at the same time 
Henry wus also down with (he 
Influenza.% Influenza. - £

of their pits and pluced In the public 
square of the nearest French town or 
vllluge. But there are still hundreds 
of thousands of live shells, hand 
grenades and millions of rounds of 
small arms ammunition lying about 
everywhere. The earth Is pitted with 
holes made by “duds" which tnuy ex­
plode the first time the farmer's plow 
strikes against them.

Despite thut, however, the thrifty 
French are cleunlng up their country, 
preparing for the sowing of crops next 
spring.

ONLY RICH DRINK
Maine Woodsmen Now Have to Pay 

$5 for Pint of 
Whisky.

Bangor, Me.—Wur, which used up so 
much alcohol und starved the distil­
leries, and the bone-dry law uffecting 
the shipment of liquors from wet Into 
dry territory, huve made anything like 
wurni sSclublllty, let alone hllurlt; 
impossible in Mnlne to uny save 
wealthy.

In the olden days a woodsman or a 
sullor went Into u Bangor bar (and at

•lty,
the

WINS SERVICE CROSS

one time there were 181, Including 
seven varieties to choose from), laid 
down a dime and took a drink of what 
could easily be Identified as whisky.

But now a drink of whisky is served 
with Bluck Hnnd secrecy, and many a 
wink and whisper of cuutlon in some 
dugout up nn alley, or maybe taken in 

j a dark hallwuy from the dirty glass of 
j a bootlegger, and costs 25 to 40 cents, 
while a liulf pint costs $2 to $2.50, a 
pint $4 to $5, and n quart $0 to $10, 
according to quality, time am) place. 
There seems to lie plenty of whisky, 
or near whisky, here and elsewhere In 
Maine, but the high cost of drinking 
has driven common folks out of the 
market.

‘COUNT’ ADMITS ‘GOOD LOOKS’
Doclares Widow Who Charges $24,000 

Theft Made Love to
Him.

Now York.—Louis Alheriliy, known 
ns “Count" ChiiIcI Hein, on trial before 
.Judge Muiquci'ti In general sessions, 
eimrgetl with the Inreeny of $21,000 
from Mrs. Anna Hndeh, a Newark (N. 
J.) widow, wlm asserts In* went 
through a fake wedding ceremony with 
her, denies all In i' charges.

Mrs. Gruleh testified tin* "count" 
laadi* ardent love to her. Tin* “count" 
swore she made tie* same brand of 
love tp him. unsought. Sin* said she 
believed In* was single. Il(* asserted 
she knew all the time he was married 
•>nd "went up In tin* air" whoa lie 
threatened to leave her.

Th<* "count" added tlmt she became 
Infatuated with iiliu on ueeomil of 
what lie admitted to he Ills "good 
looks;" that she gave him as pres- 
elds, In iinimintH of Sion to $250 a 
week, the money tie is alleged In have 
taken from her; that she Invited hint 
to Newark and offered to start him hi 
business and threatened him when he 
refused.

I'liuplelii Tin-uni' S>.unit o; Hie 
Episcopal church at Siiginaw, Ml'h.. 
arrived In*New York recently from 
England. Ciiapliilh Swann was 
awarded the distinguished servlet* 
cross for extraordinary heroism In 
action id the Marne amt Vesle rivers 
during the first two weeks In August. 
He was in the front line trenches ad­
ministering to sick and wounded sol­
diers, and on one occuiion weut over 
the top 200 yards under heavy fire to 
cencuo two wounded doughboys.

MAN MISSING MANY YEARS
Found Wandering About Boston, a Vic­

tim of Aphasia, He la Identified 
by Family.

Boston.— An aged man was found 
i wandering In Hie Smith end in a daze. 
He was a victim ef ajOiusla. Ills cloth- 

1 lug or pockets had nothing to aid in 
(he Identification. Newspapers pub­
lished a description of the tnaii ami 
bis photograph. Alter three weeks lie 
was restored to virtimlly normal con­
dition, but was iiiuihlo to t«*|| the hos­
pital physicians his mime nr address. 
Mrs. J. 11. Borofsky of East Boston 
suw the description In Ihe newspapers, 
went to the hospital and Identified the 
man as her futhcr, for whom she said 
her family hud beta searching uiouj 
vearr

WOMEN OF 
MIDDLE AGE

Need Help to Pats the Crisis Safe* 
ly—Proof that Lydia E. Pink* 

ham’s Vegetable Compound
Can be Relied Upon.

■

Urbans, 111.—‘‘During Change of Life- 
In addition to ita annoying symptoms, I 

bad an attack of 
grippe which lasted 
all winter and left 
me in a weakened 
condition. X felt at 
times that I would 
never bewella^ain.
I read of Lydia & 

iPinkham's v e g e ­
t a b l e  Compound 
lnnd what it did for 
women p as  s in g  
through the Change 
of Life, so I told my 
doctor I would try 
i t  I soon began to 
gain in s tre n g th  
and the annoying 

■pv(VnnnFnniiiii!ii* sym ptom s d is ­
appeared and your Vegetaolc Compound 
has made me a well, strong woman so 
I do all my own housework. I cannot 
recommend Lydia E. Pinkham’s Vege­
table Compound too highly to women 
passing through the Change of Life. 
—Mrs.Frank Henson, 1310 S. Orchade 
S t ,  Urbana, 111.

Women who suffer from nervousness, 
“heat flashes," backache, headaches 
and " the  blues" should try this famous 
root and herb remedy, Lydia E. Fink- 
ham's Vegetable Compound.

Famous Window.
As soon as sufficient skilled labor Is 

available the famous Flemish window 
In St. Margaret’s, Westminster, Lon­
don. will be replaced. The window 
was removed owing to the fear of 
dmnnge during air raids, and Ims been 
stored In the abbey crypt.

BOSCHEE’S SYRUP
Why use ordinary cough remedies 

when Uoschce’H Syrup has been used 
so successfully for fifty-one years in 
all .parts of the United States for 
coughs, bronchitis, colds settled In the 
throat, especially lung troubles? It 
gives th( patient a good night’s rest, 
free from coughing, with easy expec­
toration in the morning, gives nature 
a chance to soothe the inflamed parts, 
throw off thf disease, helping the pa­
tient to regain his health. Made in 
America and sold for more than half 
a century.—Adv.

Poor Hubby!
Lady—“What is your aim in life, rny 

good woman?" Good Woman—"Me 
’ustmnd, gen’rnlly."

Important to Mother#
Examine carefully every bottle of 

CASTOIUA, that famous old remedy 
for Infants and children, and see that It

Bears the 
Signature of|
In Use for Over 80 Years.
Children Cry for Fletcher’s Gastons

Love and a good dinner ure good 
workers In the field of charity.

All men are good—good for some­
thing or uood for nothing.

Confined to Her Bed 
Days at a Time

Bat Doan's Brought a Quick 
and Lasting Cure.

M r * .  IT c rrm n n  Ilu a rh k e . 177 F o u r th  
8t . .  L o n g  in la n d  L i l y ,  N . Y .,  w iy i :  
" T h e  pum a in  n iy  back were a lm oa t 
unbearab le . 1 u lw nya fe l t  t i re d  and  
h u llo **  und  {m in d  i t  almoHt impoHnihle 
to  u tte u d  to  m y  hnuxcw ork . G ra d u a lly  
th e  p a in *  increuMcd -day  by duy m y *u i*  
lu r in g  became w o rn 1. O f­
te n  (Iu k Ik** o f  l ia h t  and 
h liii- l. speck* w o u ld  a p ­
pear be fo re  m y  eye* and 
d i / i y  t-p r ll*  w o u ld  come 
o \e r  m u. M y  h a n d * n il 
fee w ere  hw o IIch  and m y 
head pa ined  mu ho a t 
limeH ] l b o u g h t i t  w ou ld
s p lit .  M y  k id n e y *  un 
t io )c d  me, too . 
cinoe (Icxpondent. 
tim e * 1 w ou ld  have to  take  to  m y 1)0(1 
fo r  th re e  o r  fo u r  day.i a t a tim e . I  
had th e  good fo rh in u  to  hear of 
t im in 'a  h ' i t t n r y  P i t ta , ho 1 began us­
ing  th e m  and wuk noon hack in  p e r. 
feet h e a lth  aga in . M y cure ha* a loud 
tin * le n t o f to n e , h i  I am on ly  to o  g lad 
to  recom m end D o lin '*  to  o th e r k idney  
H iiffc ri i> ."

M i* .  KuHchke gave th e  above Hlnte- 
i i ie n t in  A p r i l ,  lU ltl, and on A p r i l  4. 
1017, hIk* added : " I  g lad ly  repeat a il 
1 have un i'l about Im nn 'a  f f b f n e i /  
J*l t ta , fo r  th e y  h a w  r i i / c d  me o f  k id ­
ney c o m p la in t ."

G*t Dm i 'i  i t  A«r Store, S0e i  Bo*

D O A N ' S  “pT.rLV
FOSTERMIL4URN CO.. BUPf ALO, N. Y.

* U” Mu. KuicMtcHome-

YOU GANT CUT OUT TffOROUGNPfH
but you can clean them off promptly with

A B S O R B IN G
* *  • TRAOC

and you work the horse tame time. 
Does not blister or remove die 
hair. $2. SO per bottle, delivered. 
Will tell you mors if you write. 
Book 4 K free. ADSORiilNE. JK. 
the antiaeptic liniment for mankind, 
reduce! Varicoie Vein*, Ruptured
M'lKlwof UiMMnti. Rnltited flfinrfi. Wmi, 
Cr*n Allaripalnqulcklr. eocr 11-25 • bvitli 

•t dniultu or delivered. Med' In the U. S. A. by
W. P.Y0UN0.P. 0. F..»10T«*'lell .lorinsttalii. Maaa.

Use G u ticu ra  Soup  

T o  C le a r  Y o u r S k in
All Sreatata; So»» tt.  O 'ntatM t V A Bfl. Taloam P. 

i u k  fra* of ” Pm*kti«, tw»t I ,  Saata* "
r



—  PUHLIftHKh BY —

T H E  NEGAUNEE P R IN T IN G  COMPANY,

THOMAHJ. KI.YNN, President

KKKI) 1M)C<»HEKTY.
Treasurer and Managing Kdltor.

Korucri m o v .  I’.MiO P er  Year

Eotered as mall matter of the w orm  Has* 
ID Hie I'oxlotTtee *1 Aegfttifiet. Mtch.

F r i d a y ,  F e b .  2 1 ,  1 9 1 9 .

your silver xu*r«! May food eye* welcome yon, 
willing feet follow von, Mroug hand* rteteod 
you, wnrio liearfx cherish yon, and d\Hik 
lip« tf»v« you their blexxiag! our* by 
inheritance, ours by allegiance, our*

<>y affection -long may you float on ' 
ttie free wind* of heaven, the 

eiinleni of llhenv, (lie 
hope of the world

-A non.

OFF FOR BOYS* CONFERENCE

Negaunee Delegation Carries Invita­
tion for 1920 Meet

William Maas, William Haldle, Al­
exander Maitland, Daniel Suess, John 
Uakenjos and Theodore Storey left 
this morning for Ironwood, where 
they will represent organizations of 
the Negaunee high school at the Up­
per Peninsula Older Boys’ Conference, 
which Is to he held in the Gogebic 
range metropolis to-day and to-mor- 
mw. They were accompanied by Mr. 
Shand, one of the members of the 
faculty, as club leader. Walter Par- 
re r and Samuel Collins, Jr„ who are 
also delegates, but whose obligation 
as members of the hasketboall team 
took precedence, remained to partici­
pate in to-night’s game with Escana- 
b« and they will leave on the mid­
night train. The youths represent 
the various class and society organi­
zations of the Negaunee high school.

The boys bear to Ironwood a cordial 
Invitation from the city of Negaunee 
for the Boys' Conference to hold its 
•meeting next year in this city. A 
meeting of business men was held In 
Superintendent Denison’s office last 
Monday and he was assured of thd 
heartiest support in making the fi­
nancial preparations amT providing 
for the entertainment of the hundred 
or two Upper Peninsula lads should 
they favor Negaunee with their 
presence next year.

COMING AND GOING OF PEOPLE

Personal Paragraph* About Folk 
You Know

Mr. and Mrs. K. J. Bessex, Jr., 824 
K<*ed street, announce the birth of an 
eight-pound daughter, Ruth Dorothy, 
Monday, February 10th, at Burgess 
hospital.—Kalamazoo (Mich.) Ga­
zette. Mrs, Bessex was* formerly 
Miss Caroline Johnson, whose girl­
hood was spent in Negaunee and who 
reside*) in Ironwood for a few years 
prior to moving to Kalamazoo.

Abel Levine returned this morning 
from New York, where he went two 
weeks ago on a purchasing trip for 
the big store.

William Carlson Ik home with an 
hniiorahle discharge from the army.

Miss pose Wart* Is now reeoverlnV 
from a sueeessful operalloi) for ap- 
pemlieitis at tile Negaunee Hospital.

Mr. and Mrs. Thomas Kulllvan, of 
rievehmd, Ohio, former reNhif'Ots of 
Negaunee, were here early In the 
Week While ell route lu Marquette to 
attend (he funeral of Mr. Kulllvan’s 
►  Isier, Mrs, Michael Fleming, who 
dhd in Marquette last Humlny.

•loliii E. Burton, a well known min­
ing imm whose home {s in Lake Ge­
neva, Wis., hut who makes business 
headquarters in Milwaukee, is here 
for a visit at the home of his son-in- 
law, K. I). l)e»l-y>n, superintendent of 
the Negaunee public schools. Mr. 
Burton was a frequent business visit­
or to this range in the So'n and after­
ward was identified with the develop­
ment of the Gogebic range, but In 
latter years his interests have benn 
in the fur west. Mrs. .Burton hiul 
preceded him to Negaunee and they 
will remain for some little time.

Cupt. ami Mrs. Alfred Piper and 
their two children, of Alpha, are here 
spending u few days with relatives.

Thomas Pnscoe, cashier of the Nc- 
gutmee State Hank, has been on the 
sick list for the past few duys.

George McDonald was down from 
Miehigamme to-day.

Miss Jennie Ktromer was a passete 
gor last night to Virginia, Minn.

Isni Hoffffman, the pioneer tailor, 
was in Negaunee to-day from Green 
Bay.

DIED  (N O E N V fR

Miss Moynahan Had Many Friends in 
this City

D. McDonald received word last 
week of the death of his comrfn, Miss 
Carrie Moynahan, which occurred In 
Denver, Colo., on February 2d of in­
fluenza, following an illness of but 
three days. -  Deceased had many 
friends in Negaunee and will be more 
particularly remembered as the young 
lady who miraculously escaped death 
while visiting here a few years ago 
when a porch heavily weighted with 
snow and Ice she happened to be un­
der suddenly fell and buried her be­
neath. The accident happened at the 
dwelling end of McDonald’s opera 
house block and iuckiily was discov­
ered it) time by Peter Chevrette and 
qons to extricate her from serloys 
consequences.

HAS RETURNED FROM FRANCE

Lieut. Sheldon C. Crane, Who Was in 
the Aviation Service

Lieut. Sheldon C. Crane arrived 
here Thursday morning from Garden 
City, N. V., where he had been must­
ered out of the national army service, 
following his return from overseas. 
Lieut. Crane was in the aviation 
branch of the service, find after pre­
liminary training in this country was 
sent to France a little over six 
months ago to complete his training. 
He was one of the numerous ones for 
whom the armistice came a little too 
early for individual satisfaction, for 
while he had of course madelnnum- 
erable flights in the course of hi$ 
training, he was to have set out on 
his first individual assignment on the 
very morning that the armistice end­
ed the war.

Lieut. Crane will spend a few 
days with his parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
\V, J. Crane, and then will leave for 
California to join his wife and little 
son.

BACK FROM DOWN STATE

T. M. Wells Looked in on Republican 
State Convention

Thomas M. Wells, county agent for 
the State Board of Corrections and 
Charities, returned Wednesday from 
Lower Michigan, he having taken a 
little Ishpeming girl to the State hos­
pital at Ann Arbor. A stop at Lansing 
gave him opportunity to attend the 
Republican state convention, last 
Tuesday and thus be a witness of the 
historic occasion of Michigan’s first 
nomination of a woman for an elec­
tive office, she being Mrs. Dora H* 
Stockman, who goes on the ticket as 
a nominee for member of the State 
Board of Agriculture.

Mr. Wells reports the convention 
proceedings as harmonious through­
out and the outcome most acceptable 
to all with whom he tnJked during 
his down-state stay. Gov. Sleeper's 
address was well received and appar­
ently there will be no lack of approval 
for his recommendation of the budget 
system and his plans for improvement 
of .Michigan highways. The plea for 
universal military training was ap­
plauded to the echo. “Put" Keljy 
made a rousing speech.

There were at least a hundred wo­
men present In the convention and 
they seemed to be taking a keen as 
well as practical interest in at) of 
the proceedings. The convention gave 
the women folk one-third of the 
representation on the state central 
committee.

SECOND NUMBER OF "ECHO”

High 8chool Student*’ Paper le 
Doubled In Size

The second number of the present 
year’s series of the Negaunee High 
School Echo is in press and will he 
clrculutori early next week. It has 
heen found necessary to Increase Hie 
size of the puhiicatlon, and the pres­
ent number promises to lie at Idnst 
twice the size of Its predecessor. It 
is tilled to the brim with matters in­
teresting to students ami school pa­
trons alike, ami one of the features 
will he the high school’s Honor Boil, 
in which effort has been made to list 
all teachers mid students who were 
in army and navy service. It is real­
ized that the list is incomplete, and 
one of the purposes of Its publication 
a t this time Js to give opportunity 
for additions and corrections by way 
of establishing a flfhmmejit record.

The Echo is published by the stud­
ent body of tile Negaunee high school 
and the staff is us follows:

Editor iu Chief—Marjorie Atkin 
Exchange Editor—Lydia Ollila 
Reporters Senior, Eleanor Laugh- 

tin, Orville Collins; Junior, Eva 
Trotuchaiui, Carl Miller; Sophomore, 
Nannie Metherell, Leonore Klein; 
Freshman, Martha Ralo, Andrew l»er« 
cnehio.

Business Managers Hussell King, 
Walter Farrer.

Circulation Managers -Orville Col­
lins, Frank Mnteer.

Editorial Staff Supervisor, Miss 
i Erwin; staff. Misses Barney, Crisp, 
. Koip, ftcott, Bmedman and Sullivan.
I Composing Staff Supervisor, Gor- 
' don T. Thuncy; staff, John Hakenjos, 

Clair Kntgiit, Russell King, Gladys 
' Muck, Axel Olson, Arnie Solo,

KE GAONf i B  I E O H  H E R A L D

EAGLE LODGES JOINED

Ishpeming and Negaunee Aries Have 
Been Consolidated

At a joint meeting of the Islipem- j 

ing and Negaunee Eagle lodges held 
in this city both societies were con- j 
solidated. The newly elected officers 
are:

Past President—Alfred Chapman I 
President—James Vercelllno |
Vice Prest.—Fred Kornblum 
Secretary—Herman Thlbault 
Treasurer—John Collins 
Chaplain—William Forslund 
Conductor—Wm. Gilbert 
Trustees—John B. Perenchlo, T, L. 

Collins andGust Knuttila.

M'CALL 18 A HUSTLER

Former Negaunee Man is a Star in 
insurance Writing

A Houghton paper state* Ahat John 
T. McCall, a former Negaunee resident 
who is now district agent tor the 
National Insurance Company with 
headquarters at Houghton, has teen 
"cited" by this insurance organization 
for the record he made in writing in­
surance In 1918. The ,prizes were 
awarded for the amount of new busi­
ness written in 1918, allotted by 
groups of towns nn a population bas­
is, and Mr. McCall was at the top 'if 
the heap.

FORMER NEGAUNEE RESIDENT

Mrs. Michael Fleming, Who Passed 
Away in Marquette

Mrs. Michael Fleming, who died of 
influenza at St. Mary’s hospital bn 
Marquette last Sunday, was a former 
resident of Negaunee, but had made 
her home in Marquette for the past 
twenty years. She leaves a husband 
and two daughters, and she Is also 
survived by a brother and four sis­
ters—Thomas Sullivan, Clevelannd; 
Mrs. Daniel Harrington, Ishpeming; 
Mrs. Martin Loudermilk, Nevada; and 
the Misses Anna and Bridget Sulli­
van, Negaunee. Deceased had been 
prominent in the Ladies' Auxiliary of 
the A. O. H. and her death is mourn­
ed by a large circle of friends here 
and in Marquette. The funeral ser­
vices, which were private, were held 
in Marquette Tuesday.

How Death Was Caused

We were beginning to believe that 
the "fluey” was the only cause of 
death In our fair land, but the editor 
of a monthly bulletin of vital statis­
tics finds the following in reports Of 
causes of death seot to him:

“ Died suddenly; nothing serious.”
‘ Went to bed feeling well, but woke 

up dead.”
"Patient should not have died, as 

he fully recovered from his etckneeB.”
"The cause of death was his mother 

died in infancy.”
"D on’t know cause of death. He 

died without the aid of a physician.”
"Kicked by a horse ebod on left 

kidney.”
•Died from blow on the head with 

axe. Cooirlbutary cause was another 
man's wife.

"Deceased died from blood poison­
ing caused by broken ankle when au­
tomobile struck him between lump 
and radiator.”

Put Bone in “Bone Dry”

"Bone dry*’ as applied to prohibi­
tion has nothing to do with u bone. 
Ninety people out of a hundred do 
not koow It. Perhaps the percentage 
U greater, but with the war over and 
liquor fust becoming a product to be 
spokeu of in a whisper, it is interest­
ing to note that Bone happened to be 
the name of the sheriff at Sault Ste. 
Marie, Mich., who kept the county in 
such good shape that tbe author of 
Michigan’s prohibition law honored 
him by naming the luw the "Bone 
dry law”. And here, hidden away, 
among the rsi-ata-tat of riveting 
hamajers in the Oscar Daniels ship­
yard is this former sheriff, John Bone, 
whose name has now become as com­
monly accepted for state liquor legis­
lation as Webb Kenyoo, or Heed, (or 
federal laws. An odd and powerful 
character is this veterao, who only 
lacks "aud ten" to round out the 
prophet’s span of life. Asked how hie 
name had beoomu linked with ti law 
that dried a state, once deemed a 
stronghold of liquor, Mr Bone re­
plied:

1 was sheriff of Chippewa county, 
northern* Michigan, at the time my 
friend, Hepresentative Merlin Wylie, 
wrote and Introduced the law tha t has 
since been a model for other' states 
where a thorough job was wanted. It 
wasn’t qulteas up-to-date as Florida's 
with prohibition against transport­
ing liquor by airship, but It has done 
the worn, While tbe bill was pending 
I met the author one evening io the 
office of tbe prosecuting attorney and 
while we were discussing It 1 esked: 
"W hat are you going to call it Mer­
lin?" ” 1 am going to name R after 
you, John, and if it makes Michigan 
as dry as you are 1 will be satisfied."

Representative Merlin Wylie knew 
bis man for Mr. Bone has gone dry 
all bis life, cot only us to alcohol, 
but even tea, coffee and tobacco.

MOVE
IBE'BUXATIVB 
‘OCGfl SYRUP
« r  rou a

WORK OFF A
__ WITH TUB ORIGrf

COUGh

Big Chattel 
Mortgage 

SALE

at PETER RASMUSSEN’S

Ends Saturday 
Night

« 4

Last Call 
Prices

25c Arrow Brand Collars—  % .13

Boys' $5 00 Shoes...................  3*75

Men's $4.50 HbtB......... 2.50

Men's $3.50 Hats........  ........... 1.98

Men’s fancy Vests, worth up 
to $4.00.................................. ^ . 6 9

Men's $1 50 Shirts & Drawers •69

Boys’ SJ.00 Union Suits ......... .69

Men’s $1.00 Caps.....................  .69

Men’s S1.50 and $2.00 C aps... 1,19

Men’s 5 lace Overshoes... . . . .  2.98

Men's 12-In. Hitop Overshoes 3.29

Ladies* Oxfurds, worth up to
$4.50.......................................  1.29

Ladies' Oxfords, »old for $3.50 .98

Ladles’ $1.00 Rubbers......................69

Misses' 85c Rubbers.......  .59

Children’s 85c Rubbers—  .59

Ladies’ Cape Raincoats.................... 69

Misses’ $1.00 Wool Drawers.. .69

Misses’ Cotton Vests & Pants 
worth 35c.. . . .  . ............................ 19

Ladles’ $1.50 Corsets.......  .79

Ladies’ $3.50 Union Suits—  2.19

Misses'75c Union Suits__  .32

Infants’ Ruben’s V ests.... . . .  .19

All Ribbons, Half Off.

All Embroideries, Half Off. 

C lark’s Mile End Spool Cot­
ton, per spool.......  ..................04

Corticeill Bilk Twist, a spool ,04  

Braids and Trimmings, Half Price.

50c Kdeu Cloth........... ...................... 34

36c HtrEped Voiles......... ....................18

50o Sateen Linings.......  .........  .28

50c While Ostlng Flannel*.,. ,34

All Remnants, Half Price.

10c Crochet Cotton.......  ...................06

tide fancy Pillow Tops—  ............... 29

Notions and Buttons, Half Price.

Peter
Rasm ussen

314 IRON ST.

N E G A U N E E .

M I C H .

Y O U R  D O L L A R S
invested in Liberty Bonds will equips 
and m aintain the Army and Navy.

T H B  A R M Y  A N D  N A V Y
will protect your homes, our fami­
lies and our business from our 
enemies.

A  S A P B  D E P O S I T  B O X  
in our big, strong, steel v au lt wi* 
protect your Liberty Bonds, deedi 
notes, insurance policies, etc., fron 
tire, thieves or loss.

BENT A SAFE DEPOSIT BOX TO-DAY

Rents a Sate Deposit Box

NEGAUNEE 
NATIONAL BANK

“The Bank of the People.”

Copper Mines K ept Busy

Entirely free of labor troubles or 
tbe strife tbat is noted in other cop­
per mining sections of the country, 
the Lake Superior mines are runnlog 
unhampered. While operating either 
on reduced time or lower wages, none 
of tbe big producers is bothered with 
labor unrest. This makes for greater 
efficiency, as is reflected in the week­
ly statement of rock tonnages. It Is 
noteworthy that, while mine employes 
of tbe MicbigHQ copper couotry feel 
the loss in wages, resulting from 
the tbree.quarter time schedule, nev­
ertheless they accept the situation 
philosophically, realizing there was 
no other way for producers to meet 
the lack of demand for metal.

Feb. 21-Mar, 14
PBOBATE NOTICE

STATE OK MICHIGAN,
The Probate Court tortile County of Mwnjuette

At a session ol said Court. Iielu at the probate 
Office in the City of Marquette in taut County* 
on the 13in day of Kebnary, A. 1>. 11*19.

Present; Hon W. T. Hotter. Judge of Probate
Iu the Matter of the Estate of Herbert 

Charles Dower, Deceased.
Thomas Pascot, having filed lo said court 

bis final administration account, and tits pet:- 
(ton praying fur the allowance thereof and for 
the assignment and distribution of the residue 
of said estate.

It la Ordered. That the I7fh day of March 
A. D. 1919. at two o’clock in the afternoon, mi 
said prolate office. Iw» aud is hereby api>o)ute<l 
for hearing Mud M itten;

I t  Is Further Ot tered. That public notice 
thereof be given by i ubllratlun of a copy of tin-* 
order, for three successive weeks previous to 
wud day of hearing, lo the J<w .avsk k  Iron 
H Kitald a  newspaper printed und circulated iu 
said county.

Seal W T. POTTER.
A true copy. Judge of Probate

E l ia  M. TiNVKKKU., Ueginfer of Probate

JOHN JACOBSON
—The Rev. Irl R. Hicks Almanac 

fur 1910 is now ready, finer, better 
than ever. A beautiful, valuable 
weather book with weather forecasts 
for every day of 1919, written by Irl 
R. Hicks. Jr., and Rev. J. B. Noyes, 
the same as last year 35 cents by 
mail, 30 cents on news stands. Our 
monthly magazine, Word and Works, 
one year with one Almanac, $1. Tbe 
Hicks Almanac and Publishing Co., 
3401 Franklin Ave., St. Louis, Mo. tf

Keb. 21-Mar. 29
LEGAL NpTICE.

STATE OF MICHIGAN,
TtIK riHt.TlT COlltT FOB THK COUNTY Or

MAfKjuxrrx. Jn Cjjancjchy.
Sue Kearney Collins, l'lalullfT, 

vs.
Emerson Clay Collins, Defendant.

suit pending iu the Circuit Court for the 
Comity of Marquette In Chancery, before George 
P. Brown, Esquire, Circuit Court Commissioner 
lu and for saul enuuty, ou the loth day of Feb­
ruary, A, D. 1919,

On reading and filing the alfidavlt of Leon E. 
itarvtn. Ks<j., attorney for the plaintiff In the 
above cutukd cause, from which It appears 
that said defendant resides out of the Mate of 
Michigan and that he realties at Bfa Aqueduct 
Ktreoi, Montreal, Canada.

Now therefore, on motion of Leou K. Garvin, 
attorney tor said plaintiff, It is ordered that said 
defendant Kmemm Clay Collin* cause his ap­
pearance to he entered In tills cause within 
three months from the date hereof and lu case 
of such appearance that said cause proceed uc- 
cordtug to the rules and practice of this court 
and fhe statute in such case made and provided, 
aud tha t ludetault at men appearance the bill 
of complaint iu this cause be taken as confessed 
as against said defendant

And tt appearing that Th e  Nkoaunkk Ikon 
H kka lo, Is a newspaper printed, published aud 
circulating In said county of Marquette, It is 
further ordered that a copy of (his order be 
published lu said newspaper T iik Nkoaunkk 
ino.v R ick a Lb a t least once in each week (or 
six weeks in succession, the first publication 
tberco! lo be within twenty days (rum the date 
of this order.

AM> It la Kuutiikk OitDKitKb that said 
plum iff came a c<qq ol fids order Ut )*♦ mailed 
to Haul defendant at l$x last known poxl ofilce 
address hy rculxteredletter and it return receipt 
demanded at least twenty days heMrc Hie time 
herein prescribed lor lUe appearance ol defend­
ant.

GKO. I*. ItROWN, 
Circuit Court UonimlMNioner.

(khintt-rsigued;
,FRANK ti. JBNK8,

Cn*rk of Circuit Court.
LEON E. UAKVIN,

Afforuc) for Plaintiff.
Bu*d;n hhaddress: Marquette. Michigan.

Keb, tl -Mur, )4 
PROBATE NOTICE 

STATE OF MICHIGAN,
The Probate Court lor the County of Munpn-lte.

A la Hussion ul said Court, held ui the Probate 
Office In the City of Marquette in »utd County, 
on the IJU) day uf Primary, a . h  itilu

JToseut; )jon. W. T. i'oiter, Judge of Probate
lu  the Mailer ol the Estate ol Hermau Johu- 

sou, Deceased.
lu a  Juhnxun, widow ol said deceased, 

having Died In «ald court her peUliou praying 
that (he administration of said estate be 
granted to iiemelf, or to some other suitable 
person

I t  Jx Ordered, That the n th  day of Mar, a .D. 
I9lfi. at two o'clock lu the afternoon, at aatd 
probate ofilce, lie aud is hereby appointed lor 
heartug said petition;

i t  is Further ordered, That public notice 
thereof l>e glveu by publication of a copy of this 
order, for three successive weeks previous to 
said day of hearing, in the Nkoaunkk Ikon 
Hbkald a uewspaper priuted aud circulated In 
said county.

Beal W .T.fD TrB K,
A true copy. Judge of J’robttte

E lla M Tjncknkll. Register ul Probate

Feb. 7—2*
P r o b a t e  N o t io e

.-STATE OK MICHIGAN.
The Frobate Court for the Couaty of Marquette 

At a  session of said court, hula at the probate 
offloe 1» the City of Marquette, lu said county, 
on the 3d day of Kebruary A. D. 1919.

Present: Ron. W. T. Hotter. Judge of Probate 
la th e  Matter of the Estate of Johu G. 

Kero. Deceased.
Annie Kero, widow of said deceased, having 

filed lu said court her petit ten praying that 
(he administration of salu estate be granted to 
Mattl llohnl or to some other suitable person 

I t  Is Ordered, that thefcl day of March A. D. 
1919. at two o'clock iu the afternoon, at said 
probate office, be and Is hereby appointed lor 
nearing said pefltmu.*

I t  is Further Ordered, that public notice 
thereof be glveu by publication of a copy of tills 
order, for three successive weeks previous to 
said day of hearing, iu the Nkoacnkk Ikon 
H kkal(». u newspujier printed and circulated 
lu said comity.

(Seal; W. T. POTTER.
A true ropy. .Indue- ut Probate.

Ella Ji. Tinck.nxli. Register ofFrobate

^nafticnablc&atlprtnfl
ta r  ALL WORK GUARANTEED.

All the new fabrics for Fall 
and Winter now in stock.

PHOItm MO. 19*. t.-T.

Gold Street, Negaunee, Mich,
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OUR
ADVERTISING

are read by the people 
because it gives them 
news of absorbing in­
terest. People no longer 
go looking about for 
things they want—they 
go to their newspaper 
for information as to 
where such things may 
be found. This method 
saves time and trouble. 
If you want to bring 
your wares to the atten­
tion of this community, 
our advertising columns

Should
Contain Your 

Ad
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K E O A t J N E E  I K O N  H B B A L D

B ill says to 
the Doctor-  

sezze
‘•There may be 
pome plugs that look 
bigger—but it's the 
good taste of genu­
ine Real Gravely 
and the way it 
stays with you that 
counts/ 1 „ .

Good taste, smaller 
chew,longer life is what 
makes Genuine Grave­
ly cost less to chew thhn 
ordinary plug.

Write to;—

G e n u i n b  G r a v e l y
OANVILLB. VA. 

for booklet on chewing plug

P eyton B ran d  
REAL CHEWING PLUG

Plug packed in  pou ch

R & P U B L I6
Frank Pbllp, whose return, wound­

ed and gassed, from the battlefields 
of Praoce was chronicled last week, 
fell victim to pneumonia following an 
attack of influenza and passed away 
shortly before nooo last Sunday. He 
was out tbe first soldier Republic bad 
lost in tbe world conflict, but the clr- 
cumstances were exceptional and en- 
listed tbe sympathies of his towns­
people to an unusual degree, as was 
made manifest in the tribute which 
was paid to his memory last Monday, 
when tbe remains were laid to rest in 
tbe Republic cemetery.

Frank Phllpw as 32 years of age, 
having been born in Truro, England, 
January 27th. 1887 and his residence 
Id Republic dated from 1890. He was 
working in Rochester. N. Y., in tbe 
earlier months of tbe war and it  was 
at that point that be enlisted May 13, 
1918. Tbe machine gun division of 
which he became a member, was soon 
sent overseas where it lost no further 
time In getting Into action. There 
were few of the larger battles in that 
district in which Phllp’e company 
was not a participant, but it was not 
until tbe fierce battle in Argonne For­
est October 14tb, less than a month 
before tbe armistice, tha t Philip “got 
h is.” He was wounded in tbe shoulder 
as well as gassed, and it was tbe lat­
ter experience that left bits practical­
ly blind for two months. He received 
every possible attention in tbe mili­
tary hospitals and as soon as possible 
was returned to tbe United States. 
In accordaoae with the army practice 
he was returned to tbe point of enlist­
ment, and spent Fome weeks in tbe 
hospital there beforebe was permitted 
to under take the journey to bis home.

He arrived Id Republic February 
12th, and the moment he alighted from 
tbe train bis relatives and friends 
realized that be was very far from be­
ing a  well mao. Influenza developed 
a few days later and this In turn be­
came pneumonia. The tax proved to 
be altogether too great for his previ­
ously weakened vitality, and tbe end 
came last Sunday.

Surviving there are his mother, 
Mrs. Mary Pbilp, three sisters, Mrs. 
Tbomat Cbenball and Misses Beatrice 
and Florence, and & brother, William 
Pbilp, all of Republic: Miss Lillian 
Pbilp and Russell Pbilp, sister and 
brother, of Marquette.

Business of all kinds was suspended 
and tbe Bcbools were closed last Mon­
day in tbe effort to do fitting honor 
to tbe memory of him whose sacrifice 
was just as real as though it hud 
come in battle a few months earlier. 
Tbe services were conducted by Rev. 
C. G. Ziegler, tbe Episcopal rector 
from Ishpemlng, and the pull bearers 
were eight returned soldiers and sail­
ors—Frank Roberts, Earl Peterson. 
Julian Van de Csstele, Emil Isaucson, 
Charles Mukl and,Peter Venn. Assist­
ing in tbe services was a specialcboir, 
composed of Mrs. A. J. Hocalng, 
Misses Anderson, Heinoncn and 
Hooper, Messrs. Earl Thompson and 
Bradford Loveland. The Republic 
Fire Department turned out in full 
uniform, the school children headed 
by Supt. Wm. L. Connor and tbe 
teachers, marched in the procession 
and tbe greater part of liepubllc's 
citizens were also in line, making It 
by far tbe largest us well as most Im­
pressive funeral Republic haB ever 
seen .

The final rites ni the grave were 
equally impressive, a firing squad of 
eight returned Republic soldiers, 
headed by Sergj. 8 . E. Olson, dis­
charging three volleys over the grave, 
while Max Bieluoberg, of Marquette, 
Founded laps. In addition to tbe rel­
atives previously mentioned, there 
were present at the funeral Mr. uod 
Mm. Harold Philips, of Marquetlo, 
arid Mr. and Mrs. Jerome Uegooghe, 
of Republic. Sympathy In fullest meas­
ure has gooejorth from the commu­
nity to tbe bereaved family.

This is tbe eveoing of tbe the patri­
otic program, under tbe auspices of 
the Women's Council of Nutlooal 
Defense, which is to be presented at 
the Pastime theater. A considerable 
number of young people are to take 
part and from tbe inaoy indications 
of interest oo tbe part of tbe public 
a large audience is assured.

Arvid Isaacson, who helped to make 
tbe big dent in tbe Hiodenburg line, 
arrived home this week, straight from

Dreadful Cough Cured 
A severe cold is often followed by a 

rough cough for which Chamberlain's 
Cough Remedy has proven especially 
valuable Mrs. F. W. Olsen, Marys­
ville, Mo., writes: “ About two years 
ago my little boy Jean caught a se­
vere cold and coughed dreadfully for 
days. I tried a number of eougb 
medicines but nothing did him aoy 
good until I gave him Chamberlain’s 
Cough Remedy. It relieved bis cough 
right away and before be had fiolsbed 
taking one bottle be was cured. J 
think It is just flue for children.”

overseas. He sustained several 
wounds in action, and one more re­
cent one in his foot still causes dis­
comfort. He had been in France 
about fourteen months, nearly half of 
which was spent right up in tbe front 
lines. It is needless to say that bis 
frleods give him no rest in tbeir quest 
for reminiscences of experiences so 
exciting 8s those be passed through, 
and he has been bolding court daily 
at A) Hocking's store. He secured a 
furlough to visit bis parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Samuel Isaacson, but will have 
to return to camp shortly, and he is 
feeling quite fit despite tbe various 
wounds he recehed. but it is possi­
ble that be will not secure bis dis­
charge quite as soon as some of tbe 
others, owing to tbe government’s de­
sire to see that all wouodep soldiers 
have adequate hospital care before 
tbey arc permitted to return to civil 
life.

Invitations have been issued for a 
masquerade ball to be given this (Fri­
day) evening by a number of the 
young people. Woodman’s ball Is to 
be tbe scene of festivities, the stocks of 
tbe professional costumers of Chicago 
and Milwaukee have been shorn of 
tbeir choicest make-ups, Mrs. Weid- 
man's orchestra of Marquette bus 
been engaged for the occasion, and 
altogether it is likely to be a function 
long to be remembered by those privl- 
eged to participate. There were no 
lookers-on, for a  mask was one of the 
conditions of admittance.

Miss Lfcgergren returned to her 
home in Negaunee Wednesday morn­
ing. Miss LagergreD is a nurse and 
had been taking care of Mrs. Louis 
Levioe, who had been on tbe sick list 
for tbe past week,

Tbe members of the Epworth 
League of the M. E. Church enjoyed 
a sleigbrlde to Bengtson's farm last 
Tuesday evening.

Irving Labold and Russell Wilson 
were tbe official delegates from the 
Republic schools to the Older Boys’ 
Conference at Iroowood tbe latter 
part of tbe week, but tbe local dele­
gation included Bradford Loveiaod, 
Minton Weinberg and Lawrence Ut- 
berg, while Rev. Talllka and Leslie 
Brown, tbe latter manual training 
instructor at th« schools, were the 
adults who accompanied the pari}’.

The Royal Neighlrors will give a 
social at Woodmen's hall next Tues­
day evening and besides including tbe 
husbands of Royal Neighbors the in­
vitation includes all Modern Wood­
men and tbeir wives.

Leroy Geacb, who bad been in the 
radio branch of navy service for tbe 
past eight months and Mho was mus­
tered out a t Boston recently, arrived 
borne to-day.

Tbe Ladles' Aid Society of tbe 
Swedish M. E. Church held tbeir 
monthly business and social meeting 
last Saturday at the borne of Mrs. 
Gust I t  Johnson.

Miss Apploney Venn left Sunday for 
Marquette, where she will undergo an 
operation for appendicitis.

Even if he were so minded it would be 
useless henceforth for Thomas Chen-, 
ball to conceal bis age, for bis birth 
was chronicled in the “ Forty Years 
Ago’1 department of last week’s issue 
of tbe N k u a u n e k  I k on  H o  
a ll). His parents, Mr. and Mrs, Sam 
uel Cbenball, were then residents of 
Micbigamme, and it was in the build­
ing later known as tbe Milroy home­
stead that the young man in question 
first saw the light of day. His father 
was.u jeweler whose trade activities 
eucompassed Humboldt, Champion 
and other neighboring places. He 
subsequently forsook ibis business 
and it was as a blacksmith that be 
came to Repuolic in 1880, continuing 
, in the employ of the Republic Irou 
Company until his death in 1900. Tbe 
wife and mother died some five years 
after the family’s removal to Kepub 
lie, 4tod Mr. Cbenball subsequently 
remarried. Tbere was nothing in the 
birth uotice of forty years ago tplndl 
cate that “ the subject of ibis sketch” 
would be a valued employe of the Re­
public Iron Company and Its corpor­
ate successor (or roupd-about twenty 
years, cor that be would become a 
member of tbe Board of Education, 
nor that be would be elected a justice 
of tbe peace aod ex-officio a member 
of tbe townsbiiv board—but just to 
complete the record we are pleased to 
attest that these events have taken 
place.

Julian Vao de Castele, who returned 
recently from a period of Navy serv­
ice, was one of tbe Marines, tbe boys 
wbo are always In for action whenever 
tbere Is anything doing, but lo his 
case the traditions of tbe service failed 
to materialise, for a hundred miles 
was tbe closest be ever got to France. 
Just to uphold the name of the gallant 
Marines, however, Van de Castele is 
fond of relating tbe experience of one 
Marine, wbo with a machine gun held 
back ao entire company of Germaos. 
He gathered twenty bullets into bis 
own anatomy In tbe process, ten of 
them beiog in one little patch in bis 
leg, but be kept bis own guo burking 
wktb such deadly effect that tbe Huos 
were giad to give up their attempt.

Constable Bert Martell has been 
making a particularly good job of 
bis ihsk us truant officer, sort by tbe 
liui*- be gets through there will be 
precious few of school age who are

not In regular attendance. In most 
instances he Is able to accomplish his 
object without arousing any undue 
aoimosity, but the Board of Educa­
tion is fully backing bun up in all 
cases where legal action is required, 
and the comparatively few parents 
wbo lack proper consideration for 
tbeir children’s future welfare might 
belter make up tbeir minds quickly 
that they will have to “ toe tbe mark”. 
Tbe school records for the past two 
mooths show the bust attendance iD 
the history of the organixuion and 
tbe be&lth average is the heel In two 
or three 3ears at least. Tbe system 
of proved tests shows that tbe pupils 
are analog excellent progress io tbeir 
studies. 1

The motor has arrived but the ex­
tension of power haulage in tbe Re­
public mine ouw await* the arrival of 
me special cars whicn are to be used 
for the service.

Nothing further of a definite nature 
has been beard regarding the pro­
spective train  changes on the St Paul 
liae, and unless Republic people aod 
the down-tbe-road travelers are able 
to form a mighty effective sort of a 
protest it is likely that tbe long- 
threatened will pome to pass aod the 
“ day” trains will make tbeir ter­
minus at Champion instead of con­
tinuing to Marquette.

Tbe Ladies’ Aid Society of the Swe­
dish Lutheran Church held tbeir 
monthly meeting a t tbe home of Mrs. 
Oscar Johnson last Monday after­
noon.

Philo P. Chase, superintendent of 
poor for this district, was a visitor 
here Wednesday.

Lieut. Garfield Verrac, who bad 
been in government service in the en­
gineering construction department in 
and about Washington for a consid­
erable portion of the war. reached 
here this week for a visit with his par­
ents, Mr. and Mrs. F. D. Verran, aod 
it is understood that blsspecial duties 
are at ao end and that he will re-enter 
civil life, doubtless resuming the im­
portant position he held v.ith one of 
the railroad companies at St. Paul. 
During his absence in tbe East, Lieut. 
Verran's wife Las beep assisting Post­
master Verran in the Republic office.

Charles Isaacson is up from Gwion 
to see his brother. Arvid, who re­
cently returned from military service 
in France,

CARD OF THANKS
We wish to make grateful acknowl­

edgement of the kindness and sympa­
thy which has come to us during tbe 
illness and after tbe death of our son 
and brother, Frank Pbilp. There are 
so many to whom we are indebted for 
kindly deeds, words of sympathy and 
beautiful floral tributes that we can­
not hope to reach all of them individu­
ally, and we therefore ask them to ac­
cept this assurance that their kindness 
will ever be held in grateful memory. 
Wo especially wish to thank, however, 
tbe soldiers and sailors wbo were 
preseat at tbe funeral, the Republic 
Fire Department for furnishing tbe 
honorary escort, and the schoolchild­
ren for their presence.

M r s . M a r v  P h i l p  a n d  F a m il y .

ATTENDED BOYS’ CONFERENCE

W alter Clemlnaon, of Mlohlgamme, 
Represented Normal

En route to tbe Older Boys’ Confer­
ence at Iroowood, tbe Negauoee dele­
gation was joined by Walter Ciemin* 
sun, wbo was ooe of tbe delegates rep­
resenting the Northern State Normal 
School at Marquette, where be had 
been a student during tbe past year.

Proper Understanding Of It

The understanding of any subject 
before one takes a position on it 
ought to be particularly valuable in 
these times, this to prevent confusion 
in discussion, etc., and this is well 
illustrated by tbe following that has 
been written with this idea in view:

“ So many ’o these ’ere b accidents 
cad be prevented, m’soo, if a man ’as 
proper ^understanding o' things,” 
said Cap’n Dick. “ So b ’often mau 
says one thing w’en, damme e means 
t ’other, an ’ so u t’s naw wonner as 
’ow there’s confusion an’ h ’secidents. 
Naow, ’ere’s a story b ’bout 'Aarry 
Pollard so the’ll naw wot J'm driven* 
to:

“ ’Arry, as thee may ’a r e ’erd, wuz 
’andy at fitln’, but ol* trouble wuz ’e 
waz b ’oyer-confident. ’Ere ’e wuz 
braggin* ’baout wot a titer ’e wuz, till 
damme, ’Jong comes young feller ’oo 
said ’ed ’ave a go with un. So ussen 
h'arranged one o’ these ’ere baouts. 
’Arry, ’e .ad to ’ave a second, so Jan 
Kevern e d bearun b ’out, an’ so tbey 
started.

First roound this ’ere young chap, 
b’lrlsh ’e w ere,’e druv ’Arry to one 
corner, poundin’ ’im baout tba ’ead 
and hVyes sumpin’ h ’awful. But 
’Arry ’e wuz smilin' as 'e went to cor­
ner, an' sez ’e to Jan, ‘Ow ar 't gawlu’ 
naow Jan? ‘ ’Aodsome, 'Arry. ’and- 
some. Tbee'slookio like a blooey Jin’, 
says Jan. ‘Gos b 'jp  oaow, an’ 
scat to un next raouud. 'Arry.’ So 
’Arrv ’* b’up an’ pasted, an, damme, 
didn’t seem to ‘it nawthln’ but b ’air. 
W'en lime wuz called for second 
rauund, 'Arry, ’e *ez, ‘Jan, ’ow’a 
makin’ it oaow? Better this time, 
wasn’t un?' 'Ob, damme, m'soo,' eez 
Jan, T b a ’art lookin’ like a blooey 
lion. Gos on, naow, do; thee surely 
caD clean up this raound.’ ‘So ’Arry 
’e starts third time. Afore long 'e 
wuz wobblin’ from side to side, an' 
ibis 'ere h 'lrlsb chap wuz rainin’ 
blaws somethin’ b’awfu). Short 
while, an’ damme, 'ere wuz ’Arry fiat 
on Ms back. So we ’ad to carry un 
b’out an’ give uo b’air.

W ’en *e come to, firs’ thin’ ’e said 
wuz, ‘Well Jan, ’ow‘§ lookin’ naow?' 
’Like a blooey lion you,’ sez Jan. 
” Ere naow, Jan, dot* t believe th 'art 
ever seen one o ’ these ’ere lions,’ sex 
’Arry. ’Coorae I ave,’ set Jan. ’Deao 
thee remember tba one ol’ Mother 
’Oney used to ’ave in ’er bairn, In ol’ 
country, with flat b ’ears?’ ’Gosaloog, 
do, Jao; tba* wer’nt oo blooey lion; 
’were a jackass. ‘Well, ’Arry,’ sez 

J a n ,.‘ ’im were wot I meant.’” —Iron 
Ore.
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Cleanest and Cheapest
Fuel

_____________________ ____________________________

Can accept a few 
orders at present

* " W

Michigan Gas & Electric Co.
ISH PEM ING NEG AUNEE

Indorse State Police Idea

Legislative farmers clubs have 
unanimously indorsed the bill to make 
the stale constabulary permanent.

This loBures practically 50 farmers 
votes for the measure io tbe two 
branches of the legislature and is tak­
en to mean that the bill is as good as 
passed.

None of the farmers voiced aoy op­
position, although several questions 
were asked of Drug and Food Com­
missioner. Fred L. Woodworth, who 
explained the work of tbe constabu­
lary on the border.

State Candidates Named

Mrs. DoraH. Stockman of Lansing 
was nominated by the republican state 
convention, one of the party’s two 
candidates for member of the state 
board of agriculture in the election 
May 7.

Tbe convention gave women one- 
tbird of tbe representation on the 
state central committee.

In its platform the convention de­
clared for more strict immigration 
law*, deportation of interned alien en­
emies and exclusion of those who re­
turned to Europe to bear arms for en­
emy countries.

Those nominated were:
Members 61 the state board of agri­

culture— L. W. Watkins, Jackson, and 
Mrs. Dora Stockman, Lansing.

Regents of tbe University of Mich­
igan— B. S.*Hancheit, Grand Rapids, 
and Dr. L. L. Hubbird, Houghton.

Justice of the Supreme Court—R.C. 
Ostrander, Lansing and J. E. Baird, 
Adraln.

Superintendent of Public Instruc­
t io n —F. L. Keeler, Mount Pleasant.

Member of tbe State Board of Edu­
ca tio n —Frank Cody, Detroit.
| Tbere was no opposition except for 
| the board of agriculture nominee. 
Mrs. Stockman was nominated after 

! A. J. Doherty, of Claire, who bad 
i served on the board for 12 years, 
1 withdrew, and L. W. Watkins de- 
feated Robert D. Graham, who sought 

; renomination without a roll call.
Governor Sleeper urged package of 

the $50,090,000 good roads bond reso- 
! Union, strengthening of tbe prohlbl- 
I tloD laws, and a permanent state con- 
1 stabulary to huot whiskey runners.

Tbere is a limit to whicn the eyes 
can be abqsed aod still retain their 
efficiency.

Continuous reading by artificial 
light causes much eyesight trouble. 
This, of course, can be offset by pro­
perly fitted glasses.

Why neglect your eyes, when you 
have so easy access to the services of 
an eyesight specialist?

We grind lens. Bring us the pieces 
of your broken lens &Dd we will make 
you a new ooe in one hour.

Everything in the optical line.
M. H. KLDRED, Opt. D. 

Office: Woolworth’s 5 &10Cent Store, 
Ishpemiog, Mich. 11-tf.

If you intend 
to have a sale 
get our prices

Sale 
Bills 
PR IN TED

W e are fixed for turning 
out work of this kind 
in double-quick time.

BECOME A NURSE 
and earn $30 00 to $35.00 u week after 
graduation. Katruoce requirements 
two years high school. Write Supt. of 
Nurs*-*. Washington Park Hospital, 
00th Vernon Ave., Chicago KM 10

LEGAL NOTICE
MTATB o f  MICHIGAN. County of MorcjiiuU*. 

To tbe Qualified Kleclor# of said County: 
Notice i* hereby jriveu that ibere wilt beuo 

UctiMUl primary Kiwi Ion field Ju told Countv, 
on tb« first Wednesday in March, IflV tu such 
Primary lias been annulled In rouMsqueuce ol 
uo opposition to auy candidate for auy office 
upon any ticket. . ,  . , . „ .

ijjv«.»« under my hand this istb day of Feb­
ruary. A. D. 1VIS. „  ,

FVASK 0, .IKVHS.
*4 . ( « * County Clerk.

First National 
Insurance Agency

I N S U R A N C F
LIFE

FIRE
ACCIDENT 

PLATE GLASS
AUTOMOBILE

BONDS 
____ •

J. E. O’DONOGHUE,
AQtNT

N e g a u n e e , M ic h ig a n .

Your'e the one we want 
to try our

ROUGH DRY SERVICE
Exactipg h o u s e w i v e s  

hereabout s  say it’s the 

finest ever. So will you, 

after a trial.

Call No. 27 and have 

our wagon call for this 

week’s bundle.

Needham Bros.
laundry Cleaners

Too

Q U R  TIME, 
^  knowledge 
and experience 
in the printing 
business.

When you are in need of some­
thing in this line

DON’T FORGET THIS

Do
YOU
Know
About
OUR
Prices

W e  a r e  

a n x i o u s  t o  

h a v e  y o u  

f i n d  o u t  

a b o u t  t h e m

T h e y  w i l l  

i n t e r e s t  

y o u  w h e n  

y o u ' r e  i n  

n e e d  o f  

p r i n t i n g

W e’ re  O pposed 

to

M a il O rd e r C oncerns 

Because—
They here never contributed 
•  cent to (uithcitog the iotererU 
of our town—

Every cent received by lien  
Iren dm commueiiy it e direct 
Iom to our mcicheete—

In *!0 0 M eveiy cue their 
price* coo be mot right here, 
without deley to receiving good* 
end the pceaibiliiy of mutokee 
to hlltog order*.

But—
Tbe neturel humaa knit b te 
buy where good* ere cbeapetf. 
Local pride it utuelly second­
ary io (be game cl life a* 
played today.

Therefore
Mr. Merchant aod Bueiaae* 
Mao, meat your competitor* 
with fair own weapon*— 
odvertuiag.

Advertise!
The local Sold it youn. All 
yea need do it 1 0  evefl voor- 
aelf of tbe opportuefca* efeted. 
Ao edvertjacmeul io thu paper 
will carry you* sewage Ml* 
buodred* of borne* io thu coca- 
musky. hi*tbelureet medium 
of killing your greater com­
petitor. A  1 pace (hi* eice 
won't coet much. Co m  in 
aod aee ui about it.



N E G A U N E E  I R O N  H E R A L D

IT Is Jin odd coincidence Unit tho 
most modern occurrence In Prus­
sia— Us occupation by American 

• troops—should begin with Its old­
est city, observes a writer in the Kun- 
>iak City Times, Treves, or Trier, ns 
the Gdnnnns call It, into which the 
Yanks march' d recently, Is older than 
history, which begins for It half a cen­
tury hcfele i he birth of Christ. Then, 
ns the capital of the Celtic Trevlrl, 
-ouo of the most powerful Belgian 
tribes, it was captured by the Roinuus 
under Julies Caesar. It was made a 
Homan colony under the name of Au­
gusta Trevlrormn und was strongly 
fortified. By 14 B. C. It had become 
the most important northern outpost 
of the Roinnn empire. It wus an Im­
perial residence curly in the Christian 
era and the administrative center from 
which Gaul, Britain und Spain were 
ruled. The poet Ausonlus described it 
ns “Home beyond the Alps." Constan­
tine the Great lived there about twen­
ty-five years. He und his successors 
beautified It with public works and 
magnificent private villas dotted tho 
hillside all around. Some of the finest 
Homan relics north of the Alps re­
main to this day In Treves.

From the earliest times Treves, be­
cause of Its strategic position and the 

‘rich country surrounding it, wus un 
- object of warfare. The Franks par­

ticularly desired It und they made 
many expeditions against it. They 
continued their attacks after the Ro­
man occupation. Three Hines they 
racked it und held it for short periods. 
About the middle of the fifth century 
they guined permanent possession and 
inude It their capitul. The Frankish 
kings gradually transferred their pow- [

in 1704 captured it again and abolished 
the archbishopric. The congress of 
Vienna in 1814-1815 gave it back to 
Prussia. It figured several times Id 
the war just closed, belug boiuburded 
by allied aerial forces.

The modern city of Treves occupies 
almost the exact site of the ancient 
town. It nestles picturesquely in the 
valley of the Moselle river and is sur­
rounded by hills covered with the vine­
yards from which comes the famous 
Moselle wine. The newer section con­
tains brond streets and modem build­
ings. The streets in the old part are 
narrow and crooked. The Porta Ni­
gra, an enormous fortified gatewuy, 
wus built by the Rimmas. In the 
southeastern part of the city is the 
puluce of the Roman kings, now a pic­
turesque muss of ruins. In the south­
western section are the Roman buths, 
a vust and impressive ruin, and a short 
distance away is a Roman amphithea­
ter built In Kmpcror Tnijun’s time.

Famous Church and Relics.
One of the most interesting buildings 

Is the cathedral, one of the oldest 
churches in Europe. It stunds on the 
site of a church used in the time of 
Constantine. It bears the murks of 
repeuted restorations as the result of 
wars and the ravages of time. Among 
(he holy relies it contains are an al­
leged nail from the cross and the fa­
mous seamless “Holy Cout,“ Bald to 
have been worn by the Savior. Both 
uro held In great veneration and are 
declared to have figured In many mi­
raculous heullngs. A provincial mu­
seum contains many antiquities and a 
number of rare books are In the mu­
nicipal librury, including the lllumlnut- 
ed Codex Kghertl, (kiting from the close

American Troops in Troves.

■er to Metz, however, und Treves be­
came tho scut of u powerful religious 
omplre.

Troves bud a bishop at a very early 
dale. Four great muI i i I n of Hie fourth 
century are ciuuiecinl with the city. 
It was tlie Mvao of tlie firM bullish- 
fitonl of St, A H iu i i i ih Iu k ; St. Ambrose 
was horn there; St. .femme first be­
came seriously Interested in religion 
while studying (here, and Si. Martin of 
Tours went (hero iti 5S5 to plead with 
Hie tyrant Maximus for the liven of Hie 
heretic Prlscllllim uml Ills followers. 
The grout bishop, St. Nlretlus, built a 
Hplemlld rustle for himself at Treves 
In the sixth century. The nee became 
m u  archbishopric soon alter the begin­
ning of (he ninth century and its tern* 
potnl power was founded In Si)S, when 
Itudbod acquired the rights of tho 
counts of Treves. Throughout tho 
middle ages the city abounded in re­
ligious foundations mid was a grout 
seat of monastic learning.

Changed Hands Many Times.
With the transfer of (he Frankish 

capita! to Metz begun a long era of 
c hanges for Treves. The city passed 
to Lorraine in 845 und to the cust 
Pmukfsli kingdom la 870. It wus sack­
ed by the Northmen In 881 after it hud 
become a permanent part of what is 
■ow  Prussia. It became a free city 
toward the dose of the sixteenth cen­
tury. The French held It briefly three 
times in the seventeenth century and

| of the tenth century, and tho Faust 
and Gutenberg Bible of 1450.

The inanufaclurlng Interests of the 
city Include tanneries, iron foundries, 
dye works, furniture and piano fac­
tories and glass'painting works, An 
extensive trade in wine, fruit ami wood 
was curried on before the wur. Thera 
are many lend, copper and tin mines In 
tho vicinity. The population beforo 
1014 was uhout ttfi.OOO.

Got the Wrong Leg.
This little story without a claimant 

bus come up from Florida:
An elderly lloosier who has been 

spending some time In Florida has 
been giving his leisure to fishing. Tbero 
is n fine iuke ncur where ho 1ms been 
Mojourning, and every day hi* was seen 
In silent meditation, for he is a think­
er, ousting his line into die clour wa- 
tor, apparently with success. Tills 
lloosier is known for his kiuduosa 
uml consideration of the feelings of 
olliers.

One day while absorbed In his lull­
ing an ulligutor slipped up to him, 
snapped olT one of his legs, and was 
making off with It. “Hefei” cried Hie 
fisherman, "come back. You’ve mode 
u mistuke. You've tukon the wrong 
leg:"

And so lie had. The fisherman wore 
un urllficlul leg. and tills It wus that 
the ulligutor had taken.—indlumipullu 
News.

Self-reverence. self-knowledge, self- 
control,

.Then.* three alone lead life to  sov­
ereign power.

—Tennyson. 

MORE SWEETS.

We are so hungry for sweets that 
nt this season when sugar Is again 

plentiful tho desire to 
make hotne-tunde candles 
must he gratified.

Maple Creams.—Take 
four cupfuls of maple 
sugar, one cupful of wa­
ter, one-fourth of a t«i- 
spoonful of crcum of tar­
tar, added when the mix­

ture begins to boll. Stir until the su­
gar Is dissolved then remove the spoon 
und let it boll without stirring. If 
grains form on the sides of the kettle 
push them down with a hit of cloth 
on n fork, or Just covering the kettle 
tightly for a inltfute or two will keep 
them dissolved. Tost in cold water, 
and when tho soft ball stage is reach­
ed pour onto n marble slab or lightly* 
buttered platter. Let cool until the 
finger can dent It, tliep stir from the 
outsUh* to the center, working and 
kneading it until smooth and creamy. 
Put into a howl, cover with n damp 
cloth and let stand for a day or two to 
ripen. When ready to bo used, mold 
into small baits, finvor with tnnplelnc 
if desired and press a nut on top of 
each.
• Honey Caramels.—Take two cupfuls 

of strained honey and one square of 
chocolate; boil until it makes a firm 
bull when dropped into cold water. 
Take from the file and stir until It be­
gins to thicken, then add vanilla and 
chopped nuts. Pour into a shallow 
pan and mark off In squares when cool.

Nut Maple Roll.—Roll fondant Into 
long rolls on inch in diameter and cov­
er with nuts. Cut Jn slices and wrap 
in waxed paper. A most delicious roll 
is first dipped in a curainel, then roll­
ed In chopped nuts.

Parisian Sweets.—Tukc a pound 
each of dates and figs, a cupful of wal­
nuts and a cupful of ruislnB. Put the 
fruit through the meat chopper and 
cut the nuts fine with a 'kn ife ; mix 
into a ro ll; add a fourth of a teaspoon- 
fill of salt and wrap each roll in waxed 
paper. These moy he dipped ia melt­
ed fondant, then in chocolate, making 
a very elegant confection.

Orange marmalade mixed with a lit­
tle confectioner's sugar to stiffen, then 
dipped in white sugar fondant flav­
ored with orange or with orange Juice 
makes another tasty tid-blt.

T here  Is no du ty  we so much under­
ra te  o j being happy. By being happy 
we sow anopymous benefits upon the 
world, which rem ain unknown even to 
ourselves.—R. L. Stevenson.

THE HOUSEWIFE'S PROBLEMS.

We hear much of the servant prob­
lem these days and it is truly a hard 

one to solve; the 
mistress problem 
Is Just as difficult 
It Is worthy of 
note that a good 
m i s t r e s s  usual­
ly finds a good ser- 
an t; they stick, as 
does the bar of 

steel to tho magnet which attracts I t
Fully 80 per cent, and some statis­

tics say 00 per cent, of the homes of 
Amerlcu arc servuntless, and the 
housewife Is more exercised as to how 
to muke end - meet than to worry over 
a servant that site cannot afford to 
keep. Let the fortunate 10 to 20 per 
cent uttend to the servmft problem 
and the rest leurn better how to work 
without one.

There enn he no business on earth 
more Important or more elevating than 
that of making a gpod comfortable 
home with what one can afford of 
time, strength and money. “Be it 
m*r so humble, there's no place like 
homo." Do you feet it, slug ft and 
speak of it even after the shortcut ab­
sence? If not there Is something the 
matter with you or with the home.

Everything worth while is soim tlines 
hard, and even the artist, sculptor, 
musician or writer feds that bis work 
is drudgery lit times, so the housewife 
lias i io  monopoly on hard work. Em­
erson says; "It Is the office und right 
of tlie intellect to make, and not take 
ItM estimate*." Ho if there lack sweet­
ness and Joy in the dully tasks It is 
largely our own estimate, and we have 
only to change our viewpoint to see the 
pleasure we uro miNsiag. To feed a 
family with Intelligence In these days 
(not to consider economy, which Is of 
itself n problem) Is surely a task wor­
thy Hie best effort of mind and hand.

In the accomplishment of daily work 
the best results are obtained by Hie 
women with system; not but that sys­
tems must lie suspended at times to 
attend to more Important things, but 
work muy be turned off much quicker 
If a certain order Is followed. We 
must he nmnugers of our work, not lei 
<»ur work manage us. Tim woman who 
will Wash on Monday, though the 
heavens full, Is letting her work man 
age her.

Ho far there is no practical or pain­
less dishwasher that has been found 
useful In the ordinary home, so lids 
task so distasteful ttj many will still 
be found necessary as long as we con­
tinue to use dishes not made of paper. 
Here KtnetjHon tuny come to our aid 
qnd with the right thought make 
"drudgery divine."

(Special inform ation rtervtce, F atted  S tates hcparim eitt of Agriculture.)

SUITABLE DIET FOR THREE-YEAR-OLDS.

The Child Who Has Never Been Allowed Adult Pood Does Not Tease for I t

PLENTY OF MILK  
VERY NECESSARY

Do Not Expect Children to Thrive 
on Meals Selected Primarily 

for Adults.

INCLUDE PROTEIN IN RATION
_____i____

Little Forethought and Planning Need­
ed to Enable Suitable Food Being 

Served to Youngster*—Some 
Recipes Given.

Many parents make the mistuke of 
nllowing their children to eat what­
ever has been prepared for the grown 
members of the family, no mutter how 
unsuitable It may be. 'Sometimes this 
Is from ignorance of the results to the 
child, hut more often becuuse the moth­
er and housekeeper feels she is too 
busy to prepure u speclul diet for the 
small members of the fumlly.

Oftentimes part, or even all, of the 
food In the child’s rution may be 
selected from the family meals. When 
unsuitable food, however, comprises 
the adult menu, only a little fore­
thought and plunning will be needed 
to enable suitable food being served 
the children, according to specialists 
of the United States department of ag­
riculture. The sturdiness of the young­
sters will more tbun compensate for 
the extra work.

The meals given below have been 
found to provide food sufficient In 
amount and variety for the average 
healthy child of three years of age. 
They are examples of well-chosen 
meals. Many others equally satisfac­
tory could be planned.

Milk Always Advised.
One, at least, of the foods called for 

in each meal, milk, Is needed by all 
children; in others, the string beans 
und the beans and the prunes, for ex­
ample. can safely be replaced by other 
foods of the sume general kind.

Mculs like these could be prepared 
from the following dally food supply:

Vk pints milk
1 egg
4 oz. Hour o r other 

cereal (dry 
weight)

1 ox. or 2 level ta- 
bluspoonfuls su­
g a r o r  Its  equiva­
lent In o ther 
sweets

1 oz. o r 2 cubic ln». 
o r  2 level table- 
spoonful* of bu t­
te r  o r f t  cupful 
o f cream

8 to  12 oz. vegeta­
bles o r fruits, 
fresh  weight, or 
th e ir  equivalent 
dried

This ullowunce of cereal will muke 
six lurge U ounce) or eight medium- 
sized (three-fourlliH ounce) slices of 
bread or four ounces of bread and 
about one cup of cooked cereul.

Thrse Meals for Child of Three.

Breakfast.

B read-1  sm all slice 
<tt os.)

B u tter—2-3 ruble 
lni'h (2-3 OZ.) 

O iitm ea l- tt cupful 
(1 4  oz. uncooked)

Tho pulp of 2 or 3 
prune* cooked 
w ith u teespoen- 
ful of auger

Dinner,

Bread o r  toast — 1 
large o r  2 email 
slices (1 oz.))

B utter—2-3 ruble 
Inch or 1-3 oz.

1 egg, poached or 
boiled

t glass milk

4 oz. string  b rans 
served with 1 lev­
el traspoonful 
b u tte r o r a  little 
cream

% cupful oatm eal 
served w ith stew ­
ed fru it

Supper.

2 small o r J  lurgr 1 oz. honey 
slice b read  (1 oz.) i g lass milk 

2-3 cubic Inrh or 1-8 
oj. bu tter.

Not only Is tho health of tho wholn 
family improved, hut loss effort Is re­
quired of the mother where the menu 
for tho grownup* Is kept so simple 
that many of itje dishes may he given 
the younger children. In fills way the 
need of preparing speeln) dishes for 
the youngsters tinder five In eliminated.

Hlrups. inoluKses, honey, candy, or 
Jolly enn he used in place of the sugnr, 
or very finely chopped dried fruits, 
such as raisins, dates and figs, may 
he used to give KwcetneHS.

Loaf vegetables, such hh lettuce and 
gplmirh, are particularly vutuablo be­
cause of tho vitamins or the growth- 
•reducing substances tbsy supply. One

good way to serve them, Is to chop 
them fine, cook (hem In u little water, 
and make a soup by adding them ta 
hoi milk. Lettuce finely chopped can 
be mixed with butter to muke a sand­
wich filling.

The dally allowance given above in­
sures plenty of protein, vitamins, lime, 
irou ami other mineral substances, and 
also enough fuel for Hie average ch l.l 
If more is desired', it eaa safely he 
furnished in the form of breud or other 
cereal food, which is often the cheap­
est item on the hill of furc.

MEAT NOT NECESSARY i :
•  « ■ • 1
!! The main dish for any men) i > 
; J need not contain meut If milk, J | 
1« egg und fut, combined with »» 
\ J vegetables, are served. Dishes J ’ 
«i of this type are cream soups, •» 
) | .souffles and vegetables utilized Jj 
« • us the base for loaves, timbales, * • 
11 fritters and croquettes. \\

Breadjess Stuffing for Fowl.
Often you nmy not have dry bread 

or chestnuts on hand to stuff a fowl or 
you muy desire an entirely new recipe 
for a'chunge. In either event try:

Potato Stuffing.
2 cupfuls mashed 

potatoes 
1 egg (beaten)
1 sm all onion fine* 

v ly minced 
1 tablespoonful fat

1 sta lk  celery fine­
ly minced 

or
1 4  teaspoonful cel­

ery sa lt
1 teaspoonful sa lt 
Pepper

Mix the Ingredients and use In place 
of ordinary breud stuffing.

This recipe Is one recommended by 
the department of agriculture.

8tand Washing.
A cloth of plain weave shows soil 

quickly, but If It is firmly woven It 
stands rubbing well nod the dirt Is 
easily removed by wushlng. On the 
other hand, a loosely woven plain cloth 
must not be rubbed hard and must be 
carefully handled in drying so that 
the threads will not bo pulled out of 
place.

A twilled clotb does not show soli ns 
readily as plain, but It seems to hold 
the dirt more tenuclously. Materials 
of satin weaves do not stand friction 
as well as thoxe of plain weave.

Fancy, part gauze and part solid 
goods of the so-called leno weave not 
only stund very little friction, hut 
when washed must lie carefully pulled 
and stretched while drying to have tho 
goods keep Its original Khape and size. 
Loosely woven muterliilH of all kinds 
have greuter absorption powers than 
the closely woven varieties; this means 
less bluing for tlie loosely woven goods.

These are suggestions mudu by homo 
economics experts in tlie department 
of agriculture.

Foeding Fowls In Winter.
Feed grain in u deep litter on tho 

floor and make the hens exercise for 
I t  Tin.* rnnsh may be fed either wet 
or dry, and should be so regulated 
that the fowls will get about equal 
parts of nmsh and of the scratch 
grulns. It is necessary to give the 
fowls plenty to eat to get good results, 
but the birds should always he eager 
for each feed. In cold weather feed 
ubout one third of the seruteh grains 
in the morning and two-thirds at 
night. In this way Hie hens are forced 
to exercise more than If they receive 
all the grain they desire at tho morn­
ing feed. Scratch grains, mush or 
ground grains, nnlrnid protein, green 
feed, grit and shell should lie supplied 
in the winter. A good scratch mixture 
nmy he inude of equal parts, hy 
weight, of cracked corn, wheat, and 
oats; and a mash nmy be made of 
tw*o parts common) and one part 
euch of wheat bran, wheat middlings 
and beef scrap. Greco feed, such as 
eahhuges, mangel warzel beets, cut 
alfalfa, or sprouted oats, should he 
supplied—to replace tho green feed 
which tlie fowls have been securing 
In tin1 fields; and beef «*• fish scrap, 
skim milk, cut green Imne. or some 
wiudlur feed Is needed to replace |||<< 
hugs which the fowls have been get- 
ting on the range. Jb ef scrap or feed 
of this nit hire Is very essential In s«* 
curing n good supply of eggs during Hu 
winter months.

A little ginger added to a stUe.i 
dressing Is u pkasvit flavoring.

s

HUS! m e  r a n
Duty Devolving on Farmers of 

This Continent.

Western Canada Welt Prepared to 
Meet the Needs of the Old World— 
“The Earth Is a Machine Whioh 
Yields Almost Gratuitous Service to 
Every Application of Intellect”— 
Emerson.

Speaking with one of the commle- 
filoners appointed to make u survey of 
the food situation In the battle-torn 
countries of Europe the writer was 
told that the depletion and shortage 
of food was far greater than anybody 
hail expected. With the investigation, 
which at that time hud merely started, 
much had been brought to light that 
had only been surmised. Herds of live 
stock were completely wiped out, fields 
tbat had been prolific yielders 6f grain, 
roots and vegetables were terraced and 
hummocked by bombs and shells, 
many of them still lying unexptoded 
and dangerous. Until this hind can be 
gone over and clenm nothing In the 
way of cultivation can be cnrrled on, 
and even where that is done the work 
of leveling and getting under cultiva­
tion will take a long time.

Much more devolves upon the fanner 
on this side of the Atlantic than was 
at first supposed. Herds of live stock 
will have to be replenished, and this 
will take years; the provisioning of 
tho people in the meantime is tho task 
tho farmers here will be asked to un­
dertake. Producing countries will be 
taxed to tbelr utmost to meet this de­
mand; all that can be provided will 
be needed. This need will continue 
for some time, and during this period 
prices will be high. The opinion of 
those who have given the question 
most careful thought and study Is that 
food scarcity will be greater than ever 
before. The Allies will have to feed 
Germany, Austria, Turkey and Russia 
and this in addition to the require­
ments of European neutrals for In­
creased supplies now that there Is no 
submarine menace.

To the Canadian and American farm­
er this means a demand for his grain 
fully as great as at any time In the 
past Wheat will be needed, meat will 
be required. The slogan “don’t stop 
saving food” Is as necessary today as 
ever. The purpose of this article Is to 
direct attention to the fact that hun­
dreds of thousands of acres of land 
Id Western Canada are still unoccu­
pied, and this land Is capable of pro­
ducing enough to supply all needs. On 
Its rich grasses ore easily raised—and 
cheaply too—the cattle that will be 
sought; In Its soil lies the nutriment 
tbat makes easy the production of the 
grain that will be needed, and In both 
the farmer will be assured of a good 
profit on his Investment. The land can 
be purchased at low prices, on easy 
terms, and with the abundance of re­
turns that It will give, It does not mean 
a matter of speculation. The facts as 
set out are known, and certainly are 
guaranteed.

These facts, the low cost of the land, 
and its great productivity, combined 
with the admirable marketing and 
transport facilities at the disposal of 
the farmer make farming In Western 
Connda nn attractive proposition.—Ad­
vertisement.

The Big Noise.
Charles M. Schwab nuld In a Hog 

Islnnd address:
“If the German famine keeps on, fhe 

strikes will keep «n, and the whole 
country will go out of existence. 
There'N nothing like fumlno to cause 
revolution. Am the Dutchman said:

“ ‘Empty NtuinmlckH muke der most 
n o lm “

■ 1 A
True contentment Is founded on 

what you have and never on what you 
muy Home day pomkonh.

Weekly Health Talks
A  W ord About the 

Kidneys
BY DOCTOR WATSON.

People ore easily frightened when they 
think something is tlie mutter with their 
lungs or heart, and well they may be; but 
fow people understand the dangers of dis­
eased kidneys. These orguns liave s duty 
of vital importance to perform, and if they 
ore diseased, there ia no telling how or 
where the symptoms may appear. The 
kidneys are filters, und when they are 
heuitby they remove the poisons from the 
blood snd purify it. When the kUlnaya 
arc diseased, the poisons are spread every­
where, und ono of these poisons is urie 
arid. The urie acid is carried til through 
Hie system and deposited in various places, 
in the form of urate salts—in the feet, 
ankles, wrists snd hack—often forming 
bags under the eyes. Ronietimrs the result­
ing trouble is culled rheumatism, lumbago, 
sciatica and backache. Finally, come slope 
in the bladder, diabetes and Bright’* din- 
on sc.

Dr. Pierco, of Buffalo, N. Y., In recent 
yours, discovered that a certain combina­
tion of remedies would dissolve uric acid 
(urate salts) in the system. He found this 
combination to be harmless, so that he 
mode it up in tnhlets, of double strength, 
and mllcd litem Atiurie Tablets. They 
d'ssolvc uric arid in the human system as 
hot coffee dissolves sugar. Jf you have 
uric acid troubles, don't delay in taking 
Anurlc Tablets, which can he secured in 
the drug stores. You can write Dr. Pierce, 
t , 0 ,  and he will tell you what to eat and 
1 ' to live so that mora vt-io acid wifi not

n In your aystem. Dr» Pieros will sot 
1 A*, go for this advlct*
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The above diagram  shows the distribu­

tion o f the avefage Swift dollar received 

from sales of beef, pork and mutton, 

and their by-products, fduring 1918.

f

1919 Year Book of Intsreating and 
Instructive beta lent on raqocat.

Addraaa Bwlft Company 
Union Stock Yards, Chicago, Illinois

S w ift  &  C o m p an y, U .S . A .

lA W te m  Canada's
"Horn of

QffersYmHeaHh
Pleirhf

X
WestamCanadafor 

yeara haa helped to toed the world—ths same reaponab 
v  bilUymproducllonjtlllreitsunonher.
White high price* for Grain, Cattle amf Sheep 

are aure to remain, prloraf land ia much below It* value. 
Land copablo s f  yiaMlag 2 0  to  4 9  Swob- 
•la off wtioot to  tho a e ra  can bo bod oo 
«aay torm o a t  ffrooi 1 1 9  to  $ 9 0  por 
oero—good gracing land n t much loan* 

Many farms paid for frwm a elntfle year's crop. Railing cattle, shrep ami Intys beings wniursucceM. ThsGovrmmnil 
wocouragea farming and stock raising. Hallway and 
L«nd Companiesulfer unusual Indoremanti to Homo Seek* ora. Farms may n* wrakwil l»y loan* nt moderate interest, wratern Carudn offer* biw tiXHtimi, yood market* and ahlp* 
plain fine K’ltooli. cliurdwa and Jiralthful climate. *
Per M rtlm lm  m  to  m tovd  railway «M*a. loMtawnf land, Olo*’ iastea liuwsiur*. aw.. apply ts tluirf of IimbI*., Ottawa, Cm., or

ttO. A. HALL, III Iwssd Stmt. NILWAUKCt Wl*
f'srnwlJAai Uuvrrnini nt A unit

D I S T E M P E R
or HtrnntiH'H In r t i l l lo n s , brood mori'j*. mill n*l oilo'r* 
Ih m ust ili’r tn i r i l t 'i ’. 'I'Jh- w ro i  c iiu m I i i /  tlliu*u*“ inn;*t In* 
!'■ inovciJ from 11*4 body nf ()ui m ilm ul. Vo j i ' i v i n l  t'i« 
iroublu tin* wirnt* m a rt h r done.

M’OJI.VN (OMPOIM)
will r|i» hidti -i,tiri' tin* sh-k and jin*vi<nt Ihoni* ,*»-x*»rirr«‘ir* 
from Im vhur tin- iIihi'iihm. Kohl by vntir d n i” tr<i.i <••• llif 
tnitnnrm tiiM i’H. K|im*jii MimIIciiI r«i„ >| rod,.I ,S .\,

COME TO THE
SHORTHORN CONGRESS

AT tyllCACO, ILL*, Pm. 10, 10, 20 
■  1 m bUraatlaiilSbiw Pavlik*

Mam 18,000 IN CASH PK12L8
MO Riflitiricl Shorthorn#

in the Show and All 
to be Bolt* in the Audios 
Tbn Hlmrtiiom la tin* furm- 
•f'e brt'Dil, Her faint ml lit. 
Now It the tint* to produce 
Kilb. M)MIS amJ XKINti 
yoor neiabbor. L>nk over 
(tin ratlin and get acquaint-

______  rd with tbn breeder#.
Anrrlf#* Shorthorn Breeden’ Aiiodillon, Chlcif*

Baby Colds
require treatment with a remedy that eoo* 
tame no opiate*, Dio’s la mild but elfcc* 
tivr, pleasant to take. Ask your druggist for

PISO’S

Surprise Natural.
“Von nuuhl in Inivc hitm tin* Mir 

ItrWi'tl look oil tin* co|i'h faro when hi* 
lii'lrtouor siuhh»l»ly Hcoolod."

"Thai was imiimll, A boll from tin 
liltii* Ih always sm'in'lslng, ymi know,' 
• HoMlntl 'I’l-iilliMTllil.

No limit N ho piml hul wlmt In 
I'uiilil In- hi’iloi’ nml (Vw uk'm iiro *< 
liiid hul wlint th»\v might In* worn*,

V s i i v m  Oramilafed Eyelids
J[ Eyes inflamed by expo

Eyes
sure to Sao, Dull and wfs

2'ilckly relieved by Murin 
ye Remedy. NoSmartinp 

just Eye Comfort, 
igeiite or by

Por In k  #1 Ike Cyi fret writs
Nttrip# Eyo fton tdy  Co* Cblc«g«

Your Druggiite or by mail COc per Bonk

Gettysburg Sees Something Different From Rattle

GKTTYSBTJRO, PA.—(’tin the post offico and tho Rclioolhouso be linked 1 
tuifetlier in a successful co-ordination of producers anti consumers of food? 

The people of Park View district, Washington, 1». t\, have n nourishing coin*
niunity center. The community secre­
tary Is a postii! station agent.

One of the motortruck routes 
from Washington lends to (ieitysburg, 
Pa. In this region hundreds of tons 
of vegetables, I'ruil, and so forth, have 
rutted simply for lack of a market.

The route passes through Mount 
Joy township, Adams county, Pn., 
which is on the edge of the historic 
battlefield of Gettysburg. The pro­
ducers gathered in the Two Tavern 
schoolhotise and formed the Mount Joy 

Community association. The teacher was made the community secretary and 
u postal agent of the motor transport service of the post otlice department.

The motortruck stops each morning nt (tie mTiooIIiouso and picks up the 
crutes of eggs, containers of butter, hoses of poultry, etc. These goods are 
delivered the same evening at the Park View ‘•'•lmoihouse in Washington and 
there distributed to the people of the comtiumity.

The list of prices is sent each week by tin* Mount Joy community secre­
tary to the Park View community secretary. Orders are sent out and the 
goods shipped as desired. Payment is made by check weekly, anti the com­
munity secretary at Mount Joy keeps the records of the shipments made by 
each farmer and makes payments accordingly.

It is the first direct communication between rural and urban communities 
by means of the motor transport service in American history. It Is but the 
beginning, for already the Washington comimmity is demanding more than 
the entire output of the township and other organizations urc being formed 
to meet the demand.

At Gettysburg oft years ago was fought the greatest lmille on American soil. 
There, on the sltJ of battle where men went through blood nno ‘bv because 
of disunion and secession, has begun a movement lor unity um| eo-operatUm.

Children and Soldiers in a Red Cross Canteen

^jSyTEFN

CHICAGO.—Kenneth, eight years old; Keith Hernurri. seven, and Dimples 
Ilurtmru Hayes, "five and one-half, goin’ on six," spent a -day at the Jtcd 

(Toss cunteen, ,'KMi South Michigan itveuue. Kenneth and Keith and Dimples 
arrived that morning from Monteseim.
Wash., on their way to Join their 
grandma, Mrs. C-. C. !i1?cs, who lives 
at Norris, Ivy. Just a mouth ago the 
three children tost their father and 
mother, Mr. and Mrs. Juy Hayes, who 
diet! of the influenza. Then Aunt Ida, 
who "didn’t have no other name,” took 
the three tinder her wing ami iffnvt» 
them a home. A week later she, too, 
was dead of the mulady.

Neighbors took counsel and a col­
lection. Kenneth and Keith and Dim­
ples were bundled up in their warmest clothing, tugged through to Norris, 
given $3, and started on their way. From the time the big train pulled out of 
Tacoma, their life was u round of pleasure. For four duys they delighted 
their fellow passenger*, who took up a  collection that ruined their currency; 
from $3 to $36.

A passenger agent at Union station called up Mrs. Joseph T. Ryeraon, 
who sent her car for tlte children. In the canteen were soldiers who seemed 
to to  homeless also. Dimples Introduced herself and got the history of cuch 
one.

Kenneth sut still und stately •« becomes u man and managed the other 
two us best he might. Keith's ulcerated tooth—it didn’t pain much and 
kept him iu the limelight—was lanced. At Nupper Kenneth said '‘grace.” 

When a reporter win* assisting the lady In straightening her 0*10(111*8 for 
a picture she confided In a w h ite r  that, her "bloomers was red. too, aud they 
ruu red water when they was washed.” *

The children resumed their Journey at 11:20 thut night, three in a berth.

Cupid and Cupidity at Indiana’s Marriage Mill

C ROWN WJINT, IND.—Forty-odd miles south by wnithcast, as Cupid Hie*, 
lies Crown I’olnt, ItmL, famous us a "lovers’ loop," where marriage is 

timde e*sy while you wait. Intrenched deeply In tike iiflVctlmiH of the town
is uii institution known as the "mar­
riage mdil" that grinds out the daily 
bread of a number uf (Town Holm's 
InllucutUiI citizens.

Ami <Y«wn Point is sorei And 
Grown l*oiut is sore at Chicago. And 
Crowu Point Is sore at Chicago be­
cause the 4’hicago newspapers have 
published (lie statement thut with tin 
approval of (Jovernor Goodrich of In­
diana solons of tlmt slate were pre­
paring to (mss a law requiring u resi 
deuce of one year in the statu on (Ik* 

part of one of Hu* applicants for a marriage license. The repented declara­
tions of Chicago divorce judges (Iui1 *'qtt1"lt and eusy” nmrrluges euiise most 
matrimonial inismutlng prompted the proposed action.

There were 4.V2H marriage licenses Issued III Crown Point last year. 
Practically all of the applicants were wed in the town, mid practically all hy 
two Justices of the pence, The standard fee Is $5.

Up to November -i, election day. .Juslh-c of the Pence Harry II. Nicholson 
hud Ih'cu performing Ho* "liless you, my children," act at $n am! up per Kerne, 
He was defeated und he retired to Florida for the winter with Ids family, 
lie Is declared to have performed lH.UO*' uiarrluges in olllcc. Village gossip 
places the number much hlglic*.

Herbert Wheaton, elerk of l.ake county, lias declared war. "We'll (!;:h‘ 
to the finish any attempt to pass a law to stop marrying in Grown Point. I 
don't see why Ghlrugo aunts to butt In on our afTalrs. It's none of OlilcuimT 
business wluil goes on in Indiana."

F O M JH E R
HAY ahdoATS

(o fM r J )

Where Names and Business Fit; It Is to Laugh

NKW Y o HK,—Among (lie foadires of Mils cosmopolitan c ity tlm t furnish 
amusement without cost to many observant nsldenis are mimes over 

stores and business establishment*. The appropriateness of the uomenclaturu 
to. the calling Is sometimes startling 
and generally amusing, Here are a 
few of the most s trik ing  of the mime:, 
found In singular Juxtaposition i<>
htjsincNHOH ami callings and w idth 
stem almost Him hmmirous fiction:

Poddhcr. liny and oalH; Vamp, shoe­
maker; Klciie. h inm liv ; Tleuinu. hob-' 
cnhmher; Goodman, pastor; Klseman, 
optometrist: Piper, orchestra lender;
Jim Huh, Ghiinwe Inumlryman; P.crry, 
umli lin k e r; Poll, p-nl estate; Happer 
»V h lliigw e il, cloaks mid sa ils ; lln ldcr,
tranks and tings; bWeham. private dcleeilvc agem-y; Tal.hm-, phob.-p-aj i. i ; 
Dare, steeplejack; SterlJhg, Hlhersmilh; Darns, kindling wood; Tinker, tin 
Hinllh; Silteher, tttobler; iiealln. phy •b-hm: Uieki*y, llipior denier; Mmoknnn. 
cigar tltmler; Hlack. Idecksniitli; Korn, chirnpodiKl; Pulleio, ileiitisl; 'Vn\*-r. 
Imli’ilri s.‘.cr; Waters, milk denier; p.rsikcliuc, stocks nml bonds; S-n'i, •• 
pressman; Sma-hiH. moving vans; l.lidni;-. eleetrlelnn ; Gb-m, i.imp-; :-.n**- . 
boilermaker; Smith, hor-eahoei ; Keys, li.i-ksmlili; Dyer deanin;* and dyeing, 
Good’diuwc. thealrle.il ummigtr; SkliimT, m\l'drrmlKt; Sn-nv, i.-e dealer; 
Hlmrpe, cutler;: Wright, itlm.dmitetl sign.; P.\le, dm-lc build r; Sbipm.i..,. 
Mtevedore; Taylor, taller; Fenles*, re-'tmrani keeper; Kobleiv, palids and 
•'urnlsh: lhik»-r, baker; Fum-iimum, eomertloper; i'ennypar-l;;-:-. toy b - ; 
I .'II. gln/.ler; llnnimi*isej*!.l(, bnrdwe»c; W'lgbt, publl" identtfj.upher; 
gerw, public account*;*/
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Be Sure to Get

K L E t t

HE wax-wrapped 
sealed package 
with WRIGLEY'S 
upon it is a guar­
antee of quality.

The tamest chewlhfr 
sum factories In the 
world-the lariest 
selling gum in the 
world: that is what 
WRIGLEVS means.

SEALED TIGHT 

KEPT RIGHt

4 *
WBAPPCD
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The Flavor Lastsl
Dissipating.

Crossroads Merchant—My wife Is a- 
visitin’ velutlons In the city.

Traveling Salesman (with a wink)— 
llavlug a gootl time during her ab- 
senee, 1 suppose?

('niMHroads Merchant—\yell, to tell 
the truth, it was darn close to eight 
o'clock before 1 got the store opened 
this inomiiT.—HufTulo Express.

$100 Reward, $100
Catarrh ie a local dlieaie greatly influ­

enced by constitutional condition!. It 
therefore require* conitltutlonal treat­
ment. HALL'S CATARRH MEDICINE 
is taken Internally and acts through ths 
Blood on the Mucoue Surface* of the Sys­
tem. HALL’S CATARRH MEDICINE 
destroy* the foundation of ths dlsi-nse, 
Rives the patient strength by Improving 
the general health and assists nature in 
doing Its work. flOO.OO for any case of 
Catarrh that HALL’S CATARRH 
MEDICINE fall* to cure.

Druggieta 76c. Testimonials free.
F. J. Cheney A Co., Toledo, Ohio.

•Tull
Mournful Number*.

"Wlmt did the poet menu hy 
me not In mournful ntunhurs?' ”

'Maybe he was figuring on a hill the 
restaurant waiter had handed him."

Not Atway*.
"Who breaks, pays."
"That shows how much you know? 

about the people who are broke."

The hurt
Stop

of a b
Cole's CarbolUalve la

urn or a cut atop* when
died.

S top  th e  P e ls .
>r a cu 

appllt
quickly without near*. 26c and 60c by 
all druggist*. For free sample Write Tho 
J. W. Cole Co., Rockford, III.—Adv.

’f f heals

Great thoughts seldom com* Id  
bunches.

Wist* Ih the man who knowH wlmt 
not to say to a woman.

Home men have a mania for doing 
nothing—and do It assiduously.

Spanish Influenza can 
be prevented easier than 
it can be cured. * i

At the first sign of a' 
shiver or sneeze, take

C A S C A R A ^  QUININE

Standard cold remedy for 20 years—la tablet 
form—»afe, aure. no opiate#—breaks up ■  cold 
in 24 hour#—relieve* trip In 3 daya. Money 
back if it fails- The genuine bos has eRed ton 
with Mr. Hill's picture. At All Drug Store#.

W. N. U., MILWAUKEE, NO. 5-1919.

Letter from
B o ssy
If a cow entile! speak she would talk 

about her health u* people do—because 
cows suffer from ailments, little and big, 
the same a* human beinjf*. When g cow 
i* sick, she needs medicine as much si a 
sick person does.

Mere rationing will not eliminate 
disease ; medicinal treatment Is neces­
sary, Die mo»t common cow ail­
ments. such as Abortion, Retained 
Afterbirth, Lost Appetite, B. - . - ........ . Junchefi
Scours, etc., result from a diseased 
condiuoa of the digestive or genital 
organa* Any of these diseases and 
many other* can be successfully 

treated or prevented by using Kow-Kure, the great cow medicine.
Kow-Kurs is selontlllcslly prepared for th r treatment of eow dU- 

**•#• only. I t  put* ths vitid orynna In comllllon to eliminate 
dUraas and function regularly. Prevent #lckn«-»s by 0Ccu< 
sionally tiling Kow-Kure. p erj dealer* and drug 
glats sell it—00c. and f  1.20 packages, |  O**
Frse foe*, *• THE HOME COW DOCTOR,” 

etnt oo request.

Dairy Association Co., LV/r°mn0i"t̂

Clew sod Clear 
asWsttf For Contagious Abortion

Tborotijtli um <>f D-K as outlined la <rir Dulktio 62, ’TonUckius Abortion," is ths #umt p - • s 
Irnowo orcontrolliog CooUgieui Alxsiiub, isercDtiug lierrvnttr##, usd rnuovitii iU -iinad 
Lirih.

Compile Irrigation of ths uterus tsd vstioal (rart Is easy with B-K. B*K kiQa thn [nfrrtiag
Sr.-mi and foul mIkm-  brals tho iilefus—rroiorr# tli# alime aod brirl—nn IrnUtioo—do Hrwolii#. 
UK is much tnnre effrrtivs aad eafrr to uas than lyaoL rartutie arid, Lugvl's sotutioo or wal-tar di*» 
ofedaota, winch do out daaoa* tbs uterus, but make it more add.

Awarded 
Oald Mrda! 

fks^Psc. Lipu.

If your dealer docs not have B-K, seod us bis asms.
FnEEBl'M.RTlNB: AndforcompleteioformatlOB—"8p* 
rial trial offrt" end bulletins No. 62, "Cootŝ ous Aboftioo," 
sod No. D6,”CaU Bcoura."

General Laboratorlea
IN Sa. DkhteM St* 
Ma«a«. Wlâ U.S.A

jj-r. .d r  k J-k • Jj-g. U-|C
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? INTEREST ON LIBERTY BONDS
IS DUE AS FOLLOWS:

i

1st Liberty Loan.................June 15th and Dec, 15th

2nd Liberty Loan................ May 15th and Nov, 15th

3rd Liberty Loan............March 15th and Sept, 15th ;

4th Liberty Loan................April 15th and Oct. 15th ;;

M a k e  a n o te  o f th is  i n f o r m a t i o n  
f o r  f u t u r e  r e f e r e n c e .

»

You can leave Your Liberty Bonds with us ; 
for safe-keeping for which we will issue a I 
safekeeping receipt. No charge for this service ! I

Negaunee State Bank

AWEEK’S NEWS NOTES
'  Paragraphs About Negaunee 

Affairs.

k COLUMN OF LOCAL HAPPENINGS

In te resting  Items About Towns­

people and  Their Business 

and  Social Affairs.

-To-morrow is Washington's birth­
day. ______________

—Two “drunks” in Ishpeming drew 
jail sentences on Monday.

—Tbo present mild winter has 
meant a great saving in coal.

—A baby boy has gladdened the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Gust Uanlelaoo, 
Boyer Avenue.

—Some people who give skimmed 
inlIk at the door expect tho Lord to 
credit it as cream.

—The Cloveland-Cliffa Iron Com­
pany will pay its Neguunee employes 
next Tuesday—2oth Inst.

—Hans Jenson won the first prize 
at tho Liberty Theater, Alfred Doldge 
the second and Wilfred Hoyea the 
third. _____________

—Mrs. Johanna Holmgren, aged 70 
years, and a resident of Isbpciniog 
for tho past 46 years, died last Satur­
day at her homo in that city.

—Haul Srnltham, former Nogaunee 
resident, died last week at Kinney, 
Minn., and bis remains were given 
interment In this city last Sunday 
afternoon.

—At an early hour Wednesday 
morning, the thermometer dropped to 
7 below xoro, but daylight brought 
on a rising temperature and the 
weather became quite mild through­
out tho day.

—County Clork Jenks has an offi­
cial notice In this issue of the Iron 
Herald to the effect that owing to 
there being no opposing candidates 
there will be no primary election on 
March 5th.

—The Negaunee Alumni basketball 
team was defeated in a contest with 
the Cwino quint, at Gwlnn last Satur­
day evening by n scoro of 61 to 11. It 
was a fast and clean gume throughout 
and was witnessed by a large crowd.

’—Mrs. George Jewell, aged ‘JO 
years, died nthcr home in Vine street 
on Thursday evonlng, Februury IMth, 
afar a few duys illness with pneumo­
nia. Thu funeral was held Saturday, 
with services at St. Haul’s Catholic 

• church. Besides her father, she Is 
survived by her husband and two 
csmull children,

. —A bill to permit persons absent 
from their homes throughout the per­
iod of registruton to have their names 
put down on the voting lists by send­
ing an sMlduvit to the bourd of regis­
tration has been Introduced in the leg­
islature. Jt Is lutended to be a ooiu* 
panton measure to the present absent 
voters law.

LOST—Between Foitolllcennd Erick* 
son’s store, Case street, apairof gold* 
rimtuod glasses. Upward if returned
iO T. M. Wkli.h.

Catarrh Cannot Be Cured
With LOCAL APPLICATION!!, us they 
cannot rouch the ■ml nf the riUunae 
Catarrh (■ u JomJ disease. greatly la* 
flurmsd by constitutional cotiultlons, and 
In order to cur* It you must taka an 
Internal rt-mudy. Hall** Caturrh Medi­
cine la taken Internally and acta thru 
tho blood on the mucous eurfaers o( (hi* 
ayatem. Haifa Catarrh M-dtcluo waa
fireacrlbol by one of tho beat physlclana 
n this country for years. It la com­

posed of some of tho beat tonlcn known, 
combined with sown of (he heat blood 

■ purifiers. The perfect combination of 
the Initn'illi-nta In Hull's Catarrh Medl- 
#•!»<• i» what produce# such wonderful 
results In catarrhal conditions, tiend for 
testimonials, free,
r  J- CHKNKY A CO.. Props., Toledo, O. 

All Druaulats, 76c.
Ball's Family Pills for constipation.

—The Iron Herald subscription
list continues to grow.

— *
—There will be no primary election 

Id Negaunee.

—The dog races Id Ishpeming to­
morrow will attract, a goodly Dumber 
from Negauuee.

—One week from (text Wednesday, 
March 5th, will be Ash Wednesday, 
the first day of Leot.

—Don’t forget the Escanaba-Ne- 
zaunee basketbalj game at Negaunee 
High School gymnasium to-night. 
Your money's worth guaranteed.

—The drys are satisfied, the wets 
are dissatisfied. But^taow about the 
class of our cltlzeoB who are wetter 
than dry aod dryer than wet- how do 
they lake It?

—To-morrow will be the last day 
for registration for womeo voters in 
Negaunee Ip order to give them au 
opportunity to vote in tbe primary 
election of March 5th.

—Now comes the time when all 
women can have a part in using the 
symbol of our republic. Your first 
’step is to register. Use your vote. It 
was hard to get.

—Rob.ert Thompaoo, the local Ice 
man, has completed tbo work of fill­
ing his lce*houses with Teat Lake ice 
for summer use and is at present en­
gaged In tilling Winter & Suess' Ice 
house.

—With the continued fine weather, 
all are expecting an early spring— 
and there is reason for this expecta­
tion. But there are many a slip be­
tween the cup and the lip, and some­
times In a weather way.

"T h e  6 uiid Hall basketball team 
will go to Marquette to-night for a 
match game at tbe Baraga Social 
Center with the Young Men’s Catho­
lic Club. The local luds expect to 
“ bring home the bacon,” too.

—Tbe Negaunee High School bas­
ketball team won from Escanaba 
Friday night-soore 26 to 17. The 
St. John's Guild hall team was de­
feated by the Young Men’s Catholic 
club in Murquette last night.

—Escanaba and Isphumlng high 
school basketball teams came together 
In contest at Escanaba last Friday 
night und after u hot contest Escuuaba 
won. Score III to 18. The first imlf 
finished 11 to H In favor of tho Ksca- 
nuba tentn.

—Have you heard ibis one? A Swede 
came down from tbe woods and enter­
ing a saloon, asked fur u drink of 
good old squirrel whiskey. The bar­
tender said, "We have no squirrel 
whiskey, but we,vu got some good Old 
Crow.” “ Oh, Judas I’riest!” said the 
Swede, “ l don't want to lly; I just 
warn to hop around a little.”

—The filing of a petition bearing the 
game of Mil* Barbara Evert a* He- 
publican cuodldato for countv school 
commlssonor, necessitates a primary 
election Murch 6. iThe petition of 
W iliam Bath, tbe incumbent, was 
filed some ago und an Interesting con* 
test is in prospect for tbo voters. The 
oontest wilt be uuuiuai us it Is tbe 
first time a woman bat sought a 
Houghton county office.

.—The U. S. Civil Service commis­
sion announces an open competitive 
examination at Marquette for railway 
mail clerk, for both men and women 
on March 15. Vacancies in the rail­
way mail service throughout tho 
United States, at the entrance suiury 
of $1,000 u year, will be filled from 
tilts examination. Applicants must 
have reached their eighteenth but not 
their thirty-fifth birthday on the date 
of their examination, and tui*t be 
free from physical defects.

Indigestion
Take a tew doses of t'hainberluln's 

Tablets u- directed for indigestion, 
and you forget nbput your
siumuen tumbles. Try it.

N E G A U N E E  I RON H E R A L D

PABLO
The Happy 

"Hoppy" Drink
MADE BY PABST AT MILWAUKEE

A  H e a l t h f u l  D r in k .  
C o n t a i n s  N o  A lc o h o l .  i

P ro m pt  At t e n t io n  Given  to  

M ail or P h o n e  Ord ers .

*7 * SEND US A TRIAL ORDER.

CHAS. JOHNSON, Agent
NEGAUNEE, MICH.

1
■ '  l)It takes GRIT

to start saving money
I t  takes’ j ’r it to  d e n y  yo u rse lf o f  ce rta in  jplca& m r 

a n d  lu x u r i e s ,  b u t  y o  u  p u t o f f  .s ta r t in g.
"You  c a n 't J ra sp  the sekeme o f  growth —  tlia t sue- ( 

cess b e f in s  as a bud a jid  fJiat tbe r ip en ed  I ru i t  o f  f o r tu r e ^  
w ill  n eV er he y o u r s  if* y o u  k i l l  th e  hAossom o f  chance. * y 
by- th e  e a r l y  iS 'o s t o f n e j l e c i *  f/erberi hbufvarv

F I R S T N A T I O N A L B A N K
A B A N K - f ' O R - A L L - T H E - P E O P L E

M EG A U IiEE*TV tlCH IG A ri

Negaunee forty Y ^i*6 Hgo.
i t e m s  r e p r o o u o m d  p r o m
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Tbe Jackson mine, tbe oldest lo tbe 
district, continues to open new de­
posits continually. Tbe mine never 
looked better or more promising than 
it doeB at tbe present time and should 
tbe demand require it, tbe shipments 
tbe coming season could be made to 
exceed those of any previous year. 
Tbe developments at No. 7 are par­
ticularly gratifying, a drift running 
north snowing a fine body of hematite, 
which apparently underlies tbe whole 
of West Iron street. It seems that 
the Jackson cannot be exhausted un­
til every foot of the property has been 
mined.

The marriage ceremony of Louis 
Vashaux to Miss Howe is announced 
to take piace Saturday afternoon 
next at St. Paul's Church, this city, 
Rev. Father Verttn officiating.

Our Italian townsman, Mr. George 
Mushratte, of whose prospective for­
tune mention has heretofore been 
made, received the gratifying Intelli­
gence Stiaday that he was at liberty 
to draw on a Chicago bank for $40,- 
000. George doesn't feel a bit proud, 
and receives tbe ’congratulations of 
bis friends with a nonchalance that is 
commendable. Nevertheless, there 
are plenty that would like to put 
“ you yourself in bis place.”

Dr. A. Desjardlng and Miss Eva 
Bbbeau, of Ishpeming, were married 
In Marquette, tbe ceremooy being 
performed by tho Rev. Father Kenny. 
The doctor, though comparatively 
young In bis profession, has gaioed 
an enviable reputation as as a practi* 
tloner, and his friends are legion.

Mr. K. P. Harriman arrived in 
the city Sunday last and expresses 
himself as determined to prosecute 
bis search for mineral wealth.

Married, on Wednesday of last 
week, at the residence of the bride’s 
parents In Menominee, Mr. A. J. 
Mead, of Humboldt, to Miss Marie V. 
Fraser. The happy couple now make 
tbeir home at Humboldt, where a 
largo circle of friends, together with 
tbe Iron Herald, wish them un­
bounded happiness during tbeir wed­
ded life.

No lovers of terpalchorean exercise, 
combined with a grand carnival of 
fun, will fall to attend tho masquerade, 
on Monday evening next, to be given 
by the Excelsior Club. It will be 
the first legitimate masquerade of tbe 
season and the energy displayed by 
tbe club should be liberally patroolt- 
od. The music will be furnished by 
Dominic's celebrated baod, with Fitz­
patrick as prompter.

Rev. W. H. Thompson, of Escana­
ba, preached a t tbe Negauuoo M. E. 
Church last Sunday morniug uod ev­
ening to large audteucei.

The St. Clair brothers have award­
ed u coutruct to Cupt. George Herrin- 
ger for the removal of some 26,000 
ton* of rock at tho Wlnthrop mine, 
and tie  work is already in progress.

The family of C H, Ripley leaves 
California to day for home and are 
expected to arrive here early next 
week.

A singularly hold robherv was 
committed In ishpeming Iasi week, 
the victim being the jeweler, 8 . F, 
Sandmark. In all. the value of the 
silverware, watches, e’c., stolen 
amounts to about $2000,

We are ludehted to Landlord Tretu­
ba th. of the Jackson House, for a 
continuation of the weather record 
of February, During the week from 
the 13th to the 10th there were fine 
days with below zero tomporature, 
the lowest having been 15.

Hon. Edward Breitung Is sojourning 
in Chicago, muktug arrangements for 
extended explorations on tils proper­
ly on the Penoka Iron range.

John McKeona is engaged in sink­
ing another exploration shaft on the 
property recently leased by him on 
the Menominee range.

Barney Norton, a fine, rnorgetlc 
young man, left the city by Monday’s 
train to jolu his brother, James, who 
is at present superintendent of the 
Esmcruldu .Smelting Works, Eureka, 
Nevada.

Time prevents us giving an extend­
ed notice of the carnival at the r>nk. 
Tuesday evening. The number in 
masks did not quite equal those of 
the former owe. but were finer than la 
usually brought out <m such occasions. 
The prizes were owunled ns follows; 
C o m b in a tio n  silvi r set to  H, M. At- 
kitisou »nd Charb s Mitchell: scrotal 
prl/.iq silver knife, fork stni spoon, to 
impulse Kruse und Willie Mitchell; 
third prize, silver napkin rink, to 
Walter Sterling uud Miss Ilarrloglou.

The bill extending for a time the 
construction of the Marquette & Mack­
inaw Railroad, carrylog with It all 
the advantages of the amendment of 
1875, passed the Senate last week and 
is now a law. Tbe measure was fierce­
ly attacked by the greenback element 
in both House and Senate, who were 
intent in making political capi­
tal by tbeir opposition to the project. 
In spite of the opposition of these 
heretics, the prospects of the enter­
prise are continually brightening, 
and there now seems little doubt that 
tbe construceloo of tbe road will be 
commenced early next season and be 
pushed to early completion. Ex-State 
Treasurer McCreery will be promi­
nently identified with tbe project and 
will.furnish a considerable amount 0/ 
tbe capital. Moses Taylor, of New 
York, is reported to have promised 
to take $250,000 of the stock upon con­
dition that 1600.000 Is subscribed in 
tbe city of Detroit, which we are as­
sured will be done. On tbe whole, tbe 
enterprise has never looked so favor­
able.

Just ae wo go to press we learn of 
tbe sudden death of John Seymour, 
the popular and accommodating bruke- 
mao on tbe M., H. ft O. R. R., which 
occurred at Republic while bis train 
was being made up. The cause of his 
death was heart disease. Deceased 
was a member of .Co. G,*of tbe Michi­
gan militia, aod he doubtless will be 
burled with military honors.

JuBllceJobn Jones has opened an 
office in tbe building just went of the 
Red Front store, formerly occupied 
by Neil Campbell for the same pur­
pose. The Joneses seem to have the 
bulge on the justice business—Gerahom 
Jones, Byron D.Jones and John Jones 
being tbe triumvirate that administers
justice to ligliants.

•
Frleuds of the Protestant Episcopal 

Society will be pleased to learn 
that the congregation have secured 
tbe services of Rev. Edwin A. Alcorn, 
of Detroit, who will begin bis duties 
Sunday morning. His locution here 
is permanent.

Two bills reuuing to Michigamme 
were introduced in tbe House at Lan­
sing on tbe 13th lost by Representa­
tive H. O. Young. One repeals the 
act incorporating the village of Mich- 
tgamme und the othor restricts the 
powers of the commissioner of high­
ways of Michigumme. The measure 
looking toward the end of Michlgam- 
rue's existence us a village Is favored 
by a majority of the community.

The next of tbe series of sociables 
given by the ludies of tbe M. E. 
Chnrch will he be held at tbe resi­
dence of Capt. J. F, Mitchell on Wed­
nesday evening of next week.

Matters at the New York mine are 
looking extremely bright, work on 
what Is termed the "New Discovery” 
being prosecuted by tbe company 
with a considerable force of men, Mr. 
Hodgkins having surrendered tils 
contract. Severn l new exploring pits 
have revealed the exlstunee of a good 
body of ore alii I uorth of the present 
working, umi the indications ure that 
tho entire property Is underlaid with 
ore of the bent quality. The stockpile 
at present contain* about J(J,odd tons.

W inter’s brewery team started on 
an escapade momiay morning, and 
which had it not been for I'nor Foley, 
might have developed Into a first-class 
runuwuy, Somsnody always Interfere* 
to spell a first-class item.

The youngest child of Thomas 
McNubb died of whooping cough on 
tbe 18th Inst.

A special meeting nf the Common 
Council was held on the )4lh Inst for 
the purpose of making uu appoint­
ment of night watchman, Daniel 
Laugblln. the late luuumtaut, having 
tendered Ills resignation on the Uth 
jnat aod Mayor Houston having ap­
pointed Andrew Heudrlcksoo for the 
interim. The Council elected Mr. 
Heodricksou to fill the yacaoay and a 
resolution wus adopted to authorise 
the night watchman to act as police 
constable, with powers to make ar­
rests and do all other things neces­
sary to preserve the peace of the city, 
and to assist the marshal In the per­
formance of his duties.

Getting Bid of Colds
The easiest uud quickest way to get 

rid of a cold is lo take Chamberlain's 
Cough Remedy. This preparation has 
been In use for many years und Us 
value fully proven. No m a tier whut 
remedy you use, however, cure must 
ba taken not to cmitruct a second 
cold before you have recovered from 
the first one, and ihgre is nurioua dan­
ger of this. A man of middle age or 
older should go to bed and slay in 
bed until fully recovered. It Is bolter 
losiuy In bed three days at the start 
thuu three weeks iuter oa.

Jas, Pickands & Go '
(LTD.)

«

C OA L
----- A N D -------

WOOD

N e g a u n e e , ‘ Mic h .

afffirntnTfnnTffffffffffWfnfffmrwnfwwwiTmfWfffiTrfff!

IELLI0 TT &  DflWk
FURNITURE

3 2 4  IR O N  ST.
H ARD W ARE

3 0 3  IR O N  ST.

Prepare to ,"Do Your Bit” 
in the

GARDEN
SEEDS, TOOLS. EVERY- 

THING YOU NEED
B A B Y  C A R R I A G E S

l i v e d  C o fin p M ib ic

C H I L D ' S  W A G O N S

AUTO SUPPLIES
OILS AND GREASES 

Automobile Enamels 
all Colors

in

D o n ' t  f o r g e t  t h a t  ivp 
h a v e  tho

G O O D Y E A R  A g e n c y

Get the Home in 
trim for

S P R I N G

PAINTS, CALCIMINE, 
WALLPAPER 

Varnishes. Paints, Glass

Painting and 
Paper-hanging

We have a competent ^  
force and will do the job 
RIGHT—both as to work­
manship and price,

1 ELLIO TT & D A W E i

That Terrible HeuUcho

Do you have perlndlo attacks of 
headache acuampanlud by sickness of 
the stomach or vomiting, a sallow 
skin and dull eyes? If ao, you can get 
quick relief by taking Chumberlatn’s 
Tablet* as directed for biliousness, 
and you may bu uble to avoid these 
attacks if you observa the directions 
with each package.

W. H. MITCHELL
ttuooeaaor to Jno, Q. Adtwa ft 0ou.

F I R E
I N S U R A N C E

OFFICE AT CITY HALL

Negaunee, • Michigan

j

Lake Superior 81 Ishpeming 
Railway.

L . S & l

M unising, M arq u e tte  an d  

S o u th -E as tern  Ry.

I d sffsot bogiutitoff Sunday, 
May 27, 1017.

TKAIN AHltlVKK NKUAUNKK 
dally «not*ln Sunday

Front MUNIKIMi, Mar- in 09 i m 
uUHtU'jnMlallliJit'rme* ■O'** ® W 
<llut i* points.

TRAIN LKAVKh NKUAl'NKK 
dally except Hiitida)

Fur M iniucUi'.SkmitUH, 0 Eg ■  m 
l.awsim,Unmlcy.Flint O'vO P fll 
hum, Ml'NlHlNq, I'KINCKlOa 
and all lulsriiicdliitc points.

MEALS
Served a t all hours in 

our Lunch Room.

Wk ha vk a Cowplktk Link ov

Footballs, Indoor Baseballs 

Punching Bags, Boxing Gloves

CIGARS, FIFES, TOBACCO mm 
Smokers’ Supplies in General.

Ice Cream Soda Water

ANDREW ERICKSON
424 Iron Sthkkt NEGARNKK

i
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