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PERSONAL PARAGRAPHS 
ABOUT FOLK YOU KNOW.

SUPREME COURT GIVES DECISION FLUE CASES DECREASEPROTEST PHONE RATE

NEGAUNEE JOINS IN STATE-WIDE 
MOVEMENT

Twenty-five Michigan Cities File Pro 
test with the State Railroad 

Commission

Negaunee was one of the first cities 
in this immediate vicinity to file for­
mal protest against the increased te l­
ephone to ll rates contemplated by the 
Michigan State Telephone Company If 
it is able to secure authorization from 
the Michigan Railroad Commission. 
Ishpeming sent in its protest a couple 
of days ago, and Marquette is gather­
ing some data for use in connection 
with the protest which it intends to 

• file. The Copper Country was one of 
the first sections of the state to 
lodge a kick, its action having ante­
dated any move in Marquette county 
by several days.

The Negaunee action was the re­
sult of a resolution adopted at the 
January meeting of the Common 
Council. Pursuance to its provisions 
a committee composed of Aldermen 
Collins, Nelson and Trembath went 
over the existing and proposed rates, 
and as a resu lt of their report Mayor 
Robbins on Tuesday dispatched the 
following message to the Michigan 
Railroad Commission:

On behalf of Common Council of 
City of Negaunee, I wish to register 
emphatic rro test against toll and in ­
creased telephone rates. M atter dis­
cussed a t length at last regular m eet­
ing.

It was a foregone conclusion tha t 
scattering protests would be likely to 
avail little  In averting the greater 
part If not the whole of the con­
cessions the  telephone corporation 
seeks, but there is now indication 
that these protests will be so numer­
ous tha t the phone company’s appli­
cation is booked for a stormy voyage. 
Tuesday was the date appointed for 
presentation of the telephone com­
pany's application, and a  dispatch 
from Lansng states tha t representa­
tives of fifteen cities were on hand to 
ask for a hearing in opposition to 
the proposed rate increases, while 
ten other cities, including Negaunee, 
lodged protest by letter or telegram 
The municipalities which were rep­
resented took steps toward forming 
an organization to combat the tele ­
phone company's application, and it 
expects to be well fortified with data 
when the formal hearing is had 
toward the end of the month.

A suggestion which seemed to meet 
with favor N̂ as that a  suit In chan­
cery should be brought In the Ing­
ham county court raising quction as 
to the jurisdiction of the railroad 
commission. The preliminary invest­
igation which has been made by the 
muncipalites reveals th a t the tele ­
phone company’s application, if sanc­
tioned would affect every Bell tele­
phone exchange in the sta te  outside 
of Wayne county, and th a t the aver­
age increase throughout the state is 
21 per cent.

LIBERTY "THEATER IS POPULAR

Bookings at This Playhouse Will be 
Steadily Improved

The Liberty Theater which was 
recently reopened Jn the Odd Fellows’ 
block under the management of 
Johnston & Rhoades, is rapidly win­
ning its way into public favor. The 
uncertainties of the situation for the 
first week or two made it  Impossible 
for Mr. Rhoades, the resident man­
ager, to secure the bookings he de­
sired, but now that there promises 
to be no further interruption he is 
arranging for a film service tha t he 
is certain will prove acceptable to 
the Negaunee public. Even this will 
be improved upon at every possible 
opportunity.

Mr. Rhoades goes on the principle 
tha t the best is none too good for his 
patrons and examination of his pros­
pective hookings for the next few 
weeks shows a number of first re­
leases, while all of the offerings are 
strictly  new. Yesterday and to-day 
Geraldine F arra r in "The Turn o 
the WheeP’was the special attraction, 
and Saturday afternoon and evening 
the same actress will be seen in 
"Carmen." There will also be a Mack 
Sennet comedy.

The Liberty is paying special a t­
tention to ventilation and other sani­
tary precautions, and cites the asser­
tion of Dr. Copeland, head of the 
New York health department, tha t 
"theaters, churches and schools 
which arc well ventilated are the 
safest places one can find anywhere.” 
The Liberty Ir also making a spec­
ialty of "straight" admission fees, 
which include the war tax, and pa­
trons therefore do not have to be 
bothered with peonies.

•ENGLISH OAK LODGE OFFICERS

Were Recently Elected for the En­
suing Term

English Oak Lodge No. 230, Order 
of Sons of SL George, has elected the 
following officers for the ensuing 
term:

President—J. H. Tonkin 
Past President—James Webb* Jr. 
Messenger—James Lanyon 
Secretary—James Hawke 
Treasurer—S. A. Northey 
Ass’t Secretary—A rthur Roberts 
Ass’t Messenger— John Mather 
Chaplain—Edward Sampson 
Inside Sentinel—W. Garrett 
Outside Sentinel—H. Pascoe 
Trustee, (eighteen months)—John 

Toms.

THE 1919 SERIES OF WAR STAMPS

War Savings Stamps for 1919 Ars on 
8a!a at the Postoffiee and Banka

The 1919 series of War Savings 
Stamps are now on sale at the postof- 
flee and banks. The price is $4.12 
for January, raising one cent In value 
each month; they may be redeemed 
In 1924 for $5.00, or at any time 
at the purchase value, plus ofie cent 
for each month held, on giving ten 
days’ notice

No change will be made in  the 
Thrift Stamps and those purchased 
during the past year may be used in 
exchanging for 1919 War Savings 
Stamps. Purchasers are especially 
warned not to  place a  1919 war 
stamp on a 1918 certificate or vice 
versa, as a  stamp is thus rendered 
valueless. W ar Savings Stamps of 
the 1919 issue may be registered the 
same as those of the 1918 issue.

TO REGULATE "DRY" SALOONS

By Asking the Legislature to Past a 
General Law

Under instructions of the Copper 
Country League of Municipalities, 
village and city attorneys of Hough­
ton county, have drafted a  measure 
tending to regulate temperance sa­
loons, confectionery stores and bill­
iard parlors. The bill will be sub­
mitted to the present session of the 
state legislature by Copper Country 
representatives, who have given the 
league assurance of their co-opera­
tion. The proposed measure would 
give municipalities power to regulate 
such establshments and provide a li­
cense fee.

The m atter of regulating temper­
ance saloons come before the league 
last fall and the municipal attorneys 
were asked to draft a  uniform ordin­
ance for aU villages and cities Ift the 
Copper Country. The opinion was 
advanced th a t Buch establishments 
could not be legally regulated until 
such legislation was enacted by the 
state law makers and the attorneys 
are prepared to ask the legislature 
to pass a  general law.

DEATH OF MR8. HEiNONEN

Well Known Resident of Negaunee 
for Past Twenty Years

Mrs. Louisa Christina Heinonen 
died quite suddenly last Monday 
evening a t the family home in the 
Queen mine location. Mrs. Heinonen, 
who had entered upon her 68th year, 
had enjoyed splendid health through­
out her life and even In la te r years 
her health was deemed exceptional 
for one who was entering upon ad­
vanced age. The suddenness with 
which the end came was therefore a 
sad shock to her family and many 
friends. - She had just left the house 
to go to the barn when she was 
stricken by heart trouble, and she 
survived less than an hour.

Deceased was born in Finland 
July 1, 1851, and a few years after 
her m arriage to Matthew Heinonen 
they set out for the United States, 
settling in the Copper Country about 
forty years ago. About twenty years 
ago they removed to Negaunee and 
the family home has been here ever 
since. Besides the husband, nine 
children survive—Oscar Heinonen, 
Now York Mills, Minn.; Otto Heinon­
en, Baraga, Mich.; Mrs. Adolph O. 
Manley, Carlton, Minn.; MIbs Junotta 
Heinonen, Republic, Mich.; Alfred, 
John, Emil and Yalmcr Heinonen and 
Miss Hilda Heinonen, Negaunee. A 
brother of deceased, Oscar Johnson, 
resides in Kanter street.

All of the children who reside 
away from here have arrived to at­
tend the funeral, which will be held 
this afternoon. Services are to be 
conducted a t Mitchell M. E. Church 
at 2:30 o'clock. Among the relatives 
who have come to attend tho funeral 
are Oscr Scmbla, of Calumet, and 
Mrs. Semblu and daughter, Edith, of 
Kudyurd, Mich.

Mrs. James E. Crosble and son, 
Arthur, returned yesterday from 
Vulcan, Mich., where they spent' a 
few weeks a t the home of Mrs. Cros- 
ble's parents, Mr. and Mrs. A. W. 
Thompson.

Mr. and Mrs. James H. Rough, Jr., 
were passengers last Tuesday morn­
ing to Park  Palls, Wis., to pay a visit 
to Mr. Rough's brother-in-law and 
Bister, Mr. and Mrs. Clark Kirk­
patrick.

Mrs. J. H. W inter has returned 
from a v isit with Dr. and Mrs. John 
A. W inter a t  Duluth, Minn.

Miss Esther Anderson has return ­
ed to the Ferris Institute a t Big Rap­
ids, Mich., to resume her studies, af­
ter spending the holidays in Negau­
nee with her parents,

John Bower, m eat cutter at W inter 
& Suess’ meat market, returned last 
Monday morning from Milwaukee, 
where he spent New Year's w ith 
relatives and friends. He was ac­
companied to Negaunee by his niece. 
Miss Christopherson.

Mrs. Iva Hansen, who had been 
hsre on a visit to her mother,, Mrs. 
E. B. Raymond, has returned to Mil­
waukee, where she is employed as a 
trained nurse,

W alter Miller, who had been here 
on a holiday yialt to his parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. J. P. Miller, has returned to 
Lansing.

Miss Rosalie Barnard has tendered 
her resignation as a  member of the 
Negaunee High School faculty, to 
take effect a t the close of -the first 
semester.

Leo Roberts, who spent a brief 
furlough here w ith his father, Fred 
Roberts, returned Tuesday morning 
to Camp Custer.

William Augustson, recently honor­
ably dicchaiged from Camp Custer, 
left Monday on a visit to his sister, 
Mrs. James Brady, at Sault Ste. Marie.

Charles E. Dolf, of Marquette, agent 
for the Mutual Life Insurance Com­
pany, was soliciting business in Ne­
gaunee on Monday.

Sam Jacobs went to Negaunee Fri­
day morning to follow the remains of 
William L. Piper to their last resting 
place.—Crystal Falls Diamond Drill.

Miss Ida Smedman, who had been 
here on a  holiday visit to her par­
ents, Mr. and Mrs. John Smedman, 
Clark street, has returned to Flint, 
Mich., where she teaches school.

Henry J. Trevarrow left Monday 
morning for Ironwood to look after 
his diamond drill business.

Richard Cushing left last Saturday 
for Lower Michigan, where he will 
be employed for a  time.

Ira  Odgers, L. A. Henry, James 
J. Gaffney, John Mason ThomaB Mis- 
cheli and Frank D. Bali, of Crystal 
Falls, were the acting pallbearers at 
the funeral of the  late Wm. L. Plpor, 
held in Negaunee last Saturday.

Mr. and Mrs. Thomas Harvey, of 
Alpha, visited with relatives and 
friends In Negaunee last week.

George Yorkey was a passenger last 
Saturday to Detroit, where ho has 
secured work a t tho carpenter trade.

E. 8. Needham 1ms returned from 
Manistlquo, whore he spont tho holi­
days with his family.

Joseph Baralie, Jr., was n passenger 
to Superior, Wis,. lust Saturday to 
pny a visit to friends.

Miss Ellen Jewell hns returned 
home from Traverse City Mich.

Mr. and Mrs. A. E. Archamhenu, of 
Marquette, were guosts of Mr. and 
Mrs. Joseph Barabo In this city lust 
8unday.

Mr. and Mrs. Richard Eddy were 
passengers last Sunday evening to 
Rochester, Minn., whore Mrs, Eddy 
intended to submit to an operation 
for goiter at Mayo Brothers' hn»pltu).

Mr. and Mrs. John Honkn and 
daughter spent lost Sunday at their 
camp a t Three Lukes.

William Maas, who accompanied his 
mothor, Mrs. G. J. Mans, to Milwau­
kee to spend the  holidays with rela­
tives, returned home last Saturday 
in order to attend school. Mrs. Moos 
will continue her visit In Milwaukee 
for a few days

Anton Henriksen was a passenger 
to Chcago early la the week, on a 
visit to relutivcs and friends.

Mr. and Mrs. John Gaffney con­
cluded a holiday visit in Negaunee 
with relatives and friends and left 
last Sunday night on their return 
to Proctor, Minn.

John Bath arrived home last Satur­
day from France with an honorable 
discharge in hiB possession. He 
looks as though army life agreed 
with him.

Fred Ethier, of New York, was a 
business caller In Negaunee on Tues­
day. Fred is a  former Negaunee boy 
and of course took occasion to visit 
with his relatives here.

Mrs. Gordon Murray, who had been 
here for the past few weeks on a 
visit to her son-in-law and daughter. 
Marshal and Mrs. John A. Wasmuth, 
departed Wednesday morning on a 
visit to her son, Gordon Murray, and 
family at Norway, Mich.

Albert Rytkonen has resumed his 
position as pharm acist at August Sut- 
lnen's drug store in this city.

Carl Bloom returned to Negaunee 
Monday afternoon from Escanaba.

Mrs. M. Killian was here from 
Green Bay on Tuesday, paying her 
usual visit to her mother, Mrs. Curran

Andrew Rasmussen, who accompan- 
ed his soldier brother, John Rasmus­
sen, home from camp, returned to 
Chicago last Monday evening.

Mrs. Charles Yates and daughter, 
Elizabeth, who had been here on a 
holiday visit to Mr. Yates’ parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. T. C. Yates, departed on 
Tuesday evening for their home in 
Bucyrus, Ohio.

Miss Elizabeth and Daniel Suess 
have returned home from Milwaukee, 
where they spent the holidays with 
relatives.

Miss Florence Johns, who was the 
guest of Miss Florence Glanville’ In 
this city for several days, has re­
turned to her home at Gwinn.

Lieutenant Austin O'Leary of Kan­
sas- City, Mo., has been in Negaunee 
for several days on a visit to his 
mother and sisters. Mr. O'Leary is a 
practicing physician and we under­
stand has received an honorable dis­
charge from the army.

Leo Nadeau is homo from Camp 
Jackson, Columbia, S. C., with an 
honorable discharge.

Mr. and Mrs. John Stickney, Sr., 
and daughters Irena and Leona, Mr. 
and Mrs. Frank Stickney, of Mar­
quette; Mr. and Mrs. John Stickney, 
Jr., Mrs. E. McGinnis, A. J. Hcnne, 
M r. and Mrs. John Dobbs, Mr. and 
Mrs. Antoino Dobbs and J. Beau­
champ, of Ishpeming; Mr. and Mrs. 
Louis Trombley and daughter, Pearl, 
of Munising, wore here Wednesday 
In attendance at the Dobbs-Trombley 
wedding.

Miss Florence Thompson has re­
sumed her position us pinnlst at the 
Liberty Theater, uftor a slight illness

Charles Kornhlum, steam shovel 
operator, was a passenger this morn­
ing to Wakefield.

R. S. Archibald wus a passenger to 
Duluth last night.

Alfred Olson returned Wednesday 
from the Soo, whoro he went last 
Sunday to pay a visit to relatives.

Mrs. William Thompson, Lincoln 
street, was called to Evoleth, Minn., 
Thursday night on account of the 
serious Illness of her (laughter, Mrs. 
Joseph Rickard, with Influenza and 
pneumonia. Mrs. Thompson was ac­
companied by her mother, Mrs, James 
K. Williams,

William Hawke, of tho U. S. Navy, 
has notified his parents, Mr. and Mrs 
Juntos Hawke, Cherry street, that he 
has been advanced to tho rank of 
first-class llremnn.

Mrs. Jandron hns returned from 
Rochester, Minn., where she under­
went succosful treatm ent at Mayo 
Brothers' hospital.

Miss Tyna Kotfla has returned to 
N'cgnuneo from a visit with relatives 
In Hancock.

Nathaniel Lobb, of Munising, was 
in Negaunee Wednesday, in attend­
ance at the annual meeting of tho 
Escanaba River Land & Iron Com­
pany.

Frank Vercellino, of New Swanzy, 
was a business caller in Negaunee 
yesterday. Mr. Vercellino is preparing 
to engage In the ice business the 
coming season.

State Votes on Beer and Light Wine 
Amendment in April

The state supreme court has de­
nied the application of the Michigan 
anti-saloon league for a  mandamus 
to prevent the secretary of state sub­
mitting the beer and light wine 
amendment to the people at the 
April elections. This decision as­
sures the submission of the proposed 
amendment.

Dry leaders of th e  state believe 
that If the new beer and wine amend­
ment is submitted to the people of 
the sta te  in the April election, the 
vote on its adoption or rejection will 
be very close, it Is declared. Attor­
neys for the Anti-Saloon League have 
exerted every effort to prevent the 
amendment being placed on the bal­
lot. They question its validity and 
have asked the supreme court to is­
sue a w rit of mandamus to prevent 
placing the proposal before the elec­
tors. Both the dry and wet leaders 
admit tha t the women's vote in April 
will have considerable effect on the 
carrying or rejection of the amend­
ment. It is admitted that the wo­
men’s vote is doubtful, furthermore.

FINNISH MUTUAL HAS GOODYEAR

Negaunee Men Among Thoie Elected 
on Official Board

The annual meeting of the Finnish 
Mutual F ire Insurance Company was 
held at Ishpeming last Friday and 
the official reports showed that the 
organization had enjoyed an excellent 
year’s business, the net gain having 
been $3400. For a  considerable time 
the company has been paying an an­
nual dividend of 25 per cent and no 
deviation from the ruie was made 
this year. August Raatlkainen, of 
Negaunee, who was re-elected presi­
dent, will enter upon his third con­
secutive term. Alex Panttl, of Ish­
peming, will begin his fourth term 
as secretary, and John Kandeiin, also 
of Ishpeming, has held the post of 
treasurer nearly if not fully us long. 
The board of directors will hold reg­
ular meetings on the first Tuesday of 
each month.

Thfi complete list of officers for the 
ensuing fiscal year, including ap­
pointive as well as elective officers, 
is as follows:

President—August Raatlkainen, of 
Negaunee.

Vice President—A. W. Jurma, of 
Ishpeming.

Secretary—Alex Panttl, of Ish­
peming.

Asst. Secretary—Jacob H. Ander­
son, of Negaunee.

T resurer—John Kandolin, of Ish ­
peming.

Directors—A, W. Jurma, Herman 
W. Elson John Jaaksl, of Ishpeming; 
John J. Beldo, John Ollila, J. H. An­
derson, of Negaunee; John Huhtala, 
of Palmer; Otto Karjalafncn, of Re­
public; £ h rte  Williamson, of Gwinn.

FARMERS TO GET NITRATE

Applications for Same Mutt be In by 
January 2Sth, 1919

Notice has been given to L. R. 
Walker, agricultural agent for Mar­
quette county, th a t tho U. S. depart­
ment of agriculture will Bell at cost 
a supply of nitrate of soda to farmers 
in Marquette county. The nitrate 
will be sold under the authority of 
tho Food Control Act and subsequent 
legislation relating thereto. The 
price will be $81.00 a ton, free on 
board cars at loading point or port. 
Farmers are to pay In addition 
freight to their shipping points.

How to Obtain Nitrate 
Applications for a part of the ni­

trate bought by tho government will 
bo received only from actual farmers 
or owners or holders of farms for 
use on their land, and muy he made 
through County Agent L. It. Walker. 
No money will ho required with tho 
application but upon notice from tho 
authorized representative of tho de­
partment of agriculture furmers who 
have signed applications must de­
posit with a local hank, association, 
or indivdual dessignated by the Sec­
retary of Agriculture to act as the 
farmers’ agent for that purpose, 
money to cover the cost of tho fortll-1 
Izer except tho freight charge. In I 
practically every caao tho money will 
bo paid to a County Nitrate D lstrlbu-' 
tor designated by the Department of j  
Agriculture. NJtrato will bo shipped 
to distributors on sight draft with 
bill of lading attached. Distributors 
will pay drafts, tako up the bills of 
lading, collect money from farmers 
and distribute n itra te  to farmers. 
Arrangements have been made to se­
cure a large quantity of n itrate and 
It is believed th a t all reasonable re­
quirements cun be met.

WITH CARE. DISEASE SHOULD BE 
HELD TO MINIMUM

| a

Isolation Hospital In Full Running 
Order—Generous Aid from 

Red Cross Ladies

The influenza situation was im­
proved during the past week, and 
while naught else than new (.uses 
here and there can he expected for a  
number of weeks to come, there seems 
to be no doubt th a t tho physician* 
with the people's co-opcrutlon havo 
checked the disease and that exeopt 
for a possible flurry In some particu­
lar week a steady decrease in tho 
number of cases may he looked for. 
With the city's isolation hospital In 
the former Kind’s Inn building now 
In full operation the authorities uro 
in excellent position to afford proper 
care to persons who might not bo 
able to obtain It otherwise and th is 
too will contribute toward checking 
the disease.

Exclusive of some coses which 
were brought in from Negaunee town­
ship yesterday, there were hut eight 
cases "on hand" last evening, and a  
few of the la tte r were hooked for 
early discharge. I t  will require a  
week or two more to determine 
w hether the gain in lessened cases 
may be considered permanent, and 
until that time Dr. C. J. Larson, the 
municipal health officer, does not In­
tend to mnke any particular changes 
in the precautionary measures which 
the people are asked to observe.

Equipment for Hospital
Dr. Larson is greatly pleased with 

the co-operation which has come from 
tho local branch of tho Red Cross, 
particularly in the equipment of the 
isolation hospital. Through the ef­
forts of these ladies the hospital has 
been quite fully equipped with bed* 
linen, towels, etc., and the supply of 
blankets, pillows, etc., is now almost 
up to present needs. Tho local stores 
had done what they could toward 
providing such articles for the first 
patients received a t the hospital, but 
their supplies were rather limited. 
The articles fashioned by the women 
were all "made to order" and are 
therefore exactly what wus wanted, 
and moreover they are more substan­
tia l and are better made than can 
now be obtuined in commercial chan­
nels. Between the work dono in the 
Red Cross rooms and the work dono 
by women In their homes, practically 
all of the equipment necessary for 
immediate needs was supplied, but 
the ladies are keeping right on a t 
their task In order that a fair re­
serve for emergencies may be In­
sured. When the present need Is a t 
an end It is the intention to carefully 
store all of this- equipment In order 
th a t it may he available for any sub­
sequent emergency. On behalf of tho 
city, Mayor Robbins and Health Of­
ficer Larson have publicly expressed 
their thanks to the ladies of the Red 
Cross for the timely and generous 
aid they have given.

Family Brought to Hospital
The family of Carl Oscar Johnson, 

who reside In what Is known as tho 
"Goose Lake HIM" district, and who 
have been suffering from influenza, 
wore brought to tho city yesterday 
afternoon and will be cared for a t 
tho isolation hospital. The husband 
and father died between two and 
three weeks ago, leaving a  widow 
and several small children. Tho 
family was beginning to get estab­
lished on a farm, but Johnson's ill­
ness from heart troublo for many 
months preceding his demise left tho 
family in quite destitute circum ­
stances. Their plight became known 
when the hushund and father died 
and charitably Inclined people saw 
to It that Santa Claus dealt gener­
ously with the family, even if his 
visit was somewhat belated.

The subsequent illness of o ther 
members of the family added to their 
troubles, and when Health Officer 
Larson learned of the situation ho 
arranged for their removal to the city 
hospital, though strictly speaking 
the case Is beyond Negaunee Jurisdic­
tion. An amhulnnco was sent out to 
the farm homo yesterday morning, It 
being well provided with extra blank­
ets ami robes, together with foot- 
warmers, and it is not believed th a t 
the family suffered at nil during their 
long ride to town.

NEW MEAT MARKET

Onni Koskincn has lonsed the Lisa 
building nt the corner of Clark street 
nml Pioneer avenue and began a meat 
market business there to-day. Mr. 
Kosklnen has beep in the employ of 
T. L. Collins for the past ten years, 
and besides his experience he has an 
acquaintance which will be of value 
to him in his business venturi*. Ho 
Intends to carry a full line of fresh 
and salted meats.



N E G A U N E E  I R O N  H E R A L D

NEW LAW OF NATURE FOUND BY 
INVENTOR OF THE PERFECT RADIO

Puzzle of Static Electricity Has Been Solved by R. A. Weagant— 
Invention in Use by Allied Governments During the War 

Be Given to the World When Peace Is Finally Con­
cluded—Great Saving of Time and Money.

yew  York.—“I have discovered a 
pew law of nature.”

Without hearing the rest of a mod­
est Inventor's insertions think what 
that means. That la a tremendous 
declaration. It Is epochal. Not since 
the day of Sir Isaac Newton, who was 
credited with the discovery of tlu; law 
of gravitation, has a real law of na­
ture lieoii added to the world's col­
lection of marvelous scientific phe* 
teniM'iin. One may expectantly look 
for the eighth wonder of the world.

Newton may have been a modest 
man. Perhaps all great Inventors are 
modest men. The fact that most of 
them have been unfortunate in being 
Illy rewarded for their labors might 
Indicate a bashful nature. No one, 
who Inis seen ami talked with ltoy A. 
Weagant. ehlef engineer of the Mar* 
coni Wireless Telegraph company, will 
dispute the fact that he is modest, lie 
Is the young man who, after ten years 
of scientific research Into wireless 
phenomena, has solved the puzzle of 
static electricity and hy means of a 
new law of nature has eliminated that 
bothersome element from the atmos­
phere so that wireless has heroine n 
perfect means of communication for 
extremely long distances. Ills inven­
tion has already been in use hy the 
allied governments during the war and 
h«‘ |k ready mid anxious to disclose the 
"new law of nvture” to the world as 
soon as cert a ll  restrictions tire r«*- 
moved hy tin* conclusion of peace,

“A Simple Matter."
"It Is n simple matter when mice 

you find the govendng law.” suld Mr. 
Weagmit to a reporter. "Itadlo ex­
perts have looked for it lor yoars and 
some of ilioni have claimed to have 
discovered it. hut they were either 
fakers or laid made honest mistaken 
In scientific judgment. I have got It. 
That fact can he easily demonstrated 
mid will ho at the proper lime. If I 
should deserlli.* the details of the ap­
paratus h would In* a simple matter 
for radio engineers to recognize the 
new law. Wo feel constrained not to 
divulge the secret generally until 
peace has been concluded."

Mr. Weagant said lie was positive 
the Germans Ii.hI not unde the discov. 
fry themselves or ha<i any knowltnlge 
of his discovery. He declared that on­
ly a few days ago he was listening 
to whvlcss messages being sent to 
(iennany ami that the German opera­
tor requested the sender to repent the 
messages am) use more power. That 
would not have happened If the Gor­
mans had known how to utilize the 
liew method, the inventor said.

"SpiRe” has hem tile hoodoo of 
wireless telegraphy ever since Mar­
coni convinced a doubtful world of 
the uctualily of tin1 new method of 
cottiunmlealiou. Mule Imzzlngs and 
Mg clatlcrlngs along the air currents, 
particularly on moist days, have per­
sistently interrupted the clear flow of 
the wireless messages and mnde their 
reception prnetleully Impossible, The 
Inventor described the sound lit the 
Instruments ns similar to that made hy 
noire one throwing u handful of peb­
bles against a glass window1. On cold, 
snappy days the adverse atmospheric 
condition has not been so hud. Hut 
tin- trouble wtts always the worst from 
.Mite pi Oetolier.

A Prophetic Decision.
Mr. Westgnnt recalled a decision in 

the Fulled Stall's district court on 
January 7, MM. in which Judge Julius 
Mayer made a prophetic* announce- 
tnent In regard to the solving of the 
Math* problem. It wtts iu the easy of 
Klntuer vs. the Atlantic Communica­
tion company et al. where the Issue 
Involved the invention of » new trans­
mitter for wireless apparatus, Refer­
ring hack to the "state of the art” of 
wireless communication ou July t. 
1IHJ7. a date figuring In the case. Judge 
Mayer said:

“On th a t d a te  th e re  w ere Just two 
p o s s ib ilit ie s : ( l )  T o annu l, exclude.

ellminnto sta tic ; or, (2) to Improve 
the wireless note hy method of appara­
tus. or both, so far beyond the art a* 
to constitute Invention. The first hits 
not been done. He who shall accom­
plish that need have no fear of the 
fnfo of Ids invention.”

So the radio opera torn kept on 
searching for that principle which Mr. 
Weagant has nt last found. We have 
Ills word for It, and the word of Kd- 
ward .7. Nally, vice president and gen­
eral manager of the Marconi company, 
and the fact that the perfected wire­
less has been used by the government 
•luring the war, although not yet offi­
cially announced.

It has made the bridging of the 
North Atlantic by wireless, always the 
hardest route for aerial messages, ac­
cording to Mr. Weagant, easy. It has 
eliminated long distances, the most im­
portant goal radio engineers have 
striven for.

"Before the war we were limited to 
six or seven hours’ communication a 
day across the Atlantic and across the 
six thousand mile stretch from Sun 
Francisco to Japan.” suht Mr. \Yea- 
gnnt. “Now we can use the wireless 
continuously. Before the war It would 
have been Impossible to get all the 
‘news' which the German wireless 
tried to scatter over the world. Now 
we can get it all, T am not privileged 
to say to what extent our discovery 
has figured In the war. but I can say 
In a general way that almost every­
thing the Germnns sent out bearing on 
the question of pence was received.

Will Save Money.
"A considerable saving of money 

will he effeeted. In some sending sta­
tions the power needed is eui In half. 
Instead of steel masts 400 feet high, 
as some are. and cost SIS.OOO apiece, 
a mast the height of a telephone pole 
Is enough for roeeivlng.”

The Inventor said that the trouble 
with most of the radio experts who 
hud been experimenting with "static” 
was that they hud given up too soon. 
Many of them came to the eonclushm 
that (lie solution of the problem was 
Impossible. They regnnled "static" as 
a thing erratic. Incalculable, way­
ward, willful, n law ttnfo Itself.

The turning point entne when the 
Marconi engineer decided that "static” 
was a natural law, rational and follow­
ing n definite system, that only needed 
to he understood to he conquered. That 
was Iti IftOS. Since that lime Mr. Wen- 
gant has devoted the better part of his 
energies to ascertaining 3nst what the 
properties of this law were. The pre­
liminary work was done largely at ex­
periment stations In New Jersey and 
Miami. Florida. In MM government 
assistance was enlisted and tile ex 
pertinents tool: on » far more definite 
character. By the time this conn fry 
was rearlv to enter llu* war the work 
had reached pvaetleal completion and 
patenl application claims had been al­
lowed hy the I'nited States patent of­
fice. From that time forward the prob­
lem has been one largely of perfection 
of detail.

"All 1 did wa« to set out to discover 
the new law of nature and make it 
work for man. and that’s all I have 
done,” said this modest inventor. “I 
set up all sorts of hypotheses and con­
structed all sorts of apparatus, and 
when one theory wouldn’t work I tried 
another. It was like failing In fififl 
ways and Hading what .von are after 
on the thousandth attempt.”

Of course the question cume tip 
again as to Just what the Inventor had 
found out, wlmt the new law of na­
ture was. And what millions of lay­
men and a few thousand scientists, 
who were taking the attitude of the 
Missourian, wauled to he shown. It 
was stated (hut some of them had pub­
licly doubted the solving of the "stat­
ic” puzzle. The Inventor smiled amt 
shrugged his shoulders.

"That’s quite n a tu ra l” he said. "It 
sounds big to make the announcement

that we have perfected wireless after 
all these years, but I know we are safe. 
1 would like to tell the whole story, 
hut I am restrained until the pence 
pact Is signed. I don’t expect people, 
including scientific men. to believe it 
until they use It. It is like flying- 
people would not believe It could tx 
done until they actually saw It done.”

Mr. Weagant asserted that they were 
not seeking n monopoly of the Inven­
tion, and said the British and French 
governments already were familiar 
with him while he was acting for the 
United States government. He Raid 
that reasonable protection would he Re- 
cured, but that he intended to give his 
Rpcret to the world, because of the 
great Importance of having the best 
communication facilities possible ev­
erywhere.

Mr. Weagant was horn in Canada, 
hut his purents moved to Vermont 
when he wtts a baby, and he has made 
h|s residence In this country most 
of the time since then. He studied 
at Stnnstead college and nt McGill 
university, where he received the de­
gree of bachelor of science. He worked 
for the Montreal Light, Heat and Tow­
er company, the Westfnghouse com­
pany at Pittsburgh, the De Lnvnl 
Steam Turbine company, the National 
Electric Signaling company, and in 
1012 Joined the Marconi company, no 
Is u comparatively young man with 
hair slightly ringed with gray ond hns 
clear, sharp gray eyes, which reflect an 
active and highly trained mind. Me la 
rather diffident and retiring, hut ex­
presses his opinions In n voice that Is 
deep-toned and convincing. v

GRATEFUL TO RED CROSS
Italian Mothers Wept With Joy 

Sight of Children Returned to 
Health.

at

Home.—One hy one the mountain 
camps and seaside colonies of the 
American Bed Gross In Italy are clos­
ing for the season. In cities In th«i 
north mid south, in Sardinia mid 
Sicily, mothers are welcoming their

WAOTON DESTRUCTION BY THE HUNS

Mother Greeting Child Returning 
From Camp.

children home and rejoicing in their 
changed appearance.

"It Is amusing to watch mother* 
seeking to recognize their little ones," 
writes one of the Ameriean Bet) Cross 
workers. "And It N touching to see 
I heir delimit when they tit last realize 
that tin brown, sturdy yotmgsterR who 
rush Into their arms are the delicate 
Glusepplnas and the anemic Angelos 
who left them earlier in the sum­
mer.’’

I'mirlng Into the Botne office, the 
headquarters of the Ameriean organ­
ization In Italy, ure letters from these 
mothers telling of their gratitude. 
They are written laboriously und 
painstakingly, the majority of them, 
each cramped ehiirnefer eloquent of 
earnest sincerity lu this, the penned 
expression of Ibelr gratitude. Follow­
ing is one or the many received:

“I. Murhi I'Vrrnrlo, mother of Angelo 
Fermrlo, mu overjoyed nt the Improve­
ment In heiiltli of my little son. He 
returned from the mountain eurap of 
the Ati’crlciin Bed Cross at Gressonel, 
fat and with color In his cheeks, of 
whleh lie stood lu such great need. I 
can find no words to express my grat­
itude for your kindness. May Ood 
irotect ami bless the kind benefac­

tors who have done so mueli for the 
lilldren of Italy’s soldiers."

1
.... .

Tills British o.llclnl photograph. which was taken cn (he British western 
front before the signing of the armistice. shows the wanton destruction with 
which the Germnns rnragcil the country that they were evacuating. This 
♦ tie lime beautiful statue In I»mial was pulled down by the enemy for 
.........  •eii::r *',j therein.

the

TEXAS OIL INDUSTRY BOOMS
War Stimulus Result* In Development 

of Refineries With 278,500 Bar- 
rels Capacity.

Ikillns.—1'nder tin* spur of war, 
e\n*» iti/ the last year bus effected a 

tremendous development of her oil In­
dustry.

Today there are In operation lu this 
state *12 refineries, with u capacity of 

, 27H,r»OM barrels daily. They are capa­
ble of refining double the amount of oil 

.produced In the Texas fields last year. 
1 Kidds of unsuspected volume have 
been opened and made to aid in keep­
ing ships and army motors at top 
speed.

Iu the coastal region where fen refin­
eries arc in Operation, the first mitt 
of a Hg oil plant on the Houston ship 
cutiui is pearly completed. It 1h In­
tended to have a capacity of 20.00C 
barrels a day and represents an Invest­
ment of from ?MNiO,U0n to *10,000,000.

PRESIDENT SAYS GOOD-BY TO AMERICA

“Gcod-by. America !” Tre«hlenl Wilson duffs his hut In farewell to the Fulled Stales as the steamship George 
Washington, hearing the presidential party, steams from Its pier at Hoboken. Above Is seen the crew of the George 
Washington cheering the president on his arrival.

CELEBRATING WAR’S END AT REIMS CATHEDRAL

\ mlor the 'Inubw oi th.s lu.-toru* .-uthedml of Reims ihc French forces, wn,rh jetook hi. <•■..* .-mo ,Jic tierumt 
Invader*, arc holding military demonstrations of peace times. General Malstro decorates ilo- heroes of the campaign for 
valor. '1 lie rnlhedral. cloaked iu wartime habiliments of sand hags, presenting a more cheery aspect, looks silentiv on.

REBUILDING HOUSES THEY DESTROYED ! BOOMING FRENCH WAR LOAN

n .... »wei«BWWB!8M8ai

Already many ol I’-c Gen uift prisoners lu France are being put to work to 
repair some of the damage they wrought there. These Huns arc rebuilding a 
cottage that they or their fellows had destroyed.

SHOWING NURSE THEIR SOUVENIRS

Two statue* .a inc entrance of flu 
T’ullertes gardens have been protectee 
h.v sand hags shin* last winter. Now 
they have another coal of Koine .‘iiou 
samls of captured (jermnu UeUfitw U 
stimulate the French war loun.

Winnipeg’s Great Growth.
It Is forty-nine years since Louts 

Kiel, self-styled "president of the pns- 
v\slmml government nt Bed Kiver," 
took possession <»f Fort <lurry, «ppn»- 
priated Its contents, and began his 
ten months’ reign of anarchy ove- u 
considerable portion of southeastern 
Manitoba. This was Kiel’s first gam­
ble lot* power, it ended In flight. Th© 
• iM-oiul ended on the scaffold.

There was no city of \ViTmlpeg'rfor* 
t>-nlne years ago. :\ fact that reminds 

in* of the euergj and industry put 
(Orth hy the Canadians who went Went 
a generation or so ago. and of the 
richness of the m in ify  to which they 
went.

— —p—l1peiJ^^wim^ewe5IIperViiteii|5
■ i A . ■ bxls i fi  "

• wounded American*, who I:: e done (heir share m the routes: for 
justice, are showing their nurse pieces of u German e-'rpluue that 
down by the Yanks btfor# Bull ©court.

Could Hardly Have Been Grief.
"Jui'd KucklcdalVw’s oldest girl go 

married last night,” repeated (’nptul, 
Johnson of Rumpus Ridge, who wu 
In TumUnvIMe on •• shopping expedl 
Ron.

"Ah! Who was the happy man? 
; sked the editor m tin- Torch of Li): 
erty. 1

"Jurd, 1 ...... f.rasc.wnys, when
"Id by Ids place this morning I seei 
1dm standing on his head in a fetio 
"ortiet* with his heeds waving In th 
air. And, as Jurd i* all of fifty ye»u 
old. 1 don’i 'low that grief would dri? 
him to cutting such capers aa tluit»”-  
Knnaas ('tty Star.
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The House wife and Her Work
(Special Information Service United States Department of Agriculture.)

TIME TO BAKE THAT CHRISTMAS FRUIT CAKE.

The Last Stage—When Mother Puts It in the Oven.

CHRISTMAS CAKE 
WITHOUT SUGAR

Recipe for Sweetening It This 
Holiday Season by Use 

of Honey.

DRIED FRUITS INEXPENSIVE
Always Ready to Serve and Has 

"Saved the Oay" on Many Occa­
sions When Unexpected Com­
pany Arrived—How Served.

Perhaps you art* saying that you 
cannot afford a Christmas fruit cuke 
this year or that it would be unpatri­
otic to make one. h u t think of the 
many times that the fru it cake has 
“saved the day” when unexpected com­
pany arrived, as is likely to happen In 
the holiday season.

You didn't care If the dessert pre­
pared for the family was not stretch­
able, but took down the fruit cake and 
opened a cun of fruit to serve with it 
or steamed a slice around and served 
It with a sauce as a plum pudding. 
Remember the many ways you can 
make use of the fruit cake, and that 
it can be made without sugar, and you 
will find yourself deciding that you 
cannot forego it as n holiday tre a t  

This recipe makes use of honey for 
sweetening. The dried fruits used are 
fess expensive thun the candled fruits 
so often used In a fruit cake.

Honey Fruit Cake.
4 cupfuls flour touspoonful
8 teaspooofuls sods cloves 
2 cupfuls honey 3 pounds raisins,
1 cupful butter needed
6 eggs 4 ounces rltron
2 teaspoonfuls cin- 1 pound cranberries

namon 1 pound canned
2 teaspoonfuls ginger plncnpplo
3 teaspoonfuls ) 1 dried aprl-

ground cardamom cots
seeds 1 lb. dried apples

To prepare the cranberries, pineap­
ple, apricots, ami tipples, cut the 
fruit In small pieces—except Dm* cran­
berries which arc left whole—ami 
cook each in honey until soft. Hr 
move from the Are and dry in a very 
slow oven. A little water should l»»» 
added to the honey in which (he cran­
berries cook. To tiny honey left over 
from cooking the fruits mid enough 
more to make the two cupfuls used la 
mixing the cake. .Place ihc fruit in a 
large dish ami sift over it  one-half of 
the flour, mixing thoroughly. Sift the 
soda with the remaining Hour, Bring 
the honey and Die butter to the boiling 
point and while still hoi udd the 
spices. When the mixture is cool mid 
the well-bouten yolks of eggs, then the 
flour, und llnally mid the well-beaten 
whites und Die fruit. The cake should 
be divided into three or four parts 
and put into buttered dishes covered 
with buttered paper lied closely over 
the top. Steam for live hours, remove 
the paper, and bake In a slow oven for 
one hour.

If you don't get your fruit cake 
made early you can try the following 
quick fruit cake, which is very good, 
also:

Quick Fruit Cake.
*4 cupful shortening
1 rupfui corn sirup 

o r  s o r g h u m

2 crkh
2-3 cupful milk
2 tcaRpoonfuls va­

nilla
1H cupfuls flour
2 leusponnfuis t>ak 

lag powder

1 tcaspoonful salt 
1 teaspoonful cloves 
l teaspoonful ginger 
1 tnblOHpoonful cin­

namon
1 cupful chopped 

raisins
H cupful chopped 

nuts
14 capful chopped 

citron

Mix fat nod sirup, add egg yolks 
and milk. Put chopped fruit uud nuts 
In halter und add dry material* Rifted 
together. Fold In stiffly ben ten egg 
whites. Bake in lonf or muliln tins, 
Thl* cake keeps well hut. not so long 
ns the regular fruit cuke.

Make Uae of Nut 8upply.
Nuts may be had for Die galhering 

In most parts of the country and nut 
meats are certainly coming into their

own us a food. Many people are just 
beginning to find out that nuts are a 
valuable source of food. Most varie­
ties have a high nutritive value, due 
to their fat and protein content.

Chestnuts stand in a class by them­
selves, being largely carbohydrate in 
composition. They are good boiled ami 
tnoslM*d. Servo ns potatoes or use as 
stuffing for a fowl. Butternuts, black 
walnuts, English walnuts, filberts, 
hazel nuts, hickory nuts, pecans und 
almonds all may be used ns fat savers, 
for they are especially rich in fat. It 
is certain that if you have on liuud u 
large supply of nuts, you can add at­
tractive and varied dishes to your 
meals a t  little expense. The . protein 
and fut are combined in the nut much 
as they are in meat, which makes it a 
good substitute for moat. Vegetarians 
have learned to make many attractive 
combination dishes from nuts, such as 
nut loaves, croquettes and souffles, 
which they serve In place of meat.

This walnut roast Is very palatable. 
Almost any nut can he used in place 
of the walnut if desired.

W alnut Roast.
2 cupfuls whole 1 cupful walnut

milk meats (ground)
1W cupfuls toasted 2 teaspountuls onion

bread crumbs (grated)
2 eggs 1 teaspoonful salt

*

Mix the ingredients; pack into a 
greased loaf pan and bake.

We all know the place of nuts in 
salad making. The ground nuts are 
also very good mixed with cottage 
cheese. Mold the mixture and slice. 
Another attractive dish which is deli­
cious served for a Sunday night's sup­
per Is tomato, celery and nut sand­
wich. Slice bread and toast until a 
delicate brown. Place a slice of t#* 
mate on u slice of the toasted bread, 
sprinkle with suit and cover with fine­
ly chopped celery mixed with finely 
ground nuts. Cover with another slice 
of (lie (ousted bread. Some people 
prefer to toast the bread for Rucli 
umdwlehes on one side only, putting 
the toasted side out.

In the pastry and cake recipes 
which follow, tin* nuts nro used to re­
place the fat usually used. They also 
give u desirable llavor as well as rich­
ness to the products.

Nut Pastry.
Take equal weights of nut meats 

and Hour sifted with a small amount 
of salt. Bui Du* dour and nut moats 
through a food grimier together until 
Die nuts arc Andy ground. Mix with 
just enough mid water to make the 
mas", hold together. Holt thin, cut in 
rounds or in strips and bake. These 
may be spread with cream dices*? and 
used as a salad wafer or they nuiy be 
served as a tart spread with Jelly or 
lemon filling.

Nut Cakes.
8 ounce* nu.a 4 (onspoonfulu hak-
1% cupful* ttiigty lug nulla
3 cupful* dour 4 egg whites
1 teaspoonful salt IVfc cupfuls water 
(4 teaspoonful Hud& 1 toaHpoonful cinna­

mon

Mix and bake in muffin molds or in 
a loaf.

1 GOOD WORKING CREED f
<X -----  i
•  a

The Ideal of the hoy and girl •
•  club members under the direc- J
•  Don of the department of agri-
•  culture tmd the slate ngrlcui- * 
£  turn! colleges is to learn and •

practice the best way to pro- jj 
^  duee something worth while and &
•  then to give the information to * 

wane one else, who may also •
<t reap Du* lienefit* from these bet* •
•  ter praellers. J

Can Meat in Cold Weather,
Cold weather offers advantages for 

Die canning of meat, us bacteria is 
less active. But Into Jars the surplus 
cockerels and part of the freshly 
killed pork, rather than Rervu them 
until Die appetite clogs. The meat 
ready lint for reheating will come 
mighty liundy wheu unexpected com­
pany drops in or on •  hot day next 
summer.

STRASSBURG, OCCUPIED BY THE FRENCH UNDER MANGIN

Strassburg, Die capital of Alsace, which was occupied by the French under General Mnngin. That commander 
is shown in Die Insert.

AUSTRIAN NAVAL 
BASE DEMOLISHED

*-

Illinois Sailor Describes Feat of 
American, British and Ital­

ian Fleet.

ALLIES HAVE NO CASUALTIES
Mighty Base at Durazzo Is Laid in

Ruins, Several Warships and at 
Least Four Submarines Are 

Destroyed.

Waukegan. III.—How the American, 
Italian und British sailors destroyed 
the enemy fleet and reduced Durazzo, 
Albania, the mighty Austrian naval 
base, to ruins, is graphically told in 
an uncensored letter by George Milt!- 
more of Waukegan, stationed on a 
United States submarine chaser, in a 
letter to Thomas II. McCann, as fol­
lows:

“We are just returning from an at­
tack we made on an Austrian port 
American submarine chasers co-oper­
ated with allied marines In destroy­
ing a strong Austrian submarine reiv 
dlzion and port of disembarkation. 
We left our base lust week and put 
into an Italian port.

“A few days Inter we shoved off for 
Durazzo, an Albanian town captured 
early in the war by the Austrians and 
turned into nn Austrian submarine 
base and port of disembarkation for 
Austrian troops on their way to the 
Macedonian front.

• “We maneuvered over the fortifica­
tions for about an hour when the 
English light cruisers am! destroyers 
and torpedo limits, with the Itullan 
battleship, destroyers and torpedo 
boats and English and French sub­
marines appeared on the horizon, 
bearing down on us at full speed. 
Our ship had the exceptional honor of 1 
being flagship of the squadron, which I 
represented Uncle Sam in the scrap, i

“We were assigned to submarine 
and torpedo defense for the o th e r ' 
ships, and were the first ship in line I

l

HONORED BY FRENCH

und the first to draw fire from the 
land batteries. We were from two to 
three thousand yards nearer the 
beach than the other ships, and the 
shells began dropping all around us 
and whizzing just over our aerial.

“One broadside from a battleship si­
lenced the shore battery Just about 
the time they hnd our range. Our 
bombardment started at noon and 
lasted about an hour and a half. The 
Austriur. submarines came out and 
were immediately attacked by our 
fast chasers.

“In one attack, ns a submarine enme 
up for a sight, the second shot from 
a chaser cut his periscope clean off.

“After a short run, dropping light 
depth charges on it, we blew the sub­
marine clear out of the water.

"Another chaser pounced on an­
other submarine ns it was about to 
discharge a torpedo Into the fleet of 
warships and a few more ash cans 
(depth charges) sent one more Hun 
pirate and Its crew on Its final sub­
mergence. Still another unit of chas­
ers saved at least two first-class de­
stroyers from mines by cutting in 
across their bow and sinking mines 
by gunfire which lay dead ahead In 
the destroyer's course.

At times during the bombardment, 
when we would be In n certain position 
us u broadside was being delivered, 
the concussion would he great enough 
to roil our light craft as though in a 
heavy sea. When the bombardment

was finished, the whole allied fleet 
steamed hack to open sea, white (the 
United States chasers remained and 
kept up the defense until It was ob­
vious no more submarines were forth­
coming.

“We soon got into formation and 
under full speed headed out to sea and 
picked up the main fleet. The town of 
Durazzo was bombed by planes from 
5 a. m. every half hour until after we 
finished. The results were us follows: 
One big Austrian transport sunk and 
two large supply ships; one large 
Austrian destroyer and one torpedo- 
boat; a t least four submarines sunk 
and one Austrian plane brought down. 
Our whole fleet returned Intact, with 
no casualties, and Durazzo is no more.

“We intercepted nn Austrian hos­
pital ship and sent n hoarding purty 
aboard and found 200 Austrian sol­
diers aboard who were wounded dur­
ing the early bombardment.

“It appears that some were Just 
leaving the transport and others were 
stationed in Die town when they met 
their fate. There were n number of 
nurses aboard und when they saw the 
United States chasers they rushed to 
the rull to wave to the American 
gobs.”

“We turned the ship free afterward 
and let it proceed back to the Aus­
trians, even though the crew nnd 
nurses seemed quite pleased at being 
made prisoners by the Americans.

“This scheme was brought about 
mainly through the efforts of our cap­
tain and commander in charge of this 
fleet. He is a real Americnn scrapper 
and has enough reserve American 
“pep” to supply the whole allied fleets 
here. He Is an old United States navy 
man and hero of the Spunish-Amerl- 
can war."

VETERAN MARINE 
ALTHOUGH BUT 18

*-

Youth Who Fought at Chateau- 
Thierry Will Enter Naval 

Academy.

ENLISTED WHEN ONLY 16

In being uv/imled the Croix *le 
Guerre and n commission us a lieuten­
ant In the French army Dr. Anna I. 
Sholly has won u distinction extend­
ed only to two nth**!' women, both of 
them her associates. A graduate of 
the medienl department of Cornell uni­
versity, Doctor Sholly volunteered for 
surgjcpi work at the outbreak of tbo 
WAT.

Carried His Full Burden of Campaign 
and Actual Combat While He Was 

17—More Veterans Will 
Probably Be Named.

Annapolis, Md.—A youth who was 
iu the very thick of Die fighting around 
Fluiteiiu-TliiciTy and Belleitu Wood 
mid passed a full year abroad as a 
United States murine luis obtained an 
appointment for the naval academy 
und is In Annapolis preparing for bis 
entrance examinations next spring.

lie is Arthur 0. Heller, son of C. 
Arthur Heller, an attorney of New­
ark, N. and is now a si latent at a 
naval preparatory school here.

Young Heller Is a most modest 
youth mid decline* to say anything 
about ills exploits. He wishes only 
to puss Ids examinations for the acad­
emy and to enter as any other youth, 
working hard for advancement through 
ih*» different classes, uud finally to win 
a commission in Die navy. He was 
loath to aceept the appointment, 
which was obtained without solicita­
tion mi his part, us In* wished to slay 
abroad until the end of the war. He 
was with tin* very first troops that 
'••out to Fm m e with Pershing.

lie was cited In the debates in con- 
gross upon Die question of lowering 
tin* draft age as an example of what 
a very young man eouJd accomplish, 
for Heller enlisted iu the marine corps 
when In* wa< only sixteen Ttml has just 
reached eighteen, Gnusequently he 
carried ids full burden of campaign 
and actual combat while he was seven­
teen. It was argued from his case 
that the h<?st kind of fighting could he 
•hme by American youths between the 
ages of eighteen and twenty-one.

Heller will try for the academy by 
virtue of a regular congressional ap­
pointment. There are quite a number 
of other service men in Annapolis nlso 
prepurlng for the entrance examina­
tions next spring, young men who have

been in army training camps and oth­
ers from various brandies of the naval 
service. They have been given fur­
loughs in order to prepare for the 
naval academy.

More Veterans to Be Named.
So far as is known none hut Heller 

has had actual buttle experience, hut 
doubtless there will be a number of 
others before the next class is formed. 
These will come from two sources. 
Members of congress will take tills op­
portunity of rewarding worthy youths 
of their own district who have done 
creditable work in the service, und are 
still of the right age. Undoubtedly 
Secretary Daniels will he able to 
designate the full quota of a hundred 
youths from Die enlisted personnel of 
the navy and marine corps, which the 
law permits to enter curl) now cluss at 
Dm* academy.

Thl year, though the law has been 
in effect only a III IU* over u yenr. 
more Umn fifty were designated by the 
secretary. It was said that one rea­
son why Dm* quota was not full was 
that many of the young men In tin* 
service refused to leave active duty 
while there wns n rLinre of meeting 
Germany either on land or seu. Many 
of these spirited fellows will be desig­
nated for Du* next class.

Many well-educated youths entered 
the navy and marine corps for the pur­
pose of getting into the thick of it, and 
are still of the proper age, that is, be­
low' twenty. Any of these cun aspire 
to an appointment to the naval acad­
emy through designation by the sec­
retary of the navy.

* * * * * * *  * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * *
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MAN VOTES IN ONE 
PRECINCT 64 YEARS

narksvllle, In.-—Thomas Hunt 
of this city claims Dm* champion­
ship long-distance vote-ln-om*- 
prednet race In the United 
States. Mr. Hunt cast his first 
vote in ISM and has voted at 
every election sine** In this pro- 
c»nct. He has not missed nn 
election in 04 years, state, na­
tional, county or municipal. He's 
a Republican, mid generally 
“votes her straight."

t * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * )

Easy Farming Methods in West­
ern Canada and Certain 

Financial Benefits.
With ymtr crop harvested and mar­

keted, with Dm* disposal of your cattle 
nnd hogs completed, you me reudy to 
prepare your financial statement for 
the year. You will soon know ulmt you 
have gained, imd if the gala made In 
.vour farming operations lias been up 
to >our expectations nnd nil) meet 
vour requirements. Brohahly yon may 
have been the loser. Your land may 
have been productive, hut it may have 
been too hiah priced. The co*t of pro- 
dm Don has been too great. If you 
haw  had the ivniuneralion you sought 
am] arc satisfied this article may not 
Ini crest you. If .wm* returns haw  mu. 
been satisfactory, or if your ambition 
leads you to the laudable desire of bet­
tering >our condition, if y«u have de­
pendents for whose future you have 
anxiety, you will naturally look around 
for some place, some opportunity that 
otters greater advantages and brings 
satisfactory returns. To tin* north and 
west of you lie hundreds of thousands 
of unbroken acres in Western Canada 
awaiting Die husbandman, and ready 
to give of its richness to place you 
where you desire to he* placed. Fo- 
thoiisnnds of fanners from nearly ev­
ery state in the Union the prairies of 
Western Canada have afforded wcalDi 
beyond what they had been led in ex­
pect. The excellence of Die soil of 
Western Canada, which comprises Die 
ITovinces of Manitoba. Saskatchewan 
mid Alberta, can only partially he udd 
by Die knowledge of some facts.

Every year for some years past the 
world's highest prizes for wheat, oats 
anil barley have been carried off by 
grain grown on Western Canadian 
Bvnlries. Beef fattened on Die grasses 
of these same prairies recently brought 
the highest prices ever paid on the 
Chicago market. Throughout the en­
tire world the quality of Canadian 
grain, and Cunndian beef nnd mutton, 
is recognized. To recite wlmt indi­
vidual farmers have done, the riche* 
they have acquired would (Hi volume*. 
The case of James Wlsimrt of Bortnge 
In Brnlrlo is not an exceptional one. 
IBs wheut crop tills past season yield­
ed hini forty-five bushels per acre, and 
the land upon which it wn# grown was 
broken forty-four years ago, nnd it lias 
been continuously under crop except 
for nn occusionul summer follow. At 
Moose Jaw, Saskatchewan, samples of 
the wheat of 1018 weighed 08 pound* 
to the bushel, others 00 and some 05V4 
pounds. Wheat crops a t Conldnle, 
Albertn, went ns high ns ,'W bushel* 
acre, while wheut crops near Barons, 
Albertn. had yields of from 'Si to fiO 
bushels.

Records such ns these speak in glow­
ing terms of the excellence of the soli 
of Western Canada.

The war Is over, and we ore all 
settling down to a pence bnsly. There 
Is a greut world beyond the sens to 
feed and clothe, und thus Is afforded 
the opportunity to lend n Imnd In the 
great work. Aside from the philan­
thropy in which you can play n part, 
Uiere is Die satisfaction of knowing 
you nre amply providing for yourself 
and for the future of those who rauy 
be dependent ui»on you. Greater prog­
ress can be inode in this nnd your own 
development by availing yourself of 
the advantages that Western Canada 
offers hi its low-priced lands ami high 
yielding values. There nre good 
schools, desirable social conditions, low 
taxation (none on improvements) 
with an enjoyable climate, and the 
satisfaction of possessing n well tilled 
soil capable of producing abundant 
crops fur which good prices prevail, at 
easily accessible marketing places.—. 
Advertisement.

Used Ladders in Battle.
Tin* medieval scaling ladder played 

its part along with tin* more modern 
Implements of war In the closing days 
of Dm* Aiim-Hcmii advance la FrniM'e, 
according to n letter from Col. Alvord 
V. D. Anderson of the Three Hundred 
and Twelfth Infantry, received by Mrs. 
Anderson.

Colonel Anderson said Dmt Ids regi­
ment, with tin* Three .Hundred uud 
Ninth and Threi* Hundred and E'**v- 
••nth, rushed Dm* walled town of Grand 
Brc with ladders five times. Four 
times they were driven buck, in* said, 
but on the fifth rush, by sheer uvjghr 
of numbers, (hey gullied a footing, and 
scaling the Malts, which were ll! f*-.*t 
high, cup'ured the town.

Insanitary.
Sabi the observing fellow, “If* a 

wonder the health Inspectors don't get 
ahold of the chap who spits out just 
what he thinks."

Change of Countenance.
Sabi Dm* facetious M lcr: “As soon 

as a girl get* past the age of making 
faces at the hoys she starts in making 
eyes at ’em.”

Odd Foods.
Lizards and alligators nre the latest 

propositions In Dm; way of food vnrl- 
ety. They do not Ream very alluring 
to the United States appetites, yet liz­
ards have been extremely popular in 
the Bulmmu (stands, and Florida alli­
gators have h reputation of being quite 
delicious.

Zoological Notes.
Another thing we can't understand 

Is how a woman can be a pirf*-. * . i t  
and yet be scared to demi* oi u moii'c. 
—Onclnnutl (Cuqulrer.
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O U R  F L A G
folds of white and scarlet! O blue field with 

jour sliver stars! May food eyes welcome you, 
willing leel follow you, strong bauds defeud 
you, wirm hearts cherish you, and dying 
lips give you their blessing! Ours by 
inheritance, ours bv allegiance, ours 

hv affection -long may you float on 
(lie free winds of heaven, the

em< lem of liberty, the 
hope of the world.

—Anon.

ESCANABA RIVER L. & I. CO.

Annual Meeting Held In This City 
Last Monday

The annual meeting of the  Eecana- 
ba River Land & Iron Company, which 
was the twenty-eighth in the history 
of the organization, was held in th is 
city Monday and resulted In the re- 
election of the following official 
board:

President. Charles Johnson: vice 
president, Joseph EL Suess; secretary' 
and treasurer, Joseph H. Winter; di­
rectors—Mrs. Edward tpbb, Nathaniel 
Lobb, Munising; Mrs. S. P. Kline, 
Joseph EL Suess, August P. Johnson, 
Joseph H. Winter, Charles Johnson, 
Negaunee.

The company is the fee owner of 
the tract in the vicinity of Princeton 
upon which is located the Austin 
mine, operated by the Cleveland-Cliffs 
Iron Company under lease. Since 
Just about a  year ago operation has 
been greatly handicapped by an un­
derground flow of water which came 
from the adjoining Stephenson mine. 
This difficulty is gradually being over­
come, and os additional ore bodies 
had been blocked out previous to the 
water difficulty there is little  doubt 
that it will not be very long before 
the mine is again in the list of ship­
pers. Dividends amounting to 18 
cents per share and aggregating 
$7200 were distributed to the stock­
holders of the Escanaba River Land 
& Iron Company during the past 
fiscal year.

WOMAN'S CLUB MEETING

Local Organization Planning Work 
for Remainder of Year

There was a good attendance at the 
meeting of the Negaunee Woman's 
Club which was held In the Common 
Council Chamber last Tuesdiy and 
reports were submitted covering such 
work as had been done since the last 
meeting. As an organization, the 
Woman's Club has not been active 
for some little  time, Its members 
having given their services to the 
Red Cross and various forms of relief 
work, but it is the intention bo re­
sume monthly meetings at an early 
date and committees are now engaged 
in planning club work for the re­
mainder of the year.

HIGH SCHOOL FACULTY CHANGE

Miss Barnard Resigns and Will be 
Succeeded by Mr. Shand

Chamberlain's Tablets 
When you are troubled w .h Indi­

gestion or coosiipatioD, take Cham­
berlain's Tablets. They strengthen 
the stomach and enable it to do its 
functions naturally. Indigestion is 
usually accompanied by constipation 
and is aggravated by it. Chamber- 
Iain’s Tablets cause u gentle move­
ment of tbe bowels, relleviog the con­
stipated cooditioo.

Miss Rosalie Barnard, instructor in 
history in the Negaunee high school, 
has tendered her resignation to take 
effect ut the close of the first semes­
ter and she will be succeeded on Feb­
ruary 3 by John Parks Shand, on 
Ishpeming young man who was grad­
uated from the University of Michi­
gan 'in  1918 and whose major work 
was in history.

Superintendent EL D. Denison has 
been advised that T. C. Davis, who 
was at the head of the manual tra in ­
ing department up to the time th a t 
he entered the service of his coun­
try, is slated for early release from 
his duties at Great Lakes Naval 
Training Station and unless some­
thing unexpected should intervene 
he will be able to resume his duties 
here a t tbe beginning of the next 
semester or very shortly thereafter.

The Board of Education has under 
consideration the addition of oxy- 
weld apparatus for the manual tra in ­
ing department. This is one of the 
later inventions in iron working and 
knowledge of it will prove valuable 
to those who may be graduated from 
the local school. Its intense flame 
will cut its way* through the hardest 
steel like a knife through cheese, 
and while if it Is properly employed 
there is no reason to apprehend dan­
ger in its use, it is probable tha t if 
it is introduced in the local manual 
training department its  use will be 
limited to the senior classes, and 
then only under the immediate sup­
ervision of the instructors.

The attendance in the high school 
has kept up remarkably well, consid­
ering the limitations imposed by quar­
antine. as well as by influenza itself 
The number of absences in the grades 
is proportionately larger, mumps be­
ing one of the chief causes of ab­
sence in this division of the schools 
though in neither branch Is the num­
ber sufficient to seriously interfere 
w ith school work nor to be consid­
ered at all alarming.

Miss Anne I. Sinnen, a member of 
the high school faculty, who was 
summoned to Idaho during holiday* 
vacation by the death of a sister, 
is expected to return in time to re­
sume her duties next Monday.

A couple of the grade teachers are 
out this week because of illness, but 
os their ailment is of so plebeian a 
variety as mumps they doubtless will 
thank us for omission of their names.

TO PROMOTE CITIZENSHIP

REPORT OF 111B CONDITION OF

T H K  N E G A U N E E  S T A T E  B A N K
at Neitaunee, Mtcliljiso, at the close of bu«ines*. Dee. SI. 1915. 
us call**! for by tbe Commissioner of tbe Banking Department. 

KBSOl'KCBS.
D>AN8 AND DISCOUNTS, vtz: Commercial. Raving*.

Secured by collateral............................ ................... I 7<»,IH4 78 f 31,new
ruMK'iired..............................................................  jp.Wi 70
Items in transit......................................................  514 Of

Total*...................................................... 1110,63* 54 I 31,770 00 1148,40s
WINDS, MOKH;AliKH AND MKCUHITIES, viz:

Real Estate Mortgages............................................. |  2.636 45 I 3!,191 15
Municipal Bouds IU office..... ..................................  H.W SO
Municipal lUiutU I'lnlged........................................  2100 ‘0 3U.UW) UO
Wht Savin** and Thrill Stamp*...............................  W  >4
Other Bondi...........................................................  20.494 75

Tottla...................................................... 1 25.37* 04 I1U6.2I8 65 1130/95 69
HKSKUVK8, viz:

Due from Hanks In Reserve Cilie*............................  |  21,439 Ml f 5.224 25
l*. S. Ikiud* & Cert o( IndebiedneM carried aa ret’ve 9,649 si
r.xelmnge* for clearing bouse...................................  491 M
Currency......................„........................................ 3.124 00 6.0 © rtl
(inld Corn ............................................................. 2,750 00 4,000 00
Silver Coin ...........................................................  50i AJ you 00
Nickel* ami Cent*...................................................  «lu *9 100 00

ew iB Sft•iK w sfiS .-V uV ..........................  * * ■ " *  , T *7 *  '  * • *  “
dveidrafts............................................................................... |  0003
I’reuium Account................................................................... 1.200 ou
Banking House ....................................................................  2St*ij a)
Furniture and Fixture*............................................................  1,6M 00
Outside Checks ami uther Cash Item*........................................  9 50

Italian League Will Meet Sunday 
With This End In View

A meeting of the Italian Citizens’ 
League has been called for January 
26th, at the Scandinavian hall. The 
league was organized last autum n 
and its especial purpose is to en­
courage Italian residents of Mar­
quette county to acquire United 
State citizenship papers with ob little  
delay as possible. Richard DePola 
and Julius Pizzatti have been named 
as a committee to canvass th is  and 
neighboring cities and towns, to urge 
membership in the league as well as 
to stim ulate in terest in the citizen­
ship program. There is a consider­
able percentage of Italians In Mar­
quette county’s population, and while 
many of them have taken out their 
citizenship papers, there are many 
others who have not In most In­
stances the la tte r condition Is due to 
the individuals' intention to ultim ate­
ly return to Italy; and it is the ob- 
servaton of those who have studied 
the m atter that the number who re­
turn to their native land, except for 
a  visit, is comparatively small. The 
league officials are therefore con­
vinced th a t many advantages would 
accrue if more of their number 
would become American citizens 
without further delay, and th e ir  mis­
sionary efforts will be to th is end.

Ths disposition on the part of the 
league officials is in line w ith the  ac­
tivities of government and school 
authorities, who are seeking to pro­
mote more general citizenship. The 
Initial steps along this line were tak­
en by Negaunee school officials sev­
eral months ago, preparatory to s ta r t­
ing a night school if there should be 
sufficient demand for one. Before 
the project had really gotten under 
way a  damper was put upon it  by the 
influenza situation. A government 
official who was here a few days ago 
appeared to be considerably miffed 
because nothing had been accomplish­
ed in this direction, but he took 
m atters somew hat more calmly when 
the situation was made clear and he 
was assured tha t the schoo| board 
would be glad to provide tbe facili­
ties as soon as there was a  demand 
for them.

OTHER SIDE OF THE QUESTION

Ntw York Decries Too Radical Influ­
enza Quarantine

An article which recently appeared 
In the New York Times, describing 
the metropolis’ methods in dealing 
with the influenza epidemic, is a t­
tracting much interest. Briefly sta t­
ed, the policy of the  New York au­
thorities was to have as little  inter­
ference with the activities of every 
day life as it seemed saf^*4b permit, 
and especially w ith regard to per­
mitting churches, schools, theaters 
and other places of public assembly 
to remain open did the New York 
policy run counter to the ban which 
was being applied to many other 
cities.

Dr. Royal 8. Copeland, president of 
the New York board of health, has 
prepared an exhaustive statement, In­
cluding charts and tables, to substan­
tiate  the claim thht despite its five 
million population and its many con­
gested districts the liberal policy 
pursued regarding influenza restric­
tions was productive of good results. 
New York's experence with regard to 
keeping the schools open was similar 
to that of practically every other 
city which mantains medical inspec­
tion for its schools. New York, how­
ever, extended the principle, Insofar 
as it was applicable and of course 
not including medical inspection, to 
the theaters and other places of pub­
lic assembly. I t did insist, however, 
that these places be well ventilated 
and that the general rbles of the 
health department be observed. 
Places which did not conform to the 
rules were closed, but the department 
found the larger places anxious to 
co-operate to the fullest extent. 
New York's death rate from influenza 
pneumonia and kindred diseases, 
throughout the epidemic, was slightly 
less than 2 per 1000, which was 
much less than almost any other 
large city in the country, and New 
York authorities accept this as vin­
dication of the liberal policy they 
pursued.

COMING AND GOING OF PEOPLE

Personal Paragraphs About Folk 
You Know

Harry W. Jackson has returned 
home from Duluth.

Mrs. George Feigel, who came here 
from Detroit on a visit to relatives 
and friends, has been on the sick list 
for the past few days at the home of 
her daughter, Mrs. Ted Butler. ^  

Wesley Jennings, who had been in 
Negaunee for the past few days visit­
ing his parents, Mr. and Mrs. John 
Jennings,* left last evening on his re­
turn  to his duties on board the U. S. 
8. Arizona.

GARMENTS FOR THE REFUGEES

All Red Cross Women Asked to Assist 
with Present Quota

Total.
„ LIABILITIES.
Capital Stock...........................................................................
Surplus Poad..........................................................................
Undivided Profits, n et.................................... . ...........................
Dividends Uu|mIu................................................................................

COMMERCIAL DEPOSITS, viz;
Commercial l>cpoplin Subject to Check..............................................  |  9S.4V3 99
Ihie too ther Hauka and Bankers......................................................  1535 28
Postal Savings Deposits............ ............................................. r$i 59

Total.
SAVINGS DEPOSITS, viz:

Book Accounts—Subject to Hiring* By-Laws............................  fitt tU 95
Certificate! ol Deposit-Subject to Saviugs By-Laws................. 4,000 00

Tout.........................
Bonds Sold subjeet to repurchase.

Total

9365.74! I?

190.000 00 
10.000 os 

99? 61 
976 OO

9IO2J04 71

•I5&T24 »  
90,009 SS

9W .74! 11

ta.STATU OF MICHIGAN. I 
Conrrr or Mahui'kttk. j

I, Thomas Poscoe. Cashier of the above named bank, do solemnly swear that the above 
atateineot D true to the best of my knowledge and belief aud correctly reprtwenU the 
true aute of the aeveral matters therelu couialned, as tbowD bv the booas of the bank.

THOMAS PanCOK, Cashier.
Suttscrlbed nod swum to before me 

thUMbday of Jan.. 1919.
Tmkouohx A. TnoHry, 

Notary Public.
My commission expires Oct 21. 1921).

Correct Attest;
THOMAS FELLOW,
JOHN W. ELLIOTT. 
THOMAS C0XAOK&

Directors.

R A W  F U R S  

W A N T E D

HIGHEST PRICES 
PAID

stir sium. misimt, mo other iii furs it in and
receive highest market price. Shipments kept 
neparateon request till remittance!* found O K.

pay express and refund postage. Checks 
mailed same day your furs received. W rite for 
price list and shipping tie s . Ship Today.

R O B E R T  A , P F E IF F E R — D E T R O IT
68 Shelby S tm t  Tel. Charry 487

SOME BLACK HAND LETTERS

State Constabulary Getting Them 
Each Month of Year

Corporal Scavarda got his eighth 
anonymous "black hand" le tte r  last 
Monday*. He received it through the 
postoffice at Iron River. The writing 
of threatening letters has been one of 
the principal industries of some one 
in th is  county since the mounted po­
lice got on the job here.

Most of the letters give the mount­
ed men warning that they have so 
many days to leave the county and 
th a t if they don't make themselves 
scarce by th a t time something will 
happen. The lqst le tter gave Sca­
varda until midnight of December 31 
to get out of Iron county, and if he 
didn't heed he would be assassinated 
Mr. Scavarda is here yet and he says 
tha t he is going to stay irrespective 
of the  "black hand" artists. He is 
taking no chances these days, and 
anyone who has designs upon him 
had better watch out, for he means 
business. These "black hand" letters 
are the result of the activities of the 
mounted men in running down whis­
key runners. Some who want to 
profit by this illicit trade don't like 
it and they are trying to frighten the 
mounted men away.—Crystal Palls 
Diamond Drill.

273 58

BOOZE RUNNERS CORRALLED

Constabulary Continuing Their Ac­
tivities on Trains

Negaunee is getting to be a junc­
tion station for individuals who 
e ither cannot get along without their 
accustomed nip themselves or have 
been making a business of surrepti­
tiously supplying parched throats. It 
is the la tter ilk that the Constabu­
lary especially have th e ir  eye peeled 
for; they have a little  compassion for 
a man who is trying to smuggle In a 
bit for home consumption, but none 
whatever tor the person who is dodg­
ing the law for gain.

The grips and baggage of travelers 
on the North-Western tra ins have 
been yielding toll under Constabulary 
scrutiny and quite a  few of tbe of­
fenders have been lodged In the Ne­
gaunee Jail. A few have residence 
here, but the majority hail from 
elsewhere. One prominent Marquette 
man was caught in the meshes of the 
net during the past week.

NU. 3717.
REPORT OF THE CONDITION 

— OF—

The First National Bank.
At Nefaunee, io tbe State of Michigan. at tbe 

doae of business, Dec. 21,1918.
RESOURCES. .

Loansanddiscoaoif--* I 927,2i3 05
Overt! rafts uu secured..
U. S. Boudi deposited 

to secure circulation
(par value).............  1100,000 00

U.8. Bonds sod certifi­
cates of todebieduras 
pledged to ueiure U.
8 DepisHsiiurvalur) 1,M>0 00

U. S. Hoods atu certifi­
cates ot lodi-uteuness 
owued aud unpledged 140,000 00 

Liberty Lnm. Bunds.
31, 4 & 414 oopiedged 48.960 00 

Lluerty L«*n bonds.
3k, 4 & V*%. pledged 
to oecuie r  6. de­
posits......................  10.0CO 00

bunds otfier lliao U. 8. 
bonds pledged to se­
cure rust at Savings
deposits......  10,000 Ot)

Securities, other than 
j US bonds mot Inciud-
1 log stocks) owued un­

pledged....   68.139 92
Collateral Ti ust a oilier 

note* of corporations 
issued for out less Ibao .
One Year our ta ore ’
tbao Tnree Years time 34,580 00 

Tutal bonds, securities, 
etc., uther than U. 8.

Slocks, uther than Fed­
eral Reserve bank 
stock......................

HI,000 (0

58,950 0U

132,719 92

800 00
Block of Federal Re­

serve bank 150% of
6.M00buhscrtptfoo)...........

Value of baokmc bou*e 3J,0uU UO
Furutture aud fixtures. 
Lawful reserve with

8.UUU U>

Feder’l Heserve Bauk 
Cash lu vault aod uet 

amount* due (rum

65.321 46

uatlooal bauks........
Net amuuut a lie from 

banks, baukers aod

255,5*6 71

trust com(.aulea......
Check* on other bank* 

lu the same city or 
towu as reporting

12,733 55

bauk.......................
Total of Items............  272.102 63
Check* ou bauk* locat­

ed outside ct city or 
town of i-porting 
bank and other ea*U

702 07

Items......................
Redemption /and with 

l \  S. Treasurer aud 
aue from U. 8. Treaa-

1.060 01

urer...................
Interest earned bur not

collected-appruxlrn'e 
—oo Note* & BUI* Ke

W  60

celvabie oot past due 
War Ravings Certiflc’e* 

aud Tbrtlt stamps

2.500 00

actually owned........ 701 60

Total..........
LIABILITIES 

Capital Stuck paid in
surpluf fund................
lodivtdau profits
lut. A dire. collected ur 

credited, lu advauoe 
of maturity aud uot 
eariied(approxtniate) 

Ainouol reserved (or
taxes accrued............

Amouot reserved for 
aU interest accrued.. 

Circutallug notes out­
standing.....................

N**t amount* due to
National banka.........

Net amounts due to 
banks, bankers and 
trust eompaoiM -—

Total of Uetnsr...........
(odividoaidaposiusob-

2,517 ®

f l.754,699 75

• lno.ooooo
100.0011 (SI 
* 1,256 07

400 00 

2,000 00 
1.441 02 

100,04)0 00 

72 80

2,744 50

Jeelldxbeek.. 
Unified checks..

out*

Chamberlain’s Cough Remedy 
Before using this preparation for a 

Cough or cold you may wish to know 
what it has dooe for other*. Mrs. o. 
Cook, Macon, 1)1., writes, "I have 
fouod it gives tbe quickest relief of 
uoy cough remedy I have ever used.” 
Mrs. James A. Kuott. Chllllcmb**, 
Mo , says ‘'Chamberlain* Cough Rem­
edy can not bo bent for coughs 
aod colds ** H. J. Moore. Oval, Pa., 
•nys ’i  have used Chamberlalo's 
Cough Remedy on several occasions 
when I *a» suffering with a settled 
cold upon the cbtst and it bite always 
brought about a cure.”

Certifli
Cashier's Checks

stand lug.....................
Dividends unpaid........
Total demand deposits 

(other than bank d* 
posits) subject to He-
serve..........................  MMt! 19

Certificates of deposit 
(other than for mooey
borrowed)..................

Foetal Savlon deposits 
Other time deposits ..
Total of time deposits

844.171 97 
MOO

L091 22 
2,124 SO

1440 27 
5475 83 

1,014,953 12

subject to Reserve 
War loan deposit ace t 
Other Colled Btates 

dt-poaiu. Including 
deposits of U. S. dis­
bursing oilcera........

1.086,172 21 
28,000 00

1,000 00 39.000 00

Total.

STATBOF MICHIGAN. 
CocsTtor MsaqoeT. . .

I. T. C. YaU-s. Cashier of tbo ab,.»e

21,754,699 75 

1OBTTB, | “

Dittoed bank. d» soDtuoly swear that (be above 
itatcineiit is true to tbeoest of my knowledge
and belief. T c. yaTBU. Caehler.
Coshsct—Attest' __ ____

A MAITLAND, j
JoH. U. WINTER. >Directors
CUAS. JOHNMOK.l

Subscribed and sworn to before me tbU 9th 
day-I J»n.. 1919 _  „  _ ...

Tuzodoeb A THoatv, Notary Public. 
(My commission expires Oct. 21,19211

A consignment of material for 
refugee garments Is expected to reach 
here before the end of the week, and 
upon its arrival work will be resumed 
in tfie Red Cross rooms in the city 
hall. It Is expected that the emer­
gency work being done for the local 

isolation hospital will have been com­
pleted by th a t time and it is planned 
to have the work rooms open four 
days each week—Mondays, Tuesdays, 
Wednesdays and Thursdays—until 
tbe  quota has been completed. All 
Red Cross workers ore asked to Join 
In the task, and arrangements will 
be made whereby those who are un­
able to give the tim e at the Red 
Cross rooms may take work home. 
Notice will be given in case the 
shipment fails to arrive, but it is 
regarded as quite certain tha t the 
work can be gotten under way next 
Monday.

ANNUAL MEETING
Tbe nnnuNl meeting of the stockholders of tbe 

Negsuoee State Hank for the purpose ot elect­
ion directors and the transaction of any other
busineaa which may properly come before said 
meeting, will be held to tis banking office In tbe 
City of Negaunee, Michigan, <m Tuesday, Jauu-

DOBB8-TROMBLY NUPTIALS

Negaunee Young Lady Becomes Bride 
of Munlslng Man

The marriage of Miss Elsie Ophelia 
Dobbs, of Negaunee, and Vernie J. 
Trombly, of Munising, occurred a t 
St. Paul's Catholic Church last Wed­
nesday morning, the ceremony being 
performed by the pastor. Rev. Joseph 
F. Dlttman, In the presence of a 
number of relatives and friends. The 
bride was attired In a blue traveling 
suit, with a  large picture hat, and 
the bridal couple's attendants were 
Miss Marie Dobbs, a  sister of the 
bride, and Frank Peters, the la tter 
of Munlslng.

Following the ceremony a wedding 
breakfast was served a t the home ot 
the bride's parents, Mr. and Mrs. Ed­
ward Dobbs, Pioneer avenue, and that 
evening Mr. and Mrs. Trombly left for 
a wedding trip  to Duluth and other 
points. The couple are to make their 
home in Munising.

WON THE LEVINE PONY

William Belstrom, Jr„ Proved to be 
the Lucky Lad

The contest which had been waged 
among Negaunee boys for a couple of 
months for possession of the magic 
sales slips which m ight bring them 
into possession ot the pony Levine 
Brothers were to give away, came to 
a  close last week, w ith the result 
that William Belstrom was declared 
to be the  winner. Tbe standing of 
the two highest competitors was: 
Belstrom, $2,474.10; Russell Trem- 
bath, $2,430.26. In view of the close 
ness of the leaders, Levine Brothers 
gavg Trembath a consolation prize in 
the form of a $25 check, while all 
other contestants who scored $500 or 
more in sales slips received $5 each.

ary 14th. 1919, from lu a. m. to 4 i>. m.
H 15 THOMAS I’ASCOK. Cashier. 

Dated, Negaimer, Mich., Dec. loth,2918.

n lii 20 min 
«  »•!••«* <v.,b Dr. *•..« 
w ( r »op liumrtly. 

im i b  will surely pr
No vomiting. n» 

areas. A saift omlDl''av.ifihyruo -TU(\ Druotc

Use La Vida daily and you add to your person 
ality the dainty refinement of perfect complex 
ion and the silken gloss of healthy hair.

Moreover, La Vida massage brings rest 
to tired nerves and gives relief from pain.
La Vida cannot get out of order; is guaranteed 
to last for years; uses alternating current only.
W e will refund your money if  not satij/actory.
Book of instruction with every vibrator.

Michigan Gas & Electric Go
NaoAUHmm Offioms J A C K S O N  S T

E L L I O T T  &  D f lll'F ,

E  F U R N IT U R E
£  3 2 4  W 0 N S T .

Prepare to "Do Your Bit” 
in the

G A R D E N
SEEDS, TOOLS, EVERY- 

THING YOU NEED
B A B Y  C A R R I A G B 8  

R e e d  A  C o l l a p s i b l e

C H I L D ’S  W A G O N S

AUTO SUPPLIES
OILS AND GREASES

Automobile Enamels in 
all Colors

D o n ' t  f o r g e t  t h a t  w e  
h a v e  t h e

^  G O O D Y E A R  A g ^ n o y

H A R D W A R E
SOB IRO N ST.

Get the Home in 
trim for

S P R I N G
PAINTS, CALCIMINE, 

WALL PAPER 3  
Varnishes. Paints, Glass 3

Painting and 
Paper-hanging

We have a competent 
force and will do the job 
RIGHT—both as to work­
manship and price,

|  E L L IO T T  & D A W E  |
^ iU iU iU iU iU iU iU t iU U iU iU iU M it i iU iU iU M M iU lt iR



K K O A 0 NBB I R ON H B R A L D

—llial ho used to think 
he was getting more for 
his money by buying a 
big plug of ordinary to* 
bacco, until he ran across 
Real Gravely. Now you 
couldn’t make him switch 
back to the ordinary plug 

 ̂ again. Gravely has that

good taste that every man 
wants. It lasts so much 
longer that you get the 
tobacco satisfaction you< 
are looking for without
extra cost

• • • •
It gon further—that** why 

tan gH tkt food taito of thit HsuJ* 
t f  tobatto without txtre n i l .

PEYTON BRAND
Real Gravely Chewing Plug

each, p iece  packed  in  a  p o u ch
P D GRAVELY TODACCO CO •» DAN VI LL«E,, VA-

. R&PUBLIG
Edward Korpi, who resides on a 

farm near Witbecir, died of laflueaza- 
pDeumoolaat Dr. Holm's hospital to 
Ishpemioa last Monday evening. The 
entire Korpi family were ill and 
Mr. Korpi bad gone to Isbpemiog to 
get some medicine. He was far from 
well himself when he undertook the 
journey, and by the time he reached 
the hospital his condition waB such 
th a t the dootors ordered him to bed. 
Deceased was 38 years of age and be 
Is mourned by a widow and five child* 
ren, the eldest being a boy of 17.

A t the annual meeting of Beacon 
lodge, Knights of Pythias, the fol­
lowing officers were elected for the 
ensuing year:

P a s t Cbaucellor—Thoinas Cbenbali 
Chancellor Commander—Norman 

Peterson.
Vice Chancellor—August Gustafson 
Prelate—John R. Toro berg 
Masterof Work—JalmerUpperstrom 
Keeper of Records and Seal and 
M aster of Finance—A. J. Hocking 
M aster of Exchequer—Joseph F. 

Labold
M aster at Arms—Oscar Westman 
Inner Guard—Henry Isaacson * 
Outer Guard—B ert Anderson 
Trustee (3years)—Thom asChenhall 
Auditing Committee—NormanPeter* 

son, A rthur Carlson, Oscar Westman 
Installing Officer—A rthur Carlson 
Representative to  Grand Lodge— 

A rthur Utberg 
A lternate—Thomas Chenhall 
I t  was a  joyous meeting tha t Alfred 

Suoeson and Swante M errlla, two Re­
public boys, had over in France. Both 
a re  in army service, bu t they are in 
different dlvisisos and are doing 
different lines of work, so It would 
not have been surprising If they bad 
never managed to meet. Io fact, they 
would not have met but for the efforts 
which Suneson had put forth to that 
end. Chance word had brought him 
information of M errltla’s whereabouts 
and It appeared tha t the latter was 
more or less down and out. It will be 
recalled that M errllla was ooe of the 
survivors from an American vessel 
which was torpedoed on the way 
across, and though be was subse­
quently able to  join h is command it 
would seem that he had oever fully 
recovered from the exprlence. Suoe­
son detailed to ambulance duty In 
France, secured permission to use the 
ambulance for a  trip  to the particular 
"somewhere In Fraace” wbloh bad 
been named as the scene of M errlla’s 
whereabouts. I t  meant an all-night 
trip , but 8uneson was ready to un­
dertake this ou bis own behalf as be 
bad been on many an occasion under 
orders. He found M errllla without 
special difficulty, and though Suneson 
did not go into details there is little 
doubt that he was able to  do much 
toward cheering up M errllla, who was 
undeniably sick and more or less dis­
couraged in the bargain. I t  was in a 
sector where a mix-up regarding

supplies was causing some temporary 
discomfort, and Suneson was able to 
help out In Merrllla'# case by provid­
ing a couple of ex tra  blankets. De­
spite the hard work sod Irregular 
hours, the life seemed to agree with 
Suneson, for he kept on adding a 
little flesh righ t up to  the las t day of 
the war.

Another pleasurable meeting In 
France w aathat between Alfred Antll- 
a  and John Stocks. The former Is io 
the Navy and has made several trips 
across the big pond. I t  was during a 
reoent furlough visit to Republic that 
Antilla told of bis surprise at seeing 
another Republic box In the streets 
of Bordeaux. Antilla was on shore 
leave and while seeing what there 
was to be seen in the noted Frenob 
oily he chanced to note a familiar 
figure on a  passlog army truck. The 
surprise was mutual and the pair 
made the most of tbelr brief visit. I t  
developed th a t Stocks was ooe of a 
squad of soldiers detailed to  guard 
and operate a  waterworks station 
some little distance from the town. 
£ lk e  many others who possessed me* 
chanical ability, Ills services in this 
direction were so greatly in demand 
that be had never been able to  get 
anywhere near the fighting front. The 
10b was not without its attractions, 
but It did not scale up to John ’s ex* 
pectatlons of army life and hecould’nt 
see why they conld find someone else 
to take th a t prosaic job off bis bands 
and give him a whack a t real soldier­
ing. A ntilla returned to  New York 
after his recent leave expired and 
bad no means of knowtog bow soon it 
might be before he again set foot in 
Bepubllc. Like nearly all of the others 
he would be quite willing to sever hit 
connection with the navy now that 
the war Is over, but he failed to  see 
much prospect of an early  release, 
for current rum or In the east was that 
there would be need of one kind and 
another for nearly the full navy 
streogth for a considerable stretub, 
and that except where the clrccmstan- 
ces were unusual ooe could hardly 
look forward to an early release.

Miss Mllllcect Pascoe, who had 
speot the past several months In 
Rochester, N. Y., has returned to her 
home in Republic and is now teaching 
fn the local graded schools, having 
taken the position that Miss Gins- 
more resigned.

Leroy Geacb Id home oo an eight- 
day furlough from Great Lakes Naval 
Trafoiog Station, and expects to 
leave for H arvard College about the 
14th Inst to oomplete his training.

Charles Lyon, son of Mr, and Mrs. 
John Lyon, died lo IroDwood last 
Monday of influenza-pneumonia. De­
ceased was 21 years of age and was 
born and raised on a farm about 
three miles south of Republic. The 
family removed to Ironwood several 
years ago. The remains were brought 
to Republic and were given Interment 
Wednesday afternoon.

Miss Junetta HelnoDen, one of the 
teachers In the Republic high school, 
was called to  Negaunee Tuesday 
morning by the death of her mother, 
who bad passed away suddenly the

REPORT OP TUB CONDITION OF

T H E  K E P U B L I O  S T A T E  B A N K
At Republic, Michigan, at the close of business, Dee. 31,1918, 
as called (nr by the Commissioner of the Banking Department, 

KKUOUKOBS. „ . . „ ,
LOANB AND DISCOUNTS, viz: Commercial. Savinas.

Kecured by collateral................................................  117,598 00 I 9,888 W
Unsecured...............................................................  JM 88 99 22.9MM

Totals......................................................  I  44,281 99 f 82,372 47 • 76,084 48
BONDS. MORTGAGE* AND SECURITIES. viz:

Beal Estate M ortoaaea .................... ......................
Municipal Bondsm Ofllce.......
Municipal Bonds Pledged 
V. 8. Bonds and Cecil (Testes of Indebtedness )o Office
War Savings aud Thrift Bumps...............................
Other Bond#...........................................................

1,210 00 |  25,589 81
3.000 00 II,XU 00
8.000 00

4,950 rs 
04 28

2,500 00 10,180 00

RES
Totals..

KKVKtf, viz;
.* • 9,710 00 9 51,908 58 I 01,811 M

Bus from Banks In Reserve Cities............................
. B Bonds aud Cert, of Ind. carried as legal reserve 

0. 8. CertlOeaUeof Inebtednees carried as cash rese’ve
Currency ................................................................
Cold Colo...............
Silver (Join...............
Nickels sad Cents.......

»«## •»•*#•»#*#•#«

8,188 23

1,000 00 
1,902 00 

65 00 
792 IS 
110 13

6,000 00 
2.&00 00

6.600 00

169 00

Total*...........................
COMBINED ACCOUNT*, viz

Overdraft*..............................................................
Premium Acoooot....................... ................................ .
Sankiug H o u * s «#.«•*,
Fornlum and Fixtures......................... ....................
Du* from other Banks and Bankers.......................«...
Ot*b Items In Transit............, ..............
Outside Checks sod other Cash Items......

• It,90S SO 1 17,119 00 I 20,1*4 W 
..............  $ None

m w s a e s «

Total........................
LIABILITIES

ipltal stock SSSSSS
arplus fund.......
odlvtded profits, net 
ivldeods u n p a i d . ..........................

• • • i f  * e a s e s  s e e

s s s s s s  • • » * • * • * • # • • • * * *  i f s s s #  f s e s s l  i s s e f s s  s e e #  

•  o f f  # p t # e » e #  • • # * • * » • •  • • • •
ipald ••»,.. ..................................................................

rvedfor.Tazcs,Interest, etc.., n i  i v i  A K . m  l u w i o n ,  v n ,  . . . .

COMMKROIAL DEPOSIT*, viz: 
Commercial deposits subject to check.
Certified check*....................... .
Csablers' checks...............................
ToiUI isvlugs deposits......................

I177A0111
I 2SAO0 60 

MM 00 
MM 11 

760 OS 
MOO 00

•■••■*«•••§•••••*••
• 88,471 Uact 82

60
1,098 86

Tottli.............................. .............................- ........ • 87,871 69 I 87,111 69
BAVINOB DEPOSIT*, viz:

Book accounts-Subject to savings by-laws................................. 8 91,171 71
Certificates of deposit— Subject to mvlngs by-laws..................... 0.188 18

" (Xi *.............. .................Club Having* Deposits (Xmas. Thrift, etc.) 4th Liberty Loan 
paymeuli........................................................................ 6,223 00

Total........................................................................  1108,830 95 I108.6M 98

Totaf...............
STATE OP MICHIGAN.

•177,208 71

County of Marquette. ,
I. J. H Torntwrg, Cashier of the above named bank, do solemnly swear (hat (he shore 

statement Is true to the best of my knowledge and belief and correctly represents the true 
slate of the several matters therein contained, as shown by the book* of the imnk.

J. K. TOKNUEKG, Cashier.

Hubtcrltxd and sworn to before me 
this 9J> day «t Jan., l«l».

THOM A* CHENHALL.
Notary Public.

[My Commission expires Feb. tl, 1922]

Correct-Attest:
WALTER BRICHON, 
i H*B. HOOPER,
J. 0. UTBERG,

Directors.

evening previous. She will be Absent 
for the remainder of the week and 
Mrs. A. J . Hocking is fiJJlog the va­
cancy in the high school. As a mark 
of sympathy for Mies Heioonen, the 
Bepubllc teachers have arranged to 
buveooe of tbelr number, Miss Flood, 
go to Negaunee and represent them at 
tbe tuneral.

Mr. and Mrs. Louis Levine spent 
the fore p a ri of the week in Chicago, 
returning yesterday.

Mrs. Mary Thomas returned Mon­
day oiornlog from Ishpemiug, where 
she bad spent New Year’s with her 
bod, Joseph Thomas.

Emil Uuacson, a  son of Mr. and 
Mrs, Alfred IsaaoBon, has relumed 
to Republic, having received an hon­
orable discharge from the Navy.

Mr. and Mrs. Leslie Weinberg en­
tertained a number of young folks at 
their home last Saturday evening.

Miss Nola Sleberubal has returned 
to her position in the high school, 
after attending tbe funeral of her sis* 
ter-in-law, Mrs. Tale Slebentbal, In 
Crosby* Mino.

Feroely Goodney left Sunday morn­
ing for Marquette, where be i* to be 
employed.

Hugo firicson, who was assistant in 
the Republlo postoffice for so many 
years and who is now located in Mar­
quette, being employed in the offices 
of tbe P iqua Handle A  Manufactur­
ing Company, was in town Wednes­
day,

Once in a  while there comes a rumor 
about further changes in tra in  ser­
vice, and i t  is known that more or 
less correspondence is passing be­
tween the officials of the two roads 
on this subject, but it Is a pretty safe 
guess th a t the schedules will remain 
undisturbed until next spring, at least.

Republic was still without soy cases 
of influenza up to yesterday

"B illy "  Johnson, who recently 
spent a  furlough here, wears three 
stripes on his sleeve and otherwise 
gave evidet.ee that he was forging 
ahead a t the Great Lakes statioo. He 
has charge of a detail of 100 men.

The annual meeting of the stock­
holders of the Republic State Bank 
will be held on the 14th Inst.

The lessened freight traffic on tbe 
St. Paul system has made It possible 
to provide some of tbe “ big”  engines 
for the day passooger ruus between 
Milwaukee and Marquette. Tbe “ lit­
tle” engines are sturdy fellows but 
they a re  hardly equal to tbe handi­
caps whioh wtnier imposes upon rail­
roading in this section.

Uncle Sam Ready

The program  for sale of war sav­
ing stam ps io 1919, announced on Fri* 
day by tbe treasury, Is almost Iden­
tical with that followed th is year, as 
relating to cost of stamps in various 
months; In January  the stamps worth 
•6 face value will be sold for $4.12, 
and will Increase one cent a  month 
until next December. They will not 
mature until January  1, 1924, or ooe 
year la te r  than the stamps now on 
sale.

T hrift Stamps costing 25 cents each, 
will be sold throughout tbeyear.Tbey 
will be identical in design and size 
with tbe present Thrift Stamps, but 
will be blue instead of gresn, Tbe 
war savings stamps, also blue, are 
considerably smaller than tbe present 
issue.

New cards on whioh war savings 
stampB are to be attached will be is* 
sued and 1919 stampB should not be 
attached to old cards. If a  war sav­
ings cestlflcate has been only partially 
filled with this year’s war savings 
stamps, it  will be entirely valid and 
may be redeemed eventually at tbe 
m aturity value of tbe stamps it bears. 
Tbe new stamps will go on sale Jan . 1,

Indications are oow that the sale of 
war sayings stamps th is year will be 
about a  billion dollars, as 1390,090,- 
000 in sales have been reported to date, 
and belated reports after J&n. 1 are 
expected to swell ib is  considerably.

Germany's Humiliation

How the mighty have fallen. A na­
tion which has taugh t th a t her peo­
ple were supermen; that they were or­
dained of God to  rule; a  people whose 
rulers have boasted of tbfrpower and 
glory of their arm y are  now witness­
ing their soldiers coming home de­
feated. Bbe Is seeing tbe cities its 
soldiers have possessed occupied by 
tbe Allied armies, and above all they 
are suffering tbe greatest humiliation 
in the surrendering of tbe big por­
tion of her navy which is Germany’s 
pride. With her fleet thus destroyed 
never again can she expect to take 
her place among tbe nations of tbe 
world as a first class power. M ilitar­
ism has been the cause of her over­
throw and ruin. Germany must be 
boro again before she will again be- 
oomo a nation worthy of tbe respect 
and good will of tbe world. W hatso­
ever ati naon towetb, th a t shall It a 
so reap. Germany’s oup of humllla* 
tloo Is full, and she must drink ev­
ery drop. Her manufactured goods 
will not flod tbe ready sale they for­
merly eojoyad among tbe oatlom, 
where she now looks for her pros­
perity. Her toys for children will be 
a drug  on tbe market.

O ther natloni will do well to re­
member the lesion taught that right­
eousness exaltetb a nation sod that 
sin is a  reproach to any people. No 
oatton can permanency prosper 
which dishonors God aod fails to 
practice the teachings which have 
made the world what It Is today. The 
rise and fall of Germany will be a 
profitable study for tbe children of 
the next and succeeding generations.

Chambei Iain’s Cough Remeffv
Cures Cold*. Croup and WwSopioj Cough.9

An Essay on Editors

A country school boy was told to 
write an essay on editors, says an ex 
change and this is tbe result:

Don’t know bow newspapers came 
to be in the world. I don’t think the 
good Lord doeB, for he ain’t got noth­
ing to say about an editor in tbe Bible. 
1 think the editor is ooe of the miss­
ing links you read about and stayed 
lo the bushes until after the flood and 
then came out aod wrote tbe thing up 
aod baa been here ever since. I don’t 
thtnk he ever died. I never saw a 
dead one and never heard of one get­
ting licked. If a doctor makes a mis­
take be buries it and people dassent 
say noihiog. When the editor makes 
a mistake there is big swearing aod a  
big fuss, but If the doctor makes a 
mistake there is a funeral, cut flowers 
and perfect silence. A doctor can use 
a word a yard long without aoybody 
knowing what it Is, but If an editor 
uses one be has to spell It. If a doc­
tor goes to see another man's wife he 
charges for it, but if the editor goes 
be gets a charge of buckshot. Any old 
college can make a doctor but an edi­
tor bus to be born.

The Railway Clerks

The Brotherhood of Railway Clerks, 
which includes freight handlers and 
station employes, early lo the year o r ­
ganized a lodge at Marquette, Micb., 
which Is known as Marquette lodge, 
No. 187, Already a  large membership 
has been secured with new names com­
ing steadily in and many more In 
prospect. The lodge recently deoided 
to rent a hall In Marquette where 
regular meetings will be held twice 
each month. Tbe territory covered by 
this lodge embraces the entire D. S. 
8. A A. railroad system as well as the 
Mineral Range railroad and L. S. A. 
I. U. R. Members are enrolled from 
along tbe Hoe, and in several places 
employes are 100 per coat enrolled. It 
is estimated tha t in tbe country there  
are at least 500,000 men eligible to 
membership io ibis order, and it is 
understood th a t an energetic cam 
paign will be carried on in the effor 
to get tbe m ajority of them to become 
members. The Marquette lodge is io 
a prosperous condition, having a 
comfortable cash balance on band. 
Officers aod directors for the coming 
year were recently appointed in 
which every department of railway 
work affiliated with this organization 
is ably represented.

—A woman can have a grouch on 
aod get away with it by saying she 
Isn’t feeling a bit well, but if a man 
has one it’s attributed to dissipation.

—One most beautiful thing about 
winter 1q the absence of activities on 
tbe part of the neighbor’s lawn mower 
in the early morclog hours. Snow 
‘plows do not make so much noise.

—“Let’s finish the job” will be tbe 
slogan for tbe fifth Liberty Loan. Tbe 
decision was reached at the national 
meeting of publicity and sales direc­
tors who will aid In tbe next war loan 
oampaign.

—We tried manfully not to see that 
couple the other night, but our 
eyes just refused to be diverted from 
tbe spot. Still you know, we couldn’t 
help it—and, perhaps, we won’t  say 
any more about it. No, don’t ask ui; 
I t ’s too good to repeat.

—After cleaning with gasolene.— 
Put about one-tbird part of vinegar 
in the water with which you dampen 
the cloth when pressing an article 
cleaned with gasolene. This will re­
move the scent of the gasolene aod 
will prevent circles forming.

—Ratification of the prohibition 
amendment to the federal constitution 
by tbe necessary three fourths of tbe 
states by next February first is pre­
dicted In a survey of the situation 
made by the temperance board of the 
Methodist Episcopal church. Fifteen 
states have already approved and tho 
report declares thirty other states 
will vote favorably next month. The 
board Includes Mlohigan and Wis­
consin among the states which It says 
will ratify.

—In a small village in Ireland the 
mother of a  soldier met tbe village 
priest, who asked her if she bad bed 
bad news. “ Sure, I have," she said, 
“ P i th a s  been killed.” “Oh, I am 
t t r y  »orry.n •  aid tbe priest, “ Did 
you receive word from tbe war of- 
floeV" “ N o." she said, “ I received 
word from himself. ” The priest look­
ed perplexed, and said: “ But how ls 
that?"  “S u re ,"  she said, “ here Is 
tbe letter, read it for yourself. ’’ The 
letter said: “ Dear Mother, 1 am now 
In the Holy L and ,"

—Delta county trappers had a  pro­
fitable year, aooordiog to figures com­
plied by County Clerk Albert J .  Pepin, 
whioh shows that 12,091 was paid out 
In bounties on 7,712 anim als and 
birds. The liet Includes 40 wolves, 
20 wildcat aod lynx, 95 foxes and 
1,377 weasels. Tbe bounty on wolves 
is $36 a  head and $5 for a wildcat. 
While the present bounty Is agreed 
to be fair, yet there is an agitation 
on foot to have tbo bounty increased 
on the majority of uil these destruc­
tive animal*. The mutter has been 
brought to tbe attention of upper 
peninsula’s legislators and It Is likely 
that soms actloo will betaken during 
tbe preseot session.

—Tbe Rev. Irl R. Hicks Almanac 
for 1919 Is now ready, finer, better 
than ever. A beautiful, valuable 
weather book with weather forecasts 
for every day of 1919, written by lrl 
R. Hicks, J r., and Rev. J . B. Noyes, 
be same as last year. 35 cents by 

mail, 30 cents on news stands. Our 
monthly magazine, Word and W orks, 
one year with one Almanac, $1. The 
Hicks Almanac and Publishing Co., 
3401 Praokiln Ave,, St. Louis, Mo. tf

NO- 0666
REPORT OF THE CONDITION OP

The Nejaunee National Bank
at Negaunee. in the Stale of Michigan. ai the 

close of business, Dec. 81, 1918.
UKHOUKCK8.

Loans and Discounts... 1338,2*6 41
U. S. Uondt deposited u> 

secure circulation (par
value)......................  100.009 00

U.H. Bonds and certifi­
cates of Indebtedness 
(lodged to secure U. 
ri. l>ep<iiilts (parvaiue) 

U. H, B inds and ceriilt- 
cates of indebtedness 
pledged to secure
Ctil savins* Uepos-

U- B. bonds A certified* 
of indebtedness pledg­
ed as collateral fur 
5Ule or otberdepoilis
or bills payable........

Liberty Loan Bonds, 
8tf. 4 A *1% unpledged 

Bonds other than U. S. 
bonds pledged to se­
cure Postal Havings
deposits...................

Hecnrmes other th*u 
U.H. hond* mot includ­
ing stocks) owned un­
pledged ...................

Stock o( Federal Re­
serve Bank (400 of
subscription)............

Value of baokiojt house 
Furniture aud fixtures. 
Lawful reserve with 

Federal Reserve Itaok 
Cosh in vault and net 

amouuU due from
national banka.........

Net amounts due from 
hanks, baukers and
trust companies........

Checks ou other banks 
In the same city or 
towo as repovtlnx
bank.................... .

Total of Items............
Checks on banks locat­

ed outside of city or 
towuasreportt’gbank 
and other cash items 

Redemption fund with 
U. H. treasurer and 
due from U. H.Trcas’r 

Interest earned but not 
collected -approxlin'e 
-on Notes £  Bills Re 
celvable not past due 

War Having* Cfertlfl’tes 
and I lirtftMumps act­
ually owned....... .

5,COO 00

2.000 00

89.000 OO 196,000 OO

9,700 OO

25.000 00

149,170 00 174,170 00

8.750 00 
40,0110 0U 
5.0UOOO

22,984 96 

47,455 91

7,224 06

1,474 20
56,154 22

1,145 41 

5,000 00

4,745 49 

247 67

Total.........
l.iAUfL 

Capital stock paid in...
Htirplu* fund...............
Undivided profit*........
lot. & disc, collected or 

credited lo advance 
of maturity and not 
earned (approximate) 

Amount reserved for 
all Interest accrued... 

Circulating Note* out­
standing ..................

Net amount* due to
National bank*........

Net amounts due to 
basks, banker# aod
trust companies........

Total of Item*............
Individual Depontssub-

Ject to check............
Certificates of deposit 

due In less than aOdays 
(other than (or mouey 
borrowed)................

Certified checks...........
Cashier's Check* out­

standing .................
Dividends unpaid........
Total demand deposits 

(other than bank de­
posits) subject to Re­
serve.......................

Postal Having* Deposits 
(Hlier time deposits.... 
Total of lime deposit* 

subject to Reserve.... 
Other United Htatcs De­

posit*, Including de­
posit* of U. S. disburs­
ing officers..............

Bill* payable, with Fed­
eral Reserve Bank...

1852,186 19 
BB.

81C0.0U0 00
25.000 00 
8.078 91

2,306 51 

19,798 81

100.000 00 

0,076 61

5 41
5,060 92

152.539 89

IS,*7! 80 
119 90

944 fit 
5,011 00

172,187 31
12,941 88 

317,749 84

880,693 78

5,000 00 5,000 DO

R9.000 CO

Total.........  1842,130 19
State of Michigan, County of Marquette, ss.

I, II. C. Wagner, Cashier of the above-named 
bank, do solemnly swear that the above state­
ment Is true to the best of my knowledge and 
belief, U, c. WAOSEH, Cashier.
Correct-Attest:

PHILIP LEVINE, |
U. MK1M.KUR. > Director* 
JOHN Y. MILLER, S

RtibscrJbed and sworn to before me this 9th 
day of Jan., 1919.

Thkoi'Ohk A. Tjiourn, Notary Public.
[My commission expires Oct. 21,1021.j

Jan. 3—24
P roba te  Aotice,

HTATK OF MlCUIOAN,
The Probate Court for the County of Marquedo

In the matter of the Estate of Charles Tuoml, 
Deceased.

Notice I* hereby given that four months from 
the 30th day ot December A. D BUS. have been 
allowed for creditors to present their claims 
against said deceased to said court for examin­
ation and adjustment, and that all creditor* of 
said <1eoe*Keil ate required to present tbelr 
claims to said court, at tho probate office, in the 
City of Marquette In said county, on or before 
the 30th day of April A. I). 1919, and that 
said claims will l>e heard by said court on Wed­
nesday the Doth day of April A. D. 1919, at two 
o'clock In the afternoon.

Dated Marquette, Mich.. Dec. ;jl>, A. l> 19JH.
(8eal» W. T. POTTER.

A true copy. Judge of probate*

Dec. ZQ-Jaa. 10 
PROBATE NOTICE

STATE OF MIOHIUAN,
The Probate Court for the County of Marque're 

At a sensionof said Court, held at the Probate 
(Mllee In (be City of Marquette In said County, 
on tlm )ath day of December, A. D. I'Jis. 

present: Hon W,T. Potter. Judge of Probate 
lu the Matter of the Estate of William 

PcngiHse, Deceased.
Wtlllnm II. Mitchell, executor ol *nld estate, 

having filed In said court bis petliton praying 
for licvnim to sell the Interest of said estate ill 
certain real cniato therein deamheil, tor the 
purpose of distributing tho proceed* ot such 
saioamong the persons entitled Hu n t**.

It I* Ordered, Thai the I3ib day ot J annul y 
A. I). 1919, at t'-vo o’clock In the afternoon, at 
aald probate office, he and is hereby appolulcd 
for hearing *atd petition, and that all persons 
thtercNted hi said estate appear hefme said 
court, at siitd time and place, to *how cause 
why a license lo sell the interest of said estate 
hi nhUI real estate should not be granted;

It >* Further Ordered, That public notice 
thereof be given by publication of a copy of this 
order, for three successive weeks previous to 
said day of hearing, In ihe Nkoai'NKK (no* 
11 K i t  Ai.n a newspaper printed ami circulated in 
said ooumy.

Seal WT. POTTER,
A true copy. Judge of Probate.

Ella M. Tincknkli,, Keglver of Probate

There is a limit to which ibe oyes 
can be abused aod atlU retain their 
efficiency.

Continuous reading by artificial 
light causes much eyesight trouble. 
This, of course, cat) be offset by pro­
perly flttcd glasses.

Why neglect your eyes, when you 
have bo easy access to the services ot 
an eyesight specialist?

We grind lens. Bring us the pieces 
of your brokeD lens and we will make 
you a now ooe in one hour.

Everything In the optical line.
M. H. KLDUEtJ, Opt. D, 

Office: Wooiworth’s 5 AlOCent Store, 
lshpemlug, Mich. 11-tf.

W. H. MITCHELL
Buocesior to Jno. Q, Adams A Sou.

F I R E
I N S U R A N C E

OFFICE AT CITY HALL

Negaunee* - Michigan

First National 
Insurance Agency

INSM6F
LIFE

FIRE
ACCIDENT 

PLATE GLASS
AUTOMOBILE

BONDS

ANNUAL MEETING
Tbo Annual meeting of the stockholder* of the 

First National Bank of Negaumo*. Michigan, 
forth* election of director* and for the trail*- 
action of such other b-'itnes* a* may pr'qmrly 
come before the meeting, will be held at Ihe 
office of said hank In the City of Negahiiec, 
Michigan, on Tuesday, January 11th, 1919, from 
10 a. m. lo 4 p m.

1415 T. C. YATRM, Odjlur.
Dated, Negaunee, Mich., Dec. lbtli, 1918.

Jan. 10-31
, PROBATE NOTICE.

STATE OK MICIII'IAN,
-.e Probate Court fortbi'LVniofv ot Marnnottu 
In the Matter of the Estate of Lena KhIuh, 

DeieiiHod.
Notice i* hereby given that four mouth* from 

the (fill day of January, A. I) 1019. have been 
allowed for ewltlmn U> present their rhdius 
aUHtmd Halil deceaned to *ald court for examin­
ation and adjustment, and thal all creditor* of 
said dnroHHcri are required to preneut their 
claim* io hhuI court, at ilm prohutaoffice. In the 
City of Marquette In said coimly, o» or before 
the 7th day of May A- D. 1019, and that 
said claim* will he heard bv *nld court on 
Wednesday the Till day of May A. if. Wilt, at 
two o’clock In the afternoon.

Dated, Marquette, Mich., Jan. iwh, a . D, 1010, 
(SealI W. T POTTER,

A true copy. Judge of Probats

STATE 
The Fro

Jan, 10-Jan, 81
PROBATE NOTICE

......OF MIOJIJOAN.
e Probate Court for the County of Marquette 

in the Matter of the Betaleof Kdwtn Neal 
Oory, Deoeaied.

Notice is hereby given,that four monilis from 
the Mh day of January, A. D 19)9. have been 
allowed for creditors to presetil their claims 
against sold deceased to suld court for examin­
ation and adjustment, and that ati creditors of 
said deceased are required to present tbelr 
lalms to said court, at the probate office. In tbe 
Ity of Marquette In said county, fits or before 

the 9th day of May, A. D. 1019. aod that said 
claims will be heard by said court oo Friday, 
he 9th day of May, A. L>. 1919, at two o’clock 
Jo the afternoon.

Dated, Marquette, Mich., Jan. 8. A. D. 1919.
(seal) w. t . Gutter .
A true copy. Judge of Probate

Cl
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ggA Shine fn 
Cvery D ro p "

Oot m can today Irons 
your hordwaro or gro* 
oory dealer.

J. E. O’DONOGHUE,
AQBNT

N k g a u n k k , M i c h i g a n .

SA N IT A T IO N
Your clothes taunt no t only 

look c le a n - th e y  m ust be clean 
through and  through.

Germs lu rk  in dean -ap p ear­
ing clothes, more often th an  
you perhaps imagine.

Realizing th is , it h as been 
ou r one aim  and endeavor to  
m ake th is Laundry a  san ita ry  
Laundry  in all th a t  the  w ord 
implies. Articles a re  carefully 
sorted  o u t and  properly graded 
so th a t  no dainties a rc  mixed 
in w ith th e  heuties. Every 
precaution is taken to  n o t only 
w ash carefully but thoroughly . 
And our sa n ita ry  m ethods and 
equipm ent insure th is  in the 
highest degree.

Needham Bros.

laundry cleTa“ rs
Ptsii: 24-J l if im i  27 likpsalii
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WIRELESS GETS RID OF “STATIC”
An Invention which has taken the 

“static” out of wireless telegraphy. re­
moving thereby the grcuieat obstacle 
to  Die dour transmission of radio 
messages, hiiH boon perfected by Uoy 
A. Wengaut, chief engineer of Die 
Marconi Wireless Telegraph Company 
of America. Tin* invention not only 
mokes possible the sending of olonr 
radio messages regardless of atmos­
pheric conditions, but eliminates “In­
terference," tboroby making possible 
the opernUon of Innmneruble radio 
stations without “crossing" messages,

'flu* Invention also does uwuy with 
tie* necessity of constructing Inigo 
wireless towers. Perfect service nm  
bo obtained with tho u»e of antennae 
extending only n few feet from th«» 
ground.

The invention Ir sold lo murk 11 
new era in world comnmnlenDon and 
to be necond In iniportnnee in the flop] 
of radio telegraphy only to Mureonl’K
Invention. Mr. Weagant, who 1* only thlrlyaeven. has been working on the 
problem of static for 15 yeurH uml took out patent papers on bln invention 
shortly before the United States entered the war. The government kept tho 
Invention secret, disclosing It only to the allied nations. It is thought best to 
withhold nil Information concerning It until the uetual signing of a  peace 
treaty.

L FRAULEIN BAUMER’S DIARY
Entries from the diary of Fruultda 

Oerlrud Bnumer of Berlin during tho 
month of October nre of interest to 

wrlcnns. In them President Wilson 
Is n*ferred to ns an “arrogant school­
master" and tin* rage of the Uorrauu 
people at being forced to neeept the 
terms communicated to them by this 
government Is freely and bitterly ex­
pressed.

Five weeks Inter Kratileln Baumer, 
with Alice Salomon, signed the appeal 
addressed to Mrs. Woodrow Wilson on 
behalf of the national council of worn* 
on of Germany in the hope of obtain­
ing u mollification of the armistice 
terms. Kxtrucls follow:

“Tuesday, Oct. 8.—We ore to ‘re­
pent/ In ho far as there Is need of 
repentance about the mad battle of de­
struction of these four years, let the 
whole world repent of It before the 
God to whom it feels itself responsible. 
We can repent only In this great 

common sense—assuredly not before other men as our ‘betters/
“Wednesday. Oct. 0.—Wilson's answer came out tills afternoon. Doubt­

less wo expected It thus. Yet It hits us now like a stunning and blinding 
blow.

“Tuesday, Oct. 15.—The evening papers contain Wilson's answer. As 
one follows this schoolmaster's arrogance one feels that this tone and these 
suggestions must whip up to the last determiuatlon every instinct of pride 
and self-respect In the German people.

TALKING WITH THE BIRDMEN
Col. Clarence 0. Culver of Wash­

ington is given chief credit by the war 
department for the development of tin* 
new wireless telephone which cnubled 
allied airmen to give information and 
receive Instructions from the ground 
while Hying a t considerable distances 
from their bases. A headpiece like 
that worn by nil telephone operators 

‘Ik worn beneiith the airman's helmet. A 
movable speaking tube Is constantly 
near his mouth. Wires from these 
pieces connect with a battery which 
gets i u  power from tho alrplum* 
motor.

“It was In August, MHO, that I first 
became Interested In the possibility of 
sending messages from nlrplunes/'
Colonel Culver said, “and cmntneuccd 
ii series of experiments which were so 
far successful that In August, 11)10, I 
was enabled to send a radio telegraph 
message from u plane over Chats- 
worth, Cal., to San Diego, a distance 
of 10 miles. In February, 1017, after we had enlisted I lit* assistance of Gift 
foremost American telephone companies und their expert acoustical men, we 
succeeded in transmitting vonil messages from u plane to tin* ground. In 
October, 10)7, I took the llrst sets to Franco and made demonstrations there. 
By August -HO complete sets had been sent to our forecs in Franco.''

Colonel Culver says itohmly Invented anything new In applying the radio 
telephone to military airplanes. What was done was the adaptation und 
adjustment of previously discovered laws to u new field.

f  CAPTAIN MOFFETT OF GREAT LAKES ]
('apt. William A. Mofi'cit, com­

mandant ut Great Fakes Naval T rain­
ing NiaUoii, Ims boon assigned lo the 
command of the new Mtpordroud- 
intuglil Mississippi, said to he the fin­
est hatlleshlp In the United .States 
navy. Alter tin* necessary six months 
of sen service In* will he made a rear 
admiral.

Captain Moffett enmo to Grout 
Lukes as commandant four years ago. 
From a small naval training station 
with u maximum capacity of 2.0<H) 
men the station became the greatest 
naval training station in the world. On 
the day Unit Captain Moil'dt goes to 
sea be will leave behind him u indu ­
ing camp fitted to accommodate 75.- 
uou men,

Ills work In transforming Into ef­
ficient sailors the recruits who came 
to him from the farms and cities of 
the middle West made Captain MnfTdt 
one of the prominent American figures 

Vn th,» war. The capacity of the Malian was not only Increased from 2.000 to 
. 7.\t.00 under Id* administration, hut la* sent Into netIvc sorvleo 1)1,000 trained 
UiglitM i. men of tin' sea.

< |!:.ln  MoJTc!| has been more than commandant. He bus been a guide 
. und Oiend. No blim Jaekot, however obscure, hut tins sensed the Influence of 
] klnlnos und temper de Judgment; and no fatally whom* son has gone Into 
v-wi viec hut has t- l l  Me security of doau surroundings for lta boy.

Something New Under the Sun: Woman Gun-Fighter
L OS ^.-.G ELKS.—Tho last of the Jones-Lewls bandit gang has boon wiped 

out In tho suburb of Arcadia. Their murderous performances mutch those 
of tin* hundits who terrorized the western country after the Civil war. Iu one 
amazing feature, however, this gang 
outdid the old-tlmp hnndlts—a woman 
gun-lighter, twenty years old, who 
fought beside her hushund to the 
death. Dale Junes, her hnxhnnd, was 
hut twenty-one. IP* begun Ills crim­
inal career In lfil I at Los Angeles hy 
stealing nn automobile, Ills m urder­
ous depredations have ranged from 
the Pacific coast to Indhinu. He was 
a leader, If md (he head, of u gang 
which killed without hesitation. Cer­
tainly he ami his wife were the gun­
men of the gang. Tim killing of Chief of Detectives John W. Rowan a t Colo­
rado Springs In broad daylight September II. and tho wounding of an a» 
slstant, is attributed to Jones und his wife, while there Is no doubt that Jooei 
shot Ids way through u cordon of police and soldiers In Kansas City Septem­
ber 2fi, the only one of three bundlts to escape.

Deputy Sheriffs Van Vllet and Anderson found Jones and his wife and 
their automobile ut night la front of a supply station. “Throw up you* 
hands l” they shouted, covering the pair with sawed-off shotguns.

Jones, appearing to comply, drew an automatic pistol from a special 
pocket and mortally wounded Van VUet with his first shot. His second missed 
Anderson, who sprung Into the Nliudows, Junes crouched behind the machine 
imd began firing. Ills wife got Into the cur, emptied her revolver and took 
up a rllle.

Thereupon Anderson, who had bulked at killing a woman, sent one of his 
two loads of buckshot Into her body, which crumpled up over the steering 
wheel.

Jones, seeing his wife dead, left cover and headed for Anderson, firing 
as he went. The deputy gave him the oilier charge of buckshot In the head.

“Isn’t That Funny?” Says Louis. It Surely Is
G RAND RAPIDS, MICH.—Louis Latega. 331) Bridge street. Is home again 

after quite an Interesting experience In Chicago. Louis was walking down 
titjitc street In the Windy City looking In windows waiting for train time und

marveling In his own mind how feath ­
ers and furs can cost so much. Pretty  
soon he saw a man lcAdlng a crying 
man up the hi reel.

“Ills brother is very rich," said tbs 
/  man leading the weeping man.
^  * “For that should he cry?”

“1114 brother Is dying and he him­
self will soon be very rich," suld the 
stranger.

“And ho cries?” asked Louis. 
“Sure, ho cries/' said the stranger. 

“He Is crying bccuusc while he has so 
much money he bus got no money a t all. He tins bis brother’s money, thou­
sands of dollars of it, hut he can't spend a cent of It. He can’t even poy for a 
doctor for himself, und he Is *l#k. Now, if he could borrow some money for 
n few days ho could give his brother's money for security."

“I’ve got a little money," said Louis.
“He will give you $3 for each $1 you will loan him," sold the man who 

GmJ Dip weeper. The weeper efioked his sobs and nodded assen t
“How much have you got?" asked the stranger.
“I've got $1,100, but it Is Id a bank In Grand Rapids,” said Louis.
“Go and get It. Cet It nil!"
Louis enme to Grand Rapids and got it oil. He took It to Chicago, and 

(hey met him nt the train, the stranger and the sobbing man. The sobbing 
mun felt better. Louis was coming to his help.

“I don’t seo how* In the world they did It, but they did,” says Louis. “They 
took my money and their money, thousands of dollars of l t t  They counted It 
nil out right In front of my nose. They nailed It alt up In a box and gave mo 
tho box. When I opened the box there wasn't anything In i t  but paper.

“I su w 'em put the money In and I  saw 'em nail up the box. Isn 't that 
funny?"

Everybody agrees with Louis.

“How Comes It Such Little Legs and Big Body?"
C HICAGO.—“H-ra-m-ml" exclaimed Policeman Emil Harder, or words to 

that effect. “How comes It such little legs have such a big body?" Then 
Policeman Murder squinted again. It was an odd sight. Here was a wee bit 
of a fellow w hose body wus round, like 
ii ball, and the frout protruded iu u 
most extraordinary manner.

Behind the first came another lit­
tle hoy with u large sack on Ids hack.
Ho looked like Atlus holtliug up the 
world or ii Prussian soldier going home 
with his loot. The kids were moving 
away from the Clark street bridge us 
last ns they could stagger and weave 
along under their loads.

Policeman Harder took his catch 
to the centI'nl station. When little Leo 
lloiiz, eight years old, 1137 North Branch street, caught sight of the red- 
headed sergeant he forgot to hold onto Ids burdened stomach and through 
some opening In his clothes out fiew u pigeon, I t lluttcrod about the police 
Million Mid alighted.

Leo never bulled an eye. He deigned not to see tho bird. Then out flow 
unotlier pigeon,

Leo did not smile. F  • stood solemn and dignified. I’lgeun aftor pigeon 
made lls cxll from his gurmeiilH. The rappers begun to snicker. Loo's eight* 
year-old dignity persisted.

With curb bird’s flight Ids clremnfercnco grow less—It diminished ns a  
rubber balloon might slowly go down.

When the collapse wus complete the police turned to CnsUnlr f;‘""nlka, 
ten years old, JOH) West Chicago avenue, who carried tho sack.

“Wind's In there?" demanded the red-lieadod sergeunt.
“Chickens," said Caslmlr.
“Where did you kids get all these birds" he asked.
“Me an* my brother and Caslmlr and iwo other hoys I don't know got 'em 

oft’ of a truck standing on the Chirk slvoet bridge," sold little Loo, now 
reduced hy a couple of dozen pigeons.

Are Women of Denver Entitled to an Apology?
D ENVER.—Arise, you Hons of Ananias, and salute your kingl Go yet forth, 

yon viilfiers of womankind, uml hog pardon of your fa ir sisters, for Don- 
ver 'girls Insist (hey are not bow-legged. When Dame Fashion and Madams

Conservation decreed shorter skirts 
fastidious men immediately began to 
spread the charge that the underpin­
nings of most girls were marked hy 
a slight curvature. Now, 'tls said, nine 
nut of ten appear to possess knees 
which stand a t least several iuclics 
apart.

Tho libel Is declared, even hy wom­
en, not to ho ultogcthur groundless, 
Inasmuch as a great many young 
women do appear to belong to the 
bnndy-llmbod class. They blame (Ids 

upon three things: First, the kind of shoes they wear; second, the faulty 
adjustment of the stockings, und. third, enrsota that don’t fit.

Dm* of tin* chief requisites of ft chic woman Is perfect fitting footgear. 
Amt, experts say, whenever u woman has on shoes run over n t tho heels she 
gives tho imprcNHlou of being howlcggcd.

So afte r them* explanations tho spokeswomen for th« D eorer girls guy 
they are not bow-legged and that the charge Ik rank libel

HAVCKWjyW., 
LlflflCP « • 
-WAVt*ft

View of Aleppo.

W
HEN General Allenhy's Brit­
ish troops entered Aleppo, 
another change was added 
to the long list of changes 

IttaV have come to the am lenl liittltc  
city whose existence first was noted In 
Assyrian, Babylonian und Egyptian 
records under the name of Khulep.

Aleppo, or Klmlep, was handled hack 
and forth with the swaying fortunes of 
those times, until It fell before the 
world-conquering Alexander and his 
Macedonian hosts. Then Is when we 
began to hear of It In authentic his­
tory. says a writer In the Kansas City 
•Stur. ScIcucum Nleutor, was one of 
the generals who aided Philip, the* fa­
ther of Alexander, In establishing the 
Macedonian kingdom. He went with 
Alexander into Asia In .13.1 B. C. In 
321, when he was twenty-live yours old, 
he was given the government of the 
Huhylonhm satrapy, which Included 
Kluilep. He gave (he city the mime ol 
Boroeu, and as JJeroea or Khulep-Bo- 
roea, It figures historically most of the 
time for the next 1)00 years,

In 048 A. I), (t disappeared from 
European records under I lie Hurucon 
flood that swept up from the south­
east. When the wild tribes begun to 
assume u sort of nettled state under 
Moslem Influence, It reappeared as 
Hnlep. the gathering plucc of the great 
caravan* passing from Asia Minor and 
Syria to Mesopotamia, Bagdad uod the 
Persian und Iudlau kingdoms. 

Earthquake and Plague.
In common with most of the towns 

of northern Syria, Aleppo suffered fre­
quently from earthquakes. After a ter­
rible shock lute Iu the twelfth century 
It had to he almost entirely rebuilt. 
But neither earthquake nor the plague, 
to which It wus also peculiarly subject, 
could divert from it trade und pros­
perity, und it became one of the com­
mercial cupltuls of the eastern world.

The city pussed under various Mos­
lem dyuusUes, being a t one time the 
northern cupltal of the famous Huludln. 
Tho Tartars held it  awhile in the thir­
teenth century. Then the Muinelukes 
cuuie up from Egypt and took it, hold­
ing it under their terrible sway until 
Its final conquest by tho Ottoiuuus In 
1517.

Under the strong hand of its new 
rulers, the trade of Aleppo was re­
vived. The English hud recognlzud its 
Importance us a  commercial station 
und It became the eustern outpost of 
the British Turkey compuny us curly 
as the time of Elizabeth. I t  wus con­
nected wltli the western outpost of 
the East imllu company ut Bagdad by 
a private caravan service. Us mime 
was fumlllai' lu the England of that 
period. Mliiikcspeurc refers lo it sev­
eral times lu hls plays uml It appears 
frequently lu the writings of Ills con­
temporaries.

Through Aleppo passed the silks of 
Bumbycc (homhuzlncs), the light tex­
tiles of Mosul (ihOMUllnes-nmsIlns) and 
niuny other commodities for the 
wealthy ami luxurious, Tlu* discovery 
of (he route urouul the Gape of Good 
Hope to Irnllu way the first blow lo 
this trade. The second was Up* open­
ing of a land route through Egypt to 
Die Red sea und the Dilrd and l:mi) 
one wus the .consfruetion of llic Hue* 
eunat.

Long before (he Hue# “anal hemm* 
a reality, however, Aleppo hud beau 
declining from Internal causes. In Dm 
latter part of the eighteenth century 
and (lie first yeurs of the nineteenth .> 
was constantly tin* seem* of bloody dis­
sensions between rival religious and 
secular parties, lu which Dm Ottoman 
government took part, first on one side 
(hen the other, plundering both. Two 
earthquakes and three visitations of 
cholera between 1N22 und J812 left 
Dm place u wreck with only half Its 
Yoitacr population. Tumults and mas­
sacres of ('hrlMluns oceanrd in 1850 
uml la 18152, accompanied by great de- 
struetlon of property. Its trade has 
revived greatly in recent years, hut 
has been largely of a local nature, 

Modern City on Ancient Site,
The modern city stands on virtually 

the ancient site. The older sections 
nre partly within a wall built hy the 
Hm’UccUH. A medieval castle on the 
site of the ancient eltudel Is deserted 
and In ruins. It stands on a mound, 
partly urtlflehd and faced with stone. 
The population of (lo* city, about 1JXV• 
000, Is three-quarters Moslem. The 
European residents, the Armenians

and other native Christians and the 
Jews all occupy separate sections of 
the city. The exports nve mainly tex­
tiles, leather ami nuts. The nearest 
senporl Is Alcxnmlrctta, 70 miles nwny 
on (lie Mediterranean (oust.

A city so old ami held hy so many 
peoples, with their various religions 
may he expected to have Its share of 
legends und holy places. Aleppo l* 
rather disappointing In that respect. 
There are few shrines of any sort and 
all of nay consequence are Mohamme­
dan. One of the mosques, of which 
there are many, contains u tomb re­
puted to he that of Zucharios, futher 
of John the Baptist.

The Turks huvo tong regarded Alejv 
po us one of the strongholds of their 
faith und the probable capital of their 
dominion should they be forced out of 
Europe.

Ostrich Eggs 
in Liquid Form

The report of the British Imperial 
Institute on a consignment of ostrich 
eggs In liquid form gives the following 
analytical da ta : Water, 75.1 per cent; 
protclu, 10.7 per cent; fut, 11.4 per 
cent, and ash, 1.4 per cen t Chinese 
liquid eggs contain: Water, 70.7 per 
cent; protein, 12.7 per coat; fat, 12.7 
per cent, and ash, 1.7 per cent. If tho 
above flgut cH are calculated on a uni* 
form basis of 75 per cent of wuter, the 
composition works out the same In the 
two cases, and it Is also seen that 
liquid ostrich eggs contain lest pro­
tein and more fut than average hens' 
“Kgs. though ruther less of these lu* 
gradient* than ducks' eggs. The re* 
port adds that the strong odor of 
liquid ostrich eggs may prevent their 
use for edible purposes, but thut they 
might be useful for technical pur­
poses In the forms of egg albumen 
and of preserved egg* yolk In the 
leather industry. —* South African 
Jouruul.

Wooden Plpoe for Water.
In these days of iron and cement tt  

mukes one sit up to read the report 
from the New Knglund waterworks on 
wood pipe for water supply. They 
claim It Is preserved and not rusted 
or corroded hy water; it Is not cor­
roded by any substance or destroyed 
hy welds or sa lts; Its carrying capaci­
ty Is 20 per cent greuler thun enstlrou 
pipe mid remain* constant, while thnt 
of metal pipe decreases with age; It 
does not taint or nfTccf fluids going 
through It; It does not hurst If frozen, 
the cliiNllelly of Die wood preventing 
It; It requires less labor and »*perl- 
cncc to lay In place than metal pipe; 
It can, when service pipes are not 
taken oir, he laid In shallower ditches 
than metal pipe, for tt  Is not. euslly 
affected hy frost; while more or less 
Joints show slight leakage when the 
pipe In first filled, they soon swell up 
and give less trouble In the end Dam 
castlron pipe,—Los Angeles Times.

Oldtime Border Controversy,
Then* was once a border dispute he- 

twern the states of Michigan and Ohio, 
hut It was peaceably settled and hud 
no serious results, In 1835 a contro­
versy arose In regard to tho boundary 
line between the states nnd the right 
to a strip of land to which both laid 
claim, A convention laid  nt Detroit 
that year framed a constitution hy 
which Michigan claimed the tract. For 
uwhjle there was danger of bloodshed, 
lull It “blew over." Iu June, 181(1, con-’ 
gress passed an act admitting Michi­
gan into the Union er. cordllfon that 
she relinquish her claim to (he dis­
puted tract, In consideration of which 
another tract, known as “the Upper 
I'enlnsuln," nv»h given her. These con­
ditions were rejected by one conven­
tion. hut accepted hy another laid  In 
l.HId. and la .lanunry, 1817, Mlehlgun 
wus admitted Into the Union,

A Chetrful Guy.
Grump--] have absolutely nothing to 

bo thankful for.
Gay—You can bo thankful you’re not 

deud, can't you?
Grump—wim tt And mo carrying t  

big life Immriincftt
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The Fanner Receives More Than Five 
Thousand Dollars a Minute From 

Swift & Company
This amount is paid to the farmer for live 

stock, by Swift & Company alone, during the 
trading hours of every business day.

All this money is paid to the farmer through 
the open market in competition with large and 
small packers, shippers, speculators and dealers.

The farmer, feeder, or shipper receives 
every cent o f this money ($300,000 an hour, 
nearly $2,000,000 a  day, $11,500,000 a  week) in 
cash, on the spot, as soon as the stock he has 
just sold is weighed up.

Some of the money paid to the farm er dur­
ing a  single day comes back to the company in 
a  month from sale of products; much does not 
come back for sixty or ninety days or more. 
But the next day Swift & Company, to meet the 
demands made by its customers, must pay out 
another $2,000,000 or so, and a t the present high 
price levels keeps over $250,000,000 continuously 
tied up in goods on the way to  m arket and in 
bills owed to the company.

This gives an idea of the volume of the 
Swift & Company business and the requirements 
of financing it. Only by doing a  large business 
can this company turn live stock into meat and 
by-products a t the lowest possible cost, prevent 
waste, operate refrigerator cars, distribute to 
retailers in all parts of the country — and be 
recompensed with a  profit of only a  fraction of 
a  cent a  pound—a profit too small to have any 
noticeable effect on the price of m eat or live stock.

Swift & Company, U. S. A.
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—that's w hit thousands of formers 
cay, who have gone from the U. S. to 

nettle on homesteads or buy land in Western 
Canada. Canada's invitation to every industrioua worker to aettie in 
Manitoba, Saskatchewan or Alberta it  especially attractive. Site wants 
farmers to make money and happy, prosperous homes for themselves 
by helpipg her raise immense wheat crops to feed the world.

You Gan Gat a Homestead of 160 Acres Free
or other lands ot very low prices. Where you can boy good farm 
land at 915 to $30 per acre that will raise 20 to 45 bushels of 02 
wheat to the acre -it's easy to become prosperous. Canadian farmers 
also grow wonderful crops of Oats, Barley and Flax. Mixed Fam­
ing is fully at profitable an industry as grain raising. The excellent

?trasses, full of nutrition, are the only food required either 
or beef or dairy purposes. Good schools and churches; 

markets convenient; climate excellent Write for literature 
end particulars as to reduced railway rates to Supt of lm- 
migration, Ottawa, Canada, or to

flea. A, Halt, 123 Secsad SI., Hllwaukae,
Wiv.t C. A. Lawler, Marquette, Mlcfc.

Cuiindlnn Government Agents M

Tto Original House Hie Reliable Heuee

Direct Prom Net* to People That Bat Them
lUfrrwHH PoMnuur aw) CltlMoa Dank 

Season open now. Send for our prka Uat.

Consumers Fish Co. * £ £ £ '£
AMUSEMENT M S

>1> Av«.. CucoguVllL

Exacting Customer.
“Anyhow, I wouldn't food Crown 

Print!** Wllllo ulotig with the oilier 
Gcnnuns," oM'Inhnod i!io unrelenting 
woman.

“Why n o t r
"He's tin* Nori Mmi would gel din* 

(ijn'oonhto unloxtf you uIwii.vk gave him 
white bread tiini three lump* uf nugur 
In his onh'oo."

Iterate. Nabratrd. 83S Wabash

PATENTS WltlOD
LtwyrrColeman,. —.------ #w.,WMblUMlon.

J). 0- Adrior end book*fra*. 
lUtss iMSoubl*. UlxbMir*(«r*ii0M. iAraiMrrloM.

Pstout.

O l d . F o l k ’ s  C o u g h s
will be relieved promptly by PUo’a. Stop# 
throat tickle; relieve* irritation. Tin remedy 
toted by t.ioro than lift/ years of ue-c is

PISGS

Cutlcura Complexion*,
| Nothing better tlmii Cutlcura Soap 
1 dully uod Oluimeut uh noodad to make 
, the complexion clour, aculp dean and 
• hunds soft and white. For free sam­
ples address “Cutlourn. Dept. X, Bos- 

| ton." Sold by druggists and by mail. 
Soup 2d, Olutiuout 25 uud GO.—Adv.

Too Much to Expect.
"Do .toil expert Josh will hr tihlo to 

h|uuk l-'ronoli whon ho gets Iuhih.v- 
asked Mrs. < 'ornlosKcl.

"No,' replied l!rr huHhnii'l. "Von 
mu tul;o It from me ilmt .;>»h i,i> 
I'oor too lm*y lighting to Mop t>i. 11 
uny iuin-> ii('coiupliHhtut-ntH.'

the: ■ 
:mcn 

binct
When a follow knows his l.usinetos, 

hr doesn't have to explain to people 
Ilia* ho does. It isn't what a mail 
knows but what hr thinks In: knows 
that ho tn-ag* nnout. Uig talk means 
little knowtenge.

HELPFUL HINTS.

Whon buying fowl remember that a 
lai ■go ono Is more economical to buy 

than a siuull ono, as the 
pro|M>rtion of ineut to 
the hone is greater. If 
tbe fowl is rousted with 
s t n fll n g a four-pound 
fowl will serve five. 
Then i he while meat 
which Ik left may be 
carefully cm lo serve as 
cold meat or in wind- 

wichoH. The hones are covered with 
cold wutor ami simmered on the hack 
part of the stove u day or two after, 
uml with rice or hurley mukc a most 
nourishing soup for two or three. 
This soup may ho pieced out by udding 
milk and egg; 'ho lluvor will inulce it 
most appetizing. There will he small 
hits of meat ilmt muy he put through
• he meat chopper added to two cupfuls 
of boiled rice, u slice of onion fried in 
fat until brown; a big ripe tomato uud 
hiikml for a hot supper dish. This is 
a most tasty dish if well and properly 
seasoned. Giyeuue. suit and pepper, 
should he used quite freely. This sure­
ly Is enough to expect from one* fowl, 
yet these are hut suggestive of a few 
ways to make meal go as far as pos­
sible.

When laundering madras curtains, 
instead of patting on a stretcher while 
still wet, pul on tlie curtain rod anil 
also run a rod in the lower hem. Hang 
one at a time at tin open window und 
stretch the desited width. This Is a 
method especially good for burred cur­
tains as they are sure to hang even.

A windy, bright day Is the best to 
wash and dry blankets and bedding, 
especially down quills. With a long 
line, a good sweep of wind and uo 
poles to soil them they will he light, 
dutTy and full of ozone when dry.

A small piece of felt glued into the 
heel of the shoe where the nulls so 
soon push through will save many a 
darn for tin* busy house mother. If 
slmt*s wear on the edge where they 
arc stitched, thus making (lie shoe un­
sightly and uncomfortable, paste a 
thin strip of leather over It with glut*, 
before tin* threads are worn. Till! 
:nuy lie repeated time after lime, thus 
prolonging tin* wear of a shoe many 
months. Use glue ami suve old shoe 
lops for pulchlng.

X X X
Tin* most I ra n  do for my friend Is 

sim ply to he his friend. I have no 
w ealth to hesMju on him. If he known 
(hut 1 uni hi4 )py In loving him he will 
w ant no o ther reword, is not friend­
ship divine In th is? - Knicrsoii.

SOME REMINDERS.

When preparing the dinner or using 
the wood or coal range for u morn­

ing's ironing or 
baking, put on a 
disli of rice to cook. 
A spoonful or two 
may he udded to 
soup, another half- 
cupful added to a 
custard makes a 
most dainty pud­
ding, and tin* rest 

nmy he mixed with u little chopped 
uieut, seasoned with n tablespoouful 
or two of onion fried in fat and 
enough tomato to add moisture; with 
tlie seasoning well done and the dish 
halted, this makes u very good sup­
per dish,

Let us realize tin* value of dainty 
service. A dish may In* wet) prepared, 
nicely seasoned, tasty and yet when 
served In a cureless, untidy may, it will 
not In* half appreciated, and often go 
untouched, Food not well seasoned, 
however ultracllve to the eye, will not 
remain in favor longer than the first 
taste.

Just now when all materials are so 
much higher In prim*, renovate the old 
velvet lm|K and save buying new ones. 
Steam velvet hy putting a funnel Into 
the spout of tlie teakettle; this make* 
more surface for the steam. Hold 
the wrong side of the velvet over the 
funnel, and when till Is steamed brush 
lightly with a whisk broom to raise 
tin* nuik

Have a box of par-dey growing lu 
tin* basement or kitchen window; It 
will In* found a great help for flavoring 
and garnishing during the winter. A 
box of good soil should he carried In 
out of the frost ho that lu the eurly 
spring there will he Noil to start the 
seeds for early planting.

When using m> egg heater in any 
mixture which spatters, slip a paper 
hug over the bowl and heater, making 
a lade in the bottom of tin* hug to slip
• he top of the heater through. Till* 
will save sputtering yourself or the 
table.

^ t t U X c t  vttilL

Unwashed Monarchy.
The iconoelustH of history huve 

proved beyond the shadow of a doubt 
that King James, in whose honor u 
popular edition of the Bible was 
named, washed ills face only unco* u 
year. And It Is equally as well es­
tablished that queen Fily.nbelh took 
a Imlh only twice a year and then 
HTcauu'd and had to have a doefor.

Dally Thought.
Good <’iuapany anil good discourse 

. tv the \ e r s i n e w *  of t im n - 'l /u a k  
Walton.

Kill Dandruff 
With Cuticura

SrnccirU: So«p Ti, Ointment 
'.MUPlv . C, Mates.^Lnd^^ialcum "£■ "Wsnipi*free of ''OttkM,

FRESH
FROZEN

SMOKED
SALTED

J^TgrEEN BmFiSHCq
‘. JEREEN BAY.W K.

fPICED DRIED
SEND FOR COMPLXT^RICE LIST

Where Daddy Wat Lucky.
Maty watched interestedly while her 

father uuchored his tin mask to hit 
ears and then said: "Isn’t It nice, 
mother that daddy lias such ’normoiiH 1 
big ears."

MutJc for All Occasions.
I util Aunt May cam * to i*--r hou*e 

to visit, eight-.vear-old Morian cried for 
everything she wanted. Aunt May 
with the intention of curing her niece 
formed tlx* Imhit of sinking (as Marian 
wept). "Hon't cry, little girl, don't 
cry. etc." All to Marian's disgust.

One night when father was fussy, 
Auntie proved that there was a song 
to Hill' him. Sweetly she sang: ‘Tack 
up yout (roubles in your old kit bag 
uml smile, smite, smile."

A fev. nights later a bachelor of very 
uncertain age enun* to call on Aunt 
May. Aunlie was very happy until 
suddenly from the next coma \ictrola 
cam e:

'Thirling. I Am Growing old."
Murluu Imd seized h**v chance to 

prove tiial there were songs for all 
occasions.

Spanish I:iilu<Tiza can 
U1 proven u J easier than 
it can Ite cured.

At the first sign of a 
shiver or sneeze, take

CASCARA® QUININE.

Standard  odd rem edy for 20 ye«r*—in »sblet 
ferm — t*fe, aure.nc opiate* -b reak *  up o tc ld  
in  24 h our* - relieve* *rip in 3 <l*y* Mooey 
back i r it fail*. The penuine bo* ha* •  f  cd top  
will. Mr. HU;‘* p e tu r f .  At All Dru* Su>rr*.

TOO WEAK 
TO  FIGHT

The "Come-back" man wa« really never 
down-and-out. His weakened coudition 
because of overwork, lack of exercise, im-
?roper eating and living demands stiinula- 
ion to satisfy tbe cry for u health-giving 

appetite and tbe refreshing sleep essential 
to strength. GOLD MKI)AL Haarlem Oil 
Capsules, the National Remedy of Holland, 
will do the work. They are wonderful. 
Three of these capsules each day will put 
a  man on his feet before lie knows it; 
whether bis trouble comes from uric acid 
poisoning, tlie kidneys, gravel or stone iu 
tbe bladder, stomach derangement or other 
ailments that befall the over-zealous Amer­
ican. Tbe best known, most reliable rem­
edy for these troubles is GOLD MKDAL 
Haarlem Oil Capsules. This remedy bus 
stood tbe test for more than 200 years 
since its discovery in the ancient labora­
tories in Holland. I t  acts directly und 
gives relief at once. Don't wait until you 
are entirely down-and-out. but take them 
today. Your druggist will gladly refund 
your money if they do not help you. Ac­
cept no substitutes. Look for the name 
GOI.I) MKDAL on every box. three sizes. 
They are the pure, original, imported 
Haarlem Oil Capsules,—Adv.

Rr«-p rletn instd? a* w  ll a* oU(*i>l< hr (aklog 
• jrcuil* laiathe al l**»t »uc<> a wc.k, *ucb a* 
lloctor Picrrf'a flcasuol IVlht*. Ad*.

Was His Own Fault.
"Mcicy!" exrliilmcd tin* presiding 

eider, gazing slioekcdty out of (he win­
dow. “I believe your ehlidron are 
trying to kill one of their number, 
Rrother Johnson! Ah:—now they
Imve set upon him with eluhs and tire 
heating him savagely. You eon hear 
lifk cries, and—"

“Aw. tiie one that's doing tlie yell­
ing ain't none of my young ’tins," non­
chalantly replied (htp Johnson of Iturn- 
pu« Itidge. "He belongs to one of 
the neighbors—I ran tell that hy the 
fact that he ain’t swearing. Some­
thing wrong with that kid, anyhow; 
every time he gets healed tip he eomea 
over yur for another heating."—Kun- 
mis City Stur.

Often the Case.
‘Ih n t  Kaiser Hill was a bud actor.” 
“les ,” said Mr. Storiuingtou Darnea. 

“And like many another bud uctor he 
wus so busy getting his uume in big 
type on the biilhourds that he failed 
to see the handwriting on the wall.."

H o w 'f  T b if  ?
We offer fHXi.OO (or any case of catarrh 

that cannot be cured by HALL'S 
CATARRH MEDICINE.

HALL'S CATARRH MEDICINE Is tak­
en Internally and acts through the Blood 
on the Mucous Surfaces of the System.

Sold by druggists for ovsr forty years.
Price %c. Testimonials free.
P. J. Cheney & Co.. Toledo, Ohio.

Man to Be Honored.
“De real patriot," said Unde Kben, 

“Is de man dnt followed de music of 
de hand d ’ur over to whur de sho’ 
nut? flghfhi* was."

In •  Newspaper Office.
"Any naval engagement tonight?" 
“No: hut I've a military wedding.’ 

—Chicago Doily News.

Important to Mothers
Examine carefully every bottle of 

CASTORIA. that famous old remedy 
for infants and children, and see that It

Bears the 
Signature oft
In Use for Over HO Years.
Children Cry for Fletcher’s Castoria

Enthusiastic.
"He’s very enthusiastic about any 

project he thinks of going into."
“Counts his chickens before they ore 

hatched, eh?"
“Yes, und figures two to a shell."— 

Louisville Courier-Journal.

Phoenix Mineral
T h e  C o a l S a v e r

T HOUSANDS of people are using this 
wonderful PHOENIX MINERAL and 

find it a great coal and money saver. 
Simple to use, treatscoal in a minute; coal 
then has no soot, less 6moke, no bad gases 
nor clinkers, and few ashes. Therefore,
X  to H more heat. It makes no difference 
what glide of coal or coke you use.
Dhltanlb lilnarsi *• guaranteed not to Injure 
rilUtfllll WIIIIOlu! your stove, range or fur­
nace or boiler, but rather make* them tut longer 
and beat better. Remember it produce* L to 4  
more heat. One dollar can will treat one ton ot 
either hard or toft coal or coke.
Defy Jack Frotf with leee coal and more hear 
and aave money. Send for teat package. P will 
demonstrate how these things are done. t.£M) * 
ONE DOLLAR TODAY for this package to *
CootbeDti! Chemical Co., Denver, Colo.

t* rw e want a live agent in your locality.
Write for cur propoeitton.

ABSO RBING
a *  TRAM WAAKAffi.U.S.PAT. Off
Reduces Bursal Enlargements, 

Thickened, Swollen Tissues, 
Curbs, Filled Tendons, Sore* 
ness from  Bruises o r Strains; 
•topi Spavin Lameneu, allay* {win. 
Doei not blister, remove the hair or 
lay up the horse. $2.50 s bottle 

at druggists or delivered. B ook I  R  free, 
ABSORBINE, J R , for mankind-an 

antiseptic liniment for bruises, cuts, wounds, 
strains, painful, swollen veins or glands, it 
heals and soothes, f  1.25 a bottle at drug­
gists or postpaid. Will tell you mors if you 
write. Made in the U. 8. A. by 
W.F.Y0UN8. P. D. F„ |10Ti»»!*St.,8prlnofltld. Mass*

Letter from Bossy
people do—because cows suffer from ailments, Rule

id I

If a cow could speak she would talk about her beaffb 
as
and big, same as human beings.

Th* most common cow ailments, eueh as Abortion, Retain*.*. 
Afterbirth, Lost Appetite, Bunches, Scours, etc., result from a 
diseased condition of the digestive or gc-niul urgeos. Any c* 
these diseases snd many others esn be successfully treated cr 
prevented by using Kow-Kure, the great cow medicine.

Feed dealers and druggists sell it—60c. and tl.20
Kckages. Free book, “Tbe Homo Cow 

ctor,“ sent on rwjucst

j

I

~ \ Dairy Association Co.
LYNDONVILLE, VT.

You Are Dying By Acid
When you have Heartburn, Gas, Bloat, and that Full 

after eating. TAKE ONE

(FOR YOUR STOMACH S SAKE^
Rids you of tbe Excess Acid and Overload and you will fairly feel 

the GAS driven out of your body THE BLOAT GOES WITH IT.

IT GIVES YOU REAL STOMACH COMFORT
Sold by druiriflNte generully-Jf your drugglHt can't supply you u big lx.* of Entoulr f«>r 
60**, iteml um this mlv. with vour uame nod address und wi- will wild it to yon—you run m-ii.I 
us tbe BOc after you get it. Addn-ss Kaluule Itemedy Co., lUlt) a. Wabusb Ave., Cl.kngu II'

w V

He Knew Willie,
Kuril* Jim (iiftrr u vlult)— I wiiut to 

buy Wlllit* u proKrnt that will lx* ( in ­
fill mul (hat lm will krrp as long u* 

Wimt would you *upgr*iy 
WlllIr’H Dud—A enkr uf soap.

WAS GOOD ENOUGH REASON

RELIABLE PRESCRIPTION
FOR THE KIDNEYS

For many years druggists have watched 
with much interest the remurkuble record 
inaintuioed by Dr. Kilmer'm Swamp-Hoot, 
the great kidney, liver and bladder nu'di- 
uine.

It is u physician's prescription.
Swamp-iioot is a strengthening medi­

cine. It helps the kidneys, liver und blad­
der do the wurk nature intended they 
should do.

Kwutup-Hoot hus stood the test of years. 
It is sold by all druggists on its merit und 
it should help you. No other kiduey medi­
cine lias so many friends.

He hure to get Swainp-Hoot and sturt 
treatment at once,

However, if you wish first to test this
freut preparation send ten cents to Dr. 
vilmer & Co.. Binghamton, N. Y., for u 

sample bottle. When writing be sure aud 
mention this paper.—Adv.

Lending a Hand.
“Don't you want to loud a hand to 

mil' xoldlor Ijo.vh mi 1 hi* olliey sido?'1 
asked the orator ut I lu* womau'N moot- 
lug.

“Loud a hand?'' piped up oUo of 
tbo s\vh»| young tilings. "Why, I 
gave my )nt*,d to one before lie went 
over!“

V A I1 > |  Oraoulaled Eyelid*,
■  E B E J e  Eyes inflamed by expo- 

sure to $aa, Dwf and wlad
quickly relieved by Nvrloe 
EytRtaady. No Smarting, 
Just Eye Comfort. At 

Your Druniits or by mail COc per Bottle. 
For Beak el the fye free write a u
Murloe Fyo Remedy Co., Chlcogo.

Eyes

Accused Man'e Lawyer Asserted Hie 
Client'e Innocence, So What Wae 

There for Jury to Do?

“Tim following >dory cIiIut shown 
txin-uu* igimrimn- <m tin- part of *t 
Juror, or ll slum* wimt a wonderful 
ciuirin some- lau,\*rs ixereise on *i 
Jury," said a formor marshal of a 
Koulheru Indiana oily.

“A murder was eomiiilllod and It 
wax not long helore we hud the limn 
who we were sure had eoimniltcd the 
deed. Hut he imd money aud lie re- 
Inliied (lie hesi lawyers. The i\\o law­
yers we will eull While aud Black, be­
cause While aud Ithick are u<J their 
real mimes. The Jury was made up 
largely of men wiio tilled ilic soil. 
They were of the honest soil. White 
and Itmck, ‘-specially While, so |:iv- 
soiiled their client's east*, telling how 
lie could not do such a horrilih- deed, 
using their handkerchief* occasionally 
In the telling, Ilmt the Jurors were car­
ried away and voted for acquittal.

"Later i met one of Hie Jurors and 
I said lo him: 'Jones, why did you 
Vote to acquit the prisoner Tin* evi­
dence showed . clearly Hint he was 
guilty.'

"'.Vo, sir. ilitil man was not guilty.’ 
said Judes, 'Wl-.it makes you think 
so?’ I countered. 'Whv because Mr. 
White said In* wasn't!’ concluded 
Jones."

Cause for Rejoicing.
The Iporiilng of Ha eleventh, will'll 

tile hells hcgitu ringing and Hie whis­
tles blowing, Hetty wakened up mid 
asked w hat it meant.

"The war Is over und umv wc shall 
Imve peace," I explained.

"Oil. goody!" she said lu such a re­
lieved lone. "Now | call begin to spend 
a little of my own money!". Chicago 
Trihime.

in Cloie Touch.
Mrs. IJtniiu—'"Are you much In 

touch with affairs?" Mrs. Jpilicly— 
"Oh, .u s ; our phone is on a party 
line."

u  L , MILWAUKEE, NO. 81-1918. . silence is u great peacemaker.

\\ Mm m idi «»vc i tin* Mmid ic.dlze im.it 
Mill |..ole thill llu II MM’k al liollii- h«-|(it'd 
(lie -ut a ,it I he I'loal. ll illtolvid 
yield e.ililne. lend work and umisli.ill 
pli.isK.il s(.ei.;ih. Women at hoe.i
should unis,ay lor the home, A good,
wry to Jw in is to QiU your druggist (or a 
i opy or semi fA* to publisher of the 
''MrJii jJ Adviser," (;CJ M.en Kt., Buffalo, 
X. Y., and git u copy of their 1,000 |n»yor 
hook loumi in cloth, with chapter* orn 
J list Aid, Taking (‘.iru of ths Sick or- 
Mounded, Tie >iol< yy. Hygiene, Anutu 
my, Hex 1’iohlems, Mother ami Bab*.*. 
Nnliudy, man <r wo.nan, cun do gomt 
work wh»n health is impaired, If u 
woai.-n mr\our or has duzy spells, 
eulU-ra horn -wvful at regular or it-
regala) intervals the rhould turn lo a tonic 
m.de up of Let Is, lire I wdhout uhohol, 
wl.nh a.- \cr t/'..ik w  .lien strong and sii U 
woi.-'ii will. It is Hr. i ’i lee’a Favori'a* 
I'rex i ipl on. Lend Dr. I'n-ree, Jiuffulo, 
N. Y., 10 tints for tiini pn* kage.

Tiov Ci-i.ti-r, V*'u . "Th'* is to certify 
th.il 1 loive uvd Hi. I’n-rre's l*'iivoritu J'u- 
sei-qition fimi found it \eiy Imefirial. A 
few years ago ) sulYcn-d u genera) hn-nk 
down. J got very weak and thin— just felt 
miserable nil ov«-r. I D-gun taking ‘Jravur 
ite I'ri-M ription’ and m six tnotiths 1 was 
cnliiely will 1 nisei gave it to my daugh­
ter when sin was hi out 16 year* old lot 
gi-mrnl wiakoiss und it brought her out 
hi hr.« intui tion. I mn a grenl believer -n 
this medieiiie and mommend it to wumru 
who al« a j i f ig .Mrs .  (J. Kcbot.
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ARE YOU

FULLY PROTECTED
WITH

Fire Insurance
HOW about your ■ 9  HOW about your
Dwelling House \ f  Stock of
and Furniture I |  Merchandise

RATES ARE LOW

If not fully protected, call on the

N eg aunee  Sta te  Bank

{INSURANCE AGENCY
|  THOMAS PASOOE, Manager.
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>A WEEK'S NEWS NOTES
Paragraphs About Negaunee 

Affairs*

A COLUMN OF LOCAL HAPPENINGS

In te re s t in g  Item s A bout Tow ns­

people an d  T h e ir  Business 

and  Social Affairs.

—Mrs. Alfred Jandroo  entertained 
frieaea yesterday afternoon.

—The proposed new long distance 
telephone rates are to  be due on tbe 
27th Inst.

—Tbe iofiueoza situation In the 
city continues to be very satisfactory 
a t present.

—Tbe Negaunee Are department re- 
•ponded to chimney fire on Wednes- 
day morale?.

—The season of Lent begins this 
year on March 6th, considerably later 
than last year. Faster Sunday falls 
on April 20th.

—Tbe funeral of tbe late Mrs. Matt 
Helnoneo was held th is (Friday) af- 
ternooo a t two o ’clock from tbe home 
a t tbe Buffalo location

—The United States stands back of 
every Thrift Stamp that Is sold and If 
you have a 1918 o r  1919 stamp they 
will be just as good 'and  U nde Sam 
stands back of every one you buy.

—A suggestion h as been made that 
after the war is oyer and the boys 
are borne, U might help a  lot If the 
women who have been kolttlng so in­
dustriously for the soldiers, would 
keep right od knitting for their fam* 
Hies. Father might even show his 
appreciation.

—The United States Steel corpora­
tion in the current year will pay out 
in salaries and wages more than 
$400,000,000. Assuming tha t produc­
tion reaches 16,000,000 tons of finished 
steel, tbe cost in wages and salaries 
will approximate $25 per ton. Steel 
manufacturers say a revision in the 
wage scale downward will be in order 
before tbe close ol 1919.

—Many sportsmen throughout tbe 
Upper peninsula are omphalic In 
their views that tbe partridge should 
baye the protection of another closed 
season in the upper peninsula coun­
ties, ana that tbe upper peninsula 
.members of tbo legislature and the 
upper peninsula boards of super­
visors should do their utmost to sue 
ibis obtained.

—Tbe Michigan two cent fare law 
was held valid last week by Judge C. 
W. Sessions In United State* Dis- 

'i r te l  coon  a t Grand Rapid*. The 
opinion was given In denying a imtl* 
tion by tbe Brand Kspids, Brand 
Haven and Muskegon Interurban 
railway that it be allowed to increase 
its passenger rate  to three coots. 
Application for so injunction to pre­
vent the state from enforcing tbe law 
was denied,

WANTKD—Two or more furnished 
rooms with board or for light house­
keeping. Address 1*. O. flux 729.

There is more Catarrh In this section 
ot the country than a)J other diseases 
put together, and for years It ws* sup­
posed to be incut able. lectors pn-scrlbed 
Iocs) reined I oe. an d by constantly tailing 
to cure with local treatment, pronounced 
It Incurable. Catarrh is a local disease, 
greatly Influenced by constitutional con­
ditions und therefore requires constitu­
tional treatment. Hall’s Catarrh Medi­
cine, manufactured by J-' J. Cheney A 
Co., Toledo, Ohio, Is a constitutional 
remedy. Is taken Internally and acts 
thru the Blood on the Mucous Surfaces 
of ths System. One Hundred Dollars re­
ward Is offered for any case that Hall's 
Catarrh Medicine falls to cure. Send for 
circulars und testimonials.

P. J. CHENEY & CO., Toledo. Ohio.
Bold by Half gists, 7tc.
Hall's Jfwaily Bills for co'aOpation.

—Tbe young people enjoyed a hap 
py time with their skils on Teal Lake 
bluff last Sunday.

—Miss Frances W inter entertained 
tbe members of tbe Luncheon Club 
Tuesday afternoon.

—Tbe Cleveland-Cliffs Iron Com­
pany wilt pay tbelr Negaunee em­
ployes nex t Wednesday.

—We have been mailing out sub­
scription bills and hope for prompt 
responses, We need tbe money.

—Mr. and Mrs. Miles M. Main are 
rejoicing over the arrival of a baby 
boy a t tbelr borne, born Wednesday 
evening.__________________

—A dear old lady, who always has 
a  hatred for cards, frets about an avi­
ator boy being an “ ace”—must be 
thinking be’* going to tbe deuce.

—Mr. and Mrs. C. A. Meyers are 
the happy parents of a baby boy, 
John Sterling Meyer, born December 
26tb, 1618.—Tbe Wakefield Advocate. 
The mother was formerly MissCarrie 
Sterling, daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
W. M. Sterling of this city.

—“ Well doctor, when one doctor 
doctors another doctor, does tbe doc­
tor dolog tbe doctoring doctor the 
other doctor as tbe doctor wants to 
be doctored, or does tbe doctor doing 
tbe doctoring doctor tbe other doctor 
as the doctor doing the doctoring 
wants to be doctored?”

—A Negaunee man started out to 
show what be could do with a  dollar, 
buying borne goods. Hebougb^bread, 
sausage, peaout,butter etc. He broke 
tbe dollar a t a local store a n d -a n d  
tbe merchant very likely sent the 
dollar out of town to help pay for 
printed letter beads and envelopes,

—Fifty million dollars for good 
roads was tbe cry in tbe senate last 
week when senator W illiam F. Com- 
nolly of Spring Lake, introduced a 
resolution proposing a constitutional 
amendment for tbe spring election 
giving tbe legislature authority to 
vote bonds for road building up to 
$60,000,000.

—Influenza has attacked pigs in Es- 
canaba. A herd of pigs owned by Dr. 
A. 8. Winn., kept in an enclosure 
near tbe city limits, has been attacked 
by a disease said to resemble influen­
za. Tbe pigs become sick suddenly 
and die overnight. P igs valued at 
$600 bad been lost through the strange 
malady In Dr. W ino’s herd.

—A wise Mutt bas discovered that It 
Is unbealtbful for two persons to oc­
cupy tbe sume bed, regardless of the 
fact recorded In the Book of Books 
tbat Moses slept with bis forefathers, 
which were five in a bill, and then 
lived to tbe ripe old age of seven or 
eight hundred and twenty years. An­
other savior of the health of bis breth­
ren, has learned that it Is unsafe to 
ride a horse that another fellow bas 
ridden to attend church where other 
people attend. Tbe kiss has been 
branded as a tempter of death In all 
manner of diseases. Handshaking is 
oow considered extremely dangerous, 
An exchange thinks If things keep up 
it will be unhealthy to be burled In 
the same graveyard with other peo­
ple. The only place a person can be 
safe from getting dlseuso or gettlog 
run over, Is in a store that doesn’t ad ­
vertise.—Gladwin Record.

Cured st a Coat of 25 Cents 
“ Eight years ago when we first mov­

ed to Mauoori, I was a  great sufferer 
from Indigestion and constipation,” 
writes Mrs. Hubert Allison, Mattoon, 
III. ” 1 had frequent headaches and 
dizzy spells, and there was a feeling 
like a  heavy weight pressing on my 
stomach aod chest all the time. I felt 
miserable. Every morsel of food dis­
tressed me. ( could oot rest at night 
and fell tired and worn out all the 
time. One bottle of Cbatoberlain’sTab- 
lets cured me and I have since felt 
like a different person,”

Chamberlain s Cough nemedy
Cues Cclds, Cioupsud WL(Lying Cotijti

PABLO
The Happy 

"Hoppy" Drink
MA0C BY PA BIT AT MlLWAUKSK

A  Healthful Drink. 

Contains So Alcohol.

P r o m p t  Attb n t io ic  G iv e n  t o  

M a il  ok P h o n b  O r d e r s .

« r  SEND US A TRIAL ORDER,

CHAS. JOHNSON, Apt
NEQAUKEE, MICH.

It takes GRIT
to start saving money

I t  l a k e s  S r i t  t o  d e n / y t a m r e l f  o f  c e r t a i n  p l e a & m r  

a n d  l u x u r i e s ,  b u t  y o u  o u t  o f l f  . s t a r t i n g .

c a n ’t  i r a s f  t h e  s c h e m e  o f  g r o w t h — t J i a t  5ue- 

c<?ss b e | i n s  a s  a  b u a  a n d  t h a t  t b e  r i p e n e d  f r u i t  o f  f o r t u n e ^ ,  

w i l l  n e V e r  b e  v p u r r  i f  y o u  k i l l  t h e  b l o s s o m  o f  c h a n c e .  "  

b y  t h e  e a r l y  z r o s l  o £  n e g l e c t * ------ - H e r b e r t H d u fr tg n '

, FÎ TMTIONAL BANK
?£%*•* A B A N K  FOR ALL THe- P E O P L E

N E G A U N E E 'T v f  I C H I G A N

Negaunee forty Years Hgo.
IT S  M S  R R P R O D U O B O  P R O M

The Negaunee Iron Herald.
Vol. VI. Negaunso (L.8.), Mich., January 9, 1879. No. 11

Tbe clanging of the fire bell Mon­
day morning quickly filled the streets 
with a throng of residents, each ask ­
ing the other, “ Where’s the fire?” 
While search was being made, Henry 
Lee and and a  couple of more fleet- 
footed, located the blaze in tbe cot­
tage owned and occupied by Mrs. 
Jennings lo tbe northwestern portioo 
of tbe city. Tbe fire was caused from 
the burning out of tbe chimney, tbe 
flames having communicated to  the 
roof. The firemen promptly got to 
work and aside from tbe water neces­
sarily used, oo damage was done 
other than & few burned shingles. 
Miss Mary Jennings, a  daughter, 
while a iaiog the firemen, received a 
slight scalp wound from a falling 
ladder.

A severe storm of wind from tbe 
southwest passed over this section 
Monday evening. At 6 p. m. it blew a 
regular hurricane, but as tbe evening 
advaoced It abated and by midnight 
bad entirely subsided. The weather, 
which bad previously been bitter cold, 
moderated and yesterday was tbe 
most temperate day for three weeks. 
By recent orders from the Signal Ser­
vice department, tbe Northwestern 
Telegraph office will hereafter receive 
and display dally upon a  bulletin 
board the temperature of tbe weather 
a t  different points in tbe couotry, as 
well as predictions as to tb a t fo rth ­
coming.

The new openings by tbe Jackson 
from Company, on tbe bill south of 
city, look exceedingly promising, the 
body of oro Increasing as depth is -ob­
tained. The different drifts io pit NO. 
7 are also looking well, aud a much 
larger product may be expected from 
this portion of tbe property.

Mlchlgamme lodge, No. 273, I. O. 
O. F„ entertained in tbat village last 
Saturday evening with a  public In­
stallation and oyster supper. Several 
Invited guests and also a  large dele­
gation from tbe Champion lodge par­
ticipated. There were addresses by 
Bros Denton and McAllister. Tbe 
principal officers installed were as 
follows: W illiam Kae, N. G .; J . P. 
Christopher, V, G,; J . H. Alward,
R. S.; John Jewell, F. S .; William 
Sundstrom, Treas.

M arried—At Cleveland, O., Jan . 1. 
1879, a t the residence of tbe bride’s 
parents, 460 Euclid avenue, by tbe 
R«v. H. C. Haydon, Mr. James II. 
Dalliba, formerly of Marquette, to 
Miss Kate L- Baldwin, daughter of
S. C. Baldwin.

James Predlx rejoices io the adveot 
of a  little g irl at bis domicile on Mon­
day last.

%
John Sbay, living a t the Rolling 

Mill location, bad bis right eye se­
verely injured by a chip from a slick 
of wood which be was chopping.

Tbe Peninsula Brewery, which Is 
the largest of its kind on tbe Upper 
Peotnsula and which a t one time al­
most wholly supplied the bibulous 
>opu)atlon of the county, but whicb 
ms been idle for several years, has 
been leased by F- A. Llebensteio, for­
merly of Fox Lake, a brewer of large 
practical experience, who has put the 
jroperiy in condition to manufacture 
>«(-r to its full capacity. Tbe storage 

capacity is furnished by five Immense 
cellars capable of holdiug 2000 bar­
rels of beer. Tbe quality of the bev­
erage seems to give good satisfaction 
wherever It has been introduced, 
though the proprietor says it will be 
improved upon as it grows older. Ue 
uses nolbtog but genuine malt aod 
hops, and his long experience In the 
business will enable him to make an 
article tb a t will suit tbe and eye U ste 
of a connolseur. Jos. Lolb, J r. Is tbs 
sales agent,

W hat came near being a serious 
accident ocoured a t the skating rink 
Monday evening. A party of skaters 
were performing what is called “ crack 
the whip,” Miss Mary Foley being on 
the outer end. and while under con­
siderable headway her hold gave 
way and she was pitched forward 
with terrible force, falling on her 
face. W hen picked up she was in­
sensible, and remained in tha t state 
so long ns to occasion her frteods 
great alarm. After tbo use of reslora 
tives her removal to the fumlly home 
was made possible, but she has suf­
fered great pain from a severe con­
tusion on the side of her face. This 
“crack tbe whip” business is too 
serious a  game to bo Indulged in. 
It’s lots of fun for big fellows, who 
play stock, hut for the little chaps, 
who play lash, it Is cruel In tbo ex­
treme. The rink proprietors have 
Interdicted the gume for tbe future.

Prof. r .  A. Fobrman is completing 
arrangements to take a much «• eded 
vacation, whicb Is rendered u<ce»iury 
by falling health.

Aid. Se&si, chairm an of the special 
committee appointed last November 
to consider tne project of erecting a 
new Are engine bouse, reported to 
tbe Common Council a t  the meeting 
on the 2od lose that tbe committee 
had procured plans and specifications 
whicb they believed best adapted to a 
building of this purpose and consider- 
ingtbe peculiar form of tbe lo t upoo 
which It was to  be erected. A recess 
was taken while the aldermen In­
spected tbe plans and upon reas­
sembling Aid. Seass presented a reso­
lution to the effect th a t a  “ Building 
Committee” should be appointed, con­
sisting of tbe m ayor and two members 
ofebe Council, which should mature 
tbe plans for ao engine bouse, same 
to be either a  frame, veoeered, atone 
or brick bulldlog; it being expressly 
understood tbat tbe committee shall 
have no au thority  to let a  contract 
or incur any other expense without 
tbe consent of tbe Council. As such 
committee there were appointed: May­
or T. J. Houston and Aid. Merry and 
Seass.

The M., H. & O. station bouse at 
Eagle Mills was destroyed by fire at 
3 p. m. on New Y ear’s day. Loss 
about $500. Tbe fire was caused by 
the burning of tbe contents of tbe 
stove pipe. Tbe telegraph instrument 
was lost, together with $25 cash be­
longing to tbe office "boy, also $4 of 
the railroad company’s money. Some 
alarm  was apprehended for the safe­
ty of a large quantity of lumber piled 
close ty  the bulldlog, but strenuous 
work saved this property.

Tbe wloter term of tbe public schools 
commenced on Monday with an un­
usually full attendance. Both teachers 
and scholars seem to have .enjoyed 
tbe vacation.

We regret to learn of tbe severe ill­
ness of Mr. and Mrs. E. S. Green. 
Tbe nature of the Illness Is unknowo 
to us, but we hope It will be of short 
duration.

A taem of horses belonging to  tbe 
Mlcbtgamme Company broke through 
t ie  ice on Lake Mlchlgamme last 
Thursday aod went to tbe bottom to 
stay till the resurrection morn, unless 
•oooer pulled oot. Tbe ice had been 
considered safe for bauliog wood 
across some time previous, but lo 
taking a new and shorter route, tbe 
above accident occured. The team was 
one of tbe best the company bad aod It 
was valued at about $400.

John M ullins,-an aged employe of 
tbe Lake Superior Iron Company, 
tell down an Incline a t tbe mine In 
Iibpemlng last week sod sustained 
several broken ribs.

Tbe Cascade property, including 
tbe Palmer mine, Is advertised to be 
•old at sheriff’s sule on the 4tb of 
February. T his action will probably 
result iu placing tbe property in a 
condition where operations may again 
be resumed. Tbe com plications sur­
rounding th is tract have greatly re­
tarded its development.

Tbe fact was noted some time ago 
tbat tbe Berman government was mov­
ing to drive its Socialists to  the 
United Slates. Already two Socialist 
leaders, banished from Berlin, have 
arrived in New York aod othera are 
known to be oq their way. Tbe pro­
spect is tha t a large portion of the 
pestilent ag ita to rs  and demagogues, 
whom Europe fiod* It necessary, tor 
tbe preservation of law, government 
aod society, to  get rid of will be 
dumped upon our shores.

In connection with the announce- 
rneut of the filing of articles of assoul- 
tlon in Wisconsin by tbe National 
Furnace Company, tbe Madison Jour­
nal b as an loterestlog story to the ef­
fect tbat when a  bead barber and bis 
two assistants at Negaunee, Miob., 
finished up tbelr Sunday morning 
buiioes* a  few weeks ago they decided 
to take a  stro ll lo the woods. During 
their wandering they came upon a 
worn out mine shaft. By tbe aid of 
matches and some pine knots they ex­
plored the lode and brought out some 
specimens of ore wbicb left little doubt 
that mineral existed there In paying 
quantities. Hunting up tbo farmer 
bo whose land tbe shaft was sunk, 
they negotiated a lease, agreeing to 
pay a royalty  of 26 cents a too on all 
tbe ore they might take out. Later 
they continued work in a crude way 
aod soon struck U “ solid,” for assays 
•bowed a richness greater than they 
dared expect. They have siuce sold 
tbelr interests for $300,000, and the 
organization of tbe above furnace 
company is tbe result.

U uiok Ours for Lrcup
Watch for tbo first symptom, hoarse­

ness aod give Cham berlain's Cough 
Remedy at once. It is prompt aod if 
fectual.

Jas. Pickands & Co.
(LTD.)

C O A L
-------A N D ---------

WOOD

N e g a u n e e , M ic h .

:_r

BECOME A NURSE 
and earn $30 00 lo $35.00 a week after 
graduation. Entrance requirements 
two years high school. Write Supt. ot 
Nurses, W ashington Park Hospital, 
60th & Vernon Ave., Chicago. 13-tl0

Jao. i - u
P r o b a te  N o t i c e

.HATE OF MICHIGAN.
The Probate Court for the County of Marquette 

▲ i  a uwwloo of Mild court. held at the probat* 
office in tbe City of Marquette, lu SHldcouuty, 
oo the 30th day of December A t>. 1918 

Prvxeot: Hod. W. 1‘. Putter. Jud/eof Probate 
In ibe Mutter of tbe Kstats of William 8. 

Wilson, Deceased.

STOCKHOLDERS' MEETING
Tbe anuusl meeting of tbe stockholder! of 

tbe Norman Iron Company (Limited) will he 
held In tbeoflteeof tbe secretary, f . M. Huger, 
ton, lo the Negaunee Htat* Bank Building, (ft*-
Rmiee, Michigan, an Monday, the uttliddyof 

uuarv. A. D. ltd), at !0 uVlurk In tbe fore­
noon of tbat day, (or tbe purpose of electing a 
Board of Directors and iraii*actl»g such other 
busloeis ss may eome before said meeting.

ED. C. ANTHONY. President. 
IS14 J.M. EDUKRTON. Secretary 

Dated, Negaunee, Midi., Dec. 1,191tK

.uuarv. A. D 
noon of

C. L. Bporley having AM Id said court Ilfs 
administration account, aod bis petition 
lug for tbe allowance thereof ana (or the

assfriitnent and discritmtiuo of tbe residue 
of said estate.

It I* Ordered, that the 21th day of Jan. A. D. 
I9JV, at two o'clock lu the aftevaoew. at taiu 
probate office, be and Is hereby appointed for 
examining aud allowing said acoouut aud 
bearing said petition;

It is Former Ordered, tbat public notice 
thereof be given by publication of a copy of tills 
order, for three successive weeks previous to 
said day of hearing, in the Nuoaukkx Ikon 
Hiuulo. a newspaper printed aad circulated 
Id said county.

(Seal) W. T. PUTTKR,
A tme copy. Judge of Probate,

Ella M. Tincknki.i.. Readnter of Probate.

Dec. ao—Jan. 10
PROBATE NOTICE

STATE OF MICHIGAN,
The Probate Court (or the County of Marquette

In the matter of tbe Estate ot Ko»e M. 
Taylor, Deceased.

Notice is hereby given that four mouths (rum 
the Mtb day of December A U IMS. have been 
allowed for oiertltvrs to present liieir etainis 
against said deceased lo said court forexamlua- 
Hon aud adjustment, aud that alt creditors of 
said deceased are required to present their 
claims in said court, at the probate office, In tbe 
City of Marquette in said county, on or before 
the Uth day of April A. D. 1911. and that said 
claims will be beard by said oouri on Monday 
the 14U) day of April A. D. 1919, at two 
o'clock iu the afteruooo.

Dated Marquette, Mich., Dec. 14. A. D. ISIS.
(Seal) W. 7. POTTKH,

A true copy Judge of Probale.

Dec. SS-JaalK
PROBATE NOTICE.

f*TATE OK MICHIGAN,
Th>* Probate Court for llie Cnuuty of Marquette 

lu Hie Matter of (he Kstoie of Kllza Mitchell. 
Deemed.

Nodus is hereby given that four moiiflis from 
the 14th day of December a. D. IMS, have been 
allowed for creditors to present their claims 
against said deceased to said court for examin­
ation uod adjustment, am! that all creditor* of 
said deceased are required to present tbelr 
claims to said court, at the probate office, lu tbe 
City of Marquette ru said euuuty, on or before 
the !4th day of April A. D. lOttt. and that 
■ala claims will be beard by said court on 
Monday, the )4th day of April A. D. l»J», at 
two o’clock lu the afternoon.

Dated Marquette, Mich., Deo. 14th, A. D. 1918. 
(Heal) W. T. POrTKU,

A true copy. Judge of Pr>bate.

Lake Superio r & Ishpem lag
Railw ay.

L.S&l
M .w .& s .e .

Munising, M arquette aud 
South-Eastern Ry.

Id sffeot beginning Bundsy, 
May 97. 2917.

TKAIN AKKIVKH NKOAIJNKB 
dally exoept Sunday

From MUNIHINU. Mar- 4ft 0 0 . -  
uuetleandaUlDlerme* iViiaSffi 
dial* points.

TKAIN LKAVKB NKGAUNKK 
dally except Sunday 

For Marquette.Ukaodla, ft Kfl a m 
U wsou.Kumiey.Cbat 0'U$ P >i 
bain. MUNlSfNG. PKfNCKTON 
ami all Intermediate points.

JOHN JACOBSON
I f c e b io n n M e
© a t t o r t n g

A L L  WORK GUARANTEED.

All the new fabrics for Fall 
and W inter now in stock.

rMO*a mo. *•».

Gold Street, Negaunee, Mich

Cash aBdCarry
The above exp la in s how you can  

reduaft your Moat and G rocery 
Mil I f  you concen trate  

your tra d in g  a t

DROBNY’S 
Cash Market
J u s t  a  few leaders from this w eek 's 

“ Cash a  d C a rry "  Price List:
BEEF -S te a k s ........................ 3 2  cents-

Klb R o a s t . . . . ......... 2 0 **
B«ef R o ts t ............. .2 4 u
IUt> B oiling ....... . .1 5 tt

VEAL—R o a s t ...................... .2 2 44
Chops....................... .2(4 t.
Lu#........................... .2(4 u
S te w ......... .. .1(4 > t

PORK—Chops o r  R o ast.. . . 3 0 o

PICKLED P O R K ................. .3 0 tt

EGGS........... .......................... .4 0 tt

BETTER......................... 0 3  & 015 »l

WITH ms SPICE EIH WEE!

M E A L S
Served a f  all hours in 

our Lunch Room.

We  have  a complete L ink ok

Footballs, Indoor Baseballs 
Punching Bags, Boxing Gloves

CIGARS, PIPES. TOBACCO ana 
Sm okers' Supplies in Gcncrul.

Ice Cream Soda Water

ANDREW ERICKSON
424 Ikon str eet  NEGAUNEE


