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PERSONAL PARAGRAPHS 
ABOUT FOLK YOU KNOW.

Marquette County League

HOW THEY STAND

Isbpemlng....
Won 

.. 5
Lost

2
Pet.
.714

Negaunee....... .. 4 3 .571
Gwlnn.......... .. 3 4 .428
M arquette.... .. a 5 .280

Id losing to Gwlnn last Sunday the 
Negaunee baseball team lost Its poll* 
tloo In (be percentage column and 
Xebpemlog reached the top of the 
ladder by defeating Marquette by a 
•core of 2 to l .  Both games were 
well played, as may be noted by the 
scores, and.certainly gave the fans an 
opportunity to "roo t.”  The weather 
was very warm, which had a  tendency 
to keep many away from the game, 
but It was an Ideal day for the play­
ers. <

Negaunee played a t Owlnn and lost 
out by a score of 2 and 3. Collins 
pitched gllteedge ball for Negaunee* 
as also did Swanson for Gwlnn. The 
former bad four strikeouts and tbe 
latter six.

To-morrow, July 4th. tbe Negaunee 
team Is scheduled for a game with 
Marquette a t Marquette. Isbpemlng 
and Owlnn will play at Union Park.

Nearly Ready for Asphalt

The final rock courses upon the 
west end of Iron street are being 
spread aod rolled and it will be but a 
few days before tbe asphalt work, 
which constitutes the final operation 
In making the new thoroughfare, Is 
under way. This latter Is a task 
which canpot be unduly hastened and 
It is also more dependent upon weath­
er conditions than are tbe earlier 
stage of the work. While It might be 
possible to complete the asphalt work 
upon Iron street itself within a month, 
It Is likely that the Inclusion of the 
neighboring blocks may require a 
couple of weeks additional, so that 
Negaunee will do well If its prlnolpal 
downtown thoroughfares are complete 
by the middle of August. There will 
be no delay once the asphalt work Is 
started, for the material has been (o 
stock since last year, It having been 
expected that tbe work could be com­
pleted last season. I t was seen, how­
ever, that alt of tbe preliminary work 
could hardly be finished before cold 
weather, so tbe entire task was sus­
pended until this summer.

Woman Can Find a Home

Mrs. L. J. Donaldson, superintend­
ent of Good Will Farm, Houghton, 
who was in Negaunee last week jn the 
Interests of the Institution, stated that 
it had beeo found very difficult to get 
competent household help aod that If 
there was a woman in Negaunee or 
vicinity who could do tbe general run 
of domestic work satisfactorily she 
could find a steady position at good 
wages by communicating with Good 
Will Farm. If It should happen that 
the woman had a child from whom she 
did not wish to be separated this 
would prove no barrier to employ­
ment a t Good Will Farm, for tbe In­
stitution would care for the child as 
well as tbe mother. Any Inquiries 
regarding the matter should bead- 
dressed to: "Mrs, L, J. Donaldson, 
superintendent Good Will Farm, 
HoVighton, Mich.”

Played Three Games

The Maas Mine baseball team play­
ed three games of ball last Sunday and 
were victorious In only oosof tbs ssr. 
las. The first game was played with 
Rivals, of Ishpeming, and was won by 
a score of A to 4. The second game 
wee with the Rexalls-five innings— 
who won out by a score of 6 to l .  
The third game was played in tbs af­
ternoon at ths Maas Mine field with 
the Republic team and resulted In a 
soore of 13 to 3 In favor of the up-the- 
road nine,

Ready to Proceed

Tbe Delta County Itoad Commission 
is ready to proceed at tbe earliest op­
portunity with the location of tbe high­
way tha t will be built to connect the 
present system of roads lo Marquette 
and Delta tountles,and has so notified 
the Marquetlu County Road Commis­
sion. It Is expected that the members 
of both commissions wilt soon hold a 
meeting to dispose of the matter.

C. J. Byrnt Resigns

C. J . Byros, collector of tbe Dis­
trict of Superior, has presented bis 
resignation to tbe treasury depart­
ment and has taken up hit new duties 
as special reprssntatlve lo the state 
for tbe Equitable Life Association. 
With several others, the office of Col­
lector of Customs in Marquette wee 
abolished on July Ut.

Summer Session

The thirteenth annual summer ses­
sion of tbe Northern State Normal 
School opened Monday in Marquette 
and will continue for six weeks, end­
ing August 8th. The enrollment this 
year Is unusually large.

K illed at Butte

James Hodge left here last Monday 
evening for Butte, Montana, In re­
sponse to a telegram announcing the 
accidental death of Garfield Hodge, 
son of Thomas Hodge, in one of the 
mines there. No particulars were giv­
en of the accident, other than that the 
body was terribly mangled. Deceased 
was 22 years of age and was bora In 
Negaunee.

Died in Oregon

John C. Uohrer died at St. Johns, 
Oregon, on June 1st, of stomach 
trouble. Mr. bobrer was born In Ne- 
gauoee and resided here until be was 
twenty years of age, where he remov­
ed .with his parents to Hancock, where 
be resided for twelve years. He bad 
been a  resident of St. Johns for about 
six years and Is survived by bis widow 
and four children. Deceased was a 
brother of A. D. Bobrer, son-in-law 
of Capt. aod Mrs. J . H. Rough.

Raising the Weeds

Tbe Urge market gardens of the 
east are cultivating tbe dandelion 
plants for commercial purposes, and 
the sale of tbe "greens” Is very pro­
fitable. The seeds should be. sown lo 
the spring, as early as possible, and 
given tbe same cultivation accorded to 
carrots except that they require thin­
ning to ten inches apart. Next spring 
tho leaves will be ready to use, and 
should be blanched by placing a cov­
ering of boards, or other material 
over tbs rows. The cultivated kinds 
are much more tender and less bitter 
than tbe wild ooee.—Oconto Enter- 
prtM,

"Sona" Re-Union

The committee In charge of tbe gen­
eral arrangements for the state con­
vention of tbe Sons ot Bl, George, to 
be held In Hancock from July 17 to 19, 
has arranged for a big Corotsb wrest­
ling tournament in connection with 
tbe convention of July 19, and for 
this event have hung up for prises Of 
876, 850, 825 and 810 respectively.

The Hancock lodge is preparing a 
vigorous advertising osmpalgn and 
will let tbe state know something of the 
plans for tbe big gathering there. 
The Hancock lodge has been notified 
that tho Iron country lodges in parti* 
oular expect to go there with nearly 
their entire membership. The order 
Is very strong all through the Upper 
Peolnsula and many visitors are ex­
pected.

The Miller carnival company with 
eighteen shows will be there and will 
bold forth at the driving park. The 
convention Itself will not open until 
July 17', but tbe carnival will be In 
full swing the entire week.

Will go to California

M. T. Murphy, who Is among Ne- 
gaunee’s oldest oltlzeni in point of 
residence, having come hero at ibe 
beginning of tbe 70’s, aod who has 
been eogaged In business here for a 
quarter of a century, bas decided to 
make CaUforhla hli future home and 
will make the change Just as soon us 
he can arrange bis projierty lotortsta 
here. If possible he will dispose of 
his merchandise stock, store, residence 
etc., to someone who wishes to con­
tinue tbe business, but incase this 
cannot be done within a ehort time be 
will close out the business and arrange 
for subsequent disposition of tbe pro­
perty, for he wishes to get out to tbe 
oew location reasonably early lo tbe 
autumn.

Mrs. Murphy and a son, Davlth 
went west to April and are now com­
fortably located lo a cottage at Los 
Angeles, while another son, Kdward, 
is railroad station agent at Nlptoo, 
not a great distance from Dos Ange­
les. Tbe members of tbe family wbo 
are now on the Paclflo Coast are 
greatly pleased with the climate aod 
with conditions lo genera], aod while 
It cornea decidedly bard on Mr. Mur­
phy "to pull up stakes”  lo tbe city 
where be has resided for so long, he 
realises that tbe West offers maoy ad­
vantages and that It la beat for the 
family to be all together In tbe new 
location. Besides Mr. Murphy, the 
members of the family who are still 
In Negaunee are Miss Agnes Murphy 

I auu Ceruld Murphy.

Dr. and Mrs. A. W. Haidle arrived 
home Sunday morning from Lower 
Michigan, where they had speot tbe 
past two weeks with relatives and 
friends. They made tbe trip by boat.

Mrs, John Martin arrived here last 
Saturday from Green Hay to pay a 
visit to her mother and sister, Mrs. 
Gaffney and daughter, Nellie.

Miss Ella Hogan went to Hancock 
last Saturday morning to visit Mrs.
C. Doyle.

Mrs. D. C. McKinnonand daughter, 
of Iron River,arrived here last Satur­
day In their automobile and spent the 
time until Wednesday morning with 
relatives and friends.

Mrs. Lucls Trombley, who came 
here to attend the fuoeral of the late 
Oliver Lacombe, returned to her home 
lo Maple Ridge Monday morning.

J. E. MoCutcheon, who had been 
here on a visit to his sister, Mrs. A. 
H. Knight, departed Sunday evening 
for his home In Chicago.

Mrs. J. R. Slncock arrived here 
Monday from Virginia, Minn.

Mrs, J. H. Rough, Miss Viola Con­
nors, Timothy Hogan and Edward 
Whittington left last Friday on tbe 
steamer Centurion for a trip  on the 
lakes. They were accompanied by 
Miss Ruth Gibson, of Hougbt&o,

Miss Carrie Beyert of Marquette, Is 
visiting in Negaunee.

Miss Mabel Thomas, who Is teach­
ing school In the Copper Country, Is 
here on a visit to her unole, W. J. 
Thomas, and family.

■ Miss May Veroelllno left last Satur­
day morning en a visit to friends in 
Iron Mountain.

Mrs. Thomas McDonald, of Escaoa- 
bas spent last Sunday Id Negaunee 
with her slater, Mrs. Thoms* Connors,

Horraoe White arrived here Mon­
day morning on a visit to his aunt, 
Mrs. Henry Rasmussen.

Mrs. Isaac Mateer, accompanied 
by her two children, Is here on a visit 
to her parenti, Mr. and Mrs. Martin 
Conway.

Dr. and 'M rs. R. Eh Drake, who 
have been located a t Aon Arbor elnce 
last September, returned home last 
Sunday morning, accompanied by 
their sons, Holland and Donald.

John Keenan, one of tbe veteran 
passenger conductors on the North- 
Western road, Is critically 111 In a 
hospital at Stambaugb and no hopes 
are entertained of bis recovery.

Tbor as Brlmacombe speot last 
Saturday In Negaunee visiting hit 
daughter, Mrs. Samuel Stephens, 
Kanter street, while on bis way home 
to Trlmountaln from a visit in Lower 
Michigan. He was accompanied by 
Mrs. Brlmacombe.

Mrs. T. K. Rodgers arrived here 
last Saturday from Ely, Minn , on a 
visit to relatives and friends In this 
city and Ishperalog.

Mrs. W, M. Sterling went to Steph­
enson last Friday to pay a visit to 
her sister, Mrs, Sandford, and re­
turned Tuesday afternoon.

Miss Ruth Mitchell arrived horns 
Saturday from Add Arbor.

Miss Bernadette Lemlre, who bad 
been visiting In Eicanaba, returned 
borne last week.

Dr. and Mrs. J. H. Andrus returned 
last Friday from Chicago.

Mr. and Mrs. E. A, Gamble, wbo 
had been here on ao extended visit, 
departed Tuesday morning for Iron- 
wood.

Amos Saladln, of Marquette, was a 
business caller lo Negaunee on Mon­
day.

Mr. and Mrs. Joseph Slmondi and 
family arrived here last Saturday 
from Chicago* where they navo resid­
ed since leaving here some five o r six 
years ago, and will spend about two 
weeks here visiting relatives and 
friends. Mr. 81mond\ is now engaged 
as one of tbe traveling salesmen for 
the Fox River Distilling Company of 
Mayivllte, Ky.. whose main office Ii 
to Chicago.

Miss Christine Aoderson Is here 
from Nebraska on a visit to her par­
ents and frleods.

Mr, and Mrs. Homer Perry, of Gar­
den Day, are guests at the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. Albert Jaodron In this 
city.

Patrick Doyle came up from Mar­
quette on Tuesday and spent thp day 
with relatives and friends.

Miss Rena Maitland departed Sat­
urday evening for Chloago, where she 
was lo meet her sister, Mrs. J. H. 
Farrell, who Is on her way here from 
California on an extended visit to her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Alexander 
Maitland.

A. F. Willman, Louis Vtlleneuve, 
Julius Johnson and Edward Brandt, 
who left last week for their camp 
near Klug’s Lake, where they did 
some bass fishing, returned Saturday 
evening with a good catch, but were 
thoroughly disgusted with tbe recep­
tion they received from tbe mosquitoes 
and sandfiles. One of the party was 
so fiercely bitten that he was unable 
to see for a time.

Mrs. Charles Johnson and children 
and Mrs. John Curley, who had been 
visiting relatives at Omro, Wls., for 
the past few weeks, returned home last 
Saturday afternoon.

Mr. and Mrs. Philip Hogan are vis­
iting In Springfield, 111. •

Theodore M. Kieren arrived here 
Saturday afternoon from Milwaukee 
accompanied by his daughter,Lillian. 
Mr. Kieren will spend about two 
weeks here visiting his mother and 
•liter, besides putting In a portion of 
bis time soliciting orders for Tbe 
Standard Computing Scales Company 
of Detroit, for which manufacture of 
scales he bas the exclusive agency of 
the state of Wisconsin and the Upper 
Peninsula of Michigan. When at 
hpme in Milwaukee, Mr. Kieren, de­
votes a portion of bis time to his hen­
nery at bis South side home, which If 
just now the Mecca of chioken fan- 
cjsrs, owing to tbe tact that he has a 
tio-montbs-old Blue Barn Rock ohlck 
that hat accomplished the feat cl lay­
ing an egg at that early age. Mr. 
Kt«?eQ fa a fancier of some consider­
able experience, and his hennery Is 
becoming quite popular.

A. P. Gogarn was up from Turin 
6n Tuesday.

Mrs. J . E. Williams Is visiting In 
Marquette, tbe guest of Capt. and 
Mrs. James Piper.

The Misses Ruth Steelo, Jennie De* 
larjfo, Ethel Lee, Bessie Cushing, 
Mary L. Mitchell and Flossie Good­
man are among tbe Negaunee young 
ladles enrolled (or the summer term 
at the Northern State Normal School 
at Marquette.

Miss Ruth Steveos is homo from 
school at Ypsllantl.

Mrs. Dagmar LaVigne aod daught­
er, Dorothy, arrived here yesterday 
morning from Dallas. Texas, where 
they have boen located for several 
months, on a visit to Mrs. LaVlgne’s 
father, Henry Anderson. Mr. Ander­
son and daughter went to Marquette 
yesterday afternoon to spend July 4th 
with relatives.

Mr. and Mrs. J . J. Houierman re­
turned Monday from a visit with Mr. 
Elouserman’i  parenti at Common­
wealth, Wls.

Mr. and Mrs. A. K. Archambeau 
and daughter, Miss Florence, accom­
panied by their guests, Mrs. C. A. 
Young, of Seattle, Wash., aod Miss 
Bertha Couture, of Marquette, visited 
In Negaunee on Sunday. They came 
here In Mr. Archambeau'* automo­
bile.

Mrs. Joseph O'Leary is hers from 
Larlihind on a visit to her mother, 
Mrs, Mllroy.

Hesry Boyer, who speot tbe past 
three weeks here, having taken a 
three weeks'ley off on aocount of a 
sore hand, returned to tali work at 
Kscaoaba Moodaycveolng. Upon ar­
riving a t Esoanaba, Mr. Boyer found 
a mao "on tbe Job,” hence his return 
to Negaunee the following day.

Miss Olivo Vlocent spent last Sun-; 
day with friends In Marquette.

Mrs. M. J, Uackett, of Cobalt, Ont., 
who had been visiting her grand­
mother. Mrs. Mary Ooodman, aod 
other relatives, left Tuesday morning 
to pay a  visit to her former borne at 
tbe Victoria location, In tbe Copper 
Country. Mr. Hackett arrived here 
Wednesday from Cobalt. It is tbe 
Intention of Mr. and Mrs, Hackett to 
take up their residence ttf California 
la tbe near future. Mrs. Hackett's 
parents, Mr. and Mrs, W. H. Good­
man reside at Han Diego, Cala.

Mrs. C. I. Smith arrived here Tues­
day afternoon from Green Bay.

Busy Painters

Wolioer & McCall, who recently 
formed a co-partnership, are just now 
about the busiest men In the city, 
having several orders booked ahead 
for painting and decorating. They 
also make a specialty of alga writing.

Ripening Fast

Wild strawberries are beginning to 
ripen. The weather so far has been 
excellent for the ripening of this favor­
ite wild berry and tbe crop this year, 
should be good. If the present weath­
er oontlnues, raspberry and blueberry 
crops this year should also be of ex­
cellent quality and quantity.

_ K. of C. Picnic

The Ishpeming Council of Knights 
of Columbus are to give a children’s 
picnic at Cleveland grove some Sun­
day afternoon in tbe immediate future. 
This will inolude the congregations, 
old and young,of both Ishpeming and 
Negaunee. Due announcement will 
be made later of the date of the picnic

Bernard Barasa Speaker

The committee in charge of the big 
ItaUan-Amerlcan reunion to be held 
In Calumet on Saturday, July 19 met 
Monday to complete the preliminary 
details of the arrangements. Com­
mittees to re  named to take charge of 
the dlffeaent features of the big re­
union and It was decided to extend an 
invitation to Bernard P. Barasa of 
Chicago, to be tbe principal speaker 
on this occasion. There will be a big 
parade.

Ishpeming's Home-Coming

Ishpcmlng's home-coming week, in 
lieu of the customary Fourth of July 
celebration, promises to be a huge 
success. The Idea hassurely ''taken” 
and dally the trains are bringing in 
former residents who had not beeo 
back to "the old town”  (or periods 
varying from ten to forty years. The 
reunions are by no means the least 
enjoyable features of the week’s pro­
grams, though there are plenty of at­
tractions as well,, among which may 
be mentioned the miners’ rescue and 
first aid exhibitions, tbe fire run, au­
tomobile tour of tbe city for tbe old 
timers, tbe baby parade with sixteen- 
count ’em—pairs of twins and count­
less "singles”  In pushcarts. Negau­
nee has a considerable number of peo­
ple who resided at Ishpeming at one 
time or another and these &ro helping 
to swell the host of "home-comers,” 
while tbe rank and file are taking 
a friendly interest in the neighboring 
city's doings for the week.

Contracts Awarded

The Board of Education on last 
Friday evening opened the bids which 
had been received for the construction 
of tho new manual training building, 
which is to be erected on the site of 
the old Presbyterian church, and for 
tbe plumbing, beating and ventllutlng 
systems which will be Installed.

Seven bids on general construction 
were received, three being Negaunee 
contractors. The lowest bid was 
found to be that of Hlrkley A Lam- 
beau, a Green Bay firm, whoso pro­
posal footed up to  823,304. Tho other 
bids ranged all the way up to 838,(KM).

Though the Lake Superior Steam 
Heating Company, of (ahpemlng, was 
not tbe lowest bidder on beating 
and ventilating, It had the low­
est estimate on plumbing, and 
as ll had] been decided to combine 
the work and Its Joint proposals ag­
gregated less than the combined bids 
ofaD yoftheo tbercon tracto rs.it se­
cured both contracts. Thlicornpany'i 
bid on heating and ventilating was 
8369A and Its bid for plumbing. 81043, 
This firm also had an alternative bid 
which figured 8313 lower and contem­
plated certain changes In tho apeclfl* 
cations, and the board wilt doolde 
later whether It will authorise the 
changes and take advantage of the 
lower bid. Tbe National Regulator 
Company of Chicago secured the con­
tract for beat regulating apparatus on 
a bid of 8798, The Herman Andrae 
Construction Coiupuny of Milwaukee 
will furnish u)l of the electrical work 
required at a cost of 82000.

The formal contracts are now being 
executed and tbe general contractors 
expect to be at work within a week or 
two. Tbe old building had been razed* 
•o that the site Is practically all In 
readiness. The contract calls for tbe 
completion of tbe structure In five 
months, so that there will be ample 
apportunlty for the Installation of 
machinery and final equipment of the 
building, which it la planned to put 
into active service at the beginning 
of the aecoad semester In February.

A Quiet Fourth

It will be a very quiet Fourth of 
July In Negaunee, for the only sem­
blance of a celebration will be confin­
ed to the assiduous efforts of the 
small boy with bis fire crackers dur­
ing the day and the rockets which will 
ascend In tbe evening from tho lawns 
surrounding residences. The mines 
will be closed both Friday and Satur­
day, except for such tasks as are nec­
essarily continuous, aod In the city 
Itself there will be a very general ces­
sation of labor on Saturday as well 
as on Friday, though the provision 
men will keep open on Saturday, it 
having been decided that It would be 
unfair to ask tbe public during tbe 
heated term to stock up for the period 
extending from Thursday evening to 
Monday morning.

Tbe mayor, aldermen and most of 
the other city dignitaries will bo on 
hand In Ishpeming on the Fourth, In 
response to an invitation to help that 
community celebrate its fortieth an­
niversary, and they will be unofficial­
ly amended by a very considerable 
portion of Negsunee’s population. 
Negaunee automobllists will help 
swell the long line of motor vehicles 
In the neighboring city. Thu street 
railway company will provide special 
street car service between Negaunee 
and Isbpemlng throughout the cele­
bration.

Many other people wilt enjoy excur­
sions to places more distant, the 
tbree-day freedom from work afford­
ing an opportunity for visits that is 
Dot available every year.

Lightning Interrupts Feast

A lightning bolt which accompanied 
last Saturday evening’s rain storm 
proved rather disastrous for the office 
of B. J . Goodman at Little Lake, wbllo 
two of Mr. Goodman’s sons and a 
companion bad a close call from seri­
ous injury. Their day's work having 
been done. B. J . Goodman, Jr., 
Booth Goodman and West Sweet, of 
Marquette, were sitting in the office 
about 8 o’clock that evening, having 
a little lunch. It had grown pitch 
dark aod the thunder was booming, 
but the little party was not apprehend­
ing any closer contact with the ele­
ments, when a bolt of lightning 
plumped itself upoo the little build­
ing. There was a flash and a crash 
as tbe atmospheric electricity rent its 
way through the roof, descended 
through the room and burled Itself 
beneath the floor. The force of the 
visitation was seen in the manner In 
which tho boards were broken, while 
In a couple of Instances splinters pen­
etrated sheafs of paper which were 
upon the tables. Mr. Sweet sustained 
quite a severe burn upon one of his, 
arms, while it was an- hour before 
"Bunny” Goodman was able lo con­
vince himself) that he had not been 
permanently deafened. It U a sad 
commentary upon tho brand of sar­
dines served In tho Little Lake locali­
ty, that one of the members of tho 
party first supposed that it was an ex­
plosion of ono of the cans of little fish 
that had caused all the commotion.

School Election

The annual meeting und election of 
School District No. 1- of the city of 
Negaunee, will he held on Monduy, 
July 14th, and the polls will he open 
at tbe city building from 4 to H p. m. 
There Is but one trustee to be elected 
this year, the term of Robert 0 . Jack- 
son being the only oou which expires. 
Mr. Jackson has been asked to stand 
for i-e election for the three-year term 
and as it is quite certain that he will 
have no opposition It rauy be 
safely assumed that he will 
shortly enter upon his twenty-seventh 
consecutive year of service as a mem­
ber of the Negaunee Board of Educa­
tion.

Suess-Bsrry

There have been several social 
functions during the past week in 
honor of Miss Margaretha Huess, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Joseph K. 
Suesi, who is to become tbe bride of 
Oeorgo E. Barry, of Owlnn, on Sat­
urday. Among them were a luncheon 
given last week by Mls<i Myrtle 
Mitcholl and a reception given by 
Mrs. C. V. K. Townsend Tuesday 
afternoon, while Mrs. U. W. Sheldon 
will entertain at cards this (Thurs­
day) afternoon.

B u b er  Shops to Close

Negaunee barber shops will be 
closed throughout the day on the 
Fourth of July. They kept open later 
than usual Thursday evening and will 
be open on Saturday.
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Just what does the "slash*' skirt 
prove!

Baseball Is a good game, provided 
your team wins occasionally.

Alto our notion of a useless occu* 
pation Is that of raising artichokes.

In the barbers' strike riots In New 
York revolvers were employed. Next!

If all jokes were judged by points, a 
big bunch of them would score minus 
sero.

Another much needed Invention Is s 
golf ball that will whistle whenever 
It Is lost

The silk hat has survived a century. 
But the green one—a few months 
should suffice.

When the Balkan states feel like 
borrowing $1,000,000,000, what does 
Turkey feel like?

The dollara aro flowing In for tur- 
tie serum, but where are the absoluto 
proofs of worth?

It Is our notion, however, that the 
world needs simplified talking more 
than simplified spelling.

Los Angeles has two lady "coppers'* 
and It is said to be quite a sensation 
to be pinched by one of them.

After all, why correct the proof 
even If the compositor does sot It up 
vulgar Instead of Bulgar styles.

What a comfort it would be if mos­
quitoes were as fastidious as are rain­
bow trout In the matter of biting.

'Twas a mean man who Insinuated 
that at a suffragette meeting he not 
only heard plain things hut saw ’em.

Pickpockets may conclude to plead 
that In this day of empty purses and 
dollar watches they earn what they 
get.

They say that the taste for Manila 
cigars can be cultivated. Anybody 
who likes artichokes ought to be­
lieve It.

When unnecessary noise Is abol­
ished tbe ploture of a messenger boy 
looking at an automobile born will bo 
pathetic.

What has become of tbe man who 
used to eat strawberry shortcake all 
the time and then wonder what ailed 
his system?

Irrespective of currency reform, 
there should be dough for everybody 
soon. The winter wheat crop baa the 
best of proepects.

An advance of $6 a foot Is an­
nounced In tbe price of show snakes. 
But an advance In the price of tbe 
bar room kind would be better.

This country has Imported $16,000,- 
000 worth of gems since tbo first of 
the proient year. Somebody must be 
trying to square himself with his wife.

The strength with which a man 
wields a piece of bamboo depends up* 
ou whether said bamboo is a compo­
nent part of a carpet beater or a fish­
ing rod.

The statement made that a woman 
saw a soul passing from a dying rela- 
tlvs’s lips Is received by scientists 
with skepticism. Even were such 
a tblug allowed to be possible thero 
aro so many souls so small as to 
be Invisible under any clrcum- 
stances.

"How long slnco you have seen a 
woman darning a pair of aocka?" aaka 
the Cincinnati Enquirer, thus offering 
an admirable topic for tbe historical 
societies.

Tbe nsw British ambassador is re- 
portod to bo a baseball fan, which may 
prove even more influential than prof)* 
cleucy oo the tenuis court or the golf­
ing green.

That all potato cars must be hented 
In winter Is the mandate of the inter­
state commerce commission. There 
must bo a society for the prevention of 
cruelty to the potato.

The bleating at Panama la killing 
the tea serpent This will not do. At 
least oue of the sacred traditions of 
agea must bo preserved from the com­
mercial lcouoclaata of tbo age.

You remember, don't you, that Gau- 
temala borrowed $2,600,000 from 
Great Britain lu I860? Well, Great 
Britain Is unreasonable enough to 
think It la time for Guatemala to 
whack up, and la beginning to be un­
pleasant about it.

One sporting writer aaya that It is 
now anybody'! pennant. But from the 
claim* put forward by the various 
baseball managers wo aro lod to be­
lieve that It la everybody's peunant

Tbo public health bureau says that 
fear of the germs they tuuy contain 
need deter no oue from amassing 
greenbacks as swiftly as possible, 
■Inou the Ink kllla the gorm*. Was 
anyone ever discovered who allowed 
such a fear to koop him poor, aud 
if such a craven-spirited soul exists. 
Is it worth white to reassure him?

H e a d  o i  t h e  C l i f f - B u d d h a

FIGHTING SEA-SICKNESS ~
At last, It is claimed, sea-elckncss Is 

going to bo abolished. The.gyroscope 
is what Is relied upon to accomplish 
ibis exceedingly desirable consumma­
tion. You Install a graduated selec­
tion of these scientific double spln- 
nlng-tops aboard your ship, and forth­
with ahe cedaes to roll, or pitch.

So, at least, says the inventor of 
the apparatus; but tbe ordinary indl* 
vldual will probably "hae his* doota." 
He has heard the same story before.

For Instance, there was the famous 
anti-sea-slck steamer, Bessemer, with 
its adjustable "swinging saloon/' 
which, It was Intended, should always 
preserve a horlsontal floor. As a mai­
ler of fact, the Bessemer rolled worss 
(lion any tramp.

Yet another attempt to overcomfe 
the evil was that made by a French­
man named Basin. In effect, his Idea 
was to construct a  steamer on wheels. 
Not paddle-wheels, be It understood, 
but semi-submerged hollow steel discs, 
which should roll partly through and 
partly over tbe water, bearing the ves­
sel with them. Alas for his hopes! 
Tbe roller boat proved impracticable 
even in smooth water, while In rough, 
for which It was specially designed, it 
simply would not go at all.

LAKE DRIES, THEN REFILLS
Near Lorrach, in the Black Forest, 

Is the strangest lake in the world. It 
Is called the Elchcner See, and Is per­
fectly dry for from ten to thirteen 
years at a time, after which periods 
subterranean springs refill the lake 
without any previous warning, flooding 
and destroying any crops that have 
boen planted. The soil In the bed of 
the lake is very productive, but the 
farmers and peasants never know In 
what year their work will be useless 
and their young crops "drowned." A 
few weeks ago the Elcbener See, after 
having been dry for the last ten years, 
hogau refilling with water, which Id 
the deepest part Is now fifteen feet, 
the average depth being twelve feet. 
The waters of the lake generally re­
main a year or two, and then gradual­
ly disappear into the earth, leaving t 
rich soil behind.

LADIES’ HATS IN KOREA

The strange cllff-Buddha of Kiatang, whose head is here pictured, it 
about 160 feet In height It le full length and the feet are waehed by a foam­
ing mountain torrent. It wae, indeed, to guard agalnet the dangers of the 
raplde here that the figure was cut In the ellff-eide by the life-long labor of a 
•Ingle prleet The rock la rather soft and, as can be seen, there Is much 
earth in the crevices which hae been utilized for a monstrous* growth of hair, 
eyebrows and mustache.

GRAVE OF “ PRINCE" CARROLL

It !■ not unusual for a dog, the pel 
of a family, to be given burial on the 
estate of hla owner, and It often hap­
pens that a tablet of one kind or an­
other la erected to his memory. But 
it la seldom that these things fall to 
the lot of a horse, although In his liv­
ing hours he may have beeu none the 
less faithful to bis master's Interests.

"Prluce" Carroll's life was unusual­
ly happy—If horses can be happy— 
and now his grave la marked by a flue 
monument. Ilia home was at Gorham, 
Me. Hla master, John Carroll, a man 
of means, loved him.

Prince had a playground all hla 
own, where ho dally romped, forget­
ting hla advancing years. And when

he died not long ago John Carroll saw 
to It that he had more th&u a deceit 
burial within plain eight of (li%(’ur- 
rol! homestead. The gravo la marked 
by a monument which bears the in­
scription: “A Loving and Faithful 
Friend, Prince."

HENS THATJ-IATCH FISH
As is generally known, a big quanti­

ty of fish spawn Is annually lost. To 
avoid this, flsb rearers In China care­
fully collect spawn from the surface 
of the water, aud when they have ee- 
cured a sufficient quantity they take a 
number of bens' eggs, tbe contcuta of 
which havo been carefully emptied 
through a small aperture, and refill 
the ahells with the spawn. The holes 
are then sealed up, and tbo eggs put 
under broody hens.

Tbo hona are allowed to Incubate 
the eggs for a certain number of days, 
when the eggs are again broken and 
their content! put Into water that 
has been previously warmed by tbe 
aun. In a very short apace of time 
the spawn hatches, and the young fry 
are then kept In pure, fresh water 
until they attain a sufficient size to 
be put Into tbe ponds containing old­
er fish. The Chinese have loug under­
stood all the Intricacies of Incubation, 
aud were amongst the first to use lu- 
cubators for the hatching of lieni' 
eggs, long before such machlnets were 
made in this country. At one time a 
considerable business was done In 
this style of spawn hatcblug.— Week­
ly Scotchman.

In Locarno on Lake Megglore stands the remarkable painted house 
here shown. The formerly blank slds of the building hae been painted to 
represent the front entrance of a large villa. The Illusion le perfect until one 
has approached very clots to the house. Then inly le It eeen that the loggia, 
the windows with bottle glass panes, the projecting elds column with gar­
goyle and cornice, the foliage on the arbor, the round window under the 
esvee and all the sculptured decorations are merely painted cn a fiat surface 
of cement.

The Illustration shows a Korea 
maid attired In the latest product o 
tbe native milliner. It la probabl 
that to Korean eyes American fen 
lnlne headgear would appear aa out 
l&ndlsh aa this does to oura.

TWICE-PAWNED CROWN
To carry on the war lu the Balkans 

the Turkish government havo pawned 
the crown Jewela, and this has recall­
ed tbe fact that the crown Jewela oi 
England were on at least two occa­
sions placed In the eafe-keeploc of 
"my uncle." They were pawned to tbe 
Lombard merchants of tandon by Ed­
ward 111. In 188k and by Henry V. In 
HU, In both easea (o meet the 
churgee of the raouarebs specially de­
lighted.

Ho far a» la known the croyu Jewels 
of Scotland never aaw tbe Inside of 
the pawnshop, though they were loet 
on one occasion for several years.

BEE SWARM SEIZES AN AUTO
At San Bernardino, Cal., a Ulg 

•warm of beea took possession of an 
automobile belonging to W. H. Rogers, 
which was standing In front of a chop 
bouse. It Is believed the bees mis­
took tbe hood and radiator for a hive. 
It was a long time before they could 
be coaxed Into a box, and the opera­
tion attracted a big crowd, many of 
whom were stung as the result of 
their curiosity.

WORD’S BIGGEST SCREWS
The longest screws In the world 

have recently been turned out of a 
Pennsylvania engineering works. The 
castings are screws used In a machine 
for pressing oil from fish. Each screw 
Is IS feet 4 Inches long, and tbe 
thread upon It la 2SH Inches wide at 
the large end and 20 inches at ths 
small end The sharp on which the 
thread Is formed has a six Inch cor* 
running through Its entire length.

FOR REUNITED PARTY
MOST EARNE8T THOUGHTS OF 

ALL REPUBLICANS NEEDED.

Country Requires the Services of Pa­
triotic Organization Which Has 

So Thoroughly Proved Its 
Worth In the Past

Report of a scheme to capture the 
Republican organisation for Roose­
velt's nomination In 1916 Is Important 
mainly as illustrating the difficulties 
In the way of reuniting tho Repub­
lican party. These obstacles may be 
divided into two classes. There Is, 
first, In each tbe class whose personal 
power and ambition rests In keeping 
control of either Republican or Pro­
gressive faction. There Is further 
the probably much larger class, which 
distrusts any proposition for union, 
because It suspects It as a cloak to 
let the hated enemy into power again.

The reported scheme will affect tbe 
latter class and may be a product of 
the first class for that purpose. But 
It should be understood that no ef­
fective union Is to be attained by 
nominating * any man prominently 
identified with either faction In the 
quarrel of last year. The Republican 
party Is now exactly where the Demo­
cratic party was sixteen years ago, 
and the experience of that party 
showed that the breach could not be 
healed by nominating either Bryan 
himself a second and third time or by 
nominating a representative of the 
opposing wing. It was only when the 
Democracy took up a candidate tvhose 
political growth was entirely subse­
quent and extraneous to the develop­
ment of Bryanism that It was able to 
coalesce sufficiently to take advantage 
of-the Republican split.

Roosevelt would not therefore as a 
Republican candidate unite the Repub­
lican party. We might as well talk of 
uniting it by renominating Taft. Tho 
same Is true of the lieutenants most 
prominent In the factional fight. 
Dixon, Fllnn or Clapp on one side or 
Root, Penrose or Crane on the other. 
Possibly some progressive Republican 
like Hadley, La Follette or Cummins 
might do It. But the probability Is 
decided tbat the mutual Jealousy and 
suspicions will persist, so that there 
will be plenty of time for a man to 
grow up whose name does not recall 
the quarrel of 1912, and who may 
therefore unite tbe Republicans as 
Wilson did tbe Democrats.

But things will have to change de­
cidedly from the preaenj aspect if 
such a plan of union becomes feasible 
before 1920, or perhaps 1924.

Our Amazing Foreign Policy.
The Wilson administration, again*, 

tbe protest of several of the great 
powers, has formally recognised the 
new government of China on the other 
side of the earth.

Tbe provisional government of Mex­
ico, provided by the regularly elected 
Mexican congress, which has already 
been fully recognised by Great Brit­
ain, has not been recognized by the 
United States, although, as our next- 
door neighbor, It has asked for recog­
nition as a help In the suppression of 
Insurrection and brigandage.

Our annual trade with China 
amounts only to $68,984,981.

Our annual trade with Mexloo aggre­
gates $118,762,442.

Besides, about 40,000 American dtl- 
sens live and carry on business In 
Mexico, and more than $1,000,000,000 
of American money la Invested there.

If tbe Chinese government Is over­
thrown, the United States will not be 
seriously or directly involved In the 
catastrophe.

If the Mexican government falls as 
a result of the ludlfference or hostility 
of the United States, the consequences 
will be general chaos and such a de­
struction of life and property as may 
compel American armod Intervention 
and a costly war.—New York Mall.

Bryan Will Not Forget 
"It Is a settled principle of this coun­

try that a platform Is binding upon 
every man tbat runs on tbat plat- 
form," declared Secretary Bryan In his 
Harrisburg address. It's a poor oppor­
tunity that doesn't give him a chance 
to harp on that one-term plank.

Vacuous Bull Moose Mind.
The extreme and eveu vacuous des­

titution of the typical Bull Moose mind 
of any share of the gift for which Rob­
ert Burns prayed—"to seo ourselves as 
others see us"—Is Increasingly evident 
and among alienists Is In a fair way 
to be classed as a recognised variety 
of mental deficiency.

Turn the Other Chsek.
According to Mr. Underwood's warn­

ing to the American manufacturer, If 
the tariff hill smites you turn tbe other 
cheek.

Mutt Be His Plan.
It may as well be understood now 

aa later that harmony schemes whioh 
do not bear the oolonel's O. K, will net 
to  down.—Knoxville Sentinel.

Tbe promised congressional probe 
will doubtless locate an unlooked-for 
number of Democratic needles in tbe 
tlril service haystack.

His Dlvldand.
Parent—Now, what are you going 

I t  charge me to oure this boy of tbo 
peaalea?

Pbyalelan—Nothing at all, dear air, 
m  it la an original case; aud you get 
ptur ten per cent, commlaaiou for 
•very child that catches them from 
him.—-Puck.

"I gase within your eyes and dream 
Ot glorlea there are yet to gain;

In fancy I can aea the gleam 
Of sunlit palaces in Spain;

Their splendid towers cleave the air. 
And you are gentle mistress thero.

“Within your soulful eyes I  gate 
And dream of gallant armored knights} 

I live in other, glorious days.
My fancy soars to splendid heights:

I see you flaunt my colors thero 
Where knights are brave and ladles fair*

*T look within your deep, dark ey#>,
And fancy carries mo afar.

Where proudly floating standards rise. 
And undefeated legions are:

With you to sweetly bid me dare.
II dream th a t I  am leader there.”

The lady heaved a sigh or two.
And said: "How splendid it would seem. 

And how 'twould pay us both If you 
Could act as well as you can dream!” 

He ceased to babble then and there 
Of gallant knights and ladles fair.

An Incentive.
"Now, my boy," said the bead of the 

firm, "If you will attend strictly to 
your duties I will do something fine 
for you. I want you to always ask, 
when you answer the telephone, who 
It la before you let It be known 
whether I am here or not, and always 
be careful, when people come here, 
to find out who they are and what they 
want before you come Into the private 
office to learn whether 1 wish to see 
them or not."

"Yes, air,” replied the new office 
boy, "I understood. I had to do that 
where I worked before."

"Very well. See that you make no 
Mistakes, and, as I have said, 1 will 
do something nice for you."

"What are you goln' to do for me It 
I glvo satisfaction—raise me wages?”

"Well, I can’t promise that, exactly, 
but I'll bring you the score cards of 
tbe ball games and let you make an 
album of them if you tend to buslnesv 
properly. I never miss a game."

Whsn You Have Gained It.
You press ahead to gain success,

And far away you see a  goal;
But are you touched by tenderness, 

And have you gladness In your soulf

You plunge ahead day after day,
You have no time to jest or pause!

But do you leave along tbe way 
111 will for you or for your cause f

Long, long ago you made your start, 
Aud you have traveled far and fast;

But have you kindness In your heart 
And their respect whom you k'sve 

passed?

You view your goal afar; you press 
Unscarred ahead where others fall;

But are you sure 'twill be success 
Wheu you have gained It, after all T

Mildly Anxious to Know.
"I have crossed tbe Atlantic twenty 

times," boasted the man from New 
York.

"Have you?" replied tbo mao from 
Chicago. "My record beats that."

"Ob, really? How many times havo 
you boon over?"

"I’ve never been over at all; but 
I've set foot In every state in the
Union."

"Quite remarkable. By tbe way. 
old chap, bow many states are there 
now?"

Almost Spoiled It.
"Time has boon very kind to you* 

he said when they met, after the lapse 
of years.

"If is very good of you to say so,” 
•he replied, making no offoit to con­
ceal her pleasure.

"Not at all, not at all. One is al­
ways justified In straining a point if 
necessary to spread bap—I mcau I 
oouldn't truthfully say anything else."

Her Father’s Idea of I t  
"Why, I didn't know your daughter 

waa musical, Mr. Wagataff."
"Bho isn't. Bho's merely giving me 

a  obance to help support a  muslo 
teacher who would probably be too 
proud to depend on charity."
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IN BANKER’S HANDS
Postal Savings System Under 

Man of Experience. 1

Former Governor Dockery. Who De-
voted Many Years to the Bank* 

Ing Business, Now Super* 
vises the Deposits.

Washington.—For the first time 
since its Inception the postal savings 
system is to be administered by an 
experienced banker. Third Assistant 
Postmaeter Goncral Dockery, before 
he became interested in wider politi­
cal life, was In the banking business. 
As far back as 1866 be organised with 
the assistance of a coterie of his 
financial friends the Farmers’ Ex­
change bank of OaJlatin, Mo. Later 
he became its cashier and remained 
such until 1888.

While In many respects the postal 
savings depositories are widely differ* 
ent from banking institutions, Id the 
ordinary acceptance of the term, still 
there is much similarity noticeable, 
and for this reason, more than for 
any other, it is said, Postmaster Gen­
eral Burleaon waa Influenced to call 
to bta aaaiatance in the administration 
of the new system that means so much 
to the saving population of the coun­
try the experience of a trained banker.

The last reports that may be said to 
be complete thus far cover the system 
up to March 81 last At that time 
there were 18,688 depositories, located 
at 12,160 postofflcea, of which 8,282 
were of the presidential class and 
2,238 were fourth-class offloea. The 
number of depositors at that date ap­
proximated 886,000, and the amount 
on deposit about 282,600,000, or an av­
erage of about 8100 per depositor.

Alexander M. Doektry.

About $21,600,000, or more than three- 
fifths of the entire deposits,' were held 
In 851 postofflees, each of which re­
corded deposits amounting to 216,000 
or more; 216,000,000, approximately, 
was held In 87 offices, each bolding 
about 2100,000 or more.

New York leads (he list with de* 
posits amounting to 22,866,049, with 
Chicago seoond. $1,689,024; Brooklyn 
third, with $876,091, and Portland, 
Ore., the leading city in the west, fifth, 
with 2718,746. Washington ranks twen­
ty-seventh, with 2168,660, and Astoria, 
Ore., the lowest on the scheduled list, 
thirty-seventh, with 2107,866.

In addition to this big sum la de­
posits, representing the savings of the 
country, so far as the postal system 
Is ooncerned, $2,889,120 of the depos­
itors’ savings have been converted 
luto Interest-bearing IH  per oent. 
United States bonds.

While the faith of the United States 
government is specifically pledged to 
the return of the money when demand* 
<ul. the deposits, under the law, are' 
for the most part tn solvent banks or­
ganised under national or state laws 
and subject to national or stats su­
pervision, Including savings banks and 
trust companies doing a banking busi­
ness. Of these 7,848 institutions have 
qualified as depositories, including 
8,808 national banks, 8,412 stats banks, 
401 savlugs banks, 678 trust compa­
nies and 64 “organised’’ private banks.

A story Is going tbs rounds on Sec­
retary of the Navy Josephus DanleM.

It Is said that aft- 
SnOUld Change er an experience
His Uniform. !n » Washington

hots! wbsrs be 
was to be one of the principal speak* 
era at a banquet tbs North Carolina 
secretary remarked that b t Is meant 
for the life of a country town.

Arriving at tbt hotel, so the story 
goes, Secretary Daniels took an *1* 
vator for the banquet hall, where h i 
was met by a distinguished looking 
man who apparently was a foreigner.

With typical southern oourtesy, tbs 
navy secretary bowed.

"I’m glad to eee you," he said. 
“That foreign persona of distinction 
should take an Interest in our poli­
tics is gratifying to me. We are a 
new people, air, but—”

“The distinguished looking man” In­
terrupted with—

’’Name und number, bleaaeT" 
“Name and number?” repeated Mr. 

Deniels. “Whet number?"
”Ze teat number.” answered the 

other. “Eaf you gif me that, I’ll find 
your teat for you.”

"Are you a waiter?” asked Mr. Dan- 
M s with amassment.

“If you bleaae, sir.”
"Then, by George, you should 

■Benge your uniform so I could tell 
you from the guests of honor,” said 
Mr. Daniels.

William C. Redfleld, secretary ot 
commerce, in commenting on the de- 

tailed figures con* 
E xports and  cernlng the irn-
Im ports Bia. ports and ®*p°rU

r  * of the United
States for the month of March and 
the nine months ended March, said: 
"The figures are striking, both In
their magnitude and in their details. 
The aggregate business, Inward and 
outward, of the United States with 
foreign countries for the nine months 
was a little in excess of $3,300,000,000 
—an Impressive total, which if main­
tained at the same rate would bring 
the business for the entire fiscal year 
well In excess of $4,100,000,000.

"Great Britain is our largest cue* 
toraer, buying from us over $478,000,- 
000, and selling us over $234,000,000, 
an aggregate for the nine months In 
excess of $712,000,000, or a total bus! 
ness of nearly $80,000,000 a month. 
Canada Is our second best customer, 
buying from us $300,000,000 in nine 
months, equal to nearly $1,300,000 
every working day. A pretty fair cus­
tomer, that. Then Germany comes 
third, buying $268,000,000 from us in 
nine months and selling us $146,000,- 
000. She Is a pretty fair customer, 
too—buys over $1,000,000 a day. And 
fourth comes France, to whom ws 
sold $120,000,000, and from whom we 
bought $112,000,000.

“The figures for the entire nine 
months are such as to give just pride 
to every thoughtful Amerioan to 
whose notice they come. Out of the 
total transactions of $3,800,000,000 
there Is a balance in our favor of a 
little over $600,000,000. Doing pretty 
well, that. But a few comparisons 
with 1913 make It look even better. 
For example,' our sales of manufac­
tures for further use in manufacturing 
Increased over $66,000,000 and our 
sales of manufactures ready for use 
Increased over the same period last 
year $88,600,000, an Increase In these 
two lines of manufactured goods alone 
of over 1114,600,000, as compared with 
the same period of last year.”

Pointing to the number of deaths 
from typhoid fever for tbs year 1911 

as being the low- 
Typhoid D63th est on record, a
Toil Reduced. etatement of the

bureau of the cen­
sus declares, however, that this Is far 
In excess of the mortality from this 
cause In progressive European coun­
try. This reduction. It says, “Indi­
cates that the public health officials 
of the country and the people who 
support their efforts are awakening 
to the necessity of wiping out this
filth disease.”

The statement declares that In 1911 
there were 12,461 deaths from this 
cause In the registration area. This 
Is a death rate of 21 per 100,000 com­
pared with 23.6 the year previous.

Lower death rates are also noted in 
tuberculosis, measles, soarlet fever.
cancer, Infantile paralysis and organic 
diseases of the heart.

Increases were ebown in the deaths 
irom pellagra, suicide end violent 
deaths excluding suicide.

The Increase in the mortality from 
pellagra was large, according to the 
statement. During the early part of 
the decade, 1900 to 1909, the reported 
mortality from tbie disease wav in­
significant, two deaths being returned 
for 1900, two for 1908 end one for 
1904. For 1908, 23 destbs were re­
turned, all of which occurred In south­
ern cities. A largs increase was 
shown in 1909, during which 116 
deaths were reported, aad a still larg­
er Increase for 1910, when 368 deaths 
wers reported as due to this disease. 
The mortality of 669 for 1911, as com­
pared with 368 for 1910, Indicates an 
Increase of 79 per cent.

An Important statement in the cen- 
•us bureau’s paper Is that organic 
diseases of the heart In 1911 caused 
more deaths, 81,636, than any other 
disease or group of diseases shown 
In the abridged international list, al­
though* the number of deaths from 
tubsrculosls of all forms, 94,106, was 
considerably greater. However, the 
deeth rate from organic heart trouble 
In 1911 was slightly lowsr than that 
for ths preceding year, but the rate 
for these two years Is declared to be 
much higher than that of previous 
years.

After reading that so many congress- 
men had obtained their election to the 

bouse of represen-
I t W a t C a te  tatlvee “without
Of N eoenlty. spending a.dollar”

'  it was refreshing
to hear one southern member tbe 
other day admit to a few lutlmstes
that if be were haled before tbu bar 
of Justlos ha would have to acknowl- 
tdgs that he had bought votes to se­
cure his nomination and election.

“It was a case of neoesslty, though,” 
ha added, “because my opponent wae 
doing the same thing.”

Ths congressman want on to relate 
an Incident of tbe last November elec 
tlons.

“I overheard my oampalgn manager 
talking with one of his assistants. Ths 
lattsr was protesting that a voter had 
taxed him $6 for his vote.

“My manager exclaimed angrily: ’I 
won’t* stand (or It. It la an outrage. 
Ws have never paid more than 98 for 
hla vote. Hut then I suppose the other 
side has been after him. However, 
before we let the other party get him 
I reckon we will have to meet hla fig­
ure. Hold him down, though, If you 
can.’ ”

A new member of congress who was 
present was frankly smssed.

“Suppose detectives should have 
heard your manager admit he was 
buying votes?”

"Well," replied tbe other, “detoc 
tires did coma to my district once, but 
ths sheriff arrested them for carrying 

ieoacealed weapons

G O O D
J O K E S A

CAUSE FOR DISGUST. HOT ONE.

The christening party consisted of 
tho proud father, the baby—a girl— 
tho grandfather and the rest of the 
folks. The grandfather stood nearest 
the priest during the ceremony.

“What’s the child’s name?" asked 
the priest of tbe grandfather at the 
appropriate moment.

“I dunno," the grandfather replied. 
And he turned to the father and whis­
pered hoarsely: “What’s Its nameT”

"Hazel,” replied the father.
“What?” asked tbe grandfather.
“Hazel,” repeated the father.
The grandfather threw up his hands 

In disgust.
“What d’ys think av that?" he ask* 

ad the priest. “With the calendar av 
the saints full av gur-rl names—an* 
him namin' his after a nut!’’—Satur­
day Evening Post

, His Willing Tributt.
“Judge, we are getting up a little 

book, to be made up, for the most part, 
of voluntary testimonials from dls* 
tingulshed citizens who honor us by 
carrying their Ilfs Insurance In our 
company. We shall be very glad to 
have one from you. Would you mind 
telling me in a  few words bow you 
cams to insure with us?”

“Not at all, sir. Your agent was 
hounding me nearly to death. For six 
weeks be had made my Ilfs a burden. 
I gave him my application for life in­
surance Just to get rid of him.”

GREAT FAVOR.

Mrs. Farmer—If I give you a meal 
what will you do for me?

Weary Willie—Well, mum, I’ll let 
you name de baby efter met

Tragedies Told In Headlines.
“Husband Tries to Wash Dinner 

Dlshee; Smashes $47 Worth of China.”
“Candidate for Initiation Thinks Cer­

emony Too Rough; He Makes a Wreck 
of Lodge Room.”

“Ballplayer Whose Sweetheart Is 
Watching Him From Grand Stand Be­
comes Nervous; Loses Game."

“Gay Lothario Weds in Haste; Finds 
Jle Has Married Widow With Seven 
Children.”

"Man Who Has Sworn Off From 
Smoking Wins Six Boxes of Cigars at 
Raffle.”

Investigating for Himself.
It was in the suburbs.
"Sir, why are you climbing all these 

trees?”
“Well, I’m a-retlred business man, 

Just retired."
"Yes.”
“Been reading poetry all my life 

and taking their statements on trust 
I don’t like to take anything on trust. 
Poets have always given me to under­
stand that there are no birds In last 
year's nests. Now I’m climbing s few 
tree* to ascertain If this statement is 
strictly true.”

JUST REWARD.

Weary Willie—Dat’s de worst pie I 
irer tasted.

Mrs. Jones—Wslt Just'd minute and 
i’ll give you a dollar. That pie wae 
baked by my husband’s mother.

The Chap—Your refusal of me has 
broken my heart.

The Heiress—I’m truly sorry. Is 
(here nothing I can do except marry 
you?

The Chap—No, but if you could lend 
me s  couple of hundred thousand I 
might feel that I had only half lost 
you.

In London.
My lady beckoned to the butler.
“Dobson,” she said In a half whisper 

as he bent to catch her commands, “I 
wish you would take particular pains 
to see that Mrs. Busby-Burnem at the 
far end of the table gets an ample 
helping of everything. Make It a dou­
ble helping if neceaaary, Dobson. She 
seems to have an extraordinary appe* 
tite.”

Tbe butler nodded.
“Yes, me lady.” He bent a little 

lower. "I’m told, me lady, that she’s 
preparing for quite a stay in Jail.”— 
Cleveland Plain Dealer.

Mother Talks Plainly.
“Daughter, I want yon to be nice to 

that young druggist. He will make 
you a good husband.”

“He isn’t  the kind of man I want 
to marry.”

“I know the kind you want to mar­
ry,” retorted the mother, picking up a 
paper-backed novel. "You want to 
marry either a duko or a gentleman 
Raffles, but there are none In your 
set. Now you look at that young 
druggist with kindly eyes.”

And daughter subsequently did.

Who’e Who and Why.
"Who’s that Impressive looking 

woman over yonder?"
-T hat’s Mrs. Psckum. She’s a re­

markably strong-minded woman, and 
they do say that she commands a very 
large salary."

"How does she earn it?”
”8he doesn’t earn It. Her husband 

earns it and so she commands it.”— 
Puck.

IN THE GALLERY.

He—These are my aooestors. 
She—Are they all dead?
He—Why, certainly.
She—How fortunate.

Taking Ne Chanosa.
Gsnlal Squire—Many happy r»  

turn*, William. I was Just going to 
call on you with a  little bit of to* 
bacco.

William (aged eighty)—Thank yo 
kindly, sir, but I be done wl’ smokin’.

Genial Squire—Why, bow’s that?
William—Well, I’ve beard that be- 

tween eighty and ninety la a ticklish 
part of a  man’s life, so I be UkU’ 
no chances.—London Punch.

Endless Fight
“My old barber has left tbe city.” 
"You eeem very regretful.”
’’Yen; he’s been trying to sell me a 

bottle of hair tonlo for the past fifteen 
years and so far I had succeeded In 
standing him off. Now 1 shall have to 
■ta r t the battle all over with a new 
man.”

Value ef the Lingo.
"Learn to speak French. Then 

things wen’t cost so much In Parle.” 
"Oh, you can’t make ’em think you 

a r t  a Frenchman.”
"No; but sometimes you can make 

’em think you are a Russian or a 
Spaniard.”

A Second Edison.
Farmer—Yes, sir, that hired man of 

mint is one of the greatest inventors 
of the century-

City Boarder—You don’t  say 1 What 
did he invent?

Farmer—Petrified motion —Judge

Bit at See.
Mrs. Jokeemlth (giving hubby a  

Mp)—You might write something witty 
about the boat shaped hats women ore 
wearing this season.

Jokeemlth -J guess I won’t  put my 
ear la

Occasional Visitors.
▲  notable housekeeper of the last 

generation, before the days of screens, 
had Just announced that sha never 
had any flies.

“But, Aunt Augusta,” faltersd the 
timid visitor, ”!t seems to me that I 
saw a few In the dining-room.”

“Oh, those,” replied her aunt, with 
a  majestlo wave of the hand, “were 
the neighbors’ flies. Thsy coma In 
occasionally. But, as I was saying, 
we never have any ot our own.”— 
Youth’s Companion.

✓

PRESIDENT WILSON’S BUSINESS MANAGER
A nyund, elecutiouary eye, blue in 

color, and an oratorical mouth, the 
human appraiser 
would say, it 
there were such a 
specialist, as be 
wrote the items 
dow.n on  t h o  
schedule of as- 
aetac^To which he 
would add, as he 
proceeded to in­
ventorize features 
and surface char- 
asterlstica, a good, 
tuneful voice, ring­
ing and robust in 
both tbe higher

and lower registers.
In like manner ho would specify two 

military shoulders, an energetic man­
ner, a sky-biuo necktie, a flax-colored 
mustache and a pair of thick, mahog­
any-colored side-whiskers. Drawing 
a linn at the bottom of the column he 
would total tbe whole into William 
Cox Redfleld, the new secretary of 
commerce and the personal tariff coun­
selor of President Wilson.

A propensity for getting money and 
a talent for putting his active and pro­
gressive thoughts into language have 
removed Mr. Redfleld from the over­
crowded ranks of mediocrity.

Once Mr. Redfleld was a teacher and 
the superintendent of a Brooklyn Sun­
day school for 20 years. All he had to 
do In politics was to change his sub­
ject, and, possibly, bis cost and cravat, 
and then go ahead. Still it must be 
admitted that he has the gift of speak­

ing exceptionally eloquently.
Two years ago Mr. Redfleld came to 

the house of representatives. It is a 
principle in business that nothing over­
takes the sensitive man who looks and 
stands back. Tbe firing line of com­
merce has Its own methods and point 
of view. Likewlso Its own casualties, 
which Is an essay In Itself. Mr. Red- 
field, besides, was filled with prin­
ciples battling for utterance. He talk­
ed in congress right off. Better still, 
he was heard. He was a manufactur­
er. Money canie at his heck and call. 
Maybe he would reveal the secret.

Moreover, he was precise. Once ho 
was a bookkeeper and a cent even 
could unbalance his accounts. By habit 
and by Instinct he abomlnati-d errors 
of fact as be saw tho truth. So be 
took the floor when ho thought he 
heard them and slew them on the 
spot. Wherefore he was also re* 
spected and privately feared.

The secretary of commerce invest!* 
gates the organization and manage* 
ment of corporations. He has no au­
thority, however, over railroads. Fur­
thermore, he is directed to scrutinize 
and foster commerce. He Is the busi­
ness man, It might be said, at th e  
solemn table of the president's coun­
selors. His eye, In a way, is supposed 
to be on iron, steel, oil, sugar, tobac­
co, and other products more or less 
monopolized. The detection of cor­
porative lawbreakers, because be must 
know their management, Is one ot tbe 
duties he (s required to perform. Their 
prosecution la the employment of thv 
attorney general.

PRIVATE SECRETARY OF WILLIAM J. BRYAN
The duties of the private secretary 

are more onerous, if not more im­
portant, at the 
b e g i n n i n g  of 
an administration 
than at any other 
time. Also In 
most instances in 
the present ad­
ministration the 
p r i v a t e  secre­
taries, like the 
meu (bey serve, 
are new to their 
places.

As Mr. Bryan 
is premier of tbe 
cabinet, so to bis 

new secretary falls the honor of being 
premier of tbe corps of private sec­
retaries. This honor came not through 
seniority. There are other private 
secretaries who have been in serv­
ice many years, while Manton M. Wy- 
veil was appointed only recently. Out 
be Is rapidly acquiring experience, for 
regardless of tbe fact that the ap­
pointing powers of the secretary of 
state are the most limited of any of 
tbe ten cabinet members, the principal 
attack of tbe offleeseekers has cen­
tered about Mr. Bryan’s office. It 
requires a mau of cast Iron nerve and 
extended experience in tbe buffer busi­

ness to fill the position of private see* 
retary to William J. Bryan.

Secretary Bryan picked Mr. Wyvell 
on tbe ground, primarily, of bis per­
sonal fidelity. Mr, Wyvell la a Bryan 
devotee. Nearly 13 years ago, when 
Mr. Bryan was making his second 
campaign for tbe presidency, be dis­
covered Mr. Wyvell, then a student a t 
Cornell, and president of the Cornell 
Bryan club, an organization of vast 
activity and limited membership.

Now, Cornell Is one of tbe most pro  
llflc of tbe American universities In 
the production of Republican gradu­
ates. Tbe principles enunciated from 
tbe chair long held by Audrew D. 
White, were distinctly antl-Bryan, and 
It occurred to tbe anti-imperialist lead­
er of 1900 that a man who could de­
velop Bryanlsm in tbe atmosphere ot 
ltbaca, must have the real sp irit 
There and then he picked upon Wy* 
veil as his disciple, and such Wy­
vell has remained until on March 6 he 
reaped bis reward by being called to 
serve bis leader In the confidential ca­
pacity of private secretary.

Mr. Wyvell is still young, hardly 
thirty-five, but be has been In politics 
ever since be left college. Last fall 
be ran for congress, but wae defeat­
ed. His new position is bis first fed­
eral appointment.

DAUGHTER OF KAISER WEDS PRINCE ERNEST
When the Princess Victoria Louise, 

Emperor William s only daughter and 
the apple of bis 
*ye, became the 
bride of Prince 
Ernest af Cumber­
land a few daya 
ago, she was at­
tended by a bevy 
of young women 
as distinguished 
(or tbetr beauty 
as for their ex­
alted rank.

At tbe wedding 
were assembled 
proud monarebs 
and tbetr glitter­

ing suites; kings and ruling princes of 
that mighty confederation of which 
the kaiser Is tbe chief; special en­
voys laden with Jeweled orders, 
queens end princesses famed for tbelr 
pulchritude, shining with priceless 
gems, decked lu superb costumes.

And in this surrounding were group­
ed tbe bride and her four bridesmaids, 
fresh, blushing, fragrant, like rose­
buds set In a gaudily-enameled vase.

"I shall choose my bridesmaids,’’ 
said the girl whom Berliners have de­

lighted to call "Priuzesscben,” "little 
princess." And her royal and lmp> 
rial father, who bows to nobody else 
on oartb, bowed bis assent.

Princess Victoria Louise has chosen 
well. Her bridesmaids were Princess 
Mary of England, King Edward’s 
daughter; Grand Duchess Olga of Rus­
sia, tbe czar’s daughter; Princess Y<v 
lands of Italy, King Victor Emman­
uel’s daughter, aud Princess Elisabeth 
of Uoumaula, daughter of Prince Fer­
dinand, heir presumptive to the Rou­
manian throne.

Theta princesses are of distinct 
typos of loveliness. Princess Mury, 
who is second cousin of the bride, Is 
fair haired, with tbe ruddy, healthy 
compisxlon of which so many Eng­
lish girls boast. Princess Mary wae 
sixteen years old laet month. Grind 
Duchess Olga will be eighteen years 
old next November; she, too, is a seo* 
ond cousin of Princess Victoria Louise. 
Tbe grand duchess Is a pronounced 
biunette, with somber hair and eyes. 
Princes Elisabeth of Koumanla. who Is 
nearly twenty, is of tbe brilliantly 
clear Caucasian type, and is almost as 
lovely as her mother, tbe famous 
Princess Marie.

CUBA’S NEW PRESIDENT A CORNELL GRADUATE
Gen. Mario G. Meuoca) was a few 

*d us president of 
Cube. In bis in­
augural address 
the new executive 
contented himself 
with the declare 
tiou that be will 
devote ail his en­
ergies to giving 
tbe oountry a 
clean business ad- 
m in  I s t r a t ion, 
which will foster 
tbe industries of 
tbe Island and de­
velop Its splendid 
resources, which 

will welcome foreign capital and Im­
migration and maintain friendly relfr 
tlons with all natlooi, especially wtth 
the United States, to which Cuba ie 
»o olosely linked by bonds of mutual 
affection sad interest.

General Menocal was born In 1866 
at Jaguey Grande, Matansas province. 
His family moved to tbe United States 
and be wae educated io tbe military 
tollege of Washington and at Cornell 
^Diversity. He graduated from Cor 
Sell as a civil engineer. Upon leav­
ing ltbaca be went with ble uncle, 
\nioeto O. Menocal, chief of ths en­

gineering staff which made the sur­
vey of the Nicaragua canal, and 
worked with bim. lie returned to 
Cuba as an engineer for a French 
company. At Santa Crus hn Joined 
the (evolutionary forces as a private 
and rose rapidly until bn became gen­
eral of division. His military record 
waa brilliant; be rendered great serv­
ice to the Americans at tbe time of 
tbe Spanish evacuotion, and Qeueral 
Ludlow, civil governor of Havana 
province, appointed him chief of po* 
lice of Havana, a position requiring at 
that time great tact and ability. He 
uenaged a large sugar estate until a 
few weeks before bis inauguration.

Wise taw  Rsfuted.
Mrs. Vastles Rich (sentimentally)— 

Leogfellow says: "We cannot buy 
with gold the old associations.”

Vasties Rich—Don’t you believe it, 
my dear. When I was on politics 1 
found that cash would purchase the 
anclentest organisation on earth.— 
Llfe.

Seen Dons.
”lf you’ll glvs Tblckwlt time b e t  

tell you all he knows.”
“I’d give him sbout two mioutea t*r 

lhaL”



I

\

—  PUBLISHIP BT̂ —

THE NEGAONEE PRINTING COMPART.
THOMAS J .  FLYNN, President,

FRED DOUGHERTY, 
Treasurer and Managing Editor.

hubschjption, | 3.oo Pbh Year

Entered as mall matter of tbe second class 
Id tbe Posiofficeat Negaunee. Mich.

Friday, July 4th, 1913.

Taking Vacations

Increased warmth aod summer 
■porta are a reminder that tbe time Is 
at band for taking vacation*. Ap*" 
pveotly  with each succeeding year 
tbe vacation teaion open* earlier and 
lasts longer for those able to afford 
It. But, as in former years, hosts of 
people will spend immense sums on 
their holidays and yet for all that will 
not in a true sense enjoy a holiday. 
They will burden themselves with all 
maoner of things, and Instead of es­
caping cares they will carry their 
baggage. Let everyone reflect that 
there can be no real holiday unless 
there Is freedom from care. As well 
carry a coffin around as carry worries 
aod cares.

Charter Revision Task

The municipal charter revision com* 
mission held a session at tbe fire en­
gine bouse last Tuesday evening and 
tbe mayor and aldermen were present 
for an ioforma! discussion of prelimi­
naries preparatory to getting down to 
actual work on the task, Tbe com­
mission was anxious to get tbe views 
of tbe counciimen on tbe most desira­
ble form of government forNegaunee, 
and there waa considerable inter­
change of opinion, the proceedings 
being wholly informal, but tbe alder* 
men seemed to be rather chary about 
making any definite recommendations, 
tbe majority of them it&tiog that 
while they had given the subject 
thought la a  general way, they did 
not feel that they had gone into the 
details sufficiently to enable them to 
go on record with any suggestions at 
tbia time. The charter commis­
sion expects to bold another meeting 
next Tuesday evening, and it  la prob­
able that a definite line of procedure 
will have been mapped out by that 
time.

Look Out for Tetanus

Or. M. L. Holm, state bacteriolog­
ist, is out with a warning to boys and 
girls and their parents against tbe use 
of fireworks. In Michigan, duriog 
tbe last ten years, there have been re­
ported eighty deaths from tetanus, re­
sulting from Fourth of July Injuries. 
Dr. Holm says:

Statistics show that approximately 
10 per cent of tbe injuries from blaolc 
cartridges result in fatal tetanus and 
hence an injury from a blank car­
tridge, unless the patient is treated 
with tetanus antitoxin, is more dan­
gerous than an attack of typhoid fe­
ver. The average period intervening 
between the Injury and tbe outset of 
symptoms of tetanus is about seven 
days, but may vary between 6 and 15 
days. In those cases where the symp­
toms appear early,fatal results almost 
lovarianly follow, aod where tbe symp- 
tome appear later tbe outlook Is gen­
erally more encouraging, but tetanus 
should always be regarded as a very 
serious disease, aod ail preventive 
measures should be utilised, a t  there 
is no treatment which may be relied 
upon for a cure.

In caee of injury here Is what Dr. 
Holm stye to do:

Every penetrating wouod caused by 
blank shells, firecrackers or other ex* 
plosives is a potential tetanus iofec- 
tloo, and should be referred to a com­
petent physician, who will io)ect 1,600 
units of tetanus antitoxin, and should 
treat and dress the wound according 
to indications.

Chance to  go into Buaineaa

Having decided to remove to Cali­
fornia, I offer for sale my property 
aod business at iron and Tobin streets 
on exceedingly advantageous term*.

The store location Is one of the best 
In the city aod the bustoesi has been 
and continue* to be profitable. Con­
nected with the store Is a residence 
which h is  been recently completed aod 
equipped with modern Improvements. 
Smaller buildings ut toe Jackson 
street end of the lot bring good ren­
tal. This offer include* merchandise 
stock and business good will- all at a 
moderate figure if taken at once.

It Is an unusual opportunity for 
anyone contemplating engaging In 
bn sloes* or for anyone seeking a 
change of location. If you are nt all 
interested, do not put off making in­
quiry until it Is too late.

M. T. Mu w h y .

—Special holiday rales arc now lo 
force 00 ai) the railroads.

—Marquette has ION automobiles— 
amont them thirty “ Fords."

Every Farm er Muit
Have something to kei'i) hi* animals 

healthy. Those whous*,nAKVKLL,S 
CONDITION 1‘OWDKK huvu no 
trouble, i t  keep# working horses 
sound, purifies the blood, put* on llesh 
and nmkHS the coat imouth und glossy 
A* u poultrv powder tb'*r» 1" no bet- ' 
to r . Jt wards off disease, brightens | 
the plumage aod Incrcas**# the yield 
of * ggs. [Vice 2/icU. Hold bv J. K. ! 
O'Donoghu*, City Drug Store.

The Best lledlolne In the World
“ My little girl bad dysentery very 

bad. I thought she would die. 
Chamberlain's Colic, Cholera aod 
Diarrhoea Remedy oured her, and I 
can truthfully say that I think it Is 
the beat medlclnelo tbe world," writes 
Mrs. William Orvis, Clare, Mich. 
For sale by J . E. O’Dooogbue.

Going and Coming of People

Abel Levine arrived home Wednes­
day morniog from a business mission 
to Chicago.

Miss Rachel Lehman was a passen­
ger Tuesday night to Crosby, Minn., 
where she will visit relatives.

Miss Amelia M. Amoolno departed 
Monday on a visit to relatives in Iron 
River and Green Bay.

Mr. and Mrs. J. Rytkoneo are vie- 
Itlog relatives at Iron River.

8. O. Clinton, superintendent of 
Baraga schools, was a caller In Ne- 
gaunee on Monday. Mr. Cllntoo la 
teaching at tbe summer term of the 
Northern State Normal School at 
Marquette.

Dr. John A. Winter is here from 
Duluth to spend the Fourth of July at 
tbe family home.

John Dwyer.formerC. & N. W. sec 
tlon foreman, was up from Escaoaba 
Tuesday afternoon, having had some 
railroad work to look after during tbe 
day at Sands.

Miss Myra Martell will spend tbe 
next two weeks visiting ip Escaoaba 
and Chlpago.

Miss Mary Heinonen left Tuesday 
night on a visit to her brother In Du- 
lu{h.

Mrs. W. 8. Trevarrow, of Trimoun­
tain, is here on a visit to her son and 
daughter in-law, Mr. and Mrs. Albert 
Wills, Merry street.

Mr. and Mrs. T. Allen, who were 
recently married in Itbpeming. have 
taken up their residence In this city.

Louis Peterson and Victor Ring, 
diamond drill operators, left last Sat­
urday for Cuba.

Mr. and Mrs. Archibald are here 
from Barrows, Minn., on a visit to 
Mrs. Archibald's parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. M. C. Quinn.

Mrs. J . E. O'Donogbue arrived 
home yesterday morniog from an ex­
tended visit with relatives in Fonddu 
Lac, Wls.

Mrs. M. J . Rice arrived here Tues­
day afternoon from Manistlque aod 
will spend several days here vlsitiog 
at tbe home of her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Peter Lemire.

C. U. Skiff and family, who bad 
been residents of Negauoes for tbe 
past four years or more, removed 
Monday to Ishpeuiiog, as Mr. Skiff's 
business Interests oow center in that 
city, where he Is manager of the Lyric 
theater. Tbe family bad made many 
friends here aod their departure is 
regretted.

Harry and Maude Lee arc borne 
from Kfcaoab*. where they bad been 
visiting their slater, Mrs. Mervlo 
Wetton.

Ernest Fosterling cume up from La- 
tlirop last Saturday to receive treat­
ment for stomach trouble in Dr. Rob- 
bios' hospital. He was accompanied 
to the hospital by Peter UriU,

Charles K Steele returned Tuesday 
from Detroit, where he had spent a 
few days following his attendance at 
the state meeting of Royal Arch 
Masons at Saginaw.

Miss Louise Schurtz has returned 
from a couple of weeks' visit in 
Chicago. She was accompanied by 
her sister, Miss Kutb Hcburtz, of 
Chicago, who will spend a few weeks 
at the family home.

Mrs. S. J. Asbtoo arrived last Sat­
urday from Chicago to spend the re­
mainder of the summer with her sis­
ter, Mrs. T. C. Yates.

<)rr Bchurtzleft yesterday for Lower 
Michigan.

Maurice Murphy le here from Spar­
ta, Mtuo.

Naocy JUeuiueeuu, who is here on 
an extended visit with her grandmoth­
er. Mrs. Peter Hastnussen. left yester-' 
day morning on a vlslt to her uncle, 
Albert Kaemusoen, at Calumet.

Are you in need
OF COALP Need it right now?

Phone your order to JAMES PICEANDS 
& CO. (Limited) then and have your bins 
filled promptly with the best coal you could 
obtain.

WOOD D R Y  H ’O O D - A  big Bupply of sound 
dry lG-inch Hardwood on band.

P /X - W O O D - S o u u d  and Dry.

R O C K E R-W O O D .

James Pickands & Co., Ltd.
Michael Kelly and Harvard Kell- 

strom are up from Crystal Falls to 
spend tbe Fourth with relatives and 
friends.

Mrs. A. F. Maitland and the Misses 
Ruth and Cora Lee Wells, accompa­
nied by Itbpeming friends, returned 
yesterday from a lake trip.

FOR RENT—One store room In 
Laugblin block, west Iron street. 
This is tbe portion of tbe block for­
merly used as a dry goods store. 
Apply to

T. M. Wells, Administrator.

AUTOMOBILE FOR RENTAL 
George McCann, the East Iron 

street liveryman, has added a tour­
ing car to bis livery equipment, which 
will be for rental at reasooable rates. 
Just tbe thing for a quick spin to any 
point In tbe county or for weddings, 
christenings, etc. 3tt-tf

Annual Stockholders' Meeting
The annual stockholder*’ meeting of the Ver­

million 1’loe ft Iron Land Company will be held 
at the Breltuog Hotel lu tbe City of Necounee, 
Mich.. *m Tuesday July JMh. ISIS, at 2 o'clock

S', in. for the purpose of electing a Board of Dl* 
ectors and the transaction of such other busi­
ness a t may legally come before said meeting.
(40-14) K. E. DRAKE. Secretary. 

Negauoee, Mlcb.. June inh,l9ia,

June 20—July u
PROBATE NOTICE

STATE OF MICHIGAN.
The probate Court for tbe County of Marquette 

In the Matter of tbe Estate of Lizzie Flck, 
Deceased.

Notice Is hereby given tbat four months from 
the 16th day of June A. V. 1912, bare been al­
lowed for creditors to present their claims 
aaalual said deceased to said court lor examin­
ation and adjustment, and that all creditors of 
said deceased are required to present tbclr 
claims to said oourt, at the probate offloe, In tbe 
City of Marquette in said oounty, on or before 
tbe 17th day cf October A. D. 1918. and tbat 
said claims will be beard by said court on Fri­
day tbe n th  day of October A. D, 1918, at two 
o’clock lo the afternoon.
Dated. Marquette. Mich., June 14th, A. D. 1911 

(Seal) W. T. POTTER,
A true copy. Judge of Probate.

/  June 13—July 4
Probate Notice* *

STATE OK MICHIGAN, ( „
Couoty of Marquette, f B*
At a session of the Probate Court for the 

Couoty of Marquette, holdeu at tbe probate 
office la th e  City of Marquette, on-Monday, 
tbe 9th day of June, in the year one thous­
and nine hundred and thirteen.

PreseoLW.T. Potter. Judge of Probate 
In the Matter of the Estate of Isaac Slllbtrg. 

Deceased.
On reading sod filing tbe petition duly verb 

tiled, of Elizabeth KUIberg. widow of said de­
ceased, praying that administration of-*aides> 
tatej>e granted to Charles Slllberg, or to some 
other suitable persoo.

Thereupon It Is ordered tbat Monday, the 
seventh day of July A. D. 1919, at two 
o'clock in the afteruoou.be assigned for t lie 
bear I ox of said petition, and that the 
next of kin and heirs-at-law of sold deceased 
and all other persons Interested lo said estate 
are required to appear at a session of said court, 
then to beholden at Uie probate office In the 
City of Marquette, and show cause. If any there 
be, why tbe prayer of the petitioner sbould not 
begraated.

And It is further ordered tbat said petitioner 
give notice to the persons Interested In iMd 
estate of the pendency of said petition, and the 
bearing thereof, by causiug a copy of this order 
to be published In the Nkoai/xkb (box Hz*- 
alo, k newspaper printed and circulated in 
•aid County of Marquette, for three successive 
weeks previous to Mid day of hearing,

Beti). W.TTfOWER.
A true cony. Judxsof Probate.

June 13—July 4
PROBATE NOTICE.

STATE OF MICHIGAN, i u .
County of Msrquette. J "
At a session of the Probate Court, for tbe 

County of Marquette, hoiden at tiie Probate 
offlce. ln the city of Marquette, on. Wednesday, 
the nth day of June In the year one thous­
and nine hundred and thirteen.

Presents W. T Potter, Judxsof Probate, 
lu tbs matter of the estate of Edward Byrne,

DEOtfllPd
On reading and fillnc tbs petition duly veri­

fied. of Charles W. Taylor, administrator of 
sold estate, praying that he may be author­
ized, empowered anu licensed to seJL at private 
•ale, the Interest of sold estate In tbe real es­
tate described In Mid petition for the purpose 
of paying the debts and expenses of administer- 
lux said estate

Thereujwn It Is Ordered, tbat Monday, the 
?tb day of July A. D. iwix, at two o'clock 
la the aftentooo. he assigned for lbs bearing of 
told iwtlilon. and (hot tbs nsit of kin and 
helm at taw of said deceased and all other |w- 
•oos interested lo sold Relate, are required to 
appear at a neaslon of Mid Court.tbsn to be 
hoiden at the Probate Office, In the City of Mar­
quette, and show caiiM. If any there be,why 
Uie prayer of tbe petitioner should not be 
granted.

Aud II Is Further Ordered. That asld petition- 
er give notice to the persons Interested In said 
KeUle of the pendency nf Mild |»etlllon. and (lie 
hsariUK thereof. Ivy causing a copy of this order 
to he published In the NkoaIIXKK j go* Hkh 
ai d a newBittper printed and circulated In wild 
County of Marquette, for three successive week* 
previous to said day of hearing.

(rtealj W. T POTTER.
A true copy. Judge of prolmie,

July 4-84
Probate Order*

STATE OF MICHIGAN.
County o r  Majmji’KTtk,

At a session of (lie Probate Court (or the 
County of Marquette, bidden at the Probate 
office in the city of Marquette, on Friday, 
the iftlli day of June lu (heyesroue thous­
and nine hundred aud thirteen.

Present. W. T. Putter, Judge of Prol-ate. 
lu the Matter of the Estate of Nicholas Pearce 

Deceased.
On reeding and filing the petition duly veri­

fied, of Joseph 11. Newbridge. a creditor of sold 
deceased, praying that aifiulnlstrutlnu of said 
estate he grouted to himself, or to some other 
suitable person.

Thereupon U Is Ordered, That Monday, 
the « tb  day of July A. D. 1913, at two o cloca 
lu the afternoon, be assigned tor the hearing of 
sold petition, aud that (lie next of kin and heirs 
U law of Mid deceased aud all other persous 
nterested In said Estate, are required tuapiiear 

nt a session of said Court, then to be hohicu at 
I he Probate Office, lu the City of Marqurtte, 
aud alio* cause,tf any there he, why the puyer 
of the petitioner sbould not he granted.

Audit Is Further Ordered, Tuai said petition 
er give notice lo the person* interested in said 
Estate of the t*eml«ncy of -aid petition,aud the 
hearing thereof, by cau<dm' a copy ot this order 
to he published in the Nkjjaokk  Ikon Hkh- 
a u> a newsp»pei printed and circulated in <aid 
County of Marquette, f.ir three succcaslve 
weeks previous to wtid day of hearing.

ibeali W. r. I'OITKlt.
A Irucvonv. J ados ul ProUala.

M.
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I VOLUNTEER
ORE GO.

-PRODUCERS O F -

IRON ORE.
G. A. Tomlinson.

President and Treasurer
Dulutb, Mloo.

C. A. CONGDON.
Vice-President,

Dulutb, Minn.

J ames Wanless,
Secretary,

Dulutb, MIod.

Edward J. Maney,
Assistant Treasurer,

Dulutb, M Idd .

Thomas Pellow.
General superintendent,

Negauoee, Mich.

Starching 
a Shirt

is a particular piece of 
work, and because it 
is particular, it is some­
times slighted.

Not at this laundry 
however—we take care 
to see that the surplus 
starch is wiped off, and 
that the sleeves are not 
starched stiff above the 
wrist band.

It make your shirt 
feel much more com­
fortable.

Needham Bros.
Lnifirirt-Dpn-CliMiri

Both Phones - Iihpemlng

Nsgissss Agsri:—FRED BATH,
Bell Phone 24 J,

H A B I T

There is nothing quite so powerful as HABIT. 
It is the unconscious instrument of our action. To 
get into the habit of saving is the important step. 
Do not merely resolve to save. Act on the resolu­
tion. 3% paid in March and September compound­
ing interest twice a year.

The Negaunee 
National Bank

NEGAUNEE, MICH.
CAPITAL AND SURPLUS - $ 1 2 0 ,0 0 0 .0 0

OFFICERS:
E. N. BReitung, President.

Philip Levine, Vice-President. C. Mexlleur, Vice-Pre*ident, 
H. C. Wagner, Cashier.

J. H. Anderson Ase’t Cftibler.

Special Attention Given to Banking by Mail
i d

JOSEPH. H. PRIMEAU, Jr.,
A t t o r n e y -a t - L a w ,

NEGAUNEE, - MICHIGAN.
Roth Phones.

PABST.
The Beer of Quality <

CHARLES JOHNSON, Agent 
Negaunee, Michigan, j

Cleanliness and Purity  are Prime 
Factors in every stagfc of tbe 
P a b s t  E ig h t -Day  M a l t in g  

P r o c e ss , and all tbe whole­
some,healthful foodprop- 
ertiesof the barley grain 

are found in our
• /

Bavarian Bohemias
Blue Ribbon Export

P n a p t  Atteatloo to H ill i t  P to i i  Orders

Come and have a 

game of Pool at

J O N E S ’
Billiard and Pool Parlors

4 0 8  Iron Street

I6E 6R E A M
Wholeiale and Retail

None Better to be had 
Anywhere.

BOYS
Get Ready

for Summer
Date Ball Supplies and Sporting 

Goods of All Kinds. Particu ­
larly Fine Assortment o f  

FISHING TACKLE

Andrew Erickson,
42% IRON ST., KBOAUMBE.

N EW  P O O L  A N D  

BILLIARD TABLES.

We have a fine line of Cigars, 
Tobacco and Pipes.

Candies, Chocolates, Etc.

W. H. JO X B B , P r o p 'r

Flower and Vegetable 
Garden Plnnts

CUT FLOWERS
—and—

POTTED PLANTS

PALMS and FERNS

LAWN GRASS SEED

MCI LIN HUH spti rsiMN.

Prompt shipment by mall and 
express. Telephone your order.

Negaunee
G re e n h o u se s

Nefaunee, Mich.

RELIABLE DEFENDERS OF OUR COUNTRY.

1

OummIm* owlsr (La foot

iisa * u .

omr_

•if

^CHICAOO.ILt,

THE SOLDIER

Q U I C K  T O  M P I L  A T T A C K S

DR. KING’S
NEW DISCOVERS

J U S T  A S  Q U IC K  T O  

R E P E L  A T T A C K S  O P

COUGHSan»COLDS
A nd  all D la a a a a a  o f

THROAT AND LUNG S
Q U IC K E S T  A N D  S U R E S T

W HO O PING  COUGH
A N D

B R O N C H I A L  R E M E D Y  

P rice 50c and $ 1.00
M  SOLD AND GUARANTEED BY
A X . X .  D R u a a i s T a
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Help Your Children 
to Make Good

A Savirgs Bank Frej 
With the First Dollar 

Deposit
See them in the Window
Brio? tbe bo; or girl io to de­

posit a dollar; get a bank book 
with the dollar credited Jo it, 
and take bone one of these banks 
to help save tbe next dollar.

Yon have tbe bonk, we have 
tbo key. Money grows quickly. 
Bring tbe bank In from time to 
time and have the contents cred­
ited in your bank book.

Pennies and nickels soon make 
dollars Dollars make independ­
ence. I t 's  wor t h  the effort. 
Come in to-day.

The Republic Stete Bank
REPUBLIC, MICH.

R & P U B L 16
Republic’s Fourth of July celebra* 

tioo is. as usual, arranged for tbe 
special benefit of tbe children, though 
there is plenty to interest and enter­
tain the older folk as well. The Iron 
Mountain City Band hasbeenengaged 
to furnish music for tbe day and tbe 
celebration will conclude with adance 
in the evening, for wbTch music will 
be furnished by tbe Iron City Orches­
tra.

Rev. John Wargelio, pastor of the 
Finoisb Lutheran Church, will tbis 
month enter upon tbe summer course 
of study at tbe University of Chicago, 
Rev. wargelio never oeglects an op­
portunity to further perfect himself 
for bis life-work, and matters having 
shaped themselves so that be might 
have a couple of months’ leave of ab­
sence tbis summer be lost no time In 
arranging to take up special studies 
at tbe University of Chicago. Prior 
to joiniog tbe classes at Chicago, 
however, Rev. Mr. Wargelio is to 
pay a visit to the missions in Lower 
Michigan which are under bts supers 
vision. He had a class nearly ready 
for (Confirmation there a couple of 
mooths ago, but be was summoned 
to return to Republic because of tbe 
death of Isaac BHlberg. During tbe 
period that Rev. Mr. wargelio is ab* 
seot bis family will divide tbeir time 
between Republic and Crystal Falls. 
Mrs. W trgello's parents, Rev. tod 
Mrs. Holkka, residing a t tbe latter 
place.

Mrs. Herman Schmidt, who bas been 
a t St. Luke's Hospital, Marquette, 
for tbe past few weeks, Is reported to 
be improving and it  Is probable that 
she will soon be able to return to her 
borne.

Tbe Swedish M. E. Church will give 
an eotertainmeot at Woodmen's nail 
on Tuesday evening, July 16th.

Neil Munson paid a visit of a week 
or ten days with bis uncle a t Iron 
Mountain.

Miss Nola Slebentba) b is  gone to 
lodlanapolis to spend tbe school r»- 
cation.

Ernest DurandjVbo b u  been attend* 
log tbe Michigan Agricultural Col* 
lege, East Laoslog, la boms for tbe 
vacation.

Prof. John E. HUlberg, editor, lee* 
tu rn  aod educator, of Kvaoston, 111., 
who la widely known as tbe “ Swedish 
Demosthenes." will deliver a lecture 
at Woodmen's ball Saturday evening. 
Hie subject will be “ Face Sculpture."

Rev. Mr. Hill, pastor of tbe Norwe* 
gian Lutheran ebureb, of Isbpemlng. 
preached in Republic Sunday morn* 
log.

Mrs. W.T. Caine Is here from South 
Dakota for a visit at tbe bom# of ber 
father. Thomas Pascoe. Mrs. Caine 
will spend tbe remainder of tbe sum* 
n>«r In Republic aod vicinity.

Thomas Welch, who bad been called 
here by the iiloees and subsruutot 
death of bis sister, returned last week 
to bis boms in Butte* Mont.

FraokOeoord. a stationary engin­
eer at tbe Republic mins, is spending 
a week or two In Minneapolis,

Frank Munson Is bare from Ohio 
for a visit with Republic relatives 
and friends.

Jobu Pascoe, J r ., of Detroit, Is 
amoug the former Iiepublic folk who 
are home for h summer visit.

A display of deer heads in tbe Lax* 
strom store Is attracting much atten* 
tlon. They are trophies of the prow* 
ess of Fred Wllkios, who returned 
not long ago from buorlse, Wyo. In 
tbe collection are two deer beads and 
one elk. One of the deer does not 
differ materially from the species to 
be found in the Upper Peninsula, but 
tbe other is a “ mule deer" and at* 
tracts much attention, as does tbe 
ffat-borned bead of the elk.

Mr. and Mrs. Bruce Wallace have 
returned from their honeymoon trip 
aod are comfortably settled in tbeir 
new home In Republic avenue.

Mrs. Ethel Jones left Saturday 
evening for home&tJJuchenao, Micb.. 
aod when sbe returns in the course of 
a few days sbs will be aooonipanied 
by ber mother, wbo will spend tbe re­
mainder of the summer at tbe cottage 
near Witch Lake.

Rev. R. Hartman, A. M., who is to 
occupy tbe pulpit of the Finnish Lu­
theran Church during tbe absence of 
tbe pustor, Rev. Juhn Wargelio, Is a 
member of the faculty of the Finnish 
College at Hancock and during bis 
si»y in Rspublic he will conduct a 
summer school for six weeks. Ref.

Mr. Hartman wllf'be Assisted by bis 
wife, wbo will instruct tbe younger 
children. Mrs. Hartman is a sister of 
Rev/Mr. Wargelio. The school ses­
sions were begun last week.

Mr. and Mrs. Russell Wallace, of 
Oak Park, III., who had come here to 
attend the wedding of their goo last 
week, spent a couple of days in Mar­
quette before leaving for borne. Mr. 
Wallace was purchasing agent for the 
South Shore road, with headquarters 
at Marquette, some years ago.

George Gamble bas gone to Chica­
go for a visit.

Bert Jones and son, of Iron Moun­
tain, were intown Monday to arrange 
for an Inventory of what is left of tbe 
Kloman furnace plant.

When there were two telephone 
lines in operation a person could be 
reasouably sure of getting a connec­
tion over one line or tbe other, but 
with service limited to a single sys­
tem tbe chances seem to have been re­
duced proportionately. After the 
damage inflicted by recent storms bad 
been repaired, service in this end of 
tbe county was interrupted by blast­
ing which was In progress on tbe road 
in tbe vicinity of Humboldt.

Albert Carlson, formerly employed 
at C. W. Munson’s drug store, has 
gone to Iruntoo, Minn.

Mrs. Hugo Erlcsoo will snend the 
Fourth with her parents at Maoictique 
and will visit at other polots before 
returning. '

A trio of well-known Republic men 
set out bright aod early on Midsum­
mer day for an automobile run to the 
Menominee range, and tbe fact that 
they didn't progress beyond tbecoun- 
t j  line surely must bekttributed to 
some inherent defect In the motor ve­
hicle Itself,for tbe owner of tbe car Is 
a man who hae spent a lifetime in a 
specialised form of mechanical en­
deavor, one of his passengers has 
dealt with heavier forms of machinery 
for maoy years and |now rejoices in 
tne title of master mechanic, and tbe 
third member of the party might also 
be presumed to have some practical 
knowledge of machinery in view of the 
many years be spent In the engine 
rooms of ocean-going craft, not to 
mention what be nas had to do with 
machinery since he forsook tbe sea 
and settled down to the more tranquil 
task of guiding mine machinery. It 
Is barely possible, of course, that it 
was a case of "too many cooks," 
rather than a paucity of mechanical 
knowledge, but be this as it may, the 
fact remains that tbe party “didn't 
get nowhere"—unless tbe vicinity of 
Witbeck may properly be considered 
somewhere. Having relied on tbe as* 
suraoceof a swift before-breakfast run 
to tbe lower range, tbe party had nut 
provisioned tbeir craft, but tbe friend­
ly presence of a farm bouse solved 
this part of tbe difficulty and tbe hand­
iness of tbe St. Paul trblns obviated 
tbe necessity of a dusty homeward 
walk, while as for tbe motor c a r -  
well, it isn't very difficult to hoist an 
auto onto a flat car and tbe freight 
rates betweeo points within the county 
aren't excessive, you know.

Rev, Mr. Poyeeor, of Crystal Falls, 
called on friends here between trains 
Saturday*
. Matbew Gibson spent a couple of 
days last week with Republic relatives 
aod friends, t i t  was his first visit in 
ibout three gears.

Edv NeRosui. tbe Wells-Fargtf ex­
press messenger, bumped into tbe hot- 
teetofibe hot weather when he took his 
vacation, aod be Is now back at the 
old job to get cooled off.

Mrs. William Schmidt, Jr., Is visit­
ing friends in tbe Lower Peninsula.

Miss Jennie Pascoe Is vlsltiog rela­
tives io Milwaukee.

Miss Hodge, who has been teacher 
at tbe Witch Lake school for the past 
two or three years, left Monday to at­
tend tbe summer session of tbe North­
ern Normal school.

Sparks Bros.' oircus gave a first- 
class show bare last Saturday. There 
was no vulgarity aod no unoeoessary 
noise, it being a oloe clean show from 
start to fioieb.

that the comparison cannot fail to 
bring a blush of shame to think that 
Michlgamme is still pegging away 
with antiquated facilities.

The presence in town during the 
past week of Mr. Wasmuth, of the 
U. P. Brewing Company, and Mr. 
Simoods, of the Menominee River 
Company, makes it certain tha t Mich* 
igamme will not experience any un­
due drought during tbis torrid spell.

Frank Carlson has disposed of his 
driving horse to Mr. King, of L’Anse, 
and the animal was shipped Wednes­
day.

Mrs. Norman Trezise, of Calumet, 
is here for a visit to ber parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. John Anderson.

The Fourth of July will be ushered 
in by a ball by the Michlgamme Fire 
Department Thursday evening. John­
son's complete orchestra will furnish 
the musio and supper will be served 
at the Northwestern hotel.

William Maibannu has taken the 
agency for tbe William Shakespeare 
supply bouse of Kalamazoo, manu­
facturers of all kinds of fishing tac­
kle. In Mr. Majhannu tbe firm hae 
found a  most capable agent, and Wil­
liam E. Carr, the traveling represen­
tative, saw to It that Mr. Majbannu 
was completely stocked with rods, 
reels, hooks, etc. This firm manufac­
tures a particularly efficient pickerel 
book which it bas named “ Tbe MicbU 
gamme." Truly, Mleblgamme'efaoe 
is slowly but surely spreading,

John Hicks, wbo operates what is 
known as tbe Dishnow farm, bas just 
added a  21 horse-power engine to bis 
dairy equipment. It is known ae the 
Demonstrator and can be operated by 
using kerosene, gasolene o r benzine 
for fuel. Tbe engine is arranged to 
supply power for tbe separator, churn­
ing, etc. Mr. Hicks has tbe agency 
for tbe sale of this type of engine.

Carl Benson came dowo from 
L'Anse Sunday on a  visit to his par- 

»ents, Mr. aod Mrs. A. Benson.
George McDonald bas decided to 

sell his bouse at Three Lakes and tbe 
tbe sale will ioclude a three-acre tract 
which surrouods it. This will consti­
tute a bargain for anyone looking for 
a summer home.

William Dower, brakeman on 
trains 56 aod 66, is taking an enforc­
ed respite from duty because of illness, 
but be is progressing favorably un­
der tbe doctors care and probably 
will be able to return to work within 
a week or ten days.

Elmer Stone, who was bookkeeper 
at the Ohio mine in bygone days, 
arrived last Monday and expects to 
remain for tbe summer. Mrs. Stone 
will join him a little later in tbe sea­
son.

Mrs. Stoner-Rowe)! and Miss Fitz­
gerald, of Kansas City, who are to 
chaperone the summer colony at 
Camp Michlgamme, arrived Wednes 

ay and are busy with preparations for 
the care of tbe 6evy of girls who will 
be arriving by almost every trainr 
during tbe coming week.

Swedish School

M i c h i g a m m e
Saturday will be tbe big day of 

Mlchlgamme’e celebration of tbe anni­
versary of oatlonal Independence. 
Tbe Negauoee Italian Band bat been 
engaged to furnish musio for tbe day 
and tbe program contemplates "some­
thing doing" from dawn till midnight. 
At 10 a. m. there will be a street par­
ade, which will terminate a t tbe band 
stand, where the formal exercises will 
be held. Rev. Fr. Hasenberg will be 
tbe cbaplato and tbe oraUoo will be 
delivered by P. H. Treslse, while tbe 
Declaration of Independence will be 
read bjr Lawrence Paquln. During 
tbe noon hour a  picnic will be given 
at the school bouse for tbe oblldren. 
At 1:50 p. m. an interesting program 
of sports begins. A special feature 
will be tbe gasoleoe launch raoe. The 
festivities will oooclud# with a danoe 
Id tbe evening. Three hundred and 
fifty dollars has been raised, which 
insures a good time for ail. H ie offi- 
oers In charge of tbe eelebretioo a rt 
as follows: President, Dr. J . C. 
Thomas; vloe president, Capt. Harry 
Marks: marshal, W, J. MUroy; treas­
urer, E, G. Muck; secretary, Henry 
Johnsoo; arrangements committee, 
Messrs, Thomss, Murray, Muck. 
Hundstrom, Drown, Marks, Trezise, 
Block and Johnson: oommlttee on 
sports, Messrs. McDonald, Mllroy, 
M. Treado, Oscar Johnson, McKer- 
cber aod Frank Carlson.

Howard Scanlon left Sunday even­
ing for tbe Mesaba range. Percy 
Truzlse, bis school chum, who had

reoedad Howard to Minnesota, 
_iad secured for tbe latter a position 
at a remunerative salary.

Ootonagon recently dedicated a 
160,000 school building. Yet It was 
only a few years ago that Ontonagon 
was wiped off the map by a disastrous 
fire. Mlohlgtmme's school building 
was erected In 1672. Reading of On­
tonagon's educational enterprise, one 
cannot help but contrast it with Mich- 
lgemme's plight; and we may add

l

A Good Investm ent 
W. D. Magll, a well koown mer­

chant of Wbltemound, Wls., bought 
a stock of Chamberlain's medicine so 
as to be able to supply them to bis 
customers. After receiving them he 
was himself taken sick ana says that 
one email bottle of Chamberlain's 
Colio Cholera and Diarrhoea Remedy 
war worth more to h'ra than the cost 
of his eotire stock of these medicines. 
For sale by J. E. ODonogbut.

Gotpel Tent

Evangelistic services are being held 
nightly a t 8 o'clock In tbe Gospel 
Tent on Ridge street, near Leal Lai 
avenue. No meetings are held on Ba 
urdays. Sunday services a t 3 and 
p+m. All are cordially lovlted.

Banks Close Tw o Days

Inasmuch as Saturday would have 
been a half-holiday anyhow, tbe banks 
of tbe city decided that there would 
be no hardship inflicted upon business 
interests If they remained closed 
throughout Saturday, as well as upon 
the Fourth of July. Tbe bank em­
ployes will therefore have a vacation 
from Thursday afternoon until Moo* 
day momlog. .

Road Map of Michigan -5

There bas beencompleted and placed 
on tbe market a new map of Mlchlgid 
showing all autmooblle roads of th 
state and in such a way tha t it is nex 
to impossible to go wroog. A featur 
of this map is that It is to  made an 
folded that an entire day 's run can b% 
made without havlog to open It out^ 
It gives the names of all trou t streams^ 
lakes and rivers where there is sport to 
be found by tbe fishermen.

<4

Sunday School Picnic

Tbe Swedish Lutheran Betbany 
School will give its picnic io Cleve­
land grove on Friday, July 4tb. One 
of tbe most inviting places in tbe grove, 
olose to tbe entrance, baa been select­
ed for tbe oocasloo All will be wel- 
oome. and it Is tbe earnest desire of 
tbe pastor of the congregation that 
tbe parents of the children and others 
bring aloof tbeir lunob, so that all 
may enjoy a social dlooer together., 
Refreshments will be served by the/ 
Suoday School.

Mother's Pension Law

The mothers' pension aot,so-called, 
enacted by the last legislature, re­
garding which much bts been printed, 
is In reality not a pension at all. Tbe 
act provides briefly that where a 
widow is unable to support her child­
ren and under tbe present law they 
would be sent to some state Institu­
tion for neglected children, tbe court 
under the act may investigate the case 
and If it appears that tbe mother is a 
proper person to have tbe care of tbe 
cbildreo, tbe state will aaeist In tbeir 
support by paying a certain amount 
for each child weekly to tbe mother, 
aod tbe children remain a t home.

T lad Id a K n o t
Describes tbe way you feel when you 

arc struggling with an attack of Chol­
era Morbus or Cramp Colic. KKN- 
NE’S PAIN-KILLING MAGIC OIL 
unties tbe knot and quickly give* re­
lief. It does tbe same work when 
rubbed Into the skio to relieve rbue- 
tnatlsm. sprains, lame back or stiff 
neck. It's a wonderful remedy for in­
ternal or external use, Prlc* 25 cts. 
Sold by J. E. O'Dunogbue.

Tbe Swedish Lutheran church bas 
arranged for a five weeks’ Swedish 
school, to start Monday, July 7th. 
Tbe Swedish parents who are Interest­
ed in their national language should 
not miss tbis opportunity to instruct 
tbeir children. In connection with tbe 
school there will be Christian instruc­
tion, Bible reading, catechism and 
Bible history. Tbe smaller children 
will be instructed from 9 to 12 a. m. 
and tbe older children from 1 to 
p. m. Three hours a day will bo de­
voted to each division.

Celebrate Perry Day

Perry Day is to be officially observ­
ed by the schools of Michigan on Sep­
tember lOtb, the hundredth annivers­
ary of that notable victory of Perry 
and his fleet on Lake Erie. This naval 
battle was tbe determining factor to 
securing a century of peace betweeo 
Great Britain and the United States, 
and Inasmuch as It meaot even more 
to Micblgao than to any other state 
In tbe union It is eminently fitting 
that tbe state department of public In­
struction should take tbe initiative In 
lnsurlog stale-wide celebration of the 
centennial.

Inasmuch as tbe date comes right at 
tbe beginning of the fall term the 
school authorities will have to make 
an early start on planning tbeir pro­
grams, and the department of public 
Instruction has come to tbeir aid by 
preparing a bulletin attractively Illus­
trated aod containing valuable his­
torical material wbicn will be of te r r ­
ies in outlining a program. A de­
scription is also given of tbe Perry 
memorial at Put-In-Bay, for which 
tbe Michigan legislature appropriated 
•30,000.

Horses do Most Damage

“ Horses do most damage to the 
roads, and narrow steel tires come 
next. Any gravel or stone road in 
Indiana bears evifienceof tbe above." 
says C. A. Hargrave, of Danville, 
Ind., in tbe Scientific American. 
“ Unless the former is dragged In 
suitable weather, which may not occur 
during an entire season, it soon has 
three deep grooves, two for the wheels 
and one midway between, formed by 
the horses, driven single. Tbe last Is 
most difficult to control. It is due 
mostly to rapid driving. On bills, 
where tbe horses walk It Is not formed.

“Our farmers complain of automo­
biles ruining the roads, but tbe man 
a buggy, with bis fast-stepping horse, 
is a greater menace. There would be 
greater complaint if in taxing vebloles 
to raise a road fund, tbe horse-drawn 
buggy should be given its just share, 
and speed limited to four miles per 
hour, a rato that would do but little 
damage to tbe road. So far as I know 
that has not been done in any state. 
The autolst is taxed because they 
think he Is able to pay. In most cases 
be is also willing, greatly to bis 
credit. While that is true, the facts 
as to bis road wear ought to be under­
stood."

Baseball Schedule

Following is tbe official schedule of 
tbe Marquette County Baseball 
League games:

Nenuneo at Uhpemlog-Miy so, June 13*
y«  ............. “
\

and
Negauose at MsrquetU-Juue 22, July

July aod September 7.
lubperalni a t NegsuoM -July 6, Auguat 17 

Mptenber 1.
gauoae at MsrquetU-Juue 22, July 4, 

August S aod SepteinDer 11 
^Karuuette at Negaunes-June 1, July is aod

Nsgsuoee at Gwlno—June 80, August 10 aod 
September 21.

awioQ at Kecauuee-Juoe 0, June 24. July 
SO aod August II-

ftiaruuettr at labpemlng—June 28, August 
10 aod lie '

I si 
July 

1*1,
August 24.

<iwtuo at IsbpemlDg—June 
August I  aud September 14

(Member 21.
fog at Marquette-June 9, Juoe 24*Itbpemiog a

_ 80 and A u g ___
iubpemliig at Owluo—June l, July is and

rust si.

Marquette at 
September 7.

Owlno at M 
gust 17 aod September 1.

22, July 4, 

at 'Wwluo-June 16, July 27 aod

armwtte-Msy SO, July 0, Au< 
irtembi *

—There will be speolal street car 
service all day to-day—July 4tb.

—For a nomloal charge the ladles 
can bavetbelrdress goods put through 
PetersenA W iilers'electrical shrink­
ing machine and thereby add to tbe 
durability and neatness of tbe goods 
when made up.

—Tbe ladloe will And it to tbeir ad­
vantage to  have tbeir dress goods 
put through Petersen & W iilers’ new 
electrical shrinking machine before 
the cloth Is made Into garments. It 
will greatly add to the service of the 
goods.

—1Tske your dress goods, before be* 
log made up, to Petersen & W iilers' 
tailor shop and have the cloth proper 
]y treated by their electrical shrinking 
machine. It will pay you t^bave  tbe 
goods thus attended to before being 
made up, thereby avoidlog tbe shrink 
log of tbe cloth after it goes into 
the garments.

Chambei Iain's
Curas Cold*. Croup and

Cough Remedy
mi wtibpnm Cough. 9

Causes of atomaob Trouble 
Sedentary habits, lack of out door 

exercise, insufficient mastication of 
food, constipation, a torpid liver, 
worry and anvloty, overeating, pur* 
taking of food and drink not suited to 
your age and occupation, Correct 
your habits and take Chamberlain's 
Tablets aod you will wood be well 
again. For sale by J. E.O’Donogbue.

Go 
After 
Business

In a business way—the 
advertising way. An ad 
in this paper offers the 
maximum service at the 
minimum cost.  It 
reaches the people of 
the town and vicinity 
you want to reach.

Try It- 
It Pays

Juoe 20-July ll 
P r o b a te  N o t ic e  

I  OF MICHIGAN,
Tbe Probate Court tor Uie Ooooty of Marquette

At a session of said Court, held at the Probate 
Office in the City of Marquette In said County, 
on the 10th day of June A. D. 1913.

Present; Hon. W. T. Potter. Judge of Probate
Id the Matter of the Estate of Fred C. Koch, 

Deceased.
S. J. McCall having filed In said court Ilia 

final administration account, and his petition 
praying for tbe allowance thereof and for the 
assianmeot aod distribution of the residue of 
saldestate.

It U Ordered, That the 14tb day of July 
A. D. 1913. at two o’clock in tbe afternoon, at 
said probate office, be and Is hereby appointed 
for examining and allowing said account and 
bearing said petition:

It is Purther Ordered, Tbat public notice 
thereof be given by publication of a copy of this 
order, for three successive weeks previous to 
said day of bearing. In the Nkuauweb Iron 
Uibald, a newspaper printed and circulated 
In said county.

Seal W. T. POTTER,
A true copy. Judge of Probate-

Ella M. Tinckmell. Probate Clerk.

Lake Superior & Iihpemlng
Railway.

L S.  & I
M A & S .6.

Munising, Marquette tand 

South-Eastern By.

I n  sffeot beginning Sunday, 
J u n e  1, 1018.

TRAIN ARRIVES NKGAUNBK 
dally except Sunday

From MUNISING. Mar- 4A 40 •  .

auette end all Interne* l U i U A H  
late points.

TRAIN LEAVES NEGAUNMB 
dally except Sunday (

For Marquette. Bkandla, 9 Cfl •  .  
Lawson. Kumley. Chat* P *  
bam, MUNWING. PRINCETON 
and all Intermediate points.

SUNDAY TRAINS:
For Marquette, Princeton and Mu* 

nlslng will leave Negauoee at 7:68 
a. in. and 4:28 p. m.

Traios will arrive from Munlslng and 
Princeton II .-02 a. m. and 0:17 p. m.

Everybody wbo read* 
magazines bays news* 
papers, bit everybody 
who reada newspapers 
doesn't bay magexlnes.

Catch the Drift?
Here's the medium to 

rescb the people of 
this community.

*22?□

The Sum  and 
Substance

of being a subscriber to this 
paper is that you and your 
family become attached to 
i t  The paper becomes a 
member of the family and 
its coming each week will 
be aa welcome aa the ar­
rival of anyone that's dear.

It will keep yon Informed on 
tbe doings of tbe community and 
tbe bargains of tbe merchants 
regularly advertised will enable 
yon to save many times tbe coat 
of the subscription.

Ŝay, You?|

’OW about tbat printing 
Job you're la need of?

Coma la and aee as abeat
it at year first eppsrtaaity. 
Dea l watt aatil tbs vary 
laat momeat bat glva as •  
HHla Haa asd wall shew 
yoa wbat high grade work 
we eaa tars eat

Call tor the product ot the

Upper Peninsula Brewing Co.
THE SUPERIORITY OF THIS  

PRODUCT IS UNQUESTIONED.

A Specialty is made of our Tonic.
You can obtain our product by merely telephoning or 

addressing a postal card to

JOHN A. WASMUTH.
Agent Negaunee.

Upper Peninsula Brewing Oo. Mioh.

Some Things You Will Want for

HOUSE CLEANING TIME.
RUGS, i l l  kinds.

Wilton, Axminster, Body Brussels 
Tapestry, Ingrain, Velvet

PAINT
For ull purposes— Buggies, Wood 

Work, Walls, Floors. AT A INK, 
both the gloss and dead, Jitplac 
and Berry Bros. Granite for 
Floors—the best on earth.

WALL PAPER.
AH the new kinds and shuilcs ol 
color, from 10c to  |H.OO jarr roll.

FURNITURE.

Iron and Brass Beds, Dressers, 
Dining Tables and Ciiuirs, Bid* 
lets, Library Tables, Curium 
Boles. Shades made to order.

U n r d w a r o t  S to v o w  u n c i M a n y o n —the perfection oil cooks; try 
one. In Ranges wc have the Pkninm:i.ak, Gmjiik and Oi.HNWood—the 
Big Three th a t are hard to  1>cat.

Q ardm n T o o l* — Rakes, Hoes, Rubber Garden Hose, Lawn Fence, 
Poultry Netting, Screen Wire, Door und Window Screens. A full line ot 
Kecn K utter Tools th u t are guaranteed in every respect.

FOLDING OOOABTH, HA BY HUGO JE* AND THE WHITE WAGONS—
TEDDY. DIO FOUR sad OUR BOB, the Best Wsxun* Money r«» Buy.

Look over our C r o o k e r y  u n d  C h h iu  D tm to r -W n r o ,  Wc have 
some of the most beautiful patterns in the Gold Bunds und Borders 
a t  low prices.

G tam m wnro— Cut ami Fressed Bar Tumblers in all the popular b1iii|k:s; 
fine blown Wines with cut stems and plate etchings; Colonial Water 
Glasses.

Mazda Lamp» SMSES. ESS
you psy your uexi Light Bill and *e« lh** 
difference,

BICYCLES
from $ 2 t  0 0  to § 4 6 . 0 0  URII-INK. 

COME AM) SKK THEM.

JNO. W. ELLIOTT
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IA S  STEPLESS CARS
Will Save Gothamites 125,000 

Miles a  Year in Steps.

Governor of New York Expected to 
Sign Bill Doing Away With the 

Ancient Type—Old Horse 
Cars Are Doomed.

New York.—Dy tbo Introduction of 
a new style of street car the New 
York Hallways company la about to 
aavo the good people of this city 
an annual climb from the level of 
tbo street of 127,000 miles a year, and 
a descent to tbe street of exactly the 
same length. It has come about 
through Its engineers recognizing 
that it was ridiculous to make their 
passengers continue every time they 
boarded a street car to climb abpvp 
all tbo machinery and th£t a little In­
genuity would enable them to de­
sign a car with practically no climb­
ing at all. f

Once tbe figures are given anyone 
can verify this calculation for him­
self. In the year ended June 80.1912, 
tbe New York Railways company and 
its predecessor, the Metropolitan 
Street Railway company, carried Just 
under 261,000,000 passengers. The 
height of tbe step of the so-called 
stepless car from the atreet Is ten 
Inches and the height of the old-style 
car, which it Is to replace, Is about 
40 Inches. Consequently there is a 
saving of 30 Inches every time a 
passenger gets on or off the car, and 
this works out at 125,000 miles a year 
for the entire system.

The double-decked, stepless car, 
which bears so strong a family re­
semblance to the other new style of 
car, will .continue, however, for some 
time alone in Its glory.

U was only after considering care­
fully tbe many different brands of 
street car In use In other cities that 
the New York Railways company 
evolved tbo side-door, stepless, prepay­
ment car. Montreal, fpr example, has 
a side-door, prepayment car, and Phil­
adelphia prides Itself on Its "near-side 
car/' Tbe latter was inspired by tbe 
desire to provide room for more pas­
sengers and to enable them to enter 
and leave at such a point that they 
would encounter as little as possible 
of the mud of tbe street

While the newest thing In street 
cars Is being Installed In New York, 
the oldest Is about to be abandoned. 
New York bas for several years been 
the only one of tbe big cities to re­
tain horse cars. In some Instances 
this was necessary because of con­
gested traffic, but new subways have 
relieved this to such an extent that 
electric power now is practical.

Governor Sulzer now has under con­
sideration a bill requiring all street 
car companies of the city to cease op­
erating horse cars after January 1 
next. This measure bas passed tbe 
legislature, and if accepted by the 
governor, will affect six lines in Man­
hattan but even without this legisla­
tion It Is probable that In a few 
months tbe last of tbe old horse cars 
will have been driven to the barns, 
never to run again.

When tbe public service commission 
look office on July 1, 1907, there were 
ltf boric-car lines in oporatlon. Of 
these four have been abandoned and 
six are now wholly or partially oper­
ated by storage battery cars. The 
six still running are the Avenue C 
line, from the Desbrosses street ferry 
■across town to Kast Twenty-tourth 
ptreet; tbo Uleecker street line, from 
^ileecker street and Broadway to 
Fourteenth street and Ninth avenue; 
the cbetnbers etreot line, from Cham­
bers street ferry to Qrand street ferry; 
in Metropolitan cross-town line, from 
Jjesbrosses street ferry to Grand 
•trea t ferry; the Seventeenth and 
eighteenth streets lint, from Broad- 
way to tbe Twenty-third street ferry, 
'and the Sixth avenue-Desbrosses 
street ferry line, from Sixth avenue 
and Third street to tbe Desbofses 
street ferry.

JUDGE AND JURY IN CLASH
Jurist Orders Vsrdlot of Acquittal, 

but Jurors Are Obdurate, and 
Refuse to Sign.

Memphis, Teun.—Judge and Jury 
clashed Ic tbe second divisloo of the 
criminal court hero, and aa a result, 
a verdict acquitting a  man of a mur- 
d«r charge was made a part of tbs 
court's record without the signature of 
the Jurors.

C K Murrell, railroad fireman, was 
charged with having murdered Moss 
Todd Presiding Judge Palmer ruled 
that the evidence showed aslf-dofonso, 
•ud directed a verdict of not guilty.

After consultation with members of 
the Jury, Foreman Cooney refused to 
write tbs verdict Judge Palmer ex­
plained that be could permit no other 
verdict to stand, In view of tbs test)- 
tnouy.

"You have a right to your opinion," 
retorted Cooney, still obdurate, "but 
you art not the keeper of my 
conscience."

Finally, however, the verdict was 
written, but tbs Jurors carried their 
point to tbe extent of not affixing their 
elgoatares

CHIeeffO Woman Praises Prase
Boston. Mass —The further exten­

sion of the Juvenile courts system was 
urged by Mrs. Frederic flehoff of 
Philadelphia at tbe convention of the 
national congress of Mothers’ and 
Parent-Teachers’ associations. At s 
round table on "The press In exten­
sion work," Mrs. Edgar A. Ilall of 
Chicago took the poeltlon that the 
newspaper Is co t of the chief educat 
0r§ of the da/.

MR. DANIELS' SON LIKES SEA LIFE

Frank, A. Daniels, tbe nine-year-old son of the secretary of the navy, 
has developed a strong liking for life on shipboard. The picture shows him 
sitting against tbe wheel of tbe Dolphin, his father’s official yacht.

NEW TROUSERS LEAD TO WOE
Motorman Falls Downstairs In Hall­

way "Dressing Room"—Gets 
Damagsa of 1129.

Chicago.—A new suit of clothes al­
most led to the death of Martin F. 
Barry, 707 South Forty-fourth court 
Limping and holding his hand to his 
back, be appeared before Judge Mar­
tin.

Wishing to visit his mother In Iowa 
In some of the glory ascribed to Solo­
mon, be first Joined a "suit dub." He 
drew a suit and went to the tailor 
shop.

Later he made a second visit to tbe 
shop to try on his new suit. Tbe 
coat and the vest caused no difficulty. 
He could see they bad the correct 
lines without Inconvenience. But he 
wished to try on the trousers. Thera 
was no vacant room for tbe accommo­
dation of particular customers. So 
the tailor shoved Barry Into a dark 
ballway to disrobe.

No sooner bad Barry thrust his 
right foot into the right leg of his 
new trousers than be lost his balauce. 
He fell down stairs leading to a cellar 
and lay a bruised, crumpled heap on 
a hard cement floor, one foot la his 
new trousers and one in the old.

Flfty-slx days passed before Barry 
could take up his work as a motor- 
man, and his visit to bla mother In 
Iowa was postponed. He nursed bis 
back and his grievance until he ap­
peared In court craving 91.000 In dam­
ages from the tailor.

The Jury returned a verdict award­
ing Barry $126.

JOHN D. ALMOST A PAUPER
Oil Magnate's Cleveland Property Was 

$3,000 Mors Valusble in 1912 
Than at Prssent.

Cleveland, O.—John D. Rockefeller 
Is rapidly losing his wealth and Is 
becoming practically a poor man, ac­
cording to tbe report of John T. Fish­
er, tax assessor for Cleveland Heights, 
In which place tbe Forest Hill es­
tate of the oil king Is situated.

Tbe figures show that a year ago 
Mr. Rockefeller returned his personal

John 0/ Rooksfsllsr.

property as worth $7,190. This year 
Mr. Rockefeller is poorer by $2,005 
than he was a year ago, bis return of 
personal property being $4,285.

The figures show that Johu D. has 
nine horses worth $55 each, ten bead 
of cattle worth $40 oach, and furniture 
worth $3,800. He has no automobiles 
hare at this time of tbe year the as­
sessments are made, so none Is re­
turned for taxation.

■rltfs's Room In Chureh.
New York.—Plans for alterations 

V the Church of Incarnation, on Mad­
ison avenue, of which Rev. Howard 
Robbins Is rector, provide for a bride's 
room, which Is believed to be an Inno­
vation In church arrangements The 
organ loft In the rear of the chureh* 
will be removed, and In Us plaee a 
beautifully equipped room will be 
built. Here the bride may arrange 
her attire after the drive from home 
and assure bereelf that she Is to readi­
ness for tbe marah to the altar.

CITY GETS MODEL CHARTER
Cleveland, O., le to Abolish All Party 

Elections and Have Recall 
System.

Cleveland, O.—Non-partisan elec 
tlons. with tbe absolute abolition of 
political parties, as far as municipal 
affairs are concerned, is assured to 
Cleveland In the terms of tbe new 
olty charter, which has been com­
pleted. Experts declare the proposed 
charter is a model.

Nominations by petition Instead of 
by primaries and the preferential sys­
tem of voting In elections are to be 
leading features of the new govern­
mental system of tbe city.

It Is aimed to simplify election ma­
chinery and give tbe greatest possible 
expression to the will ot tbe voters, 
who not only are to have their first 
choice for each office counted, but 
their second and other choices as 
well.

Tbe mayor and twenty stx member* 
of the coudcI! are the only city offi­
cials who are to be elected under the 
new charter. All the others are ap­
pointive. Candidates for the elective 
positions are to certify their names 
backed by the signatures of voters 
tbe board of eleotlons and be placed 
upon a non-partisan ballot, carrying 
no party designations of any kind, 
and on which tbe names are to be ro­
tated.

There are to be three columns In 
which cross marks Indicating the will 
of tbe voter may be made. These will 
be headed. "First choice," "Second 
choice" and "other choices." Each 
voter may mark his first and second 
choice for each offioe, and then may 
designate as many 'other choices" as 
he sees fit. If no candidate for office 
receives a majority of tbe first choice 
votes, then the second choices are to 
be counted with the first choices. If 
no one has a majority of both first 
and second choices, the "other 
choices" are to be added, and a major­
ity of all reckoned In determining the 
victor.

The recall Is to apply to all elective 
officials. The mayor may be reculled 
upon the petition of 15,000 voters, and 
a councilman may be recalled upon 
the petition of 800 of his voting con­
stituents.

The mayor and coundlmen are 
elected for two-year terms.

The mayor Is to have the veto, bul 
It Is to be nullified to a Urge extent 
by the provision that any measure 
may be passed by tbe council over the 
veto by a majority vote.

Ordinances may be initiated by peti­
tions which contain tbe names of 5,000 
voters.

LEAD DONKEY TO THE COAST.
Election Loser le Walking From Pork 

land, Maine, to Portland, Oregon,
In Payment.

Newburg, N. Y.—Paying an electloa 
bet, Benjamin H. Anderson, formerly 
general secretary of tbe chamber of 
commerce, and now secretary of tbe 
Butler Ad-men's club of Butler, Pa., Is 
walking from Portland, Me., to Port­
land, Oregon, leading a donkey. Hs 
passed through Nswburg.

Anderson Is a strong admirer of 
Theodore Roosevelt, and was so cer­
tain that tbe colonel would be eleeted 
president that he made a wager with 
Jamea Olllesple, a Democrat of Pitta 
burg, (hat Roosevelt would beat Wil­
son. The loser must walk from Port 
land, Me., to Portland, Oregon, load­
ing behind him the animal emblematic 
of the victorious party. The wager 
also includes ths stipulation that the 
loser must call on tbe president of 
the United States.

Anderson started from Portland, 
Me., March 4. He does not have to 
flnlalTuntll March 4, 1914.

,Bovertlgfts Are Always Hosts.
London —Whan ths king and queen 

honor any of their subjects by being 
present at dinner tbs banquet differs 
from sll others In one respect; tbe 
sovereigns, although actually guests, 
are nominally the boeti of their en­
tertainer. It Is they who lead tbe 
conversation and keep It up, for when 
royalty is disinclined for speech less 
exalted mortals perforce remain quiet

Women Polios for Frisco.
San Francisco,—The board of super 

visors here have decided that of thr 
twenty-five additional polios offioera u 
be appointed, three wtU be wtmtn.

HIS MISSING FORTUNE
Its Hiding R ace Brought to  Light 

Through a  Kind 
A ct

BY FLORENCE L. HENDERSON.
Because John Davis was hungry and 

had to work, and because a  big wind 
Btorm had blown down some bams and 
fences and nearly half the trees in 
Glenvttle, thereby offering that Individ­
ual an opportunity to labor, sunshine 
came suddenly Into the life of pretty, 
patient Ethel Moore.

She needed It, poor girl, and more 
than deserved It, If ever a loving, help- 

| ful daughter and a true and earnest 
sweetheart did. Evep since her mother 
had died Ethel had led a hard, slave- 
like existence. They had not always 
lived at Glenvllle. It was the lure of 
change and a fortune that bad induced 
WiUlam Moore, her-father, ta  abandon 
a fairly prosperous store business In a 
city fifty miles distant, to fill ont, as he 
anticipated, tbe glowing dream ot bis 
life. He bad always longed for a farm, 
and when he woe wired urgently to 
the bedside of his dying brother, Rob­
ert, be felt certain that a t laat the cov­
eted acme of his ambition was In sight.

Robert Moore, reputed a  rich man, 
died before bis brother reached him. 
In bis will he left William everything. 
When "everything" was materialised 
into coherency, to the surprise of bis 
neighbors and the bitter disappoint­
ment of tbe legatee, tbe estate com­
prised only tbe old home, with its 
weather-beaten porch and boarded-up 
cupola, dreary and gloomy In the ex­
treme.

"The plaee will do to live in," mood­
ily decided William Moore, "but what 
bos ever become of tbe stocks and 
bonds and money everybody, knew my 
brother had six months before he 
filed?"

That was still a question unsettled 
;wo years after the Mooree bad taken 
ap their abode At the great, rambling

Drove Her to Her Feet With a Shock.

house, whose original owner bad built 
It as a mansion nest for a  lady who on 
the bridal eve had run away and mar­
ried another suitor: William Moore's 
wife died, he sold out his business and 
then lost his cosh In an unwise specu­
lation.

Then the shoe began to pinch. He 
had a smell bouse In tbe city which 
brought In a certain income, but not 
enough to cover living expensei. 
Ethel learned to do dressmaking and 
bow to. trim bats In season a t tbe vil­
lage millinery store, and her little 
sarnlogs helped to keep tbe wolf from 
the door.-

It waa when Archie Winston ctme 
Into her life that tbe days seemed 
worth while and tbe nights were filled 
with sweet dreams. He held a clerical 
position, where any pretentious salary 
Income w u  in tbe future, and when 
they talked of tbe wedding day they 
referred to It as very far ahead. Ethel 
was loyal to tbe comfort and Interests 
it  bar father, and Archie honored her 
for It and encouraged her In her 
course. Tbe old man had grown sour 
and selfish, and would not bear of a  
change in tbelr domestic relations.

"I may get something yst out of my 
unfortunate Investment,” he was wont 
to say. "If I do I'd feel more certain 
of things,” and then dolefully be would 
finish up with tbe remark: "If we 
oould only find out where all Robert's 
fortune went tot"

It was several days after tbe big 
storm sod tbe fallen and banging limbs 
of tbe giant trees surrounding tbe 
Moore homestead bad not been cleared 
away. William Moore was too en­
grossed over his life disappointment 
to think of mundane tblogs. Ethel 
bad dragged tbe light, stray branches 
to tbe rear of tbe lot. Tbe larger ones 
Aroble bad promised to try and get out 
of tbe way Saturday afternoon.

When Jobo Davis came along one 
morning, however, saw, rope and pole 
fn band, Ethel listened to bis applica­
tion for work with Interest and sym­
pathy.

'Tve been sick for a  long time, Miss 
Moore," be declared, "and not able to 
take a  steady Job for some time ahead. 
About all I'm fitted for la a little spad­
ing or grass mowing, or something like 
cleaning up yards. I'll trim out that 
hanging stuff up around tbe bouse for 
fifty cents and burn all tbe stray 
brush."

Ethel bad a llttls surplus savings.
,ry limited Indeed oompered with tbe

old days of affluence. A dollar now 
was of vast value. She had intended 
to buy some lace to the extent of just 
the amount her pensioner named tc 
trim up a last year’s h a t

"Very well, Mr. DavlB," she agreed 
after a moment or two ot waverini 
thought "It Isn't much to pay, 
though."

"It's a lot to me," sighed Davis,
hinklng of the hungry mouths at 

nome. "You’ll get a blessing for this," 
he added, poking a stray tear from hlf 
eye. "I know that ready money isn’t 
over plentiful with you, and that li 
why I appreciate the work the more."

Ethel went Into the house with 
thoughts of the struggling brood of 
children of John Davis’ In her mind. 
She remembered an old trunk in tbe 
attlo filled with odds and ends, and 
wondered If she would he likely to find 
anything of service to tbe Davis house­
hold.

Several old garments, she discov­
ered, might be utilized. She was kneel­
ing by the trunk, engrossed In her 
task, when a  most unearthly hubbub 
drove her to her feet wlth.a shock.

There was a loud cracking crash 
and the plaster rained down. Then 
some object of Jarring volume ap­
peared to sweep tbe slanting roof thun­
derously. She heard a  cry, a  second 
crash, then another cry.

"Oh, dear! what can have hap­
pened?" gasped Ethel breathlessly.

8be ran down tbe stairs as fast as 
she could. Her first thought was of 
her father. She glanced into tbe sit­
ting room. He was not there. Then, 
as she dished outside, she saw him 
standing in tbe garden, waving bis 
arms frantically.

"You've ruined tbe looks of tbe 
bouse!" be was storming a t John 
Davis.

The latter sat on tbe ground staring 
vacantly at a mass of wreckage near 
by. It was the shattered remnants of 
tbe old cupola.

"It’s a good thing I dodged," be ob­
served. "When I sawed that big limb 
It Just swept that old cupola off tbe top 
of the bouse clean as a whistle. 
Sorry, Mr. Moore, but honestly, It was 
so battered and wobbly the house 
looks hatter without It"

"I think so myself," remarked Ethel, 
immensely relieved to find no one 
seriously Injured. "Are you hurt, Mr. 
Davis?" she Inquired solicitously.

"Oh, no—slid only a few feet with 
the limb," answered Davis. 'T il get 
tbe truck out of tbe way right off. The 
cupola will make good kindling."

Mr. Moore advanced to where the 
ruins of tbe cupola lay. He poked tbe 
shattered boards around with his cane. 
Then Ethel heard him utter a strange 
cry. She ran towards him as he stoop­
ed over and picked something up.

It was a tin box. Her father lifted 
Its catch, threw back the cover and 
nearly fell over as a  great conviction 
illumined bis mind.

"Quick, daughter!" he panted, "Pa­
pers—and money! If it should be my 
brother's missing fortune at last—!”

It was, at last and in full. The hid­
ing place of the missing fortune had 
come to light through Ethel Moore's 
kind deed. It meant so much to Wil­
liam Moore that he seemed to grow 
younger In an hour. He sent John 
Davis home feeling rich, and he told 
Archie and Ethel that evening that 
they might arrange to have the old 
homestead renovated for a wedding.

(Copyright, 191S, by W. O. Chapman.)

BROKE IT TO HIM GENTLY
If Papa Mcetubblns taw  ths Point, Ha

Should Have Appreciated Daugh­
ter's Cleverness.

It was only a  abort time after Lula 
McBtubblne waa married that the 
startling truth wae forced upon bar 
that her young husband was not ex­
actly a teetotaler. One evening a few 
weeks after the wedding that strict 
old cold water man, Papa McStuhhlne, 
dropped In to call. He found bis 
daughter all alone. After a  while he 
asked:

"Where Is Christopher?"
"Well, tbe fact is, Christopher isn't 

feeling very well this evening."
"Is that so? What seems to be tbe 

matter?"
"Well—«r—the fact Is—er—Christo­

pher Is suffering from a  bad attack of 
—of—propinquity.”

"Propinquity—Propinquity/ repeat­
ed the puzzled old gentleman. 
"That's a  dleeaea 1 never heard of. I 
guess you must be mistaken, daugh­
ter.”

"Oh, no, father. Let me explain. 
Propinquity meant Detracts, doesn't 
It?"

”1 guess so.”
"And to be near is to be close, isn’t

it?"
"Em—yes—yes.”
"And when we speak of a  man as 

being close we mean that be Is stingy,
don’t w e r

"Sure”
"And when a  man is stingy we call 

him tight, don't w e f '
"I believe so.”
"Well,” she concluded with a  sigh, 

"that's what's the matter with Chris­
topher.”—London Pun.

Not Unnatural Conclusion.
A distinguished lady from London 

who Is vlstlng In Now York was taken 
by her hoetesi to a  turkey-trotting 
sanctuary night before list. They ar­
rived rather early and only one oouple 
waa on tbe floor. Tbe dancers, how­
ever, were turkey-trotting In tbe most 
approved fashloo and tbe New York 
boeteee called the ettentlon of her 
guest to them.

"That's the real turkey-trot,” she In­
formed her. "Do you see anything ob­
jectionable about It?”

"No,” answered her English guest 
"I cant say that I see anything ob­
jectionable about i t  hut of course he 
Is going to marry tbe lady.”

T H O S E  R H E U M A T IC  

T W IN G E S
Much of tbe rheu­

matic pain that 
comes in damp, 
changing weather is 
tbe work of nric 
acid crystals.

Needles couldn’t 
cat, tear orhurtonv 
worse when the af­
fected muscle joint 
Is used.

If such attacks are 
marked with head­
ache. backache, diz­
ziness and disturb­
ances of tbe urioe, 
it’s time to help tbe 
weakened kidneys.

Doan’s Kidney 
Pills quickly help 
sick kidneys.

A  M i c h i g a n  C u t  
Joslab Hoover, M  9. Oatbertn* St, Bay OUr, 

HIcIl, aart: "My bare sot «o bad l ooaldrrt 
bend over. IofteoOMame to ditty l bad to*it 
down and rasa Doctor* bad fallad to help rap, 
and 1 waa grow I Qf ibla oad weak. Doao'aKId- 
nor PlUa wont right to tbo apot. tbroo boxes 
obi1d(  maootDplotelf. 1 bare nod Bo troabU 
since/'

Got Dean's at Aey SSom, IOe a Boa

D O A N ' S  V .V mY
fostemulburn co„ buffalo, n, y.

Many a mao's Interest In a  woman 
is confined to wondering what fool 
thing she will do next

Mia. Wlnotewn Snotblnf Syrvp tor Children 
toothing, eoAono tbo gnma, roliaaao laflossn- 
Uen^Uego peln^mreo wind eoUeAe n beStioAM

Old-Fashioned Birds.
"I like to wander In the park."
"The birds do sing sweetly.”
"Yes; and they never sing ragtime/

Hie Trade.
"That man yonder leads a  doubts 

life/'
"You don't say so!”
"Yes. He yells duplicating ma­

chines." * .

Talking Shop.
Enthusiastic interest In one's occu­

pation Is always an advantage, but on 
the other hand, It Is not well for a 
woman In business to talk of her work 
a t all times and places. Naturally, 
tbe thing that we do constantly Is our 
most absorbing Interest, but we must 
remember that other people have 
other tblnfcs to talk about.

How They Measured.
“From tbe meadow the road began 

to ascend, and about noon we started 
to climb Greeley Hill— a thirteen mile 
road leading to Us summit. As tbe 
afternoon began to wane, and we had 
zigzagged our way over what seemed 
to us thirteen miles of road, we met a 
resident of the region and ventured to 
ask him how they measured miles In 
that country.

" 'Oh. we Just let a greyhound loose, 
and when he drops dead, that’s a 
mile/ was tbe reply."—Suburban Life 
Magazine.

Solving s Problem In Arithmetic.
Little Marlon was busy with her 

"home work." After a great a m /  
perplexed frowns and much nibbling 
at her pencil she looked up and said: 
"Tbo only answer that I can get to 
thb example Is five and three-fourths 
boiiiei. Do you 'spose that Is right,
m&iQma?"

"Well,, 1 don’t know," answered her 
mother, cautiously. "It sounds rather 

-queer."
A long pause; then the small arith­

metician’s face lit up with a smile. 
"Oh, I know," she cried. ’Til reduce 
the three-fourths horses to colts."

Juvenile Altruism. N
Little Paul came In to ask bis 

mother If Alfred and be might each 
have a cooky. Hli mother purposely 
gave him two of different sizes. In­
terested as to which Paul would give 
hli guest, she stepped to tbe door Just 
In time to see Paul give tbe smaller 
cako to his playmate.

"Why, Paul/’ she called, "don't you 
know that you should hare kept that 
one yourself?"

"Yes, I know/’ was tbe nonchalant 
reply. "But, you see, I was afraid 
that If I gave Alfred ths biggest one 
be might get sick!"

In Summer—
W hen the body needs 

but little food, that little 
should be appetizing and 
nourishing.

T h e n  ab ou t th e  b est  
and most convenient thing 
one can have handy i$ a  
package of

Post
Toasties
T h u  food ii fully cook­

ed — crisp , d e lic io u s  and  
ready to serve direct from 
the package.

Post Toasties with fresh 
straw b erries an d  cream  
are hard to beat.

“The Memory Lingers”

$•14 by Orscsrt.
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EXPERIENCE 
OF MOTHERHOOD

Advice to Expectant Mothers

Tb« experience of Motheifcood U a  try­
ing on« to most women tad  marks dis­
tinctly an epoch in their Uvea. Notona 
woman In a hundred Is prepared or on* 
derstands how to properly care for her* 
se ll Of course nearly every woman 
nowadays has medical treatment a t such 
times, but many approach the experi­
ence with an organism unfitted for the 
trial of strength, and when It la over 
her system has received a shock from 
which It Is hard to recover. Following 
right upon this comes the nervous strain 
o f caring for the child, sod a  distinct 
change In the mother results.

There Is nothing more charming than 
•happy and healthy mother of children, 
and indeed child-birth under the right 
conditions need be no hazard to health or 
beauty. The unexplainable thing is 
that, with all the evidence of shattered 
serves and broken health resulting from 
an unprepared condition, and with am­
ple time In which to prepare, women 
will persist in going blindly to the trial.

Every woman a t this time should rely 
upon Lydia E. Pinkham’a Vegetable 
Compound, a  most valuable tonic and 
invigorator of the female organism.

In m any  homes 
once childless there 
are now children be­
cause of the fact 
that Lydia E. Pink- 
ham’s V e g e ta b le  
Compound m a k e s  
w om en n o rm a l,  
healthy and strong.

If  yoi want special advice write t#  
Lydia E. Plnkkam Medicine Co. (ceil* 
Bestial) Ljbb» Mass. Tear letter will 
he opened, read sad answered fey a  
ireiaaa and held In strict confidence.

BELGIUM OINTMENT
at Hardwire aad Hu m * Stores 

E. H. HADFIELD, gif. 
Waukesha, Wit. PRICE 50o 

Guaranteed to Cure
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MAKE SALADS OF ALL KINDS
Many Tatty and Savory Diahea Are 

Easily Prepared at a Very 
Small Expense.

I may have told of the clever Uttla 
housewife who used to make a^veai 
pot pie with “plenty of gravy and sink* 
era and not much meat." Take a leaf 
out of her book and feed your family 
on stews with vegetables and light, 
delicate dumplings and well seasoned 
gravy, and see if this will not suit 
them as well as meat In coarse abund­
ance. Try Italian combinations of 
macaroni and cbeese or noodles and 
cheese enriched with a meat gravy. 
Make savory rice dishes in which the 
meat is a neglible quantity and Is yet 
sufficient to render the oompound ap 
petlzlng. Introduce aalada of all kinds, 
with French dressing or mayonnaise 
or one of the good boiled dressings. 
Turn to the generous choice of vege­
tables that come to ua In the summer.

Fill tomatoes or peppers or cucum­
bers or egg plant or potatoes with a 
well seasoned stuffing which contains 
no meat or only enough to give zest to 
the food. Compose scallops along the 
same line and vegetable stews of s 
like kind.

Do you think I am contradicting my­
self when I tell you lu one breath to 
simplify life and in the next urge you 
to study variety? The two pieces of 
counsel do not Interfere with one an­
other. The time and strength you 
save by reducing the work of keeping 
your house clean and in order -is not 
all spent in cookery, even If you have 
novelties on your table. They ueed 

jiot require much care or labor and the 
change of menu, like the change you 
achieve by altering your room and Its 
furnishings, will give you something 
different that will be an equivalent to 
fresh surroundings. Try it and see if 
I am not In the right.

HINTS FOR THE HOME SEWER
80ms Useful Suggestions for Those 

Who Try to Do Their Own 
Needlework.

The soft wash silk shirt waist is 
made more or less plain, according to 
the figure that its wearer possesses. 
For those who are plump the plainest 
models are chosen. But shoulders are 
long and so are sleeves.

The neck of these waists Is finished 
with a turnover collar and tie. The 
collar is soft and rather high at the 
back. Cuffs are turned back, and link 
buttons are worn with some of them.

By the way of a little frivolity, ja- 
bota of net or lace provide a finishing 
touch which seems superfluous with 
the four-in-band tie, but Is neverthe­
less in evidence.

When made up for a slender figure 
these waists are set to a yoke in the 
back and fulled into the shoulder seam 
In front The collars are widened.

Soft waists of crepe doth are made 
plain with long sleeves and wide sailor 
collars, as well as in the regulation 
designs just described. Turnback 
cuffs are often finished with crystal 
buttons. These waists are opened at 
the throat

Flavored Vinegars.
Flavored vinegars are welcome addi­

tions to the spring salad. One which 
is useful for potato or meat salads, 
which are Improved by the addition of 
a little onion flavor, le made by grat­
ing two large Spanish onions and let­
ting them stand with two teaspoonfuls 
of sugar for an hour or so and then 
adding a quart of vinegar. Bottle this 
and shake the bottles every day for 
a couple of weeks, then strain the 
vinegar through cheesecloth and bottle 
It in small bottles, cork» and keep in 
a cool- dry place until it Is wanted. 
It Is better to bottle it permanently 
in small bottles, so that when only a 
little of H is wanted only a little need 
be uncorked.

Eggs Stuffed With Chttee.
Stuffed eggs are always welcome, 

but never more so than when the 
stuffing contains cbeese. Boll the eggs 
hard, then remove the yolks; mash 
them well and add an equal quantity 
of grated cheese—the yellower and 
snappier the better. Add paprika and 
■alt, also a  very little mustard if de­
sired. Moisten with melted butter, 
cream or olive oil, according to one's 
preference. A few drops of onion 
juice may atoo be added. Bpinacb 
makes an agreeable garnish for this 
dish.

To Remove a Broken Screw. ,
To remove a screw with one side of 

the head broken off, place the screw 
driver against one side of the bead, 
and with a small block press firmly 
against the screw driver, at the same 
time turning tbs scisw driver and the 
block. The screw will come out almost 
as easily as if the bead was intact .

Turkish Delight
Stir together and bring to a boll ono 

quart granulated sugar and one cup 
water. Add one box gelatin, dissolved 
In one cup cold wster, and boll ten 
minutes. Add Juice of a lemon and 
orange and cook ten minutes more. 
Cut in squares and roll In pulverized 
sugar. A aubstltute for candy.

To Atop a Leak.
To stop a leak, mix whiting and yel­

low soap into a thick paste with a lit­
tle water. Apply this to the place 
where the leakage is and It will be 
instantly stopped. A visit from the 
plumber will still be necessary, but 
there Is no special burry for more radi­
cal repairs.

Cooking Vogotabtos.
To preserve the color of green vege 

tables, put them on to cook in boiling 
water into wblcb a pUv& of salt ha/ 
been dropped.

SOUTHERNER HAD NO STATE
Offiosr Was Bom In Territory, Father

In District of Columbia and Grand- 
fathor a t Boa.

Just before the Civil War, when the 
muttering* of seceulon were heard 
throughout the south, a number of 
West Point officers came together at a 
military station, among them one
of whom, we will call Captain H-----,
slid who afterward served with dis­
tinction in the Union army. Ths 
southern officers, one by one, declared 
their Intention of "going out," aa It 
was then familiarly called; that ls> 
of resigning their federal commissions 
to throw in their lot with their several 
states. H----- , In relating the Inci­
dent that follows, said that great pres­
sure was brought to bear upon him 
to join them.

"Why, don't you go with us. Cap­
tain H— ?’* said one of his acquaint­
ances.

"Why should I go with you?" said
H----- , who bad a certain southern
swarthiness of feature and softness 
of speech.

"Aren't you going to go with your 
state?"

“Why, I haven't any state," be rw 
plied; "I was born In a territory "

"Oh, thunder!" said another. "Why 
don't you go with your father’s state, 
then?"

"Can't," protested II-----; "he hadn't
any state; he was bom in the District 
of Columbia.”

"Oh, hang it!" broke In a  third; "U 
that's the case, why don’t you go with 
your grandfather's state?"

"Just as difficult," said H----- ; "my
grandfather hadn't any state; he was 
born at sea." And then be added: "Ob, 
d o , boys, It's easy enough for you fel­
lows to go with your states, or"—fix­
ing hie eyes significantly on one of 
the party—"with your wUe’s state; but 
as for me. I Intend to sund by the old 
flag.”—From the Century.

HEAD PIERCED BY A BULLET
Though Thought to Be Mortally

Wounded Jamee Buggle of Chicago 
Lives to Tell of War.

James Buggle. who Is the assistant 
custodian at Chicago headquarters of 
the Grand Army, stopped three Con­
federate bullets before he bad reached 
the age of sixteen. The last one 
nearly brought about the close of his 
young career.

"I enlisted In November, 1862,” be 
said, "and I waa not fifteen years un­
til December 22. 1 was under firs
less than a month after I bad been 
mustered Into the service. My regi­
ment, the Sixty-fourth Illinois, was 
at Decatur, Ala., in March and April, 
and then went Into the Atlanta cam­
paign. I was wounded first at 
Xleseca, again a t Kenesaw mountain 
and again at Atlanta. A ball struck 
me In the forehead, went through my 
head, blinding one aye and injuring 
the other, and came out behind the 
right ear. It broke both Jawbones, 
too.

"The battle of Kenesaw mountain 
was the hardest I was in. Our com­
pany went into It with thlrty-slx men 
and came out with five, and they were 
all wounded. We had to climb a 
steep slope. Tn that battle Genera! 
McPherson was shot by some men In 
ambush. We caught them and took 
from the knapsack of one of them the 
field glasses tnd private papers he had 
taken from the general's body."

The Limit.
An Irishman At a magazine explo­

sion was picked up unconscious. The 
doctor decided be had no bones brok­
en and had only been knocked unite- 
less. As he esme to hie senses the 
doctor was bolding a g lu t  of water 
to his Ups.

"Phat happened?" be asked.
"The magazine exploded, and yon 

had a very narrow escape, and I'm 
giving you this water to revive you,M 
replied the doctor.

"Oivln* me watber after bein' biow­
ad up?" said Pat Id disgust. "In 
Hirin'* name what would have to hap­
pen ter git er drink of wbusky?"

"Muttered In" With Beal Mustard.
The boys of the 117th N. T. tell of 

a real "mustering" In of a  darky at­
tached to that regiment, who became 
fearful he would be deprived of his 
pay unless be joined the service. A 
huge mustard plaster was applied to 
bis back, and under the belief that all 
soldiers were thus "mustered" In he 
wore It until It began to gst pretty 
hot. Then they took It off and be 
was formally declared "mustered In," 
according to the law. If that darky 
didn’t get bis wages It waa not be- 
toure he was not "mustered" in good 
and plenty.

UST OF COOK’S SKILL

Grim Humor.
Kven on the field of battle the iol- 

died Is humorous, sometimes grimly 
•0. A soldier was seen in the trenches 
bolding his hands above the esrtfr 
works. His oaptaln asked:

"What are you doing that for?*
He replied with a grim, as be 

worked his fingers; "I'm feeling for 
a furlough (just then a rifle ball 
struck him In the wrist, and a queer 
commingling of pain and hi/ruor 
passed over his face), an' 1 get a die 
charge"

PROPER PREPARATION OF THE 
SWEET POTATO AN ART.

At Least an Hour in the Oven Is N t^
•Mary Properly to Bake Potato-^ 

Boms Useful Hints and 
Recipes.

If you would know the sweet pota­
to In all Its sweetness and goodness, 
you must leisurely tour the sunny 
south In “sweet tater time," when the 
entire clan of sweet Is in its glory and 
prime. While the Jerseys are a very 
superior class, they lack the variety 
found In the southern family. Color 
and flavor range from the sleek, 
smooth red-coated sweet to the thin- 
skinned pale yellow and less sweet 
variety which will be sold you as 
white potato In some markets of the 
south unless you ask for Irish pota­
toes. The great coarse yam that 
looks like an overgrown sweet, and 
sometimes weighs five or six pounds, 
Is not & sweet potato a t all. However, 
It to a good substitute for the potato; 
is mealy and dry, and contains a large 
amount of starch. It Is not sweet, and 
is a wholesome food, though most peo­
ple have to cultivate a taste for It-

To bring out the delicate flavor of 
the sweet potato is an art. Most cooks 
•poll it by cooking too quickly. At 
least an hour In the oven is essential 
to properly bake a sweet potato.

To Boil Sweet Potatoes—Wash the 
potatoes well without breaking the 
•kins. Clip the roots that adhere, put 
them In a kettle of boiling water and 
let them cook until they can be easily 
pierced to the center with a fork, 
without being actually soft Drain 
off the water and set the kettle 
back on tbe stove, or in the oven, with 
a cloth thrown over tbe top and let 
steam about five minutes, so they will 
be mealy. Peel them at once, and 
serve plain with roast pork or beef. 
When served with fried or broiled fish, 
accompany them with a drawn butter 
sauce, or cut them In thick slices, but­
ter well and set tbo dish In tbe oven 
a few minutes.

A Fast Day Dish.—This is a popular 
creole breakfast dish served on 
fast days: Take rather large, smooth 
potatoes, peel them and fry in round 
slices and fry in deep, hot fat, same as 
Saratoga chips, until a fine brown. 
Serve in a hot dish with plenty of 
batter poured over them.

Aunt Laura’s Way—Boll the pota­
toes as directed, then peel them and 
cut in rather thick lengthwise slices. 
Lay them in a deep dish and pour over 
each layer of slices a sauce made ac­
cording to these directions: Take a 
cup each of sugar and butter and half 
a cup of hot water and boll until this 
Is thick. Some like a  little grating of 
nutmeg; others a small piece of atlck 
cinnamon boiled in the sirup.

Caramel Sweet Potatoes—Boll the po­
tatoes until just done; drala, peel and 
cut In halves lengthwise and fry a 
rich brown in lard and butter mixed. 
•Sprinkle generously, while frying, with 
granulated sugar.

Sweet Potato Biscuit—Take one
square of dry, mealy sweet' potatoes 
boiled and grated, half cup lard, half 
a cake of compressed yeast dissolved 
In half a cup of lukewarm water; mix 
with milk or water to a  batter, and let 
rise twice. Bake tbe same as tea bis* 
Cult and break open and butter hot.

Frizzled Ham.
Cut about a pound of fat bam Into 

i t  thin slices as possible. Put a fry­
ing pan over tbe fire and let It become 
rmoking hot, then put in tbe slices 
>f ham and fry for two or three mlu- 
ltes. Then dust them with dry flour 
and continue to cook until tbe flour is 
orown. During this time have mixed 
one tablespoonful each of vinegar and 
lry mustard together. When tbe 
floured meat Is brown, add the mus­
tard and viaegar, together with suffi­
cient bolting water to cover the ham. 
Boll gently for a  minute and serve. 
Eggs may be cooked with the ham in 
place of the flour and water.

Bsked Dried Fsas.
Take green whole peas and soak 

over night. In tbe morning pour wa­
ter off, rinse by pouring bolting water 
over them, then put a small piece of 
pork In ths bean pot and put peas 
In it, cover with water and put In oven 
to bake. Keep them well watered and 
oovered while baking. We tike them 
very much, and for an ecouomy meal 
try these with a good johnny peas In 
U, cover with water and put in oven 
early In morning they will be ready for 
dinner.

Cedis.
Cook enough cold cooked beef or 

mutton to make a quart, add one-half 
cup of dry bread crumbs, one table­
spoon of chopped parsley, one tea­
spoon of salt, one-eighth teaspoon of 
black popper. Dissolve one-half tea- 
•poon extract of beef In one-half cup 
of boiling water, when thoroughly dis­
solved add to the meat aud then two 
well-beaten eggs. Mold Into small 
balla, dip In egg and cracker and fry 
In hot fat. Serve with brown sauce.

To Clean Knives.
A good knife cleaning board is made 

by taking a piece of board ten Inches 
ang and elx inches wide. Tack on to 
pits piece of Brussels carpet sod 
prtnkle with fine emery. Knives 
.nibbed on this will clean well and 
with little labor.

To Moisten Citron.
M o re  slicing citron, lay It In a 

■n a il strainer and place on top of the 
taakettl > for a few minutes. The 
steam will soften tbe citron aud make 
U easier to cut.—National Magazine.

GOOD TIMES IN CANADA
BU8 INE8 8  PROSPERING, TRADE

INCREASING AND FINANCES 
IN GOOD SHAPE.

The present tightening up of money 
must not be looked upon as being In 
any sense brought about by financial 
stringency. It la really more a period 
of stock-taking resorted to by the 
banks to ascertain the true condition 
of the finances and trade of the coun­
try. Legitimate business enterprises 
ar* not affected. Throughout the 
States there are those who If allowed 
to continue borrowing, would inev­
itably be a means towards precipi­
tating something a good deal worse 
than they feel now. In Canada, the 
conditions are excellent, and It Is 
safe to aay business was never bet­
ter. Tbe pulse of trade Is carefully 
watched by the Finance Department 
of the Dominion government, and it 
Is illuminative to read portions of tbe 
address of Hon. W. T. White, tbe 
Finance Minister, delivered a few days 
ago before the House of Commons. 
Mr. White’s remarks are In part as 
follows:

"It falls agreeably to my lot to ex­
tend my most hearty congratulations 
to the House and the country upon 
tbe prosperous conditions which it 
continues to be our good fortune to 
enjoy. I am happy to announce that 
the outcome of the last fiscal year, 
which ended on March 31, will prove 
even more satisfactory as reflecting 
by far the highest pitch to which our 
national prosperity has yet attained. I 
have every expectation that when tbe 
books are closed. It will be found that 
tbe total revenue will have reached 
the splendid total of $168,250,000, or 
an Increase over the year 1911-12 of 
over $32,000,000. Some Indication of 
Abe magnificent growth of the Domin­
ion may be gleaned from the fact that 
this Increase In revenue during tbe pe­
riod of one year almost equals the en­
tire revenue of the country seventy 
years ago.

“The augmentation of revenue to 
which I have referred has not been 
Irregular, spasmodic or intermittent 
In its nature, but has steadily charac­
terized each month of the entire fiscal 
year. It was of course mainly derived 
from Customs receipts, but the other 
sources of revenue—excise, post office 
and railways—also gave u b  very sub­
stantial Increases "

"That In a  period of great finan­
cial stringency not only have we not 
been obliged to resort to the con­
gested markets of the world, but have 
been able to reduce-so substantially 
($23,000,000) tbe debt of tbe Domin­
ion, must be a  matter of gratification, 
both to tbe Houso and to tbe people 
of Canada.

"I believe tbat during this period 
of exceptional money stringency tbe 
credit of tbe Dominion as reflected in 
tbe quotations of its securities has 
maintained Itself among tbe highest 
in the world."

Owing to tbe favorable state of Its 
finances Canada was in a position to 
pay off a heavy loan in cash without 
recourse to tbe Issue of bills or se­
curities.—Advertiiement.

Just a Bit Mixed.
London Is laughing over a story 

which has recently come out concern 
log Lloyd George. It appears that 
shortly after the death of King Ed 
ward an Englishman traveling in 
Wales got into talk with an elderly 
Welshman and happened to be tbe 
first to tell him ot tbe klug's demise 

"And who might be king now?'' 
asked the Welshman.

"Why, George is king now." 
"George!" be exclaimed in surprise. 

"Well, bow be has got on, to be sure 
—and me to remember him as a little 
lawyer In Criccleth!"

RASH ON FACE FOR 2  YEARS
Sioux Falls, B. D.—"My trouble of 

skin disease started merely as a rash 
on my face and neck, but it grow and 
kept getting worse until large scabs 
would form, fester and break. This 
was Just on tba one side of my face, 
but It soon scattered to tbe other 
side. I puttered a great deal, especial 
ly at night, on account of Its itching 
and burning. I would scratch it and 
of course tha t Irritated It very much. 
This rash waa on my face for about 
two years, sometimes breaking out 
lots worse and forming larger sores 
It kept me from sleeping day or night 
for a  couple of months. My face look 
#d disgraceful and I was almost 
ashamed to be seen by my friends.

"A friend asked me to try Cutlcurs 
Soap and Cutlcurs Ointment. 1 would 
bathe my with hot water and a 
lot of CuUcura Soap, tbeo I would put 
on tbe Cutlcurs Ointment. In less 
than two days’ time, tbe soreness and 
inflammation bad almost entirely dis­
appeared, and in four weeks’ time you 
oould not see any of ths rash. Now 
my face Is without a  spot of any kind. 
I also use them for my scalp and hair. 
They cured me completely," (Signed) 
Miss Pansy Hutchins, Feb. 6, 1912.

Cutlcura Soap and Ointment sold 
throughout tbe world. Sample of each 
free, with 82-p. Skin Book. Address 
post-card "Cutlcura, Dept L, Boston." 
A d v . ________________

Opposing Tendencies.
“When you Insulted Jaggs, did be 

hesitate before giving you a soft an­
swer?"

"Yes; be swallowed bard."

Many Plante "Left-Handed." 
Habits of plants analogous to the 

right-handedness and left-handedness 
of man have been reported to the 
Cambridge, England, Philosophical 
society by R. H. Compton.

In an examination of eight varieties 
of two-rowed barley, tbe first leaf was 
found to twist to the left in 58 per 
cent, of more than 12.000 seedlings, 
and an excess of left handed growth 
was found also in millet and in oats.

In corn there seemed to be no 
marked tendency either way. No evi- 
dence of hereditary peculiarity ap­
pears to have been obtained and no 
special significance of the results Is 
pointed ou t

Poison Oak or Ivy Poisoning 
Is quickly relieved by bathing tbe af­
fected parts in a solution of two tea­
spoonfuls of Tyree's Antiseptic Fow- 
dcr to a pint of water. 25c. a t all 
druggists or sample sent free by J. 8 . 
Tyree, Washington, D. C.—Adv.

Showing Him the Road. 
Tourist—l ot Just a bit doubtful 

which Is my right road here, my good 
man; perhaps you can direct me—T 

Villager—A pleasure, sir, ‘deed 'tie; 
that there road 11 take e to Bill Wat­
son's, an* this 't-re turn to ’Any 
Thompson's—Bill keeps Mr best ale, 
but if you want 'bacca as well, tnko 
this ’ere turn—Bill don't keep no 
shag—only twist.—London Bystander.

Not Always Palatable.
"Truth ties at the bottom of a well." 
"Then 00 wonder there is so mush 

well water which Is contaminated."

Nothing Llks It.
"Is your doctor an eclectic in bis 

practice?"
"No; he’s a teetotaler.’

Im portant to M others
Examine carefully every bottle of 

CASTORIA, a  safe and sure remedy for 
Infants and children, and see that It

Bears the 
Signature of 
In Use For Over 30 Years.
Children Cry lor Fletcher’s CastorU

Could Have Saved Her.
“Why do you hate her so?"
"She ueed to be engaged to my hus­

band."
“And didn't marry him. Oh, I see."

Gee Whiz.
“Did tbe ploy have a happy end­

ing?”
"Quite the reverBP. The sheriff at­

tached the scenery for debt”

The Army of 
Constipation
Is Growing Smeller Every Dey.
CARTER’S LITTLE 
LIVER PILLS are
responsible — they 
not only give relief 
— they perma 
nentlycurcC«*
•tipstiot. Mil 
lions u s e  
them for
BillOBSMM, ^
Ifjifftties, Sick Headache, SalW SUa.
SMALL PUX, SMALL DOSE, SMALL PRICE.

G enuine must bear Signature

SPECIAL TO WOMEN
Do you realize tbe fact tbat thousands* 

of women are now using

A SolubU Antiseptic Powder
as a remedy for mucous membrane a£ 
fectlons, such as sore throat, nasal 09 
pelvic catarrh, Inflammation or ulcer* 
tlon, caused by female ilia? Woman 
who bar# been cured say "It Is worth 
Its weight In gold." Dissolve In wster 
and apply locally. For ten years the 
Lydia HI. Plnkham Medicine Co. baa 
recommended Paxtine in their privata 
correspondence with women.

For all hygienic and toilet uses It baa 
no equal. Only 50c a large box at Drug* 
gifts or sent postpaid on receipt of 

Ice. The Paxton Toilet Co., Boston,

W H I M  R .C tl^ M I .W M SPATENTS
LADIES S3 milUrcaets sn au tr  or. ••

Jinyror# tour own be»ety fane*. PartiruUn fra*.
Kibreaf fUMi., Mvcvroa, r*.

W. N. U« MILWAUKEE, NO. 24-1913.

Milwaukee Directory

[^a t - £ x i t

NAfJ MICE ROACMIS

M il l  C c M M k a l  
•*S g if cell v* 
R*—4v. lafttll- 
M ii la l
msUM t* b**4U. 
AJ «tl 4r«|4*l*, 
IB, 28 7N.

1 WlwomlnPhinuciiCo WMXiV.vr.

r n r r  to every woman
■ I  ■ ■  f c  ■ *  who writes, one copy of 
I  I  I L L  “ Lfdie*' Cyrloprdia of 
■  Health and Beauty " This
book tells bow to cultivate health and 
beauty, what to umc, gad bow to um it

THE IE. & C. SPECIALTY COMPANY
838-MO THIRD Art. MILWAUKEE. WIS.

IT IS LOST 
OPPORTUNITY
to MOVING HCTUKK MEN and Locality 
Seekers to overlook any town where the 
Mutual Program Is not represented. Why? 
Because briefly the MUTUAL PROGRAM 
if the Prr.gram of QUALITY and the pro­
gram for tiie People. It has the necessary 
attractive elemeuh to establish a permanent 
patronage. It reigns supreme 'a!<ovc all 
others: has no equal In Competition; thus 
assuring successful results. The following 
are bu! a few of the towns in Wisconsin 
open for such an opportunity. A complete 
list will be furnished ojk»o application: 
Antlgo Kfcukauu* Tomahawk
Haralxjo UorAvtcr SbcbtofAD
BurJi&fton Two Itlrmrg

JJM» M'wroe WaupUA
JatMevlUe CMpprwa Falls
We guarantee Exclusive and continaed
MUTUAL service to our customers la 
competitive localities.

WESTERN FILM EXCHANGE
iatorpriss BteMtof Milwaukee, tfto,

H
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D O N T DO T H A T !
you'l l  v /a n t  it
So m e ,? ..*  i, a

I

i
i
:

: THE

Negaunee Slate Bank
Commercial and 
Savings Bank.

w

I

% INTEREST ON DEPOSITS.
$ 1 . 0 0 — Opens an A cco u n t— $ 1 . 0 0

ASE FOR ONE OF OUR

I H r o m e  S a v i n g s  B a n k s .
THESE BANKS LOANED TO DEPOSITORS.

\

Y o u  a r e  c o r d i a l l y  i n v i t e d  to  i n ­
s p e c t  o u r  r \ew  B a n k  b u ild ir ig .
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A WEEK'S NEWS NOTES
Paragraphs About Negaunee 

Affairs.

A COLUMN OF LOCAL HAPPENIN6S

Interesting Items About Towns­
people and Their Business 

and Social Affairs.

- ’You can now send parcel post 
packages C. O. D.

—Negaunee people are celebrating 
In Isbpeming to-day.

—The banks of this city will be clos­
ed od July 4th and 5tb,

—An open-air band concert would 
certainly be appreciated these warm 
evenings.

—The Noguuneo City Hand Is fur­
nishing music for the celebration in 
Republic to day.

—Mrs. 1). H. Merritt, wife of one 
of Marquette's oldest residents, died 
at her home in that city last Satur­
day, aged 74 years.

—With Ibe loss of the "g lu e" 'fo r 
future campaigns the bull moosers 
aru taking more kindly to the propo­
sition to stick to the 0 . U. K

—County Clerk Frank G. Jenks was 
elected president of the Couoty Clerks' 
Association of Michigan at a aeatloo 
of the association held in Saginaw 
last Friday.

—Tbe I ron Herald goes to press 
a  few hours earlier this week so that 
the employes of tbeoffloe may have an 
opportunity like other folks to oele* 
brate to-morrow, July 4th.

—It surely will be a saoe Fourth In 
Negaunee.

—To-day—July 4th—is the day we 
celebrate.

—And tbe mosquitoes still continue 
to buzz around.

—Last Sunday was a very warm 
day, the thermometer registering oyer 
ninety-sU in tbe shade.

—Cold potatoes, used instead of soap 
when washing the bands, will remove 
all grit and make the skin smooth and 
soft.

—Tbe married women and young 
ladles of St. Caul's church, will re­
ceive Holy Communion in a body next 
Sunday morning at 6 o'clock.

—No matter how nice the weather 
seems to be, there Is still always 
something the matter with it. A short
time ago It was too cold, now it Is too 
hot.

—As long as you couldn’t be a June 
bride, girls, try to be July, August 
September, October, November, De­
cember, January, February, March, 
April or May bride.

a  Big Hoad
Is of two kinds. The kind that 

comes from sick headache, torpid 
liver, and biliousness, however, Is cur­
able. Does your head feel dizzy at 
times with spells of blind staggers and 
ringing noises in tbe ears? These are 
symptoms of a diseased liver and 
a clogged state of tbe bowels. The 
remedy is DU. HERUiCK’8 SUGAR- 
COATED PILLS. They are mild, 
easy to  take and clean you out beau­
tifully, Trv them. Price 26cts. 
Sold oy J. K. O'Dooogbue. City Drug 
Store.

—Hey. H. A. Uuchholtz, pastor of 
St. Paul’s church, delivered tbe com­
mencement address at tbe Baraga 
High School in Marquetteoo tbe 26tb 
ult. His subject wan "Christian Edu­
cation."

—Tbe Arc department responded to 
an alarm from box 23 about 10 o'clock 
Monday morning, afire bavlogorigi­
nated io a pll# of refuse close to tbe 
barn of Nets Hansen, Clark street. 
Although the blase had connected with 
tbe barn It was extinguished before 
tbe arrival of tbe department, which 
was upon tbe scene with Its usual 
promptness.

kurprtslng Cure o! Btomacb Trouble 
When you have trouble with your 

stomach or chronic constipation, aoo’t 
imagine that your cas«* Is beyond help 
just because your doctor faffs to give 
you relief. Mrs. G. fiteogle, Plain- 
field, N. J ., writes, "For oyer a month 
past I have been troubled with my 
stomach. Everything I ate upset ft 
terriblp. One of Chamberlain's ad­
vertising booklets came to me. After 
reading a few of tbe letters from peo*

Gle who had been cured by Cbamoer* 
iln'i Tablets. I decided to try them. 

I have taken nearly three-fourths of a 
package of them and can now eat al­
most everything that I warn." For 
aa,e by J. K. O’Donogbue.

—The Empire mine is to resume op­
erations this week. ,

—While swatting tbe fly ’tis well to 
remember to cover the sugar and but­
ter bowls,

—A number of men were laid off at 
the Volunteer mines during
the past week.

—Ore shipments are falling off. the 
market being disturbed by the uncer­
tainty as to tariff legislation.

—August Tarvljarvi lost a valua 
ble horse last Sunday, tbe horse hav 
ing died from the heat while engaged 
in hauling household furniture for a 
family that was moving to tbe Collins 
addition.

—Now that many a young fellow bag 
finished school and is going out into 
tbe world to make a living for himself 
U Is well to remember that success Is 
dependent upon honesty, industry, 
promptness and doing one's best.

—H. E. Harrington, of Detroit, who 
has general supervision of the equip­
ment for tbe Michigan State Telephone 
Company, Is expected to spend a few 
days in this city and Ishpemlng in­
specting the company's plant. Cer­
tainly needs some attention. 9

—Rev. Fr. Dtngfelder, p fS t. Paul's 
church, officiated a t tbe marriage 
Monday morning, of Philip Belpidlo 
and Miss Rose Carso, both of this 
olty. The ceremony was performed 
at St. Paul’s church at 10 o ’clock and 
was witnessed by a number of Invited 
friends,

—Some terms are misleading to 
many people. "Commencement," 
while it is always associated with tbe 
close of school, really means the be­
ginning of responsible individual life, 
for which tbe years of school training 
and discipline have been, or should 
have been, a fitting preparation.

—A boy came home from school 
sobbing with all bis might because 
his teacher had whipped him. His 
father ioqulred tbe trouble. "You 
know when I asked you last night," 
said tbe boy, "what a million dollars 
was and you said It was a bell of a 
lot of mooey? Well, that ain’t tbe 
right answer."

—The young fellow who goes forth 
to fight the battle of life with a 
healthy body, clean life, good educa­
tion, strong resolution, tbe blessing 
of his parents, and with but five dol­
lars io his pocket is to be envied. He 
is far better equipped for life than tbe 
pampered youth who has well nigh 
unlimited spending mooey.

—The firemen will make an effort to 
secure tbe annual tournament foroext 
year. They will take onp or twp lo­
cal spell-binders %ith them to tbe 
copper cobntry, to enlarge on the 
many reasons why Maoistlque should 
be selected. Here’s hoping that they 
will secure the recognition.—Maois­
tlque Pioneer-Tribune.

—Thomas Ellis Is building an ad­
dition to his home in Barn street.

—The next state convention of* the 
Ancient Order of Hibernians (1914) 
will be held in Calumet.

—E. J. Townsend, of this city, has 
been elected president of tbe Ishpern 
ing Y. M. C. A. Tenpts Club.

—William J. Locher, aged 35 years 
and well known throughout the coun 
tv, died at his home in Ishpemlng on 
Monday.

—The members of tbe Danish Sis 
terhood enjoyed a very pleasant time 
at an annual picnic held at Cleveland 
grove Wednesday.

—Mr. and Mrs. Joseph Frechette 
rejoice over the arrival of a baby girl 
on Tuesday at their borne at tbe corn 
er of Cyr and Snow streets.

—Tbe Marquette County Gas & 
Electric Company has offered free fan 
service for tbe benefit of persons serl 
ousiy 111 who are unable pay for the 
service. It is a public welfare propo 
litioo.

—"W e stand at Armegedon sod 
battle for the Lord" Is in It no longer 
Tbe Democrats have got it skinned 
forty blocks. Tbe new version reads: 
"We stand at Woodrow’s gate and 
squeal like h—1 for pie."

—Last Sunday was probably the 
hottest day of the summer so far, the 
mercury registering nearly 100 in tbe 
’shade. Frequeot showers, combined 
with the hot weather, have forced the 
garden truck along at a tremendous 
rate.

—Tbe preliminary survey of the new 
road from Palmer to Gwlon is now 
under way. The road will be fiigteeo 
miles long. As soon as the survey Is 
completed a force of men will be put 
to work on the construction task id 
order to have tbe road completed this 
summer.

—Tbe following Negaunee men will 
act as judges in tbe Fourth of July 
parade In Ishpemlng:

Commercial division—W, A. Gar­
ner. ^

Comic divlstofc -C. L. Sporley and 
Napoleon Marketty.

Industrial—F. A. Bell.
Lodges and Nationalities—Ben J. 

Miller.

ADVSBT18BD LETTERS.

. The following letters were uncalled for at the 
Krgaunee postofflce July 2ad. Mis. Person* 
calling for them will please say advertised. 
Borleh, W Lequla, Philip
walker, J

TO THE FISHERMEN
The "South Shore" early morning 

Express train of Sundays stops at 
Gordon, Sanff River, Deerton, Oootg. 
iiock River, Au Train, Wetmore ana 
Creighton. Tbe nlgbt Express of 
Sundays will stop at same points to 
pick them up. 8peclal low excursion 
fares. A golden opportunity for cap­
turing the finny tribe. 38i8,

Automobile 
Service

AT REASONABLE RATES

Between 7 a. m. and 11 p. m.

C A L L  P H O N E  2 0 6
mem

T.P.
No Charges made for Waiting.

"ACROSS LOTS 

TO R IC H E S ”
Most financial failures arc caused by trying to go too fast. 

Those who go "across lots," or the get-rich-quick route, encounter 
many pit-falls.

The main-traveled road to  success is the one which leads to the 
savings bank. I t may seem slow to some hut proof abounds th a t 
those who keep on it succeed in accumulating money and learn to 
handle it wisely.

«
Suggestion: Make an "every-payday" deposit at the First 

National Bank and you will "arrive" sooner than these who take 
the route across lo ts to riches.

1  FIRST NATIONAL BANK
NEGAUNEE, MICHIGAN.

Capital and Surplus • $200,000.°°
THIS BANK WELCOMES SAVINGS DEPOSITS 

OF ONE DOLLAR OR MORE.

A. MAITLAND, President 
T. C. YATES, Cashier

GEO. J. MAAS, Vice-President 
JOHN J. BELDQ. A ml Cashier

DEPOSITS ACCEPTED BY MAIL

F LIES
OLLOW
FILTH FEVER

OLLOWS
FLIES SCREENS

SAVES
ICKNESS

A Fly in the milh may mean a member 
of the family in the grave.

It’s better to screen the cradle and wear 
a smile, than to scoff at this precaution 
and wear mourning.

Remember it’s a short haul from the 
garbage can to the dining table via tbe 
fly route.

LET US PROTECT YOU A8AINST 
THE OEAOLY FLY.

— W e  Have—

Window Screens .  2 0 c  to 6 0 c  
Deor Screens • 9 0 c  to $ 2 . 5 0  
Wire Cloth • 1 2 c  to 2 0 c  pet rifd

Universal
Stows

#i

J. H. SAWBAID6E
H a rd w a re  »d F u rn itu re

B8TABU9HMO JG70.

Acme
Qoilft)

Paints

i n w n B i K a s K s w t f i l i H n i r a E Q g i i i a a i i i

Every Garm ent Perfect
Or as nearly as anything can well be in this 
world. One poorly made, poorly fitting 
garment docs more to tear down one's 
business than a dozen perfect ones can do 
to build it up. We have never made an 
overcoat, top coat or suit that was not per­
fectly tailored; that is why people place the 
utmost confidence in our ability as tailors.
We can make your clothes at any price and 
you get the best value for your money.

H. J. PETERSON

Mart*-Julvtf
NotlM for publication.

May iv, I9iu. 
Notice It hereby given that JamesJl. fltepb- 

ens, whose posOo&M address. 1# Northland,
IOffice HWOTD BfBlfBMfJMa ADMIOMIOU, 

Its, Mid tbs timber thereon. uodvrlhe

Michigan, did. oo tbs tab  dsv of July, m t  file 
Io tbl* office Mworn 8tatftne|iljwd Aj>|HlcMlot],
No.OZW,
ilou IV, T<
UrldlAO, BUU 1UV IIIUVTI ItfVIBVWj WUUVI IU«

provleloni of tbe Mt of June a. 11*71, Mid sets 
amendatory, known a# (lie “Timber Mid Htone 
taw,” at such value as might be filed by ap­
praisement, ami that, putsuaul to eucb applies* 
fluu. the laud oud timber thereon have been es­
timated urn) valued by applicant the timber es­
timated m M. board 0wt at f i  per M. and the 
land 
l>r«x»
•laiemeut .....- _ . . .
the Clerk of the Circuit Court of Della County, 
at Kscausba, Mich.

Auy person lest liberty to protest this pur­
chase betore entry, or lultlat* a content at say 
time before patent Issues, by filing a corrobora 
t*d affidavit in this office, alleging facte wbicb 
would defeat tbe entry.

Claimant names as witnesses:
Robert F Teuscner. Clifford Cbarboanaaii. 

Hlalr. and Joseph Bernard Choiette.all

1 Nothing; that said applicant will offer final 
*f lu support of bis appItrMjpn sndsworu 
emeut on the $vth day of July, lViil. before

Alfred ......, .
oi .Northland, Utr

> A BOWKN, RevtiUr.

D u . J o s e p h  l . S h o r e t
OtTCOPATHlC PHYSICIAN 

or MAmtvwm
r
|  W I L L  « C  I N  N C O A U M K  
j Tuesdays and Fridays from I  to t  p.m.
1 OMIDI lU NtSAUNfl N IR  BANK BLN.
1-----i i if - n un  rrn  i r~ an

June n-Auiiiil $
Nctlos for Publication,

DKPAKTMKNT OF THK IMKHlOft,
U. 8. Laud Office at Marquetm. Miehlgau, 

Julie 24, Jplj.
Notice Is hereby given that Abraham Maki. 

of Prlucetou. Mfcbhtsu, who. on Match ft, 
ItljL made lionmatead Entry No M lM.forntta 
ofNWiandNH of HWk. Neeiion h ,  lowu- 
ship M kortli. Range M West. Michigan Meri­
dian, bis filed notice of luUruOon to make three 
yean Proof, to retabIMi claim to tbe land 
above described, before tbe M aster nndHe- 
celver of U. 8 Land Office, al Marquette. Mich­
igan. oo tbe iftb day W August, ivia.

Claimant namee ae witnesses:
J ^ u  raksJe , WU> Anils, of frtUMton, 

Mich.; Erick RsrlomLkl.ufQurt-u,Mlcb.fgsm- 
uei Isakson. of Palmer. Mtrh.

WHO A. BOWSR,
BegUter,

Have Y O U  Seen That $8.00 GAS RANGE? M arquette C ounty 
G a s  & E lectric  C o .


