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Two Tickets in Field

The ward caucuses and city coo 
ventlons held last Tuesday evening 
resulted Id two full tickets being 
placed in the field for the municipal 
election next Monday, and Negaunee 
Is assured one of the most spirited 
campaigns it has seen in many a long 
year. The uncertainties of political 
fortune are well exemplified in the 
mayoralty situation, for John v7. 
Klllott, who was twice eleted as a can­
didate of the Taxpayers' party, now 
heads the opposition, or People's, 
ticket. The way for the transition was 
paved, however, by the People's party 
endorsement of Mr. Elliott's candida­
cy last spring. The taxpayers'nom ­
inee for mayor is Capt. William Heg- 
gaton, long a member of the Common 
Council and for the past few years the 
president pro tern of that body. The 
tickets are complete throughout the 
ward and city lists, with the exception 
that the People's party endorsed the 
candidacy of Oscar Field for super­
visor in the Third ward.

TAXPAYERS’ TICKET
The Taxpayers' party convention 

was held in the Are hall and was pre­
sided over by Joseph H. Winter with 
Louis Grenier acting as secretary. 
Nominations for the principal offices 
were by acclamation and the conven­
tion got through with Its work In rec­
ord time. At the conclusion of the 
nominations Capt. Lleggaton was call­
ed to the lloor and thanked the dele­
gates for tbe honor which had been 
conferred upon him. He said that if 
elected bo would endeavor to make 
uso of bis knowledge of municipal af­
fairs, gained (hiring his service as an 
alderman, in giving tbe city a clean 
and busineii-llkeadmlnlstratloD. The 
Taxpayers'city ticket, together with 
the nominations which hud been made 
at tbe ward caucuses, is as follows:

Mayor—Wllllsm lleggaton.
Recorder—JohnT. Hums.
Treasurer—H trry  Salvage.
Justice of the Peace—William Ver- 

ran.
School Inspector-John J. Beldo.
Constables—Rlohard Yelland, Jacob 

Helsel, WilliamPlppo, FlokCboquette 
and Victor Makl.

First W ard—supervisor, Simuel 8. 
Mitchell: alderman, John E. Nelson.

Second W ard-supervisor. John 
Chipman; alderman, Frank Larson.

Third Ward—supervisor. Oscar 
Field; alderman, Phil Hogan.

Fourth Ward—supervisor, Harry 
S. Nightingale; alderman, Con if. 
Driscoll.

Fifth Ward—attyervlior, Charles 
Johnson; alderman, Harry Treinbath.

PEOPLES’ PARTY TICKET
Kirkwood's hall was the scene of the 

proceedings of the People's party 
convention and tbe party leaders 
found much encouragement In the 
large attendance. The convention 
work was as expeditiously performed 
as that of tbe rival party, all of the 
nominations on the main ticket being 
by acclamation. Thomas L. Collins 
was chairman and Joseph H. Prltuenu, 
Jr., secretary. The complete city and 
ward ticket of the People's psrty is as 
follows:

Mayor—John W. Elliott.
Recorder—Sidney Williams.
Treasurer—Pstrlok Flannery.
School Inspector—John P. Miller.
Justice of the Peuoe—Joseph Cyr.
Constables—Swan Olson, Victor 

Makl, Peter llaralouo, Charles 8iwu 
and Alfred Olllla.

First Wurd—supervisor, Felix Chi- 
aboiti; alderman, Thomas Ellis.

Second Ward— supervisor, Gsorge 
Haupt; alderman, Charles Andrew 
Johnson,

Third Ward—supervisor, Oscar
Field; alderman, Robert Thorupsou.

Fourth Ward—supervisor, Andrew 
Lindquist; alderman, Robert G. Jack- 
son.

Fifth Ward—aupervlsor, Andrew 
William Koikt; alaerman, Dr. A. W. 
Ilttldlt,

Minion Opened Sundiy

The Domlulctn Fulhers, Revs. Lar* 
lanleur aud Theunte, opened a two 
weeks’ mission at lit, Paul's Catholic 
church last Sunday The speolal ex- 
rrolses were opened at tbs High Mbii 
isrvloe si 10:30 a, m., and wars largely 
attended, as were each of the services 
throughout the week. This entire 
week is being devoted exclusively to 
the wo nen, while the week, commenc­
ing uext Sunday, will be devoted to the 
ineo.

During eaoh day of the mission ser­
vices early Mass will be held ut 0:1)0 
o'clock, followed by a second Mass at 
8:30 o'clock. Thf evening service 
opens at 7:30 o'clock.

Thus far these services have been 
largely attended, extra chain  having 
to bo provided at each evening ser­
vice, aud there Is no doubt that the 
l a r g e  church edifice will be taxed to 
Its fullest capacity all next week, as a 
cordial invitation Is extended to all 
to attend three services. Roth Do­
minican Fathers are Instructive aud 
entertaining talkers aud a rare spirit­
ual treat Is Instore fo r’bo-ewho par­
ticipate In the services. ~

At Star Theater

"The Sidonias" will be a special 
attraction at tbe S tar Theater for tbe 
first three nights of next week. Man­
ager Allen says it is one of the most 
expensive acte ever given at the Star 
Theater and is sure to please. Tbe 
net is called the "Laugh Factory.”

Vote for Revision

Notwithstanding the many perplexi­
ties of the local campaign, just re­
member that there’s no politics in tbe 
charter revision matter and be sure to 
vote "yes” on tbe proposition. Ne- 
gauneo needs a new charter, no matter 
who may be elected.

Pantry Sale This Afternoon

The ladles of the Swedish Lutheran 
Church will have cake, bread, kueben 
and doughnuts, and also fresh eggs, 
on sale from 2 to ft o ’clock this (F ri­
day) afternoon and after 8 o'clock 
this evening at the home of Mrs. John 
Larson. 127 East Case street. Coffee 
and cake will also be served, for which 
there will be a charge of 10 cents.

Wedding News

Albert Agnola and Miss Anna Lar­
son, both of Teal Lake location, were 
united In marrluge last Saturday 
evening at tbe Swedish-Lutheran par­
sonage, Rev. C. E. Lindquist perform­
ing the ceremony. Miss Mabel Lar­
son, sister of the bride, was brides­
maid and Fred Agnola, brother of the 
groom, was best man.

Lott All by Flood

Mrs. C.U3. Driscoll received a letter 
this morning from her sister, Mrs. 
Keller, of Dayton, Ohio, stating that 
tbo Keller family had saved their lives 
but had|lost all tholr possessions by 
the flood ravages. Tbe letter was 
dated tbe 31st ult. and was tbe first 
word received from the Dayton family, 
notwithstanding that Mrs. Drlsooll 
had been endeavoring to seoure tele- 
grapblo communication for several 
days.

Elki' BiS Bazaar

Negaunee lodge, No. 1110, 13. P. O. 
E., Is making preparations for a huge 
bazaar to be given on Thursday, F ri­
day and Saturday evenings, April 17th 
to 10th, the proceeds from which will 
go toward payl’ig for the furnishing 
and equipment of the new lodge hall 
In thu Perkins’ block. Committees 
have been namod and are now busy at 
work, for, as becomes the "Best Peo­
ple on E arth /' they Intend to make 
this the "best bazaar" Negaunee has 
ever seen.

Two Marriages

Joseph Scanlon and Miss Noma 
Reldy were united In marriage Mon­
day morning at 0 o'clock, the cere­
mony being performed at St. Paul's 
church by the pastor, ltov, Fr. Buck- 
hbltx. The bride was attended by her 
sister, Mary Reldy, uod the groom by 
his brother, Earl Hoaulon. Follow­
ing thu ceremony a woddlng breakfast 
was served at the home of tbe bride's 
father, Jeremiah Reldy. The happy 
couple were both born and reared in 
Negaunee and we join their many 
friends in wishing them a long life of 
connubial bliss.

At St, Paul’s church, the same 
morning, Rev. Fr. Buobholt/. perform* 
nd the ceremony that made Michael 
IMecanu, of this city, and Miss Lena 
Paduan, of Keweenaw Bay, umu aud 
wife. The attending partloi were 
Miss Catherine Gudda and Baptisto 
Dlglmra.

Derailed at Bagley

The southbound North-Wustern 
train was derailed at Bagley, twenty 
miles this side of Menomlnes.lastSun- 
day night, the engine end baggage and 
mall coaokos going Into adlicb, and 
the siiiokor and ohair car leaving the 
rails. Fireman Edward Sorley and 
engineer James Corcoran, both of Es- 
ennaba, Mall Clerk K. ( ’arroll and 
two passengors were Injured. Two 
men who wore riding the "blind bag­
gage" met a horrible doath. Both 
men wnro pinioned under the wreck­
age ot the engine and their bedim 
were extricated with great difficulty. 
Tbe man were Identified us Henry Nits 
aged IH, and August Schaefer aged 
about 30. Conductor James Wall, 
who was in charge of the tralo, es­
caped without lojury.

Ernsst Klein and Joseph Lowen- 
stein, of this city, were passengers on 
the wrecked tralo am) escaped with a 

I slight shaking up.

PERSO NAL PARAG RAPHS  
A B O U T FOLK YOU KNO W .

Mrs. John Beldo arrived home last 
Saturday morning from a visit with 
friends in Ironwood.

Mrs. Dennis Driscoll spent last Sat­
urday visiting her brother, Patrick 
Shea, and family in Marquette.

George McDonald, of Three Lakes, 
was in Negaunee last Saturday on bis 
way to Mlchlgamme from Chicago 
where be bad spent tbe winter.

Mrs. E. H. Jones and daughter, 
Elsie were here from Coleraine, Minn., 
to attend the funeral of Alice Chap­
man, a niece of Mrs. Jones, whlob 
was held in this city last Sunday 
afternoon, and' returned Tuesday 
night.

Miss.E. Gauthier, of Kscanaba, is 
visiting relatives and friends In Ne­
gaunee.

Mr. and Mrs. Dominic LaVIgne, 
wbo were recently married in this 
city, returned Monday from Califor­
nia, where they had spent some time 
on their honeymoon trip.

Mrs. E. Ulseth, who had been here 
on a ylsit to her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Andrew Jacobson, and sister, 
Mrs. A. C. Seats, left Wednesday on 
her return to Blsbeo, Arlz.

John Lee, who has been employed 
In Chicago during tbe winter, arrived 
borne Monday and will resume bis 
former position as chauffeur with 
Joseph H. Winter.

Mrs. Charles Owen Squiers, who 
came here last week to pack up her 
houtehold-effecis, departed Wednes­
day afternoon to join her husband at 
Greenville, Mich , ber future borne.

The family of J . M. Edgerton, who 
are making their home in Oberllo, O., 
where the Misses Edgerton are attend­
ing Oberlln College, have been having 
experiences with the fioods which 
•wept tbe control states. The street in 
front of their home was inundated suf­
ficiently to keep tbe family housed up 
for a oouple of days and the oellar was 
filled so that procuring vegetables was 
yery much like "bobbing" for apples 
at a Hallowe'en party.

Mrs. E. B. Raymond, wbo bad been 
visting her daughter, Mrs. Herbert 
Calllgan, at Sioux City, Iowa, for 
several weeks, returned home Tues­
day.

Dr. and Mrs. Paul VaoRlper, of 
Champion, visited with friends lu Ne­
gaunee on Tuesday.

Mr. and Mrs. Dan Hahllly, of Mich- 
iramme, wore here Tuesday In attend­
ance at the funeral of the late Mrs. 
Dwyer and accompanied the remains 
to Perkins.

Mrs. D. Falvey and daughter, 
Joyoe, concluded a visit In Negaunee 
with relatives and departed Friday 
evening for their home In Baraboo,
Wis.

Arvtd Kellstrom returned home 
Tuesday morning from Florence, 
Wls,, where be hud been employed at 
diamond drill work for the past two 
or three months.

Word has Just been received that 
twin boys were born to Mr. and Mrs. 
Eldrldge Barabe, former resident* of 
this city, on Easter 'Buuday morn, at 
tholr boms In Los Angeles, Calu. The 
recent arrivals oomplsts an even half 
dossil of boys la the family.

Miss Anna AbensLelu, of Kscanaba, 
li visiting friends In Negaunee.

Rev. R. T. T. Hicks, rector of St. 
John's Episcopal church, sufficiently 
rncovurod from un attack of tonillltls 
h i  to be able to resume bis duties lest 
Sunday.

Miss Msliel Thomas, whose parents 
recently removed from this city to 
Milwaukee, was arnoog the sixteen 
students who received "Ilfs certifi­
cates" at the oloso of the winter term 
of the Marquette Normal School last 
Friday.

Dr. L. L. Lorens, of Chicago, has 
accepted a position on the Ncgiunu* 
Hospital staff of physicians, with 
headquarters at Palmer.

Samuel Hawke, of Humboldt, I* 
visiting at the home of his cousin, 
James Hawke, Bluff street.

Mr. and Mrs. Oeo. J . Maas and 
Mrs. Sarah Winter and duughler, 
Francos, wbo bad been visiting in 
Chicago since leaving here several 
days ago, left that city early In the 
week for Hoi Springs, Ark., tore- 
main for a few weeks. Tbe orlglual 
intention was to go to North Carolina 
but on account of tho Hoods they de­
cided to visit Hot Springs.

Ruth Bowden has returned borne 
from a visit at tbe borne of Mr. and 
Mrs. S. J. Spargo at Kscanaba.

Miss Georglana Kthler, wbo had 
been in charge of tbe local "central" 
of the county phonfe exchange since 
its organization some fifteen yoars 
ago, resigned tbe position on the 1st 
Inst. Miss Kthler was always recog­
nized as a most courtooui and oblig­
ing "telephone g irl."

Ralph MacKenzie. now located on a 
farm in Negaunee township, Is a can. 
didate for supervisor at tbe approach* 
ing election In that towosbip. His 
opponent is George Yookosky, who 
has held tho office for several terms.

W. J. Crocker, clerk at the Volun­
teer mine, w as opened upon for ap­
pendicitis at tbe Negaunee Hospital 
Tuesday and is now reported as get­
ting along nicely.

Ernest Klein, of Rosen Bros. & 
Klein, arrived borne Wednesday 
morning from a business mission to 
Chicago.

Rev. F. W. Kava, the new pastor of 
tho Finnish Lutheran church, arrived 
here last week from Styerlor, Wis., 
and conducted his first services last 
Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Arthur Baker, 
of Kscanaba, were here in attend­
ance at tbe funeral services of Mrs. 
Baker's mother,Mrs. Margaret Dwyer, 
which were held Tuesday morning.

J. C. Kirkpatrick, formerly of Ne­
gaunee, wbo is at the head of tbe 
National Pole Company, with head­
quarters in Kscanaba, bas been ap­
pointed a member of the Young Men's 
Christian Association Advisory Com­
mittee for the Upper Peninsula.

J, E. O'Donogbue was a business 
caller to Marquette on Monday.

Joseph Decker, of Detroit, was a 
caller in Negaunee on Wednesday.

Mrs. Charles Augustsoo returned 
Monday from Sault Ste. Mario, where 
•be bad been spending the past two 
months visiting her parents and 
friends.

Philip Levine will leave to day for 
Chicago, where he will join his wife 
and both proceed to Hot Springs, 
Ark., to spend about two weeks.

George, the ihlrteen-ycars-old eon 
of Mr. and Mrs. George Jewell, Hoow 
street, underwent u successful opera­
tion for uppendloltis last week at Dr, 
Robbins' hospital.

Rev. C. II. Rutledge, superintend­
ent of Antl-Saloofi League In this dis­
trict for the past nine years, will 
leave Ishpemiog on or about the first 
of next month for Detroit, where he 
has been assigned to tbe law enforce­
ment department.

Conductor Patrick Gallery, of tbe 
North-Western passenger and accom­
modation train running between Mar­
quette and Mlchlgamme, left Monday 
lo company with Denuls Mooney, 
road master, on a visit to Florida. 
From Chicago they will go to Key 
West, from Key West to Orange City 
and Daytona, and across the peninsu­
la to Tampa; from Tampa to Live 
Uak and Jacksonville, wltero they will 
"take the back track."

Election Dty Baxter

Tho members of the Ladles’ Aid 
Society of the Mitchell M, K. Church 
are making extensive preparations 
for their auuuul bazaur and supper to 
hs held In the church parlors on Mon­
day, April 7th, Kleollouduy. Dlr.ner 
will be served at noon aud any­
one desiring a first uiaas meal at a 
roaeooabis price uaunui afford to 
miss It. Doors will be open through­
out the afternoon arid evening and a 
very sujoyuble time guaranteed to all 
who attend. Hupper will ho served 
from five to seveu o'clock. Oel your 
friends together and have an enjoy* 
able lime at the tables. For those 
who cannot make It convenient to 
come during tho sup|»or hour, as well 
as for all others, evening amusements 
have been provided. The moving 
picture show to Imj given in the class 
rooms of the Hunduy School will bo a 
source of pleasure for all, end cun he 
enjoyed for tho small sum of ft cents. 
There Is to lie a fish-pond filled with 
good articles, a candv booth with the 
most delicious home-made candy ever 
tasted, s handkerchief booth filled 
with those necessary articles that are 
In such constant demand, and still 
other booths filled with fancy aad use­
ful articles of all descriptions. Ice­
cream will be served during the even­
ing. Everybody Is welcome. Come 
aud join with your frlrudi In having 
au all-round, eojoj able time.

i
Special School Election

The Board of Education has given 
notice of a special school meeting and 
election to be held next Wednesday, 
April Pth, at the city hall between the 
hours of 4 and 8 p. ra., to give the 
qualified electors of the city opportun­
ity to determine the size and scope of 
the now building which isto be erected 
on the site of the Presbyterian church 
property acquired some time since by 
the school district, The Board's de* 
clsion to submit the matter to the 
voters Is due, in part at least, to the 
discussions which have beeo in pro­
gress during the past week or two; 
though if an assembly hall is to be 
added to the one-story and basement 
structure as originally contemplated 
by tbe Board, the voters necessarily 
would have to pass upon the proposi­
tion because of tbe bond issue required.

But notwithstanding the arrange­
ments for the submission of this par­
ticular proposition, it seems to the 
Ikon Hkuald that the Board and tho 
people who desire to have certain fea­
tures embodied in the educational* 
physical and social facilities afforded 
by the schools are steadily drifting 
farther apart and unless a better un­
derstanding is secured between now 
and next Wednesday tbe special elec­
tion will not settle tbe real questions 
at Issue. Tbe proposition as sub­
mitted by the Board of Education cen­
ters wholly on the addition of an as­
sembly hall: while, us it was sought 
to make clear In an urtlcle a couplo of 
weeks ago, the hall was merely an in­
cident In the plans suggested by these 
people; they have no objection to the 
ball being included If It can be con­
veniently done, but tbey would greatly 
prefer to forego tbe hall If they could 
be assured of tbe other thlogs which 
they ask. Wbat they bad especially 
In mind was play-grounds equipped 
with modern apparatus, a swlmmlog 
pool, gymnastic equipment and other 
facilities for healthful recreation out­
side of school hours. Tbe tcope of 
the work and the manner in which 
schools in many places are co-operat­
ing In theseout-of-scbool-hour activi­
ties was referred to in the article two 
weeks ago. These activities come un­
der tbe bead of "social center" enter­
prises in most communities, and while 
there is some danger of tbe term being 
misleading in Its application to purely 
local conditions, it nevertheless cov­
ers broadly the purposes these people 
had in mind. The financial aspects of 
tbe matter, and particularly tbe atti­
tude of thoee whose tax bills are the 
largest, have also been quite fully 
covered and need not be dwelt upon 
now.

In the hope that the public will more 
fully realize thu nature of what was 
asked here, and just what Is being 
done In many other places, It is un-' 
derstood that effort will be made to 
have Charles H. English, dlftoctor of 
Cornell Square, a public playground 
in West Pullman, HI., come here be­
tween now and next Wednesday and 
address a public meeting. Mr. Eng­
lish recently addressed a meeting In 
Ishpemiog and is said to have cover­
ed certain phases of the general sub­
ject that would bo particularly appli­
cable hero. He certainly is lo a po­
sition to speak authoritatively about 
these matters, und the only unfortu­
nate purl of the arrangement is that 
he will necessarily get on the ground 
so late; still, If it will oven then pro* 
mote a toiler understanding of what 
is really desirable along these lines 
for Negaunee, opportunity may yet be 
found to have the community profit 
from the suggestions.

IJOAltiJ ODTI.INKM J'OHITION
The Hoard of Education has pre­

pared a statement lo make clear Its 
purpose In submitting two proposi­
tions to those qualified to vole next 
Wednesday. Tim ataiemunl covers 
the ground very thoroughly so fur as 
It relates to the Incorporation of an 
assembly hall and the financial as. 
pacts thereof; but the peoplo who seek 
provision of the other facilities refer­
red to do not, lu the first place, like 
thu idea of having such a hall looated 
on au upper Hour, and secoudiy, are 
much more duslrous of securing the 
other features then limy are of secur­
ing the hall Itself. The Board's state­
ment Is as follows:

At tho special school meeting called 
by the Hoard of Education fur April 
Dili, two propositions are to be sub­
mitted, In order that voters may indi­
cate clear) v their wishes regarding the 
kind of building they favor for a mum 
ual training school. These proposi­
tions ure: (1) To erect a two-story 
building to be m'sd for a manual train­
ing school only: or, (2) To build a 
thrue-story structure, tbe first two 
Hours of which shall be used for a 
manual training school, the third floor 
to contain a large hall and stage and 
dressing rooms, a kitchen, dining 
room, retiring und toilet rooms, to he 
devoted to a social center for the ben­
efit of the public fU large. If the lirst 
curries, there Is enough tuouey In the

treasury to erect the building origin­
ally contemplated by tbe Bouru. with­
out bonding the district. Should the 
second proposition be adopted. It will 
be necessary to bond the dis-trlct for 
an additional $20.ink) to cover the ex­
tra  cost of adding a third htury to the 
building to provide quarters for this 
social center. This figure Is the esti­
mate of the architect, bused on the 
fact that such a building must be en­
tirely fire-proof, uud the foundation 
and wulls must be of much heavier 
construction thun for a two-story 
building, In order to supimrl the 
weight of a large hall on the third 
fieor,filled with people. It will require 
also large steel girders to aid in sus­
taining such weight, and these are 
costly, in addition, this hall should 
require an entirely separate eutrance 
on Case street, with stairways leading 
up lo the third floor, all of llre-proof 
construction, because the social center 
feature of the building must be entire­
ly separate from the manual training 
school.

It seems to be agreed by all parties 
that if a social ceuter is to be provided 
it should be on the ground lloor. But 
the ground lloor of a manual tralulng 
building must be used for the heavy 
machinery and the forge room.

At first, the Hoard ontertumed the 
social ceuter Idea aud in no sense op­
posed it. but when they found how 
great tbe extra expense would be, 
they felt compelled to exclude it fur 
two reasons: first, they did not have 
this additional amount to use, aud 
second, tbe school law does not allow 
them to expend money for such pur­
pose, unless authorized to do so by a 
voto of the district. They therefore 
determined to hold the matter o]>eo 
for a week or more until they could 
ascertain the opinion aud wishes of 
the taxpayers, desiring to be guided 
thereby. During this time, the vari­
ous members mude it their business 
to consult many business men and 
found very little sentiment favorable 
to a building with a social center. 
Hut that no mistake may be made, and 
that all uixpuyerrt may have au op­
portunity to express themselves, |L* 
Board has called a special meetin/fcf 
the district, und will abide by its de­
cision.

Regarding the need of a manual 
training building, there can be no 
question. After having just got a nice 
start In industrial training, further 
progress must stop or else we must 
have much more room. Negaunee was 
slow in getting this work started be­
cause there was no building for it un­
til tbe new bigh school was built. Al­
ready this building Is entirely occu­
pied,excepting one room on thegrouod 
floor, 23x20: and one on tbe third floor. 
18x10. Of these, the first only could 
be used for manual training.

The Board of Education is sufficient­
ly progressive to oppose a policy that 
would handicap the extension or this 
vastly Important feature of our school 
system. They feel there Is pressing 
need of u building with machinery and 
equipment to put us on a par,at least, 
with our neighboring cities. As to 
the suittU amount of extru room In the 
high school building, that will soon 
be used by the natural growth of the 
school.

Tbe above statement Is not made In 
a spirit of controversy, but that all 
may vote upon thu question ut issue 
with a clear understanding of condi­
tions.

Mrs. Dwyer Dead

Word reached here Saturday of tho 
death of Mrs. Margaret Dwyer, a res­
ident of Negaunee for the past five 
years, which occurred at thu Newberry 
State Hospital that day from ulcera­
tions of the stomach, from which she 
bad long been afflicted. A short lime 
ago she suffered a mental rclupif due 
to the disease which caused her death 
and she wus taken to the hospital for 
better cure.

Mrs. Dwyer was born In Ogden*- 
berg, N. V,. fifty-eight yean* ugo und 
had hoeu a resident of the Kppi-r I’em 
Insula for the past thirty-six years. 
She was well known to a large circle 
of friends, all of whom will be grieved 
to hear of her death. Shewn* the be­
loved wlfoof Entries Dwyer, whodleu 
on Nov. Olb, iMiHi, It was when ber 
son, John Dwyer, accepted the posi­
tion of track foreman for the North- 
Western, filling the po-ltlon made va­
cant by the death of D. r .  ('nlllgan, 
that the family moved lo thlsclty.

The children bereaved are John, uf 
this city; Thomas, of Milwaukee: Mrs. 
A. Baker, of Kscanaba, und Misses 
Margaret and Kutc Dwyer of thlsclty

Thu remains wero brought to Ne­
gaunee und on Wednesday morning 
funeral services were conducted ut St, 
I'uul's C'utliollu church, following 
which the remains were taken to Her- 
kins and given sepulcher along side
those of her husband aud sun, James.

—■

Illustrated Forestry Lecture

Frof. Roth, the great authority on 
reforestation and the conservation of 
forests, will give thcmcond lectuiv uf 
the I nlverslty extension course, lu 
tho high school auditorium Tuesday 
evening, April Hlh. This lecture will 
he Illustrated with lantern slides aud 
cannot fail to prove most Interesting 
and valuable. J'rof. Roth is an luter­
esting speaker, has a special and 
vitally Important message to deliver 
tu the public, and should haicu  large 
audience tu ilsteu lo him. The lecture 
will be entirely fret, it will begin at 
k o'clock. Subject- "Forestry ut 
Rome aud Abi-oau,"
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This blosHt-d winter wearies nobody 
with its prolonged monotony.

A New Jersey man is experimenting 
raising wingless chickens. A fowl ucl 
that.

It is only just that women should 
receive men’s wages, and married 
women do.

All of the new counterfeit money is 
to the shape of $5 and $10 bills We 
should worry.

Aviators are lo be put through u 
rigid test. Flexible and resilient tests 
would be better.

Another argument in favor of spring 
Is that It will take the baseball play­
ers off the stage.

• Jn God we trust,” ' says the To­
ledo Illade, ‘ is not on the new nickel.** 
Nor on the old one.

A pproximately 176,000.000 persons 
traveled in the Ixmdon tubes last year. 
What proportion sat down?

The Brazilians make beautiful lace 
from the liber of the baonas. Rathe? 
a delicate food stuff, though.

Pittsburg has started an anti-noise 
crusade. lx)ts of college town would 
do well to follow the example.

A woman remarks: "The best hus­
bands are the most accomplished 
lia rs ’* They’ve had experience.

/  Hi \
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Cities
"High Grade” Men Had Discovered New Rich Vein

A Kansas City parson says that the 
turkey trot causes divorces. Hitting 
a  fast trot like that always does.

N KW YORK—The lights had been 
turned ou in West Side court the 

other day to dispel the gloom of the 
weather, when a short, thick-set man 
stepped up to the attorney’s table and 
from four battered leather belts let 
loose a shower of glittering gold coins 
that made the incandescents wink 
and Magistrate Corrigan shade his 
eyes. As the gold ran out, like yellow 
wheat from the mouth of a  hopper, 
the pleasant clinking of the gleaming ‘ 
metal resounded through the place. 
A few pieces dropped to the floor and 
rolled away, unregarded for the mo • 
ment. The sight of the stack of coins 
piled on the table hypnotized every j 
one within view into action.

"What Is all this?” demanded Magis­
trate Corrigan of Detective Phelan1 
of the central office, who had turned 
on the stream of gold.

“It’s $2,800 I took from those four ( 
men there,” rejoined Phelan, indicat­
ing with a jerk of his thumb four 
swarthy men with sombreros, flaming ,

red handkerchiefs and o^her synip 
torus of the wild west as depicted on 
"the screen."

"1 guess it belongs to them. ;il 
right," continued Phelan, "for no 
body's put in a claim for it."

And so the pile was swept bad. 
again into the four worn belts ar><J 
the gloom of the gray day shut do«:> 
once more.

All this occurred during the a> 
raignment of Rouiaine Molzlre. Ku 
gent Hortitapo, John Perrlziul am. 
John Zader, all accused of being "high 
grade” inen, which is not as paradox! 
cal as It sounds, for In Leadville, Col 
where the prisoners worked as min 
ers, a "high grader” Is a chap who 
steals gold right out of the vein.

The alleged high graders were nr 
rested at the Pennsylvania railroad 
station by Detectives Phelan and n 
squad of picked men. The arrests 
followed a telegram from Sheriff 
Schrader of Leadville that they had 
got away with $50,000 worth of stolen 
gold, the same being contained in 
their trunks, which were declared tc 
weigh almost half a ton. The four 
were held HU Deputy Sheriff William 
Angus and Assistant District Attor 
ney Quentin B. Bonner arrived from 
Leadville with requisition papers.

Mr. Bonner said that the men had 
been robbing the Monarch for months 
They discovered a new vein, of which 
their bosses knew nothing.

PERFUMES FROM CHEMICALS'
There are few perfumes today that : 

-•annot be made from chemicals, 
synthetically, as the chemists call i t  
Formerly all perfumes were extract- ; 
rd from flowers, fruits, spices, woods 
or other vegetables and animal sub­
stances. The first perfume to be im­
itated was vanilla, In 187G. Hello- 
tropine followed, being obtained by ox­
idation of a byproduct of camphor. 
Terpinol is one of the most freely 
used constituents of perfumes. This 
is a near relation of turpentine. With 
thia. a little oil, and aqua fortls, a 
rliemtst can produce a perfume that 1 
can scarcely be distinguished from 
ihOKC exhaled by the lily of the val­
ley, lilac, and cape jessamine, vary­
ing according to (he proportions In ‘ 
which the chemicals are blended. Ar- 
liflciai violet Is a combination of citrol 
tan essence extracted from lemon). 
Indian \ervaine, or lemon verbenu. 
with common acetone, a substance' 
very like pyroligneous acid. Most of 
tile cheap perfumes are imitations, 
and they are almost always Inferior 
to the flower extracts. Ho It might 
properly be said that it Is a wise flow­
er that knows its own perfume. :

Sweden exported 116,000,000 pounds 
of matches during the last six months. 
No other country is a match for that.

Wagon Load of Chickens at the Police Station

A canon of an English church has 
written a farce that is suid to be a 
corker. Evidently lie litt the bulls- 
eye.

1 Spain is to have a government 
school of aviation. Wouldn’t it be a 
good idea to sentence revolutionists 
to It?

One octogenarian in Boston says the 
only rule be knows for long life Is 
this: "Keep your temper and don’t 
worry.”

Boston papers are making u great 
•Hr over the discovery ofnnunkissed 
girl. But they have not printed her 
picture.

Three Prlncelou sUidents have 
opened a shop to shine shoes. Shoe 
shines ure preferable to monkey- 
shines any time.

Three Alaskan legislators have to 
travel 2,000 miles by dog sled to at­
tends session. They at least, wig 
earn their mileage.

At least there isn’t much danger 
that any man will curry around for 
days the eleven-pound parcel his wife 
gives him to mall.

I NDIANAPOLIS, Ind.—A spring wa­
gon load of more than a hundred 

I squaking chickens was unloaded a t ' 
’central pollen station the other day.
I following the arrest of three men on 
the south side just before dawn by , 
Patrolmen iluck, Davis and dribble.1

The three men arrested gave the I 
names of Edgar W. Btagg, fifty-seven ' 
years old; William Kunyon, nineteen, i 

] and Joseph Marquette, thirty-four.
, They were held charged with loiter­
ing, pending an investigation.

Patrolman Buck was standing at 
Meridian and Morris streets about 5 
o'clock when he noticed a smull wag­
on loaded with crater of chickens and 
driven by two men. He thought he 
had seen the same wagon empty earl-j 
ter In the evening going south in Mer- j 
idian street. j

"Hey, there, stop a minute,” he 1 
called. The wagon stopped, but one | 
of the men Jumped and started to run 
down the street. Jiuck fired his re-1 
volver In the air, but the figure sped 1 
oo and disappeared in the darkness.

The man who remained in the wag-1 
on was Kunyon, and there were two, 
dozen chickens with him. Hearing 
the shot, Patrolmen Davis and Dribble

Now comes an expert who says au­
tomobile riding gives a person flat 
feet. Hut that probably isn't ah an­
noying UH IlHt til'CH.

One can't In-ip feeling but that the 
aviator who flew fifty four miles to 
deliver twenty-live pounds of beaus 
didn't know ItU article.

Copenhagen Is posscsHed of u worn- 
.an gluzler. Probably preparing to 
go to London and turn user the pro­
ceeds from replaelng broken windows 
to help the cuuse.

came up on the run to investigate.
Kunyon, the patrolmen say, told 

them that the chickens were stolen 
and that It was the second trip for 
them during the night. He said he 
and bis companions had also stolen 
the horse and wagon, but refused to 
tell where they got them.

Kunyon took the police to an ad­
dress In Madison avenue, where they 
found Stagg and Marquette. Mac 
quette said he was the man who 
jumped from the wagon when (bey 
were accosted by Iluck.

Another surprise awaited the patrol- 
men at the house. Jn the back yard 
was a coop filled with chickens. There 
were chickens everywhere, and the 
police suy the men admitted to them 
every one was stolen.

HUMAN LIFTING POWER.
According to excellent authority, the 

muscles. In common with all organs 
of the human body, have thier periods 
of development and decline, our phy­
sical strength increasing up to a cer­
tain age and then decreasing. Tests 
rf the strength of several thousand in­
dividuals have been made, and the 
following figures are given as the 
averages derived from such tests: 
The liftiqg power of a youth of 17 
years is 280 pounds; in his twentieth 
year this increases to 320 pounds; and 
In the thirtieth and thirty-first years, 
respectively, It reaches its height. 
365 pounds. At (be expiration of the 
thirty-first year the strength begins 
to decline, very gradually at first. By 
,the fortieth year it has decreased 
eight pounds, and such diminution 
continues at a slightly increasing rate 
until the fiftieth year is reached, 
when the figure Is 330 pounds. Sub­
sequent to thia period the strength 
fails more and more rapidly, until the 
weakness of old age is reached. It 1b 
found impossible to obtain trust­
worthy statistics after the fiftieth 
year.

One of the greatest mysteries of the New York Zoological park is vhe 
. identity of a middle-aged rr^n who seems to worship the deadly king cobra 
. of India, which is on exhibition in the reptile house. The man is a frequent 

visitor to the park, selecting the pay days when there are very few visitors. 
' Upon entering the reptile house he will make for the glass-fronted cage 

where the king cobra, said to be the most poisonous snake in the world, is 
' on exhibition, and, as shown in the photograph, bow down in an attitude of 
prayer before the deadly reptile. If there are a number of visitors in thd 
snake house, the man merely inclines his head. Curator Ditmars has fre­
quently spoken to the man and asked for his name, but the worumpper 

; merely shakes his head and leaves the place.

Human Wedge Between Two Houses Is Chopped Out

Purls ImuHtH a woman with u 
triple personality. Sllll, the uverage 
American woman run change her mind 
much faster iliun that.

Exports of Ainerleau pianos have 
trebled in the last nine >ears. 1’er 
haps (hill's why there is always an 
old uhe In the adjoining flat.

FupUs In (he IjUS Angeles cooking 
schools ure required to eul thelc own 
pU»*. J-leie Is 4m Instance where 
puHtry comes home to punish.

Now it remain* to he seen 1) the 
puree) postman will give heed to (he 
apartment building sign "All pack­
ages must Im- delivod tu tlu- rear."

But twenty-seven lives wer* lost in 
Feansylvunlu during the JVJ2 hunting 
season. Which leads one to wonder 
whether there were poor shot* or few 
guides

A New York mother paid her mar 
rlsd daughter's rent for ten years in 
•dvunce, Taking no ehunreg ofl said 
daughter coming buck to live with 
her, evidently

CLEVELAND, O - -Nine firemen, u 
police sergeant and u patrnhnuu 

worked an hour to pull the head of 
John Foley, Worcester, Muss., from , 
between two houses at 2430 und 2436 
Frunklln avenue early the other morn­
ing. They hud to chop holes in the 
sides of the houses, llnully, before 
they could get him out. He w as! 
wedged upside down, most uncomfort­
ably, for an hour beeause he tried to 
get Into the house ut 2430 Franklin 
avenue without awaketilng other- 
boarders, j

Foley, returning from downtown ut I 
1 a. in., wulked stealthily up the long ' 
flight of outside steps. He bHd , 
reached the lop when his bulance > 
gave way. Appetite over heud, he 
dropped down the vlderuil He only 
fell u little way when his head and i

shoulders stuck because the bouses 
slope to a fool apart.

Foley wiggled for quite a time In 
sib-nee. Ho did not care to discom­
mode persons In the neighborhood. 
Finally he yelled. Mergeunt Hewlett 
and Fatrolmun Smith of the West 
Twenty-ninth street station, were 
strolling on West Twouty-llfth street 
when they heard the screams.

“ 'Tlu a murder,” Smith said, start­
ing to run.

"If he were killed he couldn't make 
that much noire,” llowlott gusped

They were sure something was 
wrong when they saw u pulr of ath­
letic legs waving over the banister. 
Smith took one leg und Howlett the 
other. They tugged. The houses 
would not give an inch and Foley told 
the neighborhood the police were klll 
Ing him. Howlett sent for the hook 
und ladder company that Is stationed 
at (‘hurch avenue und West Twenty 
ninth street.

The llremen were about to put a 
mechanical Juck under Foley's crown 
and try to force him upwurd when 
he begged them to desist Finally, 
they cut u neat hulr out of each of the 
houses und Foley, with a grout) of 
relief, turned right side up.

SNOW GHOSTS OF GERMANY
The snow ghosts of the Giant moun- 

j tains sounds like the title of a fairy 
; tate for the children. The Giant moun­
tains, however, are very real, being to 
Germany almost what the Alps are to 
Switzerland, for they are thronged 
annually with winter visitors to en­
joy the sledding and the beautiful 
scenery. A renowned feature of these 
mountains Is the singular adhesion of 
snow and Ice to all exposed objects, 
due to the peculiar conditions of the 
climate. The most bizarre formations 
are produced, the original objects be­
ing so coated and enveloped with 
snow and ice as to be unrecognizable. 
Titus the fir trees which cover the 
mountain sides resemble, especially 
in the moouiight, groups of great 
white ghosts, many of them actually 
or In fancy taking on weird human 
formations and even expressions of 
countenance. A great business is 
made in the Giant mountains of 
horned sledding, us it is called. Visi­
tors are piloted up to the tops of the 
courses, from which they slide down 
in special horned sleighs.

FOR CATS OF A PRINCESS.

BLESSING THE RIVER JORDAN
Of the numerous religious ceremo-, 

Dies Which may he witnessed in the ; 
Holy Land none, perhaps, is bo pie- 
turesque and impressive as the Greek 
ceremony of the blessing of the Jor­
dan, which takes place ut Epiphany. 
The spot selected for the blessing is 
that known the the Pilgrim's ford, 
where, It is said, CUrtst was baptized. 
Hundreds of pilgrims crowded the - 
western bank of the sacred stream ,' 
where tents and dressing sheds are 
erected for their convenience. At the 
appointed hour the archbishop of the 
Jordan, with his attendant priests and s 
deacons, all gorgeously appareled, ap­
pear In the stream in their frail craft, 
from which the service is conducted. 
This consists in the reading of the 
Scriptures having reference to the 
baptism of Phrlut. followed by appro 
priate prayers. Then, as the bishop 
drops the cross into the water and 
the blessing is pronounced, a great 
shout rends the air und hundreds 
men and women, clad in white rob"*-, 
plunge into the sacred stream

the nets. Each mesh is knotted In 
much the same way that flsh nets or 
hammocks are made.' Only tying a 
single hair it a more delicate and dif­
ficult task than tying a string 

To make a dozen nets ts a day’s 
work of ten or twelve hours.

“TOMB OF VIRGIL” SAVED.

Refuses to Continue as Undertaker for Felines

"How lo Keep Warm Without Flro,” 
the caption of tm article written 

by a physician. It is suspected that 
bu la simply boosting business

Indiana raised 2.nun,non bushels of 
onions last year. If there is anything 
Ip Hatty Green's theory, Indluus 
•bonId be a mighty hcnllhy stute

A Worcester hyootlst. defendant in 
A divorce suit, claims that his wife 
Mid "look st me,” und biffed ' him 
m  the "nut.” Trying to knock some 
#»nse into him, perhaps.

C HICAGO Hereafter police <ifll 
cers will not bury dead cuts, tm-, 

less round upon public highways.” I 
Edward Kleber, chief of police at 

Wilmette, it suburb of Chicago, nailed ' 
this sign on the wall of the police stu 
Hon tlie oilier duy. Thou he sunk 
wcurlly into n chair.

''That'll hold them for a while, I 
guess," he suld with a sigh. "I have 
been the otllclul undertaker for the 
last pet eat, and hereafter Wilmette 
people will have to bury their own 
pets.”

Nine live* apparently is not enough 
for the felines of Wilmette, as during 
the lust two weeks twenty-five or 
thirty furry pets have succumbed i 

Chief of Police fileber told of the] 
woes of being an undertaker to ca ts.;

"During the last couple of weeks,"' 
he snld, "l have been railed upon st 
All hours of the day snd night to bury 
dead cats.

"At first I would leave the work of 
'tn1 office slid comply with the request 
of M'tne woman who Informed ms

HfRTAntH F’Ol.io 
OFHCfcR-N WILL 
NOT fiUKY OLAp 
CAU Ufa f 56 
F0um> upon 
PiUHiC HIGH 
,WAYJ

with u lachrymose voice that her pet 
cut had died. But when they started 
calling inn from my slumbers, and 
asking me to come and ’bury poor 
Tom' right away. I hung up this sign "

Recent rains aru purtly responsible 
for the Increase in the cat death rate, 
according lo the chief. The rains have 
filled empty salmon cuns with water, 
and the eats, though accustomed to 
"dry" Wilmette, must drink. The wa­
ter is often poison, death ensuing 
within a few- hours.

As fur as could he learned, no pedl 
fre« d felines have succumbed, the 
mortality" being confined to cats of 

common degree.

HUMAN HAIR NETS.
The unnuul sale of nets of human 

hair, according to the report of tin* 
American consul at Kohl, Is estimated 
ut 12,000,000.

Hair-nets are made almost wholly 
In the houses of Alsatian and Austrlun 
peasants; the peculiar skill required 
to not hair has become in part heredi­
tary.

The children begin first to tie the 
hairs together, end to end. to make 
one long hulr. Then, with only a 
round piece of wood ubout uix inches 
long und one-half Inch In diameter 
and a needle, the older girls and worn- 
eu and sometimes the men weave

The ho-called «Tomb of Virgil” nea: 
Naples was put In dunger recently b] 
u landslide. Now it is being removiM 
from further peril by being tram 
ferred <o the right hand side of tin 
grotto of Fosilipo. This ruin hui 
beeu popularly known for six ceutu 
ries ns the tomb of VlrglJ. who ownet 
a villa at Poslltpo.

EDUCATING THE BACHELORS
In Ixmdon there Is a school In which 

bachelors are taught to inulte h»ds, 
cook, sew and look after their home 
needs generally.

Frlnccss Victoria of Hchteswlg-Hot- 
Atein, whose mother is uu uunt of 
King Goorgr. has taken up again her 
hobby of breeding cats fur show pur­
poses This is a picture of one of the 
cat houres ut her residence, (‘umber- 
land Lodge

STRANGE ALASKAN CUSTOM
A strange custom prevulls among 

the Indians of Alaska When a differ­
ence arises botweeu two of them :iud 
a friendly settlement seems Impos­
sible, onto of them threatens the other 
with dishonor. He executes his threat 
by tearing up a certain number of his 
own blankets. The only way his an 
tagonist cun get even with him is by 
tearing up a greater number of his 
own. The one who destroys the moat 
blankets Is regarded sc having won 
the fight,

MOST POWERFUL LOCOMOTIVE
The most powerful locomotive In 

the world has just been built for the 
Virginian rallroud. It can haul 166 
loaded 60-ton capacity goods truck* 
•t leu miles an hour It has 16 driv­
ing wheel*. The locomotive and ten­
der weigh 761,000 pounds, and the 
firebox Is largo enough to hold •  
•hunting locomotive

Though Kansas is too young to have antiquarian societies, there it a 
i organisation In Wichita that Is collecting Information and rellce relating i 
j th« • • r,y «f th* A sample of hletorlcai research Is here ttlu
\ u  >■ •  reproduction of ■  painting by C. A, Seward of Wichita th,
shows In faithful detail the sod house built close to the Santa ffe trail l 
hie grandfather forty years ego. The old sod house with Its grate roof hi 
long ego crumbled Into duet, and the topography of the country has be< 
changed from a rolling prairie, monotonous with grate, to a varied landecat 

. • f  orchards, white residences and red barns, corn shocks and wheat stack
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MUCH FOOD SEIZED
Pure Food Law Violations in Last 

Year.

In Several Instance* Cases Reported
for Criminal Action Based on Ship­

ments of Seized Goods Found 
to Be Poisonous Ingredients.

Washington.—Fourteen hundred and 
fifty-nine violations of tbo federal 
pure food law were reported to tbo 
department of Justice for action In 
the lust year. Of the total number of 
cases. 991 were criminal and 467 were 
recommendations for tbe seizure of 
adulterated or misbranded foods and 
drugs. There were 741 cases prose­
cuted by United States attorneys In 
tbe year. Of tbe criminal cases 
prosecuted, 661 resulted In convic­
tions aud twenty-three were decided 
adversely to tbe government. Fines 
were imposed In the criminal cases 
amounting to more than $14,000, and 
In addition costs were assessed, gen­
erally against tbe defendants. Of the 
cases reported, 407 were pending in 
tbe courts a t the close of tbe year, and 
376 were under consideration by the 
department of justice.

The first jail sentences for viola­
tions of this act were Imposed last 
year, and there was a tendency on the 
part of tbe courts to Impose larger 
fines for first offenses. The maximum 
fine of $200 was imposed in twelve 
cases, and there were also Imposed 
one fine of $150, 36 of $100 each, two 
fines of $75 each and 61 Ones of $50 
each. In 1911 the maximum fine of 
$200 was imposed in 16 cases, and 
there were imposed four flues of $150 
each, one fine of $125, 26 fines of $100 
each, one fine of $75 and 33 fines of 
$50 each. There was also imposed a 
fine of $400 In three cases prosecut­
ed, where several adulterated and 
misbranded articles were contained In 
one shipment. While there was a 
slight decrease in the number of 
maximum fines imposed, there was n 
substantial increase in the number of 
cases in which fines of $100 and $50 
were imposed.

In the seizure cases decrees of con­
demnation and forfeiture were enter­
ed against 294 shipments of adulter­
ated and misbranded goods. In ac­
cordance with the usual practice, 
whenever seized articles of food were 
found to consist of filthy, decomposed 
or putrid substances, or to contain 
poisonous or deleterious Ingredients 
which might render them injurious to 
health, tbo department has insisted 
Ibat orders bo entered directing tbe 
destruction of the goods. One hun­
dred and three shipments of this 
class were destroyed.

On the other hand, in the class of 
cases where tbe adulteration or mis­
branding was such that it could be 
cured by relabeling, the courts have 
tisuully released the seized goods to 
claimant* after relabeling, whenever 
claimants huve appeared aud consent­
ed to tbe entry of decrees of condem­
nation and forfeiture, paid the costs 
of the proceedings and filed bond, as 
provided for by Section 10 of the act. 
that the goods would not thereafter 
be sold or otherwise disposed of con­
trary to law. Ooe hundred and sixty- 
two shipments of this class of eases 
were released in , tbe year after re­
labeling and the filing of satisfactory 
bonds. There were seized and con­
demned shipments of sardines, figs, 
herring, dried apples, dried cherries, 
condensed milk, pie filling, cold cream 
ointment, .soft drinks, candles, cor­
dial?. chestnuts, oysters, tomato pulp, 
frozen eggs, bottled water, apples, pea­
nuts, turpentine, sparkling burgundy, 
brandy, vanilla extract, dried black 
berries, dried eggs, liquors, butter, 
vinegar, prunes, witch hazel and buy.

In several Instances canes were re- 
jK>rted for criminal prosecution baser) 
on shipments of seized goods found to 
consist of filthy, decomposed or putrid 
substance*, or to contain added poison­
ous or deleterious Ingredleots which 
might render them Injurious to health. 
Four cases were discontinued because 
of luck of evidence to maintain them. 
In eighteen cases seizures were not 
made because* the goods had been die- 
posed of prior to the filing of libels. 
In one seizure css* tbe court refusod 
to Issue process, and in another tbe 
rrocccdingtf were dismissed.

8UCAR CONSUMPTION.

Each person in the United States 
last year has used 67 pounds of sugar, 
tbe per capita consumption of this 
article having increased from 80 
pounds In 1910, 59 pounds In 1900 and 
29.5 pounds in 1880, says statistics 
gathered by the bureau of foreign and 
domestic commerce. The total sugar 
consumption this year will exceed 8,- 
000,000,000 pounds, whereas in 1900 
only 4.500,000.000 pound* were used 
The cost of sugar to the consumer this 
year will approximate $400,000,000, 
which is more than $1,000,000 a day.

Ono rourth of this sugar camo from 
(he United States proper, another 
fourth from Ifawult and Porto Rico, 
and the remainder from foreign coun- 
tries, chiefly Cuba. The largo increase 
this year in the production of beet 
sugar in this country is noted, 1,400,- 
000.00* cjutids havlog been raised, 
against 1.900,000,000 pounds In 1910 
and loss tbun half that amount In 
1905.

BU8INE88 SYSTEM REORGANIZED.

The United States treasury on Feb 
1 revolutionized Us business system 
and placed the ordinary fiscal transac­
tions of the federal government on a 
modern basis. The change, it Is de­
clared, will prevent In large measure 
the temporary tylug up in the vaults 
of the Buh-treasuries of a large amount 
of money available for clrcualtion 
without increasing the deposits of the 
government In the banka.

Tbe daily government receipts from 
customs, internal revenue and other 
sources are now placed with the ns 
tionai bank depositories to the credit 
of the treasurer of the United States.

All checks of government disburs­
ing officers are drawn on the treasurer 
ahd will be payable at any sub-treas­
ury or national hank depository In 
any part of the country.

A national bank depository paying 
one of these chocks may Immediately 
reimburse Us specified government 
account from daily receipts of customs 
or iuternal revenue deposited with it 
and forward to the nearest sub-treas­
ury only the remainder of tbe receipts. 
This extends the clearing house prin­
ciple to the government’s business 
system.

In the past all receipts in the shnr* 
of checks for customs duties or Inter­
nal revenue taxes have been forward­
ed to the sub-treasuries for conversion 
into actual cash. This process, which, 
It is said, drew money into tbe treas­
ury unnecessarily for a limited time 
at least, will now be avoided.

Also, it Is declared, the change will 
obviate the payment by pensioners 
and others of exchange on govern­
ment checks.

ITS POSITION FALSE
Progressive Organ Shown to B? 

Wrong in Premises.

SENATOR WARNER MILLER’S FINANCIAL PLIGHT

Republican National Convention to 
Change Basis of Representation le 

Not Borrowed Idea—Roose­
velt's Position in 1908.

NAVY RECRUITING GAINS.I

: The navy department has announced 
that hereafter it will be possible for 
applicants for enlistment in the navy 
to be examined in cities where there 
Is a marine recruiting office, but no 

1 navy recruiting office. The new order 
wilt apply in Peoria, 111.; Rock Island. 
Ill; Lansing, Mich.; Tiffin, O.; Front 

'Royal, Va ; Grand Forks, N. D., and 
, 8t. Joseph, Mo. There will, however,
! he no recruiting for the marine corps 
! at navy offices, as the complement of 
the marine corps is filled. Men whose 
preference Is for the navy may apply 
In any of the cities mentioned and be 
given a preliminary examination. If 
accepted they will be sent at govern­
ment expense to the nearest recruit* 
lng station to complete their enlist­
ment

The navy now is short about 5,008 
men. or between 9 and 10 per cent, of 
its authorized strength The British 
navy is short about 12,000 men, or 
about the same proportion, but the 
British face greater difficulties be­
cause their larger number must be 
drawn from areas In which recruits 
previously have been gathered and 
are thus practically exhausted.

ReciUiting In the United States 
navy is found to show a decided gain, 
the greatest single factor in enlist­
ments, according to navy officials, be­
ing the recommendation of men In 
-tbe service or who have been dis­
charged.

Sharper Than He Thought.
Nell—He actually told me 1 was 

lull
Hello— / suppose you convinced him 

to the contrary.
IP lit* f'urtalnly. I've ru t him ever 

slncu

RETAIN THE LARIAT.

The lariat has been retained by tbe 
cavalry equipment board as a part of 
the new equipment of mounted troops. 
Ab cavalry marches for a considerable 
period of years repeatedly have tra­
versed regions affording facilities for 
rail transportation of forage, and us 
plenty of forage is laid down at the 
picket lines in munuvor camps, a 
great many officers accept these con­
ditions a* those that probably always 
will prevail. As a natural result many 
have given little attention to the prob­
lem of subsisting horses in the field 
under circumstances that always huve 
prevailed in war and probubly always 
will-lack of transportation.

There are those that have main­
tained that the growth of rail and 
water transportation In every direc­
tion during recent years bus created 
the probability that our cavalry iu fu­
ture wars can look confidently to tbe 
ample supply of forage, utid therefore 
a resort to grazing will be unneces­
sary. This view has been disturbed 
as recently as last year, when for 
several months our cavalry was con­
fronted by the possibility of service 
In Mexico, s country strikingly bar- 
reu of tiansportation facilities in most 
districts

Jt is for these reaosns that the lariat 
has been retained, in order that horses 
under restraint may bo put out to 
graze.

Tho Evening Mail is mistaken If it 
thinks it can discourage the railing 
of a Republican national convention 
for the purpose of changing the basis 
of representation by saying that those ; 
who fuvor the change ure copying the I 
present rules of the (’regressive party. 
It said the other afternoon: |

"They would have Republican con- i 
\cntions adopt the identical rules gov­
erning the election and seating of 
delegates in national Progressive con­
ventions, and they would make the 
basis of representation precisely that 
of the national Progressive party—ap­
plying especially to tbe south.”

The Progressive party has no pat­
ent on the plan of apportioning dis­
trict representation in national con­
ventions according to party strength. 
It has Itself not yet put such a scheme 
in force. The delegates to the Pro­
gressive convention of 1912 were 
elected on the old geographical basis. 
Moreover, if the Progressives are go­
ing to apply the new method in 1916 
they will only be appropriating an 
Idea which many Republicans have 
been championing for years and 
which came near being accepted by 
the Republican national convention of 
1908.

Who is chiefly responsible for tbe 
failure to abandon tbe Totten bor­
ough” system of representation five 
years ago? There can be no doubt 
that if President Roosevelt had said 
the word a majority would have been 
mustered for tbe Burke resolution. In 
a recent speech In Indianapolis at a 
meeting called to consider party reor­
ganization ex-Representative James 
Watson mado this statement:

“Indiana voted in 1908 unanimously 
to cut down the southern representa­
tion over which we quarreled at Chi­
cago. Then we received a telegram 
from Theodore Roosevelt, whose hand 
reached out to stay tbe action which 
would have done away wltl) the south­
ern delegate question. He said (be 
southern delegates would get mad and 
beat Taft."

President Roosevelt did not stay tbe 
action of Indiana, or New York, or 
Pennsylvania. Hut be probably con­
vinced many delegates from other 
northern states of the necessity of 
keeping tbe southern contingent In 
good humor. He had it in his power 
to help the Hurke resolution through, 
but be allowed the system to be per­
petuated from which he was himself 
afterward to suffer.

New York's record is entirely clear 
on tbe question of representation. It 
gave a solid vote for tbe Burko 
scheme. Mr. Root only voices the set­
tled opinion of this state when he 
suggests doing now what should have 
been done in 1908. He has the Re­
publican party of New York behind 
him, and it can make no possible dif­
ference to Republicans here whether 
or not tbe Progressive party has ap­
propriated a method of representation 
which they were in favor of applying 
In Republican conventions four ye. h 
before tbe Progressive party war 
born.—New York Tribune.

Warner Miller, Penniless!
To tbe youngsters who have broken 

into tho political 
game in the last 
few years this an­
nouncement In 
the papers a few 
days ago didn’t 
mean anything 
beyond the state­
ment that anoth­
er man had gone 
broke; to politi­
cians and other 
persons whose 
memories go back 
30 or 40 years It 
brought up the 

faded picture of one of the most inter­
esting figures In the political Hfo of 
the stale.

United States senator, a power in 
Republican politics for years, a splen­
did orator, Civil war veteran, an In­
ventor of machinery that revolution­
ized paper making, a man of scholarly 
attainments, and for years one of New 
York’s big businessmen, Warner Mill­
er at 75 finds himself 1n tbe deepest 
financial straits, broken in health, all 
but forgotten In the state where 
once his name was a household word. 
Hundreds of persons who followed his 
picturesque career until he dropped 
out of sight will regret to bear of the 
reverses he has met with In his de­
clining years.

Senator Miller—he is still called 
Senator—has been making a brave

fight to get back on his feet, but bis 
financial trouble , have been too much 
for even a man of bis determination 
to overcome. They have berm pil­
ing up for years. In January, 1908, 
he made an assignment for the bene­
fit of his creditors to Ernest L. Con- 
ant, an attorney, but the schedules 
wen; not filed in the county clerk’s 
office until a few days ago. These pa­
pers show that bis liabilities are great- ■ 
ly in excess of his assets. Senator 
Miller makes his home with one of 
his children. While his health is 
feeble his mind is as clear as ever.

1 Entering political life in an acci­
dental way, he forged rapidly to tbe 

■ front in the councils of the Republic- 
| an party and continued to take a lead­

ing part in tbe political affairs of the 
state and nation for many ytars. Al­
ways In tbe thick of the Republican 
fray, ho is best remembered for bis 
uncompromising attitude toward Platt, 
an attitude which asserted Itself soon 
after tbe latter began his .campaign 
to get control of the Republican o r 
ganization of tbe state.

Miller and Platt locked horns on nu­
merous occasions, but Platt was "com­
ing" and Miller was "going,” and the 
result was not long In doubt. Platt 
was Instrumental In defeating Miller 

I for re-election to the United States 
senate in 1887, and after that Miller’s 
political fortunes began to decline.

Unfortunate speculation is respon­
sible for Senator Miller's financial dlf- 

I Acuities.—Exchange.

F O L E Y ’S  %
B W 8 K K W I
STOPS COUGHS - CURES COLDS

CooUiai No OpUlM b  S a fi For ChiUrao

The Wretchedness 
of Constipation
Can quickly be overcome by
CARTER’S LITTLE 
U V E R  PILLS.

Purely vegetable 
—act surely and

Sently on the 
ver. Cure 

Biliousness,
H e a d ­
a c h e ,
D izzi- . ,
ness, and Indigestion. They do their duty^ 
SMALL PILL, SMALL DOSE, SHALL PRICE.

Genuine must bear Signature

MUCH MYSTERY IN DR. FRIEDMANN’S ‘CURE1

AN EXPENSIVE DI8EA8E.

The offer of Charles E. Finley of 
New York of $1,000,000 for Dr. Fried­

mann’s tubercu­
losis serum has 
caused a stir in 
m e d I oa  1 circles, 
both in Berlin, 
Friedmann's home, 
and In America.

Dr. Friedmann 
said recently that 
he would give the 
German govern­
ment his discov­
ery, but up to a 
few days ago he 
had not dono so. 
On February 19 he 

sailed for New York. Just before leav­
ing be said: “I am going to America 
to earn that $1,000,000 offered by Mr. 
Finley. My time there will be rather 
limited, as I must be back to Berlin, 
where work awaits me.”

Privy Medical Councillor Klrchner, 
tbe head of the Prussian health de­
partment, stated to a newspaper cor­
respondent that Dr. Friedmann had 
not given his culture to the govern­
ment, but had merely asked for an in­
terview. Dr. Klrchner said ho was 
not prepared to say whether the gov­
ernment would accept the remedy un­
til after it had made an investigation 
of the entire matter.

Dr. Friedmann's friends say they 
cannot understand his actions and his

premature announcements. They can 
only attribute them to the fact that 
he is chiefly a laboratory man, has lit­
tle knowledge of dealing with people j 
and Is not a practical business man. I 
No one knows where his laboratory is 
and the culture, it is said, is prepared j 
by a young woman laboratory assist- j 
ant, who is the only person be really1 
seems to trust. .

Some fifteen American patients are j 
being treated in Berlin by Dr. Fried-j 
mans. Some of them declare that 
they are getting excellent results and * 

| are Improving rapidly, while others' 
express antipathy to Dr. Friedmann • 
personally and criticise his institute.

Mrs. Walter Powell of Boston, the ( 
first American patient to be treated 
by Dr. Friedmann, left a few days 
after tbe first Inoculation. Her bus- 
band said that while be believed the 
remedy had some virtue. Dr. Fried­
mann personally did not inspire any 
confidence, perhaps because be docs 
not know how to deal with Americans. 
While his terms for treatment are gen­
erally considered reasonable, averag­
ing perhaps $25 for inoculation and 
$10 for consultation, some Americans 
here declare they are very high. One 
patient claims to be paying $1,000 for 
the entire treatment. Dr. Friedmann 
says it is the custom of German phys­
icians to vary their charges in accord­
ance with the ability of the patients 
to pay.

SAID TO BE THE OLDEST MASON IN AMERICA

Making an Impression Upon Him.
Bub Dwyor, fresh from college, open­

ed a real estate office in an attractive 
suburban neighborhood and hoped to 
make his fortune. For days he sat 
undisturbed in bis little office, staring 
out at the dusty roads or twiddling his 
thumbs. On the afternoon of the 
fourth day he saw a man crossing Og­
den boulevard diagonally, beaded for 
his door. Surely this was a customer. 
He must be made to feel that business 
was flourishing.

As the man otepped over the thresh 
old Bob had tbo telephone receiver at 
his ear and was talking earnestly Into 
the transmitter.

“That's correct,” he said as the rpao 
stood before him. “Right. Wo will ac 
eppt your fifteen cash tomorrow and 
lot the thirty thousand remainder 
stand on u ten year mortgage. What’ 
Yes, I'll bring the dood around at 11 
tomorrow morning. Good morning.''

Bob hung up tbe recriver and turn­
ed au Important vlsago to the vis­
itor.

"Why. I Just camo over." said the 
man. grinning, "to connect your tel#, 
phone Instrument with tbe wlro*”- 
ILtrper’i  Weekly.

Not Part of Secretary's Duty.
Will a duty on raw wool, proposed 

by Mr. Underwood and approved by 
Mr. Wilson, embarrass Mr. Bryan as 
secretary of state? Nay, good people. 
Why should it?

What has the secretary of state to . 
do with the tariff? It Is not within ! 
the purview of his office. The Mills 
bill in 1688 was not prepared to lit 
Secretary Bayard’s views. The Mc­
Kinley bill in 1899 was not prepared 
to fit Secretary Blaine's views, and In 
one or two particulars did not. The 
denunciation of protection In 1894 
while the Gonnan-Wllson bill was 
passing through congress went on 
without regard to the fact that Sec 
re lory Gresham was a protectionist, 
and had once sought the Republican 
uomlaatlon (or president six years he 
fore on that Issue.

The oldest living member of a Ma­
sonic lodge in the United States to­

day, it Is claimed, 
resides in Platte 
City, Mo. He Is 
a retired attor­
ney, William M. 
Paxton, aged 94, 
still active with 
his pen, an l still 
teaching a*'Sun­
day school class 
of aged men 
every Sabbath. It 
is 68 years since 
be became a Ma­
son. He is also 
a Knight Tem­

plar und a Royal Arch Mason, belong­
ing to the bodies at Platte City.

Mr. Paxton was born in Mason coun­
ty. Ky., on March 2, 1819. He attend­
ed Augusta college, Ky., St. Zavler’s 
(-•liege, Cincinnati, O., und (tauter col­
lege, Kentucky. In 1839 he was li­
censed as an attorney. He can, there­
fore, claim a professional life of over

73 years and Is perhaps the oldest 
living lawyer in Missouri.
^In 1874-5 Mr. Paxton became deaf 

and had to give up his lucrative prac­
tice of law. He engaged in other ac­
tivities und prospered, but In 1907 
found that the infirmities of age de­
manded retirement. Blindness has 
since veiled his eyes, and he can 
walk only in familiar paths. His fa­
cile pen is dally at wbrk, however, 
notwithstanding the weight of 94 

• years.
All bis life Mr. Paxton has been 

deeply devoted to the church and 
I Hunday school. In 1824, four years 
after the formation of tho Sunday 
school union, Ik- uttended In Colum­
bus, O., what w u h  perhaps the first 
Sunday school in the Middle west. On 
the first day of January, 1850, he or 
ganlzed the first Sunday school In 
Platte City, Mo., and since that duy, 
sick or well, In warm or cold, for more 
than 3,000 consecutive Sabbaths he 
has failed never to attend some Sun­
day school.

MAKER OF STATUES FOR U. S. GOVERNMENT
Th* Attorney General.

Among fh* great lawyers who have 
served as attorney general of the 
United States may be recalled Kd 
mund Randolph, William Wirt, Rev- 
fitly Johnson. Caleb Cushing, Jere­
miah B. Black, William M. Everts, 
Kbeuezcr R. Hoar, Wayne MacVeagh, 
and Richard Olney. We question if 
any one of them left a record of effi­
ciency superior or eveu equal to that 
made by tbo Hou. George W. Wicker* 
sham.

His place will lake a lot of filling — 
Harper’s Weekly.

Thero la widespread disposition to 
declare unreservedly that the pork 
barrel building bill pending t rider 
Democratlc auspices contains exceed 
tngly raw pork.

Nation Fact* Peril.
Mr. Mann, tbe minority leader, j 

aghast at tbe recklessnea* of the pres­
ent congress, declares that "the con­
trol of legislation Is In the bands of a 
disorganized mob.* That is an exag­
geration, but there Is a kernel of truth 
in It. The older men are having a 
hard time holding tbe new represents 
(Ives in check. How much harder wltl 
their task be when the next congn-m* 
assembles? Necessarily it will be h 
cru<*.~ congress. U r there will be man) 
itrangera in It.

Them Is but one woman who bus 
ever made a statue fur the eapllol at 

Washingtou. Yet 
this one of the 
greatest statues of 
the many forms of 
bronze and mar­
ble of thut great 
building—the stat­
ue of Lincoln, the 
man of sorrows.

Four years ago 
this sculptor re­
ceived a commis­
sion for her sec­
ond official statue 
for the capitol, u 
representation of 

Governor Kirkwood, the wartime chief 
executive of Iowa. That statue is near­
ing completion an«J now she has re­
ceived an additional commission for 
another figure, likewise to be placed 
In Statuary Hall. This last work is 
st tho behest -of the state of Okla­
homa and Is to be tbo statue of Be-

Business Deal.
"Nobody evur get* the best of Wom­

bat.”
"I once saw him get the worst of a 

business deulM
"Never.”
Fact. He had put a penny tr. a 

blot machine and It refuted to give 
up.”

"The doctors thought he had appeia- 
dlcltis until he went into bankruptcy, 
and then—’*

"Continue.”
"They diagnosed bis case a pain In 

the stomach ”

The Peign ©f Woman.
Women will serve »u public porters 

and dining cur waiters on tho special 
train which is to carry the Illinois 
suffragists to tho Washington parade, 
and except for tin* train crew and sol­
itary nmn to shine shoes it will be aa  
example of feminized railway trans­
portation. The male shoeblack 
prompts masculine reflections on tbe 
division of menial labor under the 
now dispensation. But mere man 
may take heart. Tho time is sill! re­
mote when there will be women at 1» 
comotive throttles or in tbe more r*  
sponsible posts In railroad operation, 
—New Yoyk World.

Overloaded.
The postman, staggering under his 

tremendous burden, stopped at No. 
23 and radg tho bell.

“Here’s 'the two dozen house blinds 
you ordered sent by parcel post, 
ma’am,” ho fc< bly murmured as tbe 
lady of the house camo to the door, 
*‘and the patent washing machine and 
tbo now Iron gate for tho front yard, 
but"—and he smiled a feeble, wilted 
sort of apology—”I’m afraid you’ll 
have to wait until my next delivery 
for your portable garage.”

Fair Comparison
"Do you mean to say that you com­

pare yourself to Shakespeare?” “Why 
not?” inquired tho manager of the 
Ulot hesllne Burlesque company, 
“Shakespeare had pretty much my ex­
perience. Tho critics roasted him 
and the authorities wore always 
threatening to dose his show.”— 
Washington Star.

It Is surely tough luck If you are 
unubto to mortgage your house for 
enough to get tho kind of louring cur 
you want.

/ -

quoyun, the great Indian who Invent­
ed the alphabet which resulted In 
making a record of Judiaii speech pos­
sible.

The woman who has been thus hon­
ored by the federal government and 
by the represeutatlvos of two stales 
at Washington is Mrs. Vlunle Ream 
Hoxlo Hbe is the only woman who 
has ever received such honors at the 
hands of tho government. In fact 
there Is no man who has over been 
called upon for so much Important 
sculpture for the capitol bulldiug as 
has this littlo woman.

Mrs. Hoxle has been a famous figure 
at the national capital since tbe Civil 
wur. For a generation her borne has 
been tho gathering place for men ami 
women who have won fame In art and 
literature and public life. As Mrs 
Hoxle'* ago advances her popularity 
seems to increase aud the note of 
earlier days that is souuded in her *u- 
tertalnmonts lends them a pcculla: 
savor of distinction.

Retcua Da Luxa.
“Hurry up and save that girl!’’ 

bawh-d the lire chief. "Why don l you 
hurry ?’’

The fireman bent over und whisper­
ed down three stories.

'Til have beron the ladder In a min­
ute, chief. I'm wailing for her to cijrl 
her hair ”

It’s Always 
A Good Thing

T o  have a

Clear Horizon
at both codi of the day,

A  dish of

Post
Toasties

for breakfast and again at the 

evening meal opens and closes die 

day with a dash «f sunshine.

Toasties are bits of hard, white 

Indian Corn, Last carefully cooked, 

then rolled thin and crinkly, and 

toasted to a  delicate* appetising 

brown.

Not a  hand touches the food m 

manufacture, and it is ready to 

serve direct from the package—to 

be eaten with exaam ar milk —and 

sugar, if desired.

Post Toasties taste deliciously 

good aud are richly nourishing.

J
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Former Once Lived Here

James Buchanan Cro86,or Dr. J. B. 
Crucial, as be was known in latter 
years, a man who was implicated in 
the counterfeiting of mining compan­
ies’ "script” in this section in the 
early 70’s, Is dying at Fargo, N. D., 
where he is a county charge in the 
poor house. In Negaunee be conduct­
ed a hospital !o a huge frame building 
that stood on the site now occupied by 
the Star Theater, and he and the town 
marshal, C. Peck, connived at the 
counterfeiting o f ' ‘iron” money. They 
escaped prosecution and Cross entered 
upon an international career of fogery 
and served terms in numerous prisons. 
He finally reformed and for many 
years practiced his profession in North 
Dnkota. but met reverses and is now 
dying, penniless.

Endorsed by Osborn

The Republican State Committee 
has received the following cablegram 
from former Governor Chase S. Os­
born, dated Mombasa, British East 
Africa, April 2nd:

To the Electorate of Michigan:—To 
my mind Justice Joseph H t . S tee re 
represents the highest type of our 
American judiciary. His years of ex­
perience as circuit judge have furnish­
ed an incomparable equipment. His 
broad humanity and bis kindly hu­
man sympathies make him especially 
&ne d? the common people. His in­
nate progressivene*s enables him to 
take a broad view of the changing 
conditions of our civilization. All 
this indicates his choice as member 
of the Supreme Court especially desir­
able at the present time and he should 
be selected regardless of party affilia* 
tions.

Chase S. Osborn.

Mitchell Methodist Church

The subject of the sermon by the 
pastor, Rev. Hartley Cansfteld, at 
Mitchell Methodist Episcopal church 
nextSundaymornlngwillbe: "Chris­
tianity a Question of Personal Rela­
tionship;”  in the evening, "Giants We 
Have to Conquer.” The Sunday 
School will meet as usual at 2 p. m.

Card of Thanks

We wish to thank our friends and 
neighbors for their many kindnesses 
and expresions of sympathy during the 
illness and after the death of our little 
daughter, and to assure them that they 
will be long remembered. We are 
especially grateful to the Jackson 
school friends and the members of St. 
John’s church.

CHARLES C. CHAPMAN.
and family

A DUagaoeable Person
Is the one who suffers the misery of 

a bod liver, lie is cross, dull and 
faultfinding. In all such cuees the 
liver, stomach and bowels need a 
thorough cleansing of bile and other 
impurities, and for this purpose there 
Is nothing more effective than DR. 
HERRICK’S SUGAR-COATED PILL. 
They put the liver in order, tone up 
the stomach and purify tho bowels. 
Price 25 cents. Sold by J .  E. O’Don- 
ogbuc, City Drug Store.

—A young g irl’s idea of a perfect 
husband is one who says "Dearest” 
everytimo he opens his lips. A mar­
ried women prefers one who says 
"How much do you need?” occasion­
ally.

Straight at it
There Is no use of our "beating 

around the bush.” We might as well 
out with It first a*> last. We want 
you to try Ctiamborlain’s Cough Rem­
edy the next lliue you have a cough 
or cold. There Is no reason so far as 
we can see why you should no/ do so. 
This preparation by its remarkable 
cures lias gained a world wide reputa­
tion, and people everywhere skeak of 
It In the highest terms of praise. It 
is for sale by J. E. O'Donoghue,

—There is a wide difference of opin­
ion over the merits of the new nickel, 
Hut so long as it passes for fivo cents 
most people will probably Ik* satisfied.

Cough Umlioins for Children
Too much care cannot Is* used In 

selecting cough medicine forchtldrcn, 
It should bo pleasant to take, contain 
no harmful substance and bo most 
effectual. Chamberlain's cough Rem­
edy meets these requirements and Is 
a lavoraite with lh<* mothers of young 
children everywhere. For sale hy J. 
E. O'Donoghue.

— When a girl 1ms a pairof legs the 
size of baseball bats there should be a 
law against her raising her skirts on 
a ru inyday . There are enough dis­
appointments In life without this, and 
we men have some rights.

found A Cure Fur HboirnisUsm 
•*1 suffered with rheumatism for 

t wo veHrs and could not gel my right 
hem] to my mouth for Ihut length of 
time.” writes Lee R. Chapman. Maple- 
ton, Iona ” 1 suffered terrible pain 
»o 1 could not sleep or He still at 
night. Five \eur* ago I begun using 
( ‘hamln-rlrin’• L.iilment and in two 
mouths J was well ami have nut suf­
fered with rb*«irn*tl*ni since,’’ For 
gale by J. E. O’Douoghuf.

FOR RENT—Suite of tbtee to five 
nice rooms on the second floor of the 
Sundberg block. Apply to

J ohn F. Allison,
22tf Postoffice Block.

March 21—April 11
P roba te  O rder.

STATE OF MICHIGAN, {
County  or Ma r q u ette , f ” •

At a session of the Probate Court (or the 
County of Marquette, hidden at the Probate 
office In the city of Marquette, on Friday, 
the 14th day of March In the year one thous­
and ulne hundred and thirteen.

Present. W. 1. Potter. Judge of Probate.
In tbe Matter of the Estate of James Jordan. 

Deceased.
On reading and filing the petition duly veri­

fied. of Effle Jordan, widow of said deceased, 
praying that administration of said estate be 
granted to berself, or to some other suitable 
person.

Thereupon it Is Ordered, That Monday, 
tbe 14tb day of April A. D. 1913, at two o'clock 
In tbe afternoon, be assigned lor the hearing of 
said petition and that the next of kin and heirs 
at law of said deceased and all other persons 
Interested In said Estate, are required to appear 
at a session of said Court, then to be holden at 
the Probate Office, in the City of Marquette, 
and show cause, if any there be, wby the prayer 
of the petitioner should not begranted.

And U Is Further Ordered, That satd petition 
er give notice to the persons Interested losald 
Estate of tbe pendency of said petition, and the 
hearing thereof, by causing a copy of this order 
to be published in the N eu a u n ee  Iron Her­
ald a newspaper printed and circulated In said 
County of Marquette, for three successive 
weeks previous (0 suld day of hearing.

(Seal) W. T. POTTER,
Atruecoov Judge of probate.

April 4—26
r r o b d t *  W / t iw *

STATE OF MICHIGAN,!.,
Couuiy of Marquette. (
At a session of the ProhaU Court for the 

County of \Maniuette. holden at the probate 
office In the City of Marquette, on Monday, 
the 31st day of March, in the year ouo thous­
and ume hundred and thirteen.

Present: W. T. Putter. Judge of Probate.
In Hie Matter of the Estate of James Dono­

van, Sr. Deceased.
On reading and filing tbe petition duly verl- 

lfled.of Therese Donovan, a daughter of said 
deceased, praying that administration of said 
deceased be granted to berself, or to some other 
suitable person.

Thereupon It Is ordered that Monday, the 
twenty-eighth day of April A. D. 1613, at two 
o’clock lu the afternoon, be assigned for the 
bearlog of said petition, and that the 
next of kin and helrs-at-law of said deceased 
and all other persons Interested In said estate 
are required to appear at a session of said court, 
then to be holden at the probate office In the 
City of Marquette, ami show cause, if Any there 
be, why the prayer of the petltlouer should not 
be granted.

And It is further ordered that satd petitioner 
give notice tq the persons Interested In said 
estAte of the pendency of said petition, and the 
bearing thereof, by causing a copy of tbls order 
pi In* published iu the N k o a u n b e  I r o n  Her-
Ai.b.a newsjmimr printed and circulated In 
said County of Marquette, for three successive 
weeks previous to said day of hearing.

8eal». W.T. POTTER,
A true cony. Judge of Probate.

COMING TO NEGAUNEE
and will be a t the

K I N G ’S I N N

FR ID A Y , April 18.

A Rare Opportunity
is  he re  o ffe re d  to  th e

Sick and Suffering
o f  o u r c o m m u n ity .

Read this Carefully

VISITING SPECIALISTS
FROM THE

CLEVELAND INSTITUTE OF 
MEDICINE AND SURGERY.

O N E  D A Y  O N L Y
a  A, M. TO a  P. M.

The Institution composed of a group of regu­
larly graduated llc-itwil .tod h-gaily
tegUteird under the l*Ka of the ftfali-, visit our 
city for tin* first lime in ordi*r to Jniioduce dm 
latest methods and discoveries hi medicine, and 
give to those who call, cuusullatlon. examina­
tion and Mdvht* absolutely free. ,J*|M.W. S|,eclA|.
Isis will diagnose your case and give you the 
tN'iieUl of lliclr expert skill, und luedlcal know!- 
edge fiee of charge. There Is uo ex|ieriiiieni nr 
guess work a t your expense, you will be told 
whether you ''an Ih* cured o r not. If your ease 
Is curable you will be put under lr*atinem Hit- 
mediately. If Incurable, they will glveyou such 
advice u# may prolong your lift-. Tlie trea t­
ment, If given, brings quick relief and ultimate, 
ly cures. Being prepared to  eotie with eaeh 
Individual rase, (lie system It thoroughly fire- 
piled for the treatment In a direct ami natural 
manner, ai.d Improvement Is iiolleetl at once, 
The worst eases are treated without incoiiven. 
Ifnce to the patients or Interlerence with their 
daily nerupatlou. only those not treated by 
local physicians are Invited. All old methods 
and remedies used lo r ages by the medleal 
wutld have been discarded hy these specialists. 
Testimonials will l»* shown you, upon request, 
of thousands cured lu slxlveu different states 
of the Union No matter how complicated, or 
what llie ii itnre of >,mr sickness may lie, It 
makes no difference, of how long standing, or 
wlist you may have tu-en told. fio not get dis­
couraged, but go and see these gentlemen.

REMEMBER there will be no charge cither 
for eoiisuttutnm or examination. We will tell 
you exactly where your difficulty lies. Jfyoq 
suspect kidney or hluddcr trouble tiring 11 two- 
ounce Indite of your urine .for i-b.-mi.-al and 
mieriMcopieal examination. Only diseases o| 
long standing, such as Nervous Heart. Momach 
and l.ung Trouble, f’a ia rih . diu-au* of the 
Iviili.ey*. Deafness due to ( a l in l i ,  Heated by 
an entirely new method, and hearing m niany 
cases Is resfotiHl Ht once. D-i Hot forget tile
dale and rail for Dr Mckles, |

Hours vgo a m, to M jo p m. 1

DON'T FORGET THE DATE1

Are you in need
OF COALP Need it right now?

Phone your order to JAMES PICKANDS 
& CO. (Limited) then and have your bins 
filled promptly with the best coal you could 
obtain.

WOOD D R Y  W O O D —A big supply of sound 
_____ dry 16-inch Hardwood on hand.

----- P /.2 V -W O O D —Sound and Dry.

R O C K E R - W O O D - $ 5 .0 0  per load.

James Pickands & Co., Ltd.
LOST—Gold locket, between post- 

office and Kind’s Inn. Finder return 
to Iron Herald office.

March 2ft— May 2
Notice fo r Publication.

DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR.
U. 8. Land Office at Marquette. Michigan, 

March 2t>, 1918.
Notice Is hereby given that John F. Poblmao, 

of Prloceton, Michigan, who, on March 4, 
1908, made Homestead Entry No. 12490, Serial, 
No. 01720, for 8H of NEK and NBfc of BEE, 
Sections,Township45North. Range 25 West, 
Michigan Meridian, has filed notice of Intention 
to make Five Year Proof, to establish claim to 
the land above described, before Register and 
Receiver, at Marquette. Michigan, on tbe 14tb 
day of May, 1913.

Clalmaut names as witnesses:
Joseph N. La Rochelle, of Prloceton, Micb.; 

James Miller,of Princeton. Mich.; James Ma­
loney, of Marquette, Mich.; Frank Farquer, of 
Uwlun, Mich.

OZRO A. BOWEN.
Register.

PABST
The Beer of Quality

CHARLES JOHNSON, A p t  
Negaunee, Michigan.

J Cleanliness and P urity  are Prim e, 
1 Factors* in every stage of the 
I Pabst E ight-Day Malting 
[ P rocess, And all the whol$*
|  some,healthful foodprop-J

S erties of the barley g ra in ' 
are found in our

Bavarian Bohemian
Blue Ribbon Export

1 Prompt Attention to M i l l  or Phone Orders

For Every Baking
CALUMET

B A K IN G  PO W D ER

Best—because it'e the 
purest. Best—bccauie 
it never fails. Best— 
because it makes every 
baking light, fluffy and 
evenly raised. Best 
—because it is moder­
ate in cost—highest in 
quality.

At your grocers.

RECEIVED
HIGHEST
AWARDS

W orld’s Pwre Food C1 9 0  
•ition, Chicago. 111. 

Porta Eipoaitiao. Fraaca, 
March, 1912.

You Jen */ tees ment’j  when you buy 
cheap ot blg’Can baking pouJtt, Dent 
be mltltj. B tj Calumtl. ll '1 mote 
economical— mere aheltiomt— gtvtt 
bat reujltt, Calumet 11 fat tuperlor to 
tour milk u n J  ted t.

CURTAINS
Pretty soon you will be 

thinking of L a c e  
Curtain Cleaning.

Why not take time by 
the f o r e l o c k  and 
think of it now?

You can’t  think of the 
best Lace Curtain 
laundering without 
thinking of us. If 

we have lanndered 
yours—you k n o w 
why.

NEEDHAM BROS.
Launderers-Dyers—Cleaners

B o th  P h o n e s  - I s h p e m ln g

Negaunee Agent:— FRED OATH,
Bell Phone 24 J.

Come and have a 
game of Pool at

JONES’

Billiard and Pool Parlors
408 Iron Street

NEW POOL AND 
BILLIARD TABLES.

We have a fine line of Cigars, 
Tobacco and Pipes.

Candie5, Chocolates, Etc.

W . 11. J O X B 8 , P ro p e r

EVERY HAN
tw entjr years in business know several periods 
when actual cash was almost unobtainable and 
the banks had great difficulty in meeting the 
requirements of even their most favored deposit­
ors. At such times most men, and especially 
the smaller depositors in the large banks wish 
they had a  second bank aecount. There are 
many other reasons why a t such times a second 
account is invaluable.

The Negaunee 
National Bank

NEGAUNEE, MICH.

CAPITAL AND SURPLUS - $120,000.00

OFFICERS:
E. N. Breitung, President.

P hilip Levine, Vice-Prerident. C. Meilleur, Vice-President. 
H. C. W agner, Cashier.

J. H. Anderson, Ass’t Cashier.

Special Attention Given to Banking by Mail

THE

! VOLUNTEERi
ORE GO.

-PRO D U CpRS O F -

i Bessemer Ore.
I - - - - - -
\ G. A. Tomlinson,
T Pretwleut aofi Treasurer.
I Duluth, Minn.

\ C. A* CONGDON,
\ VIce-l’reatdeiit,
J Duluth, Minn.

4 J ames W anleff.
4 Secretary,
i Duluth, Mlno. >

|  Edward J. Maney, • f
; Aitlitaut Treasurer, r
{ Duluth, Minn.

I Thomas Pellow ,
5 General Superintendent,
j Negaunee, Mich, j

EASTER ^
F lowers.

POTTED PLANTS 
in Bloom

Easter Lilies, Cinerarias. Splreas, 
Primroses, Daffodils, Narcissus, 

Tulips, Cyclamen, Geoista.

CUT FLOWERS
Boies, Carnations, Violets, Tulips, 
Narcissus, Daffodils, Sweet Peas, 

Call a and Easter Lilies.

PALMS and FERtfS

Telephone, teUyraph or mail your 
orders, Prompt shipments by mail 
or express. Both Phones.

Negaunee
Greenhouses

Negaunee, Mich.

F DR. JO S E P H  L. SH O R eT I  
OSTEOPATHIC PHYSICIAN 9 

or MARqrrrrs
j WILL BE IN N EG A U N EE
i Tuesday* and Fridays from 2 to 5 p.m. 
r beginning Tuesday, Oct. 22nd.

S3T  OFKICt IN THI KIRKWOOD BLOCK.
iLmty* 1.1

WATCH
-----FOB-----

Special Sale!

Something that Every Fam­

ily Needs and Prices that 

Mean Big Savings

Andrew E rickson,
42** IRON S T ., NEGAUNEE.

Stove Polish

Should Use

IT ’S different from 
others becauno more 
caro is taken lu tho mak­

ing and the materials used are 
of higher grade.

Black Silk 
Stove Polish
Make* abHIIIant.xllky pollxh tbaldncuoot 
rub off o r dual oil. and tho th ins Inats (our 
times s i  long a s  ordinary atovu pollali.

Ufted on sam pls fttovsi sad  sold by 
hardw are doalers.

All M k tiU  ft trial. Um IIod yourrookatofa, 
four l»rlor fttovft or your to* r*ngr. |ry»4 
Soa'tfiod llUiofceet efteyepeNeli r«u v w  ua«d, 
yoardtfftlar l»»a(liorjMdtur«<'iii<! your loouvr. 

ln*U( ob (Hack Silk htovo 
IU4# la liquid or |Nute-oot quality.

JLACK SILK STOVE POLISH WORKS 
Stsrilsf.UUaoU

Um  SImX Silk Alr-Orylnft lr*n Snftmel ongrftM, 
lotora, atow ,>l|>M~Pra*«nta roaiioa.
' “ ' 4  SUX Mata I eollaa tot all**r. nirka! or 

itwiDv equal for um ou eutonokUM.

(J e t a C a n  T O D A Y

(wlatora,

tSTTfi

CURES 
OBSTINATE  
COUGHS

r -  -  ^
K

ROUTS 
STUBBORN 

COLDS
THE KING OF CUBES

DR. KING'S

NEW DISCOVERY

QUICKEST 

WHOOPING 

COUGH CURE

AND

FOR ALL DISEASES OF

T H R O A T
H E A L S  

W E A K , 

S O R E  L U N G S

L U N G S
PRICE

.SOo A $1

SOLD AND GUARANTEED BY
2 3 X r C 7 a 0 X S T S



SUPPLEMENT TO

NEGAUNEE IRON HERALD
Negaunee, Michigan, Friday, April 4, 1913.

C o m m o n  C o un c i l .
Hip regular monlhlv meeting of the ( omnmii 

"mineil of Hip city ol Negaunee. was held In the 
• ’11y Hall Thursday evening April 3rd. |»I3 

.Meeting called to order by Mayor Klilotl. 
Present Aids Nelson, Larson Hogan, Was- 

>nuih. Mitchell, llejgHlnn mid ThomaH.
Absent Aids. I’rowse, Collins and Driscoll. 
Mlimtci* of previous meeting approved an read 
street and Highway Committee presented the 

following report:
1'o the Honorable Mayor and (’oniinon Council 

o l th e d ly o i Negaunee Gentlemen: 
YourConimltlceoii Streets & Highway*beg 

rave to Million the following report of work
lone f*ir the month of Maren. 191.1:

Cleaning Hirer! Mitlid ulleVN................  9 HI AO
Removing miow from street* and high­

w ays...............................    m  NO
« >|n*i i Ii ik  im ite r* * ....................................... :iik  iw
opening road In cemetery...................  Hi do
SamlliiK walk)*.....................................  MW
Removing allow from Iron d irec t...... 31 (A

Total......................  iPdh 9*
l(e>«|H>ctfnlly submitted,

Wm. Hkooaton,
C. U. D u im  o i . i,.
J. A. WAHMI'TH,

com. on St. to llv. 
On motion of Aid. Mitchell supported by Aid 

bars m. renort wan accepted and placed on IHe, 
To Hie honorable Mayor and Common Conn- 

li of the City of Neimimee - tleiilleinen:
I herewith hand yon a  report of Kx|>eiidllurl‘s 

it the Water Works and Klectrie I.lirht Station 
or Hie inonlh ending March Hint. 1913 •

WATKK WOltKH
ON tons of coal at |;< on per ton ......... iv a  (Ml
jl'H  (tats c v llu d c ro ll  iu  4©c jie r p i t .......  i l  N!
s gals. ot machine oil uPitAc per gal ... i  nil

T o ta l ...............  IMT Mi
tverage number ot strokeii per 24 hours, 33,120.

KI.KITIIU’ l . l 'i l lT
.11 tons of coal at Id (Miiier ion..............  9393 00
i l  m ils c y lin d e r  ml a t  4oc p c r j ta l .  . . H i )  
*h  u n is, m ach in e  oil u t 25c per khI -------  Too

T o ta l...........  |4lH* 20
I'oial K W Kciicrnlcd for month 31,sun City Hit.;
C.C I.Co.. 2,0*7.

U ke level frozen 
Remarks:

WATKII Wfillh.
'mil, 1912 IM> Ions; 1913- KIN tons.

KI.KITHd'-I.IOUr 
cml, 1012 174 tons; 1913-131 tons 

U W Ketieraled- 1912.37,141; 1013.34,197. 
Itespm'tfully submitted

C HANSEN, Superintendent. 
On motion report was accepted and placed ou 

'lie.
The followhiK reiMiri was read^
Th* total receipt* of the Neuannce Klectrlc 
lulil r ian t tor the month February Udd. was 
4 follows: Lighting. f r il l  Art. material, 161927; 

l or February 1912 Lighting, 022A5.43; muter- 
at, »mw

No. of Inc Lamps added in March, 27,
Total No. of Inc. Lamps ou circuits, Ii4ft5.
Total No. of Arc Lamps on circuits, 71 Street 

and iu Commercial.
Respectfully suhmllted.

J. T. BURNS. Clerk.
Ou motion of Aid. iieggaton supported oy 

Aid. Wasmuth reixirt was accepted and placed 
ou hie

Report of Marshal Jackson for the month of 
March was read, and on motion accepted 
him! placed ou (lie.

Report of Sexton Chester for the inonlh of 
Man'll was read, and on motion accepted 
and placed oh file.

KciHiri of Health Ofllcer (or tin* month of 
Marcli was read, and on motion accepted 
und placed on tile.

Your Committee on Claims and Accounts beg 
leave to report that they have examined the 
foHowiiiK bills, found them to lie correct, and 
recommend ttiai same be allowed:

N1KKKT « IIIOIIW AV Kt'Ml 
Chris Hansen, salary as supt................ . V 40 Ou
John M*'AuldTe. labor services............. A 4 m
Eil Price do 50 70
liert Roscvere dn 23 10
William HU'Voiis do • 49 3 •
Ham Colllcol do 47 25
Ernest Harrlty do (to 70
it P Johnson do :hj 90
Harney Mnubriek do 2h 35
John Miller do 21 lft
Alex liaslmw do 31 00
Sam Reunett do 32 Aft
Richard Jewell do 30 45
Thomas Watts do 43 1A
(Just Andirson do V) 45
Fred Pleau No. 1 do 34 13
Anion Itolfes do 31 :<5
Louis Itoyea do 27 30
Henry McComlwr do 14 no
John Jane do 21 o0
Hoy Cuills 
1' C Rellstrom

do 10 AO
do ID U5

Peter Liieomlm do » 19 9ft
Arthur huiisiun do A 25
Yaliner lajllioneu do 3 lft
llarohl ('ox do 14 00
Frank Rasliaw do 27 30
William Rogers do 4 20
John Meish do 10 .10
la.*o R lierls do 3 IA
Fred Pleau No. 2 do 3 lft
John Acre do 4 20
Charles 8tark do 3 00
Oliver Roy do 2 00
Joseph Picciauo do 4 20
Mek I'leelano do 3 00
K Richards do 3 00
A Rouo do 3 00
Huy Roberts do 4 00
Frank Cox do 19 95
8am Thompson do 17 HA
A Menard do 2 10
John .femes •lo 7 3A
Herman Tliela do 2 |u

2N V)
Hum Rmniihw do 14 25
Holjerl ThomiMon do 9 A0
It J MacKcn/.ie do 2 30

William Sumbpilsl do 2  3s
hid Lumber & Coal (Jo., supplies .......... 30 55
iairkin .MamilueturliiK Co., nozzle.......... in (m
C F ft L (Jo., hemlock..............................  ik 37
Pioneer Iron Co., 4470cu. yds. rock Gf. .02 91 fig
Mrs K Johnson, rent............................... lo (Mi
John W Klllott, supplies.......................... | aft
AlllsCImlinei* Co., trolley wire...........  15 do
Peter Chcvrette, blacksmlthliiK.............  12 do
1) 8 8 & A Ky., freight............................. N7
C ft N W Hy., freight .............................  i ifi
Louis Helmsdorfer, straw....................... 2 4.1
WudfmmsUit Co., oil............................... 19 :«J

CITY TAX KUNI>
A. Relistrom, part salary asass't supt..
John T Rums, salary as recorder...........
T A Tlioren, salary as city attorney.......
Phil J . Hogan, salary as assessor...........
h r C J Larson, salary us heullli ofllcer.. 
Robert W. Jackson, salary as matshal. 
Richard Yelland, salary as policeman ..
Jacob llelsel do
John Chin do
Pick Chomictte u»
Victor Makl do
liolph Wheeler do
Miss 8 Wellctt, salary as librarian......
Frank Conway, salary as driver a team 
H. fl. Williams, salary as city teamster.
Matt Chester, salary as sexlou...........
William Walters, salary as Janitor......
John K Nelson, clerk of eft a com......
Bert Kosevcie, labor services..............
11 P Johnson do
Harvey Kellan do
Mrs J ilooimr, rebate on sewer...........
I F. Hwlft ft Co,, steam hose................
CJ Imrson. exiH'iiseH..... ...................
J K H'hoiiouhue. supplies...... ...........
C F A J. Co., coal...............................
Negaunee Printing Co., part contract...
Tompkins Pnarnuicy, supplies...........
August Relmrletnmer, dray lug.............
Alex Roberts, draylog.......................
James pickandsfk Co., wood..............
II 8 N Ighllngale. audltliiK record's hook*
Joseph Lowenslehi, ImmjIh..................
hid Lumber a Coal Co., coal..............
hreager Oxygen Co., pullmotor...........
Negaunee Water Works, supplies ......
M led I gait State Tele Co., novice.........
Neg Kl Lt Plant. Ilgegt aod material ...
c ft N W Ity Co, freight.....................
American Express Co.,......................

KMOTKIC I.IOIIT KPNIl

Chris Hansen, saiary as supt............
John Iteh'licl, salary as electrician......
Rasmus Mattson, fireman...................
Hie Erickson, fireman.......................
John T. Rums, salary as clerk............
Christ Jensen, salary as asHlstant clerk.
Charles Leaf, labor service................
Roy Cuills do
liert Balcotnbe do
(hist Anderson do
hick Mall do
Warner Arc Ump Co., globes.......... .
Western Union Co.,.......................
Henry Tlmmus, dray........................
Henry Lee, dray...............................

9 50 0
7.1 0U 
41 67 
37 50 
25 UJ 
7ll (JO 
liO 00 
0(1 00 
00 (*• 
00 00 
00 00
00 on 
An t/0 

lui oo 
on on
7.1 (Ml 
50 00 
A 00

29 40 
12 00 
110 U0 
3 (Ml 

22 AO 
2 '.A 

33 In 
41 94 

12-1 00 
A 00
1 2,'i 
1 (Ml
0 7A 

ao on 
9 25 

IK 2J 
107 50 
153 25 

(I 25 
476 AH 

42 
05

* in no 
Ki on 
«7 50 
07 A0 
17 50 
20 0 > 
37 50 
33 7A 
20 i 0 
19 95 
27 3h 
7 50 

'41

2 75

P Rasmussen. supplies...........................  2 05
Light fi power Com., supplies............... 14 nu
.M fell State Tele Co.,................................ j 20
(•eiiiTal KlectricCo.. supplies.................. ]9| 54
John W Klhott, supplies........................  i  55
Reerdslee Clutnd Mfg Co., supplies........  0 55
Julius Andre a Hoiis, supplies................  p,i i.t
Allls-Clialmers C o , ................................  :,t,z
A..... Express C o .............................  50
|J 8 H i; A.................................................. u {(p
C A N W lly ........................................  42:,

c c  Iron Co., 2iiKr K. W...........................  42
WATKII WOKKH KlINI*

Chris Hausen, salary as supt......  .. .
Alfred Rellstrom, pari sal. asass 't supt,
John Allen, salary as engineer..............
Oliver Hynmnds. salary as engineer.......
John T Hums, salary as clerk................
Christ Jensen, salary as assistant clerk. 
Kan Wasimith, luhor service..................
Norman Kellan do
W Frederlckson do
Alhlu Rellstrom do
hick Mall do
Roy Cuills do
Oliver Hleau, draylug..............................
U A Rrollierton, wider tnap...................
Sam liaslmw. draying...............................
.1 KO'honouliue, supplies........ ..............
Whiter a Siiess, supulles........................
Mailhaiiis oil Co., oil and waste............
Henry Tlmnms. ilniylng ........................
Oliver Iron Mining Co., supplies ......
Michigan Slate Tel Co., phones ...........
Andrew l.lmppiist, labor........................
Henry Leo,draylug..................... ............
II W Jolms-Manville Co., compound....
hid Lumber & Coal Co., coal.................
C F A I. Co., cement................................
Peter flievrclto, supplies........................
John W Klilotl. supplies.........................
Nog KI Lt PI int, lamps ..........................
C a n  W Ky Co., freight..........................

1 4u no
50 (10 
75 (Mi 
75 0) 
17 50 
20 III
;m (in
7A (Mi 
03 no 
in to 
27
13 V)

An 
:tl nu
I .VI
3 75 
l 20

27 49
4 VI 

17 (M 
4 VI
I NO
II 2.5 

29 43 
h IU 

10 N l 
0 hi

Nil 
4 15 
3 III

KIHK DKI'AUTMKNT FUM>
Julius Johnson, part salary as chief.... 5 25 ou
Jerry Romielt, salary as driver............... 7n (Mi
John Larson, salary as driver................  70 on
Mert Ralcomhe, tabor ............................. 20 U3
Mrs Jerald Renuett. washing.................. 2 An
Peter Chevretle. tilaeksmlHiing..............  2 04>
Neg Id 1.1 I’luul, light A supplies...........  49 |7
Albert Story, hhicksmltliiiig.................... 12 (to
J EO'houoghiie, hoof dressing.............  3511
Winter a Sues*, oats .............................  41 10
Itert Ralcomhe, I days lalwir.............  2 (X)
Mich Htuto Teh* Co., phono........... |  00
IajuIs Helmsdorfer, s traw .....................  7 m
8 A Parson, labor.....................................  1 20
John W KlUott, supplies........................ t2 w
A W headman, services.......................... 2» 00
Coal Fund, coal........................................ ho 40
1) H S ft A Hy Co., freight........................  75
C ft N W Hy C'u,. freight .................... Hn
American I’xitress Co,.express..............  0 All
Neg Water Works, hydrant rental........  >43 75
C (! I Co. supplies...................................  43
Chicago Fire Apparatus Co., hose..........  33 00

On motion Connell then adjourned.
JOHN T. RUUNS, Recorder.
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County Board Proceedings
PRINTED BY AUTHORITY

March 26th, 11*13.
Tim Honorable liuurd of Supervisors 

of Marquette County met pursuuu\ to 
u call duly made ul the Court House 
in the city ol Marquette, iu said coun 
ty, on Vveduesday the 26th day ol 
A'ureh, A. H., 1913.

The meeting was culled to order by 
die Chulnuaii 1). W. I'owell.

The roll being called the following 
superv Isoi'H were lound to be present: 
I 'u K c r ,  Chapman, Coilick, Corkiil. 
Kuhlslcdl, Field, Fosterling, Cuslafson, 
Hudson, .luckson, Johnsou F. J., John­
son elms., Keese, Keunaugh, lairson, 
Manley, Multhews, Mitchell, Mylly- 
inaki, Neldhuit, Nightingale*, Ulsou, 
i'erkms, Howe, Smith, Siebenthul, 
Swunson, Stickney, Thompson, Thom­
as, Tram bath, Vundcnboom, Wasley, 
7 onkosky, t ungblutli, Cluytou, and 
Cowell, Chuinuau—37.

Absent: Arnold,—1.
The reading of the minutes of the 

previous meeting was upon motion dis­
pensed with.

The following petition was reud and 
upon motion duty seconded, referred 
to the County Hoad commission.
To the honorable board of supervisors 
ol the County ol Marquette, and state 
of Michigau:

The undersigned, resident taxpayers 
of Wells Township, aforesaid County 
and State, respectfully petitions, und 
prays the uforesald hoard of supervis­
ors grunt to your petitioners, a  eouuty 
road to be constructed as follows, to

wit;
Starting from Wutson in tin* afore­

said county and stule and running in 
a southeasterly direction on the north 
side purrallel with tiucunaba und Imke 
Superior It. It. to the Delta eouuty 
line, to connect with the aforesaid 
county road. This being the only out­
let for the inhabitants ot the township 
of Wells.

Therefore we he undersigned tux 
payers pray that your petitions he 
gianted the suid county road.

Henry Arnold, Oskar Kellonieini 
Andrew lluhiu, Walter Hamulinen, 11 
.1. Jueger, M. Nelson, Will, Abruinson 
X. Vlas, Stephen Churlebols, John Con 
liar, Fred Christenson Gust Pulcen 
Jim Kuiiuer, Charles Kemppoimau 
John ilruce, Walker, Munnmeu, Gran 
Luce, Muth Decker, Peter Kelloulmi 
Victor l^arson, John Bolin, Charley 
Vohmun, Chas. A. Olson, Joseph title 
John Kleiuke, Oscar Peterson.

The following report of Uie audit 
ing committee was read and adoptee 
by the following yea and nay vote:

Yeas: linker, Chapman, Cluytou 
Coilick, Corkiil, Fuhlstedt, Field, Fos 
terliug, Gustafson, Hudson, Jackson 
Johnson, F. J., Johnson Chas., Keese 
Kenmiugh, Larson, Mauley, Matthews 
Mitchell, Myllymuki, Neidhart, Night 
ingale, Olson, Perkins, Rowe, Smith 
Swunson, Stickney, Siebenthul, Thom 
pson, Thomas, Trembatb. Vauden 
boom, Wasley, Yonkosky, Yungbluth 
und Powell—37.
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David J. Cuven, wituess fees in justice court .........$ .86 $ .80
Joseph Douckers, witness fees in justice c o u r t.......  7.25 7.20
Isaac Hanukselu, witness fees ul inq u est........................... 70 .70
Elijah Toms, witness fees at in q u e s t ...................................70 .75
Clius. Arseneault, witness fees uL inq u est........................... 70 .75
Solomon Alio, witness fees at inquest.................................70 .75
ihos. Pascoe, witness fees at inquest ........................ 1.05 1.05
John Jacobson, wituess fees a t inquest......................  1.05 1.05
Alfred Kostam, wituess fees a t inquest ....................  1.00 1.05
ltobt. Miller, witness lees ul inquest ........................ 7.25 7.25
George Argali, jurors fees ul inquest ........................ 1.00 1.50
L. ti. Green, jurors fees at inquest .......................... 100 1.50
Andrew Smedberg, jurors fees ut inquest ................  1.50 1.50
John Decare, jurors fees at inquest .......................... 1.50 1.50
Hurry Adams, jurors fees a t in q u e st...........................  1.50 1.60
Swan Andersou, Jurors fees a t inq u est........................  1.50 1.60
J. F. Imbold, Jurors fees a t inquest ...........................  3.75 3.76
C. W. Munson, jurors fees at inquest ........................  3.75 3.75
J. li. Caspar, jurors fees at inquest ...........................  3.76 3.75
Chan. P. Peterson, jurors fees ut inquest ................  3.75 3.75
J. O. Ulberg, jurors tees at inquest .......................... 3.76 J.75
Peter Johnson, jurors fees at inquest.......................... 3.75 3.75
William J. 1.upton, Jurors foesut Inquest ..................  1.00 1.50
Wesley Sweet, Jurors fees ut inquest ........................ 1.60 1.60
Theophlle Rustlen, jurors fees a t inquest ................  1.50 1.50
Herbert Doherty, Jurors fees a t inq u est....................  1.50 1.50
William Rivers, Jurors fees a t inquest......................  1.50 1.60
Timothy Duquette, jurors fees a t inquest ................  1.50 1.50
Alfred Hocking, jurors lees at inquest ........................  3.00 3.00
William Zeltler, Jurors fees ut inquest ........................  3.00 3.00
Clius. Hooper, Jurors fees ut inquest .......................... 3.00 3.00
ti. S. Rowland, jurors fees a t inquest........................  3.U0 3.00
Win, VcrRun, Justice of the Peace ...........................  11.20 11.20
L. P. Crary, Justice of the Peace ...............................  9,00 9.00
John D. West, Justice of the Peace ...........................  9.88 9.88

\  John Alpine, Justice of tlio Peace .............................  3.00 3.00
W. J. GUI, Justice of .the Peace ...............................  3.00 3.00
Samuel ti. Byrne, Justice of the Peace ....................  38.00 38.00
Junies Moloney, Sheriffs fees, bd. prisoners ............... 400.78 400.78
R. W. Jackson, Deputy Sheriffs fees ..........................  12.80 12.80
William 11. Trevarrow, Deputy Sheriffs f e e s ...........  9.80 9.80
Alex. Laxstroiu, Deputy Sheriffs f e e s ..........................  10.00 10.05
C. H. lTivlgue, Deputy Sheriffs fees ..........................  8.02 8.02
James Cronin, Deputy Sheriffs fees ...........................  8.23 8.23
Samuel Bennett, Constable#fees...............1................ 2.90 2.90
John Uerg, Constables Tees............................................ 145 1.46
John 11. Mannliig, Constables f e e s ...............................  21.20 21,26
Charles Brown, Constables fees ............................... 9.40 9.40
Thomas Chenliall, Taking testimony .......................... 3.00 3.00
Arthur Couslnuau, Taking testim ony...........................  2.00 2.00
Alike Tusson, Interpreter in Justice court ................  2.75 2.75
Wlllium Prin, Coroners f e e s .........................................  90.20 90.20
Erie tixstrom, services as couslublc over body of

Mclch Bloomer, etc................................................................. 6.26 5.25
John Lehman, Services assisting coroner ................  2.40 2.40

,Jolm T. Quine, mine inspectors’ mileage ................  17.92 17.92
'A. ti. Sterne, Co. School Com. expenses ......................  28.18 28.18
Thomas M. Wells, Truuut officers expenses ............. 30.28 30.28
Joseph R. Smith, Answering telephone, court .........  6.00 5.00
Mrs. Johu Wasley, assisting sheriff taking patient to

I*apeer .................      4-90 4.00
ti. H. Flynn, examination of Insane.............................  10.00 10.00
F. McD. Harkln, examination of insune, etc................  10.00 10.00
A. W. Hornbugen, exa'miuath n feeble minded .........  6.00 6.00
Wui. B. Luiiu, examination ol insane .......................... 6.00 6.00
JJ. J. Horubogen, exauiiuuthm of Insune ....................  0.00 6.00
Geo. G. Barnett, examination of insune ......................  0.60 0.50
Z. Vaduuls, examination of in sane...............................  O.oo 5.00
N. J. Robbins, professional set vices .............................  lG.on 10.00
V. JI. VttUdev'iiiter, profcsnloi./H services....................  0.00 _j »*0
Marquette Pub Co., publishing proceedings ............. 76.(61 75.03
Neguuuee Print. Co., publishing proceedings ...........  33.60 33.00
Mining Journal Co. L td , declarations, circulars for

dork  ...................................................................................... 13.76 13.75
Geo. A. Newell, pub. liquor und supplies............. 23.40 23 40
Peninsular Record, pub. procinMltngs and supplies ..  99.03 99.03
J. 11. Shulls, enrollment notlcos ..................................  7.34 7.34
Ihlliig Bros, tiverurd Co., letter heads and bond paper

Register of Deeds ....................................................... •>••• 99.14̂  09.14
F. B. tipeur 4t Huns, Coul for Jail, etc........................... 86.37 85.37
thin. Fuel k  Luni. Co., coal for court house ............. 190.22 190.22
LighL & Power Commission, light for Jail, M. 11., C. 11 74.76 74.76
PondlirH Pharmacy, Drugs............................................. 1«GU 1.60
Islipeming Hospital, services to John N yiuun...........  7.70 7.70
Huger Bros. Co., Ltd. book stall and wire ..................  3.10 3.1o
Gust A. Hourl, burial of pauper ................................. 23.00 23.00
Flunnlgun Bros., hauling ashen ................................... 3.76 3.76
John T. Burke, liv e ry ..................................................... 6-M &uu
Hupnrlor Uuruge ('*>„ repairing typewriter h in g e ................(10 .00
C. <\ Iron Co., hlunkols for Jail ................................... 17.00 17.60
W. II. Farrell, expenses.................................................  63.01 53.01
B. Neidhart k  Co., supplies for M. II...........................  3 50 3.00
Winter it Buess, supplies for M.ll. . ...........................  99.80 99.80
(iunmm Grocery Co., supplies for M. I I . ......................  40.15 40.16
Delf's Grocery, supplies for M .ll......... .........................  DI-31 10.21
Roach it fchwber, supplies tor M. 11...............   18.00 18.00
Jleywood Munufurturing Co. supplies ror M. II......... 17.60 17.60
F. 11. Vundeiiboom, supplies for M. II........................... 52.20 62.20
Herman titensrud, plumbing uud supplies for M. 11. ..  16.03 15.53
Frank W. Hutbwuy, supplies for M. JI........................... 4.17 4.17
Hoabury J Johnson, supplies for M. II. ....................... 4.62 4.62
Stafford Drug Co., supplies for M. JI........................... 37 .27
Joseph Burube, supplies for M.ll...................................  9*66 9.65
The Upjoliu Co., supplies for M.H...................................  13.05 13.06
F. Braustud it Co., supplies for M. JI...........................  30.42 30.42
Trembatb BroB., painting Interior M .ll.......................  030.00 030.00
C. J. Lurson, professional services .............................  15.00 15.00
Stephen Churlebols, 1 lynx bounty.............................  0.00 5.00
William J. Jueger, 1 lyux bounty ................................. 6.00 6.00
Mike Bale, 1 lynx bounty ..........................  6.90 5.00
Andrew Helhihf, 2 wolf bounties ...............................  64.01) 04.
Henry lluvery, 3 wolf bounties .................................  81.00 81.00
William Gordon, 1 wolf bounty .................................  37.00 27.00
Thomas Malwortli, 2 wolf bounties .............................. 64.00 54.00
JI. W. Wright, Hop. Co., troas., Sundry expenses . . . .  428.96 428.96
Nick Tusson, wituess foes at Inquest......................................76 .76

748 James R. Hudson, supervisors services 
i-!9 Victor Fahlstedt, supervisors services . . . .  
,0(1 Daniel W. I’owell, supervisors semccs .. 
*01 Joseph F. Neidhart, supervisors services .
702 John Stickney, supervisors expenses
703 Sutu'l S. Mitchell, supervisors expenses . . .
754 W. John Chapman, supervisors expenses
755 Oscar Field, supervisors services .............
TOG H. S. Nighliugule, supervisors services .. 
757 Charles Johnson, supervisors services
158 William Manley, supervisors services . . . .
759 Frank ti. Keese, supervisors services ........
7GU Richard Matthews, supervisors services ..
761 Alfred Coilick, supervisors se rv ice s.........
762 Wm. H. Trombuth, supervisors services ..
7G3 Gust Larson, supervisors services ...........
7G4 Richard T. Smith, supervisors services ..
7G5 CIuis. Gustafson, supervisors services ........
7GG A. J. Yungbluth, supervisors services ___
7G7 Nutliuniol Rowe, supervisors services ___
768 Henry S. Thompson, supervisors services
* G9 A. F. Baker, supervisors serv ices ...............
770 John Wasley, supervisors services ...........
771 George U. Jackson, supervisors services .. 
*72 James Keunaugh, supervisors services . . .
773 Solomon Myllynmkl, supervisors services .
774 J. C. Thomas, supervisors services ...........
775 F. H. Vandeuboom, supervisors services ..
776 George Yonkosky, supervisors services . . .
777 H. ti. Perkins, supervisors services ...........
778 W. H. Siebenthul, supervisors servles ........
779 William Corkell, supervisors services .......
780 Rusinus Olson, supervisors se rv ices.........
7SI F. J. Johnson, supervisors serv ices..............
782 John Fosterling, supervisors services ........
783 Thomas Clayton, supervisois services ___
784 t uarles R Swanson, supervisors services .
785 Henry Arnold, supervisors services ...........
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.Mis. T. Cook, rent .. 
Mrs. Al. Driscoll, rent

5.00 | Airs. Sultoncn, !o6 !Hh. 5lh ward
4.00 ' Airs. Oalumii, 227 Division, 1st

8 III*

Airs. I at Valley, rent ................  5.00 w aril
Airs. LaBranch, rent .. 
Airs. ,1. Aiowiek, rent . 
Mrs. K. Sullivan, rent

(Ml

5.i'll5.00 i Airs. Lakso. 515 S. 3rd. 1st ward
5.00 i Airs. .1. Nelson, 32 Bailor}, 3rd
4.00 i ward ......................................  ln.uu

Airs. J. IMerssens, rent .........  5.00 , J. Aleshand, Ish. T ow n.............  5.00

Airs. Labissouiere, rent . . .
Wood List.

'Airs. A. Anderson, 2 cords . . .
‘.Mrs. .1. Anderson, 2 eords . . .
P. Boshiuski, 2 co rds...............

33.60 (Airs. Al. Buckley, 2 co rd s.........  3.00
39.60 1 .Mrs. 10. Balke, 2 c o rd s ............  3.00 j Airs. Dedgeumu, 727 Morris, tith

Mrs Al. Bloom, 2 cords ........
Airs. Al. Bride, 2 c o rd s ..
Airs. I. Baker, 2 c o rd s ..

5 00 Al rs. Lyons 217 Cedar, 9th wd. 5.mi
5 O'J ti. Alenhenuelt 2lo N. 2ml, 3rd

wa r d __ 5.00
3 00 Airs Bailey . 127 N. Y. 6th ward 3.00
ti 00 Mrs. Bolin, 291 X. 5Hi. 5tli ward 9.mi
3 00 Airs. S. Peterson, 12«►il Battery
«>r>00 3rd ward lo.oo

19.20
28.S0
24.00
63.60
49.92
0796
11.88
32.40
39.6U

3.00
3.00
3.00

................  12.00 12.00

................  10.84 10.84
..................  30.24 3024
................  13.44 13.44
................. 71.28 71.28
................  27.60 27.60
................  21.96 21.90
................  5.16 5.10

19.SO
................. 21.60 21.UJ
................  36.00 36.00
................  16.48 10.48
................  18.72 iS.72
....................  13 06 19.56
F. ti. KtitiSti,
A. J. YUNGBLUTH,
CHAS. JOHNSON
WM. MANLEY,
H. S. THOMPSON,
J. F. NEIDHART.
K. T. SMITH,
l). W. POWELL

1 Airs. Benny, 1 cord ................. l.Ou
Airs. F, Bullhurzes, 2 cords . . . .  3.00
Alls. W. Dowdin, 2 c o rd s ........  3.00
Airs. H. Boudin, 2 c o rd s ........  3.00
Airs. T Cook, 2 cords .............  2.00
Airs. Ctuvln, 2 cords ................  3.00
Airs. A. Carlson, 2 c o rd s ........  3.110
Mrs. Al. Dupru, 2 co rd s...... 3.00
Mrs. 1). Driscoll, 2 c o rd s ........  3.00
Victor t'oleur, 1 cord ............... 1.50
Airs. A. Dunham, 2 c o rd s ........  3.00
Mrs. I). Desarmy, two cords . . .  3.00
Airs. D. Erickson, 2 cords . . . .  3.00
Airs. S. Foard, 2 c o rd s ...... 3.00
Airs. Forsberg, 2 c o rd s ...... 3.00
Airs T. Graver, 2 c o rd s ........  3.00
Mrs. Al. Gravel, 2 c o rd s ........  3.00
Mrs. j. Gauthier, 2 c o rd s......  3.00
Mrs. 1). Hogan, 2 cords •.. 3.U0
Airs. A. ilenricks, 2 co rds.........  3.00
Airs. L. HUl, 2 cords ............... 3.00
Airs. A. Johnson, 2 cords . . . . . .  3.00
Airs. Al. Johnson, 2 cords........  3.U0
Airs. c. F. Johnson, 2 cords.. . .  3.O0
Airs. LaBranch, 2 cords........  3.00
Mrs. C. K. Larson, 2 cords......  3.O0
Mrs. LuValley, 2 cords.......... 3.00
Airs. C. Liiudstrom, Jr. 2 cords 3.00

Supervisors Thompson uud Vauden- 
boom, chairmen of speciul committees 
asked that they be given further time 
in which to muke their report. This 
was grunted by the board.

'the lollowing reports of the Superin­
tendents of the Poor, County commis­
sioner ol schools and county game 
warden, were reud In purl and ordered 
Hied.

At a regular meeting of the Super­
intendents of the Poor of Marquette 
County Miclilguii, held on this eleventh 
day ol March 1913; there were present 
Supt. C. L. Sporley, P. P# Chase and 
H. F. ilundford. .Minutes of preceding 
meetings reud uud approved, contract 
lor County House supplies was also 
awarded to John Tierney. The follow­
ing claims were then audited and paid, 
no further business appearing, the 
Board adjourned.

H. F. HANFORD,
Sec’y. Poor Board.

Marquette, Mich., March 11, 1913.
Sir.

I have the honor to report transac­
tions of the Poor Board during the 
month of February, 1913, as follows: 
Orders drawn to Poor House

Account ............................... $1,062.18
'temporary Relief First District.

Alarqueltc City....... $ 398.40
Chocolay Twp, ___ 32.00
Hcandia Twp. ’ ........ 32.UU
West Brunch Tw p... 20.00
Powell Twp.............  0.00

T o ta l.....................................$ 487.40
Temporary Relief Second District.

First District during 
February, 1913:

the month of

Islipeming City.. . .$1,519.15
Neguuuee City 581.37
Islipeming Twp. .. 50.00
Forsyth Twp......... 62.83
Richmond Twp. .. 74.UO
Sands Twp........... 16 00
TUde.11 Twp........... .. 119.75
Wells Twp............ 39.10

Tolut ........................... ..... $2,461.20
Temporary Relief Third District. 

MIchlgHinme Twp. ..$ 107.90
Republic Twp........... 303.60
Champion Twp......... 390.00
Humboldt Twp......... 28.00
Ely Twp.......................  29.00

Total $ 864.00

Total ...................................$5,364.83
Respectfully,

H. F. HANDFORD,
Secy. Poor Board.

Claims allowed und puld in favor of 
Poor House and Farm for the mouth 
of Februury, 1913:

Firm Name Amount
Tompkins Prod. Co., supplies. $148.73
Fussbender & Pierce, sup......... 46.64
Johu Tierney, supplies .........  89.88
Swift k  Co., supplies................. 15.00
Werner Bros., supplies.............  48.00
F. B. Speur k  Sons, fu e l.........  96.33
iuke Bid. Lum. Co fu e l.........  405.00
M. M. k  S. ti. Ry. Co., fuel . . . .  144,00
Fuy k  Brlcker, fuel ................. llu’.uu
II F. Hundford, clothing .........  7.90
A. JI. Westlake, clothing .......  1.80
Dillon Clu. Co., clothing .........  6.19
li. M. Green, steno.....................  20.00
Alexuuder Cuuieron, team ster.. 30.00
Mary McDonnell, cook .............  20.00
Lillian lllll, cook ....................  20.00
Mrs. Smith, washing................. 7.00
Thus. Dougerty, labor .............  12.00
C. J. Flink, labor ut Turin.......  32.00
Mrs. Stewart, matron .............  36.00
John Stewurl, keep er............... 60.00
J. R. Hudson, labor ut furm ... G.00
PoudlU's Phurui. medicine . . . .  3,20
Stafford Drug Co. medicine . . . .  32 41 
F. McD. Hurkln, Med. ullen. ., 60.on
Huger Bros. Co. Ltd. furniture O.Oo 
F. W. Sambrook k  Sou, repairs In.54
L. S. Currluge Wkn repairs .. 1.35
M. U Muuhard k  Sou, toots

umi Implements ....................  40.11
Murquette Hardware Co., tools

und implements ....................  16.10
Wm. Hchutik, tools uud iinple.., 6.90
JI. F. Hundford, stamps .........  2.011
L. & P. Commission................. 8.00
M. J. Grillln, fertilizer.............  1.00

lumutes ut Lite Poor Furm March 1,
1913, forty-live. 4,349 meuls served 
(hiring the month of February, ut sev­
en und three-fourths cents per meul. 
Excessive cost per meal during Feb 
ruury wus caused by the purchuse of u 
cur loud or hay. All rood for stock 1h 
included in cost per meul for the in­
mates.

H. F. HANDFORD,
Sec y. Poor IJourd.

The following claims were allowed uud 
paid from the Poor Fund In the

Numes Amount
T. C. McGuire, supplies ....... .$ 10.00
John Carlson, supplies........... . 22.00
Luke. lad. Lum. Co., supplies . O.OU
Johu Siegel, supplies ........... . 35.00
Heaney k  McLean, supplies .. 10.00
C. P. Johnson, supplies ....... . 10.00
f .  G. tick, supplies .............. . 20 00
John Laniini, supplies ........... 5.00
F. G. Truscott & Co., supplies . 5.00
Chas. Wilson, supplies........... . 10.00
U. .Morin, supplies.................. 5.00
Brush's Grocery, supplies__ 5.00
Jacob Smith, supplies............. . 22.00
Frank Johnson, supplies....... . 22.00
Wutson k  Palmer, supplies . . . . 30.00
Fred Bureau & Sons, supplies. . 55.00
ti. ti. Bracher, supplies ....... . 10.00
C. Dugenais, supplies ........... . 20.00
John Tierney, supplies........... . 55.00
Geo. IJ. TouHlgnunt, supplies . . 15.UU
Jtydholm Bros, supplies......... . lion
Jas. Pickands & Co., Ltd. fuel. . 16.5*)
F. Papin, rent ......................... . 5.00
Mrs. i\. Anderson rent __ 5.UU
Mrs. Al. Demi, l e n t ......... 5.00
Hurriet It. Aduuis, rent ....... 5.00
Mrs. S. Desotelle, r e n t ........... 5.00
B. W. Wright, r e n t.................. . 7.00
M. J. Gridin, rent .................. 3.00
Imwrence Lnttereli, rent . . . 0.00
J. WuHserman, rent ............... 0.00
Caesar Messier, rent ............. 0.00
)•'. W. Sambrook k  Sons, rent . 10.00
PeudtU’K Pharmacy, medicine,. . 16.95
Tonellu k  Hon, funeral........... 12.00

H. F. HANDFORD,
Supt. Poor First Dlst.

Office of Superintendents of the poor
—First District. Persons aided dur-
Ing the month of February, 1913.

Skandlu.
Mrs. M. Peterson .................. .$ 10.00
Mrs. M. Johnson...................... . 12.00
Mrs. H. Poison ........................ . 10.00

West Branch.
Mrs. Win. Thornton................. 5.00
Mrs. ti. 1)111 ........................... 10.00
Airs. J. Beckman .................... 5.00

Chocolay.
Mr. Clius. Perry ...................... . 10.00
Mrs. Bussie ........................... 5.00
F. Dionne ............................... 5.00
Mrs. Lublne ........................... . 5.00
Mrs. U. Height ........................ 7.00

Powell Township.
Mrs. Jumes Billings ....... . . 5.00

Murquette Township
Mrs. 8. Foard ........................ . 5.00

First Ward.
Mrs. M. Buckley .................... 5.00
Mrs. B. Buckley .................... 6.00
Mrs. I. Baker ......................... 5.00
Mrs. M. Bride ........................ . 5.00
Mrs. M. Dupru ...................... 5.00
Mrs. D. H ogan......................... 5.00
Mrs. LuValley ....................... 5.00
Mrs. J. G authier...................... 5.00
Mrs. Lofgren ........................... 0.00
Mrs. I*. Olsen ......................... 5.00
N. Renow ................................. 5.00
Mrs. Zusbu ............................. 6.00
Mrs C K. lrnrson .................... 5.00
Mrs. P. Zerdeu ....................... 5.00
Mrs. LuHrunch ....................... 5.00
Mrs. T. Graver ....................... 5.00
Mrs. M. Gruvel ....................... 5.00
V. Umherlu, 609 Pine, Till wurd 0.00

Second Wurd.
P. Boshlnkl ............................. 5.00
Mrs. M. Driscoll .................... 5.00
Mrs. M. Mnrthu ...................... 5.00

Third Ward.
Mrs. M. Bloom ...................... 5.00

» Mrs. C. Anderson .................... 5.00
M. Mu reel lo ............................. 6.00

Fourth Wurd.
Mrs. F. Ilalllmrxes .................. 5.00
Mrs. N. Bolsinumi .................. 5.00
Mrs. H. Boudin ..................... 5.00
Mrs. A. C arlson....................... 5.00
Mrs. D. Dcsunny .................... 5.00
Mrs. C. tirickson .................... 6.00
Mrs. A. Henrlcks .................... 6.00
Mrs. C. Lublsslniere .............. 5.00
Mrs. F. Miller ....................... 5.00
Mrs. J. Mowlck ....................... 5.00
Mrs. J. Malone ....................... 5.00
Mrs. D. Mereuult .................... 5.00
Mrs. 1). Sheldon .................... 0.00
Mrs. J. Plerssens .................. 5.00
Mrs. M. Meshuu ...................... 5.00
Mrs. Benny ........................... G.00

Fifth Ward.
Mrs. J. A. Anderson .............. 0.01)

Mrs. W. Bowdln .................... 6.00
Mrs. M. laivel ......................... 5.00
Mrs. P. Lewis ......................... . 10.00
Mrs. G. Mudosh ..................... 6.00
Mrs. SteiiHon ......................... 6.00
Mrs. A. Dlgull. rent .............. 5.00
Mrs. 1. Baker, rent .................. 6.00
Mrs. F, BuUlmrxcs. rent . . . . 5.00

Airs. V .Munson, 2 co rd s....... 3.00 Airs. Stumtas, 617 Park. tith
Mrs. Aioranville, 2 cordB....... 3.00 w ard ..................
Airs. J. Alulone, 2cords....... 3.00 Al rs. GcIhhci*, 412 .Maple, 3rd

Airs. Al. Lovel, 2 cords...........  3.00
Airs. C. Labissiiiiere, 2 cords..
Mis. J. Mowlck, 2 cords..........
Airs. M Murtha, 2 cords.........
Airs. D. Mereault. 2 cords........

3.00
3.00
3.00
3.00

Mrs. F. Miller, 2 cords.........  3.00
Airs. G. Aladosli, 2 cords.......
Airs c. Morle, 2 cords........
Airs. Mulgreen, 2 cords........
.Mrs. Al. Meshau, 2 cords...
Mrs. Pratt, 2 cords................
Airs. K. Sullivan, 2 cords.......
.Mrs. Spence. 2 cords...........
Airs. .1. Tulbot, 2 cords........
Airs. P. Zerdon, 2 cords...........
Mrs.
M r«.

3.00
3.00
3.00
3.00
3.00
3.00
3.00
3.00
3.00

P. Louts, 2 cords.............  3.00
O. Swunson, 2 cords . . . .  3.00

II. F. HANDFORD, 
Supt. Poor First Dlst.

ward ....................................... I.00
(!. Hlmbcrg, Ish Town..............  4.1m
A Olson, 217 Bank, Sih ward .. 8.eo
t). Alarken, 311 Vine, 51 ti ward O.oo
B. Daniels, Junction, loth ward 5.mi
t). Fosmnc, ION AJichigan, 6th

ward ....................................... sun
Mrs. AlcDowell. 1302 3rd. 6th

ward ....................................... s.oo
.Mrs. Regan, loo N. Y. Olh ward 7.on
A. S. Sandstroin, 762 Morris, 6lh

w ard ........................................  4.mi
Airs. Salvage, 200 til), 3rd ward O.eu
0. Alalmstelu, 138 Summit!, 4th 

ward .........................................  lo.oo
II. Hill, 332 Division, 3rd w ard.. 
Airs, Veil, loo High. 0th ward .. 
Airs. Hnhhins, 641 tiinpil'e, 6th

ward .......................................
Airs. Aug. Johnson, Ish. town.. 
Airs. ti. tiricksnn, 308 Pearl, 3rd

ward .......................................
Airs. SutiKti, 314 Division, 1st

ward .......................................
Airs. Whitlala, 447 Division, 1st

ward .......................................
irs Carlson, 719 Bunk, 4th ward 
Airs. Pengiily, 208 Hazel, Olh

ward .......................................
Airs. Brady, 115 Superior, 2nd

w ard ........................................
Alrs( Richards, 314 Division, 1st

w ard ........................................
Airs. Clmlklcin, 327 Michigan,

6th ward ...............................
Airs. Pherson, Ish. T ow n.........

ward

O.ou
O.on

4.00 
lo.no

4.ou

O.nn

Ooo
3.00 

O.ou 

O.oo

10.0U

8.00 
O.oo

3.UO

0.00
0.00
0.00
0.00
0.00

O.oo
4.00

Office of Superintendents of Ihe poor - 
Second District. Persons aided dur­
ing the month of February, 1913: 

CITY OF ISHPtiMING. 
Islipeming Co-Operative Society.

J. Pascoe, 910 Pine, 7th wurd...$ 8.00 
Mrs. Wallace, 607 N. 7th, 0 ward 8.00 
Airs, Raymond, W. Superior, 2nd

ward ........................................  8.00
J. Jenkins, S. Pine, 7th wurd . . . .  lo.oo 
B. James, W. Jolmstou, 2nd wurd 7.00 
M. J. Pascoe, 406 S. 4th, 8th ward
J. Jenkins, S. Flue, 7th w ard ___
Mrs. Noble,-412 S. 3rd, 8th ward 
S. A. tingduhl, North St 3rd wurd 
J. Stephen, 312 S. 3rd 3rd w urd..
Airs. Hyiock, 434 Angeline, 7th

w ard ..........................................
Mrs. Symons. Itudger, loth wurd 
Mrs. Olson, Cleveland uve„ 8th

w ard ....................................  4.00
JI. Laver, 610 IMne, 2nd ward ..  0.00

$84.00
August Hendrickson.

J. Peterson, 603 Vine St 0th wurd 0.00
Mrs. Forsberg, 110 Barn, 4th

ward ..............   0.00
Mrs. Nicholson, 923 N. Oth, Olh

wurd ......................................... 8.00
Mrs. Koski, Tilden town ............  10.00
G. Gruminett, 2LI S. 3rd, Olh

ward . ....................................... 3.00
Airs. Kunberg, 708 Spring, 4th

wurd ......................................... 0.00
Mrs. tiricksnn, 713 Bank, 4th

wurd ......................................... 0.00
Mrs. Htrund, 207 Summitt, 4th

wurd ......................................... 0,00
Mrs. Frunscu, 602 Cleveland A.

4th wurd .................................  0.00
I. Imrson, 617 Vine HI., Olh wurd 3.oo
Mrs. Phulya, 324 Division, Oth

ward ......................................... 0.00
Mrs llurmu. (Ul7 N Division, Uth

ward ..............   8.00
Mrs. Strand. 772 Wuliush, Oth

w ard .................................... 12.00
Mrs. Rlthala, 313 Pearl, 8U1 ward 5.00

Total ......................................... $84.00
L. lloyseth.

C B. Anderson, N. Y. St., Oth
ward ........................................  7.00

Mrs. G. V. Anderson, Maurice St
Oth wurd ...................................  O.oo

Mrs. Bennett, 3rd and Bessemer

.Mrs. CurlHon, 820 timplre, Oth
ward ..................................

Mrs. ('rune, 7th and Mlehlgun,

C. Ducas, York, Oth ward . . .
F. Holm, 7th und Mich, 6th ward 
Mrs. Isuucson, Olh ami High, Oth

w ard ....................................
Mrs. Thompson, 719 Mich. 6U1

w urd...................................
J. A. Johnson, 818 Wulmsh, Olh

ward ..................................
Mrs. (’. Johnson, 818 Wabush,

Oth ward ...........................
Mrs. Mulmherg, Purk Ht. Oth

wurd ..................................
Mrs Me Wllllums, 604 N. 7th.

Olli ward ........................... .
A. Nelson, 7th ward, Oth wurd.. 
Mrs. Oline, 10. Vine, Oth wurd 
P, Reckstudt. 10. Vine, 0th ward.

A. W. Myers k  Co. 
Mrs, lmwry, 400 10. Pearl, 1st

wurd ........................................
Mrs. Newmuu, H23 N. Pine, 3rd

ward ........................................
Mrs. Johns. 829 H. Pine, 7th ward

F. Braustud k  Co. 
Mrs. Stum, 711 Spring, Kth wurd 
Mrs. timbioom, 1 lo N. 1st. 1st

ward .............................
Mrs. Sumuelson, 419 Ridge, 8th 

ward ......................................

Aug. tirickson, Ish. T ow n.........  6.00
C. ICrickson, Ish. Town..............  4.00
Airs, Imgasse, Ish. Tow n............ 5.00
Dross Children, Ish. Town . . . .  4.mi
Mrs. Warri, 250 Hill, 4lh ward O.oo 
Airs. Wicker, 401 Murquette,

4th w a rd .................................  O.ou
Mrs. Pentincn, 307 Superior, 9th

w ard ......................................... 10.00
Mrs. Larson. Tilden Town. .. 5.00
Mrs. Talem, Tilden Town........  O.oo
Airs. Gumerson, Tilden Town. . 6.00
il Johnson, Tilden Town......... 8.00
J. Thomas, Tilden Town............ 6.00
Airs. Mood, Tilden Town............ 6.00

Total ........................................$328.00
A. W. Conrndson.

Airs. Sumuelson, 706 Main, 3rd
ward ......................................... O.oo

Mrs. Clausen, 301 Ridge, 1th wd. O.oo 
Mrs. Carlson, 313 Bank, 8th wurd O.oo 
.Mrs, Kusimw, 462 Jasper, 4th

ward .........   6.00
Airs. Schineltz, 228 Houghton,

Olh ward ..............   7.00

Total ......................................... $27.oo
Bayurd k  ilusHclhlud.

O. Drigelsou, 1220, 3rd., 6lh ward
Jan. and Feb............................ 6.00

(>. tirickson. 114 Marquette, 41 li 
wurd ......................................... 0.00

Total ..........................................$11.00
ti. A. Johnsou.

Mrs. Roberts, 618 Iron, Oth wurd 5,00 
Mrs. C. G. Anderson, 624 Park,

tith wurd .................................  O.oo
.N..D9.M16 ....,wurd c ..t . . . .a r0 $  
Mrs. J. JC. Johnson, 6J8 Maurice

Oth ward .................................  0.00
Mrs J. Nelson, 766 Muurlce, Oth

wurd ......................................... 5.00
•Mrs. Reuherg, 107 (‘HIT, 3rd wurd 9.00
D. A. Burling, 712 N. 7lh, Olh

ward .........................................  7.00
M A. Olson, 749 Muurlce, 6 wurd 0.00 
Mrs. J. W. Carlson, 137 Cliff,

3rd ward .................................  5.00

Total ..........................................$46.00
P. Koski k  Co.

.Mrs. Lulvasola, 233 Davis, 41 h
w ard ..........................................  0.00

Mrs. Woodlock, W. Division, 1st
wurd ......................................... O.oo

W. Assklenau, 404 Jasper, 4th
wurd ......................................... lo.oo

II. Johnson, 026 High, Olh ward O.oo
R. Sunil, Ishp Town.................... K.00
Mrs. Bucku, 326 Jasper, 4lh wurd 9.00 
Mrs. Keyamppa, S. Lake, 2nd

ward ........................................  7.00
Mrs. .huitluen, 003 Jasper, 4lh 

w ard ..........................................  7.00

Total ......................................... $0600
Ishpemlng Store Co.

F. SumllM-rg, loti Dak, 3rd wurd.. T.oo
6.00 .Mrs. Hunseii. 422 Greenwood 4th

wurd ................................. . . . . K.OM
8.00 Mrs. Sjnqnish, 518 Ridge, 4th

wurd ................................... 4 00
5.00 Mrs. Suiimelhon, 319 N 7th, 4ih
d.nu ward ................................. . . . . 4 mi
4 00 Mrs. C. A. Olson, Bank and Till

4lh ward ........................... 6.00
5.no F. Johnson, Tilden Town .. < , , 6 00

Mrs, 1, Nelson, 319 N. 6th. 611,
6.00 w ard ................................. 4.oo

Mrs. Mulmherg. | l j  Jasper, 41 h
7.mi ward ...........  ............... 3.00

Mrs. titiginan, Saa Bank, -41 h wd 4 no
4.00 Mrs. G, tirickson, 77o timplre,

tith w a rd .......................... 7.011
6.00

6.00 I. Gustafson.
7.00 Mrs. Proekey. 4|o Bank, 8lh

10.00 wurd ................................. 6.00
3.00 Mrs, Heghman. Johnston, 2nd

wurd ................................. __ T.oo
$88.00 Mrs. Seuimons, tin S, 4th, Kill

w urd ................................... 6.00
Mrs, Dodge, 418 H. 4th. 8th ward 4.no

6.00 Axel Augiislen, 740 Michigan,
6th ward .......................... 4 00

6.00 Mrs. Viuut, Ishp. Town. . . . . . . . 5.00
4.00

• Total ................................. ....$ : to.00
$19.00 J. Hell wood k  Co.

Mrs. Dodergreu, Barn HI, 4th
7.00 ward ................................. 4 mi

Mrs. Mills. Bank St., Kth wurd.. 6.0a
6.00 W. Anderson. I ll Pine, 8th ward (i 00

R Hodsking, 765 Wulmsh, 6lh
6.00 ward ................................... 6.00

t



T
.1 Peterson. 313 nailery, 3rd

ward ........................................  G.ou
W. Harris, 1st St., :Srd ward . . . .  -Von 
It. Kliiinen. Ridge St., 6th ward 5.00
I*. Curlyiic. Sal rim*. 3rd ward a.no

Total ...................................... $40, oo
J. T. Williams.

.Mrs. .1. O. Larson, 7T«i Wabash
titli ward ................................... lo.oo

Mrs. Williams. Umpire, (ith
ward ...................................... lotto

Mrs. Soderhuck, Itarn St. 4th 
ward .....................................  a.00

Total ...................................... $25.00
K. M. Le.Mny.

Mrs. Ileaoehamp. 1 !* Johnston.
Mh ward ................................. lo.oo

Mrs. Mareliette. I loti IMiin, 7th
w ard ..........................................  7.««»

Mrs. St. Andrew, .Iijim-IIoii, loth
ward .. ................................. 7.no

Mrs. Italardis, 345 Johnston, 2nd 
ward ....................................

Mrs. Isaacson .. 
K. .Menheniiett . 
T. Sandberg . . . .
It. Daniels .......
Mrs. A. Johnson 
Mrs. Hurris . . . .

3.65 {.Mrs. Kli Matson ................... 3.05
3.65 Mrs. Jyllmla ...............................  3.40
3.05 ! Mrs. I’ilo ..................................... 3 90
3.0a 1 --------
3 90 
3.90

I’olal

(*. K rm m n i ..........
,1. Christenson ...
,1. Klvis ...............
J. Klvis, clothing

G.UU
5.00
n.ou
3.00

Jas. J’ickands X Co.
$06.05

8.00

Total .........................................$33.00
T. Hughes X Soli.

S. Macki. Tlldon Town. . .*.........  8.00
Mrs. Hickey, Pearl St.. 1st ward 5.00 
Mrs. (ioldworthy, S. 3rd. St. 2nd

ward ........................................ 5.00
Jeffery Children. I’earl St., 3rd

wart! ........................................  5.00
II. Anderson. IhC ward ............... 5.00

Total .........................................$38.00
J. J. Leffler.

.Mrs. Qoayle, 303 Johnston, 3nd
ward ........................................ 8.0 0 ;

Mrs. Itnso, Ijike St., 1st ward.. 3.00 j

Total .........................................$11.00.'
Matt Lofberg.

Wicks children shoes and slock- ,
logs ............................................  4.35 i

Liudbom X UJork. !
Funerul. K. Johnson ...................  23.00 1

Johnson Bros.
W. Harris, Clothing....................... 1.85 j

A. Morin 1
Mrs. Morselte, Kent ................  5.tut

Cost. Myltymaki
W . Asslklanen, rent ....... ........  5.no

A. Villonenve. |
Mrs. Cope, rent ............................ 5.00 ;

W. S. Pirutte. |
Medical attendance Tor Kelt. .. 

Consolidated Fuel X Lumber
Mrs. Hodge ...............................
Mrs. McWilliams ......................
O. Murkin ...................................
Mrs. Anderson .........................
Mrs. 0. lairson .........................
A. Sandstrom ...........................
Mrs. W allace.............................
K. Wlilmen .............................
Mrs. Holm...................................
H. Kurling .................................
Mrs. Kegan ...............................
Mrs (’n in e .................................
Mrs. Forsberg .........................
Mrs. Sumuelson ........................
Mrs. Uirson ...............................
Mrs. Taloeii .............................
Mrs. Kengslon...........................
Mrs. Maltnherg.........................
Mrs. Olson .................................
Mrs. Chalklein ............. .........
Mrs. Stephens...........................
Mrs. Slam ...............................
Mrs. Uoherts ...........................
Mrs. li, C arlson.........................
Mrs. Muekie...............................
(J. Grummetl .............................
Mrs. Persons .............................
Mrs. Krickson .........................

.Mrs. H a rris .......
J. Havls ...........
.Mrs. la irson .......
Mrs. Itacka .......
Mrs. ( 'Itapman . . .  
Mrs. Carlson 
Aug. Krickson . .. 
Mrs. A. Krickson
Mrs. Savage.......
Mrs. (J. Krickson
Mrs. S orlia .........
Mrs. Hill ...........
P. Kickslad .......
.1, A. Johnson .. 
Mrs. Harris . . . .  
Mrs. Itumbcrg . . .
v.,. Sumlhcrg........
Mrs. Kiberty . . .  
Mrs. Goldsworthy
Mrs. Clausen .......
Airs. W illiams__
Mrs. S. Petterson . 
Mrs. Cranherg . . .
Mrs. K. H ill .........
.Mr. Hickey .........
Mrs. H arm u.........
.Mrs. Lickala .......
AItn. F ranseu........
Mrs. MeHowelJ .. .
.Mrs. Carlson .......
Mrs. Nicholson . . .
Mi'S' Juntlnen ___
Mrs. St. Andre , . .  
Airs. Person.........

Total .......................................$111.1)0

Feb, 1st Patrolling at Kali's south­
ern end or county.

Feb. 2nd—Patrolling ut Camp II. 
southern end of county.

Feb. 3rd Patrolling at Camp A, 
southern end of county.

PLEASURE IN FRUITS

.Mrs. Alorsette ................ __  3.90 Mrs. Koski .................. ............. 3.65 Orders on J. Levine. Feb. 4th—Patrolling at Sugolia Lum-
AlrsAlrs. Kemp ................ Mrs. Hurt .................... .............  3.66 Mrs. J. O ttaw a .......................... 10.00 her Co’s. camp.
H. Anderson...................... . . . .  3.05 Airs Davcv .................. ............. 3.05 Airs. J. Ottawa, clo th ing ......... 2.50 Feb. 5th --Patrolling West Branch.
Airs. H. 1*. Hanson ......... __  3.05 Mrs. Jalml .................. ............. 3.65 Mrs. A. IMshno............................ 12.00 Kscanalm River.
S. A. Kngiluhl .................... . . . .  3.05 Airs. Thomas .............. ......... : 3.65 Airs. K. Aronson ...................... 10.00 Feb. Oth - Patrolling at Northland.
(’. Krickson ........................ __  3.90|.Mrs. Agnolia ................ ...........  3.65 Airs. L. Boulie............................ 5.00 Feh 7th -At Kscanaba.
Airs. J. \V. Carlson ......... . . . .  3.05 Mrs.

Airs.
Llndgren .............
Kirlaila ................

...........  3.05

...........  3.05
Mrs. J. Gustafson........................
Airs. .1. Sleemun ........................

10.00
5.00

Feh. Sth— 
violator.

At home attending trial of

3.90 
2.50
3.05
3.05 i Airs
3.05 ■ Mrs!
3.05
3.90
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05 
3.05,
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05 
3 05
3.05 
3.65
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05

Mrs. Fountain ...........................  3.65
•Mrs. Schubert ...........................  3.65
Mrs. M aki..................................... 3.05

Jordon ...............................  3.05
Gundey ...............................  3.05

O Ko> ........................................... 3.05
II. Salvage ...................................  3.05
Airs. Alalson ...............................  3.05

Total ......................................... $58.40
TOWNSHIPS.

Palmer Store Co. Kichmoml Township.
Mrs. Kokko .................................  5.00 1
Al. Kompi ................................... 10.00 ;
Airs Mnkl ...................................  s.oo
Airs. Alakl. wood.......................... 3.00 1
.Mrs. Thompson .......................... 8.00 1
Mrs. Krickson ...........................  S.OO

Krickson, wood ................. 3.00,

Mrs. (). Fish . 
J. Virtu . . . .  
Mrs. Al. TolU*.

Mrs.
Mrs.
Mrs.

......................  5.00

............................... 8.00

......................  0.00

Total ....................................... $ 73.50
Orders on Henry Takkinen.

<;. Keck. Jan. and Feb................$ lo.oo
Order on Mrs. M. Melhumeur.

Mrs K. lUslum .......................... $ 4.00
J. L. Cardinal Wood.

.Mrs Huggan. 2 cords ............... $ 10.80
Mrs. Morphy. 1 cord ................ 5.40
Mrs. Klvis, 1 coni .................... 5.4n
Mrs. Vulgren, 1 cord ............. 5.40 j
Mrs. Kcskoy. 1 cord ................ 5.40 •
Mrs. .Mitchell, 2 cords ............  10.80

to meet

Feb. 9th —Patrolling 
east of sanitarium.

Feb. ltith—At Kscanuba 
Deputy Lelsmer.

Feb. 11th Patrolling ut Northland. 
Feb. 12th Patrolling Northland and 

Kates.
Feb. Kith Patrolling north of Kates. 
Feh. 14th - Patrolling at Ralph.
Feh. 15th—Patrolling south of 

Kalpli.
Feh.
Feb.

A. Larson ...........................  4.00

3.05
3.05
3.05 
3.90

Total .....................................  $59.00
James Lucks—Tilden Township.

Mrs. T u lo re .................................  5.90
Mrs. B racket...............................  5.00

Sleeman. 1 cord . ..  
Mlkkleson. I cord ..
Ottawa. 1 cord __
Christenson, 1 cord 
Nynmn, I cord
Fish, 1 cord .........
Boulie. I cord __
Gagnon. 1 cord 
A. Hishno, 1 cord .. 
Arseneau, 1 cord ..

.Mrs. Johnson .........
Mrs. Sodergrcn.......
Mrs. G clsler.............
Mrs. Newman .........
Mrs. Nelson .............
.Mrs, Carlson ...........
Axel Augustine.......
Airs. Kuln ..............
Mrs. Philya .............
Mrs. Richards __
Mrs. Lyons..............
.Mrs Johnson .........
Mrs. Strand ...........
Mrs. (J. Anderson ...  
Mrs. C. Anderson . , .
.Mrs. Pengilly .........
Mrs. Jenkins .........
Mrs. Ruymond.........
Mrs. Curlson .........
Mrs. Olin ..............
Mrs A.‘Olson .........
Mrs. Tormun .........
Mrs. Sunstl ............
Mrs. J. Anderson .. .
Mrs. Bergmun .........
Mrs. Mills .............
Mrs. Johnson .........
Mrs. Reitala ...........
Mrs. L arson............
Mrs. Sunstl .............
.Mrs. lieghmun .......
Mrs. StenusHus .......
Mrs. Olson ..............
Mrs. Nelson ............
.Mrs. A. W. Anderson 
Mrs. Thompson ..
Mrs. Penned ...........
Mrs. Bully ..............
Mrs. Pusene............
Mrs, N elson.............
Mrs, Nelson .............
o. Mulmsieln .
Airs Kngmun .. ..
Mrs. Robbins...........
II laiver ................
Mrs. Seilgumn 
Mrs. Kniblnni . . . .  
Mrs Soderlmck 
Mrs. Legecy .
Mrs. W ickers...........
A. K rickson.........
Mrs. Sumuelson
Mrs. Krickson.........
Mrs. Il.vlock .........
Mrs Viant ..............
Mrs. Steam .............

so. no
Co.

3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05 
3.65 
3 05 
3!05
3.05
3.05
3.05 
3.Gi>
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05 
3 05
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05 
3 05 
3!U5
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05 
3 05
3.05
2.UU
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05 
.Mill
2.75
3.05
3.05
2,00
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05 
2. Oil
3.05
3.05
3.05
2.on

Total ...................................... $251.Sit
C. L. SPOKLiflY,

Supt. Poor Second Hist.
CITY OF NKUAIJNKK.

Winter X Suess.
II. Salvage................................... 7.ou
Mrs. Clausen ...........................  lu.00
.Mrs. Abondo ...............................  S.OO
Mrs. Palo ..................................... 9,ou
Mrs. Kungas .............................  lo.UU I
Mrs C. Matson .........................  10.00 I
Alls. K. .1. Southey........................ 3.00 |
Airs. Uippi .................................  5.ou
P. Petterson ...............................  5.00 '
Airs. Thom as.................................  5.00 1
Airs. Kll Matson ........................ 7.00
Airs Rowe ................................... 5.00 ,
Mrs. Napola .................................  5.00 1

Total ......................................... $89.00
Joe Bara be,

.Mis. Llmmi .................!'...........  3.0n
Mt>. Sorri ...................................  5.00
10. Liniose, Richmond twp.........  5.00
All’s. Cotu ...................................  5.(m
Airs. Osi*1’ ................................... 3.00
Airs. N arco................................... 5 00
(). Key ..........................................  5 00
Airs. Agnolia .............................  i.ou
Airs Heart .................................  4,00
Airs. Winstrom ...........................  r»!oo
Mrs. Llndgren.............................  5.00
Airs. Fountiun .............................  5.00
D. Uiforest .................................  s.oo

Total ......................................... $10.09
Julies* Trehllcock —Tilden Township.

S. Alakkl .....................................  3.50
Airs. Kokklla ...............................  3.5!)'Mrs. Olson, 1 cord . . .
Mrs Koski ...................................  3.50 Airs. Gustafson. 1 cord
II. Johnson .................................  3.50
Airs. Taleen ...............................  3.50
Airs. U irso u ........... ...................... 3.5u
All’s. Bracket ...............................  3.5U

Airs.
Airs.
Mrs.
Airs.
Mrs.
Mrs.
Airs. Aronson. 1 cord 
Mrs. Thomas. 1 cord 
Airs. S. Onge. 1 cord
Airs. laiCrosse, 2 cords .............  10.80

.......  5.40

.......  5.40
Airs. Hishno, l cord .................  5.40

Patrolling at Dend River 

At Palmer Lake and vie-

Total .......................................$24.75
August Annalu Tilden Township, 

Airs. Hugmen. Jan. and Feb. ...$10.00 
Herman Kato -Tilden Township.

Airs. Kokklla ............................... $ 5.00
Annie Larson -Tilden Township.

H. Halso Case ........................... $10.00
John Tierney —Sands Township.

.1. Cam p........................................  5.00
Mrs. Johnson ...............................  5.00
Airs. C. Olson .............................. 5.00

Total .........................................$15,00
I). R. .MacIntyre—Forsyth Township. 

Med. Attd. for J hii. and Feb. ..$30.00 
M. K. Aluulgold - Forsyth Township.

Harry Bruy, coal ...................... $ 4.90
Cleveland Cllll's Iron Co.—Forsyth.

Mrs. Avigni, wood ...................... $ 3.43
P. Koski X Co.—Forsyth Township

Mrs. R. Alio ................................ 3.50
Airs. J. Johnson ..........................  7.00

' Total ....................................... $140.40
Felix LaCrosse—Rent.

Airs. S. Huge, Jan. Feb.............$ G.U0
Fred Deroehu -Rent.

K. Lacrosse. Juu. and Feb.........$ 0.00
J. Van Riper, med. at., mdse...$ 43.50

Total Champion Township ..$395.00 
MICHIOAMA1K TOWNSHIP. 
Orders on C. F. Sundslrom.

J. P. Sandberg ........................$ 10.00
P. Alolwav .................................  7.00
Win. P o le ...................................  0.00
Airs. A. Larniour......................  G.00

Total .......................................$ 29.00
Orders on P. Christenson.

10th—At home -Snowstorm. 
17th -Al Clo'wery and Ameri­

can mine.
Feh. lStli—Patrolling east branch 

of Kscanlma river.
5.40 | Feb. 19th Patrolling Dead river.
5.40 Feb. 2oth—Horseshoe Uike.
5.40 Feh. 21st Patrolling at Painter
5.40 Lake.
5.40 Feh. 22nd- -At home—Holiday.
5.40 j February 23rd—Patrolling east of
5.40 1 .Morgan Heights.
5.40 Feb. 24th North shore of Teal Luke. 
u.4o Feb. 25th
5.40 Hoist.
5.4n j Feh. 20th
5.40 ' inily.
5.40 ' Feb. 27th —Fast of Negaunee.

Feb. 2Sth—At home-Sick.
.Made one arrest for the month.

Plead guilty and paid line of $20.00 
and costs.

Respectfully submitted.

JOHN ROUGH, 
Deputy Game Warden.

The following resolution was read 
and adopted.

Be it resolved. That we desire to 
express to .Mr. Pmvell, our Chairman, 
our appreciation of the manner in 
v liich he hns conducted his duties us 
Chairman of this hoard during the past 
year. He always has been fuir. and 
impartial to the members, ami we In­
dividually and as a body unite in offer­
ing him our hearty thunks for Ills ser­
vices to the county.

Whereupon the hoard adjourned sine
Airs. A. 
Mrs. N. 
Airs. II. 
Mrs A!. 
Airs. v).

Total

White . 
Hill . . . .  
Vulcan . 
Lakso .. 
Halcova

5.00
10.00
7.00

10.00
3.00

.$ 35.00

die
H. W. POWKLL. Chairman. 

FRANK G. .IKNKS. Clerk.

Total ......................................  $01.0«*
GAL 0 SIX Slip Report Lindy 

1-'. Braaslad.
Mrs. Tregonlng .......................... 5.00
Airs. Koski .................... t........... 8.00
Airs. Duvey .................................  0.00
J, Tiassidcr ...............................  3.00
Airs. Gundry ...............................  5.00
Airs. Adams .................................  5.00
Airs. Jorden .................................  7.00

Total ......................................... $39.00
.Mitchell Brothers.

Nichols ...............................  8.00Mrs.
Airs. Sampson 
Al. Hancock .
Joe Grigg ----
Airs, Tregoy

Total

5.00 
. 7.00
. 5.00
. 2.00

$27.00

Total .........................................$10.50
Dominie Alussetto * Forsyth Township. 
Mrs. A. Ovigni, Jan. and Feb... .$14.00 

D. A. Oliver-- Wells Township.
Funeral Win, Cunes ................... $22.26
Geo. .VI. Alushek—Wells Township.

Phoning to H. Arnold ...............$ .85
.1, A. Alio -Wells Township.

Funeral, Floyd .Martin .............$10.on
C. L. SPORLKY,

Supt. Poor 2nd. District. 
RKPUBLIC TOWNSHIP FOR KKB- 

KUARY. 1913.
Orders on Republic Store Co.

Airs. K. Johnson .......................  9.00
Airs. M. Vita ............................. 3.00
Airs. J. lly p p u .............................. 4.tMi
Mrs. .1. King ............................. 3.<m
Mrs. M. T hom as........................  4.011
Mrs. Al. Johnson .......................  8.00
Airs. A. Johnson ..........................  8.110
Airs. A. Buettlu .........................  8.00
Mrs. M. Lom prey....................... ll.oo
Airs. I. Alatala ............................ 4,00

K. Al. Stensrud Coal.
------- Mrs. Lakso, \ 2 to n ......................

Isaac Treudo Wood.
Airs. Hill. I cord, 10 In..............
Airs. Vulcan, 1 cord. 10. in. . . .  
Mrs. Alolwav, 1 cord. 10 in. . .. 
J. P. Sandberg, 1 cord, 10 in. . 
Airs. Lakso. 1 cord. 4 ft..........

4.40

5.00
5.00
5.00
5.00 
4.50

i W H e n

Ab i n e t

Total ...................................$ 24.50
I. Sicotte.

Ali-dical atlendaocu .................$ 15.00

Total Alichigamme Township .$ln 
HUMBOLDT TOWNSHIP 
Order on J. Levine

Mrs. C. Tremewun ..................
Ord**r on Humboldt .Mercantile

Airs. L. Ilenard ..........................
P. Vunitiper.

.Medical Attendance .............

'.90

5.00 
Co.
5.00

S THY burden hard and heavy 1 
Ho thy step* drag wearilyl 

Help In h«-nr thy brother's burden Cud 
will bear both it and thee.

—Kllz&beth Cfiarlea.

POTATO SUBSTITUTES.

Mrs. I 
J. M.

Joint Krickson, 
Danielson...............................  O.uo

Johnson ...........................  8.00

Total ...................................... $ 14.00
Victor Parkonen.

Mrs. .lyIlia .................................
Geo. J. lluupt.

Alls. Roberts .............................
F. CtiiboMu.

Mrs. Purketiy .........................
Sheldon X Andrus,

Aled. Attd. for Negutmee for
Feh............................................

Med. Attd. for Richmond Town.
lor February ......................

Operating and room Mrs. Koski

r.uu

5.00

5.00

5(1.00

10.00
70.00

Total ......................................... $50.1)0
Orders on J. 0. Utberg.

G. Olson .......................................  8.00
Airs. M. Olin ...............................  4.00
Mrs. Al. Thomson ......................  5.on
Mrs. T. Lynch .............................  0.00
R. Iverston .................................  4.00

Total ......................................... $27.00
Orders on B. Levine.

Tula! ....................................... $130.00
II. ,1. Horohogeo.

Treating Sandra Kallloi*ila.......  30.00
St. Alary's Hospital.

Geo Ryan. Jan 7th to Jan. loth 4.29 
L. l! Miller. Agl.

Rent. Mrs. Wlnstroin. Feb......... O.00
Rent. Mrs, Koski, Feb................  5.00

Total .$11.00
I paavola.

Rent Mis Kll .Matson................  4.00
W K Bedforl, Agt. 

Transportation D Scanlon. Ami
A r b o r ......................................  8.53
Independent Lumber x  Coal Co.

Total ...................................
Jas. Piekumls X Co.

Mrs. Suniuelsoii ....................
.Mrs. J. Nelson ....................
Airs. Noble ..........................
Airs. Krlekson ......................
It. Iloakifig ...........................
Airs, Hurhu . . . .  ..................
.Mrs, Pryor ...........................
Mrs. Saiimelsou ....................
Mrs La wry . . .
Airs. Pope ........... ...
Mrs Beuuehump ..................
Mrs. H joqulsh........................
.Mrs. J U eterson..................
Airs. C. A. Olson ................
Ml’S Wullensteln ...............
AIth L u sk o ...........................
Mrs. W oodloek....................
Mrs. Strum! ...........................
C. Fosmoe .............................
Mrs Smeltr. ...........................

$292.15

3.06
3.06
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.05
3.06
3.05
3.05

Al rs. Suit! . . 
Mrs. WhiNli'om 
Alts. Langson . 
,1. Trnsslder 
Mrs. Clansen 
Mrs Nichols .. 
Mrs, Trego) 
Airs. Hamby 
Airs, Kopplla . . 
Mrs. Cola . . .

T o ta l ...........
( ’oiiHolidated F 

Airs. Roberts .. 
J. A1 Johnson . 
Airs, Narco . ..  
Airs. SJoliolm . . .

3.65 i 3 Jimmie
3.05 ' All's. Danielson
3.06 ' Mrs Predlx
3.65 j Airs. Sampson . .
3.05 ' Mrs. Osier 
3 65 Airs, l-appl
3.05 . Airs. Nnppoln
3.66 ! Mrs. Kungas 
3.6 6 'Mrs. Sarrl
3.05 |J. Grigg ...........
3.05 I Mrs. Tregaoning

........................ 3.06
........................ 3.05

.........................  3.05

.........................  3.05

.........................  3.05

.........................  3.05

.........................  3.05

.........................  3,05

.........................  3.05

.........................  3.05

.......................... $30.50
itel and Lumber Co.
.........................  3.05
.........................  4.5u
.........................  3.05
.......................... 3.05
.........................  3,05
.........................  3.06
.........................  3 05
.........................  ;i!o5
.......................... 3.25

. . 3.05
. 3.9U

.........................  3.90

.........................  3.05

.......................... 3.05
........................ 3.65

Mrs. II. Grunt .......................... .. BM>9 1
Mrs. Jl. K ulback...................... . . 4.00
Airs. A. Beuuehump................ .. lo.oo |
Mrs. A. I îln*uu ....................... .. 7.01)
Airs. S. Chcnull ................ .. 4.00 !
Mrs. F. Phelps ........................ .. 8.00
Mrs. T, Lynch .......................... . . 3.00
Mrs. M. OuiiIh ........................ .. 0.00 ,
Airs. Win. Knotwcll ............... . . 8.00 •
Airs. T. Bcnim le...................... . . 3.00 .
F. Anderson ........................... 7.00 r
A. Ruymond ............................. 5.oo

Tot 11I $?r. no
B Levine Wood.

M. Ilurniulu. 1 cord ............... 6.O0
Airs Thomas. I cord ............... .V60 .
Airs. Luhenu. I cord ............... 5.00 :
G. Olson, ] cord ...................... 5.00 ’
Alls. Oltne, 1 cord .................. 5.09
Alls. Alatala, 1 cord ............... 5.09
Mrs. B(‘uiichnmp, 1 c o rd ....... 5.00 -
.Mrs. H)ppa, 1 cord ............... 5.00 |
Airs. Clieiiull. 1 c o rd ............. 5 00 j
Wm. KnoUcll, I cord ........... 5 OO 1
Airs. H. Grant, 1 c o r d ......... 5.00
F Anderson. 1 cord ............... 5 OO
Airs. Oncas, 1 cord ............... . 5.00
Mrs. *K. Johnson, l cord ......... 5.0(1 '
Mrs. A. Johnson, 1 cord ......... 6.00
Airs. Al. Johnson, 1 cord ....... 5.00 1
.Mrs. A. Rueltla, 1 cord ....... 5.00 ,
A. Raymond, 1 c o ld ................. 5.00
Airs. F Phelps. 1 cord ........... 5.00 '
Mrs. T. Lynch, 1 c o rd ............. 5.00
Mrs. Dcnimlc, 1 cord ........... |

Total ..................................... .$117.00 '
II. 11. Lovchiml, mm!, alien. , . 25.00

Tow nship Total ...................... .$303.0(1
CHAMPION TOWNKHH1

Orders on M. c. (Julnii.
II Yulgren ............................. . 5.(10
Airs. T. Gugnon ...................... 5.00 •
Airs. J. Duggan ........................ lo.oo
Mrs. B. .Murphy........................ 5.00
Airs. N. St. O nge...................... lo.oo 1
Mrs. K. Nieml .......................... 5.00 1
Mrs. A. K eskey........................ 8.0(1
Airs. W. Mitchell .................. 8.0(1
F. Olson ................................. 7oo
C. Mlkkleson .......................... O.oo
Mrs. Knppenen ........................ 6.00
Mrs 10 Lnerosse.................. ■S.IMI .
C Nyman ................................. 0.00 1
Mrs J. Thomas ........... 4.00

12.50

Total Humboldt Township . . . .$  28.50 
Orders on F. Braastad X Co.

KLY TOWNSHIP.
Mrs. L. Gebeuti.......................... 4.00

R. A. Burke
.Medical Attendance ................. lo.oo

P. P. (‘base.
Transportation .......................... 8.00

.Marquette County Telephone Co. .
Telephone rent .......................... 1.75

Peninsula Record Publishing Co. 
Stationer) ...................................  5.25

' Total ...................................... $ 29.00
P. P. CHASK, Supt. 3rd Dlst.

Department of Public Instruction. 
OllU-e of County School Commissioner, 
Maniuette County, Alichigati, 1913.

To the Clerk of Alaniuette County, 
Marquette. .Michigan:

Dear Sir: I hereby certify thut the 
following is u true and correct list of 
schools visited by me, with thu time 
cmploveil in each, during the month, 
ending March 19, 1913,

A, K, KTKKNK, Com. 
Feh. 19 Ishpeming. District No 3, 

3 hours Gertrude lluwes.
Fell. 19 Ishpeming Kivu* Sullivan. 
Feh. 19. Ishpeming 
Feb. 24. Iluinhohll.

3 hours Anna Shirk.
Feh. 24 Humboldt, Kniily Cox. 
Feh. 25. Humboldt, District No 4. 

2 limits llllvu Jam-la.
Feb. 20. Tilden Iwp., Dlslrh'1 No. L

4 hours Oliver O. Fuller.
Feb. 38 Skamlla, District No. 5, 2 

llOllt 'H Ken. J. Glllivllle.
Feb 28 Chocolay. District No 3, 2 
horns Mary Kuockei'

March 3. Powell, District No. 1, 2 
hours Kskcl Carlson, Marie Bowman.

Nora O'Neil. 
District No. 1,

Feb. 5 * Turin, District No, 4. 2 
hoots Margaret Heaton.

March to. Chocoluy. District No. 6„ 
1 hour Pearl K. Goodney.

March 11. Ishpeming, District No. 
1, 2 hours Nancy F. Dahl.

March 13. Kly, District No. 1. 2 
Sterne.
Kly, District No. 2 Al-

hours. Lucy 
March 14. 

vali 11. Rowe 
March 14. 

hours Ktbel 
March 17- 

hoitts Murguerth 
March 17. 

hours B. B 
March 18. 

hours Rose 
March 19.

2. 3 hours

There are several kinds of foods 
(hat might take the place1 of the po­
tato, and for variety it Is well to oc­
casionally miss a meal and substitute 
one of them.

The cheapness and availability of 
the potato is a great factor In Its 
popularity.

Rice, macaroni, breed crumbs and 
combinations with these foods will 
make quite u variety to use In place 
of potatoes, occasionally.

Rice cooked until tender, mixed 
with a tittle butter, sprinkled with 
grated cheese and onlou. Repeat with 
unothcr layer of rice, and bake. Makes 
a most nutritious dish, which may be 
served as a vegetable.

Rice and tomato, baked in layers 
and well seasoned with cayenne pep­
per, makes another acceptable dish.

Rice, pluin boiled, served In a pretty 
niouud, garnished with parsley, will 
make a most acceptable addition to 
beefsteak. The rice may be well sea­
soned and served on a plate, as one 
does mushed potato.

Macaroni With Nutt.—Take a cup­
ful of cooked macaroni, pul It hi tha 
bottom of a buttered dial), sprinkle 
with any kind of coarsely broken nut 
meats, add a cupful of white sauce, 
cover with buttered bread crumbs ami 
buke until the crumbs are brown.

Hominy Is another food rich In nu- 
trlment which may be served aw a 
vegetable. Besson. and serve well 
cooked, as potato with moat, or It may 
be combined with cheese and white 
sauce and baked.

Hominy Griddle Cakes.—Add bom- 
luy to a griddle cake baiter, and cook 
as usual, or add to muffin mixture and 
bake in the form of gems or muf­
fins.

Bread Crumb Omelet—Soak u 
ful of bread crumbs In hot milk, 
two well beaten eggs, season 
cayenne: udd two tablespoonfuls of 
grated cheese; season with salt and 
cook In an omelet pan. When set, 
place In the oven to bake the top.

Too Many People Are Huddled 
Together in Big Cities.

qup-
rvJd

with

Kly. District No.
Bergdahl.-
Kly, District No. 5, 2

Mull.
Kly District No. 6, 2

Berryman.
Kly, District No. 2. 2

(ill Forge.
Humboldt. District No. 

\gnes Hendrickson.

2

Neguniic*', Midi.. March 1st. 1913. 
lion Chairman and Board of Super­

visors. Alnrcptotle County. Michigan.
Gentlemen:

I herewith submit to you my report 
for the month of February. 1913.

In Pittsburg,
The Visitor—"I notice barrels at 

house corners under the pipes that 
receive the water from the eaves and 
roofs. Why don't they let this rain 
water run luto the sewers?

The Native—Because they are 
thrifty. That water from the sooty 
roofs hns a market value and many 
Pittsburg* families alt to tbetr la­
conic by bottling it.

The Visitor- Bottling It? What la rf
Tha Native Ink.

Inland Lakes

If One Would Interest Himself In
Orcharding He Would Find All Na- 

f  tore Soon Assuming New
Friendliness for Him.

(By R. B. BUCKIIAM.)
What the great majority of people. 

I young and old. of today need more 
than auything else is to be taught 
how to enjoy the pleasures and ud 
vantages of life in the country. Wheti 
one stops to think of it. what a Bhaine 
It Is thut so many should be huddled 
together ami coo|w»d up in the great 
cities, all the year round, when they 
ought to be out lu the open!

Recommend to a friend to try the 
country, aud you will doubtless find 
him ready enough to make the at 
tempt, but In a week or so you will 
quite likely see him coming hack 
again, bag and baggage. He did not 
And It to his liking, and gave it up. 
And It la only natural that he should; 
a result to be expected; for he was 
Blmply out of hia accustomed environ­
ment, and III at ease. He did not 
know how to accustom himself to his 
new surroundings, and so did not find 
them satisfactory.

It Is the outcome of the same prin­
ciple which will be seen at work lu 
many other fields of experience. It Is 
said that when a person beholds the 
sea for the first time. It rarely. If ever, 
makes an impression upon him. It Is 
to him u wide expanse of water, and 
thut is all. But as one cornea to know 
it better. Its many moods and ever- 
changing aspects, It becomes at length 
grand, impressive, awe-inspiring, and 
an endless source of fascination.

It Is ho. too, with the works of tho 
great masters of the past. Ho who 
looks upon even their greatest master 
pieces for tho first time, usually won­
ders, if at all, that they should appeal 
to others as they do. But as he 
comes to be able to understand and 
appreciate them, he too. feels their 
all absorbing charm and noblo inspira­
tion.

One must know how to appreciate 
the country, in order to enjoy It. Con­
firmed city dwellers an* nceustomed 
to bfing amused all the lime. Kvery 
one of their waking hours must be 
frittered uwrv with foibles of one kind 
or another, or they ure miserable. 
They will sit for hours and wateli a 
juggler perform his tricks, though 
(hey know them to he but a deception 
all the time, aud vet the great pro­
cesses of nature may go on before 
them without arousing their Interest 
in the least* But If they only knew 
how to find entertainment In the 
changing seasons, the great dramas of 
seedtime and harvest, the Btory would 
he a vastly different one. It Is said 
that the Danish, wholly an agricul­
tural people, are the happiest in tho 
world.

None need ever lack occupation and 
entertainment for all of his time, when 
once he has made friends with na­
ture. Take for example fruit grow­
ing. If one would hut Interest him­
self In this one branch of agriculture 
he would find all nature assuming a 
new frlendllnesH for hlrn. There Is a 
companionship to he gotten out of the 
care and observation of trees, very 
real and satisfying Says Thoreau. 
the seer of Walden Pond. "Sympathy 
with the fluttering ulder and poplar 
leaves almost tukes away my breath." 
Since the dawn of creation tin* trees 
have housed and fed the race, and 
yet some In theg« latter duys have so 
drifted nVay from this old-time part­
nership of Interests as to become al­
most complete strungers to their old 
time benefactors. Surely, tills should 
not be! lt:is unnatural and unwhole­
some. Do not fall to renew tile old 
alliance with the trees. It will bring 
you a new hold upon life, and help 
to heal the long-time brcuch between 
you and mother earth

RETAIN FERTILITY OF SOIL
Two Beit Ways Are Raising Btock and 

Keaplng Manure Spreader Busy 
at AM Tlmaa.

Raising nock und keeping u manure 
■prvader busy the two best ways 
of maintaining fertility In the soli 
Don't rob the land continuously and

m

_ ___

The New Way.

give nothing hack to It. Thut method 
has been tried very ofteu. It does 
not pay.

Do not lei the manure pile up be­
hind the burn and go to waste Gel 
It out on the fields. It will do inure 
good there.

••wo*

7



C o m p a r a t i v e  

Digestibility 
o f  F o o d

M a d e  w ith  d iffe re n t B a k in g  P o w d e rs

From a Series of Elaborate Chemical Tests:
An equal quantity of bread (biscuit) was made 

with each of three different kinds of baking powder— 
cream of tartar, phosphate, and alum—and submitted 
separately to the action of the digestive fluid, each 
for the same length of time.

The relative percentage of the food digested is 
shown as follows:

Bread made with
Royal Cream of Tartar Powder:

f  100 Per Cent. Digested 3
Bread made with 
phosphate powder:

1 68*4 Per Cent, Digested 1

Bread made with
alum powder f *#&****'f

r W ^ h r  Cent Digested!

These tests, which are absolutely reliable and 
unprejudiced, make plain a  fact of great importance 
to everyone: Food raised with Royal, a  cream of 
tartar Baking Powder, is shown to be entirely diges­
tible, while the alum and phosphate powders are found 
to largely retard the digestion of the food made from 
them.

Undigested food is not only wasted food, but it 
is the source of very many bodily ailments.

R E P U B L IC
No contests of any moment devel­

oped at the township caucus held on 
the 22nd Inst and the work was exped­
itiously disposed of, with Wlillam D. 
Gamble acting as chairman and James 
It, Peebles as secretary. The nomi­
nation of the principal officers was by 
acclamation, and nearly all of the 
nominees succeed themselves In the 
respective positions. In fact, about 
the only change of consequence was 
in the nomination for treasurer, Ole 
Wilson securing the place on the 
ticket. The complete ticket is as fol­
lows:

Supervisor—Wade A. Hlebentbal 
I'lerk-Peler W. Pasroe 
Treasurer-Ole Wilson 
Justice—James K. Peebles 
Highway CommUslonef-William Kootwell 
Overseer—James Dower 
Hoard ot Review -Oust Peterson 
Constables—John Oullclte. William Schmidt, 

William J .  Irwin, Chester Weinberg,
A very quiet home wedding marked 

the nuptials of William Sprage Rob­
bins, of Green Bay, and Mies Martha 
Dorothea Mertz, of this village, on 
the 25th Inst. The ceremony was per­
formed at the home of the bride’s 
mother, Mrs. M. Mertz, by Rev. Wil­
liam Edmunds, pastor of the Repub­
lic M. E. Church. Though frieods 
were aware of the approaching mar­
riage, the couple kept the precise date 
a secret and almost succeeded in get­
ting out of town before others than 
immediate relatives were aware that 
the koot had been tied. The groom 
la a conductor on tbe St. Paul line 
and through the aid of his railroad 
frienda he was almost successful in 
giving all "pureuera" tbe slip, for U 
bad been arranged to have the even­
ing passenger train make a  stop at 
the School street crossing and take 
the couple aboard there instead of at 
tbe station. All would have gone 
well but for tbe sharp eyes and oars of 
Republic youth, who appeared at the 
home about tbe time the ceremony was 
at an end. At that they were only 
partly successful, for while they were 
tuning up their musical instruments 
of tio ana copper, Mr. and Mrs. Rob- 
bios slipped out the back door and 
were nearly down to tbe track before 
the kids "caught on" and gave chase, 
arriving only a few momenta before 
the train came along. For several 
seasons past the groom has bad tbe 
ore train run into Republic and has 
spent tbe greater part of each year 
here, though his home is in Green 
Day and It Is there that the ouuple 
are to establish residence. The bride 
is a member of one of Republic's pio­
neer families and the good wishes of 
ber many friend* follow her to her 
flew home.

Mrs. P. W. Pascoo returned Tues­
day morning from a visit of two or 
three weeks in Detroit and vicinity.

Isaac Sllberg and Rev. John w ar- 
gelln spent the greater part of lust 
week in attendance at the Chicago and 
DeKalb district convention of the 
Fihnlsb Lutheran Church. Mr. 811- 
berg returned Tuesday morning and 
Rev. Mr. Wargeiln sapped en route 
in order to return with bis family, 
who bad been visiting at Crystal 
Falls.

William John Mitchell and William

▲ n  Imitation
Is never a* good a» the article It 

imitates. And so It is with RENNE'S 
FAIN-KILLING MAGIC OIL. Hun­
dreds of imitations have been offered 
to the public in place of the genuine 
but none ot them nave quite answered 
the purpose. REENF/Sdoes the work 
expected of it, both internally for 
c ra m p  colic and cholera morbus, und 
externally for rheumatism, sprains 
and for loro muscles. The public 
know It well and u*c It regularly. 
Price 20 uts. Sold by J. K. O'Dono- 
ghue, City Drug Store.

Nelson stopped in Republic for a vis­
it with relatives while on their way 
from the Copper Country to Kanka­
kee, III.

Miss Hazel Sunesoo, who is attend­
ing the Northern Normal School at 
Marquette, spent the Easter vacation 
In Republic.

The Swedish M. E. congregation 
will give a social and literary pro­
gram at the church on April 29tb.

Mrs. E. E. Lamb and son, Cyril, 
spent last Tuesday at Ishpemlng.

Dennis McCarthy returned to Glad­
stone Tuesday evening after having 
spent a few days at tbe home of Mrs. 
McCarthy’s parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Cornelius Lynch.

Bruce Wallace returned last week 
from a brief visit in Chicago. I

William Kartbeiser. woo has bud 
charge of the machinery at tbe Kloman 
mine during tbe time that operations 
were in progress there, was up from 
Marinette tbe latter part of last week.

A. E. Sterne, county commissioner 
of schools, paid an official visit to Re­
public last Monday.

Mrs. Wm. Zeltler has beenconflned 
to her home for the greater part of the 
winter by an attack of brooobitis.

George A. Woessner.of Menominee, 
was a busiuess visitor here Monday.

Births have been reported In the 
following homes: Wm. Abo, daught 
er, 22d ult; Gust Lakklla, son, 24th; 
John Sommers, daughter, 31st.

Miss Mary Welch has been quite 111 
during the pact few weeks.

Miss Nellie Carmen spent a few 
days Id Republic last week visiting 
her brother, Martin Carmen. She 
was on ber way to ber former home 
in Lower Michigan and was accom­
panied by ber little nephew, Fred 
Owens. Mrs. Carmen accompanied 
tbe visitors as far as Mhrquette last 
Sunday when they set out on their 
journey to Lower Michigan. Mr- and 
Mrs. Martin Carmen plan to remove 
to that aectlun of the state within a 
couple of months.

Emil Carlson left Mooday evening 
for a visit with relatives in Chicago.

Rev. Joseph L. Hollinger attended 
tbe Knights of Columbus Initiation 
ceremonies at Marquette last Sunday 
afternoon.

PEOPLE SHOULD GUARD 
AGAINST APPENDICITIS
Negaunee people who have stomach 

and bowel trouble should guard 
against appendicitis by taking simple 
buckthorn bark, glycerine, etc., as 
compounded in Adler-i-ks, the Ger­
man appendicitis remedy. A SINGLE 
DUSE relieves sour stomuch, gas on 
the stomach aod constipation IN­
STANTLY because this simple mix­
ture antlsepticlzes the digestive organs 
and draws off the impurities. S 
by J. E. O'Donogbue.

M i c h i g a m m e
Charles H. Haight, who was a resi­

dent of Mlchlgamme prior to some 
seven years ago, died on the 24th ult. 
at Grand Forks, B. C. Word was 
received here the fore part of tbe pres­
ent week that the widow and a son 
were on their way East with the re­
mains. and it is expected that tbe fun­
eral will be held to-day. Mr. Haight’s 
early home was in Lower Michigan, 
but he came north about the time that 
the timber country between Neetoria 
and Duluth was being developed and 
be spent a number of years at Ewen, 
following his trade of millwright. He 
then removed to Mlchlgamme and was 
filer In the Read & Co. mill until It 
was closed down some seven or eight 
years ago. Shortly afterward Mr. 
Haight removed to British Columbia. 
He was between 70 and 75 years of 
age but had continued to be an active 
worker in the sawmill Industry until 
quite receot years, when his health 
bad become considerably Impaired. A 
month or two ago be made a trip  to 
California and met several Northern 
Michigan people who were spending 
the winter In that section. Mr. Haight 
was twice married, and his first wife 
and a couple of daughters are burled 
in Lower Michigan. A son, Fred, is 
buried here and interment of the 
father’s remains Is to be beside those 
of the Bon in Lake View Cemetery, 
Mlchlgamme. Besides tbe widow, a 
son, Andrew, who is an attorney at 
Ely, Nevada, survives. Tbe latter is 
also a member of tbe Nevada Legisla­
ture. Deceased had joined tbe Inde­
pendent Order of Odd Fellows in Low­
er Michigan and never transferred bis 
membership, though be was fratern­
ally affiliated with the local organiza­
tions in his subsequent places of resi­
dence. The Mlchlgamme Odd Fel­
lows, upon receipt of advices of his 
death, made arrangements for the 
Cure of tbe body during the time it 
was to be here and for the funeral, 
which was held this afternoon, servi­
ces being conducted at the M. E. 
Church by Rey. Mr. Colllster of 
Champion.

An effort was made to get a second 
ticket in tbe field for the approaching 
township election, but candidates wil­
ling to martyr themselves in the cause 
of bucking the nomination ticket 
could not be secured, and with the 
possibility of some opposition by 
means of "slips" for offices farther 
down the line, the ticket headed by 
Dr. Thomas as supervisor; G. J. 
Scbwendeman, clerk; and E. G. Muck, 
treasurer, will be returned to office. 
Much pressure was brought to bear 
upon Dr. L Slcotte to make the run 
for supervisor and had be consented 
to the use of bis name it is quite 
probable that several aspirants for 
other places would have come out In­
to the open, with the result that a 
fairly complete opposition ticket 
might have been presented, but this

Sosslbllity ended with Dr. Siootte’s 
ecislon not to enter the race. David 

Peterson, who was prevented from at­
tendance at tbe caucus because of un­
expected duties, will contest with 
Nominee Henry Johnson for the office 
of justice of tbe peace.

George McDonald, still known as 
tbe "sage of Three Lakes," though 
be has shaken tbe clay of that suburb 
from his boots and definitely estab­
lished residence in Mlchlgamme, re­
turned tbe fore part of the week from 
a three months’ sojourn in Chicago. 
Ho .says he enjoyed evory minute of 
his stay in the metropolis and there 
Is no reason to question his word. 
He chanced to put up at a hotel where 
them was quite a bunch of college 
students and Mr. McDonald’s quaint 
personality quickly endeared him to 
each and every one of them. When 
be finally headed northward a score 
of them came down to tbe station to 
say good bye to "Uncle George. ”

Mr. and Mrs. P. E. Paquln moved 
into their new residence the middle of 
tbe week. Tbe site is an attractive 
one, oext east of the Northwestern 
Hotel, and while no undue frills ap­
pear in either exterior or interior fin­
ish it is a modern residence in every 
respect and at once takes place as one 
of tbe most valuable and desirable 
pieces of residence property in the 
village. A hot water beating plant 
and complete plumbing Installation 
add materially to tbe comforts which 
the new home affords.

Recent letters told of an automobile 
excursion made into Old Mexico by 
Mrs. C. F. Sundstrom and others of 
tbe party who have been spending the 
wiDter in California. The route from 
Los Angeles down to the Mexican 
boundary line is said to afford a nice 
auto jaunt and that portion of Mexi­
can possessions Is far enough west so 
that little effeot of the country's Inter­
nal strife Is dlscernable. The party 
paid a visit to tbe Mexloan fort aod 
were hospitably received by tbe sol-, 
filers garrisoned there. Among other 
pictures sent to Mlchlgamme relatives 
and friends was one of the huge mon­
ument which Hands on the boundary 
line between California aod Mexico. 
Tbe members of tbe Bundstrom party 
expect to return borne about May 1st.

The members of tbe Mlchlganum* 
high school who are in the cast of 
"The Crazy Idea; or, All the Comforts 
of Home," are busily engaged in 
memorizing tbeir lines und otherwise 
preparing for the production of the 
play.

H. L. Chamberlain, of Iron Rivor, 
who will supervise the operations ut 
the Niagara Company's mines to the 
west of here, expects to resume resi­

dence in Micbigamme very shortly. 
He will occupy tbe apartments in the 
hospital building vacated by P. E. 
Paquia.

John Schweitzer, who was in the em­
ploy of the South Shore at Ewen, is 
spending a few days at tbe family 
home here prior to an assignment to 
duty at some other point on the line.

Miss Jennie Thompson returned last 
S u n d a y  murniog irom a  visit oi a lew 
weeks with friends at Berglund.

Mr. and Mrs. Charles Labia of Cov­
ington. are visiting in Miuhigamme.

A. \V. Boback left Sunday for Du­
luth, where he is to enter upon bis du­
ties for Uncle Sam in tbe railway mail 
service.

C. F. Sundstrom spent last Satur­
day and Sunday with Mr. and Mrs. 
W. A. Garner at Negaunee.

Members of the Ishpeming Y. M. C. 
A., which has a summer camp, "W is- 
gaming,” on the shores of Lake Mich- 
igamme, will give a moving picture 
entertainment here at an early date, 
tbe proceeds of which will be added 
to those of similar entertainments 
given in Ishpeming and used tor tbe 
further equipment of the camp.

John Lines has taken Mr. Karpen- 
sky’s place as conductor on freight 
runs 55 and 56 for a few days.

Linas Anderson returned Saturday 
from Pequamlng, where he bad finish­
ed quite a large contract for mason 
work at the Heoard mill.

Supervisor Thomas has received 
assurances from Mr. Hlllyer, super­
intendent of tbe Marquette county
road commission, that work upon the 
new highway through Mlchlgamme 
township, which will form part of a

March 28—April ]« 
P r o b a t e  A o t f o o  

STATE OF MICHIGAN,
The Prolate Court for the Comity of Marquette.

I» the Matter ot the Estate ot rrancetco Jloo- 
gl»l. Deceased.

Notice is hereby given that four month* from 
the J4th day of March A. D- 1913. have been al­
lowed for creditors to present their claims 
against said deceased to said court for exnmlti- 
atiou and adjustment, and that all creditors of 
said deceased are required to present their 
claim* to said court, a t Mm nrolmlaoflica, in the
vivj ui t.i.KijneUw in -mu uumtiji on ot oei'oie
the 25th day of July A. D. 1913, and that 
said claims vs ill be heard by said court on Fri­
day, the 25th day of July A. U. 1913, at cwo 
o'clock in the afternoon, 

bated, Marquette, Mich-, Mar. 24, A. I). 1913. 
(Stall W. T. POTTER.

A true copy. , Judge of Probate.

April 4-25
P r o b a t e  N o t i c e  

STATE OF MICHIGAN,
The I 'n b a te  Court for Hie County of Marquetto

At a session of said Court, held at the Probate 
Office in the City of Marquette in said County, 
on the first day ot April A. D. 1913

Present: lion. W. T. Potter. Judge of Probate
In tbe Matter of the Estate of Elmer K. Lamb, 

Deceased.
Nettie K. Lamb having filed In said court her 

petition praying that a certain instrument iu 
writing, purporting to be the last will and testa­
ment of said deceased. Elmer K. Lamb now on 
Hie In said court be admitted to probate, and 
that the administration of said estate be grant­
ed to herself.

it is Ordered, That the 28th day of April 
A. D. 1913. at two o’clock in the afternoon, at 
said probate office, be and Is hereby appointed 
for examining and allowing said account and 
hearing sold petition:

It la Further Ordered, That public notice 
thereof be given by publication of a copy of this 
order, for three successive weeks previous to 
said day ot bearing, in the Nkoaunkk Ikon 
Hir a l d , a newspaper printed and circulated 
In sold county.

Seal W .T. POTTER,
A true copy. Judge of Probate

[.LA M.Ki. Tincknell . Probate Clerk.

Lake Superior & Ishpeming 
Railway.

L S. & I.

M A & S . e .
M u n is in g , M a rq u e t te  a n d

South-Eastern Ry.

I n  effeot beginning Sunday, 
June 2, 1012.

TRAIN ARRIVES NBDAUNKK 
daily except Sunday

From MUNISING, Mar- m  10 « m 
quelle andallinterme- l U . u a n l  
dial# points.

TRAIN LEAVES NKOAUNKK 
dally except Sunday 

For Marquette.Hknndia, )  CD ■  ■  
LawsomKumlev, Chat* g l» 
ham. MUNISINU. PUINUKrON 
and all lutermedlate points.

SUNDAY TRAINS:
For Marquette, Princeton and Mu- 

nistng will leave Negaunee at 7:53 
a. m. and 4:yi p. m.

Trains will arrive from Munlsliix and 
Princeton 11 A)2 a. m. and 8:17 p. m.

T h e  R e p u b lic  S ta te  B a n k
R E P U B L I C .  M IC II .

U N IT E D  S TA TE S  D E P O S IT A R Y
FOR POSTAL SAVINGS FUNDS.

No banking institution can give you better service 

than your local bank. Our depoaitors already know 

this, and you will be convinced if you open an account 

with the Republic State Bank.

through route between the Iron aod 
copper countries, will be begun just 
as soon as tbe weather will permit in 
the snriqg. Micbigamme township 
likewise will be ready to co-operate Id 
Its share of the work, which includes a 
new  bridge across tbe Peschekeme 
river. 9

Peter Dufrfisoe and daughter, Mrs. 
Earl Rlckert, spent a few days in 
Marquette.

Charles Jacobson and family, of 
L ’Anse, will visit at tbe home of Mrs. 
Jacobsoo’s parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Thompson, next Sunday.

John Johnson, a former resident of 
the village and now located at Berg- 
land, is paying his first visit to Mlch­
lgamme in four years.

Capt. J. P. Christopher left Mon­
day morning for Duluth and bewailed 
the train service that put him on his 
way a full half hour before George 
McDonald should arrive from Chica­
go: thereby preventing a recounting 
of experiences that would have been 
highly edifying to each of tbe parties 
directly concerned as well as enter­
taining to any listeners who chanced 
to be about.

The Imperial mine has added a few 
bands to Hb small force, Gust and 
Frank Carlson being among the lucky 
ones to be given employment.

A misunderstanding between Capt. 
Marks aod his borso as to tbe route 
to be pursued led to some strange 
evolutions on Railroad street the 
other evening. The explanation lay 
in the fact that some wag crossed the 
reins near the bridle during the time 
that the horse was standing near the 
station awaitlDg tbe arrival of the 
train.

An indication of forthcoming acti 
vlty at the Portland is found in aeon 
tract awarded to 8. D. Murphy to  get 
a quantity of long timber for the tree 
tie work.

Oscar Wenlge, who has purchased 
the lumber and brick in what remains 
of the F. W. Read & Co. mill, will 
shortly begin to dismantle tbe struc 
ture.

Registration Day

To-morrow (Saturday) will be reg­
istration day in Negaunee for the reg 
lsteriog of voters eligible to vote at 
the municipal and general election on 
Monday next, April 7. It is necessary 
that all voters be registered in order 
to be permitted to cast their ballots, 
but it is not required that there be a 
new registration. Only such a t  have 
become of age since the lust election 
or have moved Into a new ward need 
to rs-register.

For Fair Dealing

The merchant who is In business 
to stay knows that fair dealing aod 
absolutely truthful advertising Is tbe 
only way to get customers and keep 
them. These are the essentials of sue 
cess, They are the principles by which 
the reliable merchants who advertise 
in the Ikon Hkkald do business. 
You can rely upon tbe advertisements 
which appeur In this paper. Tbe 
merebaots who pay for tbuse an­
nouncements cannot afford to risk 
their reputations. They know It pays 
them to advertise only so long a* they 
give their customers superior mer- 
chandise at honest prices.

Read the advertisement* ia the Ilio.v 
IIkkalu closely and ooostaotly for the 
latest news from Negaunee’* uio«t re­
liable mercantile establishment*. They 
have s reputation for fair dealing.

•D aniel Tnehan, former Negaunee 
hoy and brother of Mrs. LaVorno 
Seas*, han been nominated for treas­
urer of the city of Ksoanaba on tbe 
Independent Progressive ticket.

—Is there a umn In the world to-day 
without an enemy? We don’t think 
there Is. If so he certainly is not en­
gaged in the newspaper or any other 
kind of business, for that mutter.

P#*b. 2H-April 4
Notice for Publication

DEPARTMENT ok THE INTERMIX,
U, h. Laud Office at Marquutle, Midi.

P«t>. »L 1*13.
Nntlc«* Is hereby kIvhii that Uuy Iflakr. ot 

NiHilihnd. Michigan, wfio. ou February 2. IW7. 
mode Homwitead Entry Nn. 121*8. aerial N». 
01474. lor NKA III HBU . Hecllon 34. Tuwnalilu 43 
N.. Radio* »  w , Michigan, Meridian, Inn flkd 
notice of Intention in make live year Proof to 
e*tab|uli claim tn tin* land above flw rllw d, »**•- 
fore the O r k  “f Hi" Circuit Court of (•*•»* 
County,at Rxcauabt. Michigan, on the )Mb day 
of April, 1913.

Claimant name* a* wllnewest
Jam** Edward*, id Well*. Michigan: Omnn* 

LrJcvrc, Jtolwrt Toucher. John Allen, of North* 
loud, Midi. 0ZR0 A B0WENj * * , , 1* .

Cal^ tor the product ot the

Upper Peninsula Brewing Go.
THE SUPERIORITY OF THIS 
PRODUCT IS UNQUESTIONED.

A Specialty ia made of our Tonic.

You can obtain our product by merely telephoning or 
addressing a postal card to ~

JOHN A, WASMUTH.
Agent Negaunee.

Upper Peninsula Brewing Go. Mich.

iM s ra m is & g a s in ff l
■- MATTRESS on  ovary 

U altraea

at It answers every requirement—every question—too. Fits 
nicely—4s absolutely PURR and CLEAN. Made in the 
handsomest patterns of SATIN-FINISH, DUSTPROOF 
TICKINGS.

Tbe “ Webbing Process," employed exclusively in ALL 
Steams & Foster Mattresses, unites the tiny Cotton fibres 
into 860 filmy, lacy web*, all of which have acquired tbe 
UTMOST LIFE and RESILIENCE. A more COM­
FORTABLE—more ENDURING mattres* could not pos­

sibly be made.
•V* i r
Open Closed 
TM» Swire on 
em/ MiilftN

y o u  Ca n  s e e  w i i a t s  in s id e , t o o .
A POSITIVE GUARANTEE ON EVERY MATTRESS 

Come in to -d a y —Several sty's* to citoase from.

J O H N  W . B L L I O>TT ~ J i
ITTLIM.
W T125

i l k a r u t o c W S h o e i
Factory to You 

Save a Dollar-Two
No Middleman's Profit

L atest Style
Ladies1 and Men's
Best Quality

Makers of

W ear-U -W ell Shoes
largest manufacturers In the 

world.
Sold in 600 Factory Branches

MAIL ORDER DEPARTMENT 
Send money order for amount of 
shoes and 10  cents per pair for 
Parcel Post, w e pay the rest.
State style No. and size wanted.

Wear-U-Well Branch Shoe Store No. 486

tmi so. 
123 T

W. M, BBLL,
MAWjKSf ft. 406 Iron Street, Negaunee

S H O U  H L P A l H I X a .



TWO WOMEN 
SAVED FROM 

OPERATIONS Gathered- Smiles
WRONG SURMISE. PRECAUTION.

IBy Lydia E. Pinkham’s Veg­
etable Compound —Their 

Own Stones' Here Told.

Beatrice, Neb.—“ Just after my mar­
riage my left side began to pain me and 
ithe pain got bo severe at times that 1 
ctuffered terribly with it, I visited three 
doctors and each one wan ted do operate 
eon me but I would not consent to an op­
eration. 1 heard of tho good Lydia E. 
i ’jnkham's Vegetable Compound was 
doing for others and 1 used several bot­
tles of it with the result that I haven't 
t>cen* bothered with my aide since then. 
1 am In good health and I have two littia 
«irl*.” -Mrs.R.B.CHtLD, Beatrice,Neb.

Tho O th e r  Case.
Cary, Maine.—" I  feel itadu ty  I owe 

%n nil suffering women to tell what Lydia 
X. Pinkhaxn's Vegetable Compound did 
£or me. One year ago I found myself a 
terrible sufferer. I had pains in both 
«ides and such a soreness I could scarcely 
straighten up at times. My back ached, 
X had no appetite and was so nervous t  
*»uld not sleep, then I would be so tired 
caominga that I could scarcely get 
(around. I t  seemed almost impossible 
to  move or do & bit of work and I 
thought I never would be any better 

u n til I submitted to an operation, bat 
sny husband thought I had better write 
Co you and I did eo, stating my symp­
toms. I commenced taking Lydia E. 
Pinkham’s Vegetable Compound and 
soon felt like a new woman. I had no 
•pains, slept well, had good appetite and 
tcould do almost all my own work for s  
family of four. I shall always feel that 
I  owe my good health to your Vegetable 
Compound.’’-M rs. Haywabd Sowers, 
Cary, Maine.

fi^ L lsT lT E R A R Y  MYSTERY
flev. Mr. Wolfe, Author of “Burial of 

.Sir John Moore” Buried at
f  Queenstown.
t i -----

A literary mystery of a hundred 
•y^ar* ago is recalled by the 9peciu) 
r<*nh nary number, recently issued, ol 
the Nuwry Telegraph, au Ulster 
iri-wcekly. In Its pages April 19, 
3417, under tbe simple head of "Po 
wtiy,” appeared wbat Byron called “the 
aioet perfect ode In tbe language"— 
“The Burial of Sir John Mooro.” By­
ron or Campbell or any of the others 
to  whom this poem was variously 
vtsertbad would doubtless have been 
proud to claim It. But the author was 
ri>« obscure curate of Ballyclog, In 
'Tyronne, Rev. Charles Wolfe, and 
3 m  fame of tbe piece wus but a post* 
humous fame for hltn. Not uutll Ills 
death, of consumption, In 1823, ut the 
lastly age of thirty-two, did the author* 
ship become known tu the world. And 
Wolfe, who wrote much other verso 
of merit, Is remembered only by that 
o-n© poem which sprang from the col­
umns of a provincial newspaper to 
universal recognition In the big world 
«t letters.—London Chronicle.

^Municipal Golf Courses in England.
The parks committee of ths Blr- 

Tuingliam city council Is considering 
tbe establishment of a municipal golf 
course, the proposed site being at 
Castle Browwlch.

Edinburgh, with six public courses, 
•claims to huvq boon tho pioneer of 
municipal goU. Londou bus public 
courses; Nottingham lias two courses 
a n d  Manchester Uuh liud one *tnc* 
1911. tiunderlund and Liverpool have 
iOnllur schemes under consideration. 
(Several seaside resorLs Include mu­
nicipal golf among their attractions. 
Brighton and Bournemouth urn In- 
stances. Yuruujuth hue a scheme in 
Land nod Bnuthport hus considered a 
elnnlur proposal.—London Mall.

Cowboys. i
“1 sen Portuguese cowboys have | 

V)<*en lighting with smugglers?"
"I thought all the cowboys In the 

world were working for movlng plc- I 
iu ro  outllta.”—Denver Republican. |

Eggssctly.
~E«c* are gutUug so expunstve that 

fried eggs will be used next for trim­
ming women* hats.”

“Why ootT I should think tho effect 
would be chic.”—WaahlngUm IWruld

Literal.
MDo yoa like my execution on tbe 

yUnof” "1 must say I would have 
to describe It as an exccuUuu for kill- 
fog tim e”

CONSTIPATION
Munyon’s I’aw-Paw 

Pill* are unlike all oth­
er laxative* or cathar­
tic*. They coax tbe 
liver into activity by 
geotle method*, they 
do not scour; they do 
not gripe; they do not 
weaken; but they do 
Kart all the secretions 
ol the liver and stom­
ach io a way that soon 
put* these organs In a 
healthy condition and 

ta constipation. Munyons Paw-Paw 
are a tonic to tbe stomach, liver tod 

They invigorate instead of weaken; 
enrich the blood instead* of impover* 

iti-tbey enable the stomach to get all 
nonrUhment from food that is put into 
Price eg oeota AU Druggitta

a«al OMf* SfWfu lkWaadevd. Um
la tttee Sale Sy Drier late.

"MIbb Poacher, may I ask you u 
very important question?”

“Why—er—certainly, Mr. Dubkins,” 
anawerod the young lady, trying hard 
to conceal her agitation.

“Poos your father look with favor 
on mo?”

“Yes, father likes you very much 
and if you should ask him anything 
In regard to me, l am sure—”

”1 am glad to hear thut I have won 
hla esteem, because ( have been lately 
taking a flyer In Walt street and I 
want his advice as to whether or not 
now !b a good time to sell P. D. & O. 
stock.”

Difficulty.
"It does seem as If you and I ought 

(o get along together without quarrel­
ing all the time,” sighed Mrs. Jaw- 
back.

"It does,” growled Mr. Jawback, “but 
It aeems we can't. We're fighting like 
cats and dogs from morning to night.”

“Cftta and dofts? Look at that cat 
and that dog of ours—they never fight 
They live under the same roof peace­
fully.”

“Yes, (hey do. But tie 'em together 
so they can't gat loose and sec how 
‘.hay'll act!”

HU Qualifications.
“So you want me to support Wom­

bat for the senate?" Bald the practical 
politician.

"Wo do,” chorused the delegation of 
citizens.

"On what ground*?”
"On the grounds that he is the shiest 

man for the place.”
"Urn! Now what other qualifications 

has he?”

Open Confession.
"You admit, then,” Inquired the mag- 

larvate, severely, “that you stole the 
pig?”

“I has to, boBB,” said the prisoner.
"Very well,” returned the magis­

trate, with decision, “there has been a 
lot of pig stealing going on around 
hero lately and 1 am going to make an 
example of you or none of us will be 
*afe."—Ladies' Home Journal.

OF C0UR8E.

"Why docs a woman always add a  

postscript to a letter?”
"Bee-ause she likes to have tho last 

word.” •

Tht Altruist.
Iy*t e t h e r s  k n * p  o n  t u p p l n u  t i l l s ,

Ht- doth not enro to 
.Uh-vluh* the host of Ills 

Thai fh-sh I* lo-lr to.

A Gourmet.
'Tin afraid Dubklu* lurks tho true 

aesthetic temperament ”
“Why bo?”
“The only conception be him of an 

Italian gurden is a place where pcuplo 
eat spaghetti and drink ('hlantl."

Bank President—Better fire our re ­
ceiving teller!

Cashier—Why ?
Bank President-'They're calling 

him “Honest Tom” at the club.

8toek Themes.
W« talk of heat In summer gay,

In winter talk of cold;
An<l thus one-half that people oar 

Is very briefly told.

Mere Mediocrity.
“I used to think I possessed the ar­

tistic temperament—the sacred fire; 
but 1 was mistaken. I'm Just one 
among the millions of common peo*. 
pie."

“You have no right to say that! You 
have done some splendid things— 
things that you could not possibly 
have done If you bed merely been one 
among the millions of common peo­
ple.”

"No, you're mistaken. I’m Just an 
ordinary, everyday man. Why, my 
wife has lived with me for II years 
without ever once thinking of getting 
a divorce!”—Judge's Library.

Money Saving Secret.
"Well, after a lot of experience In 

speculating 1 have at last learned how 
to keep oa the right side of tbe stock 
m arket”

"Would you mind posting me, old 
chap?”

"Not at all. The right side of the 
stock market, my dear fellow, Is the 
outside.”

Maw Knows a Few Things.
Willie—Paw, what does the mini­

mum wage mean?
Paw—It meane the smallest amount 

you can pay for a certain amount of 
work, my non.

Maw-- It really means what a mar­
ried woman receives from her hus­
band. Now you go to bed, Willie.

Obligation Both Ways.
“Some of those pictures are genuine 

old musters,” sold Mr. Cumrox.
"Of course, you are very proud to 

have them.”
“Yea, and I have no doubt the old 

masters would hare considerable re­
spect for me If they knew what I paid 
for them.”

Proved.
“Women do not especially admire 

handnome men.”
"That Is true,” replied Miss Cay­

enne. “A* I sat on the piazza ! saw 
a number of good-looking, well- 
dress 1 youths cut out by a man 
whom automobile goggles rendered 
entirely unprepossessing.”

Acqulttsd.
Walter- Have you tried our turtle 

soup, air?
IMner—Yes, 1 have tried It, and my 

decision Is that the turtle proved an 
alibi.

Keeping Before the Public.
I suppoHo It keeps you very busy 

s-upcrvlshiK the work of your publica­
tion and composing its lending artl 
eke?"

”1 don't have time for anything 
Ukn that.” answered tbe statesman 
who had founded a magazine. "I’m 
helping tho advertising department, 
and It takes all my time delivering 
lectures aud running for office.”

Expert.
“1 never have any trouble with rny 

gowns "
“How is that?”
“You my husband belong* to 

the Are department.”
•'Weil?”
“And be ran hook mo up In 4G aeo- 

ends Ixtulevllle Courier-Journal.

A Cure.
"Do you believe appendicitis can be 

cured without an operation?”
“My case was.”
"flow'd you do It?”
"A friend who had suffered told me 

what his operation coat him, and as 
soon as he had finished all my symp­
toms had departed.”

A FRUITFUL BUBJECT.

"Here Is a doctor who says that 
there arc plenty of people walking 
the streets who ought to be lu the 
asylum.”

“Of course, another veiled attack on 
congress.”

y Poor Job.
The Candidate (pnsnionalely)— 

Prom the day I was twelve I earned 
my own living! I owe no man a penoy. 
Gentlemen! ! made myself.

The Voice—Wull, you mude a  mis­
take—P. I. P.

Hie Guess.
“Bay, Bill, wol's a pedigree?”
“Bams as hydrophob). I guest.“ 
"Hydrophoby, nothin'! Vou'r* way 

off.”
"Well, It's aomeflo dogs have, any- 

f # ' "

Never Her.
“Why did you ask her age?” 
“Because 1 wanted to know how old 

she la.”
“Then ask her husband.”
“Bbo has nono.”
"Then ask her little brother”

(osklng the Vanquished. 
“What's the Crank bootblack rais­

ing such a fuvv .ibout?”
“lie claim* thut the Turk who runs 

the fruit stand should give him h 
dozen bununan and a sack of peanuts 
as a war indemnity.”

MODEST REQUEST.

Dot was an eccentric request you 
made of dat lady when ycr asked her 
to give ynr a smokin' Jacket wid trim­
mings. What did yer mean by 'trim­
mings, pal?” /

“Why, a pipe, a package or tobacco 
an' a box of matches.”

ERUPTION LIKE PIMPLES
Wathena, Kan.—"My child’s scalp 

trouble became eo bad that I was 
ashamed to have anyone see him. His 
head had a solid scab on I t  He also 
had a terrible breaking out on Uia face 
which was gradually growing worse. 
The eruption was like pimples which 
developed into sores when he scratch­
ed, which he did almost constantly. 
Haby would almost scratch himself 
raw.

“I had used several different kinds 
of salve, none of them helping in the 
least bit. when I saw the Cuticura ad­
vertisement In the paper and i t  made 
me think of tbe good results my sister 
had when she used it for her children. 
I had only used Cuticura Soap and 
Ointment about two weeks before I 
noticed that tbe sores were almost en­
tirely gone, and It must have been a 
month or six weeks he was troubled 
before I began tbe treatm ent He 
would get easy when I would pat the 
Cuticura Ointment on him. Cuticura 
Soap and Ointment completely cured 
him and he has a clear complexion 
now." (Signed) Mrs. W. H. Hughes, 
Dec. 31, 1911.

Cuticura Soap and Ointment sold 
throughout the world. Sample of each 
free, with 32-p. Skin Book. Address 
post-card "Cuticura, Dept. L, Boston.” 
Adr.

Literary Note.
Some authors remind you of Uncle 

Jim's poll parrot who got a reputation 
for being smart by using bad lan­
guage.

| Boosting a Mine.
'How's the sale of stock coming 

on?” inquired the first promoter.
“Sold 9,000 shares titi* morning," 

said the second promoter.
“That must mean a good deal of 

money.”
“AlraoRt (6. Come on, and I'll blow 

you to lunch.”

Those Perilous 'Buses.
Tho experts from tho National Phy­

sical laboratory who havo been asked 
to ascertain how far, If at all, tbe mo­
tor 'buses are endangering the stabil­
ity of St. Paul's cathedral, will have 
no simple task In apportioning to the 
‘buses their share in the tremors to 
which the cathedral Is said to be sub­
jected. But modem methods and 
measuring instruments are capable of 
some wonderful things.—Pall Mull Ga­
zette.

Alfonso Enjoys Reminders of Danger.
King Alfonso of Spain 1b said to be 

ft fulallst, and being of this temper 
he Is able to derive enjoyment from 
occurrence* that, would affright most 
people. A knife that he knocked out 
of the hamJt< of an assassin Is hung 
up in his den. The hides of two 
horse* killed In bomb explosions have 
been mudo into rug* for his cozy cor­
ner On bis wedding day an attempt 
war mud'- on his life, and the next 
day lie visited the spot and pointed 
out to his young wife the spot wbero 
the assHMSln stood.

STRENGTH
Without Overloading Ths Stomach.

The business man, especially, need* 
food in the morning that will not over­
load tho stutnacb, but give mental 
vigor for tbe day.

Much depends on tbe start a man 
gets each day, as to how be may ta­
ped to accompMrh Ibo work on band.

He can’t be alert, wltb a heavy, 
frled-meat-aiid-potatoss breakfast re­
quiring a lot of vital energy lo di­
gesting it.

A Calif, business man tried to flad 
some food combination Ibat would not 
overload tbe stomucb In tbe morning, 
but tbut would produce energy.

He writes;
"For years 1 was unable to find a 

breakfast food that bad nutrition 
enough to sustain a business man with­
out overloading bis stomach, causing 
indigestion and kindred ailments.

"Being a very busy snd also a very 
nervous man, I decided to give up 
breakfast altogether. But luckily I 
was induced to try Grape-Nuts.

"tilnce tbut morning I have been a 
new man; can work without tiring, 
my head Is clear and my nerve^strong 
and quiet.

"I find four teaspoonfuls of Grape- 
Nuts wltb one of sugar and a small 
quantity of cold tnilk, la delicious as 
tbe cereal part of the morning meal, 

| and invigorates me for tbe day's busl- 
• ness.” Name given by Postum Co., 

Battle Creek, Mich. Read the little 
book. "Tbo Road to Wellvllle,” In pkg*.

"There's a Henson.”
f ix e r  ren d  Ik *  a k o v e  l e t t e r !  A new  

« ■ *  app en r*  fr o m  t im e  t o  f la w . Tfcey 
■ r e  g e n u in e , tr u e , e a d  f u l l  0 t  k e r n e  a 
In tern et. A fv i

Neglected Opportunity.
Mrs. Crabshaw—I notice that a 

pouud of Swiss cheese seems to go 
further than a pound of any otlper 
kind.

Mr. Crabshaw—That's probably be­
cause the storekeepers haven’t yet hit 
on a plan to weigh In the holes.— 
Puck.

If a man was offered hla choice of 
famo or fortune, he'd take tho fortune 
and hope to acquire fame later.

rir.M  CURED IN 6 TO 14 DATS
will rwlund most? If PAZO Ol? 

nr cam o f Itoblar. Ml 
niewliosorl'rotnidlnfP|la*LB#toM4*j*. He.
Toprilnicftat >
MKNT fall* to car* »n

A young man should learn to pad­
dle his own canoe, even If his father 
does own a motor boat.

Nr*. Wlnalow’e  Soothing Syrup for Chi Id m i  
teetbiag, aofteo* tbe gutna, reltu-e* lafUmme- 
tlOD'AlUo'a peln.cur** wind colic  J6c a  bottleA*

A married actor doesn’t care for 
curtain calls at home.

While the way of the transgressor 
may be hard, it Is seldom lonesome.

To Women 
B ackache—Nervou* 7 

H ead ach e—B lue ?
I f  you suffer from rad), tymptom* s t  

trragultr interval* you should tax* *a 
invifforatin? tonic and womanly regu­
lator which ha* fiv * o  astiffsettoa for 
ovar 40 yean .

Dr'. P ie rc e1*
Favorite Pretcription

Ib d a  without Keobol—•  par* ste a r ic  
extract o f  American forw t root*. Your 
drugifct wUl supply yea.
I t  H u  G iven  S a tis fac tio n  F or 

O verdO Y M nl

FREE TO ALL SUFFERERS
If you fret "out o f  *orta,'-" fao dowB*‘or*,jtei the 
blu<M."auff«-r from htdo«r.bl*d^M rvoa*4(«au«4
cbrunlc wra*D*»ana, ukern,akin arupi!o**.FU**.*a, 
write for my VKHllboolt. i t la ib e a o a  iM fefp v e  
BMtlral book ever written. It tell* *11 aheet tbeae 
diaraan* and the r»>m»rtabl#eema e»*etedb;iteS*w  
rrem-li Itea^y^THBiUPIoV 
and you c*u daclde for yoareelf I f i l l*  the maedy 
your • ila e a u  Don't *e*4 * oeat. I t1* eeeel-* 
y u an . No "follow-ue“clrcu!*n. Dr.LwClere 
Co., H aver*lock  U 4 ,  H am p*

OVER 100 
VEAR8 OLD Pettit's Eve Salve
W. N. U., MILWAUKEE, NO. 11-19T&

ALCOHOL-8 PTR CENT
AVegctable Preps ration for As • 
similating thePoodandRegula* 
tmg the Stomachs and Bowels of

I n f a n i b : ( h i l u k i . n

Promotes D igestion,Cheerful­
ness and ResI.Conlains neither 
Opium.Morphine nor M ineral 
No t  N a r c o t i c

/!«,{* e tou  DrsimJEUtmm
PtUHfltt* JmJ  •

*

RnktiU Smftt •
A tm  S*td • 
ftotmiiU •
A'twjaeofc • 
hirai  Sttd  - 
ffanfwl Sttf*
Wmktfi*** Ft**er

Aperfecl Remedy forConstipa* 
lion. Sour Stomach,Diarrhoea, 
Worms .Convulsions .Feverish­
ness and LO SS OF SLEEP

Facsimile Signature ot
aCtf/zsfc

The Centaur Company.
N E W  Y O R K .

A t b . m u n l h Y  o l d
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CASTORIA
T o r In fa n ts  smd Children,

Ths Kind You Have 
Always Bought

B e a rs  th e  

S ig n a tu re  

o f

Guaranteed under the F o o d ij  

Exact Copy Of Wrappar.

For Oyer 
Thirty Years

CASTORIA
TIM MaTMt* tow ttM atvv.

RelievesNeuralgia
Sloan’s Liniment £ives instant relief from neuralgia or 

sciatica. I t  goes straight to the painful part — soothes the 
nerves and stops the pain. Don't rub—it penetrates.

PROOF
Man. Rudoi.vh Nisckk, Oconto,Wi*., w r i t e s “ I have used Sloaat 

Liniment for toothache and neuralgia In the head where nothing else would 
help me anti I would not be without the Liniment In the house.”

SLOANS
LINIMENT

is also good for rheumatism, sore throat, chest pains and sprains.

Palos AH Cod*
Mas. C. M. Dowkkb, of Johannesburg, Mich., 

writ#*;—“ I wiah to say your Liniment la the best 
tnedl' ltte In the world. It hat cured me of
neuralgia; those paLn* have *11 gone and I 
can truly say your Liniment did cure me.”

Fata A 0 C o m  *1
Ka. I. R, Swiaoxx, of u?  go. istb St* 

Louisville, Ky., wilteti—*r t  suffered with 
quite a severe neuralgic headache for four 
months without any relief. 1 used your 
Liniment for two or three nights and I 
haven’t suffered with mv bead since. I have 
found many quick reliefs from pain by the 
use of Sloan1* Liniment end believe It (o be 
the best Liniment on tbe market to-day. I 
can recommend it for what it did for me.**

Frio# Me., S0e., and $1jQ0 at il l Dealer*. 
Bend fer Sloee’s Free Seek oe lletees. Addrem

DR, EARL 5. SLOAN* 
Boston, Mass,

W . L. DOUGLAS
• 3 i 0 0  * 3 . 6 0  * 4 ^ 0

• 4 . . 5 0  AND * 6 : 2 2

8HOE8
FOR MEN AND WOMEN
t£ 8 f BOYS SHOES In tht W0BLD 

92.00, SA.60 and 99.00>
The largest makers of 
Men’s $340 end KOO 
1 shoes In the world,

A«k your d ea ler  Co a llow  you  
W, lu  JXMiylM 094)0 , 0 4 .00  an  

.oo a liw a . J o e l  na good  la  
a lv le , fit e n d  w ear  e e  o th er  m ake* c o a tin g  8 0 .0 0  

t o  D7UO— th e  o n ly  d ifferen ce  Is th e  price. 
Kline* In e ll  Iveth ere, t l y l e l  e n d  their** to  
atilt ev ery b o d y . I f  you cotfld  vlalt \V . L. 
D on gle*  ta rg e  feoterle*  e t  B ro ck to n ,

-  M u i . .m id  le e  fo r y en r* * lf  h o w  r e r e fu lly  
. I.. JJougle* IHOM a v e in e d e , yoa  w ou ld  th on  

u n d ertteu d  w hy t h e /  are w a rran ted  to  (It better , 
lo o k  to*ti*r^hvM  th e ir  shapo eu d  w ear  lo n g e r  th e n  
.  eu y  o th eri»* !< *  <*r th e  urloe.

BUose
wrywlur*, 
delivery 
rhaff** rwp*l4.

euy of her' i»*k* for tu* jtrloe
CAUTION 1 ■" “  w-u

t a k e  n o  s u b s t i t u t e
ffcitfylM thjw* *r* not fur *i 

vlftlliHv,write tV ^ ^ lf ta £ l* * ^ tn » r k t
If W L.

(1m name W
*t*ui|ift<l on tb* bottom.

■d* l a  i c a r  
to n , M m ,

JHo*. 
traiad

Meltotfe* 
Cataic

4
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IIS IMPULSIVE NOTE
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E S f a

© S o lv e d
•—solved ones 

(or all by Calomel. 
For dally oaa Id millions of kitcbeos hie 
proved that Calomel ia highest not only In 
Quality but In Uavtningpower as well—aq- 
(ailing ia results—pare to the extreme—tad 
wonderfully economical la tut. Ask your 
grocer. And try Calumet next bake day.

RECEIVED HIGHEST AWARDS

The Answer Was Hard to Get, 
but Then the Birds.

Sang On.

By WALTER J. DELANEY.
The young lawyer paused in his 

restless walk, and looked Irritably at 
the office door, as there was a low, 
hesitating knock. It might be a cli­
ent. Clyde Hlssell had found only 
threo within the two weeks since he 
had hung out his shingle. A few days 
previous he would have hailed the 
approach of a  prosperous litigant 
with eagerness. Now he shrugged his 
shoulders and looked annoyed.

He hud inherited a  fortune, but ho 
was umbitious. Thu one thought, 
when he proudly received his di­
ploma. was that he would win a high 
name by championing ever the cause 
Df the downtrodden and oppressed, 
but now—life had suddenly become 
dun and sere, and he had lost interest 
in everything. There was In Fair- 
view a certain lovely witch of seven­
teen, namely, Miss Viola Duncombc. 
For over a month ClydG had paid 
her marked attentions. Only four eve­
nings since he bad very nearly told 
hear the state of bis distracted feel­
ings. They were interrupted, but sure­
ly her heightened color evidenced 
that she understood him. The next 
day (Jlydp learned that Viola was 
about to depart on a long visit to a 
relative. He Impulsively sent her a 
little note, and It said: "May I hope 
to call upon you to tell you some­
thing you must surmise I left unfin-

Werld'e Pu ro 
P—4
CMeag*. III. 
PsrlcSip**< 
SM.PrMM. 
Mores.
ISIS.

You don't m m  money when pou k ig  
cheap o f blg-can baling powder. Don't 
be m ltlti. Buy Calumet. I t’t  mote 
economical— more wholetome— giou 
beetmuUt. Calumet It fa t tuperiot to 
tour mtUt and toda.

Crime Note.
First Small Town Police Official—A 

crook was Just In to get permission 
for a little criminal work tonight

Second Ditto—Yegg work?
Mint Small Town Police Official— 

Not much. Klrst-clana hold up by ihe 
original New York company.—Puck.

Last Extremity.
Clara—May 1 borrow your beaded 

belt, dear?
Hess—Certainly. But why ail tbli 

formality of asking permission?
“I can’t find 1L“—Smart Set.

WHEN BI'MIKR* UKCOMIO NKC'IMMAIIY 
an d  four olio.# uincb, Alien*# Fuot-Kso*, the 
A ntiseptic powder to Lm> shaken into lit* 
shore. )• Juei Hi. th in e  to  uee, Try it for 
B r.ak lrif  In New Shot*. Hold Everywhere, 
Ifrr Hempl* Kl'KK Addreee, A. H.
LeJtoy, N V, Don't nccepi fcny substitute. Adv.

Line on the Great Wrltere. 
Chaucer euys "do.” Mulory “avoid," 

Spenser “study," Kliah^speure “bo."— 
Ixwdou Athenaeum.

t»c. Pierce's t* lw *n l Pellets cure conMb 
eetlito. t^iihiljistloii Is the i'bumi of uisiiv 
dlMtsses. Curs tliM esuse slid yi*u curs lit* 
disease. ICssy to lake. Adv.

Truth muy be stranger than Ac­
tion, but the latter commands a high- 
or price hi the magazine field.

Only ( I I I .  "HltOMO QLINf
st Is I.AXAI'IVK UldtMO ................

fur Ills eigneOJM' "f N W. iflto 
is OUS Ih*r. t'UICB Ijflp IB 'J'WU

Ol'IMINS. JxxjS
>va Cue-1 S (ul3  

nsiters, ftr.

It makes a tuun feel good when he 
Is pretty certain be is go lug to uilss a 
train aud doesn't.

Tbs office hunter doesn’t pay uny 
attention to game laws.

M Q X f £
twltmum

(for SO yesrs) 
iss cared for 

tl>« sick and 
convalescent,

_  those sent by
*  family physicians for rest, baths and elec­

trical treatments. No hospital sir obi rude*. One 
geta well under (he ndvice of one’s own physU Ian 
apoperitlflS with the medical manager# of Ihe 
Xure." very moderate inclusive charges per 
week. For booklet address 
T bs Penooyar Sanitarium. Reseslu, Wbcoasie

140EGG $ r 5 ( l
INCUBATOR 0 -

fc**.**.
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THOMPSON * ITANtfT QO. f  wilts. Win

Letter? Miss Duncombe!” Ex­
claimed Clyde.

•bed the other evening?" No re­
sponse came, and the days grew 
dreary and the uighta sleepless,

“Como In!" ordered the young law­
yer sharply. The door moved, open­
ed a crack, was closed to again, and 
Clyde fancied he caught a vague snif­
fling sound. He pulled the door open 
wratbily, and confronted a small boy 
with traces of tears in his eyes.

“Well, what do you want?" rather 
uugraclously demanded the disturbed 
young man.

“Please, sir, are you Mr. Bissell, 
the lawyer?" faltered the little fel­
low.

"Yes—who are you?” demanded 
Clyde.

"Pm Mrs. Wood's boy." explained 
Ihe urchin, and be begun to cry. “My 
rna said I'd got to see you—that Is, 
look for the loiter first and then como 
and tell you If 1 found It, and If 1 
didn't find it to toll you all about 
It."

“See here," spoke Clyde impatient­
ly, “bow am I Interested?"

“Why. some one guve mo a nickel 
to fetch a letter to you. As I was 
crossing the school lot Hilly Norton 
chased me. I got away from him, but 
then I found Pd lost the letter. Then 
t made up my mind not to say any­
thing about I t  Miss Duncombe came 
over to the bouse today to bid me 
goodby, and they got asking mo about 
(bo letter, fcnd I (old. I wont up to 
(ho big lot to look for It again, but 
Hilly was there, and I was scared, and 
so--*o 1 came to you," and Mrs. 
Wood's boy broke down with a 
wall.

"A letter? Miss Buncombe?" ex­
claimed Clyde, mightily aroused. 
'What did Miss Duncombn have to do 
with It all?"

“Why, she sent It, don't you see— 
II was her letter that I lost."

Clyde wsk dazzled, then confused, 
then roused to Intense excitement. 
He made a grab for tlie terrified vis­
itor and ruHhed him to the street.

“Young tnuti.” he ordered stern­
ly und breathlessly, “you lead me 
quick as you can to wbero you lost 
that letter." “Viola answered my 
note!" he told himself raptly—“three 
days ago. 1 must find that letter If It 
costs me a  thousand dollars!"

"There's the place whore I lost the 
letter," announced Clyde's guide 
finally, pausing at the edge of the 
school lot. Immediately a lad with 
the face of a bully made a dash for 
them, leaving a crowd flying a kite. 
Then be halted, observing the Wood 
boy's companion.

"Bee here/* spoke the young law­
yer. “have you or your crowd seen 
anything of a letter around here? One 
was lost. Pll give five dollars to 
whoever finds It."

'You will!" cried Hilly Norton ex- 
Hcdly "tiny, mister, was It a fiat lit­

tle envelope? Smelled of musk?”
“I don’t know. I shouldn’t wonder," 

said Clyde vaguely.
“I just found one,” explained Hilly. 

We were looking for a piece of paper 
to make a 'messenger’ of, to send 
up on the kite. See, tbero it goes 
whizzing up the string."

It had been several years since 
Clyde had sailed a kite. He knew 

| what a “messenger” wan, though, ail 
I right. Many a card had be punctured.
| run the string through it and watch­

ed it gyrate like a top up huudreds of 
yards of string.

Hilly gaped at the young man as 
ho made a dash for the group near by. 
Clyde seized tho string to pull in the 
kite. It dived.

“Mister, mister, it’ll break loose if 
you do that!" shouted half n dozen 
voices.

Twang! With a snap the frail cable 
parted.

“Broke loose! Whoop! after it!" 
aroso tumultuous voices. Dashing 
away, the young lawyer cut astruugo 
figure leading a mob of flying boys

Twice be stumbled, once falling. 
People stured at him as he tore 
across tho road. Tho kite mndc a 
final dive and lunded on the roof of 
au old ruin of & barn.

A woman at the door of a houso 
near by Bcreamed hysterically as 
Clyde seized a ladder at the door­
step. Her husband came running 
out with a  gun. Heedles of every­
thing save that precious letter, Clyde 
placed the ladder against tho eaves 
of the barn. Their rotted ends broke 
away like punk, but he ran up the 
ladder, crept across the mouldering 
shingles, and reached the kite.

“Got It —at last!" he gn6ped joy­
fully, as he tore tho coveted “mes­
senger'’ from the string—“the mis­
chief!"

Under bis weight the flimsy roof 
bent In like a piece of rubber. His 
clothes caught on a score of nails. 
Illp-snlp-tear! Clyde rolled a foot, 
a cloud of dust covering him. A big 
spike ripped one sleeve from end to 
end. Clyde dropped to the ground.

He was a  doleful sight—smudged, 
perspiring, In tatters—but he laugh­
ed, gaily, exultantly—he had the let­
ter!

“Why, Mr. Hlssell!" exclaimed a 
surprised voice as he came out on the 
road—that of Viola herself, halting 
the automobile she drove and stared, 
startled but amused. “What has hap­
pened?"

“This!" replied tho young lawyer, 
promptly, desperately—"a lost letter."

“Oh, dear!" and Viola flushed all 
over her fair face. “I—that Is—
shall I not take you home?”

She made room for him. Hut the 
shy miss did not start the machine 
vlllageward. She took the quiet, beau­
tiful brookslde road, canopied over 
with arching trees, and lined with 
radiant flowers, and with singing 
birds all about them. The auto went 
slower and slower, and stopped In 
a  lovely nest of greenery.

Viola regarded her prince la tat­
ters archly as he told bis story. A 
smile—she could not help It—min­
gled with the lovellght in her gentle 
eyes.

“Shall I open the letter?" Inquired 
Clyde. w

“Hut It is too late to come now, as 
I asked you," she suid, dropping her 
glaitce.

“Oh, then you asked me to como!" 
cried her lover, in a tone like a 
cheer. “It was to tell you uoraothing. 
Shall I tell it now, here—how much 
I love you?"

He took silence for assent—such 
nweet, mod'-nt. inviting silence, In­
deed! and the birds sang on. and tho 
flowers appeared to nod blessings to­
wards them, and all the good, happy 
world seemed young.

(C opyrigh t, 1W3, b y  W . 0 .  C hapm an.)

Wicked Cost of Cheap Beauty.
A newspuper picture of u music bull 

dancer, accompanying an article in 
which she is supposed to toil how to 
become beautiful, sbjws her wearing a 
headdress of aigrettes und southed in 
white furs, other details of her cos­
tume being lost In the blur of ink. In 
England, where algrqtteu are known 
as the "white badge of cruelly," the 
sale of those plumes Is forbidden by 
law, and similar statutes huve been 
enacted In several American states. 
The reason Is that these plumes of the 
female heron can be taken most reud- 
lly during the breeding season, and 
when the mother has been slain for 
the sake of this omnment, the young 
perish from starvation. Tho destruc­
tion of dozens of mother In rom and 
the slaw torture of their broods must 
huve been required for Ibis particular 
beuddrexs, und u score of ermine*, 
would be ueeded to muke a wrap of 
the generous proj*ortlons portray'd. 
Quito aside from the market value of 
tlio plumes of difud birds und the skhix 
of dead animals, the young woimin bus 
paid a high price for her beauty, aud) 
us It Is.—New York Evening PosL

On Solitude.
There can be no very black mclun- 

choly to him who lives lu the midst of 
Nature and has bis senses still. There 
was never yet such a storm hut it was 
Aeolian music to a healthy und inno­
cent ear. Nothing can lightly comp'd 
a simple brave men to a vulgar sad 
ness. While 1 enjoy the fdcudtthlp of 
the seasons 1 trust that nothing can 
make life a burden to me. The gentle 
rain which waters my beans and keeps 
me In the bouse today Is not dread 
and melancholy, but good for me, too. 
Though It prevents my booing them, It 
Is of far more worth than my hot lna. 
If It should continue so long us to 
cause the seeds to rot In tbo low lands 
it would sttll be good for the groin 
on the uplands, and, being good for 
the grass, It would be good for me.— 
From Henry David Tborcuu’s tw o) 
on "Solitude."

Make ihe Horse Glad 
and Eager for Work
CHp him before you pat him st tbo sprite work. 

Take off bli witter cost that bold* Ihe » tl
eweatsnddlrt. He'll get Diorr «
Coed, look better, rest better sad fire  you bet- 
torserfleelsorery way.

et Dion* food from ble 
sc ire .

t:in't buy say but

HioiTsWeo tltth

The Stewart Ball Blaring 
’ Clipping Maohine

tbs machine that turn* coaler, etlpa tutor sad 
lelooerood »Ura»h*rplom;jr than any other. 
Oesnaresll flle hard end nit from oolld etoel 

bar. Gears encioeed. protected and run la oil. 
tlttiofr1etton,lltnewi«r. llaa Hi feet «f oewetyie, owy rue

EASY ACTION nlnr flealt>'e*b»ft and Mtewort elaf le trnelon '-lipping brad.

PRICE

IrtSM fren 
yssrdeiler 

m 4 ra Mem­
ber evert 
aaoNnt la 

lolly
tm nsttei.

&

Galvanic 
Soap is ^  
Known as

Free Free
Six Genuine Rogers Silver 

Teaspoons for only 100 
Galvanic Soap Wrap­
pers or coupons from 
Johnson's Washing 

Powder.

Here is the O ffer
For each teaspoon desired send 
us one two-cent stamp and
tvemy Cstvioic Soap wrapper* (from 
pearl oaiy) or coupon* Irea John* 
eoo’l Wuhlnt Powder.

JV'--

“The Famous 
Easy WasherM

It's a white Soap 
and the cocoanut 
oil in it makes it 
the easiest lathering 
soap on the market. 
Test it out your 
next wash day and 
d o n ' t  f o r g e t  to 
save the wrappers.

Special Offer for 
Six Teaspoons

Send 100 Galrulc Soap 
wrapper! and S 2-ceat 
Strap* to pay poMOfcs 
we will tend you a 
•ct o< ali teaipooas 

ABSOLUTELY 
KREB.

Mail them to the 
Premium Department of

B. J. JOHNSON SOAP CO., Milwaukee, Wisconsin

Actual
Spoon gcgslar 

f-ls. laagtb

These tea­
spoons are 
th e  k ind

that you’ll be 
proud to own. 

They are the gen-. 
uine lStl Rogers 
ware, heavily triple- 

plated silver on a 
white metal base. The 
pattern is the famous 
La Vignc, or Grape, 
with the beautiful 
French Gray finish. 
With ordinary wear 
these spoons will last a 
life time. Start aarlnr your 
wrapper* today, or better (till 

boy a boi of U»1»m1c ud you'll bare ICO 
wrapper*. ju*t etweeb for a *et of ipvrtu.

For PINK EYE

CANADA'S GUERINS 
TO THE SETTLER ;

THE AMERICAN RUSH TO: 
WESTERN CANADA 

IS INCREASINB
F r e e  H o m e s te a d *  
In the new Dlnirleta of 
Mniiliribs, Baakslcho- 
wan and Albert* Ibora 
nrn iboiuanda of Yf** 
Ili.mcM*ed« left, wble'i 
to t hr raiameklafCM-r 
In 3 /ears u m  fU ) be 
worth fn>m M  toJAV-r 
arro. Tbe*# l u d i ’arr 
well adeptoA W fralu 

m ins and rauT* (Suing. 
BXOfLUST BitLWlT PiCSUIIM 

In rosny ra**f tho rallwsSa in 
Canada barn bo*o ball* m >4 
▼anca «f Hv'ileaoni. sod IS *  
abort llran there will not bo e  

tb s i

f railway. Hallway Rate# sr* 
rgulateaby UuT*rmnont Coca- 
j baton.

aattlerwbo need ba more , 
ten ortwnlT* mile* (mm e lie* 
ufrallwa 
rn 
lu

fto rle l Condition*
TTw* American RetUorlaatbocao 
In Western Canada, f la la q o ie  
•trengrr In satranfo load, hay­
ing nearly a  inilllon uf hi* owj» 

ir (ruled there. | i  
enow wny\

poupin alresd
Jou drat re to anuw wnyTbeon- 

Ulno of tbo Canadlao SelUerTs
im»prroue write and eeod for 
te n u re ,  rate*, tlo., to

GEO. A. HALL 
123 2nd Street. MHwsuk**. Wit 
Canadian Government AgenCor 
addrcoa B up o rln ten d en t of 
lln in rlg ra tto ri, O tta w a , CaaoU-

JO H N  L.THO M PSON  hONHACO^Troy

BOY
OR MAH wanted to tack apalgnilm  
yonr neighborhood. Rand name oo4 
eddreaa for particular*. Good pay. 
A. U. J . Itox ISS2. Philadelphia. Pe.

Automatic leader, •irrc fee r. H  feed h t <iA  
re s  yield Inriraaed 40%. Agonta soil on eight 
for • J.60. 1100 week really made. Ea-'luely#
ter. rn ru irra ' Specially Co., Iowa City. leer*.

Iluturi of CQCC Booklet Florida loduatrlre, Me- 
Florida rnCLAi.ru I'ub. Co., Jacksonville. Flat

Woeted Mao. raferenrea, to te p rrw n l atrong rra lt*  
tloSk, bond buuae. iw vtroa atcartU ^i«,,*«a^<otto,flL

Milwaukee D irectory

DISTF*1PER 
CATARRHS!. FtVCR 
AND ALL NOtaC 
AND THROAT DISI.ftSTfi Wisconsin Pharmacal Co

Meat Economical 
osd E f f e c t i v o  
Remedy, fe  Self- 
aealisl boieo.coo- 
vealeot to handle. 
At oil druUial*. 
IS . 2 5  aod 75c. 
M a n u fa ctu rers  
M M w eukee.W le

Cures the tick and se ts a* a  preventive for others. Liquid given on the 
tongue. Safe for brood msree and all other*. Beet kidney remedy; 50c and 
•I a  bottle; 15 Wnd 110 a  doien. Sold by ull druggist* ur.d horse good* 
houses, or.sent, express paid, by the manufacturers.

S P O H N  M E D IC A L  C O ., C h e r a l f t f s .  G O S H E N , IN D IA N A

3 5  YE.ARS UNRIVALED SUCCESS 
IN CURING T H E  LIQUOR HABIT

THE KEELEY INSTITUTE
THE ONLYKEEIEY INSTITUTE IN WISCONSIN. WAUKESHA,WISCONSIN

WHY INCUBATOR CHICKS DIE W rite for book anvlitg young i-hh’kH. Hem] uu i 
tiaiitr- of 7 frl.-mln llio t o»e un ii'niturs uml gi-t ' 
Ui'il: flee. Unuedy <hi., Uliwkwell.tiUlu. J

R U PTU R E
NO CURE -  NO PAY

N o cutting. No 
pain. No loss of 
tim e  from  y o u r  
work. Examination 
Free. 36 years In 
Milwaukee. 3,000 
cured patients In 
Wisconsin.

D r . W h e e l e r ,  4 0 9  Mstlbews 0M q., 
Carocr 3rd sod Grand Aveaue. Mllsraakse. WU. 
W R IT E  — C U R E  G U A R A N T E E D

i

r
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Covers 30 blocks, comprises scores of monumental structures, with 33 miles of tracks underneath.

New Grand Central Terminal
A  w onderfu l c ity , w ith in  a city, b u ilt for the  
com fort and convenience of the traveling  public .

The main Grand Central Tcr- 
miual Building in New York if 
now open to the public. This 
vast improvement if more than a 
great railway Terminal—it is i  
Terminal City,complete in itself, 
providing every detail essentia! 
to comfort and convenience.

It will embrare convention, 
amusement and exhibition halls, 
hotels,dubs and restaurants;post 
office, express offices, modern 
apartment and office buildings, 
and numerous stored and spe­
cialty shops.

Grand Central Terminal it the 
Heart of New York. At Forty- 
second St. and Park Ave. (Fourth

Ave.),o»e block from Fifth Ave. 
and convenient to Broadway,

It is the only Terminal on ali 
lines of localtraffic subway,sur­
face and elevated. More than 
7,000 cars pass its doors every 
day, affording easy transit facil­
ities to any part of Greater New 
York. Around it, and within 
a radius of a few blocks, are 
forty*nine hotels, fifty-eight 
clubs and thirty-five theatres.

Three new lines of under­
ground transportation are now 
building to Grand Central Ter­
minal, and soon there will he 
•ix levels for human traffic in 
Forty-fecond Street.

U nderneath the T  erminal City 
and its streets are 33 miles of rail­
way tracks on two separate levels, 
the upper for Through Service, 
the lower for Suburban Service.

Kach level forrnta complete ter­
minal in iuelf, separate entrances 
and exits, with equal facilities 
for the comfort of passengers.

Both levels are reached by 
gently inclined walks. No vtair 
climbing, and no confusion, 
since incoming and outgoing 
traffic is separated.

Ticket, Pullman, Baggage and 
other facilities are progressively 
arranged from waiting room to 
train, no step need be retraced.

Plan your trip East over the New York Central Lines; enjoy restful sleep on the 
“  Water Level Route,”  three hours of picturesque grandeur along the hi»toric Hudson and enter

The Heart of New York City
ftOMB FEATURES OF GRAND 
CENTRAL TERMINAL-THE 
LARGEST RAILWAY TEMINAL 

IN THE WORLD.

Atea 10 blocks, thro* tlmo« ta rtar tbao
anr other Terminal. Eicavatlon, 3,095.000 
cubic rarda, imHhlrde *olid rock. S litj- 
•oven iracks on two Uvole, a c iro ra tlo t}) 
tulle*. Five mil** of p sm n fe r  platforms, 
level with tho car Soon. Eight hundred 
train* in tod  oat of lorniiaal everr dag. 
Fateongera bandlod aonoallg. approtl- 
maielr, 15.ooo.a4 . Thlrff ibouisnd povpt* 
nr* sccouiinodstid at on# tiao .

, NEW YORK .
C e n t r a l
11 LINES ‘

u Water Level Route”

SOME FKATUkES OF GRAND 
CENTRAL TERMINAL — UN- 
SURPASSED IN t ’SLI'ULNEbH 

'10 THE 1't HUG

Direct antran^o to subway* tor NatvY .rk 
•fid Long Island. 54 elevators foi 
gerl, mall, higgafe and eipreei. *B ticket 
window* C(fii»enientlr located lu coocour-.e. 
T all cabs and motor buteoe right under 
terminal roof. Women's private menicuie, 
half df*«*lng, and real room*. Retla'irani 
and lunch room* with unique vauiied red- 
lug Complete * ,•(#» of pagiu* —fiiend* 
are quickig located.
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ROTECT_Yoihr; 
Family 

a Ban ic  
Account

TH E

Negaunee Stale Bank
Commercial and 
Savings Bank.

—It's  warming up nicely.

—Be sure and vote YES on the fire* 
men’s pension amendment.

—Monday, April 14th, will be The 
Cleveland-Cllffs Iron Company’s pay* 
day.

—An important meeting of the Ne­
gaunee nest of Owls was held Wed­
nesday evening.

—A class of ten candidates were Ini­
tiated into the Negaunee lodge of Elks 
Wednesday evening.

—A regular meeting of the local 
Chevaliers de Lafayette Society will 
be held next Sunday, at 1:30 p. to.

—The less there is In a balloon the 
smaller If gets, and the less there la­
in a man’s head the larger it gets.

—A dance is to be given at the La­
bor Temple to-morrow evtning and a 
good time is assured all those who at­
tend.

—From present appearances there 
seems to be no hopes of reviving the 
Marquette-Delta County Baseball 
League,

—Any relatives or friends going 
away or comlog to visit? Tell us. 
No charge. The Iron Herald wel­
comes news items.

—Register to-morrow,

—Election next Monday.

-Y o u
vote.

will have eight ballots to

—Don’t forget the Republican 6tate 
officers.

—A new rock crusher plant is to be 
built by the city.

—Say, Mr. Business Man, let us 
print your office stationery.

—If you are not registered, see that 
your name is properly inscribed on 
tbe books to-morrow.

%  INTEREST ON DEPOSITS.
$1.00—Opens an Account—$1.00

ASK FOR ONE OF OUR

I R o m e  S a v in g s  B a n k s .

|  THESE BANKS LOANED TO DEPOSITORS.
♦
♦
♦
:
♦
♦

Y o u  

s p e c t

a r e c o r d i a l l y  i n v i t e d  t o  i n -  

o u r  r \ e w  B a n k  b u i l d i n g *

—A pond of water now dlls the 
space occupied by the municipal ice 
rink that bad been the scene of many 
a pleasant time tbe past winter.

Charged with selling liquor to a 
“ posted”  mao Chris Johnson, the Iron 
street saloon-keeper, has been bound 
over for trial to the circuit court.

—Oral LaCombe, Jr., is fitting up 
his shoeshining quarters adjoining 
Cheap Joe’s store and will soon bf in 
readiness to "shine-em-up”  in his 
usual satisfactory manner,

—A carload of horses were received 
here Tuesday from Ely, Minn., which 
will be employed in the construction 
work of the branch railway to tbe 
Volunteer mine by the Wick-O’Con- 
nell Company.

—The annual reunion of the Sons 
of St. George will be held in Hancock 
this year on July 17,18 and 19.

—Michael Harrington, a resident of 
lshpeming for the past forty years, 
died last Saturday, aged sixty years.

—Peterson A Willers, merchant 
tailors, have placed a new awning in 
front of their place of business in Iron 
street.

—With eight separate and distinct 
ballots to be voted tbe election to be 
held next Monday Is to be some elec­
tion, believe me.

—The women of tbe Mitchell Metho­
dist Episcopal church will conduct a 
bazaar in the church parlors on elec­
tion day—next Monday—and desire 
tbeir friends to bear this fact io mind.

Choose Affirmative Side

The Houghton high school has cho­
sen tbe affirmative side of tbe question 
"Resolved—That all elective aod ap­
pointive official* should be subject to 
recall’1 which was selected by tbe Ne­
gaunee school as tbe subject for the 
joint debate to be held at tbe Hough­
ton high school assembly room oo tbe 
evening of May 8.

Tbe Houghton team will be selected 
from those taking part in tbe high 
school debating society’s program 
aod trv-outs will be held early next 
month,—Calumet News.

—Bo sure and vote YES on tbe fire­
men’s pension amendment.

Enjoyed Themselves

Tbe delegation of Negaunee mem 
bers of the Knigbts of Columbus who 
attended tbe initiation aod banquet 
at Marquette last Sunday returned 
much pleased with the doings cf the 
day. It was one of tbe largest gatb 
erlngs^f Knigbts that has ever been 
held in the Upper Peninsula. It Is 
estimated that over six hundred mem 
bers were present.

Baked Goods on Sale

Mrs, C. V’, It. Townsend's class In 
Ml. John's Sunday School will have a 
pantry sale at the borne of Mrs. Town­
send, Main street und MueKonzle av­
enue, Saturday afternoon, the pro­
ceeds of which) will go to the guild 
hall fund. A variety of baked articles 
will be on sale und tea and coffee will 
be served between the hours of 3 and 6 
P

Not a Candidate

A campaign rumor is in circulation 
to the effect that one of the motives 
which Inspired the cuudiducy of Rob­
ert O. Jackson for alderman from the 
Fourth ward is u desire to secure tbe 
appointment of his daughter, Miss 
Mubul Jackson, as city librarian. It 
U authoritatively stated that Mr. 
Jaukson had nothing of this sort in 
mind; that Miss Jackson is not a can­
didate for this nor any other munici­
pal appointment, her time being fully 
and profitably taken up by her con­
fectionery store: and that, In case sho 
did desire to make a change, she has 

.offers of more lucrative and congenial 
^employment than that of city Ubrarlun. 

-  - ■■<
The Right of W ar

Has to bo given HAUVFLL’8 CON­
DITION POWDER, which for over 
seventy years hus been the standard 
of excellence. Why? Because the in­
gredients are so well bulunccd thut 
•Very particle of the powder performs 
its proper share In Ibowork of restor­
ing healthy conditions In your stock. 
P u t It in tuc feed and note how they 
will improve In tlesh and spirits under 
its influence, Price 26 cts. per pack­
age. Hold by J. E  O’Donoghue, City 
Drug 8 tore.

Important Meeting

The local division of Hibernians 
will hold a regular meeting at their 
ball on Sunday, April 27th. As a 
question of considerably Importance 
to each aud every member will be up 
for discussion, it Is earnestly hoped 
that there will be a full attendance of 
all members. The meeting will be 
called to order at 2:39 p. m.

FOR SALE.—10 lots in New 8woo- 
zy at $40 each. Lots are large, being 
60x142. and front io streets that are 
60 feet wide.

E, W. ADAMS,
27tf Kirkwood Block

—Members of the Negaunee High 
School Alumni defeated the high 
school team In a game of basketball 
played at the gymnasium last Friday 
evening by a score of 30 to 12. A 
dance followed the game.

—The new furniture and fixtures 
for tbe Elks’ new lodge room in tbe 
PerkinB’ block have been placed In 
position and the members now pride 
themselves as having one of the neat­
est lodge rooms in the county.

—Mr. and Mrs. Peter Barasa are 
receiving tbe congratulations of 
friends over tbe arrival of aten-pound 
baby girl at tbeir home last Saturday 
night. You’ll have to travel some If 
you wish to find a happier man than 
Peter is at the present time.

—Don’t for a moment run away with 
tbe idea that because a man falls to 
enthuse over you as a candidate for 
a certain office he is your enemy 
Not by a jug full. He may admire 
you as a neighbor and frieod and yet 
be fully conscious of tbe fact that 
you would make a d—d poor official.

—Woman suffrage comes up again 
next Monday, and if expressions heard 
mean anything the vote In favor of 
tbe proposition will be very much 
smaller than last fall, proportionately 
to tbe total vote cast. There are a 
whole lot of womeo who are not clam 
oring for tbe privilege of getting into 
politics.

WOMEN WANTKD-to sell reli­
able remedy. Big profits. Box 1, 
Goshen, Ind. •

You Work Hard
for your money, why not put some of it at 

. work for you?

By adjusting living expenses so that the , 
SAVINGS FUND will get its share you will 
build a surplus that will, in time, pay you 
a nice income.

If Why not start NOW to CRE­
ATE A SURPLUS at this bank?
Interest paid on your deposits will 
help wonderfully in doing so.

25 FIRST NATIONAL BANK
NEGAUNEE, MICHIGAN.

Capital and Surplus - $200,000.00

THIS BANK WELCOMES SAVINGS DEPOSITS 
, OF ONE DOLLAR OR MORE.

A. MAITLAND, President 
T. C. YATES, Cashier

GEO. J. MAAS, Vice-President 
JOHN J. BELDO, Asst. Cashier

DEPOSITS ACCEPTED BY MAIL.

Michigan “40”
Lord Nelson Lodge

The Order of the Sods of St. George 
at (roc River has effected its formal 
organization by electing the following 
officers:

President—J. H Palglase 
Vice President—W. J. Walters 
Secretary—Vivian Slcemao 
Ass't-Secretary—Edward Jsraes 
Treasurer—W. H. Bengry, Sr. 
Messenger—Albert Collins 
Ass’t Messenger—W. H. Bengry, J r  
Chaplain—J. S. Goodoey 
The New lodge will be known as 

Lord Nelsoo Lodge No. 619 and starts 
out wltb twenty-four members.

Designed by Cameron 
Body by Campbell 

Four Forward Speeds

Electric Lights 
Oversize Tires 

$1,585 Equipped

Now on Show.

Quinn Wins Suit

John II. Quinn, of lshpeming, has 
been victorious in his long litigation 
with William J. Tutly, of Iron River, 
over the llouliban and other mineral 
properties on the Menominee range. 
The supreme court has reversed the 
decree of the circuit court, and order­
ed entered a decree in favor of the 
oompluinant, Quinn, with provision 
determining the rights of tbe respect­
ive parties together wltb a full ac­
counting to Mr. Qulon and an award 
to him of the costs In both courts. Tbe 
litigation grew out of options upon 
mineral lands on tbe Menominee 
range and the case has been closely 
followed by mining men throughout 
tbe Lako Superior district.

Look to Your Plumbing 
You koow what happens in a house 

n which the plumbing is in poor con­
dition—everybody In the bouse is lia­
ble to contract typhoid or some other 
fever. Thu digestive organs perform 
tbe same functions in tho human body 
as tbe plumbing does for the house, 
and they *houla»be kept in first class 
oondltloo all tbe time. If you have 
any trouble wltb your digestion take 
Chamberlain’s Tablets and you are 
certalo to get quick relief. For sale 
by J. E. O’Donoghue.

Tbe Michigan "40” this year 
outbids every rival. A ndtbccar 
which results is one of the finest 
creations ever seen in this city,

Tbe designer is W. H. Camer­
on who has built nearly 10,000 
very successful cars.

The body is designed by John 
A. Campbell, tbe world’s great­
est body designer.

Tbe ear has four forward 
speeds, electric lights, tires 
36x41. The body is finished in 
22 coats. The seats have 14-lnch 
cushions, y

Here is the very last word In 
motor-enrdcsigning—a oar which 
masters have spent four years in 
perfecting. And it aull* equip­
ped for 11,686—a price never ap- 
proaccd by any car in this clasN.

T h e  “ 4 0 ”  W a r
There is a bitter war in ex­

istence now between 40-horse-

[>ower cars. It is known as tbe 
Fight of the Forties.

There are 72 makers in it, each 
trying to outdo the others. And 
prices on Forties, since this war 
begno, have been squarely cut In 
two.

You can get more for your 
money In a "40” this year than 
In any other class of car. But 
tbe Michigan "40” offers more 
than all others, according to 
hundreds of experts.

T o o k  4  Y o u  r9

Some of the greatest of experts 
have spent four years on this 
car. They have pul out In their 
testing 6,000 car*. They have 
worked out 800 Improvements.

The car that results is a car 
well worth seeing. Come, let us 
show It to you.

LATENT MODELS.

Sturgis
Luxury
Carriages

No. 4 4 4

Nickel trimmed, Reed 
s o l i d  side Collapsi­
ble Carriage, equipp­
ed with Luxury Back, 
all Steel Frame, Tubu­
lar Pusher, Rosewood 
Handle.

•14.00

J. D, SAWBRIDGE
H ardware mi Furniture

44T A B U 8H K D  1474.

m

THOMAS P. KIRKWOOD, Agent
NEGAUNEE, MICH.

Every Garm ent Perfect
Or as nearly as anything can well be in this 
world. One poorly made, poorly fitting 
garment does more to tear down one's 
business than a dozen perfect ones can do 

• to build it up. We have never made an 
overcoat, top coat or suit that was not per­
fectly tailored; that is why people place the 
utmost confidence in our ability as tailors.
We can make your clothes at any price and 
you get the best value for your money.

| H .  J . P E T E R S O N

L

JOSEPH. H. PRIMEAU, Jr.,

At t o k n k y -a t - L a w ,

NEGAUNEE. • MICHIGAN.
Both Khoow.

Keb. 28- - A|»rll 4
Notice for Publication.

DEPARTMENT OK THE INTERIOR,
0. H. Laud Office ut Marmwiu1, Midi,

Keb. to. Im .
Notice Is lmf**byglvwi tlmt Unvuw Roberto,

i. M left I .....................
VM

4.1 N\ Rang* sfo W., Mid>lgau Meridian, ha*

of Princeton. Michigan, wliu, on Murdt 6. IWU, 
mH'le RometUaui Knlry, No. (JIHU, (or EV4 ot 
NK‘* and N Wfe uf NK!*, hectluu 8, TowumIiIjj

filed notice of Inleutlun to make Commutation 
Proof, to etilabiidi claim to the lumi above 
rimteritod, before the Register and Receiver of
u. m. ; —..................................
the tttl) day

ilalmaut nom ei u  whneMea;

U. H, Laud Office, at Mai<juetle, Michigan, on 
wNtbd 
Claim*____
James Miller, of Krlooetoo. Midi.; James 

Battoul, of Negaunee. Midi ; John Pohimen. of 
Princeton, Midi.; Frank Vercelllno, of Owluu.
Mich.

OZ&O A. BOWKS, Register.

-----OO TO-----

THE NECAUNEE BAKERY
And get some of our GOOD 
H R  1C A D , We sell the

L A K G E H T L O A F
for the small price of 6 cent*.

And say, try Home of our G hahhcini 
or JIkkau Hthawh.

Have you tried our good Doughnuts?

CAKKS, JKLLY ROLLS AND 
OOOKIFS HAKKD DAILY.

Cuff or mite at M , PJOMSJCU A VJS

JOHN LISA, Prop*r,

Olir Electric Service isatyourcom“ and24h° urseachday“ d 7 .days M arquette C ountyevery week. Try it, you will be pleased. Both Phones. G as A E lectric  C o.


