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PERSONAL PARAGRAPHS 
ABOUT FOLK YOU KNOW.

Barn and Horse Burned

Fire broke out io the barn of Oliver 
Pleau, located east of the city rock 
crusher, shortly after 1 o’clock last 
Saturday morning and had gained 
such headway before being discovered 
that the structure was totally destroyed 
together with Mr. Pleau's dray 
horse and other contents. The fire* 
men responded promptly and tbelr 
presence saved the residence property 
from destruction. The fire is thought 
to have been of inceodiary origin.

Attorney Thoren 111

Attorney Theodore A. Thoren, who 
had been attending the term of circuit 
court at Marquette, suddenly became 
ill with nose bleed Monday fevenlog, 
and as it was found that an artery had 
been ruptured be went to St. Mary’s 
hospital. It proved considerable of 
an effort to check the flow of blood, 
uod the consequent weakness made It 
advisable for Mr. Thoren to remain 
in the hospital for several days. 
Mr. Thoren’s wife and brothers, 
Charles and Titus, paid him a visit 
yesterday and found him getting 
along very nicely and In hopes to be 
permitted to return home before Sun­
day. _________

Played Good Ball

The Negaunee High School basket­
ball team failed to capture a prize at 
the Upper Peninsula tournament at 
Isbpeming last Friday and Saturday. 
They played good ball, however, and 
made an excellent showing in the 
games they participated in. The 
team captured the first contest from 
the crack Crystal Falls team and lost 
out in the second contest with Han­
cock by a very close margin. In this 
game Negaunee led all the way 
through the first half and was tied 
with Hancock at the end of the sec­
ond half.

Calumet Y took first prize, Isbpem- 
log Highs second and Marquette K. 
of K. A. third prize. The tournament 
was a success and there was a large 
attendance at all the sessions.

Negaunee and Marquette highs will 
play their second oCa series of sched­
uled games at the high school gymna­
sium in this city this (Friday) evening 
and tbelr should be a good attendance 
to encourage the local lads.

Plans for Palmer Store

Andrew Lindquist bas been commis­
sioned to prepare tbe plans for the 
building which Harry Davidson is to 
erect to replace tbe building of the 
Puimer Store Company wblcb was re­
cently destroyed by fire. Tbe founda­
tion will need some repairs, but in tbe 
main Is available for tbe new struct­
ure, which will be the same size as tbe 
former one, 50x66 feet in ground di­
mensions. Mr. Davidson Is getting 
figures on both one and two-story 
structures, but it is probable that a 
•ingle story will be erected at tbe out­
set. The building will be of frame 
construction and specially designed 
for store use. Provision will be made 
for a meat market In the southeast 
corner of the building. Tbe vault 
will be restored and made a part of 
the new building. Mr. Lindquist ex­
pects to be able to submit tbe plans 
next Tuesday and Mr. Davidson will 
let the contract just as soon as possi­
ble, for he wishes to have tbe work 
begun at the earliest opportunity.

Italians Plan Re-union

Officers of the Upper Peninsula 
Jtallan-Amerloan Federation of whom 
there are several lo the Copper Coun­
try, will shortly take up their plans 
for the annual midsummer gathering, 
which this year will be held io Negau- 
nee, probably in June. It Is expected 
the gathering wilt be similar lo every 
way to those which have been held io 
the past. Represented?#* will be In 
attendance from all of tbe towns In 
the Upper PeolosuU.

As It will be Impossible for all of 
tbe Copper Country Italians to parti­
cipate lo this Upper Peolosula gath­
ering, a joint committee composed of 
representatives of ths Copper Coun­
try Italian fraternal societies will meet 
soon to arrange for a Copper Country 
re-uunlon In early summer. A meet­
ing piece will be designated, either lo 
Calumet or Laurium or in tbe Portage 
Lake towns and committees will be 
named to arrange the various details 
Laurium doubtless will make applica­
tion for tbis gathering because of tbe 
large number of societies wblcb are 
located hsre.

Laurium will send a large delegation 
to the Nsgauoee convention on a spec* 
lal train and will try to land tbe 1914 
meeting, which is almost certain to 
come to tbe Copper Country.—Calu­
met News.

Story About Capt. Byrns

The following story, as related by a 
Conneaut, O., friend of Capt. Ralph 
E. Byrns, brother o f T. W. Byrns of 
this city, is taken from a Conneaut, 
O,, newspaper of recent date:

The untimely death of Captain R. 
E. Byrns, murdered at bis home in 
Cleveland, occasioned much talk 
among Conneaut marine and harbor 
men for the big, genial captain was 
well known here aod counted his 
friends by the number ofhta acquaint­
ances.

Tbe arrest by Cleveland detectives 
and police of a suspect, who is being 
held on a charge of suspicion while 
further evidence is gathered and much 
now In possession of tbe police Is be­
ing substantiated, leads the friends of 
tbe dead captain who reside here to 
believe that justice will soon prevail.

Joseph Rossi, 1950 East 120th street, 
Cleveland, Is the man held under 81500 
ball. A blood-stained coat and vel­
our bat left by tbe murderers io tbe 
Byrns home, 1566 Ansel road, have 
been traced to tbe prisoner, the Cleve­
land police say. The arrest came as 
a climax to a five-days search by the 
police for tbe burglar-murderers.

Captain Byrns and bis wife return­
ed borne lo tbe evening, it will be re­
membered, aod found two men in their 
home. / i $  the captain moved toward 
one of tbe men he was shot down and 
died almost instantly.

After the shock of the tragedy had 
worn away, Conneaut men, who bad 
sailed with and known tbe captain, 
were wont to relate tales of the dead 
man and of bis life, and experiences 
on tbe seas of tbe Great Lakes. Ooe 
of tbe most interesting tales aod one 
that best exemplifies bis character Is 
that of bis arrest In Ashland, Wiscon­
sin, several years ago, after be had 
defeated In fair battle six members of 
tbe Ashland police force.

The admiralty laws give captains 
of vessels of tbe Great Lakes preced- 
eoce over tbe officers of tbe local 
courts and governments. So a cap­
tain has authority over his seamen 
while they are aboard ship, notwith­
standing local courts and officials. 
This right malotalos In all except 
murder cases. In other words, local 
officers cannot arrest sailors aboard 
ship for other than murder charges.

Capt. Byrns was master of the Mar­
icopa of toe steel trust fleet back in 
1903. While the boat was Id port at 
Ashland one of bis sailors got into 
trouble and then went aboard tbe boat. 
The captain was short handed and 
would not allow the Ashland police to 
arrest the mao shortly before tbe 
boat was to sail. This started a brew 
wblcb was afterwards to get the cap­
tain in a peck of trouble.

Tbe Ashland police resented bis In­
terference with them and from that 
day "bad it In for blm,” as the story 
teller related. Tbe boat returned to 
Ashland luter that seasoo and Captain 
Byrns visited tbe business part of tbe 
town.

While standing on tbe street an of­
ficer approached blm and told him to 
move on. This the captain resented 
and refused to do. Tbe.offlcer return­
ed a minute later and threatened ar­
rest and finally moved to that end.

Tbe captain was a man standing six 
feet, three inches tall aod weighed 
about 320 younds. He igoored tbe of­
ficer aod had little difficulty In push­
ing blm aside.

Two officers rushed to tbe assistance 
of their brother officer. Then Capt. 
Byrns began to act. He threw one 
down on the sidewalk and tossed tbe 
other two atop. As one would extri­
cate himself from tbe entanglement of 
legs, arms, heads and bodies,tbe cap­
tain would throw him atop the heap.

This continued for a moment or two, 
when the police chief aod two more 
ineo rushed to the scene and the cap­
tain became more active. Be bit the 
first a telling blow full in tbe chest, 
knocking tbe officer across tbe side­
walk and Into the street oar tracks in 
the middle of the street where be re­
mained, too Inactive for further par­
ticipation in the fray.

A second was soot sprawling, not to 
arise again of his own accord. The 
three original combutantsbad by this 
time arisen and began beating the 
marloer wkb their clubs. Hi was en­
tirely bald and to tbe day of bis death 
bore tbe scars left there by tbe blud­
geons of tbe Ashland offioers.

Htlll he refused to give way and be 
taken when he bad not done nothing 
for which he should have been ar­
rested. With bis bead out and bat­
tered he fought off the remaining four 
offioers until one maoaged to get a 
oord about bis neck. This was tight­
ened until breath was entirely cut off 
and tbe captain gradually sank to tbe 
side walk, blaok In tbe face and al­
most strangled. He was locked up 
and lutter arraigned upon a trumped 
upcharge. The police judge placed tbe 
fine at 1260 and costs.

Tbe men aboard the Maricopa "chip­
ped In” until tbe necessary amount 
was collected and the release of the 
captain In that way was purchased. 
They were reimbursed by the captain 
when the boat came down and be 
was repaid by the managers of the 
fleet. He made a full report to the 
managers and stated that he would 
never have paid the fine If tbe boat 
could have gotten away without him.

Ashland never beoedtted by tbe act 
aod many lake men still hold ltagalost 
tbe port on acoouot of tbe brutal at­
tack upon Capt. Byrns. It was learn­
ed that tbe Ashland polio# were angry 
because be bad not allowed them to 
arrest the sellor aboard bis host aod 
they "laid” for him throughout tbe 
ftt-aoon aod finally "got him” in this 
way.

A. Llberebal, the Marquette cigar 
man, called on his Negaunee trade 
on Tuesday. While here Mr. Liber* 
shal, took occasion to distribute some 
of bis souvenir match boxes to bis 
friends.

Mrs. J. E. O’Donoghue returned 
Wednesday morning from a visit with 
relatives in Fond du Lac, Wls.

Capt. Wm. J. Allen departed Tues­
day evening on a visit of a few weeks 
to points of interest in Arizona. He 
will also pay a visit to Capt. John 
Deacon at El Paso, Texas, where tbe 
latter is recuperating bis health and 
Is well pleased with the climate. Mr, 
Allen will spend most of his time at 
Butte and Douglas, Arizona, and will 
probably be absent until about tbe 
first of April.

Mr. aod Mrs. Archie Orr visited 
with relatives and friends In Mar­
quette on Sunday last.

Mrs. D, S. Comstock, of Sands, 
visited in Negaunee early in tbe week.

Arthur Jacque, Marquette manager 
of James Plckands <5: Co., was a visit­
or at the local office of tbe company 
on Tuesday.

Mrs. M. C. Quinn returned borne 
Tuesday afternoon from tbe Copper 
Country, where ebe had been visiting 
relatives and friends for several days.

Frank aod Joseph Wioter were pas­
sengers on Monday to Iron River, 
where they have secured work at the 
carpenter trade.

Tbe Misses Irene Driscoll and Alice 
and Katherine Scully, of Marquette 
s^eot last Sunday with friends In Ne­
gaunee.

Emery Wellet was a passenger to 
Detroit last Monday afternoun.

Rev, H. Bucbholtz, pastor of St, 
Paul’s church, assisted In the Forty 
Hours’ devotional services a t St. 
John’s church in Ishpemlng early la 
tbe week.

James Tregonnlog, who recently ac* 
cepted a position as passenger brake- 
man on tbe South Shore, says be likes 
work first rate.

Mr. and Mrs. J. H. Winter left last 
Saturday evening for Chicago and 
from there will visit in New York, 
Washington and Baltimore before 
they return.

Henry Anderson was a passenger to 
Marquette last Saturday eveoiog and 
remained until Sunday evening visit­
ing relatives and friends.

H. P. Annen, of Green Bay, was in 
Negaunee on Monday. Mr. Annen Is 
now representing an Oshkosh candy 
firm.

L, F. Knowles, of Detroit, spent 
Monday In Negaunee. Mr. Knowles 
Is secretary of tbe LakeSuperlorlron 
and Chemical Company.

Oacar Field transacted business in 
Marquette on Monday.

Mrs. W. J. Micks, of Gladstone, 
spent the first three days of tbe week 
to Negaunee with her mother, Mrs. 
Ryan, and sister, Mrs. I*. Healy.

Axel Larson, manager of the Gwlnn 
Lumber Company, spent last Sunday 
with bis relatives In Negaunee.

Dr. N. J. Robbins is home from 
Florida, where he accompanied his 
mother from Isbpeming a few weeks 
ago. Mrs. Kobblos I* to speod the 
remainder of the winter in Florida.

Albin Bellstrom arrived home Sun­
day morning from Chicago, w^ere he 
bad spent a week taking in tbe slgbta.

Mrs. Oscar Olson departed Wed­
nesday evening for Fond du Lac, 
Wli., where she will spend a week or 
two visltiog her sister and then pro­
ceed to Boone, Iowa, to join her bus- 
band, who is employed on tbe new 
school building bolng erected by Con­
tractor L. E. Cb&ussee of this city.

Mrs. John Stewart Is reported criti­
cally ill.

Amoog tbo seventeen students who 
will graduate at the end of this winter 
term in March at tbe Marquette Nor­
mal are Miss Elvina Ostrom of this city 
and Miss Anoa MoVicar, of Hough­
ton, whose grandparents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Angus MoDooell, reside in this 
olty.

Mrs. H. W. Sbeldoo arrived home 
Wednesday from Chtcago. She was 
accompanied home by Miss Norma 
Jacobson, who Is attending school In 
Chicago aod who bad been on tbe sick 
list for several days.

Mr. and Mrs. J. T. Riddell came 
down from Calumet last Friday even­
ing to attend tbe Upper Peninsula 
basketball tournament held in Ish- 
pemiog Friday and Saturday and re­
mained (n this city until Sunday af­
ternoon visiting friends. Mrs. Rid­
dell was formerly Miss Cleora Miller 
and taught history in the high school 
In this city for a couple of years. Mr. 
Riddell was alio a high school teach­
er In this city and both have many 
friends in Negaunee. Mr. and Mrs. 
Riddell were married last December.

Mrs. E. A. Beyer, of Marquette, 
visited with her mother, Mrs. Sulli­
van, In Negaunee on Sunday last.

Joseph Cyr and daughter, Mary 
Cyr, spent Sunday evening in Mar­
quette and returned home by the late 
tralo accompanied by MrB. Cyr, who 
bad been spending the week with rela­
tives in Marquette.

Mrs. John O’Leary returned Sun. 
day evening from tbe Copper Country, 
where she had been spending some 
time visiting her daughter, Mrs. Peter 
Donogbue, at Calumet.

Cbarles Johnson, of Limestone 
Delta county, was a guest of bis broth­
er-in-law, Louis Swansoo, tbe plumb­
er, last Sunday.

Leonard Sleeman. who left Negau­
nee shortly after the death of his wife, 
about a year ago, taking with him 
his little child to place In the keeping 
of bis parents, was to leave England 
on the 15th Inst, for New Zealand, 
where be ,has been promised employ­
ment. • •

Frank Dusbane, Jr., came up from 
Marquette last Friday to congratulate 
hls father: on his 77th birthday.

J. C. Dougherty, of Munlsing, spent 
last Sunday in Negaunee visiting his 
soo and daughter, Fred and Miss 
Mary Dougherty.

Joho Kelly returned home last Sat­
urday afternoon from Gwinn, where 
be bad spent tbe week assisting Oscar 
Johnson In saloon work.

Mr. and Mrs, Morgan Wright, re­
siding at tbe Ishpemlng gold mine 
property, spent the week-end In Ne­
gaunee visiting Mrs. Wright’s par­
ents, Mr. and Mrs. W. L. Sterling.

Amos Saladin, tbe piano man, is 
here from Marauette to-day, on a col­
lecting tour.

Jeremiah Reldy, who recently sub­
mitted to a successful operation for 
gall stones in a Green B y hospital, 
returned home lsst Saturday much 
Improved In health.

Miss Florence Thomas was a guest 
of Capt. and Mrs. John Ellis, at tbe 
Austin mine, last week.

City Treasurer Frank Dushane cel­
ebrated bis seventy-seventh birthday 
last Friday, 14th lost, and "looks 
good” for several more years to come

Mrs. E. G Is wold and Miss Gyda 
Tlslov* of Chicago, have been guests 
of Mrs. Henry Rasmussen In tbis city 
for a few days.

Miss Helma Pelto has been serious­
ly 1)1 for several days.

E. Merljarvl, of Hancock, will de­
liver a sermon at tbe Finnish Luther* 
an church in this city next Hunday 
morning.

Mrs. A1 Baker,of Kscanaba, is hero 
on a visit to her mother, Mrs. Dwyer, 
Clark street.

Dr. J. D. Bsraeron attended to a 
sick call down tbs line of tbe North- 
Western railway on Wednesday.

Mrs. George McCano and daughter 
arrived here yesterday from Munlsing 
to take up tbelr residence, Mr. Mq- 
Cann having recently engaged in the 
livery business in Negaunee.

John Clauson is confined to bis 
home through sickness.

Norman Luke, proprietor of the Pal­
ace Holier Rick, will spend next week 
in Iron Mountain,assisting bis father, 
Henry Luke, in the management of 
the Ice rink in that city. He will 
leave here next Monday morning.

Mias Anoa Abenstelo. of Eacaoaba, 
is paying a visit lo her uncle. Rev. 0 . 
A. Buobbolts, lo this city.

K. C. Anthony returned home Wed­
nesday eveolcg from Detroit aod was 
accompanined to Negaunee by hls 
daughter, Mrs. Howard Fenner, who

1 will remain until Sunday evening.

Road Controversy Ended

A conference last Tuesday eyening 
between representatives of The Cleve* 
land-CllfTs Iron Company and the 
Main street property owners who In­
stituted Injunction proceedings to res­
train the mining company and the 
Common Council from ordering a 
section of Main street vacated, result­
ed In an amicable adjustment of the 
differences and tbe injunction will be 
withdrawn as toon as the necessary 
legal steps can be taken.

By tbe terms of a resolution adopt­
ed by tbe Common Council last even­
ing, tbe text of which is contained In 
the official proceedings, a portion of 
East Main street will be closed for 
such period as may be required for 
mining operations, but the city re­
tains its present title to the thorough­
fare and will be privileged to restore 
it as a highway, after mining opera­
tions have been completed, if tbe city 
desires to do so. Main street is to re­
main opto for public use, however, 
until mining operations reach a stage 
making tbe closing of the thorough­
fare advisable.

Meanwhile the mining company is 
to provide the city with another right 
of way, starting from the Intersection 
of Main street nnd the old Baldwin 
Kilo road, thence runnlag northeast­
erly along the east Bide of Corblt’s 
Second Addition for a distance o 
nearly 500 feet, thence curving to the 
right until a final straight stretch of 
a thousand feet connects tbe new roac 
with tbe eastern end of tbe preseut 
Main street at tbe Intersection of the 
east line of the old Medard Gauthier 
farm, which will make a less circuit­
ous route than the one first proposed. 
This arrangement is satisfactory to 
tbe property owners who had lodged 
complaint and they therefore witbd rew 
the injunction proceedings and en­
abled the council to approve tbe re- 
v Ited route.

This adjustment of tbe differences 
is of great benefit to the city, for It 
will hasten, and not retard, exteoslve 
mining operations which mean In­
creased Industrial activity for Negau­
nee. and it provides for a restoration, 
after tbe mining operations are ended 
In that particular locality, of the high­
way which the residents sought to pro­
tect.

Offering Good Program

Manager C. B. Skiff is offering 
his usual good program at the Bijou 
nightly. He intends to put in two new 
picture machines within a few days, 
which will further Improve the ser­
vice.

Another Mask Carnival

Manager Luke of tbe Palace Roller 
Rink announces that be intends to 
give another mask carnival at tbe 
rink on the evening of March 20th. 
immediately following Lent. He will 
offer liberal cash prizes. Those de­
siring a good time should keep tbe 
date in mind.

Have Had Enough

The Mining Journal says: "None 
of those associated in tbe manage­
ment of the Marquette luague base­
ball team last year have any Inclina­
tion to take up tbe organization of a 
team for tbis reason, but they are 
willing to support any person who 
desires to take hold of the task.”

Stewart Johnston Won

Ktewart Johnston won out in the 
ouo-mlle race at the Palace Holler 
Kink lo this city last Haturday even­
ing, defeating his opponent, D. J. 
LaFonde, champion of Delta county, 
by ball a lap. If the latter had oot 
fallen twice during the race a much 
closer contest would have resulted for 
the visitor was speedy and could "go 
some.” The race was witnessed by a 
fair crowd.

Lost Hunter Seen

A photograph taken by a motion 
picture man of a parade In Chicago 
during the national republican con­
vention last June, bas revived In a 
unique way the story of the disappear­
ance of and tbe long search for Harry 
L. Brownell of St. Cbarles, four years 
ago. Brownell disappeared in the 
woods south of Newberry while on a 
deer bunting trip. The general be­
lief was that be lost himself in tbe 
woods aod perished. That be is still 
llvlog and that he Is the original of 
one of tbe figures that are lo tbe films 
of tbe Chicago national convention 
parade, is tbe firm cooyiotion of bis 
wife aud of a g /od rnaoy others whs 
knew him well.

Broke World’s Record

Ragnar Orotvet, of Chicago, the 
Norwegian student who came to this 
country a year ago to compete for the 
amateur championship in ski jump­
ing, last Sunday broke the world's 
record, jumping as a professional 
at Ironwood. Omtvet cleared 1H9 feet, 
beating the former world’s record of 
150 feet,’made in Norway.

To Carry Negaunee Ore

A new fieet of vessels to carry Iron 
ore wilt be added in a year or two to 
the Great Lakes, This fleet will be 
used to carry the products of E. N. 
Breltung A Co. It will not be la op­
eration for a season or two, but H. L. 
Kaufman, vice president of the com­
pany, says the traffic of the compaoy 
Is expanding so that a fleet will bt> 
necessary.

Joseph Scoble Drops Dead

Joseph Scoble, a well known resi­
dent of Ishpemlng, dropped dead on 
the street In that city last Tuesday 
morning. Mr. Scoble was convers­
ing with friends when he suddenly 
dropped to the ground. Deceased 
was HI years of age and was born in 
Devonshire, England. In 1870 he 
came to Negaunee and was employed
at tbe Jackson mine for a number of 
years.

Brakeman Injured

Frank Powers, of Kscanaba, a 
North-Western brakeman, was caught 
between a freight car and the freight 
depot In this city last week and quite 
severely bruised about the body. He 
was taken to the Ishpemlng hospital 
where It was ascertained that hls con­
dition was not considered serious. He 
remaloed at tbe hospital until Moo- 
day, when he was taken to his home la 
Kscanaba, where he will be confined 
for some time.

Were "Two Irishers"

At the annual banquet of the Michi­
gan Society of Chicago, Congressman 
at Large Kelley, of Michigan, was 
joked by several speakers upon the 
preeminence of Irishmen lo public life.

"That’s perfectly true: we always 
getto the top,” answered Mr. Kelly. 
*T remember an example of this that 
came to my attention a few years ago 
when I was making a trip through 
Minnesota. I came to a small town 
In the northern part of the state. Ooe 
glauca at the signs on the stores 
showed that Scandinavians ^predomi- 
nated. Johnson, Nelson, Gustavson, 
Hulberg, Olson and like names were 
all that 1 could see.

"Any Germans here?" I asked the 
man I was visiting.

"There bane none,” he said.
"Any Italians?”
"No,” be answered.
"And no Irishmen either, 1 sup­

pose?” I added.
”0, yaas, there banc two frishers 

lo town,” came the reply. One he 
bane mayor and other bane chief po­
lice.”

Easter Monday Ball

Chief Johnson, Asst. Chief La- 
Combe, A. F. Wlltinan, J. J. Wen* 
tela and Dr. Ji. J. Miller,who were ap­
pointed a committee to complete all 
arrangements for the firemen’s annual 
Easter Monday Ball to be held oa 

March 24th, have determined to spare 
no pains or expense In making the 
event a grand success hs usual. The 
tickets have been printed and the so­
liciting committee will soon have tbem 
|Q circulation. No one should refuse 
to buy.

This community owes a great deal 
to its volunteer fire department. 
Home people may think it Is hilarious 
fun to tumble out of bed ut all hours 
of tbe olgbt and all seasons of the 
year to fight fire, but such are ill-ad­
vised, and should they man the carts 
a while, would find out their mistake. 
It is a sorious business—this business 
of fighting fire - and no fireman ever 
dons hls coat without a measure of 
personal risk. In the larger cities the 
firemen are well compensated for their 
dangerous work, but, lo the smaller 
communities, the fire departments ure 
made up of volunteers uud the brave 
boys who fight fire by day or by night 
do it without thought or hope of pe­
cuniary gain.

The Negaunee volunteer department 
is composed of thirty active members 
and tbe chief, who are very prompt, 
very reliable aod very efficient and 
this community owes them a debt of 
gratitude for tbe faithful way io which 
they have, oo all occasions, grappled 
with {Impending danger to life and 
property and saved the city from »tv- 
era! conflagrations.



WHEN MEN 
PLAYED FOR 
BIG STAKES

FRANK J,

<£) o r /wx?tfAY ca
AMIILIN'G for big stakes was 
a common thing In the west 
a few years ago. In nearly 
all sections the evil has 
been suppressed by law. In 
the few portions where It Is 
still followed It la carried 
on under cover and In con* 
stant dread of police Inter* 
ference.

Not so long ago, however, the cry of the 
roulette man and the click of the ball could 
be heard In the lobbies of many of the 
principal hotels. This was particularly true 
of El Paso, Cripple Creek, Leadvllle. Gold­
field, Kuttc, the Coeur d'Alene, and many 
other sections. The practice prevailed to a 
greater or less extont In the larger towns. 
Everybody has money In the early days of 
a mining camp.

It was an era of speculation. The coun­
try had not "been proven,” and bonce a 
“find” in a new section resulted In a great 
rush to that locality. Property changed 
hands at fabulous prices overnight. The 
ragged prospector of today might be roll­
ing In wealth tomorrow. It has happened 
so many times.

When there is money to throw at the 
birds, the gamblers, like so many vultures, 
assemble at the point to which It Is being cast 
by the thoughtless and Improvident possessors.

Games were played where the stakes ran Into 
the millions. A man wealthy in the morning 
sometimes had to borrow money to avoid going 
to bed hungry at night.

A stockman in Colorado "sat Into” a poker 
game in Denver, and by midnight had not only 
lost all the cash he had with him, but bad ex­
hausted a largo bank balance.

He owned, on the range In Colorado, the neu­
tral strip C'No Man’s Land,” now extreme west­
ern Oklahoma), and In Texas ten thousand head 
of cattle, worth twenty dollars a head, or a total 
of *200,00G.

He possessed land In three states and a hand­
some residence In Denver. He made a bet of 
s thoueund steers—worth twenty thousand dollars 
—and lost. He continued this until the herd of 
ten thousand head of stock belonged to another 
man. Day dawned, and he was still playing. 
Hreakfast was sent In from a restaurant main­
tained at the end of the gambling hall for just 
such people.

"Now,” he said to the men who had won hts 
cattle, "you have the critters, but no place to 
keep them. I will play you my Texas ranch.” 

He lost that. Then followed the Colorado 
ranch, finally the residence in Denver, together 
with the furniture, his horses, his watch and 
chain. . At eight o'clock at night—twenty-four 
hours later—he was penniless, and started for 
the Rio Grande country of Texas, where he found 
employment hauling logs to a sawmill. He had 
lost more thAn a quarter of a million dollars in 
twenty-four hours!

“Will you oblige me by taking off your shoes?” 
asked a road agent politely, while he held a re­
volver menacingly In the face of a passenger 
who stood up in a line with others.

The hold up man had stopped the stage going 
Into Dendvllle to "collect toll." He had Just pur 
chased the road, he said, and needed the money.

He passed down the line and, by means of a 
pasenger whom he forced Into service, gathered 
up all the money and Jewelry, until he came to 
the last man in the line. Then he asked the man 
to take off his shoes. He found four thousand 
dollars under the Inner soles!

Several nights later the man who had been out­
witted by the hold up man was sitting In the 
dealer's chair of u faro game In the "Cloud City.” 
as leadvllle Is called. Ilefore him sat a man 
who lost money steadily. The gambler "raked 
in" the money carelessly and with the utmost un­
concern. The player lost something like five 
thousand dollars and then pushed back his chair.

"All in?" asked the gambler, urchlng bis 
brows.

“Yep—you’ve cleaned me out."
“Then we are even for that little incident the 

other night, when you collected your road tax 
from me."

• * j_ "  <
"Yes, you!”
The hold up man knocked down half a dozen 

loiterers In his rush to reach the door and escape.
A well-known mining man. who was noted for 

his Judgment In "knowing a hole In the ground" 
when he looked Into it, hud just made a purchase 
In Cripple Creek, lie had money, and he was wilt­
ing to spend It for anything that looked good. 
After having tramped over the hilts all of one 
day. he "sat Into" a poker game In the lobby 
of the principal hotel that night, and engaged In 
•  friendly game with n number of acquaintances.

They were playing for tweiity-flvo cents a cor­
ner. While the game wus In progress \  ragged 
prospector appeared and attempted to Inject him­
self Into the company. The mining man explain­
ed that It was simply a private game between 
friends outsiders, and particularly strangers, 
were not wanted.

"I have money that has never been spent.” 
"We don't know you.”
"Oh. that's It! Then let me Introduce my­

self."
There was no way to get rid of him appar­

ently. Then, like an Inspiration, and In an an­
noyed manner, the operator suid:

"How much money have you?”
"Eight hundred dollars”
"Bit down, and IT show you how to play 

poker "
In less than fifteen minutes the prospector 

w ith d rew .
Shortly after he returned with a thousand dol­

lars more. This was interesting. He lost It 
Then he lost a diamond pin. following it with a 
watch and his "csyuse ”

When ho pushed bark his chair the operator 
asked:

"An* you broke now?"
*! have h claim over on the hill ”
“What do vou value It at*"
“One hundred thousand dollars"
This staggered the mining tnau for • moment

“You have been a good loser; I'll put In with 
you and play a hundred thousand against your 
claim."

The prospector lost the claim.
“Now I will play you for your services tomor­

row to show me where the claim Is and where to 
open the ore. For that I will consider that you 
have five thousand on the table.”

The prospector lost that.
The next day he traced out the lines of the 

claim for the winner, who organized a company, 
with a stock of one million, the shares of which 
went for sixteen dollars each!

Millions were taken from the mine within a 
few years. It became one of the most famous 
In the entire Rocky Mountain country.

In the early days of the Comstock Lode, In 
Virginia, Nevada, some men made money so fast 
that they did not know what to do with I t Those 
who were not making It spent their time devising 
ways and means to talk the others out of a por­
tion of their wealth. Gamblers were In full evi­
dence, and there were some big stakes; but It 
remained for a bunch of Mexicans to play for the 
largest stake on record in the United States— 
without the use of cards.

One of the many claims, located In the midst 
of the district, had rot shown any ore. Even the 
men who had millions hesitated to sink a shaft 
on it. The people were In a fever of excitement 
The Mexicans owned practicaly nothing. In fact, 
the "greasers" could not get a “look In.” Alto­
gether It was very discouraging—to them.

Then It occurred to some bright genius to 
capitalize the labor of the Mexicans. Gathering 
a bunch of them together, it was proposed that 
they sink a shaft on one of the well-known 
claims, which was twelve hundred feet in length.

"For each foot you sink, we will give you a 
one-foot surface Interest In the claim," they were 
told,” provided you sink to ore.”

In other words, If they abandoned the work at 
any time before reaching ore, they would get 
nothing, and the owners would have the shaft 
It looked like a cheap way to prospect.

The Mexicans pow-powed and jabbered at one 
another for half a night and then started to 
work.

Everybody laughed. They were comparatively 
poor men. They could 111 afford the expense they 
were undergoing. They drilled by hand, fought 
the hard granite, and gradually lowered that 
shaft. . They balled water that flowed In so fast 
that It threatened to drown them, but they stuck 
to the work with desperation.

At throe hundred feet they uncovered the rich­
est portion of the world-famous silver deposit, 
and, from the vein they opened, more wealth was 
taken out than from any other portion of that 
richest single mile of ground In the world.

The Mexicans' share was one-quarter. Nearly 
one hundred million dollars came out of the hols 
they sank! It was n gamble purs and simple. 
They played for high stakes—and won.

In the Coeur d'Alene, of Idaho, when that min­
ing region was the center of the earth, there were 
some big games. The story Is told of ons man 
who conceived (he Idea that he could make 
money In gambling faster than hs could take It 
out of the ground. It was so much easier With 
what cash he had. after selling his mins, bs could 
count up to ons hundred and fifty thousand 
dollars.

1I« hid evotved a wonderful system
”1 simply can’t lose.” hs told his friends.
His plan was to play steadily for sixteen hours 

dally, and, by a compllcatsd series of bets, to 
retrieve when ho lost.

Everything went along swlmlngly for tbs first 
few days. At times he was as much at twenty- 
five thousand to the good.

Nine days after he started top lay he suddenly 
found that he was lust where he had started— 
he had ons huudred and fifty thousand dollars 
when (he cards cams a certain way. which would 
Involve, according to bis* system, betting the en­
tire amount on a single "turn.” He played tbs 
queen to win, and the fickle creature played false 
to him.

"Women are the cause of all trouble, anyway.” 
he muttered, as he rose from the table. "I ought 
to have known better than that, for that was the 
queen of spades, end I should not have made that 
bet except when all the queens except the queen 
of hearts was out."

It was the Irony of fste that, when the queen 
of hearts came cut of the box, 1t so happened 
that It won.

In the days when rheyenne. Wyoming, was the 
headquarters for the cattlemen of the northwest, 
gambling ran wide open. When the cowboys 
came to town they made things hum. Money 
grew on trees Tin* gnmlng srirlt was In the nlr.

A dealer standing behind a roulette table one 
night suddenly motioned the proprietor. A few 
moments later he was paid off. u f« customary 
to pay a gambler his salary at (he end of ouch

day. Many of them bavs 
the faculty of losing it 
back over the very table 
where they know the 
odds to be against the 
player.

In roulette there la a 
distinct percentage In 
favor of "the house.” 
Everybody knows that.

This dealer took a se&t la front of the table 
and in the course of a few hours bad won fifty 
dollars. Then he stopped. . He would pass In' 
and out a dozen times a day, play a little here 
and some there, but always he would bring up In 
front of the roulette table, and more often than 
otherwise left It winner. His luck was amazing. 
He started a bank acocunt. He was saving bis 
money to gut Into business with, he said.

He won so steadily that It made the proprietor 
of the place shiver every time he came in.

One day, while the ex-dealer was playing, an 
old man dropped In and, glancing around the room 
for a moment, asked:

"Who runs this place?”
>”I do,” answered a bewhlskered individual 

who was watching his former employe rake In 
the cash.

"Will you do me the favor to tel) me where 
you got tint wheel?" be asked, pointing to the 
one that proved such a hoodoo.

“1 know It's a Jonah. That fellow over there 
wins all the time.”

"Bo?” said the stranger.
He walked over and watched the man lay hts 

bets.
Returning to the proprietor, he said, as he 

passed out a card:
"1 represent this house, which, as you sr>e, 

deals in gaming devices. I take It that the man 
sitting at the wheel makes a ‘killing' every day?”

"He does, stranger, to the tune of fifty or a 
hundred.”

“For a thousand I can tell you how to bust bis 
luck and make him look the living picture of re­
morse. You would have to agree to purchase a  
new wheel from me, also.”

”lf you show me, I’m game.”
“It'i a bargain,” said the drummer.
Walking over to the wheel, be waited until the 

ball dropped, stopped it, and turning to the pro­
prietor asked:

“See anything strange with that wheel?"
”No”
"Well, see, there are two nineteen! and two 

twenty-threes on this wheel. They are unusual 
numbers—so that the fellow who plays them has 
about the same percentage in his favor, on those 
numbers, that you have when a man plays on a  

regular wheel. We made this wheel more than 
thirty years ago. It was sold to a house by a 
couple of ‘sure thing' men, who almost broke the 
outfit. Then we loat track of it."

The ex-dealer had noticed the double numbers, 
and therein was the secret of his “luck.” How 
tbo numbers bad escaped attention so many 
years Is one of those mysteries of gambling that 
can never be explained.

When Seattle was the big noise 1n the North- 
west gambling world, and the primeval forests 
were closer to her doors, some big games were 
played.

One night a stranger stepped Into one of the 
principal houses aud took a seat at a faro table. 
An hour later he had lost more than five thou­
sand dollars. The proprietor sent him a fifty- 
cent cigar. A few moments afterward the 
stranger had a couple of hundred dollars, and 
within an hour bad regained bis five thousand. 
Then commenced a streak of luck that has sel­
dom been witnessed In any gambling house The 
“roof" had been raised “to (he sky" and Mr. 
Btranger "coppered" the king and doubled a bet 
of five thousand. He tried It again for a repeat­
er, with ten thousand, and drew back twenty yel­
low chlcps, worth one thousand each.

After that he made bets of a thousand each, 
and before he bad smoked the cigar be was twen­
ty-eight thousand to the good! Then he quit.

Who he was, where he came from, where be 
went, no one ever knew. His coming and going 
were as mysterious as his winnings were sensa­
tional.

Probably one of the greatest stakes ever bung 
up was raked down on a mule raoe In Arizona. 
A man owned a “bole in the ground.” He was 
satisfied that It was worth a fortune. His 
friends thought he was crazy. He refused to go 
to other “diggings" where the prospects were 
better. He was more than twenty-five miles 
from water, which had to be carried In on the 
hurricane deck of a mule. He worked away, 
nursing his claim and sticking it out sJone. Then 
he went to a settlement some distance away. He 
became excited over the performances of a mule 
owned by another man. and In a moment of ex­
uberance bet his claim against one owned by a 
prospector from another suction that his mule 
could outrun the other fellow's, He lost.

He had the privilege of piloting the winner to 
the "mine" and saw him take more than seventy 
thousand dollars' worth of silver, net, out of a 
pocket, nlmo«t on the surface of the ground! 
Since th»n the property has produced millions 
It all came about because one mule could *iol 
run so fast as another.

GOT LEFT IN THE RU8H.

“Ruth Is engaged to be married the 
coming winter.”

“The mischief she Is! I intended 
to propose to that girl myself when 
I got time.”

Whipped Child's Protest.
"Mamma whips you only when she 

has reason for it"
"I won't stand It any longer, papa! 

I'm not married to her.”

ftHAKB INTO YOUR SHOES 
Alton's Fo'>t>Kaa<.>, tha Antiseptic powdsr for 
tlrad, aching, awolten, nervous fact. Glvra 
real and comfort. Make* walking a delight 
Sold everywhere. 36c. Don't accept any sub­
stitute. For FREE sample address Allan S. 
Otmaled, Le Roy, N. Y. Adv.

It keeps wives as busy providing for 
the Inner man as It does husbands 
providing things for the outer woman.

Dr. Fleroe'a Pellets, small, sugar-coated, 
easy to take os candy, regulate ami invtgorate 
stomach, llveraod bowels. Donotgripe. Adv.

Some men begin to economize after 
marriage by growing whiskers.

Mm. Winslow's Soothing Syrup for Children 
teething, softens the gum«, reduces Inflamma­
tion, allays paJn, cure* wind eollc.t&onboUleiW,

When fools are glad wise men are 
•aid.

LIFE’S STRUGGLE 
WITH ILLNESS

Mr*. Stewart Tell* How She 
Suffered from 16to45 year* 

old—How Finally Cured.

Euphemla, Ohio.—"Because of total 
Ignorance of how to care for myself 
when verging Into womanhood, and from 
taking cold when going to school, I suf­
fered from a displacement, and each 
month I had severe pains and nausea 
which always meant a lay-off from work 
for two to four days from the time I 
was 16 years old.

“ I went to Kansas to live with my sis­
ter and while there a doctor told me of 
the Pinkham remedies but I did not use 
them then as my faith In patent medi­
cines was limited. After my sister died 
1 came home to Ohio to live and that 
has been my home for the last 18 years.

"The Change of Life came when I was 
47 years old and about this time I saw 
my physical condition plainly described 
in one of your advertisements. Then I 
began using Lydia E. Pinkh&m’s Veg­
etable Compound and I cannot toll you 
or any one the relief It gave me in the 
first three months. I t put me right 
where I need not lay off every month 
and during the last 18 years I have not 
paid out two dollars to a doctor, and have 
been blest with excellenthealth forawo* 
woman of my ago and I can thank Lydia 
E. Pinkham’sVegetable Compound for it.

u  Since the Change of Life is over I 
have been a maternity nurse and being 
wholly self-supporting I cannot over 
estimate the value o f  good health. I 
have now earned a comfortable little 
home just by sewing and nursing since 
I was 52 years old. I nave recommended 
the Compound to many with good re­
sults, as it is excellent to take before 
and after childbirth.”—Misa EytlyW 
Adblia Stewart, Euphemla, Ohio.

If yoa want special advloe write to 
Lydia E. Pinkham Medicine Co* (confi­
dential) Lynn, Mass. Yonr letter will 
be opened* read and answered by a 
woman and held in strict confidence*

A LC O H O L-3 PER CENT  
AVetfefable Preparation fo r As- 

sim ila l  ing the Food and R egula  • 
ting the Stomachs and Bowels o f

In f a n t s  / C h ild  k i :n

a*

-i.

Prom otes D igestion ,C heerfu l* 

ness and Rest C ontains neither 

O p ium ,M orph ine  n o r M inera l 

No t  N a r c o t i c

P ta p t  S 0 M  D r S A M V U M C t a  

P bm pltt* S to d  •

ffmhtUtSmMa •
A m u  S t td  * 
fbpp*rmiiU - 
o iC i* f i t* *U S *4 A  • 
h im  S t td  * 
c ifd itJS u fg  
W i*k rfrn »  / fa v o r

Aperfect Remedy fo rC onstipa- 
l io n . S o u r S tom ach,D iarrhoea, 

W orms .C onvu ls ions .Feverish­

ness and L O S  S O F  S L E E P

Fee Simile Signature of

< a Z # t?j z 3 S Z

The Centaur Company,
N E W  A - O B K .

At 6  m o n t h  % o l d
5 5  B u m s  - J ^ C e n t s

[Guaranteed under the F o o J ^  

Exact Copy of Wrappar.

CASTORIA
For Infanta and Children*

The Kind You Have 
Always Bought

B e a r s  t h e  

S i g n a t u r e  

o f

For Over 
Thirty Years

CASTORIA
Stops Backache

Sloan’s Liniment is a splendid remedy for backache, stiff 
Joints, rheumatism, neuralgia and sciatica. You don’t need to 
rub it in—just laid on lightly it gives comfort and ease at once.

Best for Palo and Stiffness
Mr. Gto. B u c h a n a n , of Welch, Okla., writes t—MI have used voorlin- 

Imant for tha past tan yews for pain in back and stiffness and had ft tha bast 
Liniment I svar tried, 1 recommend It to anyone for pains of any kind."

SLOANS
LINIMENT

is good for sprains, strains, bruises, a  amp or soreness of tha 
muscles, and all affections of the throat and chest

Got Entire Relief
R. D. B urooynk, of Maysvillt, Ky„ RR. v. Bos 

<, writesi—»"I had severe pains between my shoul­
ders; I got a bottle of your iJnlmem and had entire 
relief at the fifth application.”

Relieved Severs Pain In Shoulders
Ma. J. UNnr.kwooD, of sooo Warren Ate., 

Chicago. III., writes: —“ I am a piano polisher 
by occupation, and since last Septeml>er have

V suffered with severe pain In both shoulders. 
I could not rest night or day. One of my 
friends told me about your liniment. 

Three application! completely cured 
me and I will never be without it*

Price 25e., 50c., and 91.00 
at All Dealers.

Seed for Sloan's free book on honifc
Address

Dr. Earl S. Sloea» 
Boston, Mata.
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PAINFUL, TRYING 
TIMES

Housework Is 
hard enough for 
a healthy worn* 
an. The wife 
who has a bad 
hack, who Is 
weak or tired 
all the time, 
finds her duties 
a heavy burden.

Thousands of 
nervouB, d i s ­
couraged, sick­
ly women have 
traced t h e i r  

*Boery Victor* T ills troubles to alck 
* Story"  kidneys — have 

found quick and thorough relief 
through using Doan's Kidney Pills.

The painful, trying times of 
woman’s life are much easier to 
bear If the ktdneys are well. '

An lows Cass
Mu. £  Hunt. IQ6B Oth He, ValrfleM. To., aayi: 

T o r thin r yeerd I inffered tmm kidney trouble. 
I had aevera b u k u h i, Headaches and dliay 
i m IIi . and ray limb* swelled au 1 couldn't walk, 
Ikrtn'a Kidney I’lllacon-d me when CTerrthlnf 
• lie  failed. 1 cannot praise them too highly."

C«t Doan’s at An* Store, SOc a Bos

D O A N ’ S Kl?LU v
F05TER-M ILBURN COM Buffalo, N ew Y ork

Away with itching 
eczema torments!

RESINOL clears skin hu­
mors right away. You can’t 
imagine the comfort the first 
use of it brings.

No matter how long you have 
been tortured and disfigured by 
itching, burning, raw or scaly 
skin diseases, just put a little of 
that soothing RESINOL on th e . 
sores and the suffering stops 
right there! Healing begins that 
very minute, and your skin gets 
well so quickly you feel ashamed 
of the money you threw away 
on useless, foolish treatments.

Prove it yourself, FREE
We send samples of Resinol with 

directions, free. Write today to 
Dept 16K, Resinol Chemical Co., 
Baltimore. All druggists and general 
stores sell Resinol, 50c. (Large size 
$1.00.) Also Resinol Soap, 25 cents.

The Wretchedness 
of Constipation
Can quickly be overcome by 
CARTER'S LITTLE 
LIVER PILLS.

Purely vegetable 
—act surely and
gently on the 
liver. Cure 
Biliousness,
H ead­
a c h e ,
Dizzi­
ness, and Indigestion. They do their duty. 
SHALL PILL SMALL DOSE, SMALL PRICE.

Genuine m u st b ear Signature

FREE TO WOMEN—PISO'S TABLETS
are recommended as the beet local remedy 
for women's ail menu. Eter to use, prompt to 
relieve. Tim wttki trvtm rnt, and en article 
"Ceuece of Dloeues in Women" maiUd At*.

THE $110 COMMIT, BOX (, WARREN, PA.

P e ttits  Fve Salve RELIEVES 
80RE EVES

THE FLYING AGE.

“How old Is Ds Swift’s youngest 
child r

’i t  can’t be more than a year old. 
It’s just learolog to fly.”

What They Brought.
The teacher, after telling the Christ 

mas story, was questioning the lufsnt 
class.

"Now, who can tell me what the 
wise men brought to tbu baby Jesus?” 
she asked.

Slx-ycarold Alexander waved a 
chubby hand.

"I know, teacher? Cold an' Lin­
coln cents an* myrrh,” be triumphant 
ly exclaimed.

f|l6 FOLEY
f l P I B Y H U S

Backache Rheumatism 
K idneys and B la dd e r

We win atart yes earning M U SIS dally at 
home Jo apar« time slivering mirrors. Book­
let free. Amerlraa Mirror Cerreepeodlaf 
School, 4IS I ullertea ISldff., St. Laule. Me.

snmsss
gO lf N L.TJIOMI’SON SONS A Trojr,M,Y.

FROM INDIAN TEPEE TO WASHINGTON FLAT
No one would Imagine that the rath­

er handsome, splendidly proportioned 
brunette, w ho 
presides over a 
section of the 
claims division of 
the Indian office 
at Washington, 
and who is known 
to her fellow 
clerks aa Mrs. 
Marie L. Baldwin, 
Is really a three- 
q u a r t e r  blood 
"red skin” with 
an Indian name. 
N-Dan:Sis, mean­
ing the daughter

of a chief.
Thoroughly cultured and speaking 

English far more correctly than some 
of her acquaintances to whom it is the 
mother tongue, Mrs. Baldwin Is none 
the less an Indi&n and Uncle Sam 
prides himself on his sense of fairness 
in placing her where she has a part 
In settling the claims of dealers who 
furnish supplies to her own people.

Her face Is of an enviable olive tint, 
her balr, soft, brown and slightly wav­
ing, is luxuriant as Is that of all wom­
en who have gone hatless through 
youth. Incidentally, she displays a 
truly “pale-face" vanity In this same 
adornment. One of her first remarks, 
after the caller had boldly enthused 
over her crowning glory, was "But I 
don’t get any credit foT It! Just be­
cause every second woman wearB rats, 
or puffs, nr braids, or all three, every­
one concludes that 1 do also."

She has the large, dark, inscrutable 
eyes which cause so many students to 
insist that the red man came original­
ly from the east. No suggestion of 
her eyelids are momentarily lowered

to be quickly raised again—In itself a 
plainsman's habit—and then a faint 
tinge of crimson In their velnlng is re­
vealed.

But Bhe is an Indian all the same, as 
she proudly Insists, even Chough she 
talks without a trace of accent.

"Indians never have any accent.” 
she explained, "unless they have 
learned French or Spanish before Eng­
lish and permit a reminiscent hint of 
them to creep in. Our own language 
Is made up of dead monotones, with 
each syllable pronounced and it en­
ables us to speak alien tonguea with 
whatever accent they require."

Mrs. Baldwin chats as readily In 
French as In her childhood tongue; In­
deed, far more so, since, she confessed 
with reluctance, her knowledge of her 
native language Is departing. For 
more than half a dozen years she has 
been here In Washington.

"Now, when I go near my own peo­
ple." she confessed sorrowfully, "1 
hear whole sentences of which I know 
not the meaning. And that Is a! dis­
grace with them. Sometime ago I was 
sent on a special trip for the office 
among the Indians and I realized then 
that 1 was growing . frightfully far 
away from them—not only in speech 
but in dress, Ideas and appearance. 
But in one thing an Indian never 
changes”—and unconsciously Mrs. 
Baldwin drew her figure up until, she 
appeared to gain several inches—“1' 
mean In the feeling of the heart. It 
explains why so many of us, after be­
coming educated, return to live the 
same as before.”

Listening, one caught the chant in 
her voice and saw visions of sweeping 
plains, a circle of indignant braves 
and, In their midst, a humiliated figure 
In store shoes and a college rig.

INVENTOR OF DOUBLE-FLOWERING PETUNIA
It was an American woman. Mrs. 

Myrtle Shepherd Francis, of the
quaint old mission 
town of San Buena 
Ventura, Ventura- 
by-the-Sea. w ho 
recently succeed­
ed simultaneously 
with the noted 
German hybridist 
In what seed- 
growers of many 
nations have for 
years been striv­
ing to produce—a 
Belf-feedlng, dou­
ble-flowering pe­
tunia!

The result of this young California 
floriculturist's splendid work with this 
popular flower Is said to bid fair to 
revolutionize the double petunia busi­
ness. In the six years that Mrs.
Francis has been working and experi­
menting with petunias and In the cre­
ating of new flowers she has won wide 
recognition, and today, she is recog­
nized, not only In America, but in 
England, In scientific and trade cir­
cles, and her recent achievements 
have made the name of Mrs. Myrtle 
8hepherd Francis known among hy­
bridists of two continents. She Is a 
member of the American Breeders’ 
association, and her double-seeding 
petunia was announced in a recent Is­
sue of the American Breeders’ Muga* 
zlne, Washington, D. C.

Mrs. Francis Is the daughter of the 
late Mrs. Theodosia Burr Shepherd, 
known as the Mother of Flowers, or 
the feminine wizard of the plant 
world, who was recognized as one of 
the world's greatest hybridists. Mrs.

Francis says: "It Is my greatest am­
bition to round out the life work of 
my mother, which she felt was but 
begun and all things point to a real­
ization of that ambition."

Among her marvelous new crea­
tions In petunias, which are her spe­
cialty, are petunias of such extraordi­
nary size and beauty In form, texture 
and color as to surpass all others; 
many of the hybridized species are In 
their rosette like doubleness very sim­
ilar to a carnation, while one of the 
favorites is the new single "orchid 
flowering,” which bearR a close re­
semblance to an orchid. The huge 
flowerR are supported on long, grace­
ful stems, and the dainty overlapping 
petals arc exquisitely ruffled and flut­
ed, and of a rich satiny texture, with 
the widest imaginable color range, 
seemingly embracing a!) the delicate 
hues and tints of the rainbow.

This energetic young woman has 
many interests, but first and above 
all else is her home, and she con­
siders her petunia work an aside; yet 
In the six years that she has been 
manager of the business, aside from 
her marvelous new creations in petu­
nias, she Is conducting a most suc­
cessful general florist business. Mrs. 
Francis Is a member of various clubs 
and associations; since the advent of 
equal suffrage, delegates from the vari­
ous womens’ clubs In Ventura have 
been admitted to the local chamber 
of commerce. Mrs. Francis was the 
delegate from the Shakespeare club, 
of which she Is the president for the 
ensuing year. In the chamber she Is 
on the landmarks committee, which 
is a subject of great interest to her.

CROWN PRINCESS REFUSES TO KEEP HOUSE
Crown Princess Cecllle of Germany 
is signified her Intention never to 

keep house again. 
She has become 
a disciple of the 
latest c u s to m  
among the mem­
bers of the higher 
circles of the 
fatherland an d  
elsewhere — that 
of living In the 
fashionable hotels 
o r  b o a r d in g  
bouses.

And 0, what a 
rage It has put 
the kaiser In! He 

Is not so angry at Cecl'e herself as he 
Is at the Princess of Pless, who put 
the Idea into his daughter-in-law’s 
bead.

The emperor fears the tottering of 
traditions tnay follow this Innovstion 
among the high and mighty. The 
war lord, though  progressive In many 
things, clings tenaciously to kingly 
prerogatives. A Hohenzollern's castle 
la his home and s noble’s palace bis 
domicile. He wants these things kept 
up.

The crown princess says she likes 
the modern hotel.

The kaiser says he will have none 
of it.

The crown prince likes the crown 
princess and likes her Idea of liking 
the hotel. But-----

Since the kaiser la so set against 
the Idea the crown prince doern’t 
know just exactly what to do.

The Princess of Pless is living at a 
hotel and says she will continue to 
do so.

The kaiser rages, but the princess 
only smiles.

And there you are. How It will end 
nobody knows.

The Princess of Pless Is really to 
blame for It all TbU feud, primarily 
between one of the most powerful of 
Europe's rulers and one of the most 
beautiful women In the world, began 
when the princess suddenly became 
tired of her palatial home and took a 
large apartment in the most up-todate 
hotel In Berlin.

In doing this the princess gave birth 
to an Idea that became Immediately 
popular. Many of her friends follow­
ed her example. Thus the merry row 
extended. Her associates, one by 
one, closed up their homes and moved 
to fashionable boarding houaes.

WILL BE HOSTESS TO THE NEW PRESIDENT
Mrs. William Corcoran Eustls. daugh­

ter of a former vice-president of the 
U n 11 e d States 
and wife of the 
chairman of the 
Inaugural com ­
mittee. will be 
hostess to the 
president and his 
wife and daugh­
ters at the Inaug­
ural ball on 
March 4.

While it is not 
probable, as has 
b e e n  generally 
stated, that Mrs. 
Eustls will lead 

the grand march with President Wil­
son, sbe will bo tbs first to greet tbe

presidential party when It enters tho 
ball room and will follow close behtnd 
them on the arm of her husband to the 
promenade.

The president and Mrs. Wilson will 
circle the room twice and wilt then 
be Invited to a seat In the gulh ry, 
where they can see the dancing. Utt­
er they will be ecorted by the inuug- 
ural committee, Mr. and Mrs. Eustls 
leading, to the supper room, where 
Mrs. Eustls will play the part of hos­
tess to the distinguished guests

Mr. and Mrs. Eustls will have prom­
inent seats on the stand near Presi­
dent-elect and Mrs. Wilson during the 
inauguration ceremonies, and among 
their duties will be to greet and make 
at ease the notables In Wasblugton 
at that time.

IDEA ANNOYED OLD GOLDE

He Knew From Experience That Col­
lege Education by No Meane 

Unfitted Boy for Work.

"Woodrow Wilson naturally believes 
In a college education for boys and 
girls alike," said a banker at tho 
Princeton club In New York.

"Mr. Wilson, lunching with me here, 
once said In his quaint way that the 
old Idea about a college education un­
fitting a lad for work had quiet diod 
out.

"We no longer hear," he declared, 
"stories like that of Gobsa Golde.

"When Gobsa Golde’s son Scatter- 
good,” he explained, "desired to go to 
Princeton, he said to tbe old man:

" ‘Pater, ts It true that boys who go 
to college are unfit for work after­
ward ?”

" ‘Of course It ain’t true!’ snorted 
the old man Indignantly. 'Why, I’ve 
got a Princeton graduate runnln' my 
freight elevator, two of my best coal 
heavers are Harvard A. B.’a and a 
Yale B. S. is my star truck driver/”

Trouble for the Future.
First M. D. (from bedside of wealthy 

bachelor)—He Is sleeping naturally— 
he will recover. 8econd M. D.—Yes, 
the worst is over. First M. D—No, 
the worst Is yet to come. Second M. 
D.—How Is that? First M. D.—We 
have yet to break tbe news to his 
relatives.—Life.

R heum atism
Backache and

W e do  n o t ask you  to  b u y -  
ju st send yo u r nam e an d  address and  
receive a  sam ple b o ttle  free.

Z -M -O  penetrates to  bone th ru  skin and 
muscles and  rem oves pain 5 m inu tes after 
you apply it.

You piay not need Z-M -O today, yet tomorrow 
pay any price to relieve pain.

FREE BOTTLE
If you have Rheumatism, Backache or Piles write M. R. Zaê e) 

& Company, 901 Main Street, Sheboygan, Wisconsin and receive 
a free bottle of Z-M-O by return nuuL At drug stores, 2S cts.

Wm. A. Rogers Silverware
given away

Absolutely Free
fo r  wrappers from

GALVANIC SOAP
o r coupons from  Johnson*s W ashing Powder

This Is Our Offer, Read It:
For each teaspoon desired send us one two* 
cent stamp and twenty Galvanic Soap wrap­
pers (front panel only) or coupons from 
Johnson's Washing Powder.

SPECIAL OFFER FOR SIX TEASPOONS
Send 100 Galvanic Soap wrappers and 5 two-cent stamps 
to pay postage; we will send you a set of SIX TEASPOONS 
ABSOLUTELY FREE.

These spoons are Wm. A  Rogers silverware, the name 
stamped on every piece. They are the Lavigne or Grape 
Pattern, Heavy A-l Stiver Piate and guaranteed. You’ll 
be proud to own them. Go to your grocer today and buy 
Galvanic the soap used by a million housewives. This 
offer absolutely expires May 1st, 1913. Mail wrappers to

B. J. Johnson Soap Co., Milwaukee, Wis.

Wedding Rings That Wear.
Tbe next time you are married—or, 

If you will, when you are married— 
don’t buy a gold wedding ring. It 
Isn’t being done. Platinum wedding 
rings are the newest thing. Mile 
Jeanne Provost, a French actress, Is 
to blame. She thought of the idea, 
and when she was married to M. 
F'lrpo, she had one. Platinum ringa 
are more expensive than gold and 
wear better. Just why an actress, 
especially a French actress, should 
want a wedding ring that will last a 
long while, the Jewelers haven’t 
learned.

A Diplomat.
Son—Pa, la a diplomat a man who 

knows bow to hold his tongue?
Father—No, m y boy. A diplomat ia 

a man who knowa bow to bold bis 
Job.

Resented Hie Defection.
Mary and J&pies bad been good' 

friends for some years, but with tbe 
advent of some "new children” In the 
block James rather failed In bis alle­
giance for a time. Tbe "new chil­
dren" proving, after all, unsatisfac­
tory, he returned to Mary—wbo 
•corned hit advances.

"You needn't come over here no 
more, James," she told him. ‘Tv# 
done with you. You an' me was 
friends while you didn’t have no oth­
ers, but I ain’t goln' to be no last 
chance or common folks friends, 
James. You con go back to your 
show-off friends, for all of me.”

Almost Throwr?,'Away.
“The fish I bad from yesterday 

wasn’t fit to eat 1 waa obliged to 
give It to my servants I "—London

All the best varietiestifb^rrifsohlamlnew, 
the very best Peonies, Dnhli.’is, (lladiolas, 
Hoses, Fruit trees. Wonder blackberry.choice 
seed* for p ra te rs , T ruckers  a m i P lant 
G row ers. Sendtodfiv forour tofreelxioka. 
CO-OPERATIVE NURSERIES, IONIA, MICH.

Office Seekers Blue Book and Manual
Wrltum hr Washington Newspaper respondent 
who ha* enjoyed oontldoontuf I'rcuMcnt* and (Whileinnn f«r over ten ywara. Nnotharhook ilk* lu Mi­

ni ef 
.d u,down t know It* ruin*. Conuins *11 Information

i t« . _
plain* specifically whet stwiuld «n<i »h«uld not be 
done, ( l im  advantage ovor un old politician wh*

about Kourth CIbm Post Mailers, Consular Hcrvle# 
and (,’ItII Hflrtlm MmajlDattonv 'lu.c.iiitalnsoofn- 
prrheoelve list of I’r^sldnotl*! t.h ce, with nauie of 
occupant. salary and when sppolntAd. 1 6 0  pegs 
Illustrated. If.Oilby oral;. W l f i l l  
1'LH LlH llktt, i'K H Tlf AHIIOY, N. ' f .

FREE TO ALL SUFFERERS
If yon feel “out of aorta"—1“run dowo’*or, 'iot tbe 
blues," suffer f mm kidney.bluld#f.nsrvousdi»«*ss«, 
ebronlo wsakonssna, ulcers,akin oruptioiM.plles.Ae* 
write fur my tTKMMnook. Hlatlmmcot instructive 
medical book ever written Hietl* all about theae 
disease* and the rwjnarkablecaretsfferiedbviheNew 
Yreach Kernedy “THICKAPfON" No. J. S u l  No t  
end yua can deolde fur yuurael ft fit let be remedy for 
four ailment. Oun't eend a cent. It's absolutely 
rKMM. No ••follow-qp"eirctilent Dr.l^CTercMML 
Co., Havorelock fid-, Hauipatwad, l —*—. Baa.

3*T.-

I Cl mew ted bmuuftM tbs M t
iPrwoutse a laiu/uul frovtb.
IX tftr  Vella t *
. Bair to Ita T. 
[PrvraoU hair falirosfisrvssrirente nair ranior.

SINGLE
B IN D E R
ALWAYS aiUABLi

W . N. U., C H IC AG O , NO. 5-1913.

Have Yon a Disordered

«
 Stomach and liver?

Do you start the day feeling that the whole world is against 
you? You cannot nope to "make good” under these cir­
cumstances. Nobody can. You must have a clear brain 
and every organ in perfect trim to do justice to yourself.

Dr. P ie rce  s  C olden M edical D iscovery
Will Brin* Quick Relief

Dr. R. V. Pierce found years ago that a  glyceric 
extract of Golden Seal and Oregon grape roots, 
queen's root and bloodroot with black cherry bark, 
would aid in the assimilation of the food in the 
stomach, correct liver ills and m nature's own way 
enrich the blood, tone the entire system and con­
sequently help in the restoration of perfect health. Many 
who have used Dr. Pierce’s Golden Medical Discovery tes­
tify that they have been restored to health when sufterinfj 
from stomach and liver ills. Let this famous old medicine 
s ta rt today to  lead you to health and strength.

Aow—lfgou prefer—you tan obtain Dr. Pierce's 
Favorite Prescription tabitts o f your druggist 
at S i per box, also In 50c elxs or send 60 one-cent 
stamps to 11 K  Pieros, Buffalo, for a trial box.

You can learn «U about hygiene, anatomy, medicine, etc., from tbe 
I People 's Com m on Sente  Medical Adviser, b y  Dr. H. V. Pierce, m n e w ly  
revised, up-to-daU edition of which la now offerod, in cloth covers, 
post-paid, for 81 cents In one-cent atom pa, to cover coat of wrapping 

;and mailing only. Address, Dr. Pierce's Invalids Hold, Buffalo, N. Y.

Don’t be poisoned by »laggl*h boweli. Dr.Plerce’a 
Pleasant Pellets regulate and lavigorate stomach,
Jtrer and bowels. Sugar coated, tiny grannies.

T he Beat Physician* 
Gave H im  Up

“ I woe altarkM *IU) g  aaverw 
nervous dlm-aMt, which wan rauw-a 
l>y a dlaor4rfit‘| ■tomiiWi and ll»- 
*r." writes Ms. J*s. y .  »f
Wees iiiro, Trnn.,liouta Jloi U. 
“ All Rir Mends Uioniriit I would 
die end the bast physicians rare

Pie up. I woe »']riw.<l to try Or.
U»f« «•'• Ool'lnn Mv*l!c«|

•ry, and derived much l*'in»0t 
from aaui-. My reen lunl run w> 
ton*. It lud rbroulr,
that nothin* wogiil rffcrl a par. 
ttonent cure, but Or. V W trr 'g  
inadu-ltHi has done mu>h to r  u s. 
aud I highly rwcotmnciwl K. I 
pnertlly a<|v|sa ita an e spring 
Ionic end furlhor edvisa ailli.* 
|w-,ple Pi take h r ,  Pierre s uinrli- 
Clnas Iwfnrw Ih.-ir disease ba*« 
run ao long theiUierw u  uucboiica 
to be rurmj."
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G. 0. P. Convention

The Republican party nominated Hi 
slate ticket at the convention held in 
T.analog last week. With practically 
al) of tbelr differences adjusted at 
raeetiogs of committees and leaders of 
the so-called "progrosslve” and "reg­
ular" factions the Republicans nomi­
nated candidates for justices of the su­
preme court and minor offlces(to be 
filled at the spring election and adopt­
ed a platform that contaloed every 
plank which the delegates styling 
themselves progressives had agreed 
to Insist upon.

Harmony proved the keynote of 
the convention. Allan H. Frazer of 
Detroit, the temporary chairman, and 
Senator W. Frank James of Hancock 
urged it. "Stick together and fight 
the Democrats'* was the appeal which 
these two made to the convention. 
The following are the nominees:

Justices of the Supreme Court— 
Joseph 13. Steere, of Sault Ste. Marie; 
Joseph B. Moore, of Lapeer.

Superintendent of Public Instruc 
lion—Luther L. Wright, of Ironwood. 

Slate Highway Commissioner—
Frank F. Rogers, of Lansing, 

agents of Lhe Stato UdTy<Regents of the Stato University— 
W. H. Sawyer, of Hillsdale; Victor 
M. Gore, of Benton Harbor.

Discuss Phone Situation

Marquette is getting considerably 
wrought up over the telephone eltua 
lion and the common council of that 
city has taken cognizance of It to the 
extent of a resolution calling for an 
inquiry into the feasibility of inde 
pendent system to connect all city de 
partmenis. The action is not likely 
to get much beyond the inquiry stage 
for there are said to be constitutions 
obstacles which would have to be 
overcome before the city could pro* 
ceed with the project, even if it were 
deemed feasible from other viewpoints

The "pay-in-advance" rule ia par­
ticularly objectionable to Marquette 
people and la also encountering some 
opposition in Ncgaunee and Ishpem 
log. In thts connection it is noted 
that a bill has been introduced in the 
Michigan Legislature prohibiting 
telephone companies from collecting 
rentals more than a single month In 
advance.

Lengthy Litigation Ended

The chancery suit of William A. 
French, ns administrator for Honry 
Should Ice. against Christine I. Me 
Donald and others, which (none form 
and another has been peoding in Mar 
quelle county courts since 1BW, has 
been virtually ended by an opinion 
in which Judge Flaonigan, of the 
circuit court, sustains the claim of 
Freocb, as Sbouldice’s administrator, 
and seta aside the sale of certain min­
eral lands, subject to tbo right* of the 
mining company which purchased the 
mineral lands from the estate of Nor­
man McLeod, Mrs. McDonald being a 
laughter of the late Norman McLeod. 
The effect of the decision will be to 
provide a settlement of Shouidice's 
claim against tho estate, which now 
amounts to approximately 9900U.

' 0 1 ̂  ■ ■
Verdict of Accidental Death

The coroner's jury which investi­
gated the deaths of Fraok Mongait 
and Paul Piano, who were killed by a 
fail of ground in the Mary Charlotte 
mine on the 10th, returned a verdict 
of accidental death last Friday. The 
jurors made an unusually thorough 
investigation of the circumstances sod 
paid a visit to the scene of the acci­
dent. The men had tieen distinctly 
warned not to venture into the aban­
doned stupe.

Loses Hand

Are you in need
OF COAL? Need it right nowP

Phone your order to JAMES PICKANDS 
& CO. (Limited) then and have your Dins 
filled promptly w ith the best coal you could 
obtain.
U R Y  W O O D —A big supply of sound dry 19*inch Hardwood 

on band.

P ra r -W O O D -S o u n d  and Dry.

P O C K B K - W O O D - $ 5 .0 0  per load.

James Pickands &  Go., Ltd.
Baseball League

Present indications oow point to the 
reorganization of the former Mar- 
quette-Delta County Baseball League 
for the season of 1913, at least base­
ball enthusiasts in tbe four cities are 
planning on reviving baseball history 
In tbe Upper Peninsula like unto tbe 
season of 1911. That a baseball 
league will be organized for tbe com­
ing season seems a certainty.

Ulornt')1 John UonimUky, of Ksca- 
naha, had hi* left hund amputated 
last work, lie wa* accidentally shot 
in the wrist with h high powered rllle 
that he did not know wa* loaded. He 
was trying to kill a mouse and as he 
kicked al the small Intruder he struck 
tbe gun In such manner a* to dis­
charge it. Mr. Comtnlsky is known 
to quite a tew in Negaunee.

Old Ago

Old age as it come* in the orderly 
process ol nature is a beautiful and 
majestic thing, it stands for experi­
ence, knowledge, wisdom, counsel. 
That is old age a* it *hould, hut o)d 
age ns it ofen Is mosti* poor digestion 
torpid bowels, as tlugg.fth liver and n 
general feeling of ill health. des|M>nd- 
eney ttnd misery. Thts tn almost 
every iosUmce is wholU unnoc< ssary. 
One of Chamberlain'* Tablets taken 
)nutlet!lately alter sup|*er w ill improve 
the digestion, tone up the liver and 
regulate the bowels. That feeling of 
despondency will give way to one ol 
hope a: d g«HKl cheer. For sale by J. 
K O'Dnnofhue.

Ran into Car of Logs

As the North-Western morning 
passenger train, due here at 7 a.m ., 
was speeding past Brampton, a short 
distance north of Eacanaba, yesterday 
morning, the engine spread tbe point 
of a switch and beaded Into the side­
track instead of continuing on the 
main line. Some of the cars followed 
suit and others dung to tbe main line 
until further progress was ended by 
tbe engine crashing into a carload of 
logs on tbe siding. Everyone sus­
tained a pretty severe shaking up, but 
nobody was seriously injured. With 
nearly every car off tbe track, it was 
quite a task to get things straightened 
out and the track cleared. Tbe south­
bound day passenger ran down as far 
as tbe wreck and returned to Negaunee 
at 2:30 p. m., bringing such of tbe 
passengers as wished to come, but 
transfer of mail and express was im­
practicable. It was after 6 o ’clock 
before tbe wrecked train reached Ne­
gaunee, and it was then brought in by 
a freight train crew, the government’s 
limit of sixteen hours’ continuous duty 
for employes In railroad train service 
operating to prevent the regular crew 
from bringing tbe train In.

FOR RENT—Ten room apartment, 
including bathroom: desirably locat­
ed in Jackson street. Apply a t Iron 
Herald office.

Masked Ball

A grand mask ball will be given at 
tbe Labor Temple In this city to­
morrow (Saturday) evening Feb. 22d. 
Twenty-five dollars In cash prizes Is 
offered and a good time Is promised 
all wbo attend. Admission, 50 cents; 
balcony, 25 cents. Following is a 
list of the prizes:

Best character costume—1st, 15; 2d* 
•4; 3d, 92.

Best comic coitum e-lst, $4; 2d, S3: 
3d, II.

Most handsome costume—$3.00
Homllest mask—13.00.

▲  Cass of Appendloltls 
Nine times out of ten it is caused by 

a constipated habit. Tbe appendix 
becomes inflamed from a congested 
state of the bowels, the best preventa­
tive is to keep tbe bowels open and the 
movements regular. This can be done 
conveniently, comfortably and with 
good results to tbe whole body by 
taking an occasional dOee of Dr. HER­
RICK'S SUGAR-COATED PILLS. 
It ie a fine old cathartic remedy that 
does its work mildly and thoroughly. 
It helps digestion aod promotes ener­
gy and cheerful spirits. Price 25c per 
box. Sold by J. E. O’Donoghue, City 
Drug Store.

T h e B eat C ough M edlo lne

"I have used Chamberlain’s Cough 
Remedy ever since I have been keep­
ing house,’’says L. C. Hames, of Mar- 
bury, Ala. "1 consider It one of the 
best remedies 1 ever used. My child­
ren have all taken it and it works 
like a charm. For colds and whoop­
ing cough It is excellent.” For sale 
by J. R. O’Donoghuo.

FOR RENT—8uite of three to 
nice rooms on tbe second floor of 
Sundberg block. Apply to

J o h n  F . A l l i s o n ,
22tf Postoffice Block.

Don't You B e lie v e  It 
Sotno say that chronic constipation 

cannot be cured. Don't you believe It 
Chamberlain’s Tablets have cured 
others—why not you? Give them a 
trial. The; cost only a quarter. For 
sale by J. E. O'Douoghue.

Keb. 21-M arcb 14

M.HTATK OK MICIIMAN.
County o r  Makqukttk,

probate Oourt for Mid County. 
Node* Is hereby given, that I Intood, oe tbe 

tweaty-elghlh day of April oexl, at eleven 
o'clock tn the forenoon, lo  make application to 
said Probate Court (or an order changing my 
name from Andrew Jobusoo to Andrew Lind- 
Qiilst according to the proviftoo* of tbe statute 
lu such ease made and provided.

Dated February lis t , A. D twin.
ANDREW JAHNPKN

Keb. 7- *>
PB0BATI NOTICE

HT4TK OK MICHIGAN,
Tlir Pmltate Court for the County ol Marquette 

At a M-toioaof said court. Iield at the |»robate 
office In (he City of Marquette, in said county, 
• m i  the btti day of February A. I>. ISIS 

Present linn W. T Poller. Judge of Piotwte 
In Hie Matter ol the Estate ol Amlrvw Uiuiil, 

Itacaaaed.
Moritr ||eim  having filed In said court hi* fin* 

al adinlnisiratiou account and his i«etnnw 
praying for Ihr allowance titer oof and for die 

fglititenl and distribution of lit* residue of 
•aid estate.

It la ordered, that the Nrd day of March A I). 
IMS, at two o'dhtck lu the aflernoou at aaid pro- 
hale office, tie and l* hereby appoltited for ex­
amining and allowing said account and hearing
Mid iM-utioii;

It I* further ordered, that putilionoltAe there­
of tie given by puhlirtbm of a cop) ol this order 
for three *ui'<*aalve weeks p m  luua to aaid day 
of hearing. In the KRuArxrtK nun* Hkhai.p 

tiew*pH|K-r primed and rircolvlrd lu aaid 
county.

An Important Part in 

the Proper Launder­

ing of Your Shirts.

If your collar band has "A" 

SHARP—you get it in the 
neck. Should the neck band 

"B” FLAT, it will seesaw 

and change your TEMPO, 

causing you to say words of 

discord tha t sound bad in 

company. No discordant 

objections here! We "see" 
NATURAL. We shape the 

band to  fit and your collar 
will not ride on it—a dis­

tinction with a difference 

worth your careful thought. 
Try us.

NEEDHAM BROS.
Lamdiriri-Dprt-CInnirs

Both Phones - Ishpemlng

Ntgiimei Apnt:—FBED BATH,
Ikll Phone 24 J.

w T. IHTTKll, 
Ige «d Pru 

. TlNrHKKl.!., Prelude Clerk.

Nual
A true copy. Judge of protwte.

Ki.i.a M.

Feb. 1 -  >

P r o b n  ( v  N o f  fop 
f t a t r  ok  Mic h ig a n .
The Proltate Court for the ikmniv ol MarqueUe

At a se*»ion of said Court, held al the Prohair 
Offiee in the (*11)-of Marquette in said Count), 
on the fifth da> of February A. l> ISIS

Present: Hun. W. T. Poller. Judge of Probate
In the Matter of the Ksiate of Hamuel Milch- 

Pll
Thomas 1‘eilow. William | |  Wallers and Co­

lon Trust Company having filed lu said court 
their fifth and sixth accounts and their petition 
praying lor the allowance thereof.

Il Is Ordered, That the third day of Msrrh 
A. I). I*u, at two o'clock m the afternoon, at 
said piobatr office, tie and I* hereby appoint*} 
for examining and allowing said account and 
heariug said petition i

li is Fiirtliei Ordered, Thai nubile notice 
fheietn U* given by publication ol a copy ol till* 
order, fur three mccesslve wees* pievtou* to 
s«td day ol hearing, lu the Nnuai ar.r Inn* 
llRliAi.t*, a iiewapap. i printed amt circulated 
lu said county.

>eal tv. T piUTKK.
A Due copy Judge of Pmlmte

El.la M Tincknri.i . Piobaie Clerk.

Q  Solve
foe all Kt#

—SOlvod OBOS 
for all by Calomel. 

For daily dm la nillioos of kitchens haa 
provad that Calumet Is highest not only Is 
qua lity  but \*U aven ing fou>»r% * wall—go- 
failing ia result*—pure to tbe extreme—and 
wonderfully economical io n*e. Aik yoar 
grocer. And try Calumet oexl bake day.

RECEIVED HIGHEST AWARDS

Come and have a 
game of Pool at

- J O N E S *  

Billiard and Pool Parlors
408 Iron Street

NEW P0.0.L AJND 
BILLIARD TABLES.

We have a fine line of Cigars, 
Tobacco and Pipes.

Candies, Chocolates, Etc.

W . H . J O X B 8 ,  P r v p ’r

Safe-Convenient-Private
Are your valuable papers now kept in a  place 

where you know they are absolutely safe by loss 
from fire and other causes?

Are your valuable papers now kept in a  conveni­
ent place where you m ay examine or procure them 
a t a  moments notice?

Are your valuable papers now kept in a  place 
affording you absolute privacy?

If not, we advise you to place them to-day in a 
safety deposit box. The rent is #3 a  year.

T h e  N e g a u n e e  

N a t i o n a l  B a n k
N EG AUNEE, M IC H .

CAPITAL AND SURPLUS - $120,000.00

OFFICERS:
E. N. Brextunq, President.

Philip Levine, Vice-President. C. Meilleur, Vice-Preeldent. 
H. C. Wagner, Cashier.

J. H. A n d e r s o n ,  Aee’t Caebier.

Special Attention Given to Banking by Mail

r DR. JO SE PH  L. SHOREY 
OSTEOPATHIC PHYSICIAN 

or MARqrrrr*
W IL L  B e  IN  N C O A U N C C  

Tneeduys tod  Friday* from ID) 5 p.m.
beginning Tuesday. Oct. tfnd.

0 T  OSSICK IN THK KINKWOOD DLOCX.

W A T C H
-FOR-

Special Sale!

Something that Every Fam­

ily Needs and Prices that 

Mean Big Savings

Andrew Erickson,
IRON ST.. NEGAUNEE.

THE

! V O L U N T E E R
ORE GO.

I
i  
i

i
i
«
5
<

: Bessemer Ore.
-PRODUCERS O F -

Jao. 17—Feb. 21
Notice for Publication.

DEPARTMENT OP THE INTERIOR,
U. 8. Land Offleeat Marquette, Michigan,

January ) \  ioi:j 
iesft.1Notice If hereby given that Jam es: 

of Northland. Michigan, who. on September ii),
Stephen*

vi iivnuiauu. ranuiaoiii miw.wu or̂ itRl))Gr .0,
1907, made Homestead Entry No. 12358, Serin) 
No. 01611. for W * of BWH of Seetlon 27. and 
8EK of SE L,Section 2 ft.TownshlptiN-.Range 
29 Michigan Meridian, ha* filed Dotlceof 
lotentioo lo make five year Proof, to establish 
claim to the land above described, before the 
Clerk of the Circuit Court of Delta County, at 
Escaoaba, Mlchlgao, on the 29th day of Febru- 
arr, 1913. .

Claimant name* u  witnesses: t
Clifford Charboaneau. Charles Walker, Wil­

liam Price, Robert Teuscher, all of Nortbtnndr 
Michigan.

OZBO A. BOWEN.
Register.

G e t  a  C a n  

T o d a y

CUT n 
!

G. A . TOMUNSON,
President and Traaaurer.

Duluth, M Id d .

C. A. CONGDON,
Vioe-Prealdeot,

Duluth, Minn,

J ames Wanlefy.
becretary.

Duluth, Mlon. 

Edward J. Maney,
Aasletaot Treasurer.

Duluth, Minn.

Thomas Fellow,
General buperlnteodeut.

Negauoee, Mich.

F l o w e r s .
Rout, Cirmtkiu, Antrlein Buitiis, 
Violets, Elites and Cilia Lilies 
Tulips, Lilies of th* Villtf, 
Roasi) Hpsclsths, Nsrclssl

POTTED PLANTS 
in Bloom

Azslsit, Clierirlis,
Dulls, Priarosss, Cjclisss, 

Llllss sf III Villsf, Tillps, Hyiclrths
PALMS end FERNS

We deliver any piece you 
say and guarantee 

aatiafaction.

N egaunee
G reenhouses

Negaunee, Mich.
BOTH ’P H O N E S .

«*eet«'e **'• 
taeasiss**. 

c*iM*e. ill. 
•erle !■*••* 
tie* FraeM. 
Mere*,
*<l.

CURES 
OBSTINATE  
COUGHS

r “ - >
K

ROUTS  
STUBBORN  

COLDS
T H E  K IN G  O F  C U B E S

DR. KING'S
NEW  DISCOVERY

FOR ALL D ISEA SES OF

THROAT

Kav don't sene money loArn you fay 
r hoop of btg'can baling wdtt, Don t 

fa milled. Buy Calumet. It i 
economical — snore uholtmme — f i i 'u  

h«tt rtMi/fj. Calumet a fat superior (o 
tour milk end tod*.

QUICKEST  

W H O O P I N G  

C O U G H  C U R E

AND

LUNGS
PRtOC 

>Oe A 91

H EA LS 
W EA K , 

S O R E  LU N G S

4

Y l’ r

>  ir  <

SOLO AND GUARANTEED BY 1

X

)
1
I
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Holding Exercises

The local schools are holding ex* 
erciees to-day in honor of Washiog- 
Son’s birthday which falls on Satur­
day. This is the first time that this 
legal holiday has occurred on Satur­
day for several years and it will .'not 
effect the school this year so far as 
“ a day off” is concerned.

Captured a Bob Cat

We learn from The Iron Index, of 
February 15tb, published at Marble, 
Minn., that William Webb, formerly 
>f this city, captured alive a large* 
Ixed bob cat, which he now has caged 
tod on exhibition at his home. He 
otends selling the animat to the man­

ager of some park.

First Degree Work

Negaunee members of the Isbpem* 
log Council of Knights of Columbus 
bave been notified to atteod a meeting 
to  be held at Braastad’s hall, Isbpem* 
lug, next Sunday afternoon, at 2:30 
o'clock, when a class of candidates 
will be Initiated to the first degree 
honors by the Isbpemlng degree team. 
A luncb and "smoker” will follow the 
Initiation.

Must Pay Up
Following instructions from the 

Common Council Superintendent of 
Public Works Chris Hansen has col­
lectors out after delinquent electric 
light and water consumers. There 
are quite a number of delinquents and 
these are earnestly requested to pay 
sip at ooce and avoid further trouble 
In the matter. There will be no ex­
ception to this rule.

Skip the Story Hour

The Negaunee Public Library will 
be closed ta-morrow in observance of 
Washington's birthday and the usual 
Saturday afternoon "Story Hour" 
will likewise be skipped. "TheStory 
Hour”  wfff be resumed the following 
Saturday afternoon aod there are not 
likely to be any furtner interruptions 
until the work Is discontinued for the 
summer.

Another Championship Race

For tome time past Peter Girard, 
boor manager at the Palace Roller 
Pink, has been claiming his ability to 
•how bis beets to the speediest of Mar­
quette oounty skaters aod in order to 
"'prove up” has agreed to a two-mile 
race on rollers with Stewart Johnston, 
the present champion of the county, 
the contest u> take place at the Palace 
Poller Rink In this city on Thursday 
evening, March 6tb.

Olrard has a good reputation as a 
faucy and trick skater on rollers, be­
sides the advantage of having com­
peting in numerous one-mile races. 
•*Hutte” Johnston, who has proven 
blmself to bo "mighty swift”  on roll­
ers by capturing the championship of 
Marquette countv, Is not worried over 
the outcome of the coming contest, on 
the contrary, he feels confident of re­
taining bis reputatioo. The race will 
nevertheless be close aod exoltlog as 
both parties can “go some.” Admis­
sion to everybody, Iti cents.

Those Michigan Names

There is a young man at Pipestoo 
Burned Willie Grow. Let it be hoped 
that he will.

Constable Coward lives in Antrim, 
souoty, which by tbe way, is a punk 
same for a constable, no matter bow 
retiring he may be. It. U. Going la 
B bustoees man at Menominee, whose 
same does not sound like an Invita­
tion to remain. Miss Zura is a music 
teacher down in 8t- Joe county who 
souods like a state.

Joshua Feather of Baroda, we learn 
• In bed with the grip. Feathers are 
sw ralff Id beds. Helen Hunt, yes 
fleen Hunt, you’ve beard of her. 
;fefe one lives at St. Joseph. Jva 

W right Uvea at Berrien Center. Of 
sourae she has.

HI Garret lives at Cedar Lake, but 
then ooe never bears of a low garret 
William Waltz lives at Gleolord. 
Wait* us arouod again, Willie.

S t  John'* Episcopal Church

{Services at St. John's Kplscopal 
Church next buoday will be at tbe 
•esa i hours.

Listen services are held every Fri­
day.si 4 aod 7:30 o’clock p. m.

fllsbop G. Mott Williams will be lo 
t o  parish for Confirmation on Pas- 
ton Sunday, March ktb.

NEGAUNEE, MICHIGAN, FRIDAY, FEB. 21, 1913.

Happy Surprise Party

Mr. and Mrs. August Allen were 
given a pleasant»surprise at their 
home In tbe city building last Wed­
nesday evening, tbe occasion being 
Mr. Allen’s birthday. Tbe number 
present is estimated at nearly one 
hundred, in fact the residence was fill­
ed to capacity. Both Mr. and Mrs 
Allen were equal to the occasion, how­
ever, and entertained tbeir friends in 
a royal maoner,

John H. Davey Dead

Word has beeo received here of the 
death of John H. Davey, formerly of 
Negaunee, which occurred at the home 
of bis son, Fred Davey, at Seattle, 
Wash., on Monday. Deceased was 
ubout sixty-four years of age and left 
Nugaunee some fifteen years ago to lo­
cate at Bessemer, where be remained 
until tbe death of his wife a few years 
ago. Mr. Davey is a brother of Wm. 
Davey of this citv. A brother, Thom­
as Davey, died at Champion last fall.

Methodist Episcopal Church

"The Divinity of Christ1’ will be 
tbe subject of tbe sermon by tbe pas­
tor, Rev. Hartley Cansfield, at the 
morning service at Mitchell Methodist 
Episcopal church next Sunday, it be­
ing tbe fourth sermon in the series on 
"Tbe AposLles’ Creed.”  At tbe even- 
log service the pastor will speak on 
"Tbe Spiritual Significance of Lent.” 
Sunday school will be held at 3 p. rn.

Uotil further notice tbe tnid-weik 
prayer meeting wilt be held on Wed­
nesday instead of Thursday evenings

Boosters All the Time

The following from the Stillwater 
Gazette applies to Negaunee just as 
well as to Stillwater:

"Stillwater needs boosters all tbe 
time. Success in aoy line calls for 
keeping everlastingly at it. Just as 
som as we succeed in one line we 
should, as a city aod for tbe city, 
take up other ideas, plans, sugges­
tions, etc., and demonstrate whether 
they are feasible or not. When they 
are to the advantage of Stillwater we 
should all pul our shoulders to the 
wheel and push, not pull back. Keep 
this in mind and we can contloue to 
Increase tbe wealth, bualneis and pop­
ulation of our city. Are you with 
us?”

Beaver Hunters Object

That the restrictions placed upon 
beaver hunters are too strenuous in 
this state is tbe opinion of many bea­
ver trappers. Tbe expensive license, 
together with the provision in 
the law which makes (t necessary fur 
every hunter to obtain permission 
from property owners before hunting 
on their lands, makes tbe seasoo of 
little value, according to the state­
ments made by men who have attempt­
ed to hunt beaver since tbe opening of 
tbe season.

Land owners have been found very 
strict In regard to allowing hunters 
on their premises. It is necessary 
for beaver seekers not ooly*t> fiod 
places where "no hunting” signs are 
uot posted Out to ask permission of 
the owners to bunt there.

Ttke No Chances With Grip

The grip, our ancient enemy, Is with 
us again.

It come* like a thief to tbe night. 
At llrst It is like a hard cold, with 
aches and palos and acute prostra- 
tloo. As we say, It "takes tbe tuck 
out o fu i.” If we are wise, we give 
In to it and set ourselves lo the ex­
clusive task of getting well. If we 
are foolish, we try to keep going, aod 
thus Invite deadliest peril.

Take no obaocee with tbe grip, Ills , 
dangerous. A train of evil oonse- 
queoses ofteo follow a neglected case 
of it,

When you get it, goto bed and oatl 
tbe docter.

Don't get up again uotil tbe doctor 
•ays so, and don’t go out uotil he says 
you may.

Don’t dose it with whiskey slings 
• nd coa! tar nostrums. Don't try to 
brave it out. You need a doctor, and 
you need tc drop your other affaire 
aod devote your time wholly to get 
ting your strength back,

Tbe grip isn't a trifling ailment, 
but a dangerous disease which calls 
for prompt expert treatment. You 
can make It trlfilog enough if you take 
care of yourself, and you make U a 
deadly tnlog If you oegiect It.

Live Stock Show Sound Advice to Youni  Men

At a meeting of tbe Marquette Coun­
ty Agricultural society, it was for­
mally voted to promote a big Upper 
Peniosula Live Stock exhibition to be 
held in connection with the 1913 coun­
ty fair, with a horse show as an addi­
tional feature.

Ski Tournament.

Don't lose sight of the fact that Ish- 
pemiog is to have, to-morrow (Satur­
day )—Washington’s Birthday—an an­
nual ski jumping contest, with a 
dog derby lo tbe forenoon of the same 
day. Noted jumpers will be present 
and, weather permitting, both events 
will doubtless be great drawiog cards

Little Lake Islands

Pick out twenty young men haphaz­
ard in this or aoy other community 
aod oot more than five of the Dumber 
are making an effort to save money. 
The indications are that the poor 
bouse of tbe future will bave to be six 
stories high with folding beds and 
cots in every room. Every young 
man, do matter how small his wages, 
should save a little money weekly, 
and deposit it in some bank, other 
than a faro bank.—Manlstique Pio­
neer-Tribune.

—The vaudeville attractions are 
drawing good crowds to the Star The­
ater this week.

—S. Makkl has purchased the mer­
chant tailoring business of Mr. 
Wuorl in Gold street.

At the United States Land Depart­
ment's auctioo sale last Saturday, A. 
C. Se&ss and Peter F. Barasa of this 
city purchased two islands in Little 
Lake. Tbe island purchased by Mr. 
Barasa contains about fourteen acres 
and is well wooded. Tbe ODe bought 
by Mr. Se&ss contains a little less 
than two acres. Both are valuable 
as locations for summer cottages, and 
it Is Mr. Barasa's inrention to build 
during tbe coming season. Mr. Seaes’ 
island is near to mainland property 
which be already owns.

Common Council.

—Some very interesting reading can 
always be found on tbe inside pages 
of the Iron Hbrald.

—Tbe Negaunee Greenhouses will 
bave &o exceptionally fine line of green 
carnations for St. Patrick's day.

—The early arrival of spring would 
convince many people that the winters 
of this section are not so bad, after 
all.

—Car) Allison, of this city, carried 
away tbe prize for best comic mask at 
tbe Elite roller rink la Isbpemlng on 
Wednesday evening.

—The street cars will oot ruo be­
yond the railroad crossing In Iron

An adjourned regular meeting of tbe Cora* 
moo Council of the City of Negaunee, Wat beld 
lo tbe City Moll Pehruary axh, DU.

Meeting called to order by Mayor Elliott.
Present-Aids. Neltun, Prouse. Collins, Lsr- 

ton. Ilogao, Wnsmuib. DrltcoU, Mitchell, Reg- 
ga'oa and 1 bomtu.

Mayor stated that object of meeting was the 
consideration of tbe petition of the Cleveland- 
Cliffs Iron Co.. George J. Maas and tbeU.nttorf 
Investment C‘». praying Council to have a cer­
tain portion of Malu Street vacated.

On motion of Aid Wasmuth supported by 
Aid. Nelson, Council took a recess of ten min­
utes

On motion of Aid Wutnutb supported by 
Aid Collins, tbe Council resekoded a resolution 
adopted at the ngular meeting on May g, 1912. 
requiring Mining Companies to pay due half 
the ripens* of cliauging roads on account of 
mining j>uri oses, herealfer Mining Companies 
to bear all of the expense.

Tin* followlug Resolution was read:
IIk It RgaoLVgn. By the Common Coii'ioll, 

of the City of Negaunee. that tbe route of that

K ton of M alnsireet.m enedtolotbe petition 
b y  T im  U tu v e la i id -C llfh  I r o n  C o m p * * f ,  

George J . Maas, tbe Lonstorf Investment Com* 
pauy. may be and hereby Is altered aod chang­
ed. aud that the portion of said Mala Htreet 
hereinafter described will be closed and discon­
tinued lo tbe manner aod subject, however, lu 
the following express terras and conditions:— 

l  That said The Cleveland-CHffs Iron Com* 
paoy, George J. Maas and tbe hoostort luvest- 
ineot Cotnimtiy shall secure aod oonveytothe 
City of Negauoee by a proper deed of convey 
anoe.arlght of way for street purposes alone 
tbe route shown ou the map hereto attached 
aod which route is more particularly described 
as follows:—

street to-morrow, in order to handle 
tbe crowds to the ski races.

—The political pot Is beginning to 
boil, and there is evidence that there 
are patriots who are willing to serve 
the city in an office holding capacity.

—The Roosevelt-Newett libel suit 
has again beeo postponed aod ff not 
again postponed will be tbe first case 
*t May term of circuit court—May 20
6 r  27. _______________

—The iron ore stockpiles are grow­
ing and the railroads of the Mar­
quette county range expect ao unusu­
ally busy season in 1913. At all 
events, the companies will be prepar­
ed to ship an increased output next 
season if called upon to do so.

—Tbe dates for tbe Upper Peninsula 
Bowling Tournament to be beld at 
Ishpemlng have been set for tbe week 
of March 10th. It will undoubtedly 
be the most Important bowling tour-

Beglnuiugata point where tbe North Hue 
of Main street Intersects the old Baldwin 
Kilo road; ttnmee Northwesterly following 
the Kast side of (Orbit's seoood addition, 
glso otherwise known as the Keoe Ttack for 
sd tsu o o e o flM ’,- thenee e u r r l o t  o o iio o '  
radius curye to the light for a distance of 
5k'; thence North i  degrees Kast for a dis­
tance of 474'; thence curving to the 
right ou a l W radius curve for a distance of 
HB'i thence North 48 degree* #> minute* 
Hast for a distance of 847’; thence curving lo 
the right ou a Ifio' radius curve for a dis­
tance of 111'; Uieuoe due Kast for a distance 
ofjolil' more or lea# lo a poJot where Main 
street Is Intersected by the Hast line of the 
old Medard Gauthier rarm.

Bald conveyance shall coutain suitable reserva 
tlous covering all mluhig and mineral rights, 
including the right to cave and destroy the same 
wheu required In the ordinary course of mining 
operations. Bald streetshalfbegraded and Im­
proved by and under the direction of the Board 
of Public Works, and said City of Negaunee and 
Hie expeiise thereof shall be borne and paid by 
the Clevelanddiff* iron Oompaoy.

i. That If aud when said right of way so con 
veyed, orany part thereof, shall he required for 
milling purposes, said petitioners, their helm, 
succeasors or asstgiis, snail In like maoner se­
cure an l i-niivey to the < liy of Negaunee by the 
same kind of conveyance another right of way 
descr bed in the preceding paragraph aud slung 
a route which shall tie convenient and desirable 
for Midi purDo-ea Bald street shall be graded 
aud Improved by and under tlie direction of the 
Hoard of Public Works and said City of Negau 
nee and the expense thereof shall be boruc and

Bald as directed by the Commou Council ut that 
n.e.
k. That the portion of Main Btreet to be 

closed as herelu provided shall remain open for

Fmbllc use so loog as It Is eoiisldrrod advisable 
iy Tbe Cieveland-CIIITs Iron Company; that the 

Cliyof Negaunee shall at all times r« tain Its 
present title lo said port loo of Kast Mhiu street, 
aud that wheu The Clevelsod-Cliff* Iron Com 
patty, or Its mtooessori. or the assigns or 
of said petilhmers. shall have completed llieir 
milling operations underueath and adjacent in 
the portion of Matu street hereinafter described

«>• City of Negaunee shall then hate the right.
p desires to do so, fo fill In. repair and restore 

said Kast Mam street and opeu the sains for 
nubile use.

4. That the portion of Main Btreet hereinaft­
er disunited may bsolosed and discontinued 
upon the terms aod conditions set forth In this 
resolution Wheu tbs same la deem d unsafe hy 
The I'h-velaud-Clllts Iron company fur puhin- 
ubh for Btreet purposes, such portion of the 
street being descrllted as follows;—

HeglunTug at a point on Main Btreet. Ha- 
gaunee alter# tile same Is lutersected by 
Ura East line of Mlue Htreet produced, 
thence Northeast along said Mam Btreet to 
a point North nf the vacated Negaunee City 
Cemetery where (he same street Isintersect- 
sd hy the Kast line produced of the farm 
formerly owned hy Msdard Gauthier, the 
description of wltlflii Is recorded lu Mlrar 
“P" of Deeds, page AID
A. That this resolution shall become effective 

upon the Qling of a written acceptance signed 
I hy said petitioners agreeing to comply with ami 

perform tbs terms and condltlous iierelnbelore 
sst forth.

Ou mottou of Aid. lleggHtou supported by Aid 
Nelson, Resolution was adopted by the unani­
mous vote of the Council.

The msttor of Kmuloyee’s Compensation Act 
was referred to the Vloaooe Committee 

Oh motion Council then adjourned.
JOHN T. BURN8, Recorder.

—Tbs parent wbo believe* every 
word tbe son aod daughter tell them 
lo regard to the conduct of tbe teach­
er, is very likely to tblok 111 of thu 
teecber aod without just reason, It 
is natural for youth to be prejudiced 
aod to reseat puDlshtDeot even If it Is 
Just. Many a good school la spoiled 
by tbe parents upboldiiog pupils whoo 
the proper treatmeot would be to up­
end them aod use tbs ooal shore).

□ament ever beld lo Marquette couoty 
and will be attended by a cumber of 
the crack bowlers of tbe peoinsula.

A D V X B T U Z D  L B T T B fiB .

The following letters were uucallcd for at tbe 
Negsuuee postoltlce Keb, Wth, ISIS. Persons 
calling for them will please My advertised: 
Heluooen, Kstrl

Terms of Circuit Court

The terms of Circuit Court io Mar­
quette county for the preseot year, 
1913, will open oo the followlog dates: 

February 10th, second Mooday 
May 26th, fourth Monday 
September 2d, first Tuesday 
December 1, ttret Mooday.

REAL ESTATE AND
GENERAL INSURANCE

O. O. S U U IE R S ,
NBBLY BLOOK,

Lake Superior ft Ishpemlng 
Hallway.

l  s  a  i

Munlslng, Marquette aud 
South-Eastern By.

Io  effect b eg in n in g  B u n d s/,  
J u n e  a . 1 0 1 9 .

TRAIN AKR1VKB NEGAUNEE 
daily exoept Buoday

/rota MUN1HING. Mar- (ft 19 1

auetleandallluternra- i v i i a e i  
late points.

TRAIN hKAVKB NKGAL'NBE 
dally exoept Bunday

Marquette.Hkaudla. * Eft a 
awsou.Rumley CUat f
am. dJUNlBlNG. PRINCE!

■
OS

SUNDAY TKAINH:
For MarqueKe. Princeton and Mu- 

ulslng will leave Negaunee at 1 Al 
a. m. aod 4 :0  p.m.

Trams will arrive inmj Munlslng aod 
Prlnoetou IldJIa m. and #17 p. m

PABST
The Beer of Quality

CHARLES JOHNSON, A p t  j 
Negaunee, Michigan. I

| Cleanliness and Purity are Prime
> Factors in every stage of the 
| P abst Eight-Day Malting
> P rocess, And all the whole*
[ some.healthful food prop*
• erties of the barley grain
[ are found in our

Bavarian Bohemian 1
Blue Ribbon Export

Pronnt Attiitloi to Hill or PIoh Orders:

Job Printing

See Us
Before
Going
Else-
where

1
Letter H 

Env 
Wed 

Potters

Ŵe are here to 
serve you with 
anything in the 
line of printed 
stationery for 
your business 
and personal 
use. □  □  □  □

eads Bill Heads 
elopes Cards 
Idinft Invitations 
or Announcements 
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The best quality of work 
at prices that are RIGHT

OUR
ADVERTISING

are read by the people 
because it gives them 
news of absorbing in­
terest People no longer 
go looking about for 
things they want—they 
go to their newspaper 
for information as to 
where such things may 
be found. This method 
saves time and trouble. 
If you want to bring 
your wares to the atten­
tion of this community, 
our advertising columns

Should
Contain Your 
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□ □ □ □ □ □ □
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Call ior tbe product ol tbe

Upper Peninsula Brewing Co.
U

THE SUPERIORITY OF THIS II

PRODUCT IS UNQUESTIONED. ||

A Specialty is made of our Tonic.

You can obtain our product by merely telephoning or 
addressing a postal card to

JOHN A. WASMUTH.
Agent Negaunee,

Upner Peninsula Brewing Oo. Mieh.

E v e r y  
Q u e s t i o n  

-An s w e r e d

It’s a pleasure
dressing beds with

w ia m u n is ir o s m i
Louk lev 
•Mr------ MSQBESS =■••verr 

Kaiutsi
Fitsas It answers every requirement—every question—too. 

nicely—Is absolutely PURR and CLEAN. Made In the 
handsomest patterns of SATIN FINISH, DUSTPROOF 
TICKINGS.

The "Webbing Process,” employed exclusively in ALL 
Stearns ft Foster Mattresses, unites the tiny Cotton fibres 
Into 860 Aluiv, lacy webs, all of w hich have acquired the 
UTMOST LIFE and RESILIENCE. A more COM­
FORTABLE—more ENDURING mattress could not pos­

sibly he made.
« r

Open Closed 
Thl* S'vk* no 
«*«iy Mam«M

YOU CAN SEE WHAT’S IN S ID E , TOO 
ft POSITIVE GUARANTEE ON EVERY MATTRESS 

Como in to-day—Several sty'tt to choose from.

JOHN W. ELLIOTT
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HOT BISCUIT,
hot cakes, matte wHh 
ROYAL Baking Powder 
are delicious, health­
fu l and easily made.

R E P U B L IC
Ad exceedingly interesting meeting 

of Beacon lodge, Knights of PythiM, 
was the session held Tuesday evening, 
when a clast of twelve was Initiated in 
the presence of Grand Vloe Chancel­
lor Vaudewalker and a number of oth­
er visiting brethren from Lower Mich­
igan, the Chopper Country and points 
nearer by. The grand vice chancel­
lor's visit was in the course of bis 
periodical inspections of subordinate 
lodges throughout the state, and 

* while the public was not apprised of
the state official's "findings,” it Is 
nevertheless known that Beacon lodge 
made a good showing In the manner 
in which it handled the initiatory and 
other work. The social side of the 
gathering was equally pleasant, for 
the members were fortified for their 
arduous session by a 6 o’clock chicken 
dinner and there were several inter­
missions which gave opportunity for 
visiting and local members to improve 
mutual acquaintance.

In a letter to a Marquette county 
friend, John E. Voegtlin, of Fort 
Wayne, Ind., states that the Kloman 
mine has been placed with a party of 
Chicago and other capitalists, who 
not only iotend to put the mine Itself 
into active operation but plan to con­
centrate the Iron ore from the jasper, 
which Is so plentiful on the property 
and which has hitherto been a waste 
product. The option was formerly 
turned over to the new company at 
on the last day of January, Mr. Voegt­
lin aodTboburn Gibson, of the Men­
ominee raoge, being among the part­
ies who were present at the confer­
ence. The Marquette county people 
who are interested in the Kloman 
property believe that the new holders 
of tne option are financially equipped 
to undertake the work and that it is 
their intention to proceed with the 
task in a very thorough and system­
atic manner, though it is not likely 
that they will get their plans perfected 
and active operations under way 
much in advance of the opeuing of 
spring.

Mrs. E. E. Lamb and bod, Cyril,ar­
rived last Wednesday morniog from 
Ypsilasti, where they bad speot the 
greater part of the time since the death 
of Dr. Lamb. They wish to thank 
each and every one of the many 
friends in Republic and vicinity for 
every act of kindness shown them in 
their sorrow and for the many beauti­
ful floral tributes. It is not possible 
to express In words their appreciation 
of deeds so wonderfully kind and help­
ful, but the memory of such evidences 
of friendship will be a life-long com­
fort.

Mrs. D. McCarthy and son, William, 
of Gladstone, spent a week or more 
here, visiting Mrs. McCarthy's par­
ents, Mr. and Mrs. C. Lynch. The 
condition of Mrs. Lynch, who has 
bad a long period of ill health, was 
less favorable for about a • week, but 
during the past few days there has 
been quite a  little improvement. Wil­
liam Lynch, of 'Proctor, Minn., also 
spent a few days at the family home.

The Republic bowling team didn’t 
fare very well on Its recent expedition 
to Diorite, losing that particular 
series by 34 pins, but as the Republic 
team is still some 400 points to the 
good in the conte.t the experience at 
Diorite was not disheartening. The 
alleys at Diorite are considerably 
different from the local ones ana the 
Republic bowlers have not been able 
to get the bang of them.

Justice J . R. Peebles officiated at 
an auction sale last Tuesday moroiog, 
the building, tools, etc., owned by the 
late John Aldeopaa going under the 
hammer, by virtue of a chattel mort­
gage executed some time ago to J . F. 
Labold. The property was bid In at 
$75 by Mr. Labold.

The beer warehouse of Louis Lafor- 
als was destroyed by tire last 8uoday 
afternoon, and the proximity of this 
buildlog to the B. Levioe department 
store occasioned much concern re­
garding tne safety of tbe latter. The 
•ituatloo was further complicated by 
the fact that some of tbe hydrants In 
tbe vicinity were frozen, but tbe firr. 
men were able to keep tbe fiamee from 
doing damage to anything but tbe 
building originally attacked. Louis 
Levioe was out of town for tbe day 
and was spared tbe snxiety that would 
have been Inevitable had he been oo 
the ground, The beer which was 
•tored in tbe Laforiae warehouse was 
saved, but tbe building itself was a 
total loss. , ,

Capt. P W. Pascoe has had quite a 
siege of illness, having been confined 
to bis bed for the greater part of the 
past few weeks, but by the beginning 
of tbe present week be was In hopes 
to be permitted to move about tbe 
home within a few days.

Mr.and Mrs. Edmund Rlnguette went 
te Marquette last Bundxy to see tbelr 
son, Max, who recently underwent an 
operation for appendicitis at 8t. 
Mary's Hospital in that city. They 
found the young man getting along 
vtrv nloely. , ,

Tbe Young People’* Society of tbe 
Finnish Lutheran church met last ev­
ening at the home of Mr. and Mrs. 
Isaac Silberg. There was a very in­
teresting program and excellent re­
freshments aaded materially to the 
enjoyment of the evening.

Prof. C. A. Fobrroau spent tbe past 
week or two here sod last Tuesday 
made • business trip to poiots In tbe 
eastern part of the county’

The seventh grade of the nubile 
scbooli bad interesting txercises this

afternoon in commemoration of Wash­
ington's birthday. The program was 
under tbe direction of the Misses Par­
ker, Siebenthal and Archibald, as­
sisted by Mr. Gamble. Tbe grading 
room and the fourth grade contributed 
the program for Lincoln'* birthday, 
tbe exerclaoa being direoted by the 
Misses Lamoon and Utberg.

Joseph White is getting around 
agalo after quite a spell of Illness.

E. 3. Rowland made bis first trip 
out of aoors, since his illness, last 
Monday.

A daughter was born to Mr. and 
Mrs.Frank Brockman on tbe 15th Inst.

W. E. Nelson, agent of tbe North- 
Western line, spent last Sunday at 
Cbannlng.

William F- Schmidt, janitor at tbe 
Republic schools, who has been hous­
ed up for the past few weeks In conse­
quence of a sprained ankle sustained 
in a fall on an icy walk, is now able to 
move about the house and is in hopes 
be will be able to resume bis duties 
by tbe first of tbe coming month.

Mies Hilxna Hogluod is home from 
Marquette for a visit.

Rev. John Wargeiin, pastor of the 
Finnish Lutheran Church, spent tbe 
greater part of tbe past week in Glad­
stone.

J . F. Vlele, of Trout Lake, was a 
business visitor here during the past 
week.

Mrs. George MacDonald has been 
paying a visit to her daughter, Mrs. 
Charles Leaf, at Iron River.

Tbe attendance at the recital given 
by Henry Clark as the last number 
In the course arranged by Beacon 
lodge, Knights of Pythias, was not 
very encouraging, but the entertain­
ment itself was exceptionally good.

M ic h ig a m m e
An exceedingly pleasant social 

event was the party given last Satur­
day evenlog at tbe Bungalow. It was 
a valentine party, arranged by tbe 
Hornets, and tbe abundance of hearts 
of all sizes and variations of hue with 
which tbe rooms were decorated might 
lead one to think that tbe young ladies 
must have put in their spare time for 
tbe past year in fashioning these sym­
bols of 8t. Valentine. The evening's 
fun started with a straw ride to the 
Bungalow and a distribution of val­
entines started tbe festivities immedi­
ately after arrival. No one was 
slighted In tbe distribution and tbe 
clever rhymes which tbe missives car­
ried made much fun. Dancing was 
then begun and except for intermis­
sion for refreshments continued until 
even tbe most enthusiastic of the danc­
ers was ready to call "quits” aod pre­
pare for tbe homeward journey. 
Those In attendance were: Tbe Misses 
Jennie, Emily, Leona. Elizabeth and 
Ella Johnson, Clara Mortrude, Anna 
Christenson, LuElla Brown, Micbi- 
gamme, and Miss Edith Crooks, of 
Negaunee; and Messrs. Archie and 
Robert Bruce, E. M. Stensrud, Lau­
rence Paquin, Lloyd Schultz, Bert 
Kirk and Howard Scanlao.

Mrs. Robert Clemloson leftTuesday 
morning for a visit in Duluth,

The new passenger trains, Nos. 19 
and 20, add a little to Michigamme's 
importance as a railroad ceoter and 
though tbe traffic at ibis eod was a 
little light for the first few days the 
service seems destined to fill a long- 
felt want. Train No. 20 leaves HougbJ 
too at «:16 a. m. and reaches Micbi-

Samine at 6:50, having connected at 
estoria with Train No. 6 for all 

points on the west end and connecting 
here with Train No. 10 for Marquette, 
as well as for points south oo toe 8t. 
Paul line. The tralo Is turned here 
aod starts out again at 9:15 a. m. as 
Train No. 19 to make a circuit of tbe 
South Range before getting back to 
Houghton. James Loree, who came 
from the west end, Is conductor and 
Mr, Shea is a t the throttle. G eorge  
Anderson, of this plaoe, Is brakeman 
a n d J .J .  Kelly, formerly of Isbpem- 
log, presides In tbe baggage car.

Nothing definite regarding tbe re­
sumption of operations at tbe Imper­
ial mine is known, but the impression 
prevails that it will be resouably ear­
ly In tbe spring and It Is oertain that 
there will be no difficulty In recruiting 
a working force for many of tbe for­
mer employes have signified their In­
tention of returning at tbe first oppor­
tunity. A clean, dry place in which 
to labor and good men under whom 
to work are a combination which Is 
not found at erery plaoe oo the range 
aod constitutes the magnet which 
draws former employes back to the 
Imperial. Two Italian miners who 
bare been workiog at Princeton dur­
ing tbe past winter were up Tuesday 
to get a  line on the prospects for work 
at tbe Imperial next summer.

A civil suit for damages sustained 
in an altercation In a saloon was 
on tbe docket of Justice Scbweo- 
demao one day ibis week, One of tbe 
participants emerged wltb adisfigured 
optic, but apparently this was a minor 
consideration as compared with the 
torn outer garment. At the requeet 
of tbe defendant tbe case was ad­
journed until tbe 27tb lost.

C. A. Hubbard, who bad charge of 
steel construction work in the im­
provements at tbe Imperial mloe, paid 
a visit to tbe Copper Country this 
week to look over tbe machinery 
equipment of tbe big copper mines.

Matt Dledrlch came down from Pe- 
q uaming for a visit at the family borne.

Oscar Weolge doesn’t make any 
pretentions to havlog individually 
scything like tbe wealth of Micblgam-

1913 Assets, $397,965,341.31
Statement, for the Year Ending December 31, 1912

OF THE

1913

M e t r o p o l i t a n  L i f e  I n s u r a n c e  C o .

JNO. R. HEGEMAN, Pres.
(INCORPORATED BY THE STATE OF NEW YORK. STOCK COMPANY.)

i
“The Company OF the People, BT the People, FOB the People”

ASSETS.

Municipal and R. R. Bonds, and Stocks..................

Bonds aod Mortgages...............................................

Real Estate................................................... ............

Cash............................................................................

Loans to Policy Holders............................................

Premiums deferred and in course of collection (net) 

Accrued Interests, Renta, etc........................ ............

$176,019,605.79

159,609,993.00

23,712,364.17

6,763.482.16

19,977,821.21

7,726.278.85

5,155,716,13

$397,965,841.31

LIABILITIES.

Dividend! Apportioned, payable 1913, on Participating 
Policies, Intermediate Branch....................................

Same on Participating Policies, Ordinary Department..
(K orn Nearly all thla Company's Ordinary Policiss art Non* 

at low rates of premium.)Participating—Issued

Bonuses Apportioned, 
Policies.....................

payable 1913, on Industrial

Reinsurance Fund ........................................
All other Liabilities....................................
Capital and Surplus....................................

$1,404,084.12
115,103.52

6,281,571.00

$7,890,758.64 
348,500,039,00 

6,672,773,42 
34,804,870.25

$307,065,341.31

GOMPABISONS, ETC.
Iocome In 1912............................................................. $106,786,078.52

8,650,799.81

Vn nf Pnllnlai In Pama TIonamKa*. 91 1010 12,837,042
Gain over 1911........................................................... (More than that of any other company in America and more than 

that of all others combined, lees one).

Increase in Assets during 1912.................................. 45,179,450.95 Gain in No. of Outstanding Policies for tbe Year Placed 
and Paid for................................................................... 829,904

Surplus in 1912............................................................ 34.894,870.25

2,162,987.38Inoreaae over 1911................................................ . . . .
Gain in Outstanding Insurance for the Year Placed and 

Paid for:
Industrial................................................................ ($97,840,612

$107,247,503

162,839

iittw lU$UlaUUS t  IbCcII bUu t  btu lui lu IV Im»
Ordinary.........................................................................

Industrial Department, Issued...... $254,661,107

"  " Revived and Increased 35,975,708
(The gain in amount of Insurance in force le larger than the gain of 

any other company In tbe United Btatee).

Number of Policy-ClaimB Paid In 1912..............................
Ordinary Department, Issued..........  171,743,959 (Averaging one policy paid for every 64 seconds of each boatneee 

day of 8 hoars).

"  "  Revived and Increased 25,786,580 $488,167,354.00 Amount Paid on the Above.............................................. $25,901,612.71
(Averaging $177.61 a minute of each business day of 8 hoars). 

Policy-Claims, Dividend and Surrender-Values Paid 
Policy-Holders Id 1912, plus addition to Reserve........

Paid Policy-Holders since organization, plus amount
M A f f f  ( M t t A f l l A f l  V A M  sk A A A m i U  ■«

Total Outstanding Insurance (larger than that of any 
other company in the world).................................... 82,604,966,102.00

$77,884,518.04

# io 9 ,6 I2 ,8 3 o . 18

The Daily Average of the Company's business during 1912 was:

536 per day In Number of Claims Paid.
6,765 per day in Number of Policies Issued and Revived.

$1,605,814 per day in New Insurance Issued and Revived,
•256,199.07 per day in Payments to Policy-Holders and addition to Reserve. 
$148,616.61 per day In Increase of Assets.

GROWTH IN TEN-YEAR PERIODS.

Year Income for the year Assets et end of Veer Surplus at end of Year Number of Politic* 
in Force at End of Year

Outstanding Insurance 
at end of Year Year

Dec. 31, 1892 $18,307,811.46 1892 $16,506,282.22 1892 $ 3,674,616.49 1892 2,719,860 $ 310,767,876.00 1892
Dec. 31, 1902 43.336,283.61 1902 89,168,790.55 1902 10,351,338.02 1902 6,976,651 1,219,166,427.00 1902
Dec. 31, 1912 106,786.078.52 1912 397,965,341.31 1912 34.894,870.25 1912 12,837.042 2,604,966,102.00 1912

John B. Hegeman,
President.

Haley Flske,
Vice-President.

James M. Craig,
Actuary.

Frederick H. Ecker,
Treasurer. 

George H. Gaston,
Second Vice-President. 

George B. Woodward, 
Third Vice-President.

Frank O. Avers,
Fourth Vice-President.

P. F. Taylor,
Fifth Vice-President.

Lee K. Frankel, Ph.D.. 
Sixth Vice-President.

Walter Stabler,
Comptroller.

James S. Roberts,
Secretary.

Stewart L. Woodford,
Counsel.

William J. Tuily.
General Solicitor.

o f f i c e r s :
George B. Scott,

Assistant Secretary and 
Manager Pacific Coast,

Thomas H. Willard, M. D., 
Medical Director.

AugustusS. Knight, M. D., 
Medical Director.

James V. Barry,
Assistant Secretary.

Charles G. Reiter.
Assistant Actuary.

James C. Brown.
Assistant Actuary.

James D. Craig,
Assistant Actuary.

Raymond V. Carpenter, 
Assistant Actuary.

John R. Hegeman, Jr., 
Assistant Secretary.

J. J . Thompson,
Assistant Secretary.

T. B. Richardson,
Assistant Secretary.

George C. Penballow,
Assistant Secretary.

W. s . Manners. M. 0., 
Asst. Medical Director.

E. M. Holden, M. D., 
Asst. Medical Director.

D. M. Gedge, M. D.,
Asst. Medical Director.

J. Bergen Ogden, M. D., 
Asst. Medical Director.

Henry W. George,
Assistant Treasurer.

Walter R. Quick,
Auditor.

I. J. Caben, Manager Ordinary Department.

JEREMIAH HARE, Supt.
Jacob Chadeayne. Manager Intermediate Branch.

Dundon Block, Ishpeming, Mich.

me township taken collectively, but 
when it comes to patriotism and pub­
lic spiritedness generally be doesn’t 
have to take a back seat. It was this 
progressive spirit which enabled him 
to have tbe distinction of installing 
tbe first electric lights in a Micbigam- 
me business buildlog or residence. 
When it became apparent that the 
township electric system would for 
sometime have to confine its service 
to street lighting, Mr. Wenige decid­
ed to see what be oouid do toward In­
dividual Illumination. A gasoline 
engine was installed in tbe basement 
of nis business plaoe and then a small 
dyoamo wltb a capacity of from twen­
ty-five to thirty incandescent lamps

gut In position. Tbe final connections 
avlng been made last Tuesday, tbe 

"juice” was turned on that evening 
and the result certainly was satisfact­
ory. Only a few lamps had been nut 
oo for tbe test run, and ai is inevita­
bly tbe case with tbe installation of 
machinery of this kind, there are 
some mloor changes aod adjustments 
to be made before the plant cau settle 
down to steady service. The engine 
has sufficient capacity to operate a 
pump and In due courae Mr. Wenlge's 
buildlog wll) have a waterworks sys­
tem as well as electrical illumination 
throughout. "Tbe Sharp Corner” 
will soon become "The Bright Cor­
ner,” as well, and Mr. Wenige surely 
Is to be commended for his faith In 
Michigamme's future and for tbe 
practical form of enterprise lo which 
bis faith finds expression.

Isaac Treado is hauling wood to 
the school lo fulfillment of bis fuel 
contract.

John F. R/ao, of Marquette, who 
with G. J. Murray of this place are 
the moviog spirits In tbe United Life 
Underwriters, handling Hartford Life 
Insurance lo this district, paid a visit 
to Michigamme during the past week, 

While Joseph Beau prey was giving 
bis gun an overhauling last Sunday 
the weapon was accldentallyexplodcd 
tbe charge making a gaping hole in 
the wall. With the weapon "headed” 
as it was, Mr. Beauprey was in no

danger, but It certainly was lucky 
that bis wife and children were ab­
sent from home at tbe time, for bad 
they been standing around tbe room 
watcblog tbe operation it is probable 
that some one would have been hurt. 
Of course a moral, based upon tbe na­
ture of tbe occupation and tbe day 
upon which it was being performed, 
might easily be drawn, but tbe Ikon 
Herald forbears emphasizing it.

Mr. aod Mrs. Newtoo Thomas left 
Tuesday evening for Rockford,. III., 
to make a visit with a  relative who is 
seriously 111. Mr. Thomas, who is 
engineer oo freight trains 66 and (6. 
has a month's leave of absence aod 
his plaoe is being filled by Timothy 
Cranny.

Tbe prospect of a village water­
works system being too remote lo the 
dim, distant future, Peter Christenson 
has followed tbe example of K. G. 
Muok and arraoged for tbe installa­
tion of a private household system. 
A storage tank, a beater connected 
wltb tbe kitchen range and pipes lead­
ing to kltcbeo sink and bath room, 
makes a very satisfactory household 
outfit aod it certainly la a great con­
venience.

Arthur Thompson left Monday 
evening for a visit at Burgland before 
returning to bis railroad duties at 
Superior.

While bringing in a bucket of coal 
a few days ago, Mrs. Max Beauprey, 
Sr., fell in sucb a manner ai to break 
an arm.

C. F. Sundatrom paid a  visit to 
down-the-road points Tuesday.

Mill Hlldur Carlson, one of Micbi- 
gamme's popular young ladles. Is to 
become tbe bride of Andrew Ander 

g I
Sunday eveniog. Tb 
be performed at the tome of the 
bride's parents, Mr. and Mrs. Albert 
Carlson and tbe couple will shortly 
take up their residence at Ishpeming.

Miss Ivy Dufresne, a Michigamme 
young lady who Is making her mark 
as a musician, is expected to reach 
home before the end of the preseot 
week, the illness of her father beiog

son, ao Ishpeming young man. next 
e ceremony will

one of tbe motives for a visit at this 
particular time. For some time Miss 
Dufresne was located at Spokane but 
more recently had joined a theatrical 
company which was making a tour of 
Idaho just prior to her departure on 
her homeward trip.

Simon Wablman and a party of 
Ishpeming friends speot a pleasant 
mid-winter week-end at tbe Wahlman 
cottage on Lake Michigamme.

Cleo. Meilleur, of tbe Negaunee 
National Bank, was a business visit­
or in Michigamme lust Tuesday.

A. K. Sterne, county superintend­
ent of achools, visited the local schools 
last Tuesday.

Miss Fassbender, of Marquette, has 
been a guest at the Lacosse home dur­
ing the pasi week.

Herman Stensrud Is here from Mar­
quette to begin work upon bis con­
tract for the Installation of acompleto 

I urn blog equipment in the home of P. 
Paquln,

A camera is enabling Mrs. C. F. 
Suodstrom to share with her North­
ern Michigsn relatives and friends 
some of the pleasures of her winter's 
sojourn in California. Some excel­
lent views of tbe "Rose Carnival” ut 
Pasadena were among the latest addi­
tions to the pictorial collection.

Miss Pearl A. Dolf, after complet­
ing her course in the Literary Depart­
ment of tbe University of Michigan, 
has returned to her home, where she 
will sneDd the remainder of the winter. 
Miss Dolf will return to Ann Arbor

K

In June to graduate wltb her class.
Miss Edith M. Dolf, ateacherln the 

fron Mountain schools, returned to 
that city Mooday evening after *(>cnd- 
log a few days at tbe home of her par­
ents. Mr. and Mrs. Peter Dolf.

Lo k tor the Hoaeoa 
If you keep chickens and consider 

it an unprofitable pastime, look for 
the reason, fa mo**t cases you will 
floe your chickens are In poor condi­
tion, will dull combs and plumage. 
Try HAUVKLL'BCONDITION BOW- 
DER and note the difference, it 
counteracts disease, improves the ap­
pearance of the fowla and what Is 
more important, largely Increase* the 
yield of eggs. Price 'l> cts. per pack­
age. Sold by J. K. O'Donoghue. City 
Drug Store.

PEOPLE SHOULD GUARD 
AGAINST APPENDICITIS
Negaunee people who have stomach 

and bowel trouble should guard 
against appendicitis by taking simple 
buckthorn bark, glycerine, etc., as 
compounded in Auler-l-ka, the Cer- 
manappendicitJaremedy. AS/NCJJ-; 
DOSK relieves sour stomach, ga» on 
the stomach and constipation IN­
STANTLY because this simple mix­
ture aotlseptlcizes the digestive organs 
and draws off the impurities. Sold 
by J. K. O'Donogbue, 2

February 21 -March 14 
NOTICE OF TAX BALE

To the owner or owners of any and all Interests In. or lleni upon the land herein described — 
Tak e  Notice That tale has been lawfully made of tbe following dt-scritH-d land for unpaid 

taxes thereon, aud that the undersigned has title thereto under lax deed or deed* iMued Uo-rt-for, 
and that you are entitled to a reconveyance thereof at aay time within six months alter return or 
service of this notice, upon payment to the undersigned or to the Keglster in Chancery of the 
Comity In which the lands lie, of all m jiiii oald upon such purchase, together with one hundred per 
cent additional thereto, and the fees of the sheriff for the service or cost of publication of this no­
tice, to be computed as upon personal service of a declaration as commencement of suit, mid the 
further surn of five dollars for ea-U description without other additional cost or charge*. if  pay­
ment as aforesaid Is not made, tbe undersigned will Institute prooeedlugs for uosseMpm of the Uml. 
Description. r Keel I on. Town. Kaujre. Amount paid. Tax for year.
NW 8W * 42 N. * * w . ffll.W lm

Amount ueceaMry to redeem |3M 0 plus the fees for service.
All in the County of Marquette, State of Michigan

MARY ’. WctJOVKKN.
Place of Business, Florence, VVisoonslo.
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It Is up to the police to make safe 
blowing unsafe.

One way to avoid cholera seems to 
be to avoid war.

Wbat excellent fuel some fireproof 
structures appear to bet

If New York can’t find a new sen­
sation it stirs up an old one.

Some young women want a vote, but 
some prefer a husband with a vote.

Husband killing episodes may be 
necessary, but they are awfully mussy.

As between dollars and bullets, we 
must say we'd choose dollars every 
time.

A New York woman lost 1440 which 
she carried in her stocking. How Is 
not explained.

The French Poets’ society 
pensions for aged members, 
will furnish the funds.

plans
Who

The kaiser has Just dedicated a mo­
tion picture house of his own. Well, 
there’s money In moving pictures.

One way to stay young, says Ad* 
mlral Dewey, Is to avoid banquets. 
Yes, they are deadlier than battles.

There are 1,000 males to 900 fe­
males In the world. And still there 
nre those who would tax the bache- 
lors.

iNEW WANTS CREATED 
BY ADVERTISING

A Kansas woman has a fad for col­
lecting pitchers. No, gentle fan, she is 
not tbe proprietress of a baseball 
team.

New York man died the other day 
and his heart was found to be on the 
right side. It was In the right place, 
all right.

“ E V E R Y B O D Y  IS  DOING IT." DOING  

W H A T ? A D V E R T ISIN G .

First the equalling Infant, with the fu ll- 
face "ad."

Loudly bawling a fter milk; he don’t know  
-dad,”

Argument effective. In the rising son,
Oeta the goods delivered, and the first 

fight’s  won.

N ext the tardy schoolboy, w ith h is top  
to trade,

Boosts the merits o f  a  top, like this one's 
mode;

Trades It off for jack knife, w ith the “aide 
unseen,”

W hetting barter's appetite, to keep It 
koen.

Then the budding lover, dressed w ith  
careful pride,

Whlaperx In the m aiden’s eor-tsounds like 
"bride;”

Skillfully ne’s  building good Impression; 
strong; >

Maiden w ill surrender, if  the "ad's” not 
wrong.

Now the man of comm erce, In the swim  
he'll wade,

Argument convincing, but w ith air more 
staid.

Scorching for im pressions, th at w ill long  
persist,

In the minds o f "prospects” who are on 
his list.

L ast the grizslcd "bruin,” scarred w ith  
traffic's cares,

A dvertises victories, ’m ong bulls and 
bears,

Proud of battles fought and won, in busi­
ness strife.

Advertising spirit only ends w ith life.
—J. O. Frazier.

HER QUEENLY STYLE
Price of Goods Also Reduced 

Because of Greater 
Business Done.

When the papers are filled with ad­
vertisements there may be readers 
who ask themselves whether the cost 
of all this publicity does not fall, in 
the end upon the customers of 
the merchants and manufacturers who 
pay the bills. Some there are, no 
doubt, who believe that advertising 
increases the prioe of the goods they 
buy, and some who do not go so far 
aUU wonder how such an expense can 
be carried by business men without 
Incurring heavy losses.

The mistake In such shortsighted 
views of one of the great creative : Ufo had been very pleasant to the 
forces In modern business lies In the I wealthy widow. She had an ample 
fact that the power of advertising to ! fortune and many valued frlendB, ant 
make trade larger and to establish in adopting her favorite niece she had 
new wants and new methods of sup- I added a new Joy to existence. Her 
plying them, is overlooked, says the , heart warmed as she listened to tbe 
Cleveland Plalndealer. Advertising , pretty prattle of Nellie and her com 
Is not merely a means of catching a panione. A token of Interest was 
larger proportion of the fish in tbe added as she thought of another fa 
pond. It Increases enormously the I vorlte—Doslyn Moore. He, too, was 
number of the fishes. ! an orphan, and bis mother had been

Without advertising much of the the closest schoolgirl friend of Mrs.

Cream and Peaches Complexion 
Temporarily Wrecked by Use 

o f Beauty Mask.

By GENEVIEVE ULMAR.
Mrs. Laura Peaslee sat in a comfort­

able rocking chair in tbe broad, airy 
hallway of her home, listening idly 
to the gay chatter and laughter of a 
group of merry girls. There were four 
of them—Nellie Day, her niece; two 
cousins, Agnes and Frances Wood 
and Blanche Vlrden, the latter a vis! 
tor of tbe Wood girls, whose home ad 
Joined that of Mrs. Peaslee.

Except for the loss of her husband

IMPORTANT BUSINESS FACTOR

A Brooklyn bride has advertised 
that she will not be responsible for 
her husband’s debts. Ten to one ebe’i 
an actress.

Norway Is now starting to manufac­
ture nitrogen from tbe air. In tbe 
midst of peace we are surrounded by 
dangers.

There are nlneteten separate grades 
of eggs In the market One la cold 
storage. The rest—O, well, nobody 
ever sees them.

Still, it seems like taking an unfair 
advantage of a hard working microbe 
when a human being saturates him­
self with onions.

A S t Louis woman wants a divorce 
because her husband borrowed mon­
ey from her relatione. Turn about is 
fair play. Usually the relations live 
on tbs husband after marriage.

A Los Angeles Judge Just granted s 
wife a divorce because her husband 
spanked her. Probably he should 
have used a club and have been given 
a fine for assault and battery.

Snakes escaped and caused all sorts 
of trouble In a Parisian railroad sta­
tion. Trouble ensuing from snakes 
should not worry Paris at this lati 
dsy.

A New York woman Is said to have 
found $200 In a newspaper. It Is be 
lleved, however, that tbe story was 
started by the paper In question as s 
circulation booster.

An easterner committed suicide be 
cause he had lost bis appetite. The 
Jury probably found that he came to 
his death through his own careless­
ness.

Now It has been discovered that 
laughing gas may be self-adminis­
tered. There are lots of grouches 
who may profit by tbe discovery.

A selMUumlnatlng car paint has 
been devised whereby an automobile 
may be spotted a mile sway. At least, 
It’s possible to say "Thera she goes" 
under such circumstances.

A soiled greenback la restored to Its 
original pristine glory by washing 
and Ironing at tbe cost of 1-10 cent 
Hut the average man worrlea not at 
all whether his greenbacks be dirty.

A professional baseball umpire has 
brought suit for divorce because his 
wife called him name*. Probably her 
defense will be that she was training 
him preparatory to the coming ••* 
son.

A Oerrnnnlown university Junior 
pasted an examination on tbe twenty- 
four books of tbe Iliad, to the great 
surprise of bla Instructor*. About 
a year after graduation he will be 
decided competent to balance a set of 
books.

Whatever else may be said of him, 
the storage man deserves tbe credit 
of putting tbe old In cold.

A Chicago woman advocates ktse 
log being taught aa a fine a rt If It 
Isn’t a fine art, It la not due to lack 
of practice among tbe younger ge» 
•ration.

Tbe supreme court of Oregon think! 
that 700 years Is too long a sentence 
for any crime. Still, It might have 
been tbe proper thing la the Urns of 
Methuselah.

Merchants Must Use Newspaper Col­
umns If They Expect to Keep 

Abreast of the Times.

Each year the volumes of newspa­
per advertising becomes larger than 
before. During the last holiday sea­
son the newspapers the country over 
carried a volume of advertising never 
before approached In extent or In cost 
to the advertiser. It has come to 
the point where It Is necessary for a 
merchant to use the columns of the 
press If ho expects to remain abreast 
of the times as regards merchandis­
ing. He realizes that a vast major­
ity of people read the papers and he 
knows that to a large degree they are 
Influenced through reading the adver­
tising matter presented. Time was 
when, especially In the smaller com­
munities, patronage went by favor. 
John Jones traded with Tom Smith, 
because they were personal friends. 
Of course this still Is the case In 
some Instances. But, as a rule, John 
Jones trades where he feels he is 
doing best for his pocketbook. The 
merchant who gets his trade Is the 
one that presents his case in con­
vincing manner, no matter whether 
he knows Jones by sight or not. There 
are exceptions, but as a rule it Is tbe 
merchant who advertises Intelligently 
who gets the patronage of tbe more 
intelligent customers, those who read 
and seek to profit as a result of tbelr 
reading.

ADVERTISING EFFICACY SEEN
Brings to Light Man Who Has Only a 

Little Finger but Who Still Con­
tinues at Hla Work.

The claim of publishers that one 
can get moat anything one wants by 
advertising has received further sup* 
port Dr. J. J. Scanlon of London, 
who Is Investigating the monetary 
loss involved In Injuries to the hand 
In connection with tho workingmen's 
compensation act, published an offer 
of $6 for a workingman who, having 
lost the thumb, Index, middle and ring 
fingers of one band by accident, was 
back at his work. William 8tanlford, 
a railroad employee, claimed and was 
given the reward. Nineteen years ago 
Stanlford lost alt the fingers except 
the little finger of his right hand, but 
he not only proved that he had since 
continued his duties, but demonstrated 
that be could paper, paint and mend 
shoes, play the organ and white with 
the maimed hand.

Advertised With Old Prescriptions.
In the Bulletin of Pharmacy a drug­

gist of Owosso, Mich., tells bow he 
fills his town with the mysterious 
numerals "60,000." This simple In­
scription was shown In the load pa­
pers, In Ids windows, on billboards, 
etc., always In connection with hla 
name, and worked up some curiosity, 
after which his show windows sud­
denly bloomed with 00,000 old filled 
prescriptions which he had accumu­
lated during the years previous, thus 
calling attention to his good reputa­
tion as a dispenser and, incidentally, 
to the volume of his business. Tbe 
results are said to have been very sat­
isfactory.

The Printed and Spoken Word.
Religious advertising? Why not? 

Tbe preacher can reach at one time 
only those few hundreds within range 
of his voice. The printed newspaper 
word counts its audience by thousands. 
And what we read Is mighty likely to 
make a more lasting Impression on us 
than what we bear. The uses of 
newspaper advertising are Just begin­
ning to be discovered. Home day Its 
full scope and power will be univer­
sally realized and that day will be 
profitable to the newspapers and to 
the discoverers of tbe value of news­
papers alike,—Jerome P. Fleishman In 
the Baltimore Bud.

business of civilized countries would 
wither and die. The wants of civil­
ization would narrow rapidly becauso 
they would be general and increasing 
ignorance of the means whereby they 
could be supplied.

In a very true and vital sense, the 
luxuries and comforts of the age have 
been created to meet an artificial de­
mand. That Is, a demand which is 
founded on widening intelligence and 
rising standards of taste, rather than 
on primitive needs native to all hu­
man beings.

Much of the beauty and interest of 
life In these days depends upon the 
wants which spring from desires that 
would fade out of business if they 
were not kept alive by the news of 
the great Industrial and commercial 
enterprises of the times; that is, by 
advertising.

For advertising, at Its best, Is sim­
ply telling tbe news of the business 
world. It Is making known the new­
est and most seasonable fruits of un­
told skill and Industry.

Advertising Is publishing abroad the 
results of the labors of hundreds 
of chemists In their laboratories and 
of thousands of inventors using their 
skill and talents to create merchan­
dise In myriad forms, finer, sounder 
and more useful, as well as cheaper, 
than anything the past ever knew.

It Is on such news that the desire 
for the latest fruits of civilization 
grows and widens. The news of busi­
ness creates business. To tell what 
is for sale in a first-class store is not 
only to attract buyers from less en­
terprising places, but to multiply the 
users of the wares, and Increase their 
expenditure.

It follows, necessarily, that the most 
progreslve, intelligent and altogether 
competent merchants are the best rmd 
most persistent advertisers, and it Is 
equally true that the holiday "ads” 
are guide posts pointing tbe way to the 
beat bargains of the season.

This Is true not merely of one city 
or of a dozen, but of all cities In all 
civilized lands. Advertising Is tbe sign 
and proof of progresslveness.

Effective advertisements have to be 
supported by good merchandise or 
they soon come to an end. Where, ad­
vertising Is continuous anu done on a 
broad scale It is certain that the prod­
ucts of factories, mills and shops will 
be found at tbelr best and freshest 
There stocks and gods will bo most 
thoroughly and reliably up to date.

There, also, customers can depend 
upon tbe most skillful service and the 
most Intelligent consideration. It all 
goes back to the same root, which is 
recognition of one of the great pro­
ductive forces of modorn civiliza­
tion.

Peaslee. The latter bad felt bound to 
Interest herself in the lonely boy, 
and she had given him a good college 
education. Now she was very proud 
of tbe progress he was making as a 
chemist In a near-by city. Every sum 
mer Deslyn spent two weeks at the 
Peaslee home. He was expected to 
make his annual visit during tbe pres­
ent week.

It was concerning him that the 
bright quartette of young ladles were 
making so much noise. They all knew 
Deslyn except Miss Vlrden. Even 
her dark Spanish-llke face had glowed, 
however, with Interest at a sight of 
his photograph, treasured by Nellie. 
Deslyn had good prospects. He was 
not engaged. Mrs. Peaslee had hinted 
that he must soon choose a bride. 
Miss Vlrden was "In the market,” and 
she listened with Interest to the en­
thusiastic comments of her compan-

Censoring tht Advertiser.
Tho new Danish law against unfair 

competition and untrue advertise­
ments, which went Into effect Octobor 
1, is not unlike certain laws already 
In force In Germany. It Is not liked 
by merchants becauso of tho provision 
which forbids more than two "clear­
ing” sales a year by any store. Ac­
cording to tho report of our Copen­
hagen consul, "exceptions are made 
In case a bankrupt stock Is to be sold 
or the death of a partner or owner 
shall cause the closing out of business 
'below cost,’ or If a bona-fide winding 
up of the business Is undertaken, or 
If the place of business Is to be re­
moved to another locality, etc. If, 
however, any of the above exceptions 
can be shown not to have been true, 
u criminal prosecution Is possible." 
Nearly every European Idea comes to 
America sooner or later, but we al­
ready have In Massachusetts a statute 
against untrue advertisements.

We All Rsad ’Em.
Albert B. Kelley, an advertising ex­

pert of Philadelphia, sat Jn the Mark­
ham club turning tbe seventy or 
eighty pages—mostly advertising mat­
ter—of a weekly,

"Advertising Is such sn art," he 
said, “that many people actually buy 
periodicals as much for the advertise­
ments as for the reading matter."

Mr. Keeley smiled.
“I sat In an editor’s office the other 

day," be continued, “when a poet en­
tered.

" ’Glad to see you’ve accepted thst 
sonnet of mine,' tbe poet said, forer* 
lshly pushing back his long hair. 'I 
do hope It will he widely read.'

" 'It’s sure to be,’ said the editor, 
’It's suro to be. I've placed It next to 
one of our most striking ads,'"

She Paused With a Smile,

ions regarding the rising young pro­
fessor.

"We must all look our prettiest, you 
know," laughed Agnes. "Aunt Laura 
says Deslyn is surely going to carry 
one of us away with him."

"Well, don't flatter yourself, plain 
homebody sister of mine," retorted 
the mischievous Frances. "It was al­
ways Nellie with Deslyn, and Nellie 
will certainly be tbe fairy princess."

"Yes," remarked Miss Vlrden in her 
feline way, "with that cream and 
peaches complexion of yours, Nellie, 
ordinary and artificial charms like 
ours will stand little show."

"Artificial!" bridled tbe circumspect 
Agnes.

"Ob, on that score tbe reference 
was exclusively to myself, dear," ex­
plained Blanche. "1 confess to tbe 
guilt of a make-up, girls. Come, Nel­
lie, you were so kind as to Invite me 
to visit with you overnight, and I 
brought my toilette case with me. I 
hardly thought you would be interest­
ed, but I look so dreadful when 1 get 
up In the morning that I didn't want 
to terrify you with my wrinkles of 
care and cross face lines."

Blanche affectod to speak playfully, 
but there was a bitter undertone to It 
all. She envied the strong, healthy, 
natural girl, whoso bright eyes and 
glowing cheeks told of sunshine, pure 
air, a quiet boloe life and—love.

They bad a great time of It as 
Blanche opened the toilette case. Bbe 
showed them bow she brought tbe 
cherry red to her Ups, the artistic 
curve to her lalbes, bow she brighten­
ed her eyes, and plnkod her ears, and 
changed a wrinkle Into a dimple. In 
her dusky beauty she was really ra­
diant, despite the superficial effect. 
Then sbe said:

"And at nigllt, dears—you see this 
muslin cloth. It Is a beauty mask. 
Now look—I saturate it from the 
green bottle, I lay It over my fate, 
and In tbe morning when I take It of? 
the skin Is clear and smooth as a 
baby's."

All these maneuvers nianche went 
through again that evening when she 
and Nellie retired. The next morn­
ing a hurry call came from Agnes, 
an unexpected invitation to a picnic. 
Blanche bad to flit early. Bbe left 
her toilette case behind her. Nellie 
did not go. Deslyn was expected on 
tbe afternoon train.

Mrs. Peaslee had gone to town to 
Mov/e some household supplies. Nel­

lie arranged her hair and selected 
her best dress to welcome the ex­
pected guest. She paused with a 
smile as she observed the open toil­
ette case. Then she looked into the 
mirror.

“Cream and peacheB, Blanche said," 
she murmured. “PeThaps I am so 
much so I look like a milkmaid. Cer­
tainly Blanche has a queenly style all 
her own. Suppose I take my nap in< 
a beauty mask. Why, I'll try it Just 
for fun."

Poor little wild-rose Nellie! She 
laughed as she saturated the piece 
of muslin from a green bottle. Then 
she settled down to a nap, the beauty 
mask over her face. Two hours later, 
Just as Mrs. Peaslee entered the 
house, she was startled by a frantic 
•cream. She rushed up the stairs. 
There was Nellie, staring into the 
mirror. Her beautiful face was raw 
blotches.

It took some time for Nellie to ex­
plain. She doubted not that she had 
destroyed her beauty. A doctor was 
hastily sent for. He ordered a dress­
ing, examined the toilette case, and 
discovered that Nellie had used a 
strong acid used for burning away 
proud flesh Instead of tho harmless 
beauty preparation. He told Nellie 
that tbe flesh would have to peel off 
before those scars would disappear

That afternoon there came a tele­
gram stating that Deslyn was delayed 
till the next day. A slight accident 
detained him, the message said.

Miss Vlrden smiled softly to her­
self when she heard of Nellie’s mis 
nap. Perhaps she was sorry for Nel 
lie, but that night she used the help­
ful toilette case to the full limit.

Nellie told her aunt she simply 
would not meet Deslyn. She mourned 
her lost beauty. She sat in her own 
room that afternoon as the carriage 
arrived. To her surprise her aunt ap­
peared leading Deslyg, who had 
bandage across his eyes.

You can come down, Nellie, dear," 
announced her aunt, appearing in her 
room. "Poor Deslyn! While experi­
menting In his laboratory a chemical 
exploded, nearly blinding him. The 
doctor says his eyeB must be kept 
continually bandaged and he must 
have careful nursing."

Two weeks later Nellie’s disfigure­
ment had totally disappeared. A few 
days later tho happy Deslyn was al 
lowed to use bis eyes. He viewed his 
radiant fiancee tenderly. She told 
him all about her mishap, and her 
tears and misery over It.

' ‘Cream and peaches,'" quoted the 
ardent lover. “Yes, Nellie, and roses 
and lilies, and all things that are pret­
ty and sweet—that's you!"

Nellie had learned her lesson. At 
the wedding she did not use even the 
ightest touch of face powder! 
(Copyright, IBIS, by W . O. Chapm an.)

DULUTH’S MANY ODD POINTS
Enterprising and Busy City Has Been 

Called the Queers*! In the 
United States,

THE BASKS 
OF

Tbe queerest city In America is be­
loved by many persons to be Duluth, 

guardian of tbe great port at the head 
of Lake Superior. Some one has de­
scribed It as 20 miles long, a mile 
wide and half a mile high, which fits 
tbe place very nicely. All about one 
side the hills come down almost to 
the shores of Lake Superior, that 
great unsalted sea. Right on the 
edge of each stretches the Zenith 
City, made famous by Proctor Knott’s 
speech.

Duluth Is the greatest outdoor town 
n the world. One can catch trout and 

shoot bear, moose and deer within Its 
limits. One fall recently, after a for­
est fire, 30 black boars were killed 
within Its boundaries. In the winter 
the girls and boys enjoy themselvef 
n Duluth by traveling about on skis. 

They go 10 or 15 miles into the coun­
try and then ski back home, and win­
ter campfire parties are as common 
there as bridge whist parties are in 
tbe east.

Duluth Is boastful. It has the big­
gest boat club and the second biggest 
wholesale house In America. Its busi­
ness Is Immense. This season It has 
handled 50.000,000 tons of ore and 
100,000.000 bushels of grain. Its har­
bor Is a wonder. There Is a  natural 
breakwater that Is like a darning 
needle, for It Is seven miles long end 
only a few hundred yayds wide. TC 
Is made of the sand and silt brought 
down and piled up by the waters of 
St. Louis river. Within this breakwa­
ter tbe shipping is done.—Philadel­
phia Grit.

Her tense of tmell.
"Is yo’ bllln’ potaters, Mis’ Green T" 

asked Rose Matilda, coming down 
from tbe roof with a basketful of dry 
clothes.

"Yes." said Mrs. Green. "How did 
you know?"

"Oh, I'se got t  mighty sharp smell," 
replied Rose Matilda, "sn’ no ooe 
csyn’t cook notin’ 'round mo dat I 
don't know ’bout. W'y, de od'er night 
w'en I went to church I s it Mis’ John- 
sin*, msh nex’ neighbor, to come sn’ 
stay wlf de btby w'lle I'a gone. Mis’ 
Johnsln, she one o' dem folks dat ain’t 
awful partic’lar ’bout wut's hers an' 
wot’s mine, Mis' Green. Well, w'en 
l's cornin’ home I felt Uke In eve’ 
bone In mab body dat Mis’ Johnsln 
she cook a suppe’ fo’ herself wlf mah 
'gradients w'lle l's 'way. And sho' 
'nuff, w'en I come In, I knowed she'd 
eat up all mah fresh algc. 'cos I Jus' 
could smell de ode’ o' bllln' aigs befo’ 
I so much aa open mah doT‘—New 
York Press.

Tbe closing of the year 1912 has 
brought out the usual bank statement! 
accompanied by the addresses of the 
Presidents and General Managers of 
these Institutions. Their reading Is 
interesting as they show In a striking 
manner tbe prosperity of the country, 
and deal with economic matters In a 
first hand way. Those who know any­
thing of Canadian banking methods 
know tbe stability of these institu­
tions, and the bigh character of the 
men who are placed In charge. In 
discussing the land situation the Pres* 
ldent of the Union Bank of Canada, 
whose branches are to be found In all 
parts of the Canadian West, said:—

"A good deal has been said about 
speculation In land. Tbe increase in 
land values has added enormously to 
the assets of Western business, and 
has to some extent formed a basis for 
extended credit, but this Is not felt to 
be a drawback when tbe value Is real 
and convertible. We consider that a 
business standing which Is strength­
ened and enhanced by property hold­
ings la entitled to a reasonable en­
largement of credit for legitimate busi­
ness operations.”

It will thus be seen that the banks 
recognize the certain rise In the value 
of farm lands In Western Canada. 
When the facts are known of the won­
derful producing qualities of farm 
lands In the Provinces of Manitoba, 
Saskatchewan and Alberta, It Is sim­
ple to understand the liberal stand 
taken by the banks.

Living not far from Lashburn, Saak., 
Is a farmer named Clarke who In 1913 
secured a crop of Marquis Wheat, 
yielding 76 bushels per acre. This 
is spoken of as a record yield, and this 
Is doubtless true, but several cases 
have been brought to notice where 
yields almost as large have been pro­
duced, and in different parts of the 
country. During the past year there 
have been reported rahny yields of 
from 35 to 45 bushels of wheat to the 
acre. Oats, too, were a success­
ful crop, and so was the barley 
crop. Wheat that would yield 40 
bushels per acre, would bring on the 
market 70c (a fair figure) per bushel, 
a gross return of $28.00 per acre. Al­
low $12.00 per acre (an outside figure) 
there would be a balance of $16.00 per 
acre net profit. This figure should 
satisfy anyone having land that cost 
less than $100.00 per acre. Very much 
less return than this proves satisfac­
tory to those holding lands In Iowa 
and Illinois worth from $260 to $300 
per acre.

The latest Government returns give 
an approximate estimate of four hun­
dred thousand of an Immigration to 
Canada during 1912. Of this number 
200,000 will be from the United States. 
Most of these are of tbe farming class 
and It Is net difficult to understand 
why farming lands In Canada will ad­
vance from ten to twenty per cent 
within the next twelve months. There­
fore investment In Western Canadian 
lands Is not looked upon as being In 
tbe speculative class. Those fortunate 
enough to secure free homesteads In 
Canada will acquire In tbe Intrinsic 
value of the land alone the best pos­
sible start for a splendid future. Ad­
vertisement

Showing the Qoods.
A novel mode of advertising for a 

wife has been adopted by an Inhabi­
tant of a provincial town In England.

photograph of the gentleman Is 
placed In the window of a shop-keep­
er, and underneath Is tbe following 
notice: "Wanted; a female compan­
ion to the abore. Apply at this 
office."

It takes a genius to save money or 
write good poetiy.
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Government Chemists Have a 
Busy Year in View.*

While All Food Products Are Down
for More Probing, the Cannery 

Business Will Get a Lot of 
Attention From the Bureau.

'Washington.—Dr. Carl L. Alsberg, 
recently appointed chief of the bureau 
of chemistry, to succeed Dr. Wiley, 
found himself furnished with a year's 
program of work of Imposing propor- 
ttons, and it Is understood that he Is 
tackling it with energy and purposes 
to carry It out to the fullest possible 
extent. The program was devised by 
Dr. R. E. Doolittle, who was acting 
chief of the bureau for a long period 
following Dr. Wiley's resignation, and 
while Dr. Alsberg may make a few 
changes In it, for the most part it out­
lines work that he will go through 
with. Not only will the bureau be ex­
ceedingly busy In pursuing routine 
Inspections of food and drugs, but 
many new Investigations are on the 
schedule, as well as elaborations of 
other Investigations.

“What Is beer?" is a question on the 
Hat calling for answer. The bureau 
proposes to make a study of the 
preparation of malt liquors from vari­
ous raw materials, especially along 
the line of determining the absolute 
composition of products made from 
barley.

Milk, canned foods and oysters are 
down for more probing. The cannery 
business will get a lot of attention 
from the bureau, with particular ref­
erence to the packing of canned goods 
with excessive quantities of water, 
brlno, sauces and other useless fillers. 
Interstate shipments of milk will be 
closely watched, particularly the milk 
furnished to cities situated near state 
borders and coming from neighboring 
states. Canned milk will be watched 
also. When the oyster season opens 
the bureau proposes to take extensive 
specimens from all sources of supply.

In connection with the study of 
foods, Important experiments will be 
carried out to get definite Information 
as to changes caused In shipment by 
temperature, altitude and humidity.

Coloring materials used In teas are 
scheduled for examination, as well as 
vegetable coloring matter and coal 
tar dyes used In foods. Vanilla ox- 
tract, an article well, known to tbe 
American housewife, will be called on 
to disclose Its socrets. The bureau 
will endeavor to determine the rela­
tion of co m m e a l to the dread disease 
of pellugra.

HlMjthing the American egg, from 
the hen to the consumer, Is one of tbe 
Interesting detective Jobs laid out. 
This will develop from an attempt to 
get facts regarding the transportation 
of perfshuhle products. Using the bu­
reau’s Omaha laboratory as a center 
and working In connection with three 
commercial establishments, the bu- 
muu will begin a study of the hind- 
ling of froxen and dried eggs during 
what Is known as the egg-breaking 
eaason- When the eggbreaking sea- 
eon ends It Is planned to follow the 
products, frozen or dried, to the bak­
ers, co-operating with tbo latter In 
etudylng the routine to which the 
products are subjected and their rste 
of deterioration after thawing or dis­
solving.

Huger, sirup and maple sap Investi­
gations are on the bureau’s list, par­
ticularly a study of tbe effect on ma­
ple sap of the metal containers In 
which It Is commonly supplied to the 
public.

One of the most Interesting studies 
of tho bureau will concern the meth­
ods or making bread In the principal 
cities of tho country and an Investiga­
tion of the value of different wheats 
for milling and baking purposes. The 
bureau also purposes to  find out some­
thing about macaroni and the us of 
ootoring matter in connection with 
Its manufacture.

While foods for human beings come 
first In Importance, the welfare of 
domostlc unlmals is not entirely for­
gotten. The bureau will make an ex­
tensive study of cattle and poultry 
foods, with an Investigation of range 
forage crops.

We mey also know more about the

shoes we wear after the bureau com­
pletes one feature of Its new pro 
gram, even to the extent of explana­
tion of just how the American small 
boy can wear out his footgear faster 
than an automobile can wear out tires. 
Practical experiments will be made 
with various kinds of sole leather, 
treated in different ways, for the pun- 
pose of determlhlng the characteris­
tics of a suitable and durable type 
and of devising laboratory methods 
for disclosing such qualities. Tbe bu­
reau will also go into tbe tanning In­
dustry to some extent, making experi­
ments in tanning leather so as to  p ro * 
duce a high grade, durable material. 
One of the objects of this leather in­
vestigation 1b the conservation of raw 
materials used In leather production, 
which are now Inadequate to the de­
mand.

At this time, when many employes 
of the government seem fearful of los-
f> M A A ,,,g  the,r P°#l*
can  t  Get Rid lions with the In- 
of His Job. coming adminis­

tration, M. E. 
Hlxon, postmaster at East Washington, 
finds himself firmly riveted to his job, 
although he Is anxious to get rid of 
It. The East Washington that holds 
him is not In the District of Columbia, 
but a small village ten miles from 
Hillsboro, N, H.

Hlxon had been country storekeeper 
and postmaster there for seven years. 
He concluded he would remove to 
Massachusetts, and so sold out his 
business and sent In his resignation. 
He also sent his family ahead to Mas­
sachusetts. The post office depart­
ment informed him he could not go un­
til his successor was appointed and 
qualified, unless tbe office were dis­
continued, and so he waited.

The department discontinued the 
post office, but the inhabitants of East 
Washington, put up such a protest 
through Representative Currier that 
the department had to back down and 
revoke its order to discontinuance. 
Hlxon then gave up In despair. He re­
called hlB family from Massachusetts, 
reopened his store and Is now doing 
business as postmaster with grim de­
termination. .

Tho post office is a fourth-class of­
fice and the postmaster's compensation 
amounts to about $200 a year. Al­
though the department set several 
dates for the examination of candi­
dates for the office, no ono ever ap­
peared to take them or seemed to 
want the Job.

Chief of Police Sylvester is going 
to Inaugurate a unique campaign of 

publicity to pro- 
ln Campaign tect persons from 
Against Crooks. victim, ot

robbers during 
the lnnugural period. Iils Idea is to 
aqualnt the general public with the ap- 
pearunce of the thieves who have re­
cently boon arrested In different sec­
tions of the country, especially the 
pickpockets, and make their faces so 
familiar that they will be unable to 
remain on the streets many hours be­
fore they are identified.

The plan the chief has adopted In­
cludes the establishment ot miniature 
rogues' galleries in hotel lobbies, rail­
road and ateamboat stations and oth­
er public places, so that persons who 
Interest themselves enough to study 
tbe faces of the crooks will be In a 
position to cause their arrest.

It Is the Intention of MaJ. Sylvester 
to procure abont 600 such pictures, 
have copies ot them made, posted on 
cards and hung about the publlo 
places, ne will place them In some of 
the larger business houses, he says, 
and In all places whore they will at­
tract attention, and he thinks much 
good will be accomplished.

Chiefs of police of most of the larg­
er cities already bare been asked to 
assist in the work, and many pictures 
already have been received. As soon 
as the copies are made and the cards 
arranged, MaJ. Sylvester says, they 
will be placed In public places.

Heavier and taller children were the 
net results of the open-air schools of 

the District of Co 
Outdoor Work lumbia, according
Great Help. t0 Health offlcepu ic a i K- William C. Wood- 
ward, who returned his annual report 
the other day. Dr. Woodward dwelt 
at length on the advantages of pure- 
air Instruction over that given In the 
classroom, and then, without any ap­
parent attempt to criticise, declared 
that tbe United States government In 
Its maintenance of Its personally own­
ed "fish and oyster wharf" here was 
maintaining "the most Insanitary es- 
tabllahment in the District of Colum­
bia for the preparation of food for 
•ale.”

The death rate, despite this, was 
falling so rapidly, acoordlng to Dr. 
Woodward, that tbe district soon 
would become one of the most health­
ful places in tbe oountry.

Burgeon General Rupert Blue, of tbe 
ibllo Health Service, through the 

state department, 
illiont Of Fi$h received thi* tele-
•e Killed. *r.ro from Thom-

as H. Bevsns, 
Ttericsn Vice Consul at Tampico,

Mexico: —
“I have tbe honor to report that dur­

ing the last ten days millions of fish 
have been killed In the waters adjunct 
to Tampico, There hare been several 
theories advanced as to the cause, but 
tbe most probable one Is that they 
were killed by a submarine volcanic 
disturbance. Tbe fish range in else 
from tbe six foot tarpon to the eight­
een Inch mullet.

“These fish are now In a state o f 
decomposition, causing much uneasl- 
non and fear of an epidemic of yellow 
fever."

OLD TIME TABLE CUSTOMS
Even at so late a period as the Res­

toration in England, It was the custom 
for guests to take their own knives 
and forks to a banquet. Pepys rec­
ords that he did this when he went to 
the lord mayor’s feast in the Guild 
ball.

In the previous reign the lord cham­
berlain had found it necessary to Is­
sue regulations for the benefit of of­
ficers Invited to dine at the royal ta­
ble. The were required to wear dean 
boots, not to be half-drunk on their 
arrival, not to drink more than one 
goblet to every two dishes, not to 
throw the bones under the table, nor 
to lick their fingers.

The Stuarts undoubtedly did much 
to refine English table manners, for 
It was one of the points admired In 
Mary Queen of Scots that the custom 
she Introduced from France made her 
courts and royal banquets more ex­
quisite and gentle than those of her 
rival, Queen Elizabeth.

FLAT FEET IN PITTSBURG
There are more flat-footed males, 

or men with kidney feet, in Pittsburg, 
than in any other American city, says 
Dr. D. B. Sable, surgeon to the civil 
service commission. More than 30 
per cent, of the men there have bro­
ken archcp, the doctor says. About 
the women’s feet he will say nothing. 
Asked to explain the cause, Dr. Sable 
said he supposed It was because ot 
the hilly topography of Pittsburg, the 
effort of walking uphill, and the Jar 
coming down, that breaks the arch 
and makes the kidney feet. Another 
reason, he says, is that men do not 
realize the importance of the foot, 
and do not give It enough attention.

OLD TEMPLE OF JUGGERNAUT

The most celebrated shrine In all 
India is that of Jaganath, or Jugger­
naut, as popular English pronuncia­
tion calls the name, on the Orissa 
coast of the Hay of nengal, not far 
from the Madras frontier. The Hin­
doo gor Vishnu Is there the genius 
loci; 12 great festivals are held In 
his honor every year. The huge 
twelfth-century Temple of Jaganath 
here shown dominates the place at 
festival flmes, sharing the regard of 
millions of devotees with the monster 
Juggernaut car, which is kept there, 
and in the days before the coming of 
the British raj used to be dragged 
through the streets over the bodies of 
self-immolated victims. The temple 
Is about 200 feet high.

STRANGE ZODIACAL LIGHT
There Is a strange light In the 

heavens appearing after sunset In the 
late winter and In spring and before 
sunrise In the autumn, but few per­
sons in our latitudes have ever seen 
It. In the equatorial regions, how­
ever, and In certain parts of the 
tropics tho rodlacal light appears with 
great splendor, and some remarkable 
views of It were obtained by a French 
expedition to the Interior of the Sa­
hara, undertaken for the purpose of 
studying the effects of the unclouded 
sun on the dry air of the desert.

The mysterious light, In the form 
or a vast triangle, rising high In tho 
heavens, appeared nearly three times 
as bright as tho Milky Way. Science 
has not entirety solved the problem of 
the origin of this light/

FALSE LEG MADE FOR CAT
The growing popularity of dogs with 

women is greatly Increasing the In­
comes of veterinary surgeons. Quite 
recently a well known London veter­
inarian was paid a fee of $436 for set­
ting the broken leg of a favorite Aber­
deen terrier—a delicate ploce of work 
Involving three and a half months’ 
careful nursing. The moet Ingenious 
operation, however, was the manufac­
ture of a false leg for a cat. A cat’s 
bonas are very elastic and springy, 
so the false leg was made of leather 
In order to give some spring to It. 
It has answered very well, and the 
pet so fitted Is still alive and active.

FARMER FIGHTS PORCUPINE
Buffering from many painful wounds, 

the result of a hand-to hand battle 
with a porcupine, Charles Murray, a 
Jefferson County, New York, farmer. 
Is laid up at home. Twenty-nine quills 
have been extracted from his face, 
hands and head. While hunting Mur 
ray and a companion lost their way 
and made a camp In the woods close 
to a fallen hollow tree. Tbe smoke 
of the camp fire routed out a porcu­
pine, and Murray encountered It. The 
lulll* had begun to work Into the flesh 
md It was necessary for tbe doctor to 
extract them.

Famous Naupas Waterwheel

Among the curlosltlee of Palestine are the famoue old Naupaa water­
wheels of Hama, etlll used In the rather crude manufactures of that city. 
Hams, the Hamath of the Bible, le on the Orontee river eouth of Aleppo.

NEARLY WEDS WRONG TWIN MASCOTS OF THE AVIATORS
Because Miss Dolly Quinn of Hege- 

wlsch, 111., was one of the very few 
who could tell William McKernan and 
John McKernan, twins, apart, she es­
caped the fate of being married to the 
wrong one.

When tho McKernan-Quinn wedding 
party went to St. Columba’s church, 
In Hammond, Ind., where Father Hil­
lary was to make William McKernan 
and Mias Quinn man and wife, John 
McKernan went along In the capacity 
of best man. The twins as usual were 
dressed alike.

Father Hillary called the prospec­
tive bride and bridegroom to the al­
tar for final instructions. William 
McKernan became confused. John 
stepped Into his place. Tho bride to 
be supposed this was a part of the 
ceremony.

When the clergyman began the wed­
ding service she saw the mistake. 
She whispered:

“You’re marrying me to the wrong 
man.”

The mix up In twins was straight­
ened out and the young woman was 
married to the right man.

NEVADA “TRAVELING" STONES
"Traveling stones” from the size of 

a pea to six inches In diameter, are 
found In Nevada. When distributed 
on a floor or other level surface, with­
in two or three feet of one another, 
they immediately begin to travel to­
wards a common center, and there 
lie huddled like a clutch of eggs In a 
nest. A single stone removed to a 
distance of three and a half feet, up­
on being released, at once started 
with wonderful and somewhat comi­
cal celerity to  Join Its fellows.

These queer stones are found In a 
region that Is comparatively level and 
little more than bare rock. Scattered 
over this barren region arc little ba­
sins, from a few feet to a rod or two 
In diameter, and It Is In the bottom 
of these that the rolling stones are 
found.

The cause for the strange conduct 
of these stones Is doubtless to be 
found In the muterlal of which they 
nrc composed, which appears to be 
loadstone, or magnetic Iron ore.

DUCKS RUIN LAKES OF OIL
Oil producers and refiners In the 

Tampico fields will lose morn than 
$600,000 because millions of wild 
ducks have migrated to Mexico since 
the advent of cold weather and thous­
ands of them have alighted In the 
great lakes of oil and perished there.

These unnumbered flocks of dead 
water fowl have ruined the crude oil, 
whloh, because of the decomposed ani­
mal matter, cannot bo refined.

I/ord Rosebery's recent confession 
to carylng an amulet or mascot, in 
the shape of a golden swastika, draws 
draws attention to a custom that is 
ve ry  com m on  nowadays. Motorists 
especlaly utilize such luck-brlngert, 
which range from miniature aeroplane 
engines to Teddy bears, and from vel­
vet cats 'to toy figures of policemen. 
Aviators have adopted tho same su­
perstition, and they also confess to a 
variety of mascots, from brown vel­
vet monkoys to a shirt. The latter, It 
may bo explained, Is always taken 
with him In his aeroplane by a Gor­
man airman, who treasures the gar­
ment because he woro it on an occa­
sion when be fell from a consider­
able height without Injury. Another 
avlattfr consistently refuses to fly 
over a cemetery—which Is, perhaps, 
Intelligible.

PAPUAN WIDOW IN MOURNING

The natives of Papua do not often 
wear much clothing, and what they do 
wear looks curious to civilized eyes. 
This especially of their mourning 
garb, a specimen of which Is here Il­
lustrated It Is a widow In weeds, the 
same being made of twigs or grass.

Spiral Approach To Bridge

Tfie people of Hastings, Minn., are bragging that they have the most 
remarkable freak bridge In the country. A person traveling over this bridge 
hardly knows whether he Is going or oomlng, for the approach on one elds 
makes a complete turn, as shown In the picture. The ground on thle side of 
the river Is low, and the Incline was made more gradual by giving the ap- 
proach this curious spiral design. The bridge croeeee the Mleslsalppl, and 
the epen over the rIVer le 320 feet long. The entire length of the structure. 
Including both approaches, le 2,300 feet.. The grounds underneath th# aplfgf 
approach Hava boon laid out aa a beautiful park.

RHEUMATIC ADVICE
Prominent Doctor’s Beet Pretcrip- 

tlon Easily Mixed at Home.

“ From  your druggist gi-t one ounce 
o f  Torts compound (tn original sealM

Snckagr) and one ounco o f  syrup of 
arsaparUln compound. Take these 

tw o Ingredients home and put them  
in to  a h a lf  pint o f good whiskey. 
Shake the bottle find take a table- 
spoonful before **aoh m eal Rnd at bed­
tim e." This Is said to be the quickest 
and best remedy known to the medical 
profession for rheum atism  and back­
ache, Onod results com e after the first 
dose. If your druggist does not have 
T orls compound tn stock  he will get 
It for you In a  few hours from nl« 
w holesale house. Don't he Influenced 
to  take a patent m edicine Instead of 
th is. Insist on having the genuine Torts 
compound In the original nne-mince. sea l­
ed. ye llo w  package. H undreds o f the  
worst cases were cured here by this pre­
scription Inst winter. Published by the 
G lobe Pharm aceutical laboratories o f  
Chicago.

SHE KNEW BETTER.

“Did your wife give you particular 
fits because you come homo at 3 
o’clock the other morning?”

“No, she didn’t say a word. It's 
too near Christmas.”

WHITE PIMPLES ON HEAD
Ransom, 111.—“The troublo startod 

on our baby when he was only about 
two weeks old. Started like little 
white pimples, looked like an old scab 
of blood and matter. His whole toad 
was covered for a fow months, then it 
went to his ear, shoulders, and his 
whole body. It seemed to come out 
thick and sticky on his head, wbtlo 
on the other parts of his body It was 
more like water coming out of tho 
skin. He would scratch until the erup­
tion would be all covered with blood 
and gradually spread. The least little 
stir or rub would cause the sores to 
bleed, spread and Itch. Never had a 
full night's sleep, restless all night.

“The sores were horrid to look at. 
It lasted until he was about two and a 
half years old. Then we saw an ec­
zema advertisement in tho paper to 
use — —, hut It did no good. Thon 
we used Cuticura Soap and Cutlcura 
Ointment. %Ve put the Cutlcura Oint­
ment on thick at bed time and put a 
tight hood on so ho could not scratch 
the sores. Then we washed it clean 
with Cutlcura Soap and warm water 
twice a day, and he was completely 
cured.” (Signed) Mrs. E. F. Sulzber­
ger, Dec. 30, 1912.

Cutlcura Soap and Oiitment told 
throughout the world. Sample of each 
free, with 82-p. Skin Book. Address 
poet-card “Cutlcura, Dept L, Boston.” 
Adv.

SOMETHING SWELL.

“Going to h&vo turkey on your 
birthday ?”

"No; I'm going to blow myself this 
year for an elaborate feed. 1'tn going 
to give a bacon dinner to tbo family.”

In a Literal Sense.
Juvenile remark* uro not always so 

naughty u» they seem. Hinail Ham, for 
Instance, had no Intention of using bad 
language when he got Into such severe 
trouble In class.

His teacher was trying to press 
home certain facts concerning a vol 
Cano. In reviewing the lesson she 
drew on t$ie blackboard her own con­
ception of a flaming mountain, using 
colored crayon with extraordinary of- 
fect.

“What Is n r  she asked, tbe picture 
finished.

Tho scholars shook puzzled heads.
“You don't know? Well, what does 

It look like?” tho teacher persisted.
Biped Hammlo, whose home boasts 

a colored pictorial Bible.
' ”/ think It looks like bell.”--Chicago 
Record-Herald.

Hsr Great Lovs.
They had already celebrated the 

fact that the mistletoe hung In the 
hall, and now they were occupying 
not only one settee, but alao tbe en­
tire drawing room.

"Could you love me, darling,” he 
murmured, as the thought of time 
sprig of mistletoe came to him again, 
“if 1 possessed only ono coat In the 
wide, wide world?”

Hbn looked up Into hi* eyes as she 
framed her reply.

"I rould,” she said, “If 1 knew you 
had sacrificed the others to buy ui« 
a new dress!”



—AM roads lead to the ski races to* 
morrow.

Negaunee Slate Bank
C o m m e r c i a l  a n d  
S a v i n g e  B a n k .

% INTEREST ON DEPOSITS.
$ 1 . 0 0 — Opens an A cco u n t— $ 1 . 0 0

<, a

ASK FOB ONE OF OUR

—Spring must be coming soon—the 
government seeds are arriving,

—The Marquette county board of 
Supervisors will meet next Wednes­
day.

—The married and single men of 
St. Paul’s church will receive hofy 
communion in a body next Sunday 
morning at the 8 o'clock mass.

—Jaimer Slmu, of this city, was ad* 
judged insane in Marquette on Wed 
nesday and following the examination 
was taken to the Newberry asylum.

—Dills have been posted announc 
ing a "Miners’ Demonstration” to be 
held at the Labor Temple next Sun* 
day afternoon. There will be speech 
ei in all languages.

—Mr. and Mrs. Wilfred Vlzlna 
mourn the death of their two*months 
old daughter, which occurred yester 
day morning at their home at the 
Queen mine location.

—Get your feet warmly clad and 
discard silke and flimsy things for the 
day, then you’ll be comfortable and 
eojoy the greatest of winter sports at 
the ski races tomorrow,

—That there is to be a tight to de­
lay the resubmission of the suffrage 
question until the fall elcctioo of 1914 
is admitted by supporters of the pro* 
posed amendment in both Senate and 
House,

—The Finnish Temperance Society 
will conduct a bazaar in their ball, 
corner of Brown avenue and Case 
street to-morrow evening and extend 

cordial invitation to their friends 
to attend.

—A rabbit hunting party were out 
hunting in the vicinity of Palmer on 
Wednesday and succeeded lo bagging 
six "bunnies.”

—E. A. Doty "is touching the high 
spots" since Sunday evening, when a 
bouncing baby boy arrived at his 
home in East Main street.

ttome Savings Banks, i
THESE BANKS LOANED TO DEPOSITORS.

Y o u  a r e  c o r d i a l l y  i n v i t e d  t o  i n ­

s p e c t  o u r  r^ e w  B a r \ ^  b u i l d i n g .

A WEEK’S NEWS NOTES
Paragraphs About Negaunee 

Affairs.

A COLUMN OF LOCAL HAPPENINGS

In te restin g  Item s About Towns­
people and Their Business 

and Social Affairs.

-•To-morrow will be "ski day."

—But one more week In February.

—Louis Vllleneuye has closed hit 
saloon temporarily.

—The ladles of the Swedish Luther 
an church gave a pleasing valentine 
party in the Sunday school of the 
church last Friday evening and those 
present pronouce the occasion a great 
success.

—C. B. Skiff Intends to close hla 
moving picture theater at Dlorite 
within a few days.

—Don’t forget the basketball game 
at the Neguuni'o High School this 
{Friday) evening—Marquotte vs. Ne- 
gaunee.

■—Member* of the "Five Hundred 
Club” were entertuind at the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. Thomas 1’ascoe, Lin* 
colu stroet, on Monday evening.

—The social dance given under the 
auspices of the Labor Temple Hand 
lust Saturday night at the Labor 
Temple was a success socially and 11* 
uumdiilly* _____

—Ijuurluin1* firemen's running team 
organized to represent the village in 
the U. 1’. Firemen's Tournament to be 
held In Ued Jacket will tic u fast og* 
gregutlou.

—The local plumbers report * stren­
uous period during the recent cold 
spell. The cold weather had sent the 
frost Into the ground to depths vary* 
ing from three to six feet.

—The criminal calendar In the Clr* 
cult Court was cleared at the session 
last week. The case against i ’eter 
Catto of this city, charged with Inde­
cent exposure, was continued.

—"buclu Tom’* Cabin, "the stirring 
drama of ante*bellum days, which 
seemingly never will grow old, was 
presented last night at McDonald’s 
Opera house and as usual drew a good 
bouse. The next attraction at Mo* 
D o n a ld 's  opera house will be "The 
Thoroughbred Tramp."

—The "Moonlight Skating” par 
tieB given at the Palace Holler Kink 
on Tuesday evening of each week are 
proving quite a drawing card and are 
affording much pleasure to the par­
ticipants.

—Swanson Bros., plumbers, of this 
city, have secured another contract In 
iron Mountain, where they have been 
employed for months—that of instal­
ling a heating plant in the home oi 
Mr. Boostrom.

-T h e  Alger County Poultry Assooi* 
alion held its Fifth Annual Show at 
Munising on Wednesday and Thurs* 
day of this week. It was woll attend* 
ed and one of the best shows ever held 
in that county.

—The firemen are interested in the 
proposal of a race for the sevoral 
teams of lire horses in the Copper 
Country during the firemen's tourna­
ment to bo held In Hud Jacket the 
coming summer.

—George McCann, of Muoising, 
who rocently secured a lease of the 
liakonjo* property, East iron street, 
fur the purposeol conducting a livery, 
sale and boarding stable therein, has 
taken possession.

— Mrs. John Arpentlpny, who had 
resided in Negaunee fur years, died 
Sunday at her home in Case street, 
aged 62 years. The husband and ten 
children survive. The funeral was 
held Tuesday morning, with services 
at St. Paul's Catholic Church.

--Although it Is a little early for 
any real stir in the political game, 
there have boen a few symptoms dur­
ing the past few days of an awakening 
and there ie every posslbllty that be­
fore long things will tako on a more 
definite aspect.

—Harry Trezona, aged 24, employ­
ed at the Loretta mine on the Menom­
inee range, was kilted at the mine, last 
week. He leaves a wlfo and two child­
ren. Truzon* was left motherless 
when young and bad made his home 
with his elS'ter, Mr*. William Stana- 
way, of Norway. Other relative* re­
side at OwIdd.

—Eastern surgeons operated on a 
man for appendicitis and found that 
he never had au appendix. Inasmuch 
'as he has a bank account, however, 
the disappointment was not as great 
as it might have been.

—The Michigan legislature la to 
take up the question of advance pay­
ment of telephone rentals and to 
make it unlawful for any person or 
partbersblp or corDoratlon to collect 
payment for telephone service before 
such service has been given.

—Too many people keep Lent like 
Jones, /ones, very much under the 
weather, lurched into a barroom and 
ordered bis nineteenth cocktail. 
"Cherry In It, air?” the bartender 
asked. "No,M said Jones, "No hie— 
no cherry. It’s Lent and I bar cher­
ries In Lent."

—A man walked into a hardware 
store and asked the clerk: "Would 
you please show me some skis? Some­
thing suitable for a girl." The clerk 
answered, "Yes, sir, How long do 
you want them?” And the man an­
swered with some asperity, " I’d want 
them all winter."

—A bill has been Introduced in the 
Legislature by Senator King to abol­
ish the game and fish department and 
substitute a non-salarled, non-partisan 
commission of five men, which is to 
name three chiefs to head respective­
ly the divisions of protection, fish 
culture and game propagation at sal­
aries not to exceed $1200 each.

—The most economical man on 
earth has been discovered in the Up* 
per Peninsula. He has let bis hair 
and whiskers grow for three years to 
raise enough ttuffiog for bis wife's 
sofa, and now he Is trying to train 
himself down to eleven pounds so as 
to go by parcel post at zone rates to 
the state fair next fall.

—WUb last Saturday’s issue of 
the Bessemer Herald that paper reach­
ed the eod of another volume and this 
week will begin Volume XXVIII. 
In view of tho.anolversary we wish F. 
A. Slebentobn, the present editor and 
manager, continued success und pros­
perity in the journalism field, The 
Herald la among our most valued ex­
changes.

Rate* to Ski Tournament

The L. H. A I. H'y and the M. A M. 
A 8, E. H'y announce that "Saturday 
rsieN," with ” week*end" privileges, 
will bo in effect for the Ski Tourna­
ment lo bo held lo Ishpemlng on Sat­
urday, Feb. 22d. Hound trip tickets 
at the ruduoed rates will be sold on 
that dsto and the tickets will be good 
for return uotll the following Monday. 
The east-bound passenger train will 
be held till 4:15 p. m. the day of the 
tournament and will also make a stop 
at the crossing near Union Park to 
to pick up passengers. 22-t2

Methodist Minister Reoommends Obam 
bertaln’s Or igh Bemedy

Hov, Jamos A. Lewis, Milaca, 
Min., writes: "Chamborlaln’s Cough 
Homedy has boen a needed and wel* 
como guest in our home for a number 
of years. I highly rocommund it to 
my fellows as being a medicine worthy 
o! trial in oases el colds, coughs and 
croup." Give Chamberlain's Cough 
Homedy a trial and we are ooofldent 
you will find it very effectual and 
continue to use It as occasion requires 
for years to oome. as many others 
have done. For sale by , E. O’Don* 
oghue.

First Hockey Game

The first hockey game ever witnessed 
in Negaunee was that played last Sun­
day morning at the municipal ice rink 
between recently organized teams of 
Marquette and Negaunee. Those who 
got an Inkling of the contest were 
present and witnessed an Interesting 
game from start to flolsh, Marquette 
won by a score of 5 to 2. Some of the 
Negaunee players never before parti 
cipated in a hockey game.

These two teams will play another 
match game at Marquette nextSunday 
afternoon. The line-up of the Ne 
gaunee team follows: Bert Rosevear, 
rover; William Pelto,left wing; Char 
lesTall.point; AloyslusLaMere, goal; 
RoyCullli, center; John Culiis,cover 
point; Wm. Davey, right wing.

Must Heed the Rules

Children under sixteen years of 
age should remember that the rule of 
the municipal ice rink is that they are 
required to leave the ice for home not 
ater than 8 o'clock in the evening. 

This rule will be strictly enforced.
Another warning Is issued to those 

n the habit of expectorating to desist 
In the practice while on the ice. The 
filthy habit will not be tolerated.

Inspected New Fire Hall

The members of the Common Coun­
cil, fire department and Board of Pub­
lic Works went to Ishpemlng Wednes­
day evening and joined the throng of 
invited guetfts In looking over Ish- 
pemlng’s new and handsome fire hall. 
AU were guests of the Isbpem- 
ing council. Following the inspection 
of the building a lunch was served, 
which was followed by informal talks.

Ishpemlng has every reason to feel 
proud of its new fire hall, which can 
easily be regarded as one of the finest 
buildings'of its kind in the Upper 
Peninsula.

Epworth League Concert

The members of the Epworth League 
of the Mitchell Methodist Episcopal 
Church have arranged a very pleasing 
concert program at the church for tbe 
evening of Washington’s birthday. 
February 22, and extend a cordial In­
vitation to their friends to attend. The 
admission price will be twenty-five and 
ten cents—the latter price for chil­
dren. The proceeds will go to tbe 
church Improvement fund.

In addition to tbe vocal and instru­
mental music and recitations a farce 
entitled "Thirty Minutes for Refresh­
ments," will be given. Following is 
the program:
Vocsl Solo—Selected................Marion McOoncil
Violin Solo—"Alice Where Art Thou".......

.......................................... Carmen Cbtuiiee
Recitation—“Tbe Good Old Timea"...........

................................................. Orville Colllna
Piano Solo—Selected................ Raymond Tbomaa
Vocal Solo—Selected..............................Mac Roec

FARCE
JOHN DOWNLEY. a bachelor............John Bath
CLARENCE FITTS, hla colored aarvsnt...

.................................................. John Thomti
JOHN FOXTON, a youni married Scotlc-

man....................................  Lealie Bowdan
MAJOR PEPPER. U. S. A............. William Bath
MRS. FOXTON................................. Eva Hooptr
MISS ARABELLA PEPPER. •  maJdco

lady.........................................Ada Richirda
POLLY, a waitlnl maid at Highland Sta­

tion..........................................................Grace Paacoe

Violin Solo—Selected............ ..........Harry Bottrill
Plano Solo—"The Fifth Nocturn"...Haacl Haupt 
Recitation—"The Station ASeot'a Story"..

.......................................... ...Mr. J. Lcvcrtoo
Piano Solo—"Walts Arabesque"....Lucile Eddy
Vocal Solo—"Craola Love SonJ"................

.............................................. Marion Bedford

Resolutions of Respect

Wiikkbah, It has pleased tbe Great 
Architect of tbe Universe to remove 
from our midst our late Brother, 
Charles Larson, therefore be it 

i i f  to ivrd  by the Danish Brotherhood, 
Lodtfu No. 0 , of Negaunee, Mich., 
that while we bow with bumble sub- 
miasloo to the Will of the Most High 
we do not the less mourn for our 
Brother who has been taken from us.

Jif M lv td , That the hesrtfeit sympa­
thy of this Lodge be extended to bis 
family in their afilloiloo; be it further 

H m loe d , That our Charter be drap­
ed In mourning for a period of 30 days, 
and these resolutions be printed In the 
Nekjaunick Ikon Herald and also lo 
the Danish Pioneer and a copy thereof 
be transmitted to the family of our 
deceased Brother.

Respectfully submitted,
Hans P. Hahmubskn, 1 
Rasmus Matuiskn, > Com. 
Ckihtian J ensen, )

The End of the World 
Should It como to-morrow would find 
people suffering pain to a more or 
less serious degree. Those, however, 
who use RENNF/S PAIN-KILLING 
MAGIC OIL get relief quickly and 
suffer least. Taken Internally It will 
cure oolie, cholera morbus aod diar­
rhoea. used as a liniment it ourea 
rhuumatlsm, nueralgta, lumbago, 
sprains, bruises. It la an admirable 
remedy for internal or external pun. 
Price 26 cts.* Sold by J. E. O'Dooo- 
ghue, City Drug Store.

You Work Hard
for your money, why not put some of it at 
work for you?

By adjusting living expenses so that the 
SAVINGS FUND will get its share you will 
build a surplus that will, in time, pay you 

’ '  a nice income.

1  Why not start NOW to CRE­
ATE A SURPLUS at this bank?
Interest paid on your deposits will 
help wonderfully in doing so*

I  FIRST NATIONAL BANK
NEGAUNEE, MICHIGAN.

Capital and Surplus - S I80,000.00
THIS BANK WELCOMES SAVINGS DEPOSITS 

OF ONE DOLLAR OP MORE.
A. MAITLAND, President 
T. C. YATES, Cashier

DEPOSITS

GEO. J. MAAS, Vice-President
JOHN J. BELDOv Asst. Cashier

ACCEPTED BY MAIL.

Cbe ^ustritc 
Hcetylene G as Lam p

Gives a steady brilliant white light. Operated with 

less cost than the cheapest oil lamp and with far 

better results.

No
Grease,

S m oke

or
Soot.

The only lamp that is JU S T R IT K

Prices—Brass, $1.00; Nickel Plated, $1.50.

Universal
Stoves

J. H. SAWBRIOGE
H ard w a re  and F u rn itu re

K 8 T A B U & H E D  J878.I

Quality

Paints

E K i a H a a 8 9 ^ i i ^ i s ^ a a > s R i f l ^ » x i s i H .

Every Garment Perfect
O r as nearly a s  anyth ing  can well be in[this 

world. O ne poorly made, poorly fitting 

garm en t does m ore to  tear down one's 

business than  a  dozen perfect ones can do 

to build it up. W e have never m ade an 

overcoat, top  coat o r suit th a t was not per­

fectly tailo red ; th a t is why people place the 

u tm ost confidence in our ability as tailors.

W e can m ake your clothes a t any price and 

you get th e  best value for your money.

H .  J .  P E T E R S O N

JOSEPH. H. PRIMEAl, Jf7|
A t t o r n k y - a t - L a w , j

IN . j  

wwmJ

NEOAUNEC, • MICHIGAN
Both PIlODM.

February lil-M nrrh 14
PROBATE NOTICE

HTATK OK MICHIGAN,
The Probate Court for Hie Couuty of Marquette 

lu the Matter of tbe Estate of Oscar Markuta, 
Demised. . .. ,

Notice Is hereby given that four month! from 
the IUh day of Feb. A. 1). lRlil. have been al­
lowed for creditors to present their clulms 
osalnst said deceased to said court for exainlu- 
atumamfadjustment, and that all creditors of 
sold deceased are required to present their 
claims to sold court, at tbe probate office, lit tbe 
City of Marquette In said ootmty. oo or before 

'  June A. 1). 19tbe lftth day 1>. isis, and tlioit June A. __  ... ...
bejtrd by ttldjwurt onWed-

m
Judge

i card „
nesdsy the 1Mb day o fju n e  A. D. ISIS, at two 

—  boon.

■ n m
Judge of Probate.

ulsyth
o'clock Id the afternoon, 

hated, Marquette, Mlcb
(Hsel)

A true copy.

-G O  T O —

THE NEGAUNEE BAKERY
Aod got some of our OOOD 
B R E A D .  We sell the

L A R G E S T  L O A F
for the small price of 6 cents.

And say, try some of our Ghahkcini
or Bhhau Btuaws.

Have you tried our good Doughnut*?

CAKES, JELLY ROLLS AND 
COOKIES BAKED DAILY.

C a ll o r w rite  at  401, P lO H E E l t  A  V K

JOHN LISA, Prop’r.

f l l i r  r i a n t r i n  Q o r u in o  is at y°ur command 24 hours each day and 7 days MARQUETTE C ounty

UUI LI GUI I lu OCIvluC every week. Try it, you will be pleased. Both Phones. G as A, E lectric  C o.


